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To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
RE: TG7291Suncoast 0 

Thanks. We'll open a docket today. 

- - - - -  Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2003 8 : 0 5  AM 
To: Ruth Nettles 
Subject: RE: TG729/Suncoast 

Y e s ,  it is OK to open a docket with an effective date of January 7, 2003. 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2003 11:oo AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TG729/Suncoast 

Good morning. We have received payment from Suncoast for  t o t a l  of $103. They are 
requesting cancellation, is it ok to open cancellation docket? 

Thank you. 
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