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, TOAAvO&PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES. THE IWXJMmRY ASSESSMENT FEE RE'IIIRN MUST BE !TLEDON OR BEFORE 01/30/2003 

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory pissessment Fee R e m  
I 

PERtOD COVERED: 
,01/01/2002 TO 12/31/2002 
I L  I 

TG82 5-02-0-R 
Strikers Family Sporb Center II, Inc. 

Sunrise, FL 33351-6004 
8500 N.W. 44th Street _ .  
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LINE 
No. 
1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

6. 

7. 

8. 

9. 

Gross Intrastate Revenue 

LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* 
(see "2. Fees" on back) 

TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation 
(Line 2 less Line 3) 

Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - @Idtiply Line 4 by 0.0015) 

Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE 

As PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTB$ THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE 1s $50 

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF TEE AMOUNT OF REWN'JES ICEPORTED 

Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered 
by this Return 



FOR THE FINEST I N "F /I/v/ILY SPORTS CENTERS" 
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April 30, 2003 

; : MAY 1 2 2003 

•• t I ~ ~ 

Florida Public Services Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 

RE: Strikers fami ly Sports Center Account # TG82S-02-R 

Dear Sir; 

Strikers Family SPOlts Center, 11 no longer has pay telephones. The telephone lines were turned off 
January 8, 2003 . There was not income from January 1,2003 to January 8, 2003. 

Co Manager 
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1577 Laskin Road· Virginia Beach, Virginia 23451· (757) 428-5897. fAX (757) 428-3194 



Ruth Nettles 

From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Thursday, May 15, 20038:16 AM 
To: Ruth Nettles 
Subject: RE: TG825/Strikers Family 

No , they owe more P&I and 2003 RAF. I will contact them. Thanks. 

-----Original Message----­
From: Ruth Nettles 
Sent: Wednesday, May 14, 2003 2:16 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TG825/Strikers Family 

I have documented this payment record in 030000 ; with att ached letter advising company no 
longer has payphones; there wa s not income fr om 1 / 1 /03 -1 /8/03. The payment submi tt ed 
totals $54.81 . Shou l d we open a docket for cancellat ion? Please advise. 
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