
. 1  . 
TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2003 

Interexchange Company Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

h ' Florida won  
STATUS: 

- Actual Return 
Estimated Returnb - Amended Return 

PERIOD COVERED: 
0 1 /O 1 /2002 TO 1 213 1 /2002 

(See Filing Instructions on Back of Form) 

TI495 -02-0-R 
North American Communications Control, Inc. 
789 Park Avenue, 2nd Floor 
Huntington, NY 1 174"Slf D A E  

I /  a: P . I -  5leC-e 3 5  6 JUN bd 3nnq 
Please Complete Below IC Official Mailing Address Has Changed 

FOR PSC USE ONLY 
Check# 1053 

k,3 7 0603001 
003001 

060300 1 
P $ /3.24 

00401 1 

Postmark Date 

Initials of Preparer 

(Name of Company) . (Address) (City/State) ' (Zip) 

I .  Long Distance Services 
2. Access Services 
3. Private Line Services 
4. 
5. Miscellaneous Services 

Leased Facilities & Circuits Services 

6. TOTAL Telephone Services $ .'3 5 J '3G 0,65 
7. LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* 

(see "2. Fees" on back) 

Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date'' on back) 

0 

13, ;3d 
8. 
9. 
10. 
1 1. 
12. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE 

* These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable. 

TOTAL REVENUES For Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation 
Regulatory Assessment Fee Due (Multiply Line 8 by 0.0015) 

Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) C f l A  :3 c. 

CURRENT COMPANY STATUS 
( ) Facilities-Based Carrier .F/ ) Reseller 
( ) Alternate-Operator Service ( ) Rebiller 

( ) Call Aggregator 
( )Other: 

9 BILLING INFORMATION 
Complete below if billing agent if other than yourself. 

- 'U"  
OVame) (Address: CitylStatdZip) . (Telephone)- 

What is the total amount of bond held (if applicable)? What is the total amount of customer deposits collected? 
Amount: $ for 19 Amount: $ Expires: 

COMPANY IN FORMATION 
DO you lease telecommunications' facilities? ( ) YES  NO 
If YES, who do you lease these facilities from? Name: 

Address: 

I, the undersigned ownerlofficer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above information is a . 
' true and correct statement. 1 am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes. whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with th? intent t<misle?d a 

I * . >  , . ,  , L ' z , .  I;! I:i+:>i nor of the second degree. , 

I' i :  " . 
Telephone Number [ 1 FaxNumber( ) 

F.E.I. No. 
(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 9 5  16  I JU)J 1 ;  & 

PSCKMU-I53 (Rev. I111 1/99) 

(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 

PSCKMU-I53 (Rev. I111 1/99) 

Telephone Number [ 1 FaxNumber( ) 

F.E.I. No. 9 5  16  I JU)J 1 ;  & 



NORTH AMERICAN COMMUNICATIONS CONTROL, INC. 
789 Park Ave, 2”d Floor 
Huntington, NY 1 1743 

June 3,2003 

State of Florida 
Public Service Commission 
Capital Circle Office Center 
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
Attn: FiscaI Services 

To Whom It May Concern: 

I am writing on behalf of North American Communications Control, Inc. (“NACC”) Tax 
Id # 1 1 -3 15096 1. NACC has had no business in the telecom industry as of September 3 1 , 
2002. We have successfully completed an Asset Acquisition with ARC Networks dba 
lnfohighway Communications. We are also currently in the process of dissolving, NACC 
and have had no income from any telecommunications act what so ever since September 
3 1,2002. Please adjust your records accordingly and feel free to contact me if you have 
any further questions along with confirmation of receipt of this letter: 

Bridgette Nally 
95 Tree Road 
Centereach, NY 1 1720 
(63 1) 588-3 1 62 

I will be handling the close out period from here on. 

Bridgette Nally 
Con tro 11 er 
NACC & 

ZZ  :6 IJV 9- Nor co 



Ruth NettIes 

To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
RE: North American Communications/T1495 

Okay, for now I'll p l a c e  this in undocketed. Thanks Paula. 

----- Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Thursday, June 12, 2003 8 : 5 0  AM 
To: Ruth Nettles 
S u b j e c t :  RE: North American Communications/TI495 

I wrote the company and asked it to confirm t h a t  it was requesting cancellation and to pay 
the 2003 RAF. Thanks. 

----- Original Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
Sent: Wednesday, June 11, 2003 1:45 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: RE: North American Communications/TI495 

Okay, coming your way. 

----- Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
S e n t :  Wednesday, June 11, 2003 1:44 PM 
To: Ruth Nettles 
S u b j e c t :  RE: North American Communications/TI495 

now. Thanks. 

----- Original Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
Sent: Wednesday, June 11, 2003 1:15 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: North American Communications/TI495 

Paula ,  I have recieved payment record form company for 2002 RAFs with P/I; attached is a 
letter advising company has not been in telecom industry since 9/02; Can I f ax  this to 
you? I'm not sure if the company is asking f o r  cancellation, to me, it seems to imply but 
its not really said. Let me know when I can f ax  to you. 

1 


