
To: 
Subject: 

Paula Mer 
RE: Craig A. Pfeffer, TG923 

Okay. I'll use this e-mail to do so. 

Thanks. 

----- Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Tuesday, June 17, 2003 10:47 AM 
To: Kay Flynn 
Subject: RE: Craig A. Pfeffer, TG923 

Yes. He's paid up since he included payment for 2003. 

--_-- Original Message----- 
From: Kay Flynn 
Sent: Tuesday, June 17, 2003 10:40 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: Craig A. Pfeffer, TG923 

Paula, we have this cert holder's 2003 RAF payment info. He states he's canceled his PATS 
service with Verizon. Do we open a docket to cancel his PATS cert? 
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