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State of Florida 
.r ( h x -  ,- 

CLERK 
DATE: December 29,2003 
TO: 
FROM: Division of Economic Regulation (Fletcher) %+- 
RE: 

Division of the Commission Clerk and A d m i n i s t r p  Services 

Docket No. 020408-SU - Application for Rate Increase in Seminole County by Alafaya 

Please file the attached facsimile from Martin S. Friedman, dated December 29,2003, in 
the docket file for the above-referenced docket. 
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FACSIMILE COVER SHF,ET 

407 830 8522 p.01 

TO: Bart Fletcher 
Fl&&P&dic-.Service. Commission 

DATE: Dccember 29.2003 

FAX: (850) 413-7018 

PHONE: (850) 413-7017 

PACES: A0 
MATTER: 30057.46 

COMMENTS: 

Please notify u5 immediately if not received properly: 
(407) 830-633 1 

The information contained in this transmission is attorney privileged and conhdeatiaI. It is intmdcd osly for the we 
of lhe individnal or entity named above. If the reader of this messerge is not ihe intendtd recipient, you are hereby 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copy ofthis comiunicntion i s  strictly prohibited. If you have received 
this communicatjon in  TOT, please notify us immediately by telephone collect and return the original message to us 3t 
the above address via the U. S. Postal Service. We will reimburse you for postage. Thank you. 



DEC-29-2803 14:48 ROSE SUNDSTRUM 8 BENTLEY 487 830 8522 P.Q2 

RP,~I..Y TO ALTAMOFTE SPRINGS 

December 29,2003 

Mr. Bart Fletcher 
Division of Economic Regulation 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 
Tallahassee, FL 32399 

Re: Docket No, 020408-SU; Application of Mafaya Utilities, hc., for Rate Increase 
in S e m b "  County, Florida 
Our File No.: 30057.46 

Dear Bart: 

As I have previously advised you, Aafaya Utilities, Inc., has two major projects 
which are scheduled to be completed in 2004. In that regard, I have enclosed the 
following Contracts t 

+ Contract with USFilter for rehabilitation of the Alafaya West Plant at a 
cost of $173,474. That project isscheduled to begin the first week of 
February, 2004. 

+ The Contract with CPH Engineers for the design of the digester 
replacement at a conwact amount of $36,500. These services have 
already commenced. 

+ Comtruction Contract with Itlorida Environmental Construction for 
replacement af the digesters at a cost of $668,000. Construction is 
scheduled to commence immediately upan completion a€ the 
engineering. 
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Mr. Bart Fletcher 
December 29,2003 
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Should you have any questions regarding the enclosed Contract8, please do not 
hesitate to contact David Orr at Alafaya Utilities, Inc., directly at 407/869-8588 ext. 
227 or me. 

Very truly yours, 

kbh 

MSFhnp 
Enclosures 

cc; Mr. Steven M. Lubertozzi (w/endoswcs’) 
Mr. David L. Orr (w/enclosures) 
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E Q W I R ~ N T  PROPOSAL AND PURCHASE ORDER 
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EQUIPMENT PURCHASE ORI)FR 

Partbeer: 

S d l w  Davis Products, a division of 
United Sbtas Filter Corporation 
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SECTION 00520 

AGREEMENT FORM 

PART 1 GENERAL 

1.01. THIS AGREEMENT, made Shk 23 day of DecembeK, 2003$ by and b e w e n  (1) Alafava 
Utilities, Inc. , hereinafter called the Owner, and (2) Florida -Environmental Construction, 
and hereinafter called the Contractor. - 

A. Contra& Documents 

The Cantmct Pacuments eorrslst of this Agreement; all kerns listed in the index to 
the Project Manual; the Drawings as listed in the Project Mandoh the Florida 
Department of T~3nsportatbh Standard Specificatkms for b a d  and Bridge 
Construction - lt 991 ~ as incapwated by the Project Manual; all Addenda issued 
prior ta and all Change Orders issued after execution of this Agrmm". Those 
form the Contract and all arp 3s fully a part of the Contract as if attached to this 
Agr@emnent by repeated hemin. 

The Contractor shall perform all wortc; required by the Contract DoGumetlfs for the 
construction of the 141 Alafaya Digester ReDlacement . Any significant change in 
the scope af services, as Rrtified by lhe Engineer, will be eligible far 8 revision to 
the Contract Price. 

c. Ca" Time 

The Contractor shall begin work within 9 0 days after the issuanw of a written Notice 
to Proceed and shall oomplele substantially complete the work within (5]18Q 
calendar days from the date of the Notice to Proceed. The work shall be finaily 
wmptete, mady far Final Payment in accordance with the General Conditions, 
within 30 mlendar d a p  frDm the a&sl datE of substamtial completion. 

D. Liquidated Damages 

OWNER and CONITRACTUR recognize that time is of the essence of this 
Agreement and that OWNER will surfer financial lass if the Work is not substantially 
complete within the time apedfted In Paragraph C above, plus any a>rtensSans 
thereof allowed in accordance with the General Conditiaw. They also recognize 
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the delays, expense and diRwlties invalved in proving in 3 kgqi arbitration 
prezceeding the actual loss suffered hy OWNER if the Work is nat substantially 
campkte on time. Accofdingly, instead of requiting any such prouf, OWNER and 
CONTRACTOR agree that as liquidated damages f5r delay (bat not as a penalty) 
CONTWCTOR shall pay OWNER $500 for each calendar day that expires after 
the time specified in Paragraph C for substantial completion until .the work is 
substantially csmplsk, It is agreed that if this Work is not Finally completed in : 
accordance with the Contract Documents, the CONTRACTOR shall pay the- 
OWNER as liquidated damagesfor delay, and not as penalty, one-fourth (%> of the 
rate sbt forth above. 

E. Contract Price 

Unit Pri- Contract 

The Owner will pay Zbe Contractor in current funds far 'the performance of the work, 
subject to additions and deductions by Change Order and subject to the 
Measurerner~t and Payment Provisions, and subject to actual cotWructed quantities; 
the Total Contra& Ptice of Six Hundred sad-ht Thousand Ddlars 
{$668,00Ql3CiJ. Payments will be made to the Canlr&Xor an the basis af tt?e 
Schedule of UnR Prices induded as part of his 8id, which shall be as fully a part 
of the Contract as if attached or repeated herein. 

F. Payments 

The Owner will make payments ~ 1 s  providd b the General Canditians and 
Supplementary Cohditiafis. 

G. Engineer 

me Project has been designed by CPH Engineers, Inc., referrad to in the 
dacumefifs as the Engineer, whose aCIfhmrity during the progress of construction is 
defined. in the General Conditions and Supplementary Conditions. 
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1 ,Os IN wlrNES5 WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this Agreement the day and 
year first above w h t t ~ .  

(Sea!) 

I 

... 

'b&vSd OW, Regional Manacler - 
Printed Name end Title 

, -  

Attest (Signature) 

. . . . ._ . .. - .- 

TOTAL P . 2 8  


