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Ruth Nettles I 

From: Paula Mer  
Sent: 
To: 
cc: 
Subject: 

Monday, December 29,2003 4:04 PM 
Ruth Nettles 

. 

Jackie Gilchrist 
RE: TG037 1GINAL 

Yes. Make the effective da te  today.  

----- Original Message----- 
From: R u t h  Nettles 
Sent: Monday, December 29, 2003 3 : 5 2  PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TG037 

Hey, P a u l a .  I received a letter from Mr. Raymond Yauchler, he has submitted payment of $50 
for 2003 RAFs and he wishes to withdraw company as public telephone provider in Flor ida .  
Please let me know if we can open a docket. 


