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Kay Flynn
To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE: TG823 Pinecastle

Will do. Thanks.

From: Paula Isier

Sent: Tuesday, January 11, 2005 11:27 AM
To: Kay Flynn

Subject: RE: TG823 Pinecastle

Yes. They are paid up with this payment. Open a docket with an effective date of 12/31/04. Thanks.
----- Original Message-----

From: Kay Flynn

Sent: Tuesday, January 11, 2005 11:26 AM

To: Paula Isler

Subject: TG823 Pinecastle

Good morning...

We received 2004 RAF payment record from this company. On form was a sticky note saying they gave up
pay phone service in May 04....do we open a docket to cancel?

Kay
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