
From: Paula lsler 
Sent: 
To: Dorothy Menasco 
Subject: RE: THO1 5 

Thursday, March 03, 2005 4:32 PM 

Open a docket with an effective date of today. Thanks. 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Dorothy Menasco 
Sent: Thursday, March 03, 2005 3:46 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: THO15 

We have received a request to cancel the PATS certificate for Suzanne C. Brown. She sent payment of $103 for 
2004 and 2005, How shall I proceed? 
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