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Raquel Tully

From: Pauia Isler Q k:\g: “ df

Sent: Monday, May 16, 2005 8:18 AM K l L{

To: Raquel Tully Qh & 6 OOO o
. c

Subject: RE:

Yes. All to General Revenue Fund for Docket No. 040062-T1. 5’ 9”0 S‘

2T

From: Raquel Tully ,
Sent: Monday, May 16, 2005 7:17 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

We received a check for $5000.00 from New Century Telecom, is this a fine?
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