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From: Paula Isler

Sent: Thursday, June 16, 2005 8:38 AM
To: David Brown; Valorie Moore

Ce: Raquel Tully

Subject: FW: 040904-TI

I just checked and Ragquel wasn't in. Can one of you check to see if the payment was
received? The reason I need to know is that the deadline is tomorrow and if Records does
not have record of it this company's certificate will be cancelled. I forgot to give you
the company code - TJ153, Public Telephone Network, Inc. Thanks so much!

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Thursday, June 16, 2005 8:18 AM
To: Raquel Tully

Subject: 040904-TI

We were supposed to receive a $500 settlement from this company yesterday. I was told it
was sent by overnight delivery via DHL. Can you confirm we received it?
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