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c\h* \L\3b2 From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 
To: Raquel Tully 

Subject: RE: 

Monday, July 11,2005 9:48 AM 

Yes. 
1- 8 - 0 5  

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, July 11, 2005 9:47 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

Good Morning 

Received a check from New Century Telecom for $5000.00, is this a fine? 
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