
CL%S a a - - N  Dorothy Menasco 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
Tuesday, August  02,2005 1054 AM 
Dorothy Menasco 
RE: TJ195 anWX547 

Hello there. Yes, for TJ495 and TX547. Thanks! 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Dorothy Menasco 
Sent: Tuesday, August 02,2005 10:52 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TJ195 and TX547 

Hi Paula. 

I have a $100 payment record from VIVO-FLA requesting cancellation of certs for TJ195 and TX.547. Seeing 
as how TJ 195 is actually for a company called National Phone Corporation, I'm thinking VIVO-FLA meant to 
say TJ495. Should I proceed with opening dockets for these two? 
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