
A 
TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 0 113 112005 

TJ3 98-04-0-R 
First Communications, LLC 7 

3340 West Market Street , I  

Akron, OH 44333-3306 6 0 2 pgt, '1 

Docket No. 050706-TI 

Interexchange Company Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

, 

STATUS: 

- Actual Retum 
Estimated Return - Amended Retum 

- 

PERIOD COVERED: 
0 1 /O 1 /2004 TO 12/3 1 /2004 

Please Complete Below If Official Mailine Address Has Chanced 

FOR PSC USE ONLY 
Check# d3i39 j '1 
$ I49 II 06-03-001 

003001 
/ $  W i 7 &  

06-03-00 I 
00401 1 

I 
- 

Postmark Date d 3 - c )  i 
Initials ofpreparer R I- 

ame of Compan (Ci /State) (Zi 

FLOFUDA 
LINE NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION GROSS OPERATING REVENUE INTRASTATE REVENUE.. . 

1. Long Distance Services $ 990.2SI 

6. TOTAL Telephone Services $ ?sa ;76 3 

2. Access Services 
3. 
4. 
5 .  Miscellaneous Services 

Private Line Services 
Leased Facilities & Circuits Services 37 518 

( 67b ,4bX ) 
7. 

8. 
9. 
IO. 

12. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE 

LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies, 
(see "2. Fees" on back) 
TOTAL REVENUES For Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation 
Regulatory Assessment Fee Due (Multiply Line 8 by 0.001 5 )  
Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 49.78 

a4.m a78.7~ 11. Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

* These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable. CmA - 
AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336, FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE IS $50 CTR 

LlrK CURRENT COMPANY STATUS - 
( ) Facilities-Based Carrier ( ) Reseller ( ) Call Aggregator 
5 ) Alternate-Operator Service ( ) Rebiller [ ) Other: a- 

BILLING INFORMATION 
Complete below if billing agent if other than yourself. -- -- 

(Name) (Address: CityiStateiZip) (Telephone) 
What is the total amount of customer deposits collected? What is the total amount of bond held (if a-le)? 

Amount: $ for 19 Amount: $ Expires: - 
COMPANY INFORMATION 

Do you lease telecommunications' facilities? 
If YES, who do you lease these facilities from? 

( ) YES 
Name: 

( ) NO 
' 

, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above information is a true 
Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with the intent to mislead a public 

isdemeanor of the second degree. 

ccl.ltt.o\ Ler I % \ \  b s  
-(signature of Company Official) (Title) (Date) 

rrcfik \.-omanno Telephone Number 9 a 83 s A q 4 \  FaxNumber( I 

3+ imoae7 (Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 
F.E.I. No. 

PSCICMP-I53 (Rev Il / l i /99) I I :[I ! , ,  2-  ],.j SO 



Be heard. 

PHONE INTERNET WIRELESS 
Settlement Proposal 
Docket # 050706-TI 

December 1,2005 

Ms. Blanca Bay6 
Director 
Division of the Commission Clerk & Administrative Services 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tal lahassee, F L 323 99-0850 

Dear Ms. Bay6, 

Attached please find the First Communications 2004 Regulatory Assessiiient Fee Return. 
Also attached, please find a check for $278.76, which is payment in hll including the 
penalty and interest for late payment. 

First Communications sincerely regrets this oversight and has put into place the following 
steps to prevent a reoccurrence: 

0 The Public Utilities Commission has a new contact name and information. Now 
the RAF form will be sent to a specific person, Mary Cegelski, Manager of 
Regulatory Affairs. Confirmation via e-mail that this has been completed is 
attached. 

0 Internal meetings were held mapping out ownership for the completion of the 
form. Our Regulatory Department will own the form instead of Accounting. 
Regulatory will work with Accounting for the revenue information. An 
Accounting point of contact has been assigned to gather the revenue details. 

In addition, First Communications respectfully requests that you accept a settlement offer 
of $200. Please contact me at (330) 835-2272 with any questions. 

Sincerelv. 

Mary Cegelski 
Manager of Regulatory Affairs; Carrier Relations 

Enc. 
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Raquel Tully 

From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 
To: Raquel Tully 

Subject: RE: 

Monday, December 05,2005 8:05 AM 

Yes, it is OK to deposit. Please send Records proof of payment and the settlement proposal. Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, December 05, 2005 8:OO AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

First Communications(TJ398) Docket 050706-ti sent a check in for $278.76, for Raf and P&l. They ask that you 
accept a $200.00 settlement fee, but did not send this check in. Can I deposit this money? 


