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David Brown ~ 

From: Paula lsler $12.5o-p 
-4; 3.50-= Sent: 

To: David Brown 

Subject: RE: TX750-Smart Network Solutions (Docket # 050628-TX) 

Thursday, December 01,2005 155 PM 

/ I  -23 45 
Yes. w 
From: David Brown 
Sent: Thursday, December 01, 2005 1:27 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TX75O-Smart Network Solutions (Docket # 050628-TX) 

Paula, 
we received a check in the amount of $66.00 to pay for 2004 past due RAF and P&l. There is a docket involved. 
Can we go ahead and deposit this check? Thanks and please advise .... 


