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TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2066

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return

Florida Public Service Commission FOR PSC USE ONLY
STATUS: {See Filing Instructions on Back of Form) Check # /?Z;
___ Actual Return THO010-05-0-R $ JD JO 06-03-001
___ Estimated Return Tommy Page - EZ Link 003001
____ Amended Return 6901 Cranberry Drive $ P
New Port Richey, FL. 34653-4590 06-03-001
PERIOD COVERED: 004011
01/01/2005 TO 12/31/2005 SmPUoiT DAY $ I
' N0
6 0 5 DEC 2 8 200 Postmark Date _/ o2/ E%@‘j
W Initials of Preparer m
Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed
(Name of Company) (Address) (City/State) (Zip)
LINE
NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION AMOUNT
1. Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) $ ﬂ
2. Gross Intrastate Revenue 0
3. LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies
(see "2. Fees" on back) : ( )
4. TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation ' ‘
(Line 2 less Line 3) $

5. Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0020)

6.  Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back)

7.  Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back)

8.  Extension Payment Fee (see "4. Extension" on back)

9. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE (MINIMUM $50.00) s_ 44 o0 o

10. Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered by )

this Return /17@2 @W P 568
s 3#05‘ M o
(1) These amounts mus| ntrastate only and must be verifiable (see "2 Fees" on back)

(2) Regardless of the gross operating revenue of a company, a minimurn annual regulatory assessment fee of $50 shall be imposed as provided in
Section 364.336, Florida Statutes.

1, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief [h.e abo.ve
information is g true and correct statement. .1 am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with
Mlcad a pub]@ant in the performance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree.

-3 L. U8/ [Z2-22-05~

(Si e of Cogipany Official) (Title) (Date)
— .
Z 0 M M t/¢ 7?‘] G:E Telephone Number  ( ) Fax Number { )
4 (Preparer of/Forfn - Please Print Name) DOCUMENT M Lin -DATE
I F.E.I. No.
LA [ T936 DT T
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You will need to send an actual written letter to the Commission, send it to: /

Florida Public Service Commission
Blanca Bayo, Commission Clerk
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL 32399

Mr. Page,

Request that "Tommy Page d/b/a Tommy Page - EZ Link, Certifi 08" be
cancelled effective 12/31/05, the Company is no longer in busingss. State that you have

&rciosed the $50, 2005 Régulatory Assessment Fee (RAF) for Company Code THO10.

With this information, the Clerk will open a cancellation docket, the RAF fee will be paid up
for 2005 and your certificate will be cancelled effective 12/31/05. You will no longer owe
any fees, etc... to the Commission and your certificate will be cancelled in good standing.
Try to get this letter in the mail so it is date stamped in 2005.

I am sorry it didn't work out. It was a good idea and | was also interested in the concept. It
is ashame that such scam operators manage to do this to folks and seemly get away with it
scott free.

If you have any questions, please contact me.

- Take Care and Happy Holidays,

Toni Joy McCoy

Regulatory Analyst

Florida Public Service Commission
Bureau of Market Development
TMCCOY@PSC.STATE.FL.US
850/413-6532 Direct Line

850/413-6533 Fax Line

From: Marshall / Tommy [mailto:tpage002@tampabay.rr.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 20, 2005 3:04 PM

To: Toni McCoy

Subject: Assessment Fee

From: Toni McCoy

Date: 12/21/05 10:49:04

To: Marshall / Tommy
Subject: RE: Assessment Fee

Hi Toni, This is Tommy Page -EZ Link. | have closed down my lntemet-Kic;'éRLmaYc:h‘ijr)es. I
could not get them to work and the company that sold them to me and hundreds of other
investors was a bunch of scam artists. The Pantheon Holding Group from Miami FL.

12/21/2005



