REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET
(Please Type)

Date: | 12/29/2005 Docket No.: | (COOQ 75 - (.

1. Division Name/Staff Name: | Division Of Competitive Markets & Enforcement/Isler

2. OPR: | Division Of The Commission Clerk And Administrative Services

3. OCR: | Office Of The General Counsel

4. Suggested Docket Title: | Request for cancellation of PATS Certificate No. 7877 by Tommy Page d/bfa Tommy Page

- EZ Link, effective December 27, 2005.

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)
A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company.

B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.)

1. Parties and their representatives (if any):

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any):

6. Check one:

Documentation is attached.

E Documentation will be provided with recommendation.
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COMPANY IDENTIFICATION

Printed on 12/29/2005 at 10:

14:37 by PJI

Complete Name: Tommy Page d/b/a Tommy Page - EZ Link

Mailing Name: Tommy Page - EZ Link

Company Code: THO10

FEID Number:

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2005 THROUGH 12/31/2005

Reg. Date: 09/08/2004 Inactive Date:
Service: PAT - Pay Telephone

Received: Actual RAF Form

Status: Satisfied

Amended: No Extension: No
Frozen: No Comments: No

Payment Count: 1 Payment Made to Date

Operating Rev: $0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00
RAF Rate: 0.0020 Net RAF Due: $50.00
Assessment Due Paid Owe

RAF $50.00 $50.00 $0.00
Penalty $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Interest $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Extension Fee $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $50.00 $50.00 $0.00

Last modification was

made on Wednesday, December

TOMMY PAGE D/B/A TOMMY PAGE - EZ LINK (THO010}
Industry: Telecommunications, Service provided: PAT

Company type: Pay Telephone Companies
Regulation date: 09/08/2004, Inactive date:
Certificate number: 8508, County:

Company liaison: Tommy Page, Owner

Mailing address:
6901 Cranberry Drive

New Port Richey, FL. 34653-4590

Location address:

28, 2005 at 1:34 PM by David Brown

6901 Cranberry Drive

New Port Richey,

E-mail address: tpageO02®@tampabay.rr.com

Web site:

Phone number: (727) 505-

Fax number:

2929

Period covered: 01/0:1/2005 through 12/31/2005

Operating rev:

$0.00 Gross intrastate rev:

Documents: Actual RAF form received on 12/22/2005
RAF form mailed on 12/01/2005
Postmarked Trans Date Date Posted-By Dep # Check #

12/22/2005 12/28/2005
RAF paid

12/28/2005-DBR LF&§05 1973
LF605

FL. 34653-459%0

RAF rate: 0.0020
$50.00

Check Amount
$50.00
$50.00
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Mr. Page, .

You will need to send an actual written letter to the Commission, send it to:

Florida Public Service Commission mp

Blanca Bayo, Commission Clerk
2540 Shumard Oak Bivd.
Tallahassee, FL 32399

Request that "Tommy Page d/b/a Tommy Page - EZ Link, Certifi 08" be

cancelled effective 12/31/05, the Company is no longer in business, State that you have
Enclosed the $50, 2005 Regulatory Assessment Fee (RAF) for Company Code THO10.

With this information, the Clerk will open a cancellation docket, the RAF fee will be paid up
for 2005 and your certificate will be cancelled effective 12/31/05. You will no longer owe
any fees, etc... to the Commission and your certificate will be cancelled in good standing.
Try to get this letter in the mail so it is date stamped in 2005. '

| am sorry it didn't work out. It was a gooa; idea and | was also interested in the concept. It
is ashame that such scam operators manage to do this to folks and seemly get away with it
scott free. ;

if you have any' questions, please contact me.

Take Care and Happy Holidays,

Toni Joy McCoy

Regulatory Analyst

Florida Public Service Commission
Bureau of Market Development
TMCCOY@PSC.STATE.FL.US
850/413-6532 Direct Line

850/413-6533 Fax Line

From: Marshall / Tommy [mailto:tpage002@tampabay.rr.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 20, 2005 3:04 PM

To: Toni McCoy

Subject: Assessment Fee

From: Toni McCoy

Date: 12/21/05 10:49:04

To: Marshall / Tommy
Subject: RE: Assessment Fee

Hi Toni, This is Tommy Page -EZ Link. [ have closed down my Intemet-Kigé‘k\mé(Chjpes. |
could not get them to work and the company that sold them to me and hundreds of other
investors was a bunch of scam artists. The Pantheon Holding Group from Miami FL.

12/21/2005



Company Code:
Complete Name:
Mailing Name:
Certificate No(s):
Status:
Regulation Date:
Bankruptcy:

Company Liaison #1:

Title:
Mailing Address:

Physical Location:

Phone:
Fax:
Related Dockets:

040538-TC

MCD Company Information for TH010

Printed on 12/29/2005 at 10:17:18 by PJI

THO10

Tommy Page d/b/a Tommy Page - EZ Link
Tommy Page - EZ Link

8508

Active

09/08/2004

No

Tommy Page

Owner

6901 Cranberry Drive

New Port Richey, FL 34653-4590
6901 Cranberry Drive

New Port Richey, FL. 34653-4590
(727) 505-2929

Application for certificate to provide pay telephone service by

Tommy Page d/b/a Tommy Page - Ei) Link.



