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Raquel Tully 

From: Paula Isler 
Sent: 
To: Raquel Tully 

Subject: RE: 

Monday, January 09,2006 3:05 PM 

6 0 8  JAN I 

2. The $50 is 2005 RAF for American Farm Bureau, Inc. d/b/a The Farm Bureau Connection (TJ383). It can be 
deposited as you normally would. Thanks. 

-- .... . ., . . , . . , . I  . , ,. , ,.,..,.,, . .. . ,, .,. ,.. , . . , " ,,,.,,..I, ~ ~ ~ , ,  ,,o, 5" ~ , , From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, January 09,2006 11:40 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 
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w I have a question pertaining to two checks. 

We received a $1 0,000.00 check from Network Communications, Order #psc-05-0967. Is this a fine? 

Also we received a $50.OOcheck for Docket 050906-Tl, is this okay to deposit? 

1 /9/2006 
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NClC Operator Services 
P.O. Box 551 

Longview, TX 75601 
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