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January 11 , 2006 

Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd., 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
Attention: Fiscal Services 

-'- 

Re: Docket No. 050649-TC 

To whom it may concem: 

On' behalf of my client, Daytona International Speedway, LLC, formerly Daytona 
International Speedway, Inc. (collectively referred to herein as "DIS"), and in connection 
with Docket No. 050649-TC, enclosed please find the following: (1) the Pay Telephone 
Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Retum form for DIS for the 2004 
Regulatory Assessment Fee, together with a check in the amount of $1,068.50 as 
p a p e n t  for (i) the 2004 Regulatory Assessment Fee in the amount of $50.00, (ii) the 
$12.50 penalty and $6.00 interest charges that were unpaid related to the 2004 Regulatory 
Assessment Fee and (iii) the $1,000 fine that was imposed on DIS by the Florida Public 
Service Commission (the Tornmission") related to the 2004 Regulatory Assessment Fee; 
and (2) the Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee R e m  form for 
DIS for the 2005 Regulatory Assessment Fee, together with a check in the amount of 
$50.00 for payment of the 2005 Regulatory Assessment Fee. 

By way of background, DIS was granted Pay Telephone Certificate No. 543 on Jmuary 
28, 1986. Through an oversight and clerical error, the 2004 fee was not paid, which 
resulted in the penalties and fines described above. Upon payment of the fees, as well as 
the penalties and fines, the matter should be concluded as described in the Order of the 

CMP Commission. To resolve this docket, DIS respecthlly requests that the Commission 
accept the attached amount of $1,068.50. Additionally, DIS requests that the Commission CQM 
accept the attached amount of $50.00 as payment of the 2005 Regulatory Assessment 

CTR F e e .  
ECR 

y a s t l y ,  DTS hereby requests that Pay Telephone Certificate No. 543 is cancelled by the ''' -Commission at the earliest possible date and that the Commission takes arl necessary acts 
OPC in order to cancel such certificate. The reason for such request of cancellation is that DIS 

RCA 
will be removing the pay telephones on its property- 

SCR 



Given the importance to DIS of the matters discussed herein, please call me as soon as 
possible at (3 86) 681 -5 164 should there be any difficulties resolving the matters 
discussed herein or if you should need Eurther information. Thank you for your prompt 
attention to this matter. 

On behalf of Daytona Intemational 
Speedway, LLC 

Cc: Paula Isler, Florida Public Service Commission 
Bob Shafto, Director Communication Technology 
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Raquel Tully 

From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 
To: Raquel Tully 
Subject: RE: Docket No. 050649-TC 

Wednesday, January 18,2006 9:46 AM 

The $1,000 should be broken down as $200 for collection (PSC Trust Fund) and the balance of $800 to General 
Revenue Fund. The RAFs payment can be deposited as you normally would. Please provide Records proof of 
payment. Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Wednesday, January 18,2006 9:09 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

We received a $1000.00 ck for docket 050649, Company Code TC 458. They also paid 2004 Raf and P&l, and 
2005 Raf, How would you like me to d the breakdown for the $1000.00 

Thanks 



_. 
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TO AVOID PENAL'I"y AND INTEREST CHARGES, REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE REIWFW MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE OU30/2006 

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

STATUS: 
#- Actual Return - 

Estimated Return 
Amended Return 

- 
- 
PERIOD COVERED: 
01/01/2005 TO 12/31/2005 

Florida Public Service Commission 

TC458-05-0-R 
Daytona International Speedway, Inc. 
1801 West International Speedway Blvd. 
DaytonaBeach, FL 32114-1215 

I I 

Please Complete BeIow If Official Mailing Address Has Changed 

FOR PSC USE ONLY 

heck # _bo2 a q37 
06-03-001 

003001 

P 
06-03-00 1 

00401 1 
I 

JstmarkDate /-I700 6 
itials of Prepaxer 

(Name of Company) (Address) (City/State) (Zip) 

LINE 
NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION - 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

6. 

7. 

8. 

9. 

so. 

Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) 

Gross Intrastate Revenue 

LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies 
(see "2. Fees" on back) 
TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation 
(Line 2 less Line 3) 

Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0020) 

Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

hterest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date'' on back) 

Extension Payment Fee (see "4. Extension" on back) 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE (lWNMUM $50.00) 

Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered by 
this Return 

AMOUNT 

5 

(1) These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable (see "2. Fees" on back). 
(2) Regardless of the gross operating revenue of a company, a mini" annual regulatory assessment fee of $50 shall be imposed as provided in 

Section 364.336, Florida Statutes. 

I, the undersigned ownedofficer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my.kuowledge and belief the above 
that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a fdse statement in Writing with 
of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree. 

/ (Title) @ate> 
5eC3i-L 

(Signature ofcolzipaby Official) 

Telephone Number q q q - b w  FaxNumber (36($ ?97-&Wy 
(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 

F.E.I. No. 57 - 3csaiqa 
PSC/CMP 026 (Rev. 01/05) 



TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT F!5E RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 0 1/3 1/2005 

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

STATUS: 

% ActualReturn 
- Estimated Return 
- Amended Return 

PERIOD COVERED: 
01/01/2004 TO 12/3 1/2004 

Florida Public Service Commission 
(See F&UE Instructions on Back ofForm) 

TC45 8 -04 - 0 -R 
Daytona International Speedway, Inc. 
180 1 West International Speedway El~q.~ 
Daytona Beach, FL 32114-1215-' 

rdA 

~~~ ~ 

Please ComDIete Below If Official Mailine Address Has Changed 

FOR PSC USE ONLY 
Check# 0 030 YL 7 
$ 50.00 06-03-001 

00300 I 
$, 12. sw p 

06-03-001 
0040 1 1 

$ 6.CJO I 

' N a m e  of Company) (Address) (City/State) (Zip) 

LINE 
- NO. 

1. 

2. 
3. 

4. 

5. 

6. 

7. 

.. 8. 

9. 

ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION AMOUNT 
Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) $ -0 fl  

Gross Intrastate Revenue -0" 
LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies * -0- 1 
(see "2. Fees" on back) 

TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation $ -01- 
(Line 2 less Lbe 3) 

Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.00 15) 

Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) &r/lat&, f6, 6 0  
$ /,068*5Q 

#loo& 40 fidd TOTAL AMOUNT DUE 

AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MXNXMUM ANNUAL FEE IS $50 

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AM) RE"F,D WGARDLESS OF TEIE AMOUNT OF REVENUES REPORTED 

Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered I[ 
by this Retum 

* These amounts must bt intrastate only and must be verifiable. 

I, the undersigned ownedoffiwt of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and decIare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above information is a me and 
correct statement I am aware thatp-t to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writin~witb the intent to mislead a uublic servant in the 

PSC/CMP-26 m.1 YlU99) 


