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Raquel Tully O§O 19Y ‘TI ,
From: Paula lsler n‘Q!—G]—N’A‘

Sent:  Monday, April 10, 2006 3:57 PM R T e
To: Raquel Tully 6 A 3 APP ]

F S

Subject: RE: R

weit st [ATE

£ 9nne

Each are settlements and should be deposited in the PSC Trust Fund for collection costs.

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Monday, April 10, 2006 3:28 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

Good Afternoon,
I received the following checks, please tell me how you want me to deposit them

Docket 050787-TJ927, $100.00

Docket 050782-MLC Telcorp $100.00

Docket 050794 United Telecmu $100.00 ¥

Docket 050786 CCD Communications $100.00

Docket 050743 System Tech ~ $100.00 Q\( Ny L as!
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www. USPS com  EO 918 454 609 US 0144 0000 0803 2309
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04/07/06 Olb8oz Mailed from33166 071V00503274

USPS EXPRESS MAIL®

-~ MATTHEW SCHULMAN
- REGNUM GROUP
7999 NW 53RD ST
MIAMI FL 33166-4603
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to: PAULA ISLER
' FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
DIV. OF COMPETITIVE MARKETS & ENFORCE.
2540 SHUMARD OAK BLVD

_TALLAHASSEE FL 32399-7_01 9
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Insurance Fee




