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: From: Paulalsler S STAUST DAt Q)(ﬁ 2 4 R =
Sent:  Tuesday, August 01, 2006 8:24 AM Mkl AT - "
T4 :
To: Raquel Tully 670 AUG 05 200 Cxd 200 .
Subject: RE:

200.00 Fne

7-3\ole
Good morning. Concerning Affordable Phone Services, Inc. dfb/a High Tech Communications - TKO02 - Piease deposit $9 for 2005
P&l as you normally would. Please deposit $200 in the PSC Trust F

und for collection costs and the balance of $300 in the General
Revenue Fund. Please provide Records proof of payment for Docket No. 060466-T1. Thanks.

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Tuesday, August 01, 2006 8:07 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

I received a check for $509.00 from Affordable Ph. Services, Docket # 060466. Please tell me how to deposit the check.
Thanks

DOCUMENT HUMBER*DATEZ
0699Y AUG-kS

* £pSC-COMMISSION CLERK
2006



