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Raquel Tully OR| G! NAL

Toial 8 3 081. 05

From: Paula lsler I Q1Q~H 7 8%

Sent:  Tuesday, August 08, 2006 4:01 PM

To: Ragquel Tully 672 RUGTOnne C ¥ Do .00 T, Fud
Subject: RE: 206.c0  Fno

-0
TX364 is Interactive Services Network, Inc. d/b/a ISN Telcom. It appears $3.00 is for late payment of the 2001 RAF. The $3 should
be deposited as you normally would P&I. Please deposit $200 in the PSC Trust Fund for collection costs and the $300 balance in
the General Revenue Fund. Please provide Records proof of payment for Docket No. 060462-TX. Y

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Tuesday, August 08, 2006 3:37 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

Sorry, | have one more TX364 for $3031.05. They have $1915.19 going to Raf and $612.86 going to P&l
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