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Raquel Tully 
r- --- , , , ,, , , .---.--- ---- . ~ _ _ _  , , , , 

From: Paula ISkr 

Sent: 
To: Raquel Tully 

cc: Melinda Watts; Ray Kennedy 

Subject: RE: 

Tuesday, September 19,2006 2:49 PM 

Deposit all in the General Revenue Fund. Please provide Records proof of payment for Docket No. 050954-TX. Thanks 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Tuesday, September 19, 2006 2:17 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

'lease let me know the break down for Docket 050954-TX, MTG Corp for $41 6.67 

Thanks 
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PRESS HARD. YOU ARE MAKING 3 COPIES. 
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