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From: Valorie Moore 

Sent: 
To: Raquel Tully 

Subject: FW: 

O@i% -Q s Monday, October 30,2006 656 AM 

/O-dJ--OQ Water and Wastewater don’t have collection fees, deposit it into general revenue if it a fine . 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Friday, October 27, 2006 3:53 PM 
To: Valorie Moore 
Subject: FW: 
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From: Paula Isler =?e 
Sent: Friday, October 27,2006 2:49 PM 
To: Raquel Tully c.. 

Subject: RE: w {-:a 

Who should I send this to 
z - --”. 

That‘s a water and wastewater utility. You’ll need to check with someone else. Sorry. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Friday, October 27, 2006 2:08 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject : 

I received a check from Useppa Utility Company, Inc. for $1 000.00. Please tell me how to deposit this 
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