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Documentation is attached. 

0 Documentation will be provided with recommendation. 
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Paula lsler 

From: lonnie gilbert [Itrain9@yahoo.com] 

Sent: 
To: Paula Mer 

Subject: Re: ZoTel, Inc. (TG684) 

Thursday, December 07,2006 7 5 1  PM 

I would like to cancel Zotel, Inc Public Service Commissi n Certificate to operate payphones in the State of Florida. I am 
cancelling my Certificate because Zotel, Inc is no longer in the business of providing payphone service in the State of 
Florida. I also have dissolved my corporation. 

Alonzo Gilbert 

Paula Isler <PIsler@PSC.STATE.FL. US> wrote: 

I Dear Mr. Gilbert: 

This is a follow up to our telephone conversation today concerning your 
pay telephone certificate. As I explained, in March 2006, this 
Commission received your check for $106. Of that amount, $56 was 
applied to the 2005 Regulatory Assessment Fee and late payment charges 
and the balance of $50 was applied to the 2006 fee. From our 
conversation, it is my understanding you wish to cancel your 
certificate. If that is the case, we must receive something from you in 
writing. Therefore, please respond to this e-mail by requesting 
cancellation of ZoTel's certificate and give the reason why (such as no 
longer in the payphone business, etc.). As soon as a response is 
received, a docket will be established to grant you a voluntary 
cancellation. Thanks. 

Paula Isler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(85 0) 4 1 3 -65 02-Phone 
(850) 4 13-6503-Fax 
PIsler@psc.state. fl.us 

Want to start your own business? Learn how on Yahoo! S-mall. Business. 

12/8/2006 
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Paula lsler 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
Thursday, December 07,2006 150 PM 
'Itrain9@yahoo.com' 
ZoTel, Inc. (TG684) 

Dear Mr. Gilbert: 

This is a follow up to our telephone conversation today concerning your pay telephone 
certificate. As I explained, in March 2006, this Commission received your check €or $106. 
Of that amount, $56 was applied to the 2005 Regulatory Assessment Fee and late payment 
charges and the balance of $50 was applied to the 2006 fee. From our conversation, it is 
my understanding you wish to cancel your certificate. If that is the case, we must 
receive something from you in writing. Therefore, please respond to this e-mail by 
requesting cancellation of ZoTel's certificate and give the reason why (such as no longer 
in the payphone business, etc.). As soon as a response is received, a docket will be 
established to grant you a voluntary cancellation. Thanks. 

Paula Isler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
( 85 0 )  4 13 -65 02 -Phone 
( 8 5 0 )  413-6503-Fax 
PIsler@psc.state.fl.us 
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MCD Company Information for TG684 

Printed on 12/20/2006 at 13:45:08 by PJI 

Company Code: TG684 
Complete Name: ZoTel, Inc. 
Mailing Name: ZoTel, Inc. 
Certificate No(s): 7389 
Status: Active 
Regulation Date: 05/10/2000 
Bankruptc : No 

Title: 
Mailing Address: 

Physical Location: 

President 
2210 N.W. 192nd Terrace 

0 a Locka, FL 33056-2627 
2f10 N. W. 192nd Terrace 

Company iI. iaison #1: Alonzo Benjamin Gilbert, II 

Phone: 
Fax: 

Opa Locka, FL 33056-2627 
(305) 975-3568 

Related Dockets: 

Ap lication for certificate to provide pay telephone service by 
Zo el, Inc. .F 000225-TC 
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