REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET
{Please Type)

Date: 1/25/2007

Docket No.:

OT1ooTTT AC.

1. Division Name/Staff Name: Divisidn Of Competitive Markets & Enforcement/Isler

2. OPR: Division Of The Commission Clerk And Administrative Services

3. OCR: | Office Of The General Counsel

4. Suggested Docket Title: | Request for canceliation of PATS Certificate No. 111 by Centratel Services international,

Inc., effective December 31, 2006.

5. Suggested Docket Malling List (attach separate sheet if necessary)
A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company.

B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.)

1. Partles and their representatives (if any):

2. Interested persons and their representatives

(if any):

6. Check one:

{ Documentation is attached.

[1 Documentation will be provided with recommendation.

DOCUMEKRT RUMBIR -[ATT

PSC\CCA 010-C (Rev. 07/04)

00784 Jnass
Grest.doc
FPSC-COMMISSION CLERK




COMPANY IDENTIFICATION
Printed on 01/25/2007 at 08:22:54 by PJI

Complete Name: Centratel Services International, Inc.

Mailing Name: Centratel Services International, Inc.

Company Code: TC029

FEID Number:

59-2143550

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2006 THROUGH 12/31/2006

Reg. Date: 08/27/1985 Inactive Date:

Service: PAT -~ Pay Telephone

Received: Actual RAF Form

Status: Satisfied

Amended: No Extension: ¥No

Frozen: No Comments: No

. Payment Count: ]l Payment Made to Date
Operating Rev: $0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00
RAF Rate: 0.0020 Net RAF Due: $50.00
Assessment Due Paid Owe

RAF $50.00 $50.00 $0.00
Penalty $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Interest $0.00 $0.00 $50.00
Extenaion Fee $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $50.00 $50.00 $0.00

Last modification was

made on Friday, January 19, 2007 at 8:45 AM by David Brown




Paula Isler

From: Paula Isler
Sent: Tuesday, January 09, 2007 3:48 PM
To: - 'mschneider@centratel.net’

Subject: TC029 - Centratel Services International, Inc.

Dear Ms: Schneider:

The Commission received your letter today via fax asking how to "stop being required to
file" the annual Regulatory Assessment Fee return since you stated the company has not
operated any payphones in a few years.

All a company has to do is request cancellation of their certificate in writing, provide
the reason why, and pay the current year's Regulatory Assessment Fee. Therefore, as soon
as the 2006 Regulatory Assessment Fee return form and the minimum $50 payment is received,
I will open a docket to vecluntarily cancel Centraltel’s pay telephone certificate and will
use your faxed letter as the written regquest for cancellation.

Just as information, I pulled the company's 2005 Regulatcry Assessment Fee return to see
if there was a letter attached or a note on the form requesting cancellation, but there
was not. The 2006 return form and minimum fee must be received by January 30th for the
company not to be responsible for the 2007 fee.

Please confirm that you are requesting cancellation and if you are, please advise when we
can expect the form and $50 fee. Let me know if you have any questicns.

Paula Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard ©Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850

(850) 413-6502-Phone

{850) 413-6503-Fax
PIsler@psc.state.fl.us



Paula Isler

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Tuesday, January 09, 2007 2:22 PM
To: David Brown

Subject: RE: 727 319 0255, 2 page(s)

David, Il respond to her but before | do, please advise what they sent in for 2005 (they paid 2005 RAF, P&l - except 50
cents) and it says a RAF return was received but there is nothing scanned. | would like to see what they sent before
contacting them. Thanks.

From: David Brown

Sent: Tuesday, January 09, 2007 2:10 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: FW: 727 319 0255, 2 page(s)

Paula, please take a look at this. Thanks....

From: Valorie Moore

Sent: Tuesday, January 09, 2007 12:43 PM
To: David Brown

Subject: FW: 727 319 0255, 2 page(s)

| Believe this is yours.

From: NET SatisFAXtion

Sent: None

To: Valorie Moore

Subject: 727 319 0255, 2 page(s)

You have received a new fax. This fax was received by NET SatisFAXtion. The fax is attached to the message. Open
the attachment to view your fax.

Received Fax Details

Received On: 1/09/2007 12:39 PM
Number of Pages: 2

From {CSID): 727 319 0255

From ({ANI):

Sent to DID: 6276

Duration of Fax: 0:01:04
Transfer Speed: 9600

Received Status: Unsustainable connection (Errcr: {455 Extended: 0000}
Number of Errors: 1
Port Received On: RockForceGCTO+ Port 7

<< File: FAX.TIF >>



- FROM : FHONE NO. : 727 319 8255 Jan. B9 2087 B1:24PM P1

Centratel Services Intl Inc
11193 Seminole Blvd
Largo, FL 33778
727-319-0671
727-319-0255 Fax
Florida Public Service Commission -
Attn: Paula Isler
850-413-6268 fax
Dear Ms, Isler:

Centratel Services Intl Inc TC029-06-0-R
11193 Seminole Blvd
Largo, FL 33778-3232

We no longer have any payphones in operation and have not had any payphones in
operation for a few years,

‘What must I do to stop being required to file that attached Pay Telephone Service
Provider Return each year.

Please Advise

Qe Sean D

Michelle Schoeider
727-318.0671
mschneider@centratel net



FROM : PHONE NO. @ 727 319 8255 Jan. 99 2007 B1:25PM P2

T AVOUI PENALTY AND INTEREXT CHARGES, THE REGUIATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2007

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return

Florida Public Service Commission FOR PSC USE ONLY
STATUS (Sz¢ Viling Instructiong pn Back of Korm) Check #
__ Actual Return TC029-06-0-R s 06-03-001
____ Fstimated Retarn Centratel Services International, Inc. 003001
___ Amended Return 11193 Seminole Blvd. . J——
Largo, FL 33778-3232 5 P 0603001

PERIOD COVERED: . 004011
01/01/2006 TO 12/3112006 5 !

Postmark Date

Initials of Preparer

‘ Pleig;g Complete Below If Offtckit Mailing Address Has Changed

N e e e PR . P LI . .- DT ey

(Name of Company) {Address) (City/State) Zip)
LINE _ -
NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION AMOUNT

1.  Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) ' | $ 22

2 I Tanbvnntondn TV mevasaesn : . m‘ﬁ -




. TOAVEID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2006

) Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return

, Florida Public Service Commission FOR PSC USE ONLY
STATUS: (See Filing Instructions on Back of Form) Check # £; g\ C:‘
___ Actual Return TC029-05-0-R $_SO. Cien 06-03-001
____ Estimated Return Centratel Services International, Inc. 003001
____Amended Return 11193 Seminole Blvd. $_ .S P
Largo, FL 33778-3232 : 06-03-001
PERIOD COVERED: o . 004011
01/01/2005 TO 12/31/2005 Ges o 11 RATE $ I
6 3 2 MAR 0O 1'2006 " |Postmark Date 2~ @ 4- Ola
Initials of Preparer _gi_
Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed
(Name of Company) (Address) (City/State) | (Zip)
LINE
NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION AMOUNT

1. Gross Operating Revenue (Florida)
2. Gross Intrastate Revenue

" 3. LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommumcatlons Compames oo

(see "2. Fees" onback) )
4. TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation
(Line 2 less Line 3)
5. Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0020)
6.  Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) t:Q : 5@
7.  Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 95 O
8. Extension Payment Fee (see "4. Extension" on back)
‘ o
9. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE (MINIMUM $50.00) $ ﬂ oy @
10.  Number of pay telephonés in operation at close of period covered by : Q 5
this Return

(1) These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable (see "2. Fees" on back).
(2) Regardless of the gross operating revenue of a company, a minimum annual regulatory assessment fee of $50 shall be imposed as provided in
Section 364 336 Flonda Statutes D e

<

I, the undersigned: owmer/dificer‘of the ‘above-named company, have tead the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowfé‘dg'e" and belief the abave
mformauon is;a-trug:; and corregt statement. 1 .amyaware- that pyrsuant:to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement.in writing with
ny to mislead ervant in the performance of his official duty shall be guilty of & tmisdemeanor of the second degree.

(Slgnature of Company Ofﬁcxal) (Title) (Date)

Telephone Number 17.;2 7)5/ %é?) Fax Number (70'27) 3[? - 0&5 f
F.E.L No. 5q -/ f 3 SSO

(Preparer of Form - Pleas¢ Print Name)

PSC/CMP 026 (Rev. 01/05)



P

c.

v 5T PETERSBURG

24 FEB 2006 PM e

ATTN: FISCAL

FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION .
2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULEVARD -
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0876






