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ORIGINAL 
From: Paula Mer 

Sent: 
To: Raquel Tully 

cc: Kiwanis Curry 

Subject: RE: 060619-TX 

Monday, February 26,2007 8:55 AM 

Good morning. Please deposit all $500 in the General Revenue Fund and provide proof of payment to Records so that it can 
documented in Docket No. 060619-TX. Thanks. 

u&q-&;g &qE From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, February 26, 2007 8:46 AM 
To: Paula Isler 7 2 5 FE8 li 7 2007 
Subject: 

We received a ck for $500.00 on Docket 060619-TX. Please let me know the breakdown. 

Thanks 
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T E L E C O M  
4 W Las Olas Blvd. 9* Floor 
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301 
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