
Raquel 

From: 
Sent: 

To : 

cc: 

Subject: 

Tully C 

Paula Mer 

Friday, April 06, 2007 9:14 AM 

Raquel Tully 

Kiwanis Curry 

RE: 

Happy Friday to you, too! Please deposit all $500 in the General Revenue Fund and provide the Commission Clerk proof of 
payment for documentation in Uocket No. 06061 9-TX. Thanks. 

_.-.- __I , , ,  _I__ - - ,  , ,  ,, --- 
From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Friday, April 06, 2007 8:58 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

Happy Friday! 

I received a $500.00 check for Docket 06061 9-TX, from North America Telecommunications, How would you like me to apply this? 

4/6/2007 



T E L E C O M  
4 W Las Olas Blvd. 9* Floor 
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301 


