

REDACTED

ORIGINAL

070001-EI

Exhibit B

REDACTED

- CMP _____
- COM _____
- CTR _____
- ECR 1
- GCL _____
- OPC _____
- RCA _____
- SCR _____
- SGA _____
- SEC _____
- OTH _____

DOCUMENT NUMBER-DATE

05355 JUL-25

FPSC-COMMISSION CLERK

D Coal Summary Sheet

Summary

REDACTED

Attachment A
 Response to Staff's 1st Interrogs (No. 1)
 Docket No. 070001-EI

| Submission Date | Supplier | Contract Identifier (PFC/FEB2006-xx) | Mine | Term | Origin | Per Month short Tons | short ton Price | Transp Mode |
|---------------------------|----------------------------------|--------------------------------------|----------------|------|----------|----------------------|-----------------|-------------|
| 2.15.06 | National Coal | 23 | NO BID | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | K&P Mining | 24 | NO BID | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | PS Energy Group | 25 | NO BID | | | | | |
| 2007 Import D Bids | | | | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | Glencore LTD | 22a | La Jagua | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Glencore LTD | 22b | La Jagua | 2007 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Glencore LTD | 22c | La Jagua | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Glencore LTD | 22d | La Jagua | 2007 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Coal Trade Int. | 20 | Australia | 2007 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Interocean Coal Sales (Drummond) | 14 | Mina Pribbenow | 2007 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Inter-American Coal, Inc. | 9 | Mina Norte | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Coal Marketing Co. | 18 | Cerrejon | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Oxbow Carbon Minerals | 6 | Columbian | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Emerald Coal | 13 | Russian Coal | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | PT Adaro Indonesia | 2 | Tutupan | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Suek AG | 27c | various Suek | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Suek AG | 27a | various Suek | 2007 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------------------------|----------------------------------|-----|--------------------|------|----------|------------|---------------|-------|
| 2.15.06 | MIR Trade AG | 28a | n/a | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | MIR Trade AG | 28b | n/a | 2007 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| late 2.15.06 | PT Kideco Jaya Agung | 30 | Pasir / Batukajang | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2008 Import D Bids | | | | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | Glencore LTD | 22a | La Jagua | 2008 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Glencore LTD | 22b | La Jagua | 2008 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Glencore LTD | 22c | La Jagua | 2008 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Glencore LTD | 22d | La Jagua | 2008 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Coal Trade Int. | 20 | Australia | 2008 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Interocean Coal Sales (Drummond) | 14 | Mina Pribbenow | 2008 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | PT Adaro Indonesia | 2 | Tutupan | 2008 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| late 2.15.06 | PT Kideco Jaya Agung | 30 | Pasir / Batukajang | 2008 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2009 Import D Bids | | | | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | Glencore LTD | 22a | La Jagua | 2009 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Glencore LTD | 22b | La Jagua | 2009 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Glencore LTD | 22c | La Jagua | 2009 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Glencore LTD | 22d | La Jagua | 2009 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Coal Trade Int. | 20 | Australia | 2009 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |

| | | | | | | | | |
|--------------|----------------------------------|----|--------------------|------|----------|------------|---------------|-------|
| 2.15.06 | Interocean Coal Sales (Drummond) | 14 | Mina Pribbenow | 2009 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | PT Adaro Indonesia | 2 | Tutupan | 2009 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| late 2.15.06 | PT Kideco Jaya Agung | 30 | Pasir / Batukajang | 2009 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |

2007 Domestic Water D

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|--------------------------|-----|---------------|------|-----------------|------------|---------------|-------|
| 2.15.06 | Keystone Industries, LLC | 1 | Rush Creek | 2007 | ya, Marmet Docl | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Central Coal Co. | 17b | Kanawha Eagle | 2007 | Kanawha | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |

2008 Domestic Water D

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|--------------------------|-----|---------------|------|-----------------|------------|---------------|-------|
| 2.15.06 | Keystone Industries, LLC | 1 | Rush Creek | 2008 | ya, Marmet Docl | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Central Coal Co. | 17b | Kanawha Eagle | 2008 | Kanawha | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |

2009 Domestic Water D

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|--------------------------|---|------------|------|-----------------|------------|---------------|-------|
| 2.15.06 | Keystone Industries, LLC | 1 | Rush Creek | 2009 | ya, Marmet Docl | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
|---------|--------------------------|---|------------|------|-----------------|------------|---------------|-------|

2007 Domestic Rail D

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-------------------|-----|----------------|------|---------|------------|---------------|-----|
| 2.15.06 | Central Coal Co. | 17a | Kanawha Eagle | 2007 | Kanawha | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5g | PRB OTC | 2007 | OTC | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5h | PRB OTC | 2007 | OTC | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5i | PRB OTC | 2007 | OTC | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | TECO Coal Corp. | 15a | Perry Co. Coal | 2007 | EK | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Bandmill Coal Co. | 26a | Highland | 2007 | Kanawha | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | CoalTrade LLC | 12 | Cook Mountain | 2007 | Kanawha | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |

2008 Domestic Rail D

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-------------------|-----|----------------|------|---------|------------|---------------|-----|
| 2.15.06 | Central Coal Co. | 17a | Kanawha Eagle | 2008 | Kanawha | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5g | PRB OTC | 2008 | OTC | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5h | PRB OTC | 2008 | OTC | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5i | PRB OTC | 2008 | OTC | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | TECO Coal Corp. | 15a | Perry Co. Coal | 2008 | EK | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Bandmill Coal Co. | 26a | Highland | 2008 | Kanawha | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | CoalTrade LLC | 12 | Cook Mountain | 2008 | Kanawha | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |

2009 Domestic Rail D

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-------------------|-----|----------------|------|---------|------------|---------------|-----|
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5g | PRB OTC | 2009 | OTC | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5h | PRB OTC | 2009 | OTC | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | TECO Coal Corp. | 15a | Perry Co. Coal | 2009 | EK | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Bandmill Coal Co. | 26a | Highland | 2009 | Kanawha | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | CoalTrade LLC | 12 | Cook Mountain | 2009 | Kanawha | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | CSX |

A Coal Summary Sheet

REDACTED

| Submission Date | Supplier | Contract Identifier (PECFEB2006-xx) | Mine | Term | Origin | Per Month short Tons | Short ton Price | Transp Mode |
|------------------------------|-------------------|--|------------|------|----------------|----------------------|-----------------|-------------|
| 2.15.06 | National Coal | 23 | NO BID | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | K&P Mining | 24 | NO BID | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | PS Energy Group | 25 | NO BID | | | | | |
| 2007 Import A Bids | | | | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | Koch Carbon | 19b | S. African | 2007 | McDuffie | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Koch Carbon | 19c | S. African | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | SSM | 16a | Norway | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | SSM | 16b | Columbian | 2007 | IMT | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2007 Domestic Water A | | | | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5a | OTC | 2007 | Big Sandy | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5b | OTC | 2007 | Big Sandy | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5c | OTC | 2007 | Big Sandy | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5d | OTC | 2007 | Ohio | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5e | OTC | 2007 | Ohio | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5f | OTC | 2007 | Ohio | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | Williamson Energy | 29 | Ill #6 | 2007 | ok Coal Term / | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2008 Domestic Water A | | | | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5a | OTC | 2008 | Big Sandy | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5b | OTC | 2008 | Big Sandy | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | barge |

| | | | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------|-----------------------------|-----|----------------|------|-----------|--|----|--|-------|
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5c | OTC | 2008 | Big Sandy | | \$ | | barge |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5d | OTC | 2008 | Ohio | | \$ | | barge |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5e | OTC | 2008 | Ohio | | \$ | | barge |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5f | OTC | 2008 | Ohio | | \$ | | barge |
| 2009 Domestic Water A | | | | | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5a | OTC | 2009 | Big Sandy | | \$ | | barge |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5b | OTC | 2009 | Big Sandy | | \$ | | barge |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5d | OTC | 2009 | Ohio | | \$ | | barge |
| 2.15.06 | LDES | 5e | OTC | 2009 | Ohio | | \$ | | barge |
| 2007 Domestic Rail A | | | | | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | CAM Mining, LLC | 3 | Various/Damron | 2007 | Big Sandy | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | ICG, LLC | 10 | Supreme | 2007 | Big Sandy | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Alpha Coal Sales | 11 | Enterprise | 2007 | EK | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | TECO Coal Corp. | 15b | Various | 2007 | EK | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Bandmill Coal Co. | 26b | Love Branch | 2007 | Big Sandy | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Logan & Kanawha | 8 | Snap Creek | 2007 | Kanawha | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Constellation | 21 | Various | 2007 | Kanawha | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | TrinityCoal Marketing, Inc. | 7a | various | 2007 | Big Sandy | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | TrinityCoal Marketing, Inc. | 7b | various | 2007 | EK | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | James River Coal Sales | 4a | various | 2007 | EK | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | James River Coal Sales | 4b | various | 2007 | EK | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Koch Carbon | 19a | OTC | 2007 | Big Sandy | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2008 Domestic Rail A | | | | | | | | | |
| 2.15.06 | CAM Mining, LLC | 3 | Various/Damron | 2008 | Big Sandy | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | ICG, LLC | 10 | Supreme | 2008 | Big Sandy | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Alpha Coal Sales | 11 | Enterprise | 2008 | EK | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | TECO Coal Corp. | 15b | Various | 2008 | EK | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Bandmill Coal Co. | 26b | Love Branch | 2008 | Big Sandy | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Logan & Kanawha | 8 | Snap Creek | 2008 | Kanawha | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Constellation | 21 | Various | 2008 | Kanawha | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | TrinityCoal Marketing, Inc. | 7a | various | 2008 | Big Sandy | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | TrinityCoal Marketing, Inc. | 7b | various | 2008 | EK | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | James River Coal Sales | 4a | various | 2008 | EK | | \$ | | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | James River Coal Sales | 4b | various | 2008 | EK | | \$ | | CSX |

2009 Bids

| | | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----------------------------|-----|----------------|------|-----------|------------|----|------------|-----|
| 2.15.06 | CAM Mining, LLC | 3 | Various/Damron | 2009 | Big Sandy | [REDACTED] | \$ | [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | ICG, LLC | 10 | Supreme | 2009 | Big Sandy | [REDACTED] | \$ | [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | TECO Coal Corp. | 15b | Various | 2009 | EK | [REDACTED] | \$ | [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Bandmill Coal Co. | 26b | Love Branch | 2009 | Big Sandy | [REDACTED] | \$ | [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Logan & Kanawha | 8 | Snap Creek | 2009 | Kanawha | [REDACTED] | \$ | [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | Constellation | 21 | Various | 2009 | Kanawha | [REDACTED] | \$ | [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | TrinityCoal Marketing, Inc. | 7a | various | 2009 | Big Sandy | [REDACTED] | \$ | [REDACTED] | CSX |
| 2.15.06 | TrinityCoal Marketing, Inc. | 7b | various | 2009 | EK | [REDACTED] | \$ | [REDACTED] | CSX |

REDACTED

PROGRSS ENERGY FLORIDA, INC.
 SPOT CONTRACTS
 2006

PEF Confidential Data
 6/11/2007

| Counterparty | FWx Contract # | Date of Contract | Expr. Date | S02# | Btu Content (Btu/lbs) | 2006 Annual tons | 2006 Price (\$/ton) | 2007 Annual tons | 2007 Price (\$/ton) |
|---------------|----------------|------------------|------------|------|-----------------------|------------------|---------------------|------------------|---------------------|
| Alpha | 134 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.70 | 12,400 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| Amvest | 169 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.20 | 12,400 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| Arch | 161 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.20 | 12,500 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| CAM | 217 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.80 | 12,500 | - | - | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] |
| CMC | - | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.20 | 11,600 | - | - | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] |
| CoalSales | 141 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 0.81 | 13,300 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| CoalTrade | 153 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 0.80 | 8,800 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| Constellation | 182 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.20 | 12,200 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| Constellation | 191 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.20 | 12,500 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| Constellation | 162 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.20 | 12,500 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| Constellation | 124 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.20 | 12,500 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| Constellation | 123 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.20 | 12,500 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| Drummond | 166 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.2 | 11,500 | - | - | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] |
| Keystone | 142 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.20 | 12,500 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| Koch Carbon | 239 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.20 | 11,500 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| MC Mining | 90 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.60 | 12,300 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |
| NRG | 188 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | 1.20 | 12,500 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | - | - |

REDACTED

“Attachment B”
 Response to Staff’s 1st Interrogos (No. 4)
 Docket No. 070001-EI

REDACTED

STAFF 1st POD

#2

070001

REDACTED

| Counterparty | SO2 | BTU | 2007 Contract Price | | 2008 Contract Price | | 2009 Contract Price | |
|---|------|-------|---------------------|---------------|---------------------|---------------|---------------------|---------------|
| | | | 2007 | (\$/ton) | 2008 | (\$/ton) | 2009 | (\$/ton) |
| Glencore LTD - Bid 22a | 1.2 | 12400 | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] |
| Glencore LTD - Bid 22b | 1.2 | 12400 | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] |
| Interocean Coal Sales (Drummond) - Bid 14 | 1.05 | 11550 | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] |
| Inter-American Coal, Inc. - Bid 9 | 1.1 | 13000 | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] |
| Coal Marketing Company - Bid 18 | 1.05 | 11400 | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] |
| ICG, LLC - Bid 10 | 1.95 | 12300 | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] |
| Jarvis River Coal Sales - Bid 4a | 1.42 | 12636 | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] |
| Keystone Industries, LLC - Bid 1 | 1.2 | 12250 | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] |
| Central Coal Co - Bid 17b | 1.1 | 12500 | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] |

1) Assumes ratable shipments throughout the contract term

REDACTED

STAFF 1st POD

#4

070001

REDACTED

PEF-07FL-001312 through PEF-07FL-001321
STAFF'S 1st POD #4

REDACTED

STAFF 1st POD

#6

070001

Bid Summary
Suwannee No. 6 Oil-1% for 2007

| | <u>Index</u> | <u>Adder</u> | <u>Total</u> | <u>Total Cost</u> | <u>Diff. from low</u> | |
|----------------|--------------|--------------|--------------|-------------------|-----------------------|-------------------|
| Martin | 49.87 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | truck delivery |
| Transmontaigne | 49.87 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | truck delivery |
| Western Fuels | 49.71 | [REDACTED] | [REDACTED] | \$ [REDACTED] | | rail car delivery |

Index : Platts USGC 1% for the period 10/05-9/06
Western based on low
Martin and Transmontaigne based on mean