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“EPOSIT UAL |
From: Paula Isler AZPOSIT VAV Q\L\ﬁ a LQ ‘-1 38
it:  Thursday, July 19, 2007 1:48 PM 761 JUL 2 02007 & 300.an T
To: Ragquel Tully ) '
Subject: RE: Ygnition Networks, Inc. and Common Pointe Networks of Florida, LLC 30060
7-1<-O7
sood afternoon:

e
~oncerning the $565.50 check, it is for Ygnition Networks, Inc. (TX896). Please deposit $65.50 for RAF and P&l as you normally

vould, $200 in the PSC Trust Fund for collection costs, and the balance of $300 in the Gene'ral Revenue Fund. Provide the Clerk'
dffice with proof of payment for documenting in Docket No. 070351-TX.

>oncerning the $500 check, it is for Common Pointe Networks of Florida, LLC (TX891). Please deposit $200 in the PSC Trust
‘und for collection costs and the balance of $300 in the General Revenue Fund. Provide the Clerk's Office with proof of payment
or documenting in Docket No. 070351-TX.

‘rom: Raquel Tully

ient: Thursday, July 19, 2007 10:35 AM
ro: Paula Isler

iubject:

received a check for $565.50 for TX896 and a $500.00 check for TX891, please tell me the break down
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DOCUMINT NUMBER-DATE
06106 JuL19s
) FPSC-COMMISSION CLERK



EARLY, LENNON, CROCKER & BARTOSIEWICZ, P.L.C.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
900 COMERICA BUILDING
KALAMAZOQOO, MICHIGAN 49007-4752
TELEPHONE (269) 381-8844
FACSIMILE (269) 381-8822

GEORGE H. LENNON ROBERT M. TAYLOR OF COUNSEL

DAVID G, CROCKER RON W. KIMBREL JOHBN T, PETERS, JR.
MICHAEL D. O°’CONNOR PATRICK D. CROCKER

HAROLD E, FISCHER, JR, THOMAS A, BIRKHOLD THOMPSON BENNETT
LAWRENCE M, BRENTON RUSSELL B. BAUGH (1912 - 2004)
GORDON C. MILLER ANDREW J. VORBRICH VINCENT T, EARLY
GARY P. BARTOSIEWICZ TYREN R. CUDNEY (1922 - 2001)
BLAKE D. CROCKER JOSEPH J. BURGIE

(1926 - 1992)

July 18, 2007

Office of the Commission Clerk

Florida Public Service Commission Via Federal Express
Capital Circle Office Center

2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.

Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850

Re:  Common Pointe Networks of Florida, LLC Company Code TX891
Docket No. 070351-TX
Order No. PSC-07-0547-PAA-TX

Dear Sir or Madam:

Enclosed herewith for filing with the Commission, please find a check in the amount of $500.00
made payable to the Florida Public Service Commission.

Please contact merif you have additional questions or concerns.

enc



FedEx | Ship Manager | Label Page 1 of 1

From: Origin ID: HAIA (616)381-8844 Ship Date: 18JULO7
PATRICK D. CROCKER-TLB Fed=x. ActWgt: 1 LB

EARLY LENNON PETERS & CROCKER PLC eS| System#: 4209098/INET7061
900 COMERICA BUILDING Accountf: S

Delivery Address Bar Code

KALAMAZOO, M 49007

cL 112

&

L

SHIPTO:  (850)413-6770 BILL SENDER Ref# 8179
[FL] Office of the Commission Clerk Invoice #
Florida Public Service Commission Pt
Capital Circle Office Center
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd
Tallahassee, FL 323990850
- THU - 19JUL A2
AU 79029464 1470 FIRST OVERNIGHT
iR 1|
. TLH

RS | X1-TLHA
Shipping Labehlyz Your shipment is complete

1. Use the 'Print' feature from your browser to send this page to your laser or inkjet printer.
2. Fold the printed page along the horizontal line.
3. Place label in shipping pouch and affix it to your shipment so that the barcode portion of the label can be read and scanned.

Warning: Use only the printed original label for shipping. Using a photocopy of this label for shipping purposes is fraudulent and
could result in additional billing charges, along with the cancellation of your FedEx account number.

Use of this system constitutes your agreement to the service conditions in the current FedEx Service Guide, available on fedex.com.

FedEx will not be responsible for any claim in excess of $100 per package, whether the result of loss, damage, delay, non-delivery, misdelivery, or
misinformation, unless you declare a higher value, pay an additional charge, document your actual loss and file a timely claim. Limitations found in the current
FedEx Service Guide apply. Your right to recover from FedEx for any loss, including intrinsic value of the package, loss of sales, income interest, profit,
attorney's fees, costs, and other forms of damage whether direct, incidental, consequential, or special is limited to the greater of $100 or the authorized declared
value. Recovery cannot exceed actual documented loss. Maximum for items of extraordinary value is $500, e.g. jewelry, precious metals, negotiable
instruments and other items listed in our Service Guide. Written claims must be filed within strict time limits, see current FedEx Service Guide.

https://www.fedex.com/ship/domesticShipmentAction.do?method=doShipContinue 7/18/2007



