REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET
(Please Type)
Date: | 7/27/2007 Docket No.: D70 SLL—" T
1. Division Name/Staff Name: | Division Of Competitive Markets & Enforcement/Isler
2. OPR:
3. OCR: | Office Of The General Counsel
4, Suggested Docket Title: | Compliance investigation of IXC Registration No. TK111, issued to Eymol Corp. d/b/a
Voinline Telecommunications Group, for apparent first-time violation of Section 364.336,
Florida Statutes.
5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)
A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company.
B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.)
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Complete Name: Eymol Corp. d/b/a Voinline Telecommunications Group

COMPANY IDENTIFICATION
Printed on 07/20/2007 at 15:01:26 by PJI

Mailing Name: 'Voinline Telecommunications Group

Company Code: TK111

FEID Number:

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2006 THROUGH 12/31/2006

Reg. Date: 10/19/2006 Inactive Date:

Service: IXC - Interexchange Telephone

Received: No RAF Form

Status: Pending

Amended: No Extension: No

Frozen: No Comments: No

Payment Count: 0 Payments Made to Date

Operating Rev: $0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00

RAF Rate: Net RAF Due: $0.00

Agssessment Due Paid Owe

RAF $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Penalty $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Interest $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Extension Fee $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Last modification was

made on Friday, December 1,

2006 at 4:42 PM by David Brown
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Paula Isler

From: voinline@gmail.com on behalf of EMolina-Voinline [emolina@voinline.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 11, 2007 6:25 PM
To: Paula Ister '

Cc: M
Subject’ Re: TK111 - Eymol Corp. d/b/a Voinline Telecommunications Group
ject e TR

We sorry for the inconvenience, we want to confirm you that the missing part in our address is: Suite 306.
We will send our payment according to your instructions.

Best regards

Eybar Molina

Voinline Telecom
D:(305) 742 2164
F:(707) 736 7652

On 4/9/07, Paula Isler <Plsler@psc.state.fl.us> wrote:
Dear Mr. Eybar Molina:

The 2006 Regulatory Assessment Fee return was mailed to 7105 SW 8th
Street, Miami, FL. 33144 on December 15, 2006. It was subsequently
returned to the Commission marked "insufficient address." On February
20, 2007, we mailed you a delinquent notice advising the 2006 Regulatory
Assessment Fee has not been paid and it also was returned by the US
Postal Service. We double checked that the address we have on file is

the one provided to us on your application. Apparently, the US Postal
Service cannot deliver mail to your company as it appears there are
multiple units at this address.

I am attaching the 2006 Regulatory Assessment Fee return form. The 2006
Regulatory Assessment Fee is .0020 of a company's intrastate revenues or
$50, whichever is greater. Therefore, if you owe the minimum fee of

$50, the total due is $59, which includes $9 late payment charges.

Since the Regulatory Assessment Fee is already late, please pay by April

24,2007.

In addition, you need to provide this Commission with your complete
address. Let me know if you have any questions.

Paula Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850
(850) 413-6502-Phone

(850) 413-6503-Fax
Plsler@psc.state.fl.us

1/12/2007
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Label/Receipt Number: 7006 0810 0002 3487 5285
Status: Insufficient Address

Your item was retumed to the sender on February 22, 2007 because of an incomplete .
address. l

Notification Options

Track & Confirm by email

Get current event information or updates for your item sent to you or others by email. § Bo> }

site map contact us - government services  jobs - National & Premier Accounts
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5%, Praserving the Trust

ttp://trkenfrm1.smi.usps.com/PTSInternetWeb/InterLabellnquiry.do 4/9/2007
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US POSTAGE

T LS ASSESSMENT FEE NOTICE

See Filing Instructions on Back of Form

'Voinline Telecommunications Group
7105 S.W. 8th Street
Miami, FL 33144-464
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Company Code:
Complete Name:
Mailing Name:
Certificate No(s):
Status:
Regulation Date:
Bankruptcy:

Company Liaison #1:

Title:
Mailing Address:

Physical Location:

Phone:
Fax:
Related Dockets:

060691-TI

MCD Company Information for TK111

‘Printed on 07/16/2007 at 13:54:10 by PJI

TK111
’{Efyl_no] Corp. d/b/a Voinline Telecommunications Group
oinline Telecommunications Group

Active

10/19/2006

No

Eybar Molina

President

7105 S.W. 8th Street, Suite 306

Miami, FL 33144-4664
7105 S.W. 8th Street, Suite 306

Miami, FL 33144-4664
5305; 742-2164
707) 736-7652

Acknowledgment of registration as intrastate interexchange
telecommunications company, effective October 19, 2006, by Eymol
Corp. d/b/a Voinline Telecommunications Group.
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