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Raquel Tully QR!G’NAi
From: Paula lsler v OATE

s T A o ; f o
Sent:  Monday, July 30, 2007 10:19 AM +zPOSH

To: Raquel Tully 767 JUL3 12007

Subject: RE: Synergy Telecom Service Co., Inc. (TG963)

Good morning. Deposit $200 in the PSC Trust Fund for collection costs and the balance of $300 in the General Revenue Fund.
Please provide the Clerk's Office with proof of payment for documenting in Docket No. 070383-TC. Thanks.

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Monday, July 30, 2007 10:15 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

| received a check for $500.00 for company code TG963, please let me know the breakdown.
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