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Date: 

REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET 
(Please Type) 

1/4/2008 Docket No.: O g o O a o  -'E 

4 .  Suggested Docket Title: 

1. Divis ion Name/Staff Name: I Division Of Competitive Markets 8 Enforcementllsler 

2. OPR: 

Request for cancellation of STS Certificate No. 8404 by Jerome I .  Davis, effective 

3. OCR: I Office Of The General Counsel 

5.  Suggested Docket Mai l ing L is t  (attach separate sheet i f  necessary) 

A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company. 

B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to  companies.) 

1. Parties and their representatives (if any): 

2. Interested persons and their  representatives (if any): 

I 

I. Check one: 

Documentation is  attached 

0 Documentation wi l l  be provided wi th  recommendat ion.  



\ 

January 4,2008 

Dear Mr. Davis: 

I attempted to e-mail you on December 28, 2007, but the e-mail was retumed by the System 
Administrator. Therefore, I am enclosing a copy of the e-mail explaining that before I can 
recommend a voluntary cancellation, the 2007 Regulatory Assessment Fee must be paid. 

If you decide to pay the fee, please write “TS202” on your check and use the enclosed blue 
envelope, which will insure prompt processing. 

If you have any questions, just let me know. I can be reached at (850) 41 3-6502-phone, (850) 
41 3-6503-fax, by intemet e-mail at PIsler@psc.state.fl.us, or at 2540 Shumard Oak Blvd., 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850. 

Enclosure: Copy of 12/28/07 E-mail 
Pre-addressed blue envelope 



Paula lsler 

From: 
To: 
Sent: 
Subject: 

System Administrator 
spp43@ssp.navy.mil 
Friday, December 28, 2007 3:28 PM 
Undeliverable: Jerome I. Davis (TS202) 

Your message did not react1 soiiie oi t i l l  of the intended recipients 

Subject: Jeronie I .  Davis (TS202) 
Sent: 12/28/2007 L:51 PM 

The following recipiernt(s) coiild riot be reached: 

spp43~~ssp.iiavy.inil oii 12/28/2007 3:28 PM 
Tine e-mail account does not exist at tine organization this message was sent to. Check the e-mail address, or contact the recipient directly to 

<SPMAIL5.SPHQ.SSP.NAVY.MIL #5.1.1> 
f ind out the correct address. 



Paula lsler 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
Friday, December 28, 2007 2:51 PM 
'spp43@ssp.navy.mil' 
Jerome I. Davis (TS202) 

Dear Mr. Davis: 

The Commission received t h e  2007 Regulatory Assessment Fee re tu rn  f o r m  with t h e  no te  ' Business sold " Although 
you did not specifically request it, I am guessing tha t  you are requesting cancellation o f  your shared tenant service 
cert i f icate.  Please cor rec t  me if I ' m  wrong 

There a re  two types o f  cancellation One is voluntary, which is when a cer t i f i ca te  is cancelled a t  a cer t i f i ca te  
holder 's request and has paid a11 Regulatory Assessment Fees The other IS involuntary and is when a cer t i f i ca te  is 
cancelled on t h e  Commission s own motion f o r  a rule, statute,  o r  order violation Jus t  as Information, t h e  
Regulatory Assessment Fee is applicable if a cer t i f i ca te  is active f o r  any day during a calendar year 

I w i l l  open a docket t o  cancel your cert i f icate w i t h  an e f fec t i ve  date o f  December 27, 2007  Unfortunately, t he  
ininimum fee  f o r  2007 must s t i l l  be paid I n  addition t h e  minimum fee increased f o r  2007 t o  $100 

If you cannot pay the  $100 minimum, your cert i f icate w i l l  s t i l l  be cancelled, it w i l l  j us t  be cancelled on the  
Commission's own motion and t h e  unpaid fee w i l l  be turned over t o  collections. 

Please le t  me know by Janucry 14, 2008, how you wish t o  proceed 

Paula I s l e r  
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd 
'Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 413-6502-Phone 
(850) 4 13-6503-Fax 
PIsler@psc.state f I.us 

1 



F 1 or i d a P u b 1 i c S erv i c e C om m i ss i on 
(Scu Filiiig I r ~ ~ I r u c t i u w  OII Each or I'iirriil 

TS202-07-0-R 
.Icromc I .  Davis 
I). 0. Box 84 
Cape Can avcra 1. F L 3 2 9 2 0 - (10 S 4 

LINE 
NO. 

1 .  

2. 

3. 

4. 

3 .  

6. 

7. 

8. 

ACCOUNl C I A S  S I FIC: AT 1 ON 

Gross Intrnstatc Operntirig Rcvciiiic 

LESS: Amounts Paid to Otlicr 'Telcconiiniiniciiti~~~is Coiiipiiiiics 
( S C C  "2. Fees" 011 back) 

0) 

NET INTRASTATE OPERATING REVENUE for Regulatory 
Assessmciit Fee Calculation (Lriie / less Lrrie 2) 

Interest For Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Datc" on back) 

Extension Pavment Fee (see "4. Extension" on back) 

TOTAI, AMOUNT DUE (MINIMUM $100.00) 

AMObN'I' 

I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the forcgoing and tlcclare that to the hcst of my knowledge and belief t l ic  abovc 
information is a true and correct statement. I am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with 
t h e f i t  to mislead a public servant i i i m n a n c e  of his o f i c ~ a l  duty shall be guilty o f a  misdemeanor of the  secc2id degree. 

(Signature of  Company Official) (Ti t  le) 

Tclcphonc Nuinhcr (?I( ) 2 2 3 - g C ( ( z  Fax Numbcr ( ) 

(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 

F.E.I .  No. 



MCD Company Information for TS202 

Priiited 011 01/04/2008 at 08:47:57 by PJI 

C 0 I l l  p an y C 0 (1 c : m o 2  
Coni pl e t e N 21 m c:  Jerome I .  Davis 
Mailing Nanic: Jerome I .  Da\,is 
C k r t  i fica t c N o (  s)  : 8404 

\ /  

s t a t  II s : 
R ccii In t i o t i  I3a t c : 
E3a;;kt.uptc ': N 0 
~ o m p a n y  tiaison ii I : 
l i l lc :  Scl f 
M ai 1 i iig Add t'css : 

P h ys i ca I 1,oc ;i t i o ti : 

.~cronic I .  Davis 

P. 0. Box 84 

Cape Canavcral. FL 32920-0084 
406 Tyler Avenue 

P honc: 
Fax : 

c' ap c c a11 a v c I'a 1 , 
( 3 3  1 ) 543-0450 

FL 32920-2335 


