
Newstar 
Communications 

January 8,2008 

Florida Public Service Commission 

572 Davidson St SE 
Palm Bay Florrda, 32909 

Dear Sir or Madam: 

I Angel Cruz d.b.a. Newstar Communications effective December 1, 2007 will no longer be doing 
business in Brevard County or the state of Florida. Please close out my account. 

Sincerely, 

a-N,eL!fw 
Angel Cruz 
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TO AVOIi) Pl:NAI.TY AND INTEREST CHARGES, TIII? REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01130/2008 

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 
< 1 
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Check# 51 b 
$ /e 06-03-001 

003001 
$ E 

$ P 06-03-001 

$ I 
00401 1 

[nitials of Preparer 

STATIJS: 

Actual Return 
- Estimated Return 
- Amended Return 

- 

PERIOD COVERED: 
01/01/2007 TO 12/31/2007 

Eccords d- 

Florida Public Service Commission 
(See Filing Instructions on Buck of Form) 

TG784-07-0-R 
Newstar Communications 
572 Davidson Street, S.E. 
Palm Bay, FL 32909-6652 

jJEPOSlr dAkk 

Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed . 
(Name of Company) (Address) (City/State) (Zip) 

LINE 
NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION AMOUNT 

Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) 

Gross Intrastate Revenue 

!$ 

ZLESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies 
:?(see "2. Fees" on back) 
..*TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation -c 
I 

.(Line 2 less Line 3) 
I .- 
.r 
XI 

. -;?Regulatory ., Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0020) 

&Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 
7 
f Y  

Extension Payment Fee (see "4. Extension" on back) 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE (MINIMUM $100.00) 

Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered by 
this Return 

( I )  These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable (see "2. Fees" on back). 
(2) Regardless of the gross operating revenue of a company, a minimum annual regulatory assessment fee of $100 shall be imposed as provided in 

Section 364.336, Florida Statutes. 

I, the undersigned ownedofficer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above 
information is a true and correct statement. I am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with 
the intent E niislcad a public servant in the performance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdcmeanor of the second degree. 

QLme& i9/.-//- ug 
ASignature of Compary Official) (Title) (Date) 

A N G E L  i -  C w z  Telephone Number (321 ) 9gv-d6$3 Fax Number ( ) 
(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 

F.E.I. No. 2 75 yL ,9,93 L/ 
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Dorothy Menasco 

From: Ruth Nettles 

Sent: 

To : Paula lsler 

cc: Dorothy Menasco 

Subject: RE: NewStar Communications 

Wednesday, January 16,2008 4:28 PM 

Thanks, 1’11 open two dockets for these companies. 

From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Wednesday, January 16, 2008 4:27 PM 
To: Ruth Nettles 
Subject: RE: NewStar Communications 

Yes. Please make the effective date December 31, 2007. Thanks! 

_ _  . -  ” -  - -  - _ - -  

From: Ruth Nettles 
Sent: Wednesday, January 16,2008 4:25 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: NewStar Communications 

Paula, we received a letter from company requesting cancellation, would you like for us to open a docket? 

Attached to the request is the RAF for 2007, they made a payment of 100. 

I also received from Fiscal a RAF for 2007 for G&G Communications, the RAF has a note, “Closed Co. 9/07” 
Would you like for us to open a docket for this company. 

Thanks very much for your help. 

R 

1 / 1 6/2008 


