REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET
(Please Type)
Date: | 2/7/2008 Docket No.: oyo0085F ~1C
1. Division Name/Staff Name: | Division Of Competitive Markets & Enforcement/Isler
2. OPR:
3. OCR: | Office Of The General Counsel
4. Suggested Docket Title: | Request for cancellation of PATS Certificate No. 7465 by Thomas J. Neaman, Jr., effective
February 1, 2008.
5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)
A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company.
B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.)
1. Parties and their representatives (if any):
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2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any): o
6. Check one:
X] Documentation is attached.
] Documentation will be provided with recommendation.
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Paula Isler

From: Tom Neaman [tomjn02@yahoo.com]
Sent:  Thursday, February 07, 2008 10:19 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: Fwd: Re: Thomas J. Neaman, Jr. (TG718)

Paula,
[ received your email with "08 form. | will probably take care of that in the next 2-3 months. I will let you know when I

mail it out. Thanks.
Tom

Tom Neaman <tomjn02@yahoo.com> wrote:

Date: Fri, 1 Feb 2008 16:09:05 -0800 (PST)
From: Tom Neaman <tomjn02@yahoo.com>
Subject: Re: Thomas J. Neaman, Jr. (TG718)
To: Paula Isler <Plsler@PSC.STATE.FL.US>

Dear Paula,

Thanks for your response. As of 1/31/08, I have disconnected service to my remaining payphones. The 3 units
that are physically in place will be totally removed this weekend.
As such I would like to cancel my pay telephone Certificate # 7405. Thank you.

Thomas J Neaman Jr
352/586-7126 or 352/795-0236

Paula Isler <Plsler@PSC.STATE.FL.US> wrote:

Dear Mr. Neaman:

This is a follow up to our telephone conversation concerning the cancellation of your pay telephone
certificate. Please send me an e-mail requesting cancellation because you are no longer in the pay telephone

business.

After getting your e-mail, I will open a docket to cancel your certificate. Let me know if you have any

questions. Thanks.

Paula Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850
(850) 413-6502-Phone

(850) 413-6503-Fax
PIsler@psc.state.flus
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Paula Isler

From: Paula Ister

Sent: Monday, February 04, 2008 8:14 AM
To: Tom Neaman'

Subject: RE: Thomas J. Neaman, Jr. (TG718)

Attachments: RAF-TG718-08-0-R.pdf

Dear Mr. Neaman:

Since you did not disconnect some of the payphones until January 31, 2008, the 2008 Regulatory Assessment Fee must also be
paid before we can grant you a voluntary cancellation. | am attaching the 2008 return form. Please let me know when the fee will be
paid so that | can go forward with the cancellation. Thanks for your assistance.

Paula Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Bivd.
Tallahassee, FLL 32399-0850
(850) 413-6502-Phone

(850) 413-6503-Fax

Plsler@psc. state.fl.us

From: Tom Neaman [mailto:tomjn02@yahoo.com]
Sent: Friday, February 01, 2008 7:09 PM

To: Paula Isler

Subject: Re: Thomas J. Neaman, Jr. (TG718)

Dear Paula,

Thanks for your response. As of 1/31/08, I have disconnected service to my remaining payphones. The 3 units that are

physically in place will be totally removed this weekend.
As such I would like to cancel my pay telephone Certificate # 7465. Thank you.

Thomas J Neaman Jr
352/586-7126 or 352/795-0236

Paula Isler <Plsler@PSC.STATE.FL.US> wrote:

Dear Mr. Neaman:

This is a follow up to our telephone conversation concerning the cancellation of your pay telephone certificate. Please
send me an e-mail requesting cancellation because you are no longer in the pay telephone business.

After getting your e-mail, T will open a docket to cancel your certificate. Let me know if you have any questions.
Thanks.

Paula Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL. 32399-0850
(850) 413-6502-Phone

(850) 413-6503-Fax ‘:3 0 9 8 7 FER-8 8

2/7/2008 | -
FPSC-COMMISSICN CLERK

DOCLMT N W MEER-DATE




Company Code:
Complete Name:
Mailing Name:
Certificate No(s):
Status:
Regulation Date:
Bankruptc

Company I%iaison #1:

Title:
Mailing Address:

Physical Location:

Phone:
Fax:
Related Dockets:

000492-TC

MCD Company Information for TG718

Printed on 02/07/2008 at 13:55:24 by PJ1

TG718

Thomas J. Neaman, Jr.
Thomas J. Neaman, Jr.
7465

Active

06/16/2000

No

Thomas J. Neaman, Jr.

Owner
1479 North Endicott Point

Crystal River, FL 34429-2678
1479 North Endicott Point

Crystal River, FL 34429-2678
g3 2; 795-0230
352) 795-6383

Application for certificate to provide pay telephone service by

Thomas J. Neaman, Jr.
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