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Sent:
To:
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Subject: RE: Payment received

Paula Isler S Q RGEHEN 7.
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OK, then I'm guessing you know how to apply the $81.00 and $107.96 checks for RAFs and late payment charges. As far as the
$500 fine is concerned, please deposit $200 in the Public Service Regulatory Trust Fund for collection costs and the balance of
$300 in the General Revenue Fund. Please provide the Clerk's Office with proof of payment for documenting in Docket No.

050763-TI.

David, you had provided me a copy of their 2007 return and payment showing revenues. Since there wasn't a 2007 screen in RAF
System, the payment was applied to the 2005 RAF. | contacted the company, and attached the 2004 and 2006 RAF return forms,
and advised them to complete the return forms so we would know how much they owed and pay accordingly and to pay the $500
fine. | also told them they must reapply for a new IXC registration or they could be fined up to $25,000 for providing service in
Florida without a certificate. Bottom line: This is going to be one of those situations where you need to get Don in ITS to add the
2006 and 2007 screens to RAF System for TJ906 and then move the money according to what their RAF returns show. If you
would like a copy of what | faxed them, let me know.

Let me know if you need more information.

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Friday, February 08, 2008 10:54 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: Payment received

yes

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Friday, February 08, 2008 10:43 AM
To: Raquel Tully
Subject: RE: Payment received

Did they complete and send in the 2004 and 2006 RAF returns that | had sent them?

From: Raquel Tully
Sent: Friday, February 08, 2008 10:30 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

this.

2/8/2008
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Digizip.com, Inc TJ906 sent in three checks for $81.00,$500.00, and 107.96. lease let me know how you would like me-to ggply -3
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BRI Y
e W’N STATE OF FLORIDA TO:
A TNE Greg W. Schneider

Phone: 866-375-8324
Fax: 877-323-3901

' \ FROM:
PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION | paula Isler

- © 2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULEVARD Phone: (850) 413-6502
WW , TALLAHASSEE, 1. 32399-0850 Fax: (850) 413-6503

/\/\ﬂ‘/& L// E-muil: Plsler@psc.state.fl.us
RE:

/ O_} % Digizip.com, Tnc. (TT906)

Dcar Mr, Schneider:

The reason I'm contacting you 18 twofold. First, it appears Digizip.com, Inc. is operating in the
state of Florida without an active IXC registration, which is in violation of our rules and can
carry a finc of up to $25,000. The company must rcapply for no IXC registration. You can
download the registration form from our website, www floridapsc.com. Click on "Utility
Regulation”, "Telccommunications”, "Forms (Application Packages)”, and "Intercxchange
Companics." You can then download the form in pdf or word format.

Second, tho company must pay al] outstanding fees and fines. What prompted our
investigation is that the Comnission received the company's 2007 Regulatory Asscasment Fee
retumn form, along with its payment for the $700 minimum fec. That js when we checked and
found that Digizip.com was fined $500 and its IXC registration was cancellsd on December
31, 2008, for violation of the Regulatory Assessment Fee rule/statute in Docket No. 050763 -

TI.
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As information, telccommunication companics must pay the Regulatory Assessment Fee by
January 30th of every ycar for the preceding calendar year. At the time Docket No. 050763-TI
was cstablished on October 10, 2005, Digizip.com had not paid the 2004 Regulatory
Asscssment Fee, Thercfore, the company was fined $500 and its registration was subsequently

cancelled.

Tn roviewing our records, 1 found that wc havc never received a 2004 Regulatory Assessmont
Foe return form. We received two 2005 Regulatory Asscssment Fee return forms completed
by two diffcrent people.  We have not received a 20006 Regulatory Asscssment Fee retumn
form but we did receive the 2007 retum form.

The first 2005 return form we received was completed by Digizip.com's consultant, Telecam
Compliance Service out of Alpharetta, Georgia. That form was dated January 24, 2006,
postmarked on January 26, 2006, and included a check for $60.71. The company rcported
intcrstate revenues in the amount of $331,140.08 and intrastate revenues in the amount of

$30.358.25.

The sccond 2005 retum form was complcted by Digizip.com's CPA, Mark Lammert. That
form was dated February 17, 2006, postmarked on February 28, 2006, and included a check for
$70.99. The company reported interstatc revenues in the amount of $350,546 and intrastate -

revenves in the amount of $33,486.00.

The minimum fee in 2004 was $50.00, therefore, since we do not lnow the company's 2004
revenues, [ will use the minimum as the amount owed. If we apply the first check for $60.71
toward the 2004 amount due of $68.50 ($50.00 fec, $12.50 penalty, $6.00 interest), there is a
balange due of $7.79. The 2004 Regulatory Assessment Fee retum form is attached. Please
complete the form and if the company computes that it owes more than the $50.00 minimum,
then {he penalty and intcrest charge should be computed as you normally would (penalty 1¢
25% of the amount owed and interest is 12% of the amount owed using the paid datc of
Tanuary 26, 2006). Deduct the amount of the first check ($60.71) and pay the difference.

The second check in the amount of $70.99 received was applied toward the 2005 Reguletory
Asscssment Fee and it is showing as paid in full (866.97 fee, $3.35 penalty, and $0.67 intcrest).
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The company paid more than the minimom for the 2005 fce, therefore, we will wait for the
company lo complete the 2006 Regulatory Assessment Fee to compute the amoupt of Jate
paywment charges. The 2006 Regulatory Assessment Fee return form s attached. The
Regulatory Asscssment Fee is .0020 of 8 company's intrastate revenucs, or $50.00, whichever
is groater. The penalty is capped at 25% of the amount owed, and the interest is 1% for every
30 days the [ee is paid late. For exemple, using the 2005 intrastate revenues reported by Matk
Lammecrt ($33,486) and 1f the company postmarks its 2006 Regulatory Assessment Fee return
form end payment between now and February 24, the total duc is $92.42 ($66.97 fec, $16.74

penalty, and $8.71 interest).

The 2007 Regulatory Assessment Fee return form, which was completed by Mr. Lammen, is
dated January 24, 2008, and was postrarkcd January 30, 2008. The company reported
$73.460 intrastate revenues and the minimum $700 fee was paid. No late fees were assessed

sinee it was paid timely.

The bottom line is that the company needs to complete the 2004 and 2006 Regulalory
Assossment Fee return forms and pay accordingly, including late payment charges. In
addition, thc company must pay the $500 fine imposed in Docket No. 050763-T1. And finally,
the company must reapply for another [XC registration (there is no application fee) by

February 22, 2008,

Ploasc let me know if you have any qucstions. Thanks.

Pauia Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Osk Blvd.
Tallahassce, K. 32399-0850
(850) 413-6502-Phone

(850) 413-6503-Fax

Plslerféipsc stale.fl.us

Attachments (2004 and 2006 Regulatory Asscssment Fee retun forms)




TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 1/30/2004
Interexchange Company Regulatory Assessment Fee Return

STATUS: Florida Public Service Commission For PSC Use Only
Check # 311 1
X Actual Return
Estimated Return TJ906-04-0-R R e $ 56 O 0603001
Amended Retum Digizip.com, Inc. = QJQ:;?T LAt B . 003001

9 East 45th Street, 9th Floor $ SO P 0603001

/!
PERIOD COVERED: New York, NY 100178456 O 20 FEB 2}6 200 004011
04/21/2004 TO 12/31/2004 8 $J 85 O 1

Postmark Date<=2~ 8”0%

Initials of Preparer (&
Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed
(Name of Company) (Address: City/State/Zip) (Telephone)
Line Florida
No. Account Classification Gross Operating Revenue Intrastate Revenue
1. Long Distance Services $ 196,306 3 14,911
2. Access Services $ - $ N
3. Private Line Scrvices $ - $ .
4. Leased Facilities & Circuits Services $ - $ -
5. Miscellaneous Services $ - $ -
6. TOTAL Telephone Services $ 196,306 $ 14,911
7. Less: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* 3 . $ -
(see "2. Fees" on back)
8. Total Revenues for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation $ 14911
9. Regulatory Assessment Fee Due (Multiply Line 8 by 0.0015) $ 50.00
10. Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) $ 12.50
11. Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) $ 18.50
12, TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 81.00
These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable.
AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336, FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE IS $50
CURRENT COMPANY STATUS
D Facilities-Based Carrier m Reseller D Call Aggregator
l:] Alternate-Operator Service D Rebilter D Other:
BILLING INFORMATION
Complete below if billing agent if other than yourself. o 80
(Name) (Address: City/State/Zip) (Tclephone) |~ a
What is the total amount of customer deposits collected? N/A What is the total amount of bond held (if applicable)? N/A
Amount: § for 2004. Amount: § Expires: e
COMPANY INFORMATION il O
Do you lcase telecommunications' facilities? W e
[]Yes No : 2o
o]
If YES, who do you lease these facilities from? Name: S
Address:

[, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief
the above information is a true and correct statement. | am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a
false statement in writing with the intent to myslead a public servant in the performance of his/her duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the

second degree.

Greg W. ScKnei . President 2-7-2008
(Signature of Company Official) (Title) (Date)
Preparer of Form: Mark Lammert Company's Telephone Number: 702-547-8421
Preparer's Telephone Number: 407-327-1919 Company's Fax Number: 702-967-6119
Preparer's Fax Number: 407-327-1921 Company's Federal ID #, 33-0365398

PSC/CMU-153 (Rev. 11/11/99)



TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 1/30/2007
Interexchange Company Regulatory Assessment Fee Return

STATUS:

X

PERIOD COVERED:
01/01/2006 TO 12/31/2006

Q}W

c/o Compliance Solutions, Inc,

Florida Public Service Commission

Actual Return

(Sce Filing [nstruction on Back of Form)

For PSC Use Only
Check # 3\

Estimated Return
Amended Return TJ906-06-0-R

Digizip.com, Inc,

9 East 45th Street, 9th Floor

=~O8IT

mﬁ. PE:

New Yok NY 10017843 8 2 prp m_zmﬁ_

Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed

740 Florida Central Pkwy, Ste. 2028, Longwood, FL 32750

$ l & . 30603001

003001
s 19,5 poso3001
004011

RISHER

Postmark Date 2 6S-CK
Initials of Preparer

407-260-1011

(Name of Company) (Address: City/State/Zip) (Telephone)
Line Florida Gross
No. Account Classification Operating Revenue Intrastate Revenue
1. Long Distance Services $ 340,507 $ 39,115
2. Access Services $ - $ -
3 Private Line Services S - $ -
4. Leased Facilities & Circuits Services $ - $ -
5. Miscellaneous Services $ - $ -
6. TOTAL Telephone Services 3 340,507 $ 39,115
7. Less: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies'" $ - $ -
8. TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation $ 39,115
9. Regulatory Assessment Fee Due (Multiply Line 8 by 0.0020) $ 78.23
10. Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) $ 19.56
11 Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) $ 10.17
12. Extension Payment Fee (see "4. Extension" on back) $
13. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE (850 MINIMUM) 3 107.96
(I} These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable. (see "2. Fees" on back).

(2) Regardless of the gross operating revenue of a company, a minimum annual regulatory assessment fee of $50 shall be imposed as provided in
Section 364.336, Florida Statutes.

CURRENT COMPANY STATUS

|:] Facilities-Based Carrier
L__| Alternate-Operator Service

m Reseller
D Rebiller

D Call Aggregator

[] Other: bad

BILLING INFORMATION

Complete below if billing agent if other than yourself.

(Name)

What is the total amount of customer deposits collected? None

Amount: $

for 2006.

(Address: City/State/Zip)

What is the total amount of bond held (if applicable)? None

Amount: $

Expires:

(Telcphone-;

COMPANY INFORMATION

Do you lease telecommunications' facilities?

|:] Yes

If YES, who do you lease these facilities from?

Address:

No

Name:

I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief
the above information is a true and correct statement. I am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a
false statement in writing with the intept to mislead a public servant in the performance of his/her duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the

second degree.

Greg W. Schnei

President

L-7-2008

(Signature of Company Official)

Preparer of Form: Mark Lammert, CPA

(Title)

Preparer's Telephone Number: 407-260-1011

Preparer's Fax Number: 407-260-1033

PSC/CMU-153 (Rev. O1/05)

CA\DOCUM-1\dbrown\LOCALS-I\T

Company's Telephone Number;
Company's Fax Number:
Company's Federal ID #:

£
P B!

(Date)

866-375-8324
877-323-3901
86-0978461

5978067\ doc

{01 CLERK

}



KTV

FedEx | Ship Manager | Label 799798582831

From: Origin ID: SFBA (407)260-1011
Mark Lammet MEXO
Compliance Solutions, Inc. Expees
740 Flosida Central Pkwy, Ste 2028
Longwood, FL 32750

CCCCCCC 2UM

Ship Date: 07TFEB08

ot: 1 LB
Systemi: 1755545/INET8011
Accountt; S #rereerrt

Page 1 of 1

SHIP TO: 850-413-6502 BILL SENDER
Paula Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Capital Circle Office Center

Tallahassee, FL 323990850
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