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Paula lsler 

From: cvellanti@aol.com 

Sent: 

To : Paula lsler 

Subject: Re: Christopher Vellanti (TH052) 

Tuesday, February 26,2008 8:37 PM 

Paula, all of these fees are brutal. The taxes and fees are out of control. It is a real dilemna for the business person these 
days. This is rediculous. All of this because I wanted to give my tenants a pay phone to use in my mobile home park 
because not many of them can afford a cell phone. This is wrong. I dont want any thing to do with this Florida Publice 
service commission. Mr Vellanti 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler <PIsler@PSC.STATE.FL.US> 
To: cvellanti@aol.com 
Sent: Tue, 26 Feb 2008 8:28 am 
Subject: RE: Christopher Vellanti (TH052) 

Dear Mr. Vellanti: 

OK, I will open a docket to cancel your payphone certificate. As information, certificates remain active until a company requests 
cancellation or until the Commission cancels a certificate on its own motion for a rule, statute, or order violation. In this case. we 
have not received previous notification to cancel your certificate until now, so the effective date of the cancellation will be February 
25, 2008, the date we received the request. 

In addition, the Regulatory Assessn-rent Fee is applicable if a certificate is active for any clay during a calendar year, whether or not a 
company had any revenues or ever started operations. Unfortunately, this means that the fees are applicable for 2007 arid 2008. I 
am attaching the 2007 and 2008 Regulatory Assessment Fee returns. 

As my e-mail below states, the 2007 fee IS already past due, so statutory late payment charges also apply If payment is postmarked 
by February 29, 2008, the total due IS $206 ($100 fee for 2007, $5 penalty for 2007, $1 interest for 2007, $1 00 fee for 2008) If 
payrrierit IS postmarked between March 1 and March 30, 2008, the total due is $212 ($100 fee for 2007, $10 penalty for 2007, $2 
interest for 2007, $1 00 fee for 2008) The late payment charges continue to accrue until the fee IS paid 

If payment of the fees is not made, staff will recommend that a voluntary cancellation be denied and instead, the pay telephone 
certificate should be cancelled on the Commission’s own motion. Any unpaid Regulatory Assessment Fees, including late payment 
charges, will be turned over to collections. 

I regret I do not have better news for you but I wanted you to have all the information Let me know if you have any questions 
Paula lsler 
Florida Public Service Conimission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 41 3-6502-Phone 
(850) 41 3-6503-Fax 
Plsler@psc.statc.fl.us 

From: cvellanti@aol.com [mailto:cvellanti@aol.com] 
Sent: Monday, February 25, 2008 9:lO PM 
To: Paula Isler; CVellantiC3aol.com 
Subject: Re: Christopher Vellanti (TH052) 

Dear Paula, Please cancel my certificate. I no longcr LISC the pay phone. It has not worked in two years. Thanks, Chris 
Vellanti 727-643-643 I 

2/27/2008 
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-----Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler < l ' l ~ l c t ~ ~ ~ ~ l ~ S ~ '  S rATE.F i..llS> 
To : c\. ell all I I @,uol .COlTl 

Sent: Mon, 25 Feb 2008 4:OO pm 
Subject: Christopher Vellanti (TH052) 

Dear Mr. Vellanti: 

The Regulatory Assessment Fee is applicable if a cert i f icate is active for  any day during a calendar year whether a 
cert i f icate holder had any revenues o r  ever s tar ted operations. The fee must be postmarked by January 30 th  t o  avoid late 
payment charges. Our records show the  2007 fee, including late payment charges, has not been received. The fee is .0020 
of a cert i f icate holder's intrastate revenues, o r  the  minimum $100, whichever is greater. 

If you owe the  minimum and if payment is postmarked by February 29, the  amount due is $106 ($100 minimum fee, $5 
penalty, $1 interest). If you owe the  minimum and if payment is postmarked between March 1 and March 30, t h e  amount due 
is $112 ($100 minimum fee, $10 penalty, $2 interest). As information, t he  late payment charges continue t o  accrue unti l t he  
fee is paid. 

Delinquent notices have now been mailed and if a cert i f icate holder does not comply with the  notice within 15 days, 
cert i f icate holders wi l l  automatically be f ined $500 f o r  a f i r s t  offense, $1,000 f o r  a second offense, and $2,000 for  a third 
offense. If you do not comply, you would be automatically f ined $500 since this w i l l  be the  f i r s t  offense of t h e  Regulatory 
Assessment F ee rule violation. 

If you wish t o  cancel your pay telephone cert i f icate, please wr i te  the  Commission a le t te r  requesting cancellation. If you 
want a voluntary cancellation, please include payment o f  t he  2007 and 2008 Regulatory Assessment Fees, including any 
applicable late payment charges. If full payment is not included, the  Commission would s t i l l  cancel t he  certif icate, it would 
just be cancelled on the  Commission's own motion and any unpaid fees would be turned over t o  collections. 

Please le t  me know i f  you have any questions or need a copy of t he  2007 (and/or 2008) Regulatory Assessment Fee re tu rn  
form(s). Thanks. 
Paula I s l e r  
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 413-6502-Phone 
(850) 4 13 -6503 -Fax 
P I S  I e r  @ psc .s t a t e. f I. us 

More new features than ever. Check out the new AOl- Mail! 

212 712 00 8 



MCD Company Information for THO52 

Printed on 02/29/2008 at 16:08:29 by PJI 

Company Code: 
Complete Name: 
Mailing Name: 
Certificate No(s): 
Status: 
Regulation Date: 
Bankruptc : 

Title: 
Mailing Address: 

Company 1: iaison #1: 

THO52 
Christopher Vellanti 
Christopher Vellanti 
8591 
Active 
08/19/2005 
No 
Christopher Vellanti 
Owner 
P. 0. Box 273942 

Tampa, FL 33688-3942 
6531 King Palm Way Physical Location: 

Phone: 
Fax : 

Related Dockets: 

050372-TC 

Beach, FL 33572-2108 

A plication for certificate to provide pay telephone service by 
CRristopher Vellanti. 
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