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Ruth Nettles

From: Trina Collins [TCollins@RSBattorneys.com]

Sent: Friday, June 20, 2008 3:47 FM

To: Filings@psc.state.fl.us

Cc: Martin Friedman; Christian W. Marcelli; Trina Collins

Subject: !:\ilinlg int .Docket No. 070695-WS; Miles Grant Water and Sewer Company 2007 General Rate Increase
pplication

Importance: High
Attachments: PSC Clerk 07 (Response to RAI).Itr.06-20-2008(2).pdf

. Martin S. friedman, Esquire
. Rose, Sundstrom & Bentley, $1P

S (407) 830-6331 Work
i MPriedman@RSBatiormeys.com

Sanlarido Center

2180 W, State Road 434
Suite 2118

Longwood, Florida 32779

b. Docket No. 070695-WS; Miles Grant Water and Sewer Company 2007 General Rate Increase Application - Filing the
Utility’s responses to the Commission Staff's May 20, 2008, correspondence requesting additional information to
complete the application.

¢. Miles Grant Water and Sewer Company.

d. 66 pages.

e. Letter to Commission Clerk — 6 pages; Attachments 60 pages.
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E-FILING

Commission Clerk

Office of Commission Clerk
Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, FL 32399

Re:  Docket No.: 070695-WS; Miles Grant Water and Sewer Company
2007 General Rate Increase Application
Our File No. 30057.149

Dear Ms. Cole:

The following are the Utility’s responses to the Comrmission Staff's May 20, 2008,
correspondence requesting additional information to complete the application:

Staff needs the following information to complete its review of the application.

1.

The following items relate to the pro forma plant additions reflected in
adjustment (A)(1) on MFR Schedule A-3.

For each addition, provide the following:
(a) a statement why each addition is necessary;

(bya copy of all invoices and other support documentation if the plant

addition has been completed or in process; p 80

PR

TN

(c) a copy of the signed contract or any bids, if the plant addition has not been;’ff: =
completed; v
(d) a status of the engineering and permitting efforts, if the plant addition has D
not been through the bidding processing; and w0 ;2
(e} The projected in-service date for each outstanding plant addition. g 2 o

#SS510N CLERK



Ann Cole, Commission Clerk
Office of Commission Clerk
Florida Public Service Commission
June 20, 2008

Page 2

RESPONSE:

Please see the schedule attached hereto entitled, “Miles Grant Water and Sewer
Company, Inc. — Pro Forma Plant.”

Because they are too voluminous to submit here, copies of the invoices and all
supporting documentation will be submitted under separate cover.

2. The following item pertains to the utility’'s water and wastewater treatment
systems. Please provide your latest Wastewater Treatment Plant Site Map that
shows the wastewater plants, equalization tanks, filter and reclaimed water
storage tank and any proposed additions.

RESPONSE:

Please see the maps attached hereto entitled, “Site Plan” and “Improvement Plan and
Sections.”

3. The following items relate to the utility’s requested rate case expense.

(a) For each individual person, in each firm providing consulting services to
the applicant pertaining to this docket, provide the billing rate, and an
itemized description of work performed. Please provide detail of hours
worked associated with each activity. Also provide a description and
associated cost for all expenses incurred to date.

(b)For each firm or consultant providing services for the applicant in this
docket, please provide copies of all invoices for services provided to date.

(c) If rate consultant invoices are not broken down by hour, please provide
reports that detail by hour, a description of actual duties performed, and
amount incurred to date.

(d) Please provide an estimate of costs to complete the case by hour for each
consultant or employee, including a description of estimated work to be
performed, and detail of the estimated remaining expense to be incurred
though the PAA process.

(e) Please provide an itemized list of all other costs estimate to be incurred
through the PAA process.

Rose, Sundstrom & Bentley, LLP
SANLAREO CENTER, 2180 W . S7art Roab 434, SinTe 2118, Lonawoon, Froripa 32779



Ann Cole, Commission Clerk
Office of Commission Clerk
Florida Public Service Commission
June 20, 2008

Page 3

RESPONSE:

Please see the invoices and estimates attached hereto as Attachments to Item 3.

4. The following items are related to Miscellaneous Service Charges. Please
complete the following charts:

RESPONSE:

After discussions with Staff regarding the level of specificity required of this response,
the Utility submits the following response: The Utility is requesting miscellaneous
service charges of $21.00 during business hours, and $42.00 after hours, (which charges
are consistent with what this Commission has recently approved for other subsidiaries of
Utilities, Inc.), in order to create uniformity in the implementation of such charges. The
Public Service Commission, in Docket Nos.: 060255-SU, 060256-SU, 060257-WS,
060254-SU, and 060261-WS, has recently authorized other subsidiaries of Utilities, Inc.,
to implement the same miscellaneous service charges requested by Miles Grant Water
and Sewer Company in this proceeding. In each of those cases the Order acknowledges
that the miscellaneous service charges contained in the now repealed Staff Advisory
Bulletin #13 are outdated and analyzed more recent Commission determinations. The
Commission concluded that miscellaneous service charges of $21.00 for business hours,
and $42.00 for after business hours were “cost based, reasonable, and consistent with
these we have approved for other utilities” (See Order No. PSC-07-0199-PAA-WS). A
calculation of those fees would generally be as follows:

During Business Hours:

Item: Cost:

Labor ($31.50/hr. x 0.5 hours) $15.63
Transportation $ 5.00
Total $20.63

Rose, Sundswom & Bentley, LLP
SANLANDIO CENTER, 2180 W. Svate Roab 434, Surve 2118, Lonawoob, FLORIDA 32779



Ann Cole, Commission Clerk
Office of Commission Clerk
Florida Public Service Commission
June 20, 2008

Page 4
After Hours:
Item: Cost:
Labor ($46.88/hr. X 0.75 hours)* | $35.16
Transportation $ 6.00
Total $41.16

* Represents time and a half wage and the longer time it takes an employee to get to the customer's
property after hours

5. The following items are related to the utility’s MFR schedules.

(a) As shown on MFR Schedule E-2, page 1 please explain why the 2”
Bulk rate customer was reclassified as a general service customer on
a going forward basis.

RESPONSE: The Miles Grant Country Club was getting a discounted tariffed rate in
relation to a typical general service customer; it appears that the above mentioned
customer uses approximately 19% of the total water and pays 1.8% of the revenues;
which is only 10% of their proportionate costs. The country club is the only user of the
wastewater treatment plant’s effluent. There is no alternate disposal method. The Utility
is in favor of having the country club pay a rate that is not subsidized by the rest of the
customer base. Also, the Utility considered that the average irrigation customer is not
really a “bulk user” unless there are expenses not incurred because of the nature of their
service; the country club does not have any costs of services that should not be allocated
to them. Thus, the Utility wanted to include this customer as a regular retail (not bulk)
customer for the use of potable water (for any purpose) and to correct for the
adjustment, the Utility took an average of the last five years of the country club’s
consumption to determine the gallonage rate for all customers, which are reflected in the
MFR Schedule E-2, page 1.

(b)  During the test year, as shown on the MFR Schedule E-2, page 1,
the 2” Bulk rate customer was presented as an irrigation customer.

Please explain the usage characteristics of this customer.

RESPONSE: Please see the attached service agreement, marked “Service Agreement.”

Rose, Sundstrom & Bentley, LLP
Santantx CENTER, 2180 W. Syare Roan 134, Sorre 2118, Lonawoon, FLORIDA 32779



Ann Cole, Commission Clerk
Office of Commission Clerk
Florida Public Service Commission
June 20, 2008

Page 5

(c)  Shown on the bottom of the MFR Schedule E-2, page 1, the utility
has provided a total for consumption over the last 5 year average for
consumption. The 5 year average for consumption was used as the
proposed adjusted gallons for the previous 2” Bulk rate customer.
However, consumption appears to be low for years 1, 2, and 4. Is
the average usage appropriate on a going forward basis? Please
explain the variation of consumption within the last 5 years.

RESPONSE: The Utility believes that the average usage is as appropriate as any other
comparison method. The Miles Grant Country Club is using potable water that is
supplementing reuse. Thus, in wet years the customer has an adequate water supply. In
dry years, the Utility sells water to augment the reclaimed water delivered from the

Miles Grant wastewater treatment plant.

(d) The billing analysis contained in Volume II shown on MFR Schedule
E-14, pages 2, 3, and 10 for water or wastewater indicates a few

customers with consumption over 100,000 gallons.

o Are the high levels of consumption presented in the billing analysis
correct?

RESPONSE: The levels of billing consumption presented in the billing analysis are
correct. Please see the attachment marked “Discovery Item Number 5(d).”

e If this is correct, please provide copies of the customer’s consumption for
each month of the test year and explain the significant high level of
consumption.

RESPONSE: Please see the attachment marked “Discovery Item Number 5{d)” to see
the customer’s consumption for each month of the test year.

e If this is not correct, please make the appropriate adjustments to correct
consumption and resubmit E-14, pages 2, 3, and 10.

RESPONSE: The levels of billing consumption presented in the billing analysis are
correct. Please see the attachment marked “Discovery Item Number 5(d).” Therefore,
there are not any necessary adjustments to correct consumption and resubmit E-14,
pages 2, 3, and 10.

Rose, Sundstrom & Bentley, LLP
Sanpanty CENTER, 2180 W, Svark Roan 434, Sinre 2118, Lonowoon, Florioa 32779



Ann Cole, Commission Clerk
Office of Commission Clerk
Florida Public Service Commission
June 20, 2008

Page 6

(e)

It has been Commission practice to calculate 20% differential in the
wastewater gallonage charge between residential and general
service customers. A review of the wastewater gallonage charges
presented on MFR Schedule E-2, page 2 indicates the gallonage
charges have been calculated without a residential/general service
differential. Please resubmit MFR Schedule E-2, page 2 to reflect
the appropriate gallonage rate for general service and the proposed
revenues.

RESPONSE: Please see attached revised MFR Schedule E-2, page 2, marked “Discovery

Items 5(e).”

MSF/cm
Enclosures

Very truly yours,

} W - %@MV

MARTIN S. FRIEDMAN
For the Firm

cc:  John Hoy, Chief Regulatory Officer (w/enclosures)
Rick Durham, Regional Vice President for Operations (w/enclosures)
Patrick C. Flynn, Regional Director (w/enclosures)
Ms. Deborah Swain (w/enclosures)
Mr. Frank Seidman (w/enclosures)

M\ ALTAMONTENUTILITIES INCAMITES GRANTA(.149) 2007 RATE CASENPSC Clerk 07 (Response to RAl ir.doc

Rose, Sundsirom & Bentley, LLP

SaNtanTr CENTER, 2180 W, Svare Roan 434, Surre 2118, Lonawoon, Foonna 32779
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iles Grant Water and Sewer Company, huc.
#ro Forma Plant

Additonal Total EST Estimated
Prajuct Capualized  [nvoiced Costs lo Cost 1o Cost of Date of
Sysiem Bescripuon Project ID ¥ Wi ¥ 1DC Time Costg Darz Complete Project Water Sewer Reuse Completion % Complete Retuments Justificatior:
Miles Grant Install HSP Vanable 4637 0U)-0648-115-07-02 2 477 10868 20,343 % 2482 1 23.000 1902 T 92007 100% Mo retirements Eliminate check vaive hammer at
Frequency Drives pumip shuioff causing premature
wear on check valves
Miles Grant Replace generator fuel 1766 NUL640-11707-01 195 170 23,11 26,106 $ 24,800 e 6% 112872007 100%  Retired 500gal single-walled tank Single-wall wanks replac.d with
tanks a WWTP mstalled in 1873 A double-walled tanks o mcel curment
7530-gal tank was insatled o the  DEP peuolewn storage wank rule
WTP. origtnal tnk s stil in
Miles Grant Replace 5 fire hydrams 4237 091.0640-115-07-04 49 68 34,G0% 24320 5 13,000 100% 111742007 100 Retired 42) hydranis instalied in - Hydranls were oot repai-abie and no
1972 and (3 instatled n 1979 longer functioned
Miles Grant Replace HSP check 092 091.0640-115-07-03 - 58 10.976 1,3 H 8,500 0% 6/28/2007 100%  Reured 2 ¢ach 6-nch check Tha valves no longer finciioned
valves at WTP

valves installed in 2005 and 2006, properly causing high service pumps
L cycle on and off repe.edly.

Touwl 442 781 80,588 31.816 5 2632 % 71300



Attachments Responding to Item 2
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Attachments Responding to Item 3




Analysis of Rate Case Expense Florida Public Service Commission
Company: Miles Grant Water £ Sewer Co Scheduie: B-10
Docket No: 070695-WS Page 1ol )
Test Year Ended: 06/30/07 Preparer: Erin Povich

Explanation: Provide the total amount of rate case expense requested in the application. Slate whether the fotal includes the amount up 1o proposed agency action or through a hearing before the Commission. Provide a list of each firm

providing service
1} 2 (] [T 5 (8} ) (8} o 10y
Esumate
Actual () Esfimate of
Counsel, Hourty Total Estimate Hours Actual Complete Charges 1o
Consultant of Rate Per  Estimated  of Charges by  Worked as Charges Through Complete
Line ¥ Fim of Vendor Name Witness Person Hours Firm of $/11/08 Incurred PAA Through PAA Type of Service Rendered

1 Milian Swain & Assocites Deborah Swain 180 5 310 17 00 3,060 500 D00 Assist wHFRs. data requesis. sudd faciitation
2 Meian, Swain & Assccisles Cyntwa Yapp 140 m 46,620 34170 47.828 1500 2100 Assst wiMFRs, data requesis, audil facitation
3 Milian, Swain & Associates Masia Beavo 140 12 1845 EXE] 526 100 140 Assist w/MFRs, data requests, audd faciiiabon
4 Miian, Swain & Associates Sandia Castilo 50 2 100 200 100 100 50 Assisi w/MFRs, data requosts. audit facination
5 Rose, Sundstrom & Bertey, LLP Martn Fedman 290 156 45,240 2230 12,600 132.70 38773 Legal Feos

6 MER Consulanis Frank Sedman 135 50 6 500 zn 3039 4400 6,240 USUAnalysis. Assist w! MFRs. 0ats requests, sudi [acidaton
7 Pubhc Service Commmssion afa nia 4,000 ria - 0.00 - Fiing Fee

& Water Service Corp. Joba Hoy o6 50 4,800 200 BG4 50,00 4750 Assist w/MFR=, data requests, auchl facikdation
9 Water Sorvice Corp. Kistan Weeks a5 kL 13,800 6100 2806 300 00 13500 Assist wiMFRs, data cequests, aud facination
10 Vvater Servce Corp Pamck Fiymn 3392 00 3392 2475 340 10000 3202 Assist wMFRs, data requests, auc facibtabon
1 Water Servico Corp Michelle Rochow 2 450 15.300 18850 6,409 45000 14850 Assist wiMFRs, data requests, sul faciiabon
12 Water Service Corp Enn Povich kil 450 13,950 17 3627 450,00 13500 Assist wMFRs, dats requests, audit facitation
12 Water Servca Carp Drpasquale, Susan M 3392 100 3302 1100 373 10000 3207 Assist wMFRs, data requests. audd facinanon
14 Walet Serace Cotp Curham, Rick 5649 50 4825 550 531 45000 4375 AswsiwiMFRS, dala requests. audit faciitanon
15 Water Service Comp, Marzouk, Micheile 4 100 1,400 3850 538 45000 950 Asmst w/MFRs, daks 1oquests. audit facilfiation
18 Water Service Corp. Valeria, LaWanda 14 00 1,400 9524 1333 45060 950 Assist w/MFRs. data isquests. audit faciialion

na 1779 1,000 Cusiomer nONCEs posiage

13 Water Service Corp. wa na 2, na
14 Water Senvice Comp. na nfa 28 aa 342 nia 200 TCusiomer potices, slock
15 Water Service Corp. nia na 1200 na - nia 1.200  Travel, Awfare
16 Waler Service Corp. wa na 1600 na - nia 1500 Travel Hotel/Accommodation
17 Water Service Corp. wa na 400 s 5 nia 400 Travel Rental Car
18 Water Senvice Corp nfa wa 12,000 a 12,000 nia 12,000 Fed Ex, copies & oihar mrsc
19 Estimate Through 314781 k3 99,560 $ 14087
0 [x | PAA
21 [} Commussion ety
22 Amorhzation Penod 4 Years
23 Explanation if dfferent from Section 367 0816, Flonda
24 Amoruzation of Rate Case Expense
Ay 1B} =}

Waier Vasiowater Total
25 Prior unamortized rale case expenses 0 0 s :
25 Cisrent rate cass expense 51,306 48,254 99,560
27 Tolal piojected raie cass expermss 5106 48254 99,560
23 Annual Amortizaton 3 12826 E 12,064 £ 24 890
23 Methad of allccabion between systems.
30 Customers (based on ERC Counts GEMI0O7) 11181 105186 2169 7

31 Percentage of average cusiomers. 8% 100%




P.0. Box 13427
Taltahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673

g-mail: frankden@nettally.com

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

\L N
QﬁUﬁ 69 .
()J"\B{\Q) ?(.\f*\\{(g

A

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

UTILITIES, INC.

2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062

CONSULTING -~ LUSI - U&U - HTY 2006/7

Week of:

08/13/07

08/20/07

08/27/07

EXPENSES

PAYMENTS
09/10/07

FS

FS

FS

WEDGEFIELD - U&U - HTY 2006/7
LONGWOCD - U&U HTY - 2006/7
MILES GRANT - U&U - HTY 2006/7

PREVIOUS BALANCE

CONSULTING - ALL CASES -
COMMUNICATIONS W/MSA.

CONSULTING - ALL CASES - RESEARCH RE
PREVIOUS CASES & Ars; ESTABLISH BASE
DATA. COMMUNICATE W/MSA & UI.

CONSULTINq - ALL CASES - CONFERENCE
CALL W/UI & MSA RE STRATEGY FOR ALL

CASES.
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

AND CREDITS
PAYMENT, as of

BALANCE DUE

\\p}§“ %;\3

oy WHEL
09/10/07
20026.10
$ 0.00
HOURS
0.50 67.50
11.00 1485.00
1.50 202.50
13.00 $ 1755.00
- 0.00
§ 1755.00

Note: Allocation for “All Cases” - LUSI - 60%: Wedgefield - 20%: Longwood - 20%



P.O. Box 13427
Tailahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673

e-mail: frankden@nettally.com

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

CONSULTING -

Week of:

09/03/0Q7

05/03/07

09/03/07

09/03/07

08/24/07

10/01/07

1G6/08/07

1a6/08/707

10722707

UTILITIES,

INC.

2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062

FS

F3

Fs

FS

FgS

FS

FS

ES

FS

LUSI - U&U - HTY 2006/7
WEDGEFIELD - U&U - HTY 2006/7
LONGWOOD - U&U BTY - 2006/7
MILES GRANT - U&U -~ HTY 2006/7

PREVIQUS BALANCE
CONSULTING - ON-SITE INSPECTION

LUSI SYSTEM.

CONSULTING - ON-SITE INSPECTION

LONGWOOD, WEDGEFIELD, MILES GRANT.

CONSULTING -~ MEET W/CLIENT RE
ALL CASES.

CONSULTING - ON-SITE INSPECTION
TRAVEL, ﬁhL CASES.

CONSULTING - ALL CASES - DEVELOP
HISTORICAL FLOW,CUSTOMER AND
SYSTEM DATA.

CONSULTING - ALL CASES - DEVELOP
HISTORICAL FLOW,CUSTOMER AND
SYSTEM DATA.

CONSULTING - ALL CASES - DEVELOP
HISTORICAL FLOW, CUSTOMER AND
SYSTEM DATA.

CONSULTING - ALL CASES - DEVELOP
HISTORICAL FLOW, CUSTOMER AND
SYSTEM DATA.

CONSULTING - ALL CASES -~ DEVELCOP
HISTORICAL FLOW,CUSTOMER AND
SYSTEM DATA & “F” SCHEDULES.

11/01/07

20026.10
$ 1755.

HOURS

8.00 1080.
10.00 1350.
2.00 270.
11.00 1485.
8.00 1080.
6.00 810.
4.00 540.
10.00 1350.
6.00 R10

00

00

00

00

00

00

oo

00

-0



P.O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427

Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673
e-mail; frankden @nettally.com

Management & Regulatory Consultants, inc.

{11/01/07 Invoice) - cont.

10/22/07 FS

10/22/07 FS

10/22/07

10/22/07

EXPENSES
09/06/07

09/06/07
05/05/07
09/05/07

PAYMENTS
11/01/07

FS

F5

CONSULTING - LUSI - DEVELOP
HISTORICAL FLOW, CUSTOMER AND
SYSTEM DATA & “F” SCHEDULES.

CONSULTING -~ WEDGEFIELD -

DEVELOP “F” SCHEDULES.

CONSULTING - LONGWOOD -
DEVELOP “F" SCHEDULES.

CONSULTING - MILES GRANT -
DEVELOP “F” SCHEDULES.
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

TALL/CLERMONT / ALTAMONTE / TALL
548 MILES @ $0.45/MILE

TOLLS

LODGING

MEALS

AND CREDITS
PAYMENT, as of

BALANCE DUE

5.00 675.00

2.00 270.

2.00 270.

2.00 270

00

00

0o

76.00 $10260.

$12423.

00

Note: Allocation for “All Cases” - LUSI - 60%; Wedgefield, Longwood & Miles Grant - 13.33% each.
Allocation for Wedgefield, Longwood & Miles Grant, only - 33.33% each.



P.O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850} 877-0673

e-mail: frankden @nettally.com

Management & Regulatory Consultants, inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.

2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062

CONSULTING - LUSI - U&U - HTY 2006/7
WEDGEFIELD - U&U - HTY 2006/7

MILES GRANT - U&U - HTY 2006/7

PREVIOUS BALANCE

Week of:

11/01/07 FS CONSULTING - WEDGEFIELD-
PREPARE U&U ANALYSIS.

11/05/07 FS CONSULTING - WEDGEFIELD-
PREPARE U&U ANALYSIS.

11/0%/07 FS CONSULTING -~ MILES GRANT
DRAFT “F* SCHEDULES.

11/05/07 FS CONSULTING - ALL CASES
PREPARE U&U ANALYSIS.

L4
11/12/07 FS CONSULTING -~ WEDGEFIELD-
DRAFT “Fr SCHEDULES.

11/12/07 FS CONSULTING - LUST
PREPARE U&U ANALYSIS.

12/16/07 FS CONSULTING - LUSI
PREPARE U&U ANALYSIS.

FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

EXPENSES

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS

11/05/07 PAYMENT (Check no. 643032)

BALANCE DUE

12/27/07
20026.10
oo, % 1ALt
9. Infck
$12423.17
HOURS
3.00 405.00
3.00 405.00
7.00 8945 .00
2.00 270.00
5.00 675.00
5.00 675.00
1.00 135.00
26.00 S 35106.00
- 1755.00
S

Note: Allocation for “All Cases™ - LUSI - 60%; Wedgefield - 20%: Miles Grant - 20%

/
4 15%

\
371

*39a9



P.0O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL. 32317-3427 gﬁﬂ
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673 ~

e-mait: frankden @ netially.com

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

UTILITIES, INC.

2335 SANDERS ROAD

NORTHEROOK, IL 60062 02/14/08

20026 .10
CONSULTING - LUSI - U&l} ~ HTY 2006/7

WEDGEFIELD - U&U - HTY 2006/7
MILES GRANT -~ U&U - HTY 2006/7

PREVIOUS BALANCE $14178.17
Week of: HOURS
01/07/08 FS CONSULTING - LUSI - DISCUSSION
& REVISION “F* SCHEDULES. 4.00 540.00

01/14/08 FS CONSULTING - WEDGEFIELD & LUSI
REVISED “F” SCHEDULES TQ MSA. 2.50 337.50

01/14/08 FS CONSULTING - ALL CASES
PREPARE RC EXPENSE INPUT FOR MFR. 1.00 13s5.00

01/21/08 FS CONSULTING - ALl CASES
RECONCILE F-9 & F-10 TO RECORDS. 8.00 1080.00

01/28/08 FS CONSULTING - LUSI
REVISE F-3 SCHEDULE RE PEAK DAY, 0.50 67.50

1
01/28/08 FS CONSULTING - ALYL CASES
PREPARE & FORWARD FINAL “F” SCHEDULES

ALONG W/CORRECTED VERSIONS. 3.25 438.75
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 19.25 $ 2598.75
EXPENSES
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
-10260.00

01/03/08 PAYMENT (Check no. 703746)

BALANCE DUE $ 6516.92
NOTE: Bal. Due = current $£2,598.75 + £53,510.00 from 12/27/07 invoice +

$408.17 expenses from 11/01/07 invoice.

Note: Allocation for "All Cases” - LUSI - 60%; wedgefield - 20%; Miles
Grant - 20%

Note: LUSI is Lake Utility Services, Inc.

SR Pl
% g S0



Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD

NORTHEBROOK,

CONSULTING - LUSI - U&U -~ HTY 2006/7
WEDGEFIELD - U&U - HTY 2006/7
MILES GRANT - U&U - HTY 2C006/7

Week of:
02/11/08 FS

02/25/08 FS

EXPENSES

PREVIOUS BALANCE

CONSULTING - LUSI -
UPDATE “F” SCHEDULES.

CONSULTING - MILES GRANT -~
UPDATE "“F” SCHEDULES.
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS

03/04/08 PAYMENT,

as of

BALANCE DUE

P.0. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673

e-mail: frankden@nettaily.com

IL 60062

03/04/08
20026.10

$ 6516.

HOURS

0.50 67.

0.50 67

92

50

.00

1.00 $ 135.

Note: Allocation for “All Cases™ - LUSI - 60%; Wedgefield - 20%; Miles Grant - 20%
Note: LUSI is Lake Utility Services, Inc.

Lee

Y4l

37 310%

i1 50

g iy1.00

00



P.O. Box 13427
Tallahassee, FL 32317-3427
Phone or Fax (850) 877-0673

e-mail: frankden@nettally.com

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc,

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062

CONSULTING ~ LUSI - U&U - HTY 2006/7

Week of:

03/17/08

03/17/08

03/24/08

03/24/08

04/14/08

EXPENSES

PAYMENTS
02/28/08
03/19/08
04/15/08

WEDGEFIELD - U&U - HTY 2006/7
MILES GRANT -~ U&U - HTY 2006/7

PREVIOUS BALANCE

FS CONSULTING - WEDGEFIELD
TEL.CONF. W/M. BRAVO RE PROFORMA EXP.

FS CONSULTING - LUSI
DEFICIENCY LETTER REVIEW.

FS CONSULTING - WEDGEFIELD
DISCUSSION RE STRATEGY FOR WW: REVISE

MFS5's FOR WW CIAC.

FS CONSULTING - LUSI -
CONF. CALL RE DEFICIENCIES.

FS CONSULTING - LUSI -
CONF. CALL RE ALL 3 CASES.
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

. t
AND CREDITS
PAYMENT
PAYMENT
PAYMENT

BALANCE DUE

05/07/08
20026.10
$ 6516.92
HOURS
0.50 67.50
0.25 33,75
2.25 303.75
0.50 67.50
0.50 67.50
1.00 s 540.00
- 3510.0C0
- 2598.75%
- 135.00
$ 813.17

Note: Allocation for “All Cases™ - LUST - 60%: Wedgefield - 20%; Miles Grant - 20%
Note: LUSI is Lake Utility Services, Inc.



Management & Regulatory Consuitants, Inc.
Summary of Rate Case Expense from Invoices through June, 2008
Miles Grant Utilities, Inc. - Docket No. 070695-WS

BILLED EXPENSE
Assist w/ &
Repond to
Prepare Data Req. Corrections
MFRs & New info. o MFR Expenses Totals
Frank Seidman Hours 22.11 22.11
Billing Rate: $135/hr  Amount $2,985.52 $0.00 $0.00 $54.42 $3,039.94

PROJECTED REMAINING EXPENSE

Prepare  Prepare for
Assist w/ &, Direct & & Attend
Repond to Rebuttal Hearings &
Discovery  Testimony  Agenda
Requests & Exhibits Conference Exp. (est.) Totals
Frank Seidman Hours 40.00 4.00 44,00

Billing Rate: $135/hr  Amount $0.00 $4,000.00 $400.00 $300.00 $4,700.00

Cumutative Total, Billed and Remaining $7,739.94



LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.0. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.E.L# 592783536 B50} 877-6555 LEASE REFER TO INVOL B
{850} GIHEN BEGHER IS OICE NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD SEPTEMBER 13, 2007

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 36197
FILE # 30057-00149
PAGE 1

MATTER: MILES GRANT WATER ANS SEWER CO
2007 RATE CASE

8/21/07 CONFERENCE CALL WITH UTILITIES, INC. AND .80
CONSULTANTS REGARDING STRATEGY AND GOALS FOR
UPCOMING RATE CASE.

8/28/07 REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM PREVIOUS DOCKETS fOR .30
INFORMATION REQUIRED BY RULE 25-30.430 REGARDING
TEST YEAR LETTERS.

8/29/07 LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING UTILITY'S PREVIOUS RATE .80
ASSESSMENT; DRAFT TEST YEAR LETTER PURSUANT TO
RULE 25-30.430 OF THE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE.

8/30/07 BEGIN DRAFT APPLICATION FOR RATE INCREASE .80
PURSUANT TO RULE 25-30.436, FAC; LEGAL RESEARCH
AND REVIEW OF ANNUAL REPORT FOR INFORMATION
REQUIRED BY RULE 25-30.436.

TOTAL HOURS 2.70
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 607.50
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ .00
TOTAL STATEMENT $ 607.50

N CRTAYE
yencloy ¥ Cbelet



LAW OFFIGES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.0. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 323021567
F.E.L# 59.2783536 {850} B77-6555 PYEASE REFER 10 INVOICE NUMBER
UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD OCTOBER 10, 2007
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 36262
FILE # 30057-00149
PAGE 1
MATTER: MILES GRANT WATER ANS SEWER CO
2007 RATE CASE
9/13/07 TRAVEL TO TALLAHASSEE FOR MEETING WITH PSC STAFF 2.30

REGARDING UPCOMING RATE CASE AND CONFERENCES WITH
MR. HOY AND MR. FLYNN EN ROUTE.

TOTAL HOURS 2.30
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 632.50
TELECOPIER 150
LONG DISTANCE CALLS 1.75
LEXIS SERVICE 8.72
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $11.97
TOTAL STATEMENT $ 644.47

~ ViSYALS

imvoﬁﬁ-#
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LAW OFFIEES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.0. BOX 1667
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567
F.E\# 50-2783536 (850) B77-6555 PLEASE REFER 10 INVOICE NUMBER

UTTLITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD NOVEMBER 9, 2007
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 36534

FILE # 30057-00149

PAGE 1

MATTER: MILES GRANT WATER ANS SEWER €O
2007 RATE CASE

10/03/07 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING PRO FORMA PLANT .40
ITEMS; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF TEST YEAR
LETTER WITH RESPECT TO PRO FORMA ITEMS AND
DETAILS OF LAST RATE REVIEW; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE
TO CLIENT REGARDING NEED FOR INFORMATION ON
UPGRADES TO PLANT AND CHANGES IN OPERATING

' PROCEDURES SINCE LAST RATE REVIEW.

10/11/07 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF TEST YEAR LETTER; .20

CONFERENCE WITH MARTY FRIEDMAN REGARDING CONTENT
: OF TEST YEAR LETTER.

10/30/07 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM PATRICK FLYNN .40
REGARDING TEST YEAR LETTER; REVIEW AND REVISE
TEST YEAR LETTER TO INCLUDE MAJOR CHANGES AND

UPGRADES .

TOTAL HOURS 1.00
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 22500

PHOTOCOPIES . ) o 75

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ .75

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 225.75




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.O. BOX 1587
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.E.l# 59-2783536 ’ (850) B77-8555 Wﬁ-lEéng EKEFrETIIQNTé) INVOICE NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD DECEMBER 12, 2007

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 36774
FILE # 30057-00149
PAGE 1

MATTER: MILES GRANT WATER ANS SEWER CO
2007 RATE CASE

11/05/07 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM PATRICK FLYNN 30
REGARDING MAJOR CHANGES 7O THE WATER AND
WASTEWATER SYSTEMS SINCE THE LAST RATE
PROCEEDING; REVIEW AND REVISE TEST YEAR LETTER TO
INCORPORATION SAID MAJOR CHANGES: DRAFT
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING TEST YEAR
LETTER, REQUESTING COMMENTS AND ADVISING OF
INTENDED FILING DATE.

TOTAL HOURS 30
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 67.50
FEDERAL EXPRESS 5.56
PHOTOCOPIES 18.00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 23.56

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 91.06




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.0. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.E.L#59-2783536 B50) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER 7O I
(850) Ry REGRER ] é} NVOICE NUMBER

UTTLITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD JANUARY 14, 2008

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 36824
FILE # 30057-00149
PAGE 1

MATTER: MILES GRANT WATER ANS SEWER CO
2007 RATE CASE

12/05/07 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM PSC APPROVING TEST .30
YEAR LETTER; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT AND
RATE CASE CONSULTANTS REGARDING APPROVAL OF TEST
YEAR AND REQUIREMENTS CONTAINED IN THE PSC'S

LETTER.
TOTAL HOURS .30
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 67.50
PHOTOCOPIES _ 1.00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $1.00
TOTAL STATEMENT $ 68.50



EE.L#59-2783536

UTILITI
ATTN:

ES, INC
JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062

LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LILP

P.0. BOX 1567

TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

{850) 877-6555

EASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER

WH EN REMITTING

FEBRUARY 10, 2008
INVOICE # 37022
FILE # 30057-00149
PAGE 1

1/15/08

1/31/08

MATTER:

MILES GRANT WATER ANS SEWER CO

2007 RATE CASE

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING .20
APPROPRIATE FILING FEE FOR RATE CASE; LEGAL

RESEARCH REGARDING CALCULATION OF FILING FEES;

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SIZE AND ERCS

SERVED BY UTILITY: DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT

REGARDING APPROPRIATE FILING FEE.
REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON "F" SCHEDULES

TOTAL HOURS

PROFESSIONAL FEES

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED

TOTAL STATEMENT

.30

50
$ 142.00

$ 142.00

Noc, H A8wlS
2110(00



UTILITI
ATTN:

LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.0. BOX 1567

TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.EL# 56-2763536 (850) 877-8555

ES, INC
JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062

MARCH 11, 2008

INVOICE # 37172
FILE # 30057-00149

PAGE 1

2/22/08
2/26/08
2/28/08

MATTER: MILES GRANT WATER ANS SEWER CO

2007 RATE CASE

RESEARCH AND DRAFT APPLICATION FOR RATE INCREASE.

REVIEW F SCHEDULES

MISCELLANECUS FINAL PREPARATION FOR FILING

TOTAL HOURS
PROFESSIONAL FEES

LONG DISTANCE CALLS
EXTRA CLERICAL SUPPORT
FILING FEE

PHOTOCOPIES

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED

TOTAL STATEMENT

$ 1,160.00

.25
173.10
4,000.00
542 .50

$ 4,715.85

$ 5,875.85

2.10
1.70

4.00



LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
P.0. BOX 1567

TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.E.L#59-2783535 (850} B77-65655 \l;—'VLHEémNS% ER&F];_E‘_I'?N'I"? INVOICE NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC

ATTN:  JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD APRIL 14, 2008

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 37498
FILE # 30057-00149
PAGE 1

MATTER: MILES GRANT WATER ANS SEWER €O
2007 RATE CASE
3/11/08 DORAFT RATE CASE SYNOPSIS PURSUANT TO FLORIDA RULE 1.80

25-22.0407; REVIEW MATERIALS NEEDED TO DRAFT
SYNOPSIS, INCLUDING: REVIEW OF PROPOSED INTERIM
AND FINAL RATES, REVIEW OF APPLICATION FOR RATE
INCREASE AND REVIEW OF TEST YEAR LETTER.

3/26/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. FLETCHER OF PSC WHO .30
TELEPHONED AND DRAFT LETTER TO MS. COLE EXTENDING
INTERIM RATE DEADLINE.

TOTAL HOURS : 2.10

PROFESSTIONAL FEES $ 582.00

FEDERAL EXPRESS 183.42
LEXIS SERVICE 3.01
OUTSIDE PHOTOCOPIES 1.608 81
PHOTOCOPTES 1.75
"~ TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $1.796.99

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 2.378.99




LAW DFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.C. BOX 1567

_ TAUAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567
F.Ei#50-2783536 {850) 877-8555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING
UTILITIES, INC
ATIN: JOHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD MAY 12. 2008
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 37585
FILE # 30057-00149
PAGE 1
MATTER: MILES GRANT WATER ANS SEWER CO
2007 RATE CASE
4/02/08 REVIEW PSC DEFICIENCY LETTER AND LETTER TO MS. .30
, WEEKS ACCORDINGLY
4/63/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CYNTHIA YAPP REGARDING .30

RESPONSES TO STAFF'S DEFICIENCY LETTER: REVIFW
CORRESPONDENCE FROM CYNTHIA YAPP REGARDING SAME:
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ERIN POVICH REGARDING
-RESPONSES TO STAFF'S DEFICIENCY LETTER; REVIEW
CORRESPONDENCE FROM ERIN POVICH REGARDING SAME.

4/08/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CYNTHIA YAPP REGARDING .30
DEFICIENCY RESPONSES; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM
CYNTHIA YAPP REGARDING MFR SCHEDULES AND
RESPONSES TO DEFICIENCIES.

4/09/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CYNTHIA YAPP REGARDING . 2.60
RESPONSES TO STAFF'S DEFICIENCY LETTER; REVIEW
CORRESPONDENCE FROM CYNTHIA YAPP REGARDING
RESPONSES TO STAFF'S DEFICIENCY LETTER; REVIEW
RATE ORDER NO. 20066 REGARDING APPROVED 0&M
EXPENSES; REVIEW REVISED B-7 AND B-8 SCHEDULES
FROM CLIENT: REVIEW SCHEDULES RECEIVED FROM
MILIAN SWAIN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MILIAN
SWAIN REGARDING REVISED "C" SCHEDULES; REVIEW
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CORRECTIONS TO REVISED
"C" SCHEDULES; REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO
STAFF'S DEFICIENCY NOTICE.

4/10/08 REVIEW AND REVISE DEFICIENCY RESPONSE .20
4/10/08 REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO STAFF'S DEFICIENCY 2.10
LETTER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CYNTHIA YAPP
REGARDING REVISED SCHEDULES AND RESPONSES TO
DEFICIENCIES; REVIEW ALL REVISED SCHEDULES;
PREPARE DOCUMENT AND ATTACHMENTS FOR FILING.

4/14/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS .30
REGARDING REQUESTS FOR INFORMATION FROM THE
OFFICE OF PUBLIC COUNSEL.



LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.O. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1587

F.ELY 59-2783536 ' 850} B77-8555 PLEASE REFER T
{850) R BErER ) G0 INVOICE NUMBER

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice #: 37585 PAGE 2

4/16/08 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. FLETCHER OF PSC WHO .30
TELEPHONED AND LETTER TO MS. WEEKS

4/21/08 REVIEW STAFF'S REVISED RECOMMENDATION: REVIEMW .30

FIRST RECOMMENDATION IN COMPARISON WITH REVISED
COMPARISON: CONFERENCE WITH MARTY FRIEDMAN
REGARDING SAME.

4/24/08 REVIEW DETAIL OF COAS AND LETTER TO MR. FLETCHER .30
AT THE PSC CONCERNING SAME

4/25/08 REVIEW STAFF RECOMMENDATION AND LETTER TO MR. HOY .30
CONCERNING SAME

4/28/08 REVIEW STAFF RECOMMENDATION REGARDING SUSPENDING 1.80

RATES. INTERIM RATES AND UTILITY UNDERTAKING:
DRAFT INTERIM RATE CUSTOMER NOTICE; DRAFT
CORPORATE UNDERTAKING FOR MILES GRANT: DRAFT
CORPORATE GUARANTY FOR UTILITIES, INC.; DRAFT
PROPOSED INTERIM RATE WATER AND WASTEWATER TARIFF
SHEETS: CONFERENCE WITH PATRICK FLYNN REGARDING
CURRENT TARIFF SHEETS.

TGTAL HOURS 9.10
PROFESSTONAL FEES $ 2,523.50
PHOTOCOPIES : 42.50

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 42.50

TOTAL STATEMENT ' $ 2.566.00




ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

ESTIMATE TO COMPLETE THROUGH PAA PROCESS

Description

Telephone conferences and communications with client regarding rate
case issues

Respond to Staffs data requests; Telephone conferences with client,
consultants and Staff regarding same
Review audit report; Conference with client regarding response to

same; Prepare response to same

Travel to Martin County and attend customer meeting; Respond to
customer complaints

Review Staffs Recommendations; Conferences with client and
consultants regarding same

Prepare for and travel to Tallahassee to attend Agenda

Telephone conferences and communications with client and consultants
e same

Review PAA Order

Telephone conferences and communications with client, consultants
and Commission Staff re same

Draft revised tariff sheets, notice of new rates and other implementing
documentation

Letter, telephone conferences and communications with Commission
Staff re same

Miscellaneous post-PAA noticing and filing matters, COAs, Final Rate
Case Expense, reports, ete,

Total estimated fees

Estimated Disbursements
Description

Telephone and facsimile

Travel and Accommodation (1 trip to attend Agenda Conference; 1 trip to
attend Customer Meeting)

Photocopying
Federal Express

Total estimated disbursements

Hours

2.0
12.0

4.5

9.5

1.5

14.0

1.0

2.0
2.0

1.5
3.0

53.5

Fees

$580.00
$3,480.00

$1,305.00

$2,755.00

$435.00

$4,060.00

$250.00
$145.00

$580.00

$580.00

$435.00

$870.00

$15,515.00

$20.00

$1,000.00
$80.00
$60.00
$1,160.00



Current Timesheets Report Milian, Swain & Associates Page 1
Order By: Project Project: uoz2-14 — uUnZ2-14
Period: 0710172007 — 05/30/2008
Project
Employee P/E Dep  Staff Work Date OVIM ST STATE Hours Worked Biltable Hours
U02-14 Miles Grant Water & Sewer Company
cyY Cynthia Yapp 08/10/2007  FIN 007 08/10/2007 N B 11.75 11.75
MFR PREPARATON o i
cY Cynthia Ya Yapp ) T08A7T2007 FIN 007 0311 712007 N 8 T 225 2250
IPREPARE M MFR T T ST s |
cy Cynihia Yapp ‘0B/24/2007  FIN 007 0B/242007 N B 77 3700 31.00
PREFARE MFR |
1
oY Cynthia Yapp 08/31/2007 FIN 007 O®&/31/2007 N B 75 18.75
8/27/0T CONFERENCE CALL RE: MFR T T e
oy iEynthia Yapp 09/21/2007  FIN 007 09/21/2007 N B 2325 2335
WINIMUM FILING REQUIREMENTS ) i
ey Cynthia Yapp 10/05/2007  FIN 007 10/052007 N B 3.00 3.00
cy Cynthia Yapp 10/26/2007  FIN 007 10/26/2007 N B 2.00 2.00
cy Cynthia Yapp 11/02/2007  FIN 007 11/02/2007 N B 0.25 0,25
DATA REQUEST T )
cy Cynthia Yapp 11116/2007 FIN__ 007 11/18/2007 N B 950 9.50
MINIMUM FILING REQUIREMENTS ) i
cy Cynthia Yapp o 11/23/2007 FIN 007 "11/23/2007 N B 18.00 18.00
Prepére Minimum Fiting F waremenrs & related worksheets T T
cY ‘Cynihia Yapp 111302007  FIN 007 11/30:2007 N B T T T T 22.25
f’repare Minimum Filing qurefﬁ?e;?E & related worksheets - '——-j
cY Cynthia Yapp 1211472007 FIN 007 12/14/2007 N B 0.75 0.75
MFR PREPARATION N - L . - _
cy Cynthia Yapp 1212172007 RN GO7  A2/212007 N B 125 1.25
WFRPREPARATION ——~ T T
cy Cymihia Yapp T01/0472008  FIN 007 017042008 N B 0.25 0.25
[CONFERENCE CALL RE: al L OCATIONS i
cy Cynthia Yapp 01/11/2008  FIN D07 O01/11/2008 N 8 24 50 24.50
2007 TY MINIMUM FILING REQUIREMENTS !
cy Cynihia Yapp 01/18/2008  FIN 007 01/16/2008 N B 12.25 12.25
2007 TY MINIMUM FILING REQUIREMENTS T T j " T o j
oy Cynithia Yapp 01/25/2008  FIN 007 01/25/2008 N 8 13.50 13.50
2007 TY MINIMUM FILING REQUIREMENTS ]
cy Cynihia Yapp 02/08/2008  FIN 007 02/08/2008 N B 1350 13.50
PREPARE MFR !
(' CynthaYapp  02A5/2008  FiN 007 021152008 N B 27.00 27.00
PREPARE MFR___ T ' " o , T ]
cy Cynihia Yapp T 022212008 FIN 007 0272212008 N B 4025 4025
PREFARE MFR i
cy Cynthia Yapp 02/26/2008  FIN 007 02/29/2008 N ) 37.45 37.45
[PREPARE MFRS
DS Deborah Swain 0811072007 FIN 001 08102007 N B "oz 0.25
Data requests / telcon J. Md.frams !
DS Deborah Swain T 08/31/2007 | FIN 001 08/31/2007 M B .25 0.25
coordination / telcon 8-27 o ’ B )
DS Deborah Swain T 09/18i2008  FIN' oot Toifgzo0s N T8 7T 0.50 0.50
*Pm;ecr coordmahbﬁ rewew T R T e T
oS Deborah Swain T02m1/2008  FiINT 003 dZiotzoos N B - w.rs 0.25
Project coordinalion - i¢, mtgs. :
DS ‘Deborah Swain 02/08/2008  FIN 007 02/08/2008 N B 100 1.00
DS Deborah Swain 02/22/2008  FIN_ 001 02/22/2008 N B 3.25 3.25
Rales - t/c, email re: buik user, stc. T - .
un Date: Jun 5, 2008 @ 08:19:43 PROTIMF FRYX



Current Timesheets Report Milian, Swain & Associates Page 2
Order By: Project Project: Ud2-14 — P02-14
Period: 07/01/2007 — 05/30/2008
Project
Employee P/E Dep Staff Work Date OVTM ST STATE Hours Worked Billable Hours
U02-14 Miles Grant Water & Sewer Company
DS Deborah Swain 02/29/2008 FIN 001 02729/2008 N B 10.75 10.75
iReview MFRs T :
MB MariaBravo  08A0/2007  TFIN T oo7 Toenoéor N BT 225 2.25
Coordinating with client, reviewing proposal and budget. TTTTTT o T
MB ManaBravo ~ 08A7/2007 FIN @07 o8nrzo0r N B 7T T 150 1.50
Coordinating with client !
SPC Sandra Castilio 08124/2007 ADM 016 08/24/2007 N B 2.00 200
E.?.‘E‘?ﬂiﬂg g FPSC Document for Cynthia. - o L e
354.95 35495
Phase Subtotal: T 35495 354.95
001 Deficiencies errors
CcY Cynthia Yapp 04/11/2008 FIN 007 04/11/2008 N R 7.00 7.00
'RESPONSE TO DEFICIENCIES -
cY Cynthia Yapp 04/18/2008 ~ FIN 007 0471872008 N R T Ti7s 1.75
PUBLIC COUNSEL REQUEST FOR MFRS IN EXCEL FORMAT T
DS Deborah Swain T D4/0472008°  FIN 001 04m4/2008 N R 050 0.50
E’Ew‘ew deficiencies, emaits _,,,,__.i
DS Deborah Swain 04/18/2008 FIN 001 04/18/2008 N R 0.25 0.25
[Felcon U1 R |
o 9.50 950
Phase 001 Sublotal: 9.50 9.50
Project Total 384 .45 IB4.45
Grand Total 364.45 364 .45
wn Date:  Jun 5, 2008 @ 08:19:43 PROTIME FRY




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 5. W. 32" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

Kirsten Weeks

Manager, Regulatory Accounting

Utilities, Inc.
2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL. 60062-6196

INVOICE

Invoice No.27273
Invoice Date: September 12, 2007
Page 1, Billing # 1

For Professional services rendered through August 31, 2007 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Miles Grant Water & Sewer

Company
Hours Rate Amouni
Senior Staff Accountant:
Deborah Swain S0 180.00 90.00
Cynthia Yapp 84.00 140.00 11,760.00
Maria Bravo 3.75 140.00 525.00
Sandra Castillo 2.00 50.00 100.00
Totat Due for invoice 27273 $12,475.00
Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc. . ,
ONE BNVEL VAT
15,923

v endor




Kirsten Weeks

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 S. W. 32™ Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0638

Manager, Regulatory Accounting

Utilities, Inc.
2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, 1L 60062-6196

Invoice No.27307
Invoice Date: October 3, 2007
Page 1, Bitling # 2

For Professional services rendered through September 28, 2007 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Miles Grant Water & Sewer

Company

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Staff Accountant:
Cynthia Yapp 23.25 140.00 3,255.00
Total Due for invoice 27307 $3,255.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Asseciates, Inc.

"\'F\\’ Q-\ . ﬁ— U%S 2“\4'

vendor 19922




Kirsten Weeks

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 8. W. 32" Avenne
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

Manager, Regulatory Accounting

Utilities, Inc.
2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

Invoice No. 27356
Invoice Date: October 30, 2007
Page I, Billing # 3

For Professional services rendered through Qcteber 26, 2007 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Miles Grant Water & Sewer

Company

Hours

Rate

Amount

Senior Staff Accountant:

Cynthia Yapp

5.00

140.00

700.00

Total Due for inveice 27356

£700.60

Please make check payable to Miliun Swain & Associates, Inc.

poc 19N

g ANE



Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
202585 W. 32™ Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

INVOICE

Invoice No.27404
lIavoice Date: December 5. 2007
Page |, Billing # 4

Kirsten Weeks

Manager, Regulatory Accounting
Utilities, Inc.

2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, I1. 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through November 30, 2007 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Miles Grant Water & Sewer

Company

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Staff Accountant:
Cynthia Yapp 50.00 140.00 7.000.00
Total Due for invoice 27404 $7,000.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc.

_D(}(/. g \cfﬁ’]’\
1122401



Kirsten Weeks

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 8. W. 32" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

Manager, Regulatory Accounting

Utilities, Inc.
2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

Invoice No.27435
Invoice Date: January 4, 2008
Page |, Billing #5

For Professional services rendered through December 28, 2007 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Miles Grant Water & Sewer

Company

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Staff Accountant:

Cynthia Yapp 2.00 140.00 280.00
Total Due for inveice 27435 $280.00
Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Ine.

Voc. {29609

2-“‘\0%




Kirsten Weeks

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 8. W. 32™ Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145

Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax.: 365-441-0688

Manager, Regulatory Accounting

Utilities, Inc.
2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-6196

Envoice No 28101
Invoice Date: Januvary 28, 2008
Page [, Billing #6

For Professional services rendered through January 25, 2008 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Miles Grant Water & Sewer

Company
Hours Rate Amount

Principal

Deborah Swain .50 180.00 90.00
Senior Staff Accountant:

Cynthia Yapp 50.50 140.00 7.070.00
Total Due for invoice 28101 $7,160.00

Dot ¥ 4189

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc.

ETIEALS



Tel.: 305-441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 8. W. 32" Avenue
Miagmi, Florida 33145

John Hoy

Chief Regulatory Officer
Utilities, Inc.

2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL. 60062-6196

INVOICE

Invoice No 28134
Invoice Date: March 4, 2008
Page 1, Billing # 7

For Professional services rendered through February 29, 2008 in connection with
Apptlication for Increased Rates and Charges for Miles Grant Water & Sewer

Company
Hours Rate Amount
Principal
Deborah Swain 15.25 180.00 2,745.00
Senior Staff Accountant:
Cynihia Yapp_ 118.20 140.00 16,548.00
Tetal Due for invoice 28134 $19,293.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc.

Doe ¥ 44325
312%|0%




Milian, Swain & Associates, Inc.
2025 5. W. 32™ Avenue
Miami, Florida 33145
Tel.: 305.441-0123 Fax: 305-441-0688

INVOICE

Invoice No.28206
April 29, 2008
Page I, Billing # 8

John Hoy

Chief Regulatory Officer
Utilities, Inc.

2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL. 60062-6196

For Professional services rendered through April 25, 2008 in connection with
Application for Increased Rates and Charges for Miles Grant Water & Sewer

Company

Deficiencies Errors Hours Raie Amount
Principal

Deborah Swain 75 180.00 135.00
Sentor Staff Accountant:

Cynthia Yapp 8.75 140.00 1,225.00
Total Due for invoice 28206 $1,360.00

Please make check payable to Milian Swain & Associates, Inc.

Oec B 0150

5i7710T




Miles Grant Water and Sewer Company
Docket No. 07-0695-WS

Estimate to Complete Through PAA

Respond to Staff audit report, telephone conference cails with Mr, Freidman and Ms. Weeks; review Stafl
recommendations, review PAA Order.

Hours Rate Total

Principal:

Deborah Swain 5.0 $ 180.00 $ 900.00
Senior Siaft Accountants:

Cynthia Yapp 15.0 140.00 2,100.00

Maria Bravo 1.0 140.00 140.00
Misc. Expenses (Postage,
Federal Express;
Photocopying 50.00

Total Estimate to Complete $3,190.00



. Baeh__ 2. 2R60
APR 247
poc___ (4D ]
Patrick Flynn
Utilities, Inc.
Afin: Accounts Payable
2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, iL. 60062

Miscetlaneous Service Area Mapping

Profi 1 Servi rou A r 2

Professional Personnel

Clerical 11

Sr.Deslgn Architect
Senior Deslgn Engineer
Deslgn Techniclan
CADD Operator
Administrative

Total Labor

Unit Billing
Blueprints 24X36
Color Plots 24X38
Total Units

Qutstanding Invoices

Number Date
58617 11/09/07 14,230.59
Total 14,230.59
Billings to Date
Current
Labor 12,722.50 139,546.75
Expense 0.00 B,323.46
Unit 328.80 7,989.37

Totals 13,051.30 155,859.58

A0 YA

CPH Engineers, Inc.

P.O. Box 2308
Sanford, FL 32772-2808
Phone: 407.322.6841
Fax: 407.330.0639
November 30, 2007
Project No:  U0722
involce No: 60010
ENTERED
SR 008
Rate Amount
50.00 787.50
95.00 1,947 .50
100.00 2,650.00
85.00 §,270.00
60.00 1,320.00
65.00 747.50
12,722.50
12,722.50
4.80
324.00
328.80 320.680

Total this Invoice 13,051.30,

M’w chack

Total # Ci S /

152,269.25
8,323.46
8,318.17

168,910.88




Project - Un722 Utilitles-Misc Service Area Mapping Invoice 60010

Services provided during this period indude;
3739.60 LUS] Rate Case Mapping

5584.60 Wedgefield Mapping

3727.10 Miles Grant Mapping

13051.30 Total

]
CPH Engineers, Inc. w/ﬁ'{// S e

: e ;b«/ﬁ.:f\\
/’}&ar)f//"hwj p/ hﬁ

%3 Lo Juss RAL beo N ) G SR = LoSD
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Account Description

Gt
Hourty Captime

Name Rate Date Co |Hours Amount
Dipasquale, Susan M 33.92 2/12/2008| 253 1.00 33.92
Dipasquale, Susan M 33.52 2/12/2008] 253 4.00 135.68
Dipasquale, Susan M 33.92 212/2008] 253 5.00 169.6
Dipasquale, Susan M 33,92 2/12/2008] 253 1.00 33.92
Dipasquale, Susan M Totai 11.00 373.12
Durham, Rick J 95.49 5131/2008) 253 2.00 192,98
Durham, Rick J 96.49 5/31/2008] 253 0.25 24.12
Durham, Rick J 96.49 5/31/2008] 253 1.00 96.49
Ducham, Rick J 96.49 5/31/2008| 253 1.00 86.49
Durham, Rick J 96.49 5/15/2008{ 253 0.25 24.12
Durham, Rick J 96.49 5/15/2008] 253 0.50 48.25
Ourham, Rick J 96.49 5152008 253 .50 48.25
Durham, Rick J Total 5.50 530.7
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 5/31/2008] 253 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 5/31/2008] 253 8.00 271,36
Flynn, Palrick C 33.92 5/31/2008] 253 1.00 33.92
Fiynn, Patrick C 33.92 5/31/2008] 263 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 5/15/2008] 253 0.25 8.48
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 S/15/2008] 253 0.50 16.06
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 515/2008] 253 2.00 67.84
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92, 4/25/2008] 253 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 2/25/2008] 253 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 2/29/2008] 253 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 2/29/2008] 253 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patnick C 33.92 2/29/2008] 253 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 2/25/2008] 253 2.00 67,84
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 1/31/2008] 253 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 1/31/2008] 253 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 1/15/2008] 253 1.00 33.92
Flynn, Patrick C 33.92 1/15/2008] 253 1.00 33.92
[Elynn, Patrick C Total 24.75 839.52
Hoy, John Patrick 96 5/31/2008] 253 3.00 288
Hoy, John Patrick 96 5/31/2008] 253 1.00 96
Hoy, John Patrick 26 5/15/2008] 253 1.00 96
Hoy, John Patrick 96 5/15/2008| 253 1.00 96
Hoy, John Patrick 96 3/15/2008] 253 1.00 98
Hoy, John Patrick 96 2/25/2008] 253 1.00 96
Hoy, John Patrick o6 1/15/2008] 253 1.00 96
Hoy, John Patrick Total 9.00 B854
Marzouk, Michelie 14 1/07-6/07] 253 5.50 91
Marzouk, Michelle 14 T/07-9/07] 253 1.00 14
Marzouk, Michelle 14 5/20/2008] 253 2.25 31.5
Marzouk, Michelle 14 5/20/2008] 253 4.50 53
Marzouk, Michelle 14 5/20/2008] 253 1.75 24.5
Marzouk, Michelle 14 5/6/2008] 253 1.75 24.5
Marzouk, Michelle 14, 5/6/2008| 253 5.00 70
Marzouk, Michelle 14 5/6:2008| 253 2.00 28
Marzouk, Michelle 14 4/22/2008| 253 0.50 7
Marzouk, Michelle 14 4/22/2008] 253 2.00 28
Marzouk, Michetle 14 2/26/2008] 253 1.75 24.5
Marzouk, Michelle 14 2/26/2008| 253 0.50 7
Marzouk, Michelle 14 2/12/2008f 253 2.25 31.5
Marzouk, Michelle 14 2/12/2008; 253 0.50 7
Marzouk, Michelle 14 1/28/2008| 253 0,25 3.9
Marzouk, Michelle 14 1/15/2008] 253 3.00 42
Marzouk, Michelle 14 1/15/2008) 253 0.50 7
Marzouk, Michelle 14 1/15/2008} 253 2.50 35
Marzouic, Michelle Total 38.50 539
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 10/07-11/071 253 17.50 542.5
Povich, Erin Patricia 1) 7/07-9/07 253 8.50 263.5
Povich, Erin Palncia 31 5/31/2008] 253 3.50 108.5
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 SI31/2008] 253 4.00 124
Povich, Erin Patncia a 5/31/2008] 253 4.00 124




Povich, Erin Paltricia 3t 5/31/2008] 253 4.00 124

Povich, Erin Patricia at 515/2008] 253 1.00 31
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 4/25/2008] 253 2.00 62
Povich, Erin Palricia 33 4/25/2008] 253 1.00 31
Povich, Erin Paltricia 31 2/29/2008] 253 1.00 3t
Paovich, Erin Patricia K3l 2/2972008{ 253 7.00 217
Povich, Erin Patricia 3t 2/20/2008] 253 2.50 77.5
Povich, Erin Patricia 3 2/29/2008] 253 5.00 155
Povich, Erin Patricia 3 2/29/2008] 253 4.00 124
Povich, Erin Palricia 31 2/29/2008] 253 §.00 186
Povich, Enn Patricia 31 2/29/2008] 253 2.00 62
Povich, Ern Paltricia 31 2/15/2008f 253 2.00 62
Povich, Erin Palricia 31 1/31/2008] 253 1.00 31
[Povich, Erin Patricia 31 131/2008] 253 1.00 31
{Povich, Erin Palricia 31 1/15/2008] 253 2.00 &2
Povich, Erin Patricia 3 1/15/2008| 253 3.50 108.5
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 1/15/2008] 253 5.00 155
Povich, Erin Patricia 3 1/15/2008] 253 2.00 §2
Povich, Enin Paltricia 3 1/15/2008; 253 2.00 62
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 1/15/2008| 253 1.00 31
{Povich, Erin Patricia 31 1/15/2008] 253 1.50 46.5
Povich, Erin Patricia 3 12/31/2007| 253 2.00 62
Povich, Erin Patricia a4 12/31/2007}F 253 3.00 93
Povich, Erin Patricia 3 12/31/2007] 253 3.00 93
Povich, Erin Patricia 3 12/31/2007] 253 1.50 46.5
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 12/31/2007f 253 3.00 93
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 1243172007 253 4.00 124
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 12/15/2007} 253 1.50 46.5
Povich, Erin Palricia k]l 12115/2007] 253 2.00 62
Povich, Erin Patricia 31 12/115/2007] 253 3.00 93
Povich, Erin Patricia Tota 117.00 3627
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 7R07-9/07] 253 39.50 1343
HRoechow, Michelle Menotti 34 10/07-13/07] 253 7.50 255
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 5/31/2008] 253 4,060 136
Fochow, Michelle Menotli 34 5/31/2008] 253 3.00 102
Rochow, Michelie Menotti 34 5/312008] 253 2.00 3333
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 5/31/2008] 253 2.00 68
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 5/31/2008| 253 3.00 102
Rochow, Micheile Menotti 34 5/31/2008] 253 2.00 68
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 5/15/2008] 253 4.00 136
Rochow, Michelie Menotti 34 6/15/2008] 253 8.00 272
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 5/15/2008] 253 6.00 204
Rochow, Michelle Menctti 34 5/15/2008| 253 3.50 119
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 3 5/15/2008] 253 3.00 102
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 4/25/2008] 253 3.00 102
Rochow, Michelfe Menotti 3 4725/2008] 253 3.00 102
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 4/25/2008] 253 2.00 68
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 4/25/2008) 253 2.00 68
Rochow, Michells Menotli 34 A)25/2008] 253 85.00 306
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34, 4/25/2008] 253 6.00 204
Rochow, Michelle Menctti 34 4/265/2008] 253 6.00 204
Rochow, Micheile Menotti 34 2/29/2008] 253 9.00 306
Rochow, Michetle Menotti 34 2/29/2008} 253 5.00 170
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 2/29/2008] 253 4.00 136
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 2/29/2008| 253 3.00 102
Rochow, Michelle Menotti a4 2/29/2008] 253 3.00 102
Rochow, Michelie Menotti 34 2/29/2008] 253 4.00 136
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 2/15/2008] 253 4,00 136
Reochow, Michelle Menoti 3 1/31/2008] 253 1.00 34
Rochow, Micheile Menolli 34 1/31/2008] 253 4.00 138
Rochow, Michellg Menotli 34 1/31/2008] 253 2.00 68
Rochow, Michella Menotti 34 1/31/2008] 253 1.0D 34
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 1/31/2008] 253 2.00 658
Rochow, Michelle Menotli 34 1/15/2008] 253 2.00 88
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 1/15/2008] 253 3.00 102
Rochow, Michelie Menotti 34 1/15/2008{ 253 2.00 68
Rochow, Micheille Menatii 34 1/15/2008) 253 3.00 102
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 1/15/2008] 253 3.00 102




Rachow, Michelle Menolti 34 1/15/2008] 253 2.00 58]
Rochow, Micheile Menotti 34 1/15/2008] 253 3.00 102
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 1/15/2008] 253 1.00 34
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 1/15/2008] 253 1.00 34
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 1/15/2008] 253 2.00 68
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 12/31/2007] 253 2.00 68
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 12/31/2007{ 253 1.00 34
Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34 12/31/2007] 253 3.00 102,
Rochow, Michelle Menotti Total 188.50 6409
Valrie, LaWanda N 14 5/20/2008] 253 3.07 43.01
Valrie, LaWanda N 14| S/20/2008] 253 4.61 64.52
Valrie, LaWanda N 14 5/20/2008] 253 6,14 B6.02,
Valrie, LaWanda N 14 5/20/2008] 253 9.22 129,03
Vairie, LaWanda N 14 5/20/2008{ 253 12.28 172.04
Valrie, LaWanda N 14 5/6/2008] 253 5.14 86.02
Vairie, LaWanda N 14 S5/6/2008] 253 4.61 64.52
Vairie, LaWanda N 14 5/6/2008] 253 9.22 129.03)
Valrie, LaWanda N 14 5/6/2008] 253 2,22 128.03
Valrie, LaWanda N 14 5/6/2008] 253 9.22 126.03
Valrie, LaWanda N 14 5/6/2008f 253 6.14 B86.02
Valrie, LaWanda N 14 4/22/2008] 253 3.07 43,01
Valrie, LaWanda N 14 4/22/2008] 253 3.07 43.01
Valrie, LaWanda N 14 2/26/2008] 253 9.22 129.03
Valrie, LaWanda N Total 95.24 1333.32
Weeks, Kirsien Elise 46 2/29/2008] 253 2.00 92
Weeks, Kirsten Elise 465 2/29/2008] 253 4.00 184
Waeeks, Kirsien Elise 46 2/20/2008) 253 8.00 3658
Weeks, Kirsten Elise 46 2/29/2008; 253 9.00 414
Weeks, Kirsten Elise 46, 2/15/2008] 253 2.00 92
Weeks, Kirsten Elise 46 2/15/2008] 253 1.0 46
Weeks, Kirsten Elise 46 2/15/2008] 253 200 92
Weeks, Kirsten Elise 48 2/15/2008] 253 3.00 138
Weeks, Kirsten Elise 46 2/15/2008] 253 3.00 138
Weeks, Kirsten Eiise 48 2/15/2008] 253 2.00 92
Weeks, Kirsten Elise 46 2/15/2008| 253 1,00 46
Weeks, Kirsien Elise 46 215/2008] 253 3.00 138
Weeks, Kirsten Elise 46 2/15/2008] 253 3.00 138
Weeks, Kirsten Elise 46 2/15/2008| 253 4.00 184
Weeks, Kirsten Elise 46 12/31/2007) 253 .00 414
Weaks, Kirslen Elise 46 12/31/2007| 253 5.00 230
Woeks, Kirsten Elise Total 61.00 2806
Grand Total 550,49 17321.66
Captive. Rakes

Dipasquale, Susan M 33.92

Durham, Hick J [:T:

Flynn, Patrick C 34

Hoy, John Patrick 96

Marzouk, Michelie 14

Povich, Enn Patricia 31

Rochow, Michelle Menotti 34

Vairie, LaWanda N 14

Weeks, Kirsien Elise 45




Attachments Responding to Item 5




Service Agreement



SHOSAL AMILES GRANT ROAD - STUART. FLORIDA 23R4 - TRELEPHONE 306/285 1100

Decembexy 16, 1985

Mr, Perxy Owens

Chairman & Chief Executive Officer
Utilities Inc.

2335 Sanders Road

Northbrook, IL 60062

Dear Mr. Owens:

Because of a shortage of irrigation water, the Club applied
to the South Florida Water Management District for an increase

in its allotment.

A copy of their answer is enclosed, In it are suggestions to
obtain additional irrigation water which involves cooperation
from cur water supply utility.

We would appreciate it if you would give us the benefit of
your thinking regarding the implementation of the suggestions.

Sincerely,

P
ra
&

/)
,/ichfzx_xﬂgtc(f//

Harvey Mahlig 7
President

HM:dlc

enc.



South Florida

John R. Wodraska. Executive Diractor
Tilforg C. Creal, Depuly Execulive Direclor

Water Management District

Post Oftice Box V 3301 Gun Club Road
West Palm Beach, Flgrida 33402
Telephone (305) 686-8800

Fiorida WATS Line 1-800-432-2045
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UTILITIES, INC. OF FLORIDA

AN AFFILIATE OF UTILITIES, INC.

200 WEATHERSFIELD AVE,
ALTAMONTE SPRINGS, FLORIDA 32701

TELEPHONE: 305-869.1919%

CORPORATE OFFICES:
2335 Sanders Road
Northbrock, [linois 60062
Telcphone: 312/498-6440

January 2, 1986

Mr. Harvey Mahlig, President
Miles Grant Country Club
5101 S.E. Miles Grant Road
Stuart, FL 33494

Dear Mr. Mahlig:

In response to your letter of Decewber 16, 1985 concerning the
Country Club's need for additional irrigation water, the following

information is supplied:

1. All sewage effluent from our utility customers currently
is being used by the Country Club.

2. The flow currently averages approximately 165,000 gallons
per day during peak usage.

3. The small holding pond (called a percolation pond by Water
District) does not lose very much sewage through seepage
due to high water table underneath pond.

4. We have proposed a plant modification to the Florida DER
which will:

a. eliminate the small holding pond

b. Increase the treatment capacity of the existing system,
and

c. Improve the quality of the effluent.

The plant modifications have been planned to solve the problen
raised by the Florida D.E.R. requiring a three day holding tank for

plant upset conditions.

If additional areas were tied into the central sewer system, their
effluent would be available for irrigation purposes. This is not a
short term scolution, however.

1f, as suggested by the Water District, effluent was sprayed
directly from the treatment plant, a holding lake would still be
required to normalize flow and pump capacities. This does not
appear to be a viable alternative.
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Mr. Harvey Mahlig
January 2, 1986

Finally, the option of entering into an agreement to allow the
Country Club to utilize excess water withdrawal capacity of the
Utility Company may be a possibility. Our pumpage varies in direct
proportion to the occupancy of units within Miles Grant. This means
that some months we have more excess capacity than other months when
occupancy is near 100%. Since we must reserve the right to all of
our withdrawal permit, we would have to keep control of the amount
withdrawn by charging the Country Club on & per 1,000 gallon basis
for all water taken from the utility's allocation by the Country
Club. The joint usage would have to be carefully monitored.

We are certain that the Country Club is employing the obvious
conservation techniques, such as sprinkling only at night when
maximum efficiency is accomplished with little evaporation
experienced. Also, the system should be pressure-tested to insure
water is being delivered to the spray heads where needed and not
lost through leaks in mains.

Please let us know if you wish to pursue this subject further.
ncerely,

Do if e

David H. Demaree
Vice President

DHD:ajn



Yo
0L S B MILES GRANT ROAD » STUART, FLUORIDA 34997 » TELEPHONE 4&-5?186.1320

August 25, 1988

Utilities Inc.

Mr. Patrick J. O'Brien
2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL 60062

Dear Mr. O'Brien:

Referencing your meeting of June 21, 1988 with Messrs. Wallower,
Mazuk and Rasmusson, I would like to verify the rate agreed
upon at that luncheon meeting to tie into your line as required

hy the D.E.R. to supply water to the B8th fairway. According
to my understanding, the amount is 50¢/1,000 gallons.

Please advise to the correctness of this rate.
Sincerely,

Mz Ay S didien

-Carlton H. Burcher

Vice President

CHB:dlc
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2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, Hhinois 80062
312/498-6440

August

TIES,INC.

30, 1988

Mr. Carlton H. Burcher
Vice President
Miles Grant Country Club

5101 S.
Stuart,

E. Miles Grant Road
Florida 34997

Dear Mr. Burcher:

Thank you for your letter of August 25, 1988 to Mr. O'Brien. We

confirm your understanding that the rate for supplying water to the
8th fairway will be $.50/1,000 gallons with the following conditions

and understandings:

1)

2)

3

1)

b))

We are
matter

Water taken from ocur system at this location will be used only
for watering the 8th fairway.

Recognizing that we could not commit to a price for an
indefinite period of time, we will extend this commitment until
the date of our next general rate increase. At that time we
will review the rate in conjunction with our other rates.

If a meter larger than 2" is required, we will ask you to pay
the incremental cost.

Recognizing that the county may, in the future, pursue
purchasing the system, this commitment will be binding on usg
only as long as we own the system.

If, for any reason, we have a shortage of water to deliver to
the residents of Miles Grant, we will ask that the sprinkling
of the 8th fairway be curtailed until we can restore our
pumping capacity to normal.

interested in working with you and the country club in this
in the spirit of cooperation. If you have a guestion on any of

these conditions, please feel free to call me collect,

Sincere

&J’éz@fﬂuu&_

Pavid H. Demaree
Vice President, Operations

DHD:a jm



S101 S.E. MILES GRANT RUAD » STUART, FLORIDA 34997 « TELEPHONE 407:286.2220

August 14, 1989

Mr. David Demaree

DPirector of Operations
Utilities, Incorporated
2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, Illinois 60062

Dear Mr. Demaree:

We would like to formalize our agreement with your company to
provide supplemental water to Miles Grant Country Club. This
water will enable us to maintain our ponds at the legally set
limit of 6" above mean sea level (?} and still properly irrigate
our golf course. This additional water will only be required
during the summer season, since full occupancy during the winter
months will provide sufficient effluent water to maintain proper

pond levels.

At any time if Utilities Inc. is concerned as to their well
volumes or possible salt water intrusion, we will immediately
upon notification stop withdrawing this supplemental water.

We understand that the rate per thousand gallons will be a
mutually agreed upon rate.

We wish to express our appreciation of your understanding and
cooperation in this matter.

Very truly yours,

r B
A Y
-Carl Butcher
President

CB:al




MILES GRANT WATER & SEWER COMPANY

Sub 640
Raies are stated bimonthly Effective 08/12/07
WATER:
64001 5/8" Residential Base charge $ 2181
64002 1" Residential Base charge $ 5428
64004 5/8" General Service Base charge $ 218t
64005 5/8” Gen Serv. Irrigation Base charge $ 2183
64010 1* General Service Base charge $ 5428
64012 1.5" General Service Base charge $ 108.40
64013 2" General Service Base charge $ 17342
64015 4* General Service Base charge $ 54159
Usage on all above meter sizes @ 2.66/1,000
64007 2" Irrigation Bulk Rate Base charge
(Special agreement tsage @ .54/1,000
per DHD 12/88-
M.G. Country Club
8th Fairway Irrigation) //
SEWER:
64022 5/8" Residential Base charge $ 2879
All meter sizes Usage @ 4.06/1,000
Maximum 20,000 $ 109.99
64029 5/8" General Service Base charge $ 2879
64032 1.5" General Service Base charge $ 14400
64033 2" General Service Base charge $ 2304
64035 4" General Service Base charge $ 720M
@ 4.06/1,000

Usage on Com't all meter sizes

Page 1 of 2



MISCELLANEOUS:

64051

64054

64053

64056

New Account Chg - W customer

(initial customer-this code must
be added manually keying -0
customer}

Reconnect Chg - W customer

{subsequent customers-this code
added by computer when status
changed to A)

New Account Chg - W&S customer
{add code manually as above)

Reconnect Chg - W&S customer
{added by computer as above)

Premises Visit
{Use code D0012)

15.00

15.00

15.00

15.00

10.00

Page 2 of 2



Discovery Items 5(d)



Discovery hem Number 5{d-1
MFRAE-14 Page 2

UREPQAT uBR
SUMMARY CON

BiCoca Roe
54004
£4001
84001
84001
64001
64001
64001
54001
E4001

Discovary ltem Nuthber 5(d)»2
MFR E-14 Page 2

(5284 RC) Repon UB
Ci528A AC) Report U

BLCoda Account Nusmb

54001 .. SA0010des
BaogY - BAOTOENR.
SBROt T BAOGHORINY. |

&4

4001
4001 400

102
Iy
i
137
156
175
204
n
am

osize.

THOW(528D RC) UTILITY BILLING SYSTEM PA GE |
SUMPTION BY TRG  LISANDS FGR INVD 1CES ISSUED
July Aupust Sapmoembar Qclober Nevembar Decambar January Febiruary March Api May June Grand Towl
] 1
1 1
1 1
1
1 1
1 1
1
1 1
t 1
Rasponse: As you can see Bbova, the high iavels of CongUMPLOn prasented in the billing analysis are carrect.
ACONS RC Detalt Conay mption Intoemat  ion by Bill Cod & By Ascounl Croated On 16:15:05 07 .37
BRCONS. RC Utithes, InG - Billing S yslam Fags 1 2
Detall Co MAWNpEon infor  mation Dy Bill Tede by Account
B.Pro January Febuary March Aprd May June July August September  October Movembar  Decembaer  SiandTotal
' & 4750 Astg 820 2040 15560 300
8. LT3R 8310 Rl 85360 111080 451510
.8, _atsne 137200 0790 10ra 158150 B35460
i 211440 70 0 ¢ 178020 66030
LN 85500 73830 HM450 84500 110310 826560

Respones. Please see above provided coples of the specific #ocount holders (Customer's) congumption for sach month of the tasy yoar,

Discavery ltem Numbet ${d)-3
MFR E-14 Page 2

Response: This is correct, Mere a/é no appropriais adiustrnents fo correct this consumption of cause o rasubmit E-14 page 2



Discovary Fam NHumber B(d)1
MFRE.14 Page 3

AEPORT UBR THDW({528D.RC) S UMMARY CONSUMPT
+ REPORT  UBR THOW (5280 AC)
SUMMARY  CON SUMPTION BY THO  USANDS FGR INVO
BiiCode Rpe Janary Fobruary

84002 120

TON BY THOUSAND
ICES ISSUED

Reaponss: 4s you can see above, tho high lavaly of consumpiion pressnisd in the bHling analysis arq cotrect.

Discovery tein Number ()2
MFA E-14 Page 3
{528A RC) Rapon U RCONS. RC Derstl Conwy
' (5284 .RE) Repan U BRCONS RC
BLCode Account Numb B Pr Jariary
84002 840010700 3

mption Informa
Datsit Co

Febvary

%10

S FOR INVOICES  ISSUED CREA TEQON 181824 HIW2007

uniuTy BILLING SYSTEM PA GE2

Aprit May June July August Seplembel  Oclober tovambar  Decembar
1

oh by Bili Cad a By Aceount Crealnd On 18 15:05 07 =37

Uliriins, Inc - Billing S ystam Page 2

niumption tnlor nation by Bill Code by Account

Wareh Aprii May June July Ausgust Seplember  October HNovartibar

130050 17560

Response: Pladse 154 sbove provided copiss of tha wpecilie sccount holder's (cuntomar s) consumption tor sach monih of tha veal pesr

Discovety lism Numbaer S(dy3
MFR E-14 Page 3

Assponse: This I comeet, tare ars no appropriats scjustmants 1o corrac! this eonsumplion Or causs (o regubmit E14 page 3

Grang Tatel

Dacernizar

1

Grand Tersl

210200




Discovery tem Number 5(¢)-1
MFR E-14 Paga 10

REFCRT UBR

THOW{528 UMMARY «i{ON BY THS FOR INVISSUED CREA TED ON 1€ 7/30/2007
“IREPORT UBR THDW(528D.RC) UTILITY  BILLING SYSTEM PA GE 10
SUMMARYCON SUMPTIOH USANDS FICES ISSUED
BliCode Rge July August  September Oclober  Novernber December January  February  March April May June Grand Total
64022 102 1 1
84022 1M 1 4
64022 137 1 1
64022 156 1 1
64022 445 1 1
Responsa: As you can see above, the high levels of consumption presented in the billing analysis are correct.
Discovery item Number 5{d)-2
MFRA E-14 Page 10
(5284, RC) Report UB ACONS. RC Detall tmptien Intoion by Bili (e By AccouCrealed  On 16:15:0 -37
i{528A  .RC)RepontU BRCONS .RC Utites,  Inc - Billing ystern Page 4 6
Detail Co  nsumption matian by £ Gode by Account
8LCode  Account Numb B.Pro January Febuary March April May June July August SeptemberQctober  MNovember December GrandTotal
BAgR2 ... SA00LGS131 T - 8. L TR080 . 81500 137200 - 90790 101780 186150 639460
O BAQRR - eApDIOSTR -3 o R TR $5310 94280 85360 111080 551610
84022 6400104163 8 ABOB20 4750 1110 520 2040 15560 504800

Response: Please see above provided copies of the specific account holder's {customer's) consumption for ach month of the test year.

Discovery ltem Number 5(d}-3
MFR E-14 Page 10

Response: This Is correct, there are no appropriate adjustmants to correct this consumption or cause to rasubmit E-14 page 10.
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Revenue Schedide at Present and Proposad Rates - Sower

Comparry: Miles Grant Water and Sewer Company
Dockel No.. 060253 - WS

Tast Yaar Ended: June 30, 2007

ttarim { | Finad fx]

Historical [x) Projected | |

Wates [ | Sewer (x]

Florida Pubiic Service Commisalon

Setaduie €-7
Faga 2 of 2 REVISED

Preparer: Erin Povich

Explanation: Provide a calculalion of revenues 3t present and propossd rates using he bilting analysly. Explain any ditforances betwesn thesa revenues and bHooked revenues. H a rale change ocourred

during the lesl year, a revenue calculation must be

Revonues
Line Bl Tots Total Tent Year Test Yaar Current Rates Anmalized  Proposed at Proposed
Mo.  Code Class/Maier Size Bills Gattons (MG} Adlusimants Ratoz Ravenues Ef. B.12.07 Rovenuss Rates Hates
1 RESIDENTIAL
2 6402 W& 7215 5 279 320187670 % 2879 S 20771985 $ S4B 0§ 39552630
k] Gatlonags Charge per 1000 galions. 29619 385 116,995.05 +.06 120253 14 756 2,519.64
4 {Mleguimasrn 20000 gallonsy
5 Total Resigential 7215 29,619 M 8_3.2.'!_:9;.29; $ 61944554
e ——
3 Average Residential Bil _f__at’-{_zg- -S___.d:i s 586
A ———
7
8 GENERAL SERVICE
9 G402 S8 T2 2798 $2,014.56 2879 % 207288 % 54 82 5 194704
10 eua32 1.zt 6 139 86 839.76 144.00 864 00 27410 164460
11 84003 & & 22394 1.343.64 230 41 1,382 46 438.56 2,631.36
12 64025 47 o £99.88 - 7044 137050 .
13 Gaklonage Chacge per 1000 galona. 1,717 395 5,782.15 4.08 5,971.02 9.07 15,573.19
12 Tolal General Service B84 17 $10,980, 11 $ 11,2903 5 23,796 19
AT—————T. E e L
15 Average General Service Bil $ 130.72 3 13401 5 28329
16 {RAIGATION
17 B4DO7 27 iminAtion Buk Aete & [eXe ] - - - .
3 Gallonage Charge per 1,000 Galions 9.347 -9,347 ] 53 4,953.9t 0.54 5,047.98 -
19 Total irzigalion & 9,347 £9.347) o 3 1.953.91 $ 5,047 38 ]
20 AveraQe Irrigation Bil $825.65 $841.23 300
21 Othar Revenuas 5 1,501 05 3 1.501.05 s 1,501.05
22
23 Tolal Annualized / Proposed Revenuss £336,305.82 $ 581178 1 544,743 18
24 Adfustment 1o reciassiy revanues 1or B8 Code 54007 booked 10 the incorrec! accound £ (495391 $ 5047 38)
25 Adusted Annuahzed / Proposed Revenuss 3 I35 $ 140,784.40 $ GBMTAI
Total Per Books $ 3A7ATE08 $ JTATEOS 3 39717606
&7 Diftesance 5§ {5.82415) $ J,588.34 3 307,567.12
28 Petcentago 1. 73% 1.06% 91 22%




