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Raquel Tully 

From: Paula lsler 

Sent: Friday, October 03,2008 3:07 PM - . .  
e%+ I " x L& To: Raquel Tully 

Subject: RE: RAF fine received 8 7 3 a o c i  - 21533 

Hi Raquel. 

Concerning TX686 - City of Quincy d/b/a netquincy d/b/a netquincy.com d/bl/a .m.netquincv.com - Please deposit $200 in the 
Public Service Commission Regulatory Trust Fund and the balance of $800 in the General Revenue Fund. Please provide the 
Clerk's Office with proof of payment for documenting in Docket No. 080461-TX. Thanks. 

p' 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Friday, October 03, 2008 2:58 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

The mailroom has a check from the City of ?Quincy for $1000.00, please let me know the breakdown 

10/3/2008 
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THE CITY OF QUINCY 
404 W. Jefferson Street 
Quincy, Florida 3235 1 


