Holland +Knight

December 24, 2008

Ms. Ann Cole, Director

Commussion Clerk

Florida Public Service Commission

2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard

Betty Easley Conference Center, Room 110
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850

Tel 850 224 7000
Fax 850 224 8832

Holland & Knight LLP

315 South Calhoun Street, Suite 600
Tallahassee, FL 32301-1872
www.hklaw.com

Gigi Rollini
850 425 5627
gigi.rollini@hklaw.com
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Re: In Re: Application for increase in water and wastewater rates in Alachua,
Brevard, DeSoto, Highlands, Lake, Lee, Marion, Orange, Palm Beach, Pasco,
Polk, Putnam, Seminole, Sumter, Volusia, and Washington Counties by Aqua
Utilities Florida, Inc., Docket No. 080121-WS

Dear Ms. Cole:

On behalf of Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc. (“AUF”), enclosed for filing are the original and
9 copies of AUF’s Notice of Filing Late-Filed Hearing Exhibit Nos. 179, 190, 195, 199, 204,
206, 207, Composite 209, Composite 210, 215, and 217.

Please acknowledge receipt of this filing by stamping the extra copy of this letter “filed”
and returning the copy to me. Thank you for your assistance.
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~. ——ee+  Ralph Jaeger, Esq. (w/encl.)

SSC ——  Katherine Fleming, Esq. (w/encl.)
SGA — Caroline Klancke, Esq. (w/encl.)
ADM Erik Sayler, Esq. (w/encl.)

CLEK Charles Beck, Esq. (w/encl.)

Cecilia Bradley, Esq. (w/encl.)
Kimberly A. Joyce, Esq.
#5916326_v1

Sincerely,

HOLLAND & KNIGHT LLP

DOCUMENT RUMBER-CATE

Atlanta - Bethesda * Boston * Chicago * Fort Lauderdale « Jacksonville * Los Arge @©
Miami « New York « Northern Virginia « Ortando * Portland - San Franciscag 'fss 9 LI' DEC 2“ °
Tallahassee * Tampa ¢ Washington, D.C. « West Palm Beach
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BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

In Re: Application for increase in water and
wastewater rates in Alachua, Brevard, DeSoto,

DOCKET NO. 080121-WS

Highlands, Lake, Lee, Marion, Orange,
Palm Beach, Pasco, Polk, Putnam,

Seminole, Sumter, Volusia, and Washington

Counties by Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc.

FILED: December 24, 2008
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AQUA UTILITIES FLORIDA, INC.’S NOTICE OF FILING
LATE-FILED HEARING EXHIBIT NOS. 179, 190, 195, 199, 204, 206, 207,
COMPOSITE 209, COMPOSITE 210, 215, AND 217

Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc. (“AUF”), by and through its undersigned counsel, gives

notice of filing of AUF’s Notice of Filing Late-Filed Hearing Exhibit Nos. 179, 190, 195, 199,

204, 206, 207, Composite 209, Composite 210, 215, and 217.

Respectfully submitted this 24th day of December, 2008.

HOLLAND & KNIGHT LLP
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ruce May, Jr.
Florlda Bar No. 354473
Gigi Rollini
Florida Bar No. 684491
Holland & Knight, LLP
Post Office Drawer 810
Tallahassee, Florida 32302-0810
(850) 224-7000 (Telephone)
(850) 224-8832 (Facsimile)

-and-

Kimberly A. Joyce, Esquire
Aqua America, Inc.

762 West Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010
(610) 645-1077 (Telephone)
(610) 519-0989 (Facsimile)

Attorneys for Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc.

DOCUMENT NUMRTR-CATE
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE
I hereby certify that a true and correct copy of the foregoing was furnished by electronic
transmission to Ralph Jaeger, Katherine Fleming, Caroline Klancke and Erik Sayler, Esq.,
Office of General Counsel, Florida Public Service Commission, 2540 Shumard Oak
Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850, to Charles Beck, Esq., Office of Public Counsel,
111 West Madison Street, Room 812, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1400, and to Cecilia Bradley,
Esq., Office of the Attorney General, The Capitol-PL01, Tallahassee, FL 32399-1050, this

24th day of December, 2008.

Attorney_J
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BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

In Re: Application for increase in water and
Wastewater rates in Alachua, Brevard, DeSoto,
Highlands, Lake, Lee, Marion, Orange,

Palm Beach, Pasco, Polk, Putnam,

Seminole, Sumter, Volusia, and Washington
Counties by Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc.

Docket No. 080121-WS

Dated: December 24, 2008

AQUA UTILITIES FLORIDA, INC.'S

LATE-FILED EXHIBIT NO. 179
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AUF Late-Filed Exhibit No. 179

Response to OPC’s Exhibits re: Chuluota Customer Usage and Rate Increase Impact
Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc. (AUF) recognizes that there are Chuluota residents who disagree

with AUF’s request for a rate increase. AUF notes, however, that customers in Chuluota average
approximately 9,326 gallons of water per month, or 311 gallons per day. As Ms. Sullivan stated
in her hearing testimony, her neighborhood and surrounding neighborhoods have irrigation
requirements and restrictions with respect to what kind of grass can be used. Like others in the
newer section of Chuluota, residents try to maintain golf course quality grass. (Tr. 15).

Under AUF’s proposed rate increase, if a Chuluota customer uses approximately 5,000 gallons
of water per month, his or her bill would be approximately $40.00 per month. But where typical
usage is closer to 10,000 gallons per month, as it is in the newer section of Chuluota, the bill will
be significantly higher. Like many of the Chuluota residents opposing the proposed rate
increase, including those listed in OPC’s Exhibit Nos. 173 and 174, it should be noted that
AUF’s requested increase can be mitigated by Chuluota residents limiting or curbing their
overall usage.

Water consumption in AUF’s Chuluota system varies significantly by divisions within the
system. Chuluota is comprised of an older section, where AUF provides water service but not
wastewater service (customers are on septic systems). In the older section, the lot sizes are
approximately % acre with no irrigation systems.

The newer sections, comprised of Osprey Lakes and The Trails, have larger lots that are
approximately 2 acre, with irrigation systems, and the residents have wastewater provided by
AUF. '

Chuluota has approximately 1,327 water customers and 695 wastewater customers. The average
usage in Chuluota is 9,326 gallons per month, or 311gallons per day. However, the 9,326 gallon
figure is an average of the high usage in the newer section of Chuluota and the lower usage in
the older section of Chuluota. A sampling of customers located in the older section of Chuluota
over the last 6 months shows that average usage there is approximately 3,500 gallons per month,
or 117 gallons per day.

On the other hand, in the newer section of Chuluota, including Osprey Lakes and The Trails,
average usage of AUF’s wastewater customers is 11,494 gallons per month, or 383 gallons per
day. This average reveals that customers in the newer section of Chuluota have much higher
usage than in other AUF systems.

- Response to OPC’s Exhibits re: Flushing in Chuluota
There is no evidence to refute that flushing the distribution system is an important system

management tool to control nitrification and to respond to “black water” conditions. Witness
Walker testified that flushing “is a reasonable beneficial use, and it is necessary to maintain
distribution water quality.” (Tr. 1003). Witness Walker of the St. Johns Management District is
aware of AUF’s flushing program and testified that there is no evidence the flushing program is




causing harm to wetlands. (Tr. 986). Witness Luitweiler also testified that AUF is not flushing
water in any wetlands. (Tr. 1133).

Since July 2004, AUF has added 14 automatic flushing valves in the distribution system. These
automatic valves flush predetermined amounts of water from dead ends of the distribution system
during hours of low use to keep the water from stagnating in the mains. Flushing is critical to
maintaining water quality at dead ends and extremities of the distribution system where
nitrification would otherwise first occur.

As Witness Luitweiler testified, Dr. Taylor has developed a plan to monitor and sample the
distribution system to obtain a baseline for water quality. As this baseline data develops, it will
aide in determining when and how much flushing is required to maintain water quality. Under
Dr. Taylor’s plan, flushing levels generally will likely be reduced, though semi annual or annual
flushing throughout the system will likely continue to occur.

Response to OPC’s Exhibit re: Chuluota Day Care Water
Please see AUF’s Late-Filed Exhibit No. 190.

#5921010_vl




BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

In Re: Application for increase in water and
Wastewater rates in Alachua, Brevard, DeSoto,
Highlands, Lake, Lee, Marion, Orange,

Palm Beach, Pasco, Polk, Putnam,

Seminole, Sumter, Volusia, and Washington
Counties by Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc.

Docket No. 080121-WS

Dated: December 24, 2008

N N’ e e N N N’

AQUA UTILITIES FLORIDA, INC.'S

LATE-FILED EXHIBIT NO. 190



AUPF’s Late-Filed Exhibit No. 190

Report on Chuluota Day Care Bottled Water

There are specific issues related the day care center which prompted AUF field
operators to offer to bring bottled water to the premise. First, the referenced day care
center is located at the exact dead end of a water main in AUF’s Chuluota water system.
Unlike a typical residence, the day care center uses little to no water over the weekend,
making it extremely difficult to maintain acceptable levels of chlorine residuals to this
location.

To maintain the chlorine residual, AUF’s operations team started flushing the line
in the early morning. However, as the day progressed, the water quality at this location
would deteriorate. To address this issue, AUF field operators voluntarily offered to
bring bottled water to the premise until AUF completes the water main extension project,
which would connect the dead end into another water main.

At this time, the water mains at this location have all been installed and
hydrostatically tested. Bacteria samples have been taken and AUF is awaiting results
before submitting an application to DEP for release to put the system into service. AUF
expects to have the release by December 31, 2008.

The cost of the purchased water to the day care center is not included the rate
case. AUF has purchased 350 gallons of water and has provided that water to the day
care center. The cost incurred by AUF is approximately $1,600.00.



BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

In Re: Application for increase in water and
Wastewater rates in Alachua, Brevard, DeSoto,
Highlands, Lake, Lee, Marion, Orange,

Palm Beach, Pasco, Polk, Putnam,

Seminole, Sumter, Volusia, and Washington
Counties by Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc.

Docket No. 080121-WS

Dated: December 24, 2008

AQUA UTILITIES FLORIDA, INC.'S

LATE-FILED EXHIBIT NOS. 195 AND 217




AUF’s Late-Filed Exhibit Nos. 195 & 217

UPDATED RATE CASE EXPENSE
AND RESPONSE TO OPC’S RATE CASE EXPENSE DISALLOWANCES

As requested, AUF has revised and updated rate case expense to recognize additional
actual incurred costs and to adjust estimated costs through the conclusion of the docket. The
revised estimate of $1,778,586.00 is a reduction of $76,516.00 from the previously submitted
estimate, and takes into account recent events and actual costs associated with the December
FPSC hearings.

There is no legal precedent or authority in Florida to support OPC’s recommended 50%
disallowance for AUF’s rate case expense. However, AUF has included downward adjustments
associated with costs of the prior rate case; costs associated with deficiencies; rate case
. participation by an AUF employee; and estimated costs to complete the rate case. AUF
continues to assert that costs associated with substitution of counsel, protocol regarding OPC’s
extensive discovery and granted motion to expand original discovery parameters, issues
regarding return on equity (ROE), witness substitution, preparation of the required billing
analysis, and hourly rates for outside counsel are appropriate and necessary expenses directly
incurred in preparing and supporting the instant rate case.

The attached excel file includes a detailed worksheet supporting the updated and revised
expense estimate of $1,778,586.00, a summarized comparison of OPC’s proposed rate case
.disallowances, and AUF’s proposed adjustments, a listing of invoice updates, and a listing of all
invoices to date. In addition, copies of invoices received by AUF since the time of the last
estimate are included in the attached PDF file.
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AUF Rate Case Expense- Docket 080121-W$S
AUF response to OPC Rate Case expense Disallowances

Issue OPC Adjustment AUF Adjustment
Deficiencies-Legal $ 5473 $ 5,473
Pasceri Deficiencies $ 4380 $ 3,200
Guastella Deficiencies $ 23,438 $ 2,535
AUS Deficiencies $ 10,500 § 10,500
DTF Deficiencies $ 449 $ 4,496
Service Co. Deficiencies $ 2,240 $ 2,240
T.Ward Deficiencies $ 900
Rendell issues $ 5072 $ 5,072
Holland Knight hourly rate $ 826
Legal Switch $ 160
OPC- Discovery Protocol $ 2,030
ROE $ 1,988
Witness Substitution $ 273
AUS bill analysis $ 67,950
Rutiedge, Encinia- Prior case $ 41251 § 41,251
Sub Total $ 170,077 $ 75,667
Estimated Consulting fees $ 106,179 $ 28,500
Totai 3 276,256 % 104,167

AUF Comment

Invoices removed from expense

AUF adjustment based on hours reported
AUF adjustment based on hours reported
AUF adjustment based on hours reported
AUF adjustment based on hours reported
AUF adjustment based on hours reported
AUF adjustment based on hours reported
Invoices removed from expense

No adjustment warranted

No adjustment warranted

No adjustment warranted

No adjustment warranted

No adjustment warranted

No adjustment warranted

Invoices removed from expense

AUF Final Estimates have been revised



Aqua Florida - AUF
Rate Case Expense - Invoice Update

AMOUNT

RUTLEDGE, ECENCIA $  40,432.14 Invoice Removed from Rate Case Expense
RUTLEDGE, ECENCIA $ 214.00 Invoice Removed from Rate Case Expense
RUTLEDGE, ECENCIA $ 370.45 Invoice Removed from Rate Case Expense
RUTLEDGE, ECENCIA $ 234 .45 Invoice Removed from Rate Case Expense
HOLLAND KNIGHT $  34,116.68 Invoice Attached

HOLLAND KNIGHT $  48,118.57 invoice Attached

HOLLAND KNIGHT $ 2,518.50 Invoice Attached

TOTAL RUTLEDGE, ECENCIA $  84,753.75

TIMOTHY P WARD CPA 18,697.90 Invoice Attached
TIMOTHY P WARD CPA $  22472.00 invoice Attached
TOTAL - TIMOTHY PWARDCPA §  41,169.90

L]

R.PASCERI $ 14,063.00 Invoice Attached
R.PASCERI $ 11,387.25 Invoice Attached
TOTAL - R PASCERI $ 2545025 -

GUASTELLA & ASSOC. $ 32,862.00 Invoice Attached

TOTAL GUASTELLA & ASSOC $  32,862.00

AUS $ 4,637.50 A/P Processing Invoice

TOTAL AUS $ 4,637.50

P MOUL $ 13,515.00 A/P Processing Invoice

DTF SOLUTIONS $ 5,800.00 Invoice Attached

TOTAL - DTF SOLUTIONS $ 5,800.00

COLORAMA $ 8,229.49 Invoice Attached-Portion Transferred from Prepaid

S 83929




Aqus Florida - AUF
Rate Case Expense - lavoices

RUTLEDGE, ECENIA- Docket 08012)
RUTLEDGE, ECENIA- Dacket 080121
RUTLEDGE, ECENIA- Docket 080121
RUTLEDGE, ECENIA- Docket 080121
RUTLEDGE, ECENIA- Docket 080121
HOLLAND KNIGHT

HOLLAND KNIGHT

HOLLAND KNIGHT

HOLLAND KNIGHT

HOLLAND KNIGHT

HOLLAND KNIGHT

HOLLAND KNIGHT

TOTAL LEGAL

TIMOTHY P WARD CPA
TIMOTHY P WARD CPA
TIMOTHY P WARD CPA
TIMOTHY P WARD CPA
TIMOTHY P WARD CPA
TIMOTHY P WARD CPA
TIMOTHY P WARD CPA
TIMOTHY P WARD CPA
TIMOTHY P WARD CPA
TIMOTHY P WARD CPA
TIMOTHY P WARD CPA
TIMOTHY P WARD CPA
TOTAL - TIMOTHY P WARD CPA

R.PASCERI
R.PASCERI
R.PASCER!
R.PASCER!
R.PASCERI]
R.PASCERI]
R PASCERI
R.PASCERI
R.PASCERI
R.PASCERI
R.PASCERI
TOTAL - R.PASCERI

GUASTELLA & ASSOC.
GUASTELLA & ASSOC.
GUASTELLA & ASSOC.
GUASTELLA & ASSOC.
GUASTELLA & ASSOC.
GUASTELLA & ASSOC.
GUASTELLA & ASSOC.
GUASTELLA & ASSOC.
GUASTELLA & ASSOC.
TOTAL GUASTELLA & ASSOC

AUS
AUS
AUS
AUS
AUS
AUS
AUS
AUS
AUS
AUS
AUS
TOTAL AUS

PMOUL

DTF SOLUTIONS
DTF SOLUTIONS
DTF SOLUTIONS
DTF SOLUTIONS
DTF SOLUTIONS
DTF SOLUTIONS
DTF SOLUTIONS
DTF SOLUTIONS
DTF SOLUTIONS
DTF SOLUTIONS
TOTAL - DTF SOLUTIONS

PSC
PSC
TOTAL PSC FEES

CPH

CPH

CPH

FA MILLER

CPH

CPH

CPH

CPH

CPH

TOTAL SYSTEM MAPS

DICCICCIO BAPTISTA
DICCICCIO BAPTISTA
DICCICCIO BAPTISTA
DICCICCIO BAPTISTA
INNOVATIVE
INNOVATIVE

COLORAMA
COLORAMA

$ 709.00
s 768.00
$ 4.80
$ 2,560.00
s 581237
s 8,818.30
s 512.66
§ ssonm?
§ 3411668
§ 775213
$ 4811857
3 2,518.50

[ SRS 1110

$ 233,703.78

$ 1,553.46
§  17,601.99
$ 1723312
$ 1611826
$ 1958168
$ 25677.12
$  22,809.35
s
s
N
N
)
3

19,872.90
18,242.90
17,785.28
18,697.90

s 177075
$ 1068250
§ 1131250
§ 1459778
$ 1397250
$ 1325250
$  10,854.63
§  11.759.88
$ 1005463
$  14063.00
$ 1138725
$ _129,708.89
§ 3838100
$ 9,443.00
§ 1234500
§ 38384350
$ 6,166.50
$ 1L394.00
$ 1042350
s $,810.50
§  323862.00
$ 168210.00

s 2,193.75
s 1,886.85
$ 2817376
$ 5971991
s 133734
§$ 3835000
§$  18179.42
N 9,309.32
s 8,734.45
s 1,241.34
s 4,637.50

§ 173,763.64

$  13515.00

$ 4,858.48
H 4,000.00
H 5,432.00
$ 1224000
$ 1128800
s 2,320.00
s 4,880.00
s 3,400.00
$ 824.00
$ 3,800.00

—_—
§ 5904248

§ 4,500.00
$ 9,000.00

$ _13,500.00

3 6.243.22
$ 49615.04
$ 2,161.9
$ 1,035.00
$ 1194287
s 2,165.76
s 8,697.32
N 3,804.49
s 6,686.60
$ 9235226

$ 1061110
s 8,229.49
$ 1884059




Aqua Florida - AUF

Deficiency Cost
Rate Cass Expense Column A Column 8 ColumnC=A+B ColumnD ColumnE=C-D
Expense Project Future Portion of Expense
Incurred Expense Expense Estimated
{Deferred) Through Estimated Removed from Through
_Type of Expense 14/3008 Completi Expense Expense Completion
Legal $ 233,704 $ 103,820 $ 337,523 $ 10,545 $ 326,978
Consulting $ 771,986 § 97512 $ 869,498 § 21631 $ 847,867
Service Company $ 230414 $ 42,036 $ 272,450 $ 2,240 $ 270,210
Other $ 310,805 __3___2_2_.112_ $ 333,531 $ 333,531
Total Rate Case Expense _$ 1,546,909 _$ 266,093 $ 1813002 $ 34416 $ 1,778,586
Detail Of Legal, Consultants & Service Company Employees
' Approx.
Projected Portion of
Approx. Total Amount |  Future Projected Approx. Total  Projected Total | Expense Curing
Rate Hours Bitled Billed Hours Future Bilis Hours Expense Deficiencies
Legal
$ 263 : $ 337,523 10,545
Rutledge / Holland Knight Billed 889 $ 233,704
Future Estimated 395 § 103,820
Totals ‘$ 233,704 $ 103,820 $ 337,523 | $ 10,545 |
Total Legal Exp. For Case
Consultants
Timothy P, Ward, CPA $ 100 2418 § 241,846 800
Bifted 2,176 $ 217,646
Future Estimated 242§ 24,200
Ronald J. Pasceri $ 80 1862 § 148,928 3,200
Billed 1,621 §$ 129,709
Future Estimated 240 § 19,219
Guastella & Assoc. $ 195 881 $ 171,710 2,535
Billed 863 $§ 168,210
Future Estimated 18 $ 3,500
AUS Consuitants $ 175 - 1,004 $ 175,764 10,500
Bilted 993 $ 173,764
Future Estimated 1 $ 2,000
Robent M. Griffin $ 100 353 § 35,250
Billed 101§ 10,100
Future Estimated 262 § 25,150
Paul Moul $ 225 93 § 21,000
Billed 60 % 13,515
Future Estimated 33 $ 7.485
DTF Solutions, inc. $ 80 938 § 75,000 4,496
Billed 738§ 59,042
Future Estimated 199 $ 15,058
Totals 771,986 $ 97,512 $ 869,498 21,631
Total Consultant Exp. For Case
Service Company
Employee
Daubert, J.R. $ 47 604 $ 28,388 94 $ 4,412 698 $ 32,800
Devine, Brian $ 40 1,142 § 45,680 78 $ 3,120 1220 § 48,800 2,240
Drager, Rick $ 52 902 $§ 46,904 - 3 - 202 $ 46,904
Joyce, Kim $ 80 506 $ 40,480 250 § 20,000 756 $ 60,480
Shank, David $ 72 19 $ 1,368 - 3 - 19 §$ 1,368
Bums, Kelly $ 38 200 $ 7.600 50 $ 1.800 250 § 9,500
Hopper, Mary $ 78 428 $ 33,384 250 § 15,616 678 $ 49,000
Gabage, Paul $ 42 47 S 18,774 $ - $ 18,774
Packer. William $ 67 72 $ 4,824 $ - $ 4,824
Nardelli, Chad $ 49 61§ 3,012 b ] 988 $ 4,000
Totals _$ 230414 $ 45,048 $ 272,450 2,240
Total Service Employee Exp. For Case
Other
Travel & Fi. meetings/hearings $ 30,929 $ 9,071 $ 40,000
System Maps $ 92,352 $ ) $ 92,352
PSC Filing Fee PSC - Bilted $ 13,500 $ - $ 13,500
Printer - Initial Filing $ 41,812 $ (0) 3 41,812
Notice Requirement $ 91,076 $ ] $ 91,076
Customer Notices - Printing $ 18,841 $ 0 3 18,841
Customer Notices - Postage $ 9,660 $ 9,660 $ 19,320
PwC Review $ 3,630 $ - $ 3,630
Other Expense $ 9,005 $ 3,995 $ 13,000
Total Other Exp. For Case $ 310,805 $ 22,726 $ 333,531
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AQUA FLORIDA .
AP INVOICE INPUT DOCUMENT
COMPANY NUMBER: 33

 VENDORMNAME:  Holland & Knight, LLP_
VENDOR NUMBER: ' 20192 INVOICE DATE:  7/23/2008

REMIT TO: P.0. Box 864084° : o DUE DATE: Upon Recelpt
Orlando, FL 328064064 : -

INVOICE NUMBER: 2274337 INVOICE AMOUNT: __ $34,116.68

DESCRIPTION: For servicss rendered - 2008 Florida Consolidated Rale Cese

_ . ACCOUNT DISTRIBUTION _

s01]  sest01] - 34,116.08 M91761

. wg11am
o | . ACCOUNTSPAYAB

e

JOTAL : : $34,116.68

APPROVALS - Department
Other

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS: . ENCLOSURE  (CHECK )
' OTHER

anCEWEB———"" E




Law Offices
BOLLAND & KNIGHT nir . atlanta Lakeland

- Sethasda tos Angeles
P.0. Box 864084 . Bouton Hiaml
Orlando, F1 32886-~4084 © Chicage Sow York

{813) 901-4180
BIN 59-0663819

Aqua America, Inc.

portland - Beljing

San Prancieco Caracas®

Tallahasses Maxico Clty
Tel Avive

st Paln Beacb

. 'Représentative Oftice

762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

July 23, 2008
mvoice 2274337

Page 1 :
TRRME: DU ON RECEIPT

For professional - -gervices rendered through June 30, 2008
in connection with the following:

our Matter #117542.00001
Florida Rate: Case

05/23/08

05/28/08

05/29/08

Prepare for apd participate in meeting with
Kimberlly Joyce and Troy Remdell.

NO CHARGE

" D. Bruce May 3.50 hours at .00 per hour.
Phone conference with Kim Joyce regarding o
representation in rate case. .
D. Bruce May .30 hours at .00 per hour. NO CHARGE
Begin review of OPC's discovery; xeview and
consideration of e-mail correspondence from
clig.-nt; call with Ken Hoffman regarding
substitution of counsel; begin review of - ) ) .
testimony provided by client; begin review of IO
MFR exhibits. ) - L
. D. Bruce May 4.00 bours at 365.00 per hour. .146.0.00
 AUG 1 1 2008

ACCOUNTS PAYAB




Aqua America, Inc. a July 23, 2008
. 762 W. Lancaster Avenue : ’ Involce 2274337
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 _ Page 2

05/30/08

05/31/08

-06/02/08

o6/02/08

06/02/08

RECEIVED

COx;i:inued review of OPC’s discovery to AUF; AUG 112008
review and consideration of e-mall . .
correspondence with Ken Boffman regarding ACCOUNTS PAYAB

substitution of counsel; continued review of

testimony provided by client; continued review

of MPR exhibits; research and analysis of

commission orders.

D. Bruce May 4.00 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1460.00

Begin to asgess scope of rate case, including

discovery required and begin to gather

documentation.

G:Lgi Rollini .30 houre at 190.00 pex howur. $7.00 -

Review discovary; multiple phone calls with

Troy Rendell .and Kim Joyce regarding rate case; -
continued réview of rate case testimony; .
organizational conference call with Kim Joyce,

Troy Rendell, Chris Franklin and other Aqua
represenca.tives; review various e-mail

corregpondence and phone conferences with

¢lient regarding service hearings and

discovery; begin preparation of letter to OPC"

regarding its di.scovary requests to Aqua and

discovery responses..

D. Bruce May 2.90 hours at 365.00 per hour. . 1058,50

various consultatiope with B. May re logistics

of extranet, document control, document

Tetention directives, and applicatiom of

privileges to- various categories of experts.

Elizabeth I, Bevingtom .70 hours at .00 per hour. NO' CHARGE

abtain direct tesetimony filed on behalf of Aqua
Utilities; obtain case law cited in T. Rendell‘s
direct testimony; begin to consider discovery
response options, substantive direot testimony
and potential Office of Public counsel conflictse



LN Y

Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancasterr Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

06/02/08

06/03/08

' 06/03/08.

and ethics concerns in light of unified rate
system that will impact customers differently;
attend teleconference with T. Rendell and
Florida Rate ‘Case team regarding discovery
propounded and responses, privilege, upcoming
hearinge, hiastory; prepare letter to C. Back
-(0ffice of Public Counsel) with texms of
proposed agresment regarding discovery
parameters; begin to develop document
preservation and collection directive.

Gigi Roilind 5.40 hours at 190.00 pexr hour.

Commmications with B. May and E. Bevington
regarding preparation for responding to
discovery requests, gathering, numbering and
imaging client documents and overall case
organization; telephone call to vemdor

‘regarding imaged doouments and management of

same.

vicki g, willis .60 hours at .00 per hour.

Review and considexation of e-majl
correspondence from client regarding proposed
letter to OPC; finalize and provide letter to
Charles Beck (OPC counsel); phone conference
with OPC counsel regarding discovery; rassearch
and analysis regarding discovery absent order
establishing procedure; research and analysis
regarding document retemtion protocsl and

‘notice; draft same to provide to client; review
and consideration of e-mail correspondence from
-OPC counsel; discussion with client mgurding

same; continued review of testimony.
D. Bruce May 3.00 hquxs_ at 365.00 per hour.

Continue to receive comménts to proposed

discovery agreement; develop substance for Aqua

Pocument Retention Directive, including
definitio:na of "documents® and “scope" as .
related to Aqua‘s Application for increase in

* July 23, 2008

Invoice 2274337

_Page 3

RECEIVED
AUG 1 l 2008
ACCOUNTS PAYAB .

1026.00

‘NO CHARGE

1095.00
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aqua America, Inc. ’ July 23, 2008
762 .W. Lancaster Avenue - Invoice 2274337
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010~ Page 4 .

'RECEIVED -

Floridz water and wastewater rates, document

and attorney/client privilege in light of

non-lawyer, testifying/non testifying experts

who are algo part of the litigation team;

obtain Extranet 7.0 instructions; review final

Document Retention Directive, . .
Gigi Rollini 3.90 hours at 190.00 per hour.’ 741.00

retention requirements, and impact for failure ’ ' AUB 1 1 2003

to retain; begin to develop outline of standard : .
rotocol to ¢ ider t - t y :

protocol to cons o protect work-produc ACCOUNTS PAYAB

06/04/08 Review and consideration of e-mail
' correspondernce -from OPC regarding discovery

production; various e-mail correspondence and
teléphomne conferences with client regarding
same 'and pervice hearing schedule; meeting with
Troy Rendell regarding rate case proceeding;
review and congsideration of e-mail
correspondence from Florida Public, Service
Commission etaff regarding its discovery
requests to Agua; begin review of ‘diacovery

requesis. ) .
D: Bruce May 3.10 hours at 365.00 pex hour. - 1131.50¢

06/04/08 Continue to review direct testimony that Aqua
filed on 5/29/08 in preparation for cliemt
meeting; attend client meeting on background,
history, concerms, action items, aud hearing
schedule with T. Rendell; memorialize action
items and dates due and present to B. May., :
Gigi Rollini  5.40 hours at 190.00 per hour, - 1026.00

06/04/08 Extranet training. re uploading documents,
ability of application to share documents '
‘drafts and each members role in managing the
" extranet site, .
Jennifer Kilinski .80 hours at .00 pex hour. . WO CHARGE



Aqua America, Inc. o July-23, -2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue - : Invoice 2274337
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 . Page’ 5

06/04/08

'06/05/08.

06/08/08

06/05/08

'RECEIVED
AUG 11 2008
commnicaticns regarding information and ACCOUNTS PAYAB

Participaée in Rxtranet trainiug;

document control and organization in comnection
with responding to extensive discovery .

requests. - : -
Vicki 8. willis 1.00 hours at .00 per hour. NO, CHARGR

Participate in client conference call regarding

service hearing logistics, discovery, status of

case. B .

D. Bruce May 1.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. $47.80

Phone conference with Charles Beck (OPC counael)
regarding discovery; begin e-mail correspondence

.to Charles Beck regarding same; review digcovery

tracking file from client regarding OPC
discovery requests; begin preparation of
chjections to OPC discovery requests; review and
consideration of e-mail correspondence from
client regarding service hearings. ’

D. Bruce May 1.30 hours at 365.00 per hour. 474.50

continue to coordinate participation in public
hearings, ilncluding presentation of availability
to B. May and schéduling; continue to prepare.
memorandur privilege and work product summary
protocol to ensure protection, in light of
testifying/non testifying witnesses, access to
extranet, and draft participation for discovery
responses; review correspondence regarding -
specific locatians for hearings. . .

~ Gigi Rollini = 2.70 hours at 190.00 per hour. h - 533.00

06/05/08

Attend meeting to diascuss organization of .the
Extranet site to be uged in responding to -
digscovery requests,

. Vicki 8. Willis .40 hours at .00 per hour. | O CHARGE




Aqua America, ‘Ine.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 -

06/06/08

06/06/08

06/09/038

Review and consideration of a-mail
correspondence from Kim Joyce regarding OPC
discovery; review matrix provided by client
regarding same; conference call with OFC counsel
regarding production .and response dates for OPRC
discovery; preparation of e-mail correspondence
to OPC counsel regarding production and response

~dates to OPC dieoovery; conferenve c¢all with Kim

Joyce regarding game.
D. Bruce May 2.60 hours at 365.00 per bhour.

Participate in Extranet training confexrence
call with client including discussion regarding
protocol for drafting respomses to
interrogatories and production of documents;
internal communications regaxding same.

vicki 8. willis 1.70 hours at .00 per hour.

Conference with ¢, Beck regarding discovery;
prepaxation of letter regarding agreement to

- waive Bection 367.082(2) (a), F8, for limited

06/10/08

. 06/10/08

‘purposes of agreeing to not implement interim

rates and chargesg before 7/30/08, if Cowmission
has not authorized interim rates by that date;
additionally Aqua Utilities will waive 60-day
timeline for Commission to suspend
implementation of final rates to 7/29/08.

D, Bruce May 1,80 hours at 365.00 per hour.-

Review extranet; telepﬁme conference with
Tallahagsee offjice regarding same (.7).

Anna L, Brinker .70 hours at 140.00 per hour.

AY .
continned preparation of petition for leave to
interveme; continued prepaxation: of pretiled

‘testimony to be filed in support of Lake Suzy

issue; preparation of letter regarding
agreement to waive Sectiom 367.082(2) (a), FS,

July 23, 2008
Invoice 2274337
Page 6 -

RECEIVED
AUG 11 2008
p“:cxjt“§TSiPﬁv{Ad3

949.00°

"NO CHARGE

657.00

98.00




Aqua America, Inc.’
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

06/10/08

06/10/08

06/11/08

for limited purposes of agreeing to not
implement interim rates and charges before
7/30/08, if Commission has not authorized
interim xates by that date; additionally Aqua
Utilities will waive 60-day timeline for
Commiggion to suspend implementation of final
rates to 7/39/08; prepare tranamittal letter to
comniggion clerk; edit, revise and finalize
petition, letter and testimony.

D. Bruce May 3.10 hours at 365. 00 per hour.

(Lake Suzy) Finalize Petition for Leave to

Intervene, including pPetition certification;

prepare and finalisze Notice of Filing Direct

. Testimony; prepare transmittal letters with
rule-compliant copy requirements; review final

version of pre-filed Direct Testimony to be

filed and offer

commants to B. May; comvert

Lake Suzy *"Utilities" to "Utility" to conform
with Secretary of State, Division of
Corporation reportings; approve and sign -
transmittal letters and pleadings;
correspondence regarding follow-up on late

filed exhibits;

_Aqua System.

Gigi Rollini

{General) extranet training for

6‘,50 hbura 'at: 190.00 per hour.

Communications with A. Brinker regarding :
protocol for managing discovery respomnse using
the Extranet, creating tracking chart in

connection with
draft email out

game and document production;
lining procedures discussed with

client during EBxtranet training conference call.

vicki 8. Willis

Telephone confe

1.00 hours at .00 per hour.

rence with H&K lit'igauosn

supportregardingsetupanduaeotmanet

website (.7).
Anna L. Br:pnke;

July 23, 2008
Invoice 2274337

Page -

.70 hourq at 140.00 per hour.

7

RECEIVED
aug 112008

ACCOUNTS PAYAS

1131.50

1235.00

98.00



Agua America, In:g.
762 W. Lancast;er Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

' 06/16/08 Multiple phone calls with Plorida Public
8ervice Commission staff regarding discovery
and accelerating responses thereto; review POD
requests; continued preparation of responses;
phone conference with Troy Rendell; phone
conference with Kim Joyce; conference with Tim
Ward regarding discovery.

D. Bruce May .90 hours at 365.00 per hour.

06/16/08 Extended conference with Florida Public Service
Commission staff regaxding additional isaues
" outstanding for approval of reorganization of
, Lake Sugy and assoclated name change. .
D. Bruce May .60 hours at 365.00 per hour,

06/16/08 Receive and review multiple correspondence
. updating weekly Florida discovery status calls
and integrate changes into calendar entries.
Gigi Rollini .20 hours at 190.00 per hour.

06/17/08 Review dimcovery issues; review prefiled -
testimouny; phone call with Ralph Jaeger
regarding staff’s discovery; e-mail to client
regarding same; review and comsideration of
e-mail correspondence from Troy Rendell
regarding Staff's discovery; call from Chris
Franklin regarding service hearings. .

D. Bruce May .70 hours at 365.00 pexr hour.

06/17/08 Begin to obtain and review client responses to
PODs and POGH; strategize regarding objections
thereto; receive and review correspondence
regarding FPSC's PODs .10 and 11; determine
whether and what discovery notices need to be
filed with the FPSC; counfirm participation in
discovery status conference call. )

@Gigi Rollini 1.40 hours at 190.00 per hour.

July 23, 2008
Invoice 2274337
Page 8

RECEIVED
AUG 1 1.2008
'ACCOUNTS PAYAB

328,50

219.00

38.00

255.50

266.,00




Aqua America, ‘Inc. July 23, 2008 .

762 W, Lancaster Avenue . Invoice 2274337
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 " Page 9
RECEIVED 5
i
AUG 11 2008
ACCOUNTS PAYAB{

06/18/08 Participate in weekly discovexy status :
conference call with OPC; notes to file ' -
regarding agreements made and follow-up . C
required; cbtain players list. . .

Gigi Rollini .80 hours at 190,00 per hour. 152.00

06/19/08 Review documents provided by Tallahasses office
(Players List, discovery matrix) and Florida _ :
PSC website (.4); telephone conferences with _ ) ;
Tallahassee office concerning-discovery
protocol, tracking chart; preparation of draft :
protocol; begin preparation of tracking chart ) ' .
(2.6) . :
Anna L. Brinker 3.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. 420.00 ;

06/19/08 Prepare responses to interrogatories served by
OPC; review objections; continued preparation
' of responses to digscovery propounded by Statf;
review potential cbjeations. .
D. Bruce May 1.10 hours at 365.00 per hour. 401.50 |

06/19/08 Regeiie status update on discovery responses . i
and organizaticnal plan regarding extranet. :
Gigi Rollini .20 hours at 190.00 per hour. -38.00 :

_06/20/08 Review latest uploads from client; update L |
. diacovery tracking chart accordingly (.6). ;

Anna L. Brinker .60 hours at 140,00 pexr houx. 84.00
. 06/20/08 Ca.ll from. Kim Joyca regaxﬂ:lng discovery

schedule . .

D. Bruce May .20 hours at 365.00 per hour. 73.00

06/20/08 Receive request for teleconference and update
on OPC POD Request Nos. 69 and 70 and respond
to B. May.
Gigi Rollini .20 hours at 190.00 pexr hour, 38.00



aAgqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaater Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

06/21/08

06/22/08

06/23/08

06/23/08

06/23/08

Determine action needed, 1nc1uding' items

‘related to timely and complete respouse to OPC

discovery by pertinent deadiines; begin to
identify response deadlines based on plecemeal
extensions; begin to obtain staff discovery
Tequests. .

Gigi Rollini .50 hourp at 390,00 per hour.

Continue to discern pertinent discovery
response deadlines.
Glgi Rollini .30 hours at: 190,00 per hour.

Update discovery tracking chart; review
correspondence from client enclosing (D'e
responsive to POD {.5).

Amna L. Brinker = .50 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Mulitiple phone calls with Kim Joyce and 'rroy

Rendell regarding discovery issues; phone
conterence with general counsel regarding
confidentiality of documents requested by OPC;
continued review of discovery propounded by
OPC; continue to prepare responses to request
for production of documents; review documents
for potential privilege claims; conference with
client; review answers to interrogatories;
begin preparation of privilege log; review MFR -
deficiency letter provided by Tim Devliin.

D. Bruce May 1.60 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Begin to develop protocol for response to PODs,
including to protect applicable privileges and
ob:lectionsr begin. to identify responses to date

‘and. pertinent cbjections to preserve; numerous

correspondence regarding public hearings and
privilege/confidentiality issues for
resclution; determine status of late-filed
exhibits; determine atatus of production in
response to staff d:laoovery requegts; confirm
public hearing attendance.

Gigi Rollini 3.80 hours at 190.00 per hour.

July a3, 2008
Invoice 2274337
Page 10

95.00

57.00
‘ , 70.00
RECEIVED"
AUG 11 2008
4 ACCOUNTS PAYAB

564.00

$32.00



Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Nawr, PA 19010

06/24/08

06/24/08

06/24/08

Update discovery tracking chart (documents in
responge to OPC's First POD (.3); begin

printing documents in response to Second

Request for Production for bates labeling

{(1.5). ’

Anna L. Brinker 1.80 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Review privilege log; research regarding motion
for temporary protective order.
D. Bruce May <70 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Numerousa correspondence; coanfirm status of
Late-filed Exhibite E-F; continue to develop
digcovery protocol for PODS; research FPSC
procedure for keeping certain daiscovery
documents that constitute confidential
trade-gecret, business or otherwisgse sensitive
information, notwithstanding Chapter 119, Fla.
stat., Florida's Public Recoxrds Act; consider
and research whether corporate campensation

- committee minutes are "confidential® or whethe}

os}zs/oa

it ie arguable that they are; consider
strategic options for handling discovery
request for confidential informatiom in light
of Aqua’s desire to be cooperative with OPC;
consider whether OPC is a public "agency® for
Public Records Act purposes; meet with B. May.
to brief on research and prépare for client .
teleconference with R. Stahl; continue to track
outstanding discovery due within next week;
continue to.develop objections/respongses to
OPC’s ROGs; determine format to use regarding
filings with FPSC after responsea to PODs and
ROGS are served; receive staffvs 2nd set of
ROGS . :

"@lgi Rollini 4.90 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Countinued preparation of documents for use in
responding to OPC‘g second get of POD; B
preparation of tracking chart of same (7.7).
Armna L. Brinker 7.70 hours at 140.00 per hour.

July 23, 2008
Invoice 2274337 .

Page 11

252.00

255.50

RECEIVED
AUG 11 2008
ACCOUNTS PAYAB

931.00

1078.00




DR

Aqua America, Ipc. B
762 W. Lancaater Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

06/25/08

Extended phone conference with Florida Public

. Bervice Commission staff attormey, Ralph

06/25/08

. 06/25/08

Jaeger, regarding format of service hearings;
begin preparation of exhibits to service
hearings in Palatka and Gainesville; review
discovery issues; multiple phone comferences

.with Kim Joyce regarding legal issues and

privileged information associated with request
for production of documents and interrogatories
submitted by OFC. ’

D. Bruce May 1.20 hours at 365.00 per hour,

Participate in weekly discovery status call
regarding discovery response extensions by OPC;
continue to update response deadlines,
including extensions granted on call; prepare
magter list of" items to be completed to timely
and fully respond to discovery regquest, method
for completion and timing; contimue to claxify
discovery production protocol to ensure
production is labeled, timely, complete and
accompanied by objections and Notice to the
¥P8C; continue to develop substance, including
appropriate statutory authority, for Motiom for
Temporary Protective Order; define parameters
for research into additional Motions to file if
OPC elects. to use confidential information at
hearing.

Gigi Rollini 5.10 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Research past docket filings with the Florida
Public service commission xre motions for '
temporary protective order, requests for
confidential classification, notices of intent
to file, notice of service of answers and
notice of production documents; draft motion’
for temporary prbtective order. .

© Jemnifer Kilinski 2,00 hours at 140.00 per hour.

July 23, 2008
* Invoice 2274337
Page .12

438.00

RECEIVED
AUG 11 2008
AGCOL (S PAYAB

969.00

280.00



P

Aqua America, I:ic.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

06/26/08

06/26/08

06/26/08

Continued preparation of production documents

in response to OPC's Second Set of POD; updat:e
diacovery tracking charts (9.3).

Anna L. Brinker 8.00 hours at 140. 00 per hour.

Continued review of discovery responses to OPCs
1st and 2o0d PODS and 18t ROGs; continued
preparation of responses to PODs and ROGs;
multiple phone: calls to Kim Joyce regarding
legal issues associated with production and
privileged information; review motion for
temporary ordér for confidential documents;
multiple phones with Troy Rendell regarding -
service hearing; prepare exhibits for sewice
hearings.

D. Bruce May 1.60 hours at- 365.00 per hour.

Recelve, review and prepare to incorporate
Aqus’s specific cbjections.to OPC’s
Interrogatories and Production of Docunents;
receive and respond to correspondence regarding
objections to PODs 106 and 107; numerous
correspondence with updates; receive and begin
to review document bates stamp protocol
regarding POPs ¢ and 74 (regarding privilege);
continue to prepare written réaponses,
including general objections and specific.
objections to OPC’a First Request for
Production; begin to prepare template to be
used for writtem respomses to OPC'®m First Set
of Interrogatories; begin to prepare Motiom for
Temporary Protective Order; track PGD and ROG
extensions and potential extemsions, for
incorporation into written yesponses; develop
tracking table for remaining responses/answers
to be uploaded to extranet.by Aqua; begin to
agsess true number of subparts and compound
requests for first POD set for inclusion in -
general objections.

‘Gigi. Rollini 6.50 hours at 190. 00 per hour

July 23, 2008
Invoice 2274337

Page 13

- 1120.00

584.00

RECEIVED
AUG 11 2008
ACCOUNTS PAYAB

1235,00



Aqua America, mc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue

06/26/09

06/27/08

06/27/08

06/27/08

- Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

Finalize draft of motion for temporary
protective drder on discovery documents; draft
defendant’e response to plalntiff’s request for
production of documents; conference ¢all with
Tallahassee and Jackgonville team working on
the case for discovery procedures and status
update on timely filing.

Jennifer Kilinski 1.00 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Final preparation of production documents in
response to OPC’s Secomd S8et POD; instructioms
to copy service regarding same (1.8).

Amna L. Brinker 1.80 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Review discovery responses (PODs and ROGs);
call from Charles Beck’'s office; multiple phone
calls with Kim Joyce regarding discovery
responses; multiple phone calls with Mary
Hopper regarding discovery response; review
correspondence from Troy Rendaell; prepare for
service hearings; review opening statement;
prepare revisions thereto; prepare eikhibits .
regarding proof of publication and affidavit of
customer notice; conference call with client
regaxrding discovery reaponse and future
discovery; begin review of second set of
interrogatories and third set of production of
documents sexrved by OPC.

D. Bruce May 2.50 hours at 365.00 per hour,

Prepaxe writ:t-.e.n auswers/objections to OBC’s
Firgt set of Interrogatories to Aqua; comsider
method for handling ROG attachmentsa, including
possible production in POD catch-all, if any,
in light of bates labeling protocol/timing;
participate in discovery status teleconference
with cliente; determine whiéh production of -
document requests ghould be included in Motion
for Temporary Protective order; finalize Motion
for Temporary Protective Order; prepare Motion

July 23, 2008
Involce 2274337 -

140.00

'252.00

'RECEIVED
" AUG 1 1.2008

. ACCOUNTS PAYAB

912.50



Aqua America, Inc. ; ' July 23, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avemie ) . mvolce 2274337 .
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 : Page 15

for distribution to client for review/ccmment
and send; determine method for handling
requests for which Aqua received extension, |
vhich are ready but ‘were not included in bates
stamped documents; continue to.prepare written
responsed o OPC'e Pirst Set of Interrogatories
(Req. Nos. 1-101), including set of respouses '
uploaded to extranet at end of day; assess
remaining roge for which no response has heen
uploaded.

Gigi Rollini 6.00 hours at 180,00 per hqur.

06/27/08 Review Gainesville and Palatka trial
transcripts to determine what pleces of
evidence were introduced by client in those
proceedings and report them via spreadsheet.
.Jeanifer Kiliuski 1. 80 hours at 140.00 per hou.r

06/28/08 Review document production to OPC; reviezw

responses to interrogatories; prepare swume.
D. Bruce May 2.00 hours at 365.00 per hour.

06/28/08 Confirm CDs from Aqua were received; continue
to prepare written responses to OPC's gecond
Request- for Production; determine intarrogatory -
reaponses with attachments were consolidated to
1 CD for inclusion into writtem respouses;
assess interrogatory respouses with formatting
difficulties, including Interrogatories 19, 90
and ‘97; continue developing general and

- specific objectlon language and format.

Gigi Rollini 2.90 houra at .190.0Q per hour.

06/29/08 Begin preparation of order of proof, A
D. Bruce May .60 hours at 365.00 per hour.

1140.00 .

252.00

730.00

RECEIVED
AUG 1 1 2008
ACCOUNTS PAYAB

5§51.00

219.00
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REMITTANCE COPY
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Holland & Knight LLP
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_ orlando, FL 32025-5016
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"_Holtand & Knight LLP

CHECK REQUEST

@Dpnno#_ 29182

. { Complete ines 2fo 6 i & vendor number is niot known }
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Florida Rate Case
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" October 24, 2008

$48,118.67
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Qeneral Ledger
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186101
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Aqua America, Inc. _ oOctober. 15, 2008

762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 230f927 .
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REMITTAMCE CORY

MATTER BALANCE EROUGHT FORWARD: 129,764.30

TOTAL DUR" | . $ 177,883 .47
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Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

_For pro:esaional services rendered through September 30, 2008
in connection with the following: .

Ouxr Matter #117542.00001
Florida Rate Case

09/01/08

-

Continue to track document uploads for 9/2

" round of discovery production; begin to develop

p9/02/08

09/02/08

objection/response for OPC 4th POD (including
consideration of PODs 196, 199 and 200).
Gigi Rollini = 3.50 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Update discovery and deadline charts;
preparation of chart showing all I-Manage
document numbers; review of Staff‘s 2nd POD and
Fifth ROG; preparation of Notices of Service

and Transmittal letters for Staff‘s 4th
Interrogatories, OPC’s 3rd, 5th and 6th
Interrogatories, and OPC’s 5th and 6th PODs
(4.4). .

Anna L. Brinker 4.40 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Review discovery responses; extended phoune

- conference with Mary Hopper; extended phone
conference with Kim Joyce; review

attorney-client privilege issues; continued .
preparation of privilege log; call from nor:l.da
rublic Service Commission.

D. Bruce May 1.50 hours at 365.00 per hour.

665.00

616.00 -

547.50

TERNS: DUE ON' RICBIPT
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09/02/08 Continue to track POD attachment documents to
engsure all documents to be produced to OPC with -
AUF's response to OPC's 4th PODs have been
provided; continue to determine method for
assessing G. Prettyman’s e-mails for production
in response to POD No. 199; receive and begin
to review Staff’s Sth ROGs and 2d PODS;
determine deadline for staff‘s new discovery
requests in light of mail service/prehearing
order on procedure; finalize 4th POD responses
to PODs 196, 199 and 200 and prepare document
for client approval and correspondence with
producticn protocol; begin to obtain approval
for expedited objection sets (OPC’s 6th ROGs
and 5th/6th PODs); begin to develop next round
of document templates; teleconference with M.
Hopper t:0 finalize POD 200 response;.finalize,
sign and prepare for service/filing. . .
Gigi Rollini 3.70 hours at 190.00 per hour. 703.00

09/027/08 Review of email correspondence from G. Rollini
. on production of documents over the weekend;

upload documents to extranet and notify client
of what was uploaded and the location of the
document; download and organize documents
uploaded to the extranet by client for
-potenitial review by OPC staff.
Patricia B. Greene 2.50 hours at 140.00 per hour. 350.00

09/03/08 Preparation of templates for responses to OPC’S -
Pifcth POD, Sixth POD, Third ROGs, Sixth ROGs,
and supplemental responses to OPC's Third ROGs,
Fourth ROGs and Fifth ROGs, and Staff’'s Second
POD and Fifth ROGs; update discovery recap
chart (5.3). :
Anna L. Brinker 4.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. 560.00
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09/03/08 Continued review of discovery responses; review

09/03/08

09/03/08

.09/04/08

09/04/08

attorney-client privilege issues; continued

preparation of privilege log; call from Florida

Public Service Commission.

D. Bruce May 1.50 hours at '365.00 per hour. . 547.50

Continue to review G. Prettyman correspondence

(POD 199) to detail specific fact vs. opinion

work product/privileged materials; receive

template documents for upcoming rounds of

discovery and begin to review to finalize. . .
@igi Rollini .50 hours at ' 190.00 per hour. ) 95.00

Production and organization of email

correspondence and documents uploaded by client

to the Extranet. . .

Patricia B. Greene 1.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. .140.00

Conference with PFlorida Public Service

Commission staff regarding deficiency issues;

conference with Florida Public Service.

Commigelon staff regarding discovery propounded

by staff; review correspondence from OPC

regarding discovery; continued preparation of

Gary Prettyman‘s deposition; continued A

preparation of trial notebook; prepare legal

analysis of consolidated rate iasue.

D. Bruce May 2.20 hours at 365.00 per hour. 803.00

Correspondence regarding Commission on Ethics
draft opinion regarding T. Rendell; continue to
determine discoverablity of e-mails and to
analyze PSC-specific standards for fact/opinion
work product doctrine protection and
attorney-client privilege; prepare AUF‘s written
response to Staff’s 4th ROGs for today’s
sexrvice/filing, including transmittal letter,

_Notice of 8Service, and stamndardized written

answer language; begin to determine best method
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09/04709

09/04/08

'09/05/08

for handling “attachments® for ROGs 7, 8 and 9,
and coordinate effort to print and bates label
attachments; print, sign and prepare for .
filing/service; begin to design privilege log to

be used for POD 199/G, Prettyman e-maila;

prepaze for and attend weekly discovery status
call with OPC; determine supplemental response
to additional OPC 2nd ROGs will be due Tuesday,
9/8/08, and begin to prepare document template,
transmittal and Notice in preparation for quick
deadline; receive copy of stamped/filed
documents.

Gigi Rollini 5.00 hours at 190.00 per hour. - $50.00"

Printing and organization of documents for
review by Office of General Counsel staff.
Patricia B. Greene 2.00 hours at 140,00 per hour. 2860.00

Communications with @. Rollini regarding
privilege issues and drafting privilege log. . T
vicki s. Willis .20 hours at .00 per hour, © ' NO CHARGE

Preparation of templates for Supplemental
Responge to OPC’s 2nd Interrogatories, Notice -
of Service and Transmittal letter for same;
receipt, review OPC‘s Seventh PODS; preparation
of template for Gemeral Objections to same;
update discovery chart, tracking charts and

. discovexy recap index (3.0).

09/05/08

Amna L. Brinker 1.50 hours at 140.00 per hour. 210.00

Continued preparation of document production;
review work product issues; continued
preparation of privilege log; review
correspondence from Florida Public Service
Commission; conference call with Kim Joyce
regarding documents responsive to production of
docunent requests filed by OPC; phone
conference with Troy Rendell; conference with
Mary Hopper. a

D. Bruce May 1.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. S 547.50-




- Agqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
. Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

09/05/08

09/0s/08

Consultation re discovery of expert materials.

Elizabeth L. Bevington ° .30 hours at .00 per hour. ' -NO CHARGE.

Numerous correspondence regarding discovery,
Ethics Opinion regarding T. Rendell; continue to
prepare for OPC's document inspection néxt
Monday, including audit responses and G.

- Prettyman e-mails; correspondence with C. Beck

regarding ROGs 130, 146 and 162; teleconferxence
with M. Hopper regarding POD 199 production;

- meet with B. May to begin to develop legal

argument for handling of witness correspondence;
memorialize/notes to file; continue to review
Prettyman's e-mails; review PSC case law
interpreting Florida Rules of Civil Procedure
regaxding trial preparation discovery, work
product protection and methodology for seeking
commmications between a testifying expert
witness and counsel for client; begin to develop
privilege log for commmications and
recomnendation regarding documents to be

. _disclosed for Monday's inspection to protect all

09/05/08

applicable objections.
Gigl Rollini 6.00 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Printing, review and organization of documents
for review by the Office of Public Counsel.

_Patricia B. Greene 9.00 hours at 140.00 per hour.

09/07/08

09/07/08

Continue to prepare for OPC’'a doéument

.inspection, including finalize privilege log

for POD 199; continue to prepare supplemental
response document to ROGs 109, 128, 143 and
180, due Tuesday. o

Gigi Rollini  2.10 hours at 190,00 per hour.

Organization and production of documents for
review by the Office of Public Counsel.
Patricia B, Greene 4.00 hours at 140.00 per hour.

S

_Octcber 15, 2008
Invoice 2307927
Page

1140.00

1260.00

399.00

560.00
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09/08/08 Conférence with Troy Rendell regarding staff
audit; conference with Plorida Public Service
Commission staff- counsel regarding discovery;
review staff interrogatory 30 issue; review
documents for production to OPC; begin outline
of motion for protective order; phone .
conference with Mary Hopper; phone conference
with Kim Joyce. .
D, ‘Bruce May 1.30 hours at 365.00 per hour. - ] T 474.50

09/08/08 Continue to prepare for OPC’s document review:
and eénsure all documents are present and
accounted for; prepare for production POD 199
privilege log; develop and prepare for
production POD 200 privilege log, including
determination of specific privileges that apply
to each that are to be included in logs; begin
to prepare Motion for Protective Order for PODs
136, 199 and 200, including determine
requirements for expanded privilege log; report
on OPC. document inspection after its conclusion; -
determine legal bases for cost allocation to OPC
for requested copies of discovery produced by
AUF to OPC; continue to review witness e-mails
received from.client for applicable privileges,
portioms requiring redaction, and determine
which (if any) pages reflecting missing
attachments need to be obtained from client as
potentially discoverable within scope of POD 199

request. - .
Gigi Rollini  6.00 hours at 190.00 per hour. . 1140.00

. 09/08/08 Final orxrganization and production of documents
for review by the Office of Public Counsel;
monitor review of documents by staff of the
- Office of Public Counsel. .
Patricia B. Greene 3.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. 420.00
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09/09/08 Attendance at team teleconference (.7);

- preparation of templates for Supplemental

. Answers to OPC’s 3rd. Interrogatories, Notice of
Service and Transmittal Letter; preparation of
Notice of Service and Transmittal in
conjunction with Answers to OPC’s 4th
Interrogatories; update discovery tracking
chart, deadlines chart and discovery document
recap index {(2.4).

Anmna L. Brinker 1.50 hours at; 140.00 per hour. - 210.00

"09/09/08 Call from Troy Rendell regarding advisory
opinion; call from Florida Public Service
Commission regarding same. ’

D. Bruce May .30 hours at 365.00 per hour. . 109.50

08/09/08 Multiple telephone calls to Troy Rendell"
regarding billing issues; continued preparation
" for Gary Prettyman deposition; call to.Ralph
Jaeger regarding discovery; call to Mary Hopper
regarding rebuttal testimony; meeting with AUF
team regarding hearing preparations and
document production; calls from Tim Ward
regarding billing analysis. ’ :
D. Bruce May 1.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 547.50

09/09/08 Advise on legal basis for charging OPC for copy

requests regarding ADF‘'s discovery production

© to determine handling of -OPC's 9/8 copy
requests; determine to track costs, but not to
bill oPC for copies; receive, review and begin
" to analyze OPC's discovery follow-ups,
including to POD No. 200 privilege log (claim
of attorney/client privilege); receive

" integrated AUF supplemental answers to OPC’s
ROG Nos. 109, 128, 143 and 180, standardize
language, and prepare for flling/service;
prepare for filing/swervice requisite B
transmittals and Notice; receive and begin to
analyze OPC’'s initial objections to AUF's
ROGe/POD8; work om finalizing document

Aqua America; Inc. - ‘ - October 15, 2008.°
762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2307927
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‘09/09/08

09/10/08

09/10/08

0s8/10/08

templates for AUF’'s objectioms/written

responses to OPC’s 7th PODg, corrected 5th

PODs, 6th PODg, and 6th ROGS; coordinate

protocol and effort regarding discovery

prepared according to OPC’'s request for copies,

including labeling, copying, storage and pick

up. : .
Gigi Rollini '6.00 hours at 190.00 per hour. 1140.00

Review and coordinate the copying of documents

requested by the Office of Public Counsel;

meeting with B. May and . Rollini to discusas

organigation, status and strategy of rate case;

bates .labeling of document for G. Rollini.

Patricia B, Greene 3.00 hours at 140.00 per hour, 420,00

Preparation of Answers to OPC’s Third and

Fourth Interrogatories in final; preparation of

revised Notice of Service and transmittal ’

(2.7). . . :

Amna L. Brinker 1.50 hours at 140.00 per hour. 210,00

Conference with Eim Joyce regarding answers to

interrogatories; extended phone conferemce with

Tim Ward; review billing issues; begin

preparation for deposition of Gary Prettyman;

prepare attormey-client privilege. documents

regaxding same. Co . - .

D. Bruce May 1.20 hours at 365.00 per hour. © 438,00

Rumerous. corregpondence regarding canceled
Aqua, OPC discovery status call, cost estimates
and Chuluota update; continue to ensure
docunents requested by OPC are available for
OPC and properly labeled; continue to develop
document templates for next rounds of
discovery; advise regarding procedure for
transmitting OPC’s requested documents and
requirements as to other parties per Order on
Procedure and FL Civil Procedure rules, and




. Aqua America, Iac.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue

Bryn Mawr, PA 138010 . Page

prepare correspondence to all parties; continue
to track discovery extensions granted by OPC
and/or answered early by Aqua; prepare written
responses to OPC’g 3d ROGs, including
finalizing all responses with attachments,
standardizing response/cbjections, tracking
attachments to ensure complete, cobtaining
affidavits and reconciling all document
references; prepare 3d ROGs for filing/sexrvice, .

. including Notice and transmittals; prepare

09/10/08

09/11/08

09/1;/08

written responses, Notice, transmittals for -
OPC’s 4th ROGs and prepare for filing/sexvice;
memorialize. protocol ‘for upcoming discovery
written responses and tracking to shift
handling as trial preparation phase of rate
case approaches.

Gigl Rollini 6.00 hours at 190,00 per hour.

Review, printing and organization of email
correspondence from Extranet and from G. Gillis .
and G. Rollimi.

Patricia B. Greeme 1.20 houra at 140.00 per houi. '

Continued review of discovery responses; review
draft interrogatory answers; research and '
analysis regarding attorney-client privilege
protection; review confidentiality issues
associated with OPC’s discovery requests;
conference with Kim Joyce regarding contract
issues associated with reuse projects; phone
conference with Mary Hopper regarding POD
responses; phone conference with Troy Rendell
regarding water management district witnesses
and implications for rate case.

D. Bruce May 1.20 hours at 365.00 per hour

call from ethics commission.

D. Bruce May .30 hours at 365.00 per hour.

9

October 15, 2008 .
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09/11/08 Begin tb_'prepare for OPC’s request to inépect .

.documents to ROG 128(b) and (c); continue to

© create privilege log for POD 199 documents,

09/12/08

09/12/08.

including identification of all attorneys for
purpose of attorney/client privilege and
distinction of fact vs. opinion work product;
determine “affidavit® requirements of log for
purpose of potential motion to compel and
report findings to B. May; continue to prepare
for potential motion to compel, including legal
research into fact vs. opinion work product in
PSC proceedings; continue to review OPC’'s
objections to Aqua‘’s discovery to identify
inconsistencies regarding OPC‘s potential
reaction to Aqua’s assertionsg of privilege,
work product and rule-based cbjections; review
letters from PSC Staff regarding expert’
testimony and correspondence regarding selected
experts; assess likely topics of testimony. :

Gigi Rollini 4.40 hours at 190.00 per .hour. 836.00 .

Review notice of taking Gary Prettyman’s
deposition; preparation of discovery responses;
conference with client regarding same; edit
same; finalize discovery responses; prepar&t:.on
of letter to clerk regarding discovery. .
responses; preparation for conference call
regarding Gary Prettyman’'s deposition;
participate in same.

D. Bruce May 2.80 hours at 365.00 per hour. ~ 1022.00

Receive and review G. Prettyman Notice of

. Deposition and consider document request;

review assessment of ROG 415 true ups; obtain

copy of supplemental discovery filings for ROGs

190, 192, 193 and 203; review apecific

discovery requested by OPC for import. . S
Gigi Rollini .90 hours at 190,00 per hour. 171.00




Aqua’ America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

09/13/08

09/14/08

09/15/08

09/15/08

Continue to review recent discovery propounded
to OPC per OPC’s specific requedt.
Glgi Rollind .30 hours at 190.00 per hour.’

éontinue to track and review recent discovery
propounded to OPC, _
Gigi Rollindi .20 tiours at 190.00 per hour.

Review of final Supplemental Answers to
Interrogatories 190, 192, 193 and 203; update
diacovery tracking chart with same (.3).

October 15, 2008
Invoice 2307927

Page 11

Anna L. Brinker .30 hours at 140.00 per hour.-

Review discovery responses; finalize and file
game; continued preparation for Gary
Prettyman’s deposition; review interim rate
hedring tramscript; preparation of e-mail

. correspondence regarding billing determinante’

09/15/08

09/16/08

09/16/08

and billing ahalysis.

D. Bruce May 1.60 hours at 365.00 per hour.
Receive and review request from OPC regarding
electronic discovery sets for OPC's 3d ROGs and
4th PODs; advige regarding expedited objections -

‘to OPC’s 7th PODs, to be served today.

Gigi Rollini .40 hours at 190.00 per hour,

Update discovery tracking charte and deadlines
chart (.4); begin preparation of Answers to
OPC’'s Fifth Interrogatories (.S)..

Anna L. - Brinker .90 hours at 140,00 per hour.

Review and comdideration of e-mail

correspondence from Gary Prettyman regarding
billing analysis issues; prepare response to
same; continued preparation for deposition of

Gary Prettyman.
D. Bruce May 2.00 bours at 365.00 per hour.

———— .. . o s - e ¢

57.00 -

- 38,00

42.00

584,00

© 76.00

126.00

730.00
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09/16/08

Determine status of weekly discovery call with
OPC to ensure coverage; continue to ascertain
POD 199 privilege log action needed in light of

- OPC's deposition notice to G. Prettyman;

09/16/08

09/17/08

'o§/i7/os

09/17/08

continue to oversee discovery tracking.
Gigi Rollini  1.10 hours at 190.00 per hourx.

Commnications with B. May and G. Rollini
regarding status of document review and
preparation of expanded privilege log; continue
review and analysis of documents; compile list
of Aqua employees, consultants and attorneys;
communications with J. Gillis regarding
unidentified individuals appearing on
documents; continue preparation of expanded
privilege log in comnection with response to
OPC's Request for Production No. 1%9.

October 15, 2008
Invoice 2307927
Page 12 -

o~

Rebecca J. Hilliard 2. oo hours at 140.00 per hour.

Preparation of Answers to OPC's Fifth .
Interrogatories, Notice of BService and
Transmittal; begin updating discovery charts
{2.8)}.

Amna L. Brinker 2.80 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Travel ‘to and participate. in witness
preparation for deposition (Gary Prettyman).
D, Bruce May 7.00 hours at 365.00 per hour,

Determine appropriate objection for ROG 417
Yegarding executive compensation, which was
also subject to Order granting Aqua’s Motlion
for Temporary Protective Order, and strategize
regarding rew Motion for Temporary Protective
Order; continue to prepare to serve Aqua’s
responses to OPC’s Sth ROGs; prepare the Notice
and Transmittal letter for Aqua’s regpomses to
oPC's Sth ROGs; emsure inclusion of signed

-arfidavit page; coordinate effort to reconcile

209.00

' 280.00

392.00

2555, 00
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09/03/08 Continued review of discovery responges; review
attorney-client privilege issues; contimued
preparation of privilege log; call from Florida
‘Public 8exvice Comuission.
D. Bruce May 1.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. . " 547.50

09/03/08 Continue to review G. Prettyman correspondence
" . (POD 199) to detail specific fact vs. opinion
work product/privileged materials; receive’
template documents for upcoming rounds of
digcovery and begin to review to finalize. .
Gigi Rollini .50 hours at - 190.00 per hour. . 95,00

05/03/08 Production and organization of email
correspondence and document:s uploaded by clieat -
to the Extramet. ‘
Patricia B. Greene 1. 00 ‘hours at 140,00 per hour 140.00

09/04/08 Couference with Florida Public Service
: Comnisasion staff. regarding deficiency issues;
conference with Florida Public Service.
Commission staff regarding discovery propounded
by staff; review correspondence from OFC
regarding discovery; continued preparation of
" Gary Prettyman’s deposition; continued
preparation of trial notebook; prepare legal
analysis of comsolidated rate issue.
D. Bruce May 2.20 hours at 365.00 per hour. B03.00

09/04/08 Correspondence regarding Commission on Ethics
draft opinion regarding T. Rendell; continue to
determine dlscoverablity of e-mails and to
analyze PSC-specific standards for fact/opiniom
work product doctrine protection and
attorney-client privilege; prepare AUF’s written
response to staff’s 4th ROGs for today’s
service/filing, including transmittal letter,
Notice of Service, and standardized written
answer language; begin to determine best method
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09/04/08

08/04/08

09/05/08

09/05/08

for handling “attachments® for ROGe 7, 8 and 9,
and coordinate effort to print and bates label
attachments; print, sign and prepare for
filing/service; begin to. design privilege log to

be used for POD 199/G, Prettyman e-mails;

prepare for and attend weekly discovery status
call. with OPC; determine supplemental response
to additional OPC 2nd ROGs will be due Tuesday,

.9/8/08, and.begin to prepare document template,

transmittal and Notice in preparation for quick

deadline; -receive copy . of stamped/filed

documents. .

Gigi Rollini 5.00 ‘bours at 190.00 per hour. i © 950,00

Printing and organization of documents for
review by Office of General Counsel staff. ‘ .-
Patricia B. Greene 2.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. ' 280.00

Commmications with G. Rolﬁ.ni regarding .
privilege issues and drafting privilege log.- : )
Vicki 8. Willis .20 hours at .00 per hour, NO CHARGE

Preparation of templates for Supplemental

Response to OPC's 2nd Interrogatories, Notice

of. Service and Trinsmittal letter for same;

receipt, review OPC’s Seventh PODs; preparation

of template for General Objections to same;

update discovery chart, tracking charts and

discovery recap index (3.0). | :

Anna L. Brinker 1.50 hours at 140.00 per hour. 210.00

Continued preparation of document production;

review work product issues; continued

preparation of privilege log; review

correspondence from Florida Public Service

Commission; conference call with Kim Joyce

regarding documents responsive to production of

document requests filed by OPC; phone

conference with Troy Rendell; conference with

Mary Hopper. ’ ’ )

D. Bruce May 1.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 547.50
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09/05/08 Consultation re discovery of expert materials.
Rlizabeth L. Bevington' .30 hours at .00 per hour. NO CHARGE

09/05/08 Numerous correspcndence regarding discovery,
Ethics Opinion regarding T. Rendell; continue to
prepare for OPC’s document inapection next
Monday, including audit responses and G.
Prettyman e-mails; correspondence with C. Beck

" regarding ROGs 130, 146 and 162; teleconference
‘with M. Hopper regarding POD 199 production;
meet with B. May to begin to develop legal
argument for handling of witness correspondence;
memorialize/notes to file; continue to review
Prettyman's e-mails; review P8C case law
interpreting Florida Rules of Civil Procedure
regarding trial preparation discovery, work
product protection and methodology for seeking
communications between a testifying expert
witness and counsel for cliemt; begin to develop'
privilege log for commumications and
recommendatlion regarding documents to be
disclesed for Monday‘’s inspection to protect all
applicable objectiomns. ,
Gigi Rollini 6.00 hours at 190.00 pexr hour. : 1140.00

- 09/05/08 Printing, review and organizac:lgm of documentsg
) for review by the Office of Public Counsel. .
Patriclia B. Greeme 9.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. . 1260.00

" 09/07/08 Countinue to prepare for OPC's docummu:

inspection, including finalize privilege log

for POD 199; continue to prepare supplemental

résponse document to ROGs -109, 128, 143 and

180, due Tuesday. . )
Gigi Rollini 2.10 hours at 190.00 per hour. . 399.00

09/07/08 Organization and production of documents for
review by the Office of public Counsel. )
Patricia B. Greenie 4.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. 560.00
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09/08/08

Conference w:lth Troy Rendell regarding staff
audit; confereuce with Florida Public Servi.ce
Commission staff counsel regarding discovery;

. review staff interrogatory 30 issue; review

0s/08/08

documents for production to OPC; begin outline

of - motion for protective order; phone

conference with Mary Hopper; phone conference

with Xim Joyce.

D. Bfuce May 1.30 hours ‘at 365.00 per hour.‘ 474.50

COntinue to- prepare for OPC’s document review
and ensure all documents. are pregent and
accounted for; prepare for production POD 199
privilege log; develop and prepare for
production POD 200 privilege log, including
determination of specific privileges that apply

. to each that are to be included in logs; begin

.08/08/08

to prepare Motion for Protective Order for PODs
196, 199 and 200, 1nc1ud1ng determine
requirements .for expanded privilege log; report
on OPC. document inspection after its comclusiom; -

‘determine’ legal basea for coet allocation to OPC

for requested coples of discovery produced by

AUF to OPC; continue to review witness e-mails

received from.client for applicable privileges,

portions requiring redaction, and determine

which (if any) pages reflecting missing '

attachments need to.be obtained from client as

potentially discoverable within scope of POD 199

request. .

Gigi Rollini - 6.00 hours. at 190.00 per hour. : 3140.00

Final organization and production of documents -
for review by the Office of Public Coumsel;
nonitor review of ‘documents by staff of the

- Office of Public.Counsel.

.Patricia B. Greene 3.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. - 420.00



Aqua America, Inc. E October 15, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue < Invoice 2307927
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 . Page . 7 .

'09/09/08 Attendance at team teleconference (.7);
preparation of templates for Supplemental :
Answers to OPC‘s 3rd Interrogatories, Notice of
Service and Tramsmittal lLetter; preparation of
Notice of.Service and Transmittal in
conjunction with Answers to OPC's 4th
Interrogatories; update discovery tracking
chart, deadlines chart and discovery document
recap index (2.4). . _
Anna L. Brinker 1.50 hours at 140.00 per hour. - 210.00

09/09/08 Call from Troy Rendell regarding advisoxy
- opinion; call from Florida Public Service
Commission regarding same. :
D. Bruce May .30 hoursg at 365. oo pexr hour. ~109.50

09/09/08 Multiple telephone calls to Troy Rendell
‘regarding billing issues; continued prepaxation
for Gary Prettyman deposition; call to Ralph
Jaeger regarding discovery; call to Mary Hopper
regarding rebuttal testimony; meeting with AUF
team regaxrding hearing preparations and
document production; calls from Tim Ward
regarding billing analysis. .
D. .Bruce May 1.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. : 547.50

09/09/08 Advise om -legal basis for charging OPC for copy
. requests regarding AUF’s discovery production
to determine handling of OPC’s 9/8 copy
. requests; determine to track costs, but unot to
bill OPC for copies; receive, review and begin

. to analyze OPC's discovery follow-ups,
including to- POD No. 200 privilege log (claim
of attorney/client privilege); receive
integrated AUF supplemental answers to OPC’s
ROG Nos. 108, 128, 143 and 180, standardize
language, and prepare for filing/service;
prepare for filing/service requisite )
tranemittals and Notice; receive and begin to

- analyze OPC’s initial objections to AUF’'s
ROGe/POD8; work on finalizing document °




Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
. Bryn Mawx, PA 19010 ; Page

69/09/08

09/10/08

' 09/10/08

" 09/10/08

templates for AUF’'s objections/written
responses to OPC’'s 7th PODg, corrected 5th
PODs, 6th PODs, and 6th ROGS; coordinate
protocol and effort regarding discovery
prepared according to OPC’s reguest for copies,
including labeling, copying, storage and pick
up. .

Gigi Rollini '6.00 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Review and coordinate the copying of documents
réquested by the Office of Public Counsel;
meeting with B. May and G. Rollini to discuss
organization, status and strategy of rate case;
bates labeling of document for G. Rollini. .

Patricia B. Greeme 3.00 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Preparation of Answers to OPC's Third and

Fourth Interrogatories in final; preparation of
revised Rotice of Bervice and transmittal

(2.7).

Anna L., Brinker 1;50 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Conference with Kim Joyce regarding answers to
interrogatories; extended phone conference with

Tim Ward; review billing issues; begin
preparation for depositiom of Gary Prettyman;

prepare attorney-client privilege docunents
regarding same.

D. Bruce May 1.20 hours at: 365.00 per hour.

Numerous correspondence regarding canceled
Aqua, OPC discovery status call, cost estimates
and chuluota update; coantinue to ensure
documents requegted by OPC are available for
OPC and properly labeled; continue to develop
document templates for next rounds of
discovery; advise regarding procedure for
transmitting OPC’s requested documents and

requirements as to other parties per Order on

Procedure and FL Civil Procedure rules, and

October 15, 2008
Invoice 2307927

1140.00

420.00

'210.00

438.00




1

Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

prepare correspondence to all partiles; continue

to track discovery extensions granted by OPC
and/or answered early by Aqua; prepare written
responses to OPC’s 3d ROGs, including
finalizing all responses with attachments,
standardizing response/objections, tracking
attachments to ensure complete, obtaining
affidavits and reconciling all document

references; prepare 3d ROGs for £iling/service, .

including Notice and transmittals; prepare
written responses, Notice, transmittals for -
OPC’s 4th ROGs and prepare for filing/sexvice;
memorialize protocol for upcoming diacovery
written responses and tracking to shift

. handling as trial preparation phase of rate

09/10/08°
. correspondence from Extranet and from G. Gillis .

05/11/08

09/11/08

~ D. Bruce May

.case approaches.

Gigi Rollini 6.00 hours at 190.00 per hour.
Review, printing and organization of email

and G. Rollini.

october 15, 2008
Involice 2307927

Page

patricia B. Greene 1.20 hours at 140,00 per hour.

Continued review of discovery responses; review
draft interrogatory answers; research and
analysis regarding attorney-client privilege
protection; review contidentiality issues
associated with OPC’s discovery requests;
conference with Kim Joyce regarding contract
issues assocliated with reuse projects; phone
conference with Mary Hopper regarding POD
reaponses; phone conference with Troy Rendell
regarding water management district witnesses
and implications for rate case.

D. Bruce May 1.20 hours at 365.00 per hour

Call from ethics co:mission.
.30 hours-at 365.00 per hour.

9

1140.00

168.00

438.00

109.50




Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue

October 15, 2008
Invoice 2307927

Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 " Page 10

09/11/08

09/12/08

09/12/08.

Begin to prepare for OPC’s request to 1nspecc

documenta to ROG 128(b) and (c); continue to

create privilege log for POD 199 documents,

including identification of all attorneys for

purpose of attorney/client privilege and

distinction of fact ve. opinion work product; .
determine *affidavit® requirements of log for

purpose of potemtial motion to compel and

report findings to B. May; continue to prepare

for potential motion to compel,.including legal:

research into fact ve. opinion work product in’

PSC proceedings; continue to review OPC’s

objections to Aqua’s discovery to identify

incongistencies regarding OPC’'s potential

reaction to Aqua’s assertions of privilege, "

work product and rule-based objections; review

letters from PSC staff regarding: expert’

testimony and corxespondence regarding selected

experts; -asgess likely topics of testimony, )

Gigi Rollimi  4.40 bours at 190.00 per hour, ' 836.00

.Review notice of taking Gary Prettyman’s

deposition; preparation of discovery responses;

conference with client regaxrding same; edit

same; finalize discovery responses; preparation

of letter to clerk regarding discovery

responses; preparation for conference call

regarding Gary Prettyman’s deposition;

participate in same.

D. Bruce May 2.80 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1022.00

Receive and review G. Prettyman Notice of
Deposition and consider document request;.
review assessment. of ROG 415 true ups;.obtain
copy of supplemental discovery filings for ROGe
190, 192, .193 and 203; review specitxc

discovery requested by OPC for import. '

Gigi Rollini .90 bours at 190,00 per hour. 171.00




Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

.

09/13/08
09/14/08

09/15/08

09/15/08

09/15/08

09/16/08

09/16/08

Continue to review recent discovery propounded
to OPC per OPC’'s specific request. '
Gigi Rollini .30 hours at -190.00 per bour.

éontinue to track and review recent discovery

propounded to OPC. .
Gigi Rollini .20 hours at 190.00. per hour.

Review of final Supplemental Answers to
Interrogatories 190, 192, 193 and 203; update
discovery tracking chart with same (.3).-

Anna L. Brinker .30 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Review discovery responses; finalize and file
same; continued preparation for Gary
Prettyman’s deposition; review intexrim rate
hearing tramscript; preparation of e-mail
correspondence regarding billing determinants
and billing ahalysis.

D. Bruce May 1.60 hours at 365,00 pex hour.

Receive and review request from OPC regarding
electronic discovery sets for OPC’s 3d ROGs and
4th PODs; advise regarding expedited objectioms -
‘to OPC’s 7th PODs, to be sarved today.

Gigi Rollini .40 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Update discovery tracking charts and deadlines
chart (.4); begin preparation of Answers to
OoPC’'s Fifth Interrogatories (.5).

Anna L. Brinker .90 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Review and consideration of e-mail
correspondence from Gary Prettyman regarding

" billing analysis issues; prepare response to

same; continued preparation for depogition of
Gary Prettyman, -
D. Bruce May 2.00 hours at 365.00 per hour.

October 15, 2008
Involce 2307927
Page 11 -

$7.00"

© 38.00

42.00

- 584.00

76.00

126.00

. 730.00
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AQUA SOURCE (FLORIDA) COMPANY (33)
CHECK REQUEST

- 70: ACGOUNTING DEPARTMENT

. PLEASE ISSUE WIRE TO: :--_..' S S o . _'VENDORNO# . - 120192

. 1VendorName - . - ~ - Holland & Knight LLP ‘ s
T . L S LWMbeitwndorwnbuhnotm)
P.O. Box 864084 '
Orlarido, Florida_32886-4084

. Business Purpose: ' . Legal Fees
- L COE Matter #117542.00003: AUF Rate Case - .

lww:. - Peggy Mobley - — usnagers spprover - KL vitl, H/dlﬁﬂ
S T ' RV fisomgerromons apgeoms " A4 A S ]

mvoiceMo. - 2304106./

o . . . . . L Smklm HRE : E -
" \nvoloe Date- . . October 8, 2008 ' Please retum-check to:-+ - - o

LiwolceDueDate .- °_ October29, 2008

Amounl‘ o : . ‘$2,.518.60

[ Accounting Approval
’ : ATTACH INVORE:

AccouringUnit | . GereralLedger | - Sub’ "
(BudgetNo.) . Account
" 9001 633800

2,518.50 C M9ATBT

~RECHIVED

—NgOB 2008
"ACCOUNJS PAYAB - . .

25|

- JoFAL. | _$2,518.50 I



law Offices Internaticoal:

HOLLANRD & KNIGHT LLP Atlanta Lakeland _  Poptland Beijing

’ Betheada Los Angeles  San Frangcisco Caracas®
P.O. Box 864084 / Boston Miani Tallabassee ' pexico City
orlando, Fl 32886-4084 Chicago Nev York Tampa Tel Avive -
{(813) 901-4180 Pt. Lauderdale No. Virginia Washingtem, D.C. .

EIN 59-0663819 Jacksouville Oxlando West Palm Beach

L sRepresentative Office
October 8, 2008

Aqua America, Inc.
Involce 2304106

762 W, Lancaster Avenue

Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 :
: ) . TERNS: DUE ON RECEIPT

_ REMITTANCE COPY
(PLEASE RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT)

Our Matter #117542.00003
COE matter

*

Fees for Professional Sexvices - . -4

INVOICE TOTAL

BALANCE DUE THIS TINVOICE

-—— - - - - P T T Y

09716708 2295415 17,423.20

 RECEIVED
NOV-052008
ACCOUNTS PAYAB




Mua America, Inc. - . . October 8, 2008
762 W, Lancaster Avenue ’ Invoice 2304106
‘Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 . . ' Page 2

) ’ REMITTARCE CCPY

MATTER BALANCE RROUGHT FORWARD: e 17,423.20. .

TOTAL DUE . : 5 19,941,70

---.---.--- .
If you. wish to remit by WIRE TRARSFER, please wire txansfer funds to:

Wachovia Bank |

e X, muzm Mu-n 31302
DOWNETIC Clisate: @A TE@
mutm:m b &ﬁ«"
ch:‘dathmmots

) m
= REDACTED
'Please indicate our INVOICE NUMBER as reference in ymu.- w:l.re transfer.
Xf you wish to romit by oouam, DELIVERY, plme use the tollqw:l.ng address:
lloluaanmmuqu..‘ o
‘Suite 864084

11080 Take Underhill hoad
Orlando, PU 32038-5016

06270



http:17,",23.20

Law Offices
HOLLAND & KWIGHT LLP

P.O. Box 864084
Orlando, Fl1 32886-4084
{813) 901-4180 '
EBIN 59-0663819

Aqua America, Ing.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

Atlanta Lakeland . Fortland Beijing
Bethesda Log Angeles” . Ban Francieco  Caracas*
Bogton Miami " . Tallshassee mexico Civy
Chicago Few York Tampa . " Tel Avive

Ft. Lauderdale ¥Wo. Virginia

Jacksonville

Orlando

Washington, D.C.
West Palm Beach

*Repressutative Office

October 8, 2008
.Invoice 2304106
-Page 1 ’
TERNMS: DUE ON RECRIPT

For professional services rendered through September 30, 2008
in connection with the following:

Our Matter #117542.00003
COE matter

08/05/08

09/02/08

Research on whether the staff acnalysis for

.HB1377 (or any senate companion) suggests ‘that

the languagé in Chapter 112, relating to ethics
governing public officials and employees, is
modeled after some other provision, such as s.
350.0605; research whethex.cne of the federal
provisions identified inm your prior research
reveal similar language upon which Chapter 112
proposed changes was modeled; research whether
similar language was introduced and discussed
in subsequent legislative sessions; research
what happened with that language, vhy it failed
and any related matters; research prior
legislative sesaions for simllar language;
research whether other .provisions in the 2005
bill were subsequently enacted, perhaps
suggesting that the Legislature gave up on
trying to addreses this issue.

‘~Jennifer Kilinski 2.40 hours at  .0d per hour.

Correspondence from/to Troy Rendell regarding
September 5 COE nmeeting.
L. Sellers, Jr. .30 hours at 365.00 per hour.

NO CHARGE -

109.50




Agua America, Inc.
762 W. I.anqaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

09/03/08

09/04/08

09104/08

Telephone conference with Bruce May; telephone
call to Julie Costas (COE) regarding draft
advisory opinion and September 5 COB Meeting;
correspondence to Bruce May regarding same.

L. Sellers, Jr. .60 hours at .365.00 per hour.

Review COE staff reconmendat:ion, call from
client. .
D. Bruce May . .30 hours at 365,00 per hour.

Correspondence from/to Bruce May;
correspondence to Rob Sniffen; telephone call
to/from and telephone conference with Julie
Costas (COE) regarding September 5 COR meeting;

.. telephone conferemce with Bruce May; various

09/05/08

correspondence from/to Gretchen Toner; prep&re
for September 5 Commission meeting.

L. Sellers, Jr. 2.20 hours at 365,b0 per hour.

Attend commission on ethics hearing regarding
advisory opinion on Tréy Rendell; memorandum to
client; call from Michael Cooke at Florida
Public Service Commission regaxding advisory

" opinion issues.

09/05/08

0s/10/08

D. Bruce May 1.10 hours at 365.00 per hour

Prepare for and attend Commission on Ethics
meeting; conference with Julie Costas; )
conference with Phil Claypool; post-meeting
oorrespondenee to client; telephone conference
with Bruce May; correspondence from/to Troy
Rendell; for use of name in published opinion;
correspondence from Julie Costas regarding same
and regarding schedule for posting written
opinions (Septembexr 10).

L. 8ellexrs, Jr. 1. 90 hours at  365.00 per hou.r

Review COE press release; correspondence with
same to client.

L. Sellers, Jr. .20 houre at 365.00 per hour.

october 8, 2008
Invoice 2304106

Page

2

219.00

109.50

803.00

401.50 -

693.50

73.00



Aqua America, Inc. October 8, 2008
762 W. Lancaster ‘Avenue ) Invoice 2304106
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 . page 3

09/11/08 'relephone conference with Bruce May; follow-up
correspondence to Millie Fulford (COE)
regarding posting of final version of advisory
opinion. . : .
L., 8ellers, Jr. .10 hours at 365.00 per hour. ' 36.50°

09/12/08 Correspondence from/to Millle Fulford (COE)
regarding posting of final version of advisory
opinion; correspondence with same to Bruce May;
correspondence to ¢lient with advisory opinion
ag published on Commission’s webaite.

L. 8ellers, Jr. .20 hours al: 365.00 per hour. 73.00

Total Fees for Profesaional Services .......$ 2,518.50
Name Title Houre Rate Value
May,. D. Bruce Paxtner 1.40  365.00 ' $11.00
Sellexs, Jx,, Lawrence E. Partuer .50 365.00 2,007.50
xilingki, -venmifer Law Clerk 0.00 0.00 . 0.00 R

Current Billing for this Matter ............ - 2,516.50
BALANCE DUE THIS IIWOICE.$ 2.518.5@)

OUTSTANDING INVOICE STRMMARY

DATE .- INVOICE . - AMOUNT

----- - - - - Y L L

09/16/08" 2295415 - "17,423:20



Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

MATTER BALANCE BROUGHT FOR!

TOTAL DUE ceivervnerrsccanes

f

October 8, 2008
Invoice 2304106
Page 4

-

Ceeveenans $ 19,941.70
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VENDOR NUMBER:

INVOICE DATE:  11/1/2008

170 Cameron Drive___- ' DUEDATE: Upon Receipt 4
Foland, PA 16968 -~ —

'INVOICE AMOUNT: ___ $18,697.90
: FL Consolidated Rate Case: /20 - 10/26/08

_ INVOICE NUMBER: None Listed.
DESCRIPTION: . For sarvices rendered for ongol

S _.-'_'u'.a N | |
T T Y e = '

9001 186101 1809790 MO17BY

$18,697.00

W@.@m .. L ‘5/4,/ V4

Other .

. SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS: '  ENCLOSURE

el | . | OTHER

. '.V . -
(CHECK ) -

Please return check to:
Peggy Mobley - Rates S
RECEIVED

'NOV 0.5 2008... A
ACCOUNTS PAYAB -




T:mothy P Ward, CPA
Involce for Consulting Services
Aqua America,.Inc-

. October, 2008 |
Fforida Proceedmgs

Payable on receipt :

. Billing for services rendered commericirig 929 and ending 102608 ° - $.186097.90

Percent =~ Amount < . -
FLA Consolidated Rates 100.0% $ 18,697.90 ~
Sarasota ' : - 00% $ L -,

- 100.0% 3 '1&697.90 o

Services:

T DiractandmnageFLAdlsoovefypmcess infoMleImeethgsandcontadsmﬂ:OPCand

o piaming, coorilinating, and supporhng rabuuartesﬁmony

RECEIVED
- NOV-O5 2008 - .

. ACCOUNTS PAYAB




BN Wome Gpul
Date Totelite| Office | TotsiHes | Lunch | Totaltics, | Milsane| Yalis-
Wkof .. : = T 1
. SI2008 . - o208 . eWe430p | 1000 |- 100 900 .
- 083008 930aM5p] 729 " | 70a830a | 400 100 . .26 ‘70 8200
10/01/08 . | o%ec00p] 550 | .70ae%s ] 100 100 | - 550 -70 6200
10402008 916e30p | o575 | 7es30e 1.50 725 |- |s2m
10403408 9.00 ’
10/04/08 - 73020 150 : ;‘m
. 10006108
Total Wk, Y600 | 300 | "i%—
Whof -] T .
TS 10/08/08 830-6%p | 1000 100 9.00
. . 7e-%0 8 6p- . . .
100708 10a4p 600 . [7pa10p-t1p| 600 1.00 10.00 7 |$20
10/08/03 130a-715p] 776 | Ti%e-1048a} 350 1.00 10.25 ™ ]$200
100008 10802-0159] 700 | 71609308 | 226 925 70 |s200
_1010/08 . sa-2% | 500 T80 7.00 . 1200 70 f$20
1011208 Co - 0.00 ’
) . 1ehzos - Te-830a 1.50 1.50
Total Wi 3 | 2028 | 300 | 5200
Wkef ~ . 1 - B .
o3 101808 - 10432-14%5p] 300 | ep-1030p 400 0.50 6.50 70 ]s200
. : 101408 84%a-T15p | 1050 . 10.50 70 |5200
. . . . | Ta0e-100&
10M508 - 10482430p] 578 | - Todp 350 0.50 878 70 |$200
1016008 1080a8p | 750 | 7TS00830a [ 200 1.00 8.50 7 |$200
. . u-uumvk :
10N708 B 530p 10.00 10,00
10118008 Ba-11a s00 |- 3.00
. - 10/10/008 . 0.00
Tolal Wk, - o0 1IN |
“d. . . . - -
18720098 10720008 8230p718p] 1025 1026
715000 & . -
102108 $45a430p | o075 | Bx0prsop | 375 1.00 9.50 70 }$200
7300-1230p -
122008 oV ey 11.00 1100
. 6309300 & . N
10/23/08 10150430p] 625 8p-730p 450 1.00 0.76 0 |$20
7160-8150 .
1042408 o4sa4asp | 700 "] ep10p 200 9.00 70 1§20
10/2508 .- : 102-1230p | 250 2.50 ’
10726/08° . : 000 |
© Total Wk, 20 34.00 230.{ sz200
G'T*" - . e
10128108 91.00 , 10078 | tano | 18178
Billing :
Ant-Hrs 18178
BiNing -
Ant$ _$18,775.00 | $494.90

. . Wilonge/ -
. . Tols _§ 82290
Yots

ALA -

Alloc  $13.80790
NC Alloc .

Total




Timothy P. Ward, CPA
~Invoice for Consulting Services
Aqua America, Inc
November, 2008
Florida Proceedings

Payable on receipt

Billing for services rendered commencing 10/27/08 and ending 11/30/08 § 22,472.00

Percent Amount
FLA Consolidated Rates 100.0% $ 22,472.00
Sarasota 00% $ -
100.0% $ 22,472.00 *
Services:

Direct and manage FLA discovery process , review of intervenor testimonies, and
" planning, coordinating, and supporting rebuttal testimony and witness diepositions.




)

Timothy P. Ward, CPA

Work Schedule for Aqua America, Inc
October 27, 2008 through November 30, 2008

Bryn Mawr Home Grand FLA
Date Tmpe |JYotailis| Office | TotsiHrs | Lunch § YotalHre, | Mieage| Jolts | Hours
Wk of - 7a-930a &
10/27/08 10027/08 1030a-430p] 500 |} 530p-730p 450 0.50 9.00 0 |$20 9|
715a-830a &
10/28/08 930a-Tp 9.50 8p-1130p 3.76 1.00 1225 70 |$ 200 12.25
10/29/08 8a-630p 10.50 1.00 9.50 70 1$200 9.5
10/30/08 1030a-715p} 875 | 8ap45a 1.75 1.00 9.50 70 |$200 9.5
a-g30a & 4p}
103108 645p 425 425 425
110108 0.00 0
11/02/08 000 | 0
Total Wk, 3378 14.26 3.60 44.50
Wk of )
11/08/08 11/0v08 1015a-645p] 8.50 7a-8a 1.00 9.50 70 |$200 9.5
11/04/08 10a-716p 9.25 7a-8a 1.00 1.00 9.25 70 |$200 9.25
11/05/08 10a-545p 7715 | 715a-915a 2.00 1.00 8.75 70 |$200 8.75
645a-830a &
11/06/08 930a-4p 6.50 730p-9p 3.25 0.50 9.25 70 |$ 200 9.25
11/07/08 630a-930a 3.00 3.00 3
11/08/08 0.00 0
11/08/08 630p-730p 1.00 1.00 1
Total Wk, 320 | 11.25 2.50 40.75
Wk of - 730a-845a &
11/40/08 11110/08 930a-715p | 9.75 816945 2.75 1.00 11.50 70 |$2.00 1.5
111108 8a-730p 11.50 845p-10p 125 1.00 175 70 |$200 175
1112/08 830a430p | 6.00 830p-11p 1.50 1.00 8.50 70 {§200 8.5
11/13/08 815a-816p | 12.00 [1015p-1115p] 1.00 13.00 70 {$200 19| -
1111408 7a-9a 2.00 200 2
11115008 1p-4p - 3.00 3.00 3
11/16/08 8p830p -] 150 . 1,50 15
Total Wk. "5 | X 300 | 6126 |
Wk of - -
1117108 14117108 815a-11a 276 4p-7p 3.00 1.00 475 70 |$ 200 4.75
1118/08 815a-730p | 1125 | 9p-1130p 2.50 13.76 0 |s200] 13.75H
11119008 930a-6p 850 | 715a-815a 1.00 9.50 70 |$200 9.5
11/20/08 . | 615a-1015a | . 4.00 4.00 70 |$200 4
1172108 830a-645p | 1026 10.25 7 |$200 10.25
11/22/08 0.00 0
11/23/08 230p-730p | 5.0 10a-1130a 1.50 6.50 70 18200 65
Total Wk, : ! A 200 [ 700 | 4a.76 |
Wk of - - 7aba &
11124108 11/24/08 945a-Tp 9.25 830p-10p 3.50 1276 70 |$200 12.75)
14/25/08 715a115p ]  6.00 2p-445p 276 8.76 70 |$ 200 8.75
715a%a & 4p-] - L
11/26/08 ep 375 375 3.78
11/27/08 0.00 0]
11/28/08 0.00 0
11/28/08 730e-10a 2.50 2.50 25]
316p-5p & Tp; :
830p & 9p- .
11/30/08 10p 4.25 4.25 428
Total Wk, 15.26 16.75 0.00 32.00
Gr Total
thru
1473008 160.00 6726 } 1000 | 21725 | 140000] $40.00} 21725
Fodera!
Billing Mileage
AmtHrs 21726 0505 | rate | 100.0%
Billing
Amt$  $21,725.00 | $707.00
Mieage/
Toks _$ 747.00
Total 472.00
FLA
Alioc  $22,472.00
NC Alioc_$ -
Total ~$22472.00

Page 2 of 2



Timothy P. Ward, CPA
Credit Card Charges incurred for Aqua FLA hearings
December 6-11, 2008

12-08- Purchase VISA PLATINUM / USAIRWAYS 0372330802 PHILADELPHIA PA Date

2008  12/06/08 O 8341441822 4 3063 %% Card 92 #8582 15.00
12.09 Purchase VISA PLATINUM/ HAMPTON INN & SUITES J JACKSONVILLE FL Date -

2008  12/07/08 O 8342101578 1 3665 %% Card 92 #8582 111.87
12.14- Purchase VISA PLATINUM/ PPAPHLY 00100024 PHILADELPHIA PA Date 12/12/08 0

2008 8347142407 0 7523 %% Card 92 #8582 77.00
12.14- Purchase VISA PLATINUM/ USAIRWAYS 0372331 428 ALLENTOWN PA Date 12/12/08

2008 08347259158 3 3083 %% Card 92 #8582 15.00
12.16- Purchase VISA PLATINUM /- HAMPTON INN & SUITES T TALLAHASSEE FL Date 651,95

2008 12/12/08 0 8347000738 0 3665 %% Card 92 #8582
12-09- Purchase VISA PLATINUM/ TGI FRIDAY'S TALLAHASSEE FL Date 12/07/08 0 30.21
2008 8342206050 0 5812 %% Card 92 #8582 ’

Purpose of charges in order of appearance:
12/8- Luggage Charge for 12/6 flight- $15 (receipt attached)

- 12/9- Jacksonville Hotel- 12/6- $111.87 (receipt attached)
12/14- Long term parking — Phila airport 12/6-12/12 - $77(receipt attached)
12/14- Luggage charge for 12/12 flight - $15 (receipt attached)
12/15- Tallahassee Hot4l- 12/7- 12/11 - $551.95 (receipt attached)
12/9- Take out dinner on 12/7- $30.21 (receipt attached)

Other Costs:

Mileage to/from Phila Int’l airport- 70 miles R/T @ $.585 = $40.95

Air Fare (pd by Aqua)- Phila -FLA 12/6-- $138.80 (confirmation attached)
FLA- Phila 12/12 - $ 89.50 (confirmation attached)

Total Costs - $1,070.28
Aqua Paid - $ 22830

Billable to Aqua_ $ 841.98



033 0291030 . T e NEW -. I
AQUAFLORIDA R
IPANY NUMBER:. 33 . -

- AIP I

veunoaﬂms RonaldJPasced ‘

fvsuoonuuuaen. - s INVOICE DATE: 11[3/2008 '
. REMITYO: * " 419 Highténd Temaca / L IJ'UEI.")A:]‘E:, : umnw
|  Holmes, PA 19043 — T
_moneuum L '1o L o . INVOICE AMOUNT: swmoo

) DESCRIP‘HON For consdﬂgg sérvices rendered for ggﬂm late ﬁll_mg FLA Cmso]ﬁmd Rates-09m-1013112608

' L_mm__lL_.__mnm___J

4 1493_3,_.491761'

. Y
_ ENCLOSURE  {CHECK. )

OTHER

' RECEWVED
-~ Novos e
© ACCOUNTS PAYAB'




Ronald J. Pasceri .
Invoice for Consulting Services

' Aqua America, Inc.
September 29, 2008 through October 31, 2008
FLA Consolidated Rates '
" involce Numbeér - 010 :
Invoice Dato - November 3, 2008 ’ T y .
Involce paystie upon recelpt . s -, Tl

AmountPue - - )

Bmingfdrswvms‘mndmmsmmberm 2008 through October 31, 2008 . § 14,96300
Sunumary of Services: Preparation and coordination of rate base mlamd rOSponses
to IROGs and PODs. Preparation and coordination of responses to Audit Report
findings related to rate base differences between the Company and the Audftors.

Review OPC testimony, draft OPC dlsoovely and draft rebuttal testimony for rate
. base refated Issues.

'RECEIVED
~ Novesaes
. ACCOUNTS PAYAB . -



Work Schedule for Aqua America, lnc i .
September 29, 2008 through October 31, 2008 .

: " - Bryn Mawr Boyn Mawr Home Grand
" |o/aor2008 Conedl FL. rate base - BAM 10 1ZPM 1230PM D 4PM 7.50 750
‘w30/2006 | * . Conecl FL rate bese - 8AM 10 12PM 12:30PM 10 3PM 6.60 8.50
10/1/2008 Consck FL rete base - 5AM 1o 1ZPM 1PM 10 4PM . 7.00 7.00
107272008 Consol FL. rate bass - 8AM lo 12PM 4.00 4.00
1072008
quaum! 1Q/372004 25.00 25,00
1u_rémoa ’ . Consol FL rate base - 8AM to 12PM 4.00 4.00
10772008 |  Coneol FL rate base - BAM f6 12:30PM 1PMw4:30PM ~ | 800 8.00
1000/2008 | Consol FL rets beise - 8AM t0 12-30PM TPM 0 4:30PM 8.00 8,00
107272008 | Consol FL rate base - BAM 10 11:30PM 13:45AM o 416PM | - 8.00 800 -
10/10:2008]  Consol Fi. rate baee - 8AM 10 12PM 12:30PM 10 3:30PM 7.00 7.00
| T I"«Ws ' "800 3500
10132008]  Consol FL rats base - BAM 10 1230PM 1PM to 4:30PM 8.00 8.00
10/14/2008]  Consol FL. rate bess - 3AM 1 12PM 12:15PM 10 3:16PM: 7.00 | 7.00.
Faoris2008| * Coneol FL rzte base - 8AM o 12PM 12:30PM 10 4:30PM 8.00 .00
- }ron Coneol FL rete base - 8AM (0 12PM 12:30PM lo 4:30PM 8.00 8.00
1017 Consol FL rate base - 8AM 10 12PM '12:15PM 0 4:15PM 800 8.00 .
[Waok End ' £ X)) 000
J10r202008]  Consol FL rate baws - 8AM 0 12PM 12:30PM 10 4:30PM 8.00 8.00
10224/2008]  Corwol FL rate bacs - 8AM 1 12PM 1245PM I 3:15PM .50, - 850
10/22r2008] Consol FL rato base - 8:16AM 10 1216PM 1245PM 10 4:45PM | 8.00" 8.00
10/23/2008] Coneol FL sats base - 8:16AM 1o 1215PM 1245PM o 4:45PM ] 8.00 8.00
1 Consol £L rate base - 8BAM 1 12PM .12:30PM to 4:30PM 8.00 8.00
[Week Endi 55 850
102772008]  Gonsol FL rate base - BAM10 12PM 12:30PM 1o 4:30PM 800 800 .
10/28/2008]  Coneol FL rate base « BAM o 12PM 12:30PM o S:00PM 6.50 850 °
10/2/2008] . Congol FL rate base - BAM to 12PM 12:30PM 10 4:30PM -8.00 8.00
1050/2008]  Consol FLL mte base - BAM to 12984 12:30PM 1 4:30PM 8900 8,00
10/31/2008 Cansol FLrsto bose - SAM 10 12PM - 400 400
iw«k! 1 ’ 3450 345'0
Period.| _ 1 X0) 0

Total .

720 3 0.508

$1370000 $  80.00




Ronald J. Pasceri
Invoice for Consulting Services
Aqua America, Inc
November 3, 2008 through November 28, 2008
FLA Consolidated Rates

Involce Number - 011
Involce Date - December 3, 2008

Invoice payable upon receipt Total
Amount Due
Blillng for services rendered from November 3, 2008 through November 28, 2008 $ 11,387.25

Summary of Services: Preparation and review of rebuttal testimony related to
Dismukes and Merchant rate base testimony. Preparation and coordination of rate
base related responses to discovery requests. Review Citizen's responses to rate
base related discovery and provide deposition questions related to KHD Schedule 27
orrors.Preparation of RMG late filed exhibits 2 and 8 as a result of the 11/25
deposition of Bob Griffin. Review and analyze revised Schedule 27 from Kim
Dismukes and attend meeting to discuss strategy.



Ronald J. Pasceri
Work Schedule for Aqua America, inc
November 3, 2008 through November 28, 2008

— 5 5
Date Time Total Hrs | Office Total Hrs,
111322008 | Consol FL rate base - BAM to 12:30PM 1PM t0 4:30PM 8.00 8.00
11142008 |  Consol FL rate base - BAM 10 12PM 12:30PM 1o 4:30PM 8.00 8.00
11/5/2008 |  Consol FL rats base - 8AM 10 12PM _12:30PM to 4:30PM 8.00 8.00
11/8/2008 |  Consol FL rate base - 8AM to 11:30PM 12PM to 4:30PM 8.00 8.00
117712008 Consol FL rate base - BAM to 12:00PM 4.00 4.00
Wook Ending 11772008 36,00 35.00
1110/2008]  Consol FL rate base - BAM to 12:30PM 1PM to 4:30PM 8.00 8.00 2
11/15/2008 Consol FL rate base - 8AM 10 12PM 1PM to 3PM 6.00 8.00 25
11712/2008] . Consol FL rate base - BAM to 12:30PM 1PM to 4:30PM 8.00 8.00 26
11/132008] Consol FL rate base - 8:15AM to 1:15PM 1:45PM to 4:46PM 8.00 8.00 25
11/1472008| Consol FL rate base - 8:15AM to 12:15PM 12:45PM 0 5:15PM | .50 8.50 25
Woek Ending 1171472008 38.50 36.50 126
11/17/2008]  Consol FL. rate base - BAM to 12PM 12:30PM to 4:30PM 8.00 8.00 25
11/18/2008]  Consol FL rate base - BAM to 12PM 12:30PM to 4:30PM 8.00 8.00 25
11/19/2008]  Consal FL rate base - BAM to 12PM 12:30PM to,4:30PM 8.00 8.00 25
11/20/2008§ Consol FL rate base - 8:15AM to 12:16PM 12:30PM to 5:30PM | 9.00 8.00 25
11/21/2008 Consol FL rate base - 8AM to 12PM 12:30PM to 4:30PM 8.00 8.00 25
Woek Ending_11/21/2008 4100 41.00 126
11/24/2008]  Consol FL rate base - 8AM to 12PM 12:30PM to 4:30PM 8.00 8.00 zs‘I
11/25/2008]  Consol FL rate base - BAM to 12PM 12:30PM to 4:30PM 8.00 8.00 25
11/26/2008 Consol FL rate base - 12:30PM to 4:30PM 4.00 4.00 25
1112712008 Holiday
11/28/2008 Consol FL rate base - 8AM to 12PM 4.00 4.00
Weok Ending_11/28/2008 20.00 4.00 24.00 fg*
IPeitod Endl'LW-—_ng ook Ending_11/28/2008 13550 400 - 450
Billing
Amt-Hre 13360 $ 0.508
Billing
Amt$ $11,160.00 §  80.00
Mileage _$ 22125
Total 91,387,935

ety

Federal Mileage
rate

Hourly Rate




033 02910 38 _,:1':.' T e

AQUAFLORIDA - -
& Iﬂ!OICE INPUT QQUMENT

. COMP UMBER: -

VENDOR NAHE. Guasielh Assodatet. inc.

"vemoauuuaen: - - mvoicEpatE: emo:zoos

" REMIT TO: BaeaconStreet.Sune“o . DUEDATE: . Upon Recsipt
T Bosn,WA 02108 ' SRR '

NVOICENUMBER: Nondlsted . - - . . INVOICEAMOUNT; m.aﬁz.oo': R

DESCRIPTION: - Forservlqas nahdet'ed brongo_ir_lg rate fing

9001|. _1gs101] $. - 328300 MoEl -

. TOTAL -

'SPECIALINSTRUCTIONS: -~ - .~ ' ENCLOSURE (CHECK ) _
R —— RECEIVEB‘HER _ '
e NV S g
ACCOUNTS PAYAB ARECE'VED
. N0V102008 ,
_Ac_:counrs_ PAYAR




Ms. Kimberly A. Joyce

Assistant Rate Counsel

Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc. o
6960 Professional Parkway E., Suite 400
Sarasota, FL. 34240

June 10, 2008

re; Rate Ca‘se

" Period: 5/1/2008 - 5/31/2008

Work in progress on rate filing. Complete used and useful'calwiaﬁons‘and
MFR schedules; recount revised maps; prepare testimony and attachments;

related conference calls and correspondence.

. Hourly
Staff Charges Rate Hours Amount
Principal | - $§ 195 . 3550 § 6,822.50
Associate . $ 240 - $ c -
Director - Engineering $ 195 10200 § 19,890.00
Director - Financial/Accounting  § 195 250 .8 . 487.50
Rate Analyst R $ 140 . - 8§ -
Technician ) $ 118 4500- $ 5,310.00
~ Administrative 3 48 526 $ 26200 -
Subtotal 19025 $ 32,862.00 _ -
Experpseé: ECE' VED
Travel - Air ' NOV.I 2 2008 |
Travel - Ground A
Room & Board cc.oums PAY4p .
. . Previous Balance

Amount Due




. 0330291031

NEW VENDOR [ .

L l_\gua Flondg L
' NP |NVO|GE INPUT DOCUMENT o
- COMPANYNUMBER: 33 .

VE&WR'NAME: .- DTF Solutions; lnc;.- : l

VENDORNUMBER: . ° .~~~ - ' -INVOICEDATE: A1212008

" REMWTO: . © -30GlennGirde ' - DUE DATE: . - JoﬂReceP‘
L Erdenheim, PA 19033 S

.-.INVOICE NUMBER '08—10-FL R lNVOIOEAMOUNT .:$5,800.00

: "n;scmp'nou. - For consultlgg_rvk:es rendered - 2008FlondaConsolidated RateCase Dan Francesld

AQQOUNT DISTRIBUTION ‘ o
__wgﬂi ACC T'.' I & | AEQ___EMQ.!H!I

*‘E
'3‘5

9001 |-~ 186101 : : ‘5aoooo ]M91761

CTOTAL - . . TOTAL L. ssaam

" APPROVALS . Department

- Other.‘.

ENCLOSURE (CHECK - )

- Please ntact Peggy Mobley as soon gbclla;:k!écqi;

. OTHER .. R - o



DTF Solutions, Inc. — INVOICE # 08-10-FL.

) ] S November 2, 2008
Aqus Americs, Inc. ' .
762 West Lancaster Avenue

Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 .

Attn Kimberly Joyoe
Imlee for work performed for Aqln FL In October 2008 by. Dan Fraleuki

Time wotked an AUF rate case: 72.5 bours.
Rate: $80 per hour.

.. - Total amount due: SS,MOO

SImmary of werk perforned on FL AUF:
.. ResponsestoPOD roquests, mmouyremewandrebuual.and:datedptogmmng.

Dates and bours worked: '

. 1001 | 35 1013 . g5 02. .45
" 10/02 20 . 1014 - g5 1022 ° 10
10/07 1.0 10/15 3.0. , 10/24. . 45
1008 1.0 - 10M8 g9 . 1028 . 60
10/09 15 T 10020 55 . OctTof 725
-10110 85 : 10721 65 L o
Daniel T Frandeski _
'RECEIVED -
- NOV- 0 5.2008
' ACCOUNTS PAYAB
DTF Solutians, Inc. (BIN 20-8232316) - : . . 30 Glenn Circle /
215-233-1221 office; 215-219-2362 cell . . ‘Erdenhoim, PA 1903

dan&anccsh@yaboooom )
. ‘l‘erns: Paymentduenpon reeelpt



Service Company Employee hours

Gabage Daubert Devine Drager Packer Bums Hopper  Joyce Shank

Emplo!
pioyes 1 22 12 40 8 40 43 18 8
Hours charged 16 56 20 72 40 34 53 34 3
to AUF Rate Case 2 32 14 32 16 40 50 36 2
65 24 49 72 8 36 45 50 4
49 16 72 80 29 40 2
77 6 76 72 37 24
64 50 21 76 42 32
45 66 52 36 48 24
54 46 7 56 37 28
70 60 40 70 2 12
4 72 72 4 24 16
76 70 36 20 4
20 67 47 32
26 72 77 24
16 62 56 5
44 48 9
60 28 3
76 10
68 4
52
24
Addt't November Hours 16 48 50 101
Total 447 604 1142 902 72 200 428 506 19
Employee Dutles :
Garbage . Engineering department contact for all engineering requests.
Projected Time No further time is required '
Daubert Provided CIAC support for rate base section and was Powerplant sofiware contact person.
Projected Time Review testimony and data for CIAC section.
Devine Provided Customer Deposit, Other Taxes and Rate Case Expense data and was Lawson software contact person
Projected Time Review testimony and provide rate case expense updates. ‘
Drager Provided data for expense section of MFR.
Projected Time No futher time is required
Packer Provided data from Banner billing system.
Projected Time No futher time is required
Bums Provided tariffs schedules and notices.
Projected Time Prepare further tariffs and notices
Hopper Provided legal support and review of Staff and OPC requests.
Projected Time Prepare and review testimony.
Joyce Provided legal and regulatory lead for rate case.
Projected Time Prepare and review testimony. Resolve regulatory issues.
Shank Provided support for company’s allocation methods.

Projected Time

No futher time is required




033 6296669 2475 .
Colorama Mail & Print Services 1Inv01ce
5564 Palmer Blvd. Date frvoice #
Sarasota, FL, 34232 T 085
1
Bill To Ship To
Adqua Utilitics Florida - Accounting Aqua Utilities Flotida - Acoounting
Sarasota, FL, 34240 Sarasola, FL, 34240
P.O. Number Terms Rep Ship Via F.O0B. Project
. 21580 Net 15 o 11/13/2008
Quentity ltem Code Description Price Each Amount
Notioe of Mecting RRG
18,250 | Black & Whitc Printing Announcemests 0.045 821.25T
18,250 | 1001 - | Mailing Servioes 0.0625 1,140.63T
18,250 ] 1002 | Customer's Mailing List ‘ 0.00 0.00T|-
Bogining Balance Postage =~ $13,944.44 9OF
2000 Postage Used - Peemit = - $6,130.28 \O 0.00 0.00
Ending Balance Postags = $7,814.16 & 'b
700% 137.33
/8Ciol, M7l — | 822049 | <
S p
g 6,130 43 Y

Wy

Please mako check payable to Colorama. Anty questions plcase calt 378-5700. Thanks for your busincss.




Law Offices

HOLLAND & KNIGHT LLP
P.O. Box 864084
Orlando, F1l 32886-4084

(813) 901-4180
EIN 59-0663819

Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

(PLEASE

Our Matter #117542.00001
Florida Rate Case

Fees for Professional Services
Reimbursable Costs

INVOICE TOTAL

BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE

International:

Atlanta Lakeland Portland Abu Dhabi
Bethesda Los Angeles San Francisco Beijing
Boston Miami Tallahassee Caracas*
Chicago New York Tampa Mexico City¥*
Ft. L§uderda1e No. Virginia Washington, D.C. Tel Aviv*
Jacksonville Orlando West Palm Beach

+*Representative Office
November 12, 2008
Invoice 2320787

TERMS: DUE ON RECEIPT

I

REMITTANCE COPY

RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT)

OUTSTANDING INVOICE SUMMARY

DATE INVOICE

10/15/08 2307927

3 41,744.00
6,738.70
$ 48,482.70
$ 48,482.70
AMOUNT
48,118.57




Aqua America, Inc. November 12, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2320787

Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page 2
REMITTANCE COPY

MATTER BALANCE BROUGHT FORWARD: 48,118.57

TOTAL DUE $ 96,601.27

If you wish to remit by WIRE TRANSFER, please wire transfer funds to:

Wachovia Bank

214 N. Hogan Stxeet, Jackmonvi 3220 N‘TEE »
DOMBSTIC Clients: N-Rj 4 [ Ag\, g2 p.

INTERNATIONAL Cliente: SWIFT
Por Credit to the Account of:

T REDACTED

Please indicate our INVOICE NUMBER as reference in your wire transfer.

If you wish to remit by COURIER DELIVERY, pleasé use the following address:
Holland & Kaight LLp
Suite 864084

11050 Lake Underhill Road
. Orlando, FL 32825-5016

06270



http:96,601.27
http:48,118.57

Law Offices

"HOLLAND & KNIGHT LLP Atlanta Lakeland
Bethesda Los Angeles
P.O. Box 864084 Boston Miami
Orlando, Fl1 32886-4084 Chicago New York
(813) 901-4180 Ft. Lauderdale No. Virginia
EIN 59-0663819 Jacksonville Orlando

Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

International:

Portland Abu Dhabi
San Francisco Beijing
Tallahassee Caracas*
Tampa Mexico City*

Washington, D.C. Tel Aviv*
West Palm Beach

*Representative Office

November 12, 2008
Invoice 2320787
Page 1

TERMS: DUE ON RECEIPT

For professional services rendered through October 31, 2008

in connection with the following:

Our Matter #117542.00001
Florida Rate Case

10/01/08 Preparation of templates on Response to OPC's
Seventh PODs, Objections to OPC’s Seventh ROGs,
Objections to OPC’s Eight PODs, Answers to OPC’s
Seventh ROGs, and Response to OPC’'s Eight PODs;
preparation of revisions to Answers to Staff’s
Sixth ROGs and Response to Staff’s Third PODs.
Anna L. Brinker 2.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. 280.00

10/01/08 Review and consideration of various e-mail

correspondence from clients regarding Pasco

County pass-through issue; call with Troy
Rendell regarding interim reports; e-mail

correspondence to clients regarding outline of

strategy to discuss for final hearing;
continued preparation for final hearing;

research and analysis regarding confidentiality
agreements concerning discovery with OPC; begin

review of Prettyman’s deposition transcript;

prepare e-mail to Prettyman regarding same.

D. Bruce May 2.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 912.50



Aqua America, Inc. November 12, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2320787
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page 2

10/01/08 Analysis regarding electronic document requests
by OPC in latest round of discovery; review
final written responses to OPC’'s 7th PODs, 7th
ROGs, and 8th PODs. .
Gigi Rollini .70 hours at 190.00 per hour. 133.00

10/01/08 Uploading of templates and tracking charts onto
the Extranet.
Patricia B. Greene .20 hours at 140.00 per hour. 28.00

10/02/08 Review discovery issues; review production of
document issues; call from client regarding
prehearing statement issues; review evidentiary
basis for customer testimony; continued
research and analysis regarding collection
obligation for Pasco County utilities
department; review commissioners statements at
service hearing regarding Jasmine Lakes issues.
D. Bruce May 1.30 hours at 365.00 per hour. 474.50

10/02/08 Assess pre-hearing and briefing schedule
through December and catalog; trial preparation
priorities.
Gigi Rollini .30 hours at 190.00 per hour. 57.00

10/03/08 Research and analysis issue regarding
shareholder services; prepare analysis to
client regarding same; consideration of e-mail
correspondence from client regarding same;
research regarding prehearing statement; call
with Ralph Jaeger regarding prehearing
statement; begin draft issues list; review and
consideration of e-mail correspondence from
client regarding issue identification
confererce.

D. Bruce May 2.40 hours at 365.00 per hour. 876.00

10/06/08 Preparation of final Response/Objections to
OPC’'s Seventh PODs; update discovery chart.
Anna L. Brinker .70 hours at 140.00 per hour. 98.00




Aqua America, Inc. November 12, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2320787
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page 3

10/06/08 Review legal issues regarding to what extent
can the FPSC completely deny a rate increase
based on poor quality of service; Review
possible evidentiary objections regarding news
media presented at New Port Richey service
hearing.
D. Bruce May .60 hours at 365.00 per hour. 219.00

10/06/08 Receive and review OPC’s request for copies of
documents produced to PSC Staff’‘s 5th ROGs and
2nd PODs, and reply; continue to analyze issues
needing briefing, including regarding uniform
rate; finalize response to OPC’s 7th PODs for
today’s service/filings; assess objections
needed to OPC's 7th ROGs/8th PODs; prepare
cumulative discovery count; received stamped
copies of today’'s filings; coordinate
preparation for OPC’s in-office inspection (7th
PODs) .

Gigi Rollini 1.60 hours at 190.00 per hour. 304.00

10/06/08 Printing and documentation of uploaded
attachments by client to the extranet for
production of documents; participate in weekly
conference call to coordinate upcoming
deadlines, etc.
Patricia B. Greene 2.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. 280.00

10/07/08 Multiple phone calls to Ralph Jaeger; call to
Troy Rendell; research and analysis regarding
prehearing statement; continued preparation of
same; review Florida Public Service
Commission’s legal authority to deny rate
relief purely based upon quality of service
issues.
D. Bruce May 1.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 547.50

10/07/08 Client correspondence; continue to determine
need for Amended Affidavit of Mailing for all
customer service hearings and continue to
assess action needed to correct Affidavit of
Mailing; review mailing confirmations exhibit




Aqua America, Inc. November 12, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2320787
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page 4

10/07/08

10/08/08

10/08/08

to identify dates of mailing per system;
prepare Amended Affidavit of Mailing with
correct dates and incorporating by reference
prior Composite Exhibits submitted to PSC at
New Port Richey hearing (Ex. 52); finalize
Amended Affidavit and present to B. May for
approval; incorporate New Port Richey exhibits
into cumulative customer service hearing
exhibit 1list; continue to research uniform rate
structure, including review of briefing in
Southern States prior rate.

Gigi Rollini 1.30 hours at 190.00 per hour. 247.00

Respond to email correspondence from client and

forward copies of requested documents to

client.

Patricia B. Greene .20 hours at 140.00 per hour. 28.00

Review and consideration of e-mail
correspondence from D. Francheski regarding
usage; call with Troy Rendell; prepare e-mail
correspondence to client regarding action
items; continued preparation of prehearing
statement; participate in debriefing session
with Dan Francheski; extended phone conference
with Tim Ward; prepare analysis regarding
supplemental interim rate report; conference
with Kim Joyce.

D. Bruce May 2.30 hours at 365.00 per hour. 839.50

Continue to prepare Amended Affidavit of

Mailing; client correspondence regarding same;

teleconference with M. Hopper to catalog any

remaining supplemental responses required for

follow ups to discovery responses; prepare for

expedited objections to OPC’'s 7th ROGs and 8th

PODs, due 10/10; continue to review Southern

States/Florida Water briefing, memorialize

findings and present to B. May.

Gigi Rollini 3.00 hours at 190.00 per hour. 570.00



Aqua America, Inc. November 12, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2320787
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page 5

10/09/08 Extended phone conference with AUF team
regarding rebuttal testimony; prehearing
statement; additional legal issues regarding
rate consolidated rate issue; additional
discovery; follow up phone call with Kim Joyce
regarding prehearing statement issues and issue
identification conference.
D. Bruce May 1.80 hours at 365.00 per hour. 657.00

10/09/08 Prepare for and attend strategy teleconference
with client; continue to determine POD/ROGs
responsive to street light/garbage pass-thru
charges; continue to develop exhibit list from
customer service hearings; obtain details for
Issue ID meeting; continue to review OPC's
discovery responses to Aqua’s discovery
requests; begin to identify which non-Bates
labeled OPC-produced documents apply to which
Aqua discovery requests, absent specification
in OPC's responses; begin to prepare
spreadsheet memorializing documents produced,
Bates numbers, and to which Aqua POD/ROG each
document responds.

Gigi Rollini 5.00 hours at 190.00 per hour. 950.00

10/10/08 Preparation of template for use in responding to
Staff’s Seventh Interrogatories; update
deadline, discovery charts.
Anna L. Brinker .70 hours at 140.00 per hour. 98.00

10/10/08 Extended phone conference regarding additional
planning tasks to prepare for final hearing;
review discovery; prepare amended exhibit to
Chris Franklin’s testimony; review information
requiring amendment; conference call with Kim
Joyce; continued preparation for final hearing;
review potential ROE witness issues; call from
staff; prepare edit and file specific
objections to OPC’s Eighth Request for
Production of Documents; conference with Mary




Aqua America, Inc. November 12, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2320787
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page 6

Hopper regarding same.
D. Bruce May 2.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 912.50

10/10/08 Continue to determine authority/requirement for
street light/garbage pass-thru charge; continue
to review OPC’'s documents produced in response
to Aqua’s discovery requests; receive and
review Staff’s 7th ROGs (No. 35) and coordinate
response template creation; OPC discovery
response review continued, including review of
Sarasota County Resolution, and continue to
determine to which ROG/POD request produced
documents answer; receive and begin to review
proposed pre-hearing statement.

Gigi Rollini 3.90 hours at 190.00 per hour. 741.00

10/12/08 Continue to outline issues for research in
preparation for hearing briefing and issue
identification conference.
Gigi Rollini .30 hours at 190.00 per hour. 57.00

10/13/08 Attendance at team conference (via telephone)
concerning discovery issues (.3); preparation of
Notice of Service and Transmittal letter for
Staff’s Third PODs and Sixth ROGs (.3); update
discovery charts, deadlines charts. (.3)
Anna L. Brinker .90 hours at 140.00 per hour. 126.00

10/13/08 Multiple phone calls with Florida Public
Service Commission staff regarding response to
audit; continued preparation of audit response;
conference with client; ‘-begin preparation of
additional discovery to OPC; phone conference
with client; call from Tim Ward; review
Prettyman deposition transcript; call from Gary

Prettyman.
D. Bruce May 4.40 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1606.00
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10/13/08 Phone conference with Roseanne Gervasi
regarding prior rate case docket and any
additional items that are needed prior to
closing of that docket.
D. Bruce May .30 hours at 365.00 per hour. 109.50

10/13/08 Prepare for and attend strategy meeting
regarding trial preparation, identification
conference, and remaining notices with B. May;
continue to research issues in preparation for
hearing briefing, including scope of PSC
authority regarding rate increase denial;
receive filed copies of Objections to OPC’s 7th
ROGs/8th PODs and Composite Exhibit CHF-1 (C.
Franklin); audit response to Staff continued.
Gigi Rollini 1.50 hours at 190.00 per hour. 285.00

10/13/08 Uploading of tracking chart on deadlines to the
extranet; Work on bates numbering of discovery
documents; revise and update tracking chart to
énclude bates numbered items; participate in
weekly conference call to coordinate deadlines,
etc.
Patricia B. Greene .60 hours at 140.00 per hour. 84.00

10/14/08 Review staff audit report; prepare response
thereto; file response thereto.
D. Bruce May 2.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 912.50

10/14/08 Continue to assess discovery produced and
prepare to move toward trial preparation; audit
response correspondence; finalize Bates number
incorporation into OPC production spreadsheet
and begin to prepare correspondence to PSC
regarding numbering documents and Order
establishing procedure; receive and begin to
review Intervenor’s testimony and exhibits;
continue to determine PSC authority to penalize
Aqua on customer service, including in light of
OPC’'s testimony.

Gigi Rollini 3.30 hours at 190.00 per hour. 627.00




Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page

10/15/08

10/15/08

10/15/08

10/15/08

10/15/08

10/15/08

Call with Bart Fletcher and Curt Mouring from
staff; call with Troy Rendell; continued
preparation of rebuttal testimony.

D. Bruce May 1.00 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Conference call with Gary Prettyman regarding
errata to deposition; review additional
exhibits to deposition; prepare letter to OPC
regarding same. ,

D. Bruce May .60 hours at 365.00 per hour.
Review and consideration of e-mail

correspondence from Florida Public Service
Commission staff counsel, Ralph Jaeger,
regarding staff’'s preliminary list of issues;
conference call with Ralph Jaeger regarding
same; preparation of AUF draft issues list;
e-mail to client regarding same.

D. Bruce May 1.00 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Review and consideration of e-mail
correspondence from Tim Ward regarding
supplemental audit findings; begin preparation
of same for filing with clerk.

D. Bruce May .50 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Begin to assess impact of K. Dismukes’s ROE
pre-filed direct testimony and rebuttal;
continue to work with M. Hopper on organization
of produced discovery; continue to assess other
pre-filed direct testimony filed by OPC;
finalize Notice of Filing Discovery Table (OPC
documents), transmittal and Table attachment
for filing/service; memorialize first set of
ROE adjustment research findings and present to
B. May.

Gigi Rollini 5.20 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Bates numbering of ROG 417; update tracking
chart on bates numbered documents.
Patricia B. Greene .60 hours at 140.00 per hour.

November 12, 2008
Invoice 2320787

365.00

219.00

365.00

182.50

988.00

84.00
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10/16/08 Review and consideration of e-mail
correspondence from client regarding rebuttal
testimony; prepare e-mail correspondence to
clients regarding rebuttal testimony and issues
for rebuttal; conference call with client
regarding same; begin preparation of discovery
requests to OPC.
D. Bruce May 2.70 hours at 365.00 per hour. 985.50

10/16/08 Continue to develop AUF’'s draft issues for
Issue ID Conference; continue to develop
additional discovery to propound in light of
OPC prefiled direct testimony; continue to
analyze OPC's prefiled direct testimony.
Gigi Rollini 4.20 hours at 190.00 per hour. 798.00

10/16/08 Email correspondence regarding bates labeled
documents.
Patricia B. Greene .30 hours at 140.00 ‘per hour. 42.00

10/17/08 Research and analysis regarding supplemental
response to staff’s audit; prepare draft,
finalize and file supplemental response to-
staff audit; phone conference with Kim Joyce;
phone conference with Tim Ward.
D. Bruce May 1.10 hours at 365.00 per hour. ) 401.50

10/17/08 Extended phone conference with rebuttal
testimony team to develop rebuttal testimony;
continued review of Andrew Woodcock’s testimony
to develop rebuttal testimony to used and
useful issues; review water quality assessment
issues associated with Woodcock’s testimony;
conference with client; continued preparation
of draft prehearing statement; continued review
of potential issues.
D. Bruce May 1.80 hours at 365.00 per hour. 657.00
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10/17/08 Begin to finalize first round of discovery AUF
will propound on OPC in response to OPC'’s
prefiled direct testimony; receive signed
Amended Affidavit of Mailing and prepare to
file/serve; receive and begin to review Staff’'s
8th set of ROGs and Staff’s 4th PODs to AUF and
coordinate template creation and deadline
calculation.
Gigi Rollini 3.40 hours at 190.00 per hour. 646.00

10/19/08 Continue to review OPC’s prefiled direct
testimony; continue to review draft ID list.
Gigi Rollini 1.00 hours at 190.00 per hour. 190.00

10/20/08 Review Rothschild’'s testimony regarding cost of
equity; review leverage formula docket;
continued preparation of rebuttal.
D. Bruce May .80 hours at 365.00 per hour. 292.00

10/20/08 Research and analysis, prepare and finalize
interim revenue report; continued research and
analysis regarding potential rebuttal testimony
to Kim Dismukes’ testimony with respect to
quality of service, rate base adjustments, O&M
Expense adjustments; review negative
acquisition adjustment positions of OPC;
prepare rebuttal regarding same; review legal
issues associated with averaging rate base
adjustments; review confiscatory rate policy
issues; review Andrew Woodcock’s testimony
regarding used and useful analysis; begin
preparation of rebuttal testimony outline;
multiple phone calls with client.

D. Bruce May 5.00 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1825.00

10/20/08 Prepare for and attend strategy session with B.
May; begin to prepare discovery table documents
for filing/service on 10/21.
Gigi Rollini .80 hours at 190.00 per hour. 152.00
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10/21/08 Preparation of templates for use in responding
to Staff’s Fourth PODs and Eighth ROGs; update
discovery tracking chart, production charts and
deadlines.
Anna L. Brinker .80 hours at 140.00 per hour. 112.00

10/21/08 Preparation of draft issues list to provide to

staff; prepare e-mail correspondence to clients
" regarding same; review and consideration of

various e-mail correspondence regarding draft
issues list; revise draft issues list; various
conference calls to discuss rebuttal testimony;
review and analyze possible additional
discovery requests to propound to OPC;
continued preparation of response to OPC
discovery.
D. Bruce May 5.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 2007.50

10/21/08 Ensure Notice of Filing Discovery Table is
compliant with PSC e-filing requirements and
file/serve.
Gigi Rollini .80 hours at 190.00 per hour. 152.00

10/21/08 Download updated deadlines chart to the
extranet.
Patricia B. Greene .50 hours at 140.00 per hour. 70.00

10/22/08 Prepare for and attend conference call
regarding draft issues list; prepare revisions
to same; review and consideration of e-mail
correspondence and attachment from OPC
regarding Citizens draft issues list; prepare
edits to same and provide to client; prepare
e-mail correspondence to staff regarding draft
issues list; prepare for and participate in
discussion concerning rebuttal testimony
(Mexchant) .

D. Bruce May 3.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1277.50
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10/22/08 Continue to prepare rebuttal to OPC’s prefiled
direct testimony; correspondence regarding
draft issue list for issue ID conference; begin
to prepare Motion for Protective Order;
coordinate with client to prepare written
responses to Staff’s 6th ROGs/3d PODs, due
10/23.
Gigi Rollini 1.90 hours at 190.00 per hour. 361.00

10/23/08 Preparation of final Response to Staff’s Third
PODs and Sixth ROGs; update discovery charts.
Anna L. Brinker .80 hours at 140.00 per hour. 112.00

10/23/08 Attend hearing on ROE docket; continued review
and revisions to draft issue list; prepare for
issue identification conference; continued
preparation of rebuttal testimony; review
combined issues list provided by staff;
conference regarding same; conference call with
client regarding rebuttal testimony (Dismukes).
D. Bruce May 3.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1277.50

10/23/08 Continue to analyze bases for Motion for
Protective Order; finalize Aqua’s written
responses to Staff’s 6th ROGs/3d PODs and Bates
numbered attachments, transmittals and Notice
of Service and prepare for service/filing, with
requisite ROG affidavit; finalize analysis of
OPC’'s prefiled direct testimony of K. Dismukes
and schedules to ensure action needed regarding
Motion for Protective Order.
Gigi Rollini 3.50 hours at 190.00 per hour. 665.00

10/23/08 Download 7th and 8th ROG documents to the
Extranet and notify client of the Extranet
location for documents; bates labeling of excel
files to copy and produce for filing due this
date.
Patricia B. Greene 1.90 hours at 140.00 per hour. 266.00
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10/24/08 Meeting with Kim Joyce and Troy Rendell
regarding discovery; preparation of rebuttal
testimony and issues for issue identification
conference; review refund study methodology
from prior docket; call from Ralph Jaeger
regarding same; attend prehearing issue
identification conference; meeting with Bart
Fletcher at Florida Public Service Commission
regarding refund; follow phone conference call
with Paul Moul and Kim Joyce and Troy Rendell
regarding development of rebuttal testimony to
Mr. Rothschild.

D. Bruce May 5.00 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1825.00

10/24/08 Continue to prepare final discovery before
discovery deadline; continue to analyze
prefiled direct testimony.
Gigi Rollini .30 hours at 190.00 per hour. 57.00

10/27/08 Attendance at team telephone conference.
Anna L. Brinker .30 hours at 140.00 per hour. 42.00

10/27/08 Extended phone conference regarding rebuttal
testimony; multiple phone conference with staff
counsel regarding depositions and additional
discovery; phone conference with clients
regarding development of rebuttal testimony in
all areas of rate case; review correction to
refund report; research and analysis regarding
negative acquisitions adjustments; research and
analysis regarding legal issue associated with
recovery of only half of rate case expense.

D. Bruce May 5.40 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1971.00

10/27/08 Receive and begin to review Staff’s Sth
PODs/9th ROGs and assess remaining discovery to
which responses are upcoming.
Gigi Rollini .30 hours at 190.00 per hour. 57.00
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10/28/08 Continued preparation of rebuttal testimony
regarding ROE; continued preparation of
rebuttal testimony to Andrew Woodcock; research
and analysis regarding used and useful rules;
call from Patti Daniel; call from Katherine
Fleming; call from Troy Rendell; call from
Ralph Jaeger regarding issues; call from OPC
regarding issues; prepare revised issues to
track interim rate order; research and analysis
regarding regulatory asset established in
interim rate order and legality thereof in
response to OPC’s assertion that the legality
of a regulatory asset concept is subject to
dispute and should be an issue in case; begin
review of water quality testimony submitted by
DEP and health department witnesses; begin
development of rebuttal testimony regarding
quality of service; review water quality
testing issues.

D. Bruce May 4.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1642.50

10/28/08 Continue to develop final rounds of discovery;
continue to analyze OPC’'s and Staff’s
testimony/exhibits; determine necessary
information to be included in rebuttal exhibit
regarding rate case expense.
Gigi Rollini 2.00 hours at 190.00 per hour. 380.00

10/29/08 Receipt, review of additional discovery
propounded by OPC; preparation of templates for
use in responding to OPC’s Seventh
Interrogatories and Eighth Request for
Production; preparation of Notice of Service and
Transmittal letter for same; update deadlines
lines and discovery recap log.
Anna L. Brinker 1.40 hours at 140.00 per hour. 196.00

10/29/08 Continued to develop discovery questions with
respect to OPC; continued preparation of Third
PODs and Third ROGs to OPC; begin preparation
of discovery to staff; review testimony of Kim
Dismukes for possible discovery; research and
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analysis regarding testimony of Andrew Woodcock
regarding used and useful analysis and his
purported exception to single well rule;
prepare discovery regarding same; review tax
implications associated with Tricia Merchant’s
prefiled direct testimony; continued to develop
discovery regarding Ms. Merchant’'s testimony;
continue to review James Rothschild’s testimony
regarding ROE; phone conference with expert
regarding ROE rebuttal testimony; research and
analysis regarding same; continued review
refund report; continued to develop prefiled
rebuttal testimony; multiple phone conferences
with Troy Rendell regarding issues; prehearing
statement and additional potential witnesses
regarding Chuluota.

D. Bruce May 3.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1277.50

10/29/08 Continue to review OPC’s and Staff’s prefiled
direct testimony and exhibits; continue to
develop rebuttal testimony needed, analyze
further discovery needed, and assess exhibits
to submit with rebuttal testimony; continue to
prepare final round of discovery to OPC
(ROGs /PODs) .
Gigi Rollini 2.90 hours at 190.00 per hour. 551.00

10/29/08 Download 5th POD and 9th ROG documents to the
extranet and notify client of the extranet
location for documents; download revised
version of deadline chart to the extranet.
Patricia B. Greene .50 hours at 140.00 per hour. 70.00

10/30/08 Preparation of final response to OPC’s Eighth
Request for Production and answers to OPC’s
Seventh Interrogatories; update discovery charts
(1.3); assist in determining number of PODs and
ROGs propounded by OPC to date.
Anna L. Brinker 1.90 hours at 140.00 per hour. 266.00
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10/30/08

10/30/08

10/30/08

10/31/08

Extended phone conference with Troy Rendell
regarding various discovery issues; continued
preparation of rebuttal testimony to Kim
Dismukes, Andrew Woodcock, Rothschild;
continued review of testimony filed by Water
Managements Districts, DEP and Health
Departments; phone conference with Florida
Public Service Commission staff attorney;
multiple phone conference with Kim Joyce.

D. Bruce May 6.50 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Receive and review Staff’s Response to AUF's
1st POD (No. 1), including the workpapers
supporting the calculations in P. Stallcup’s
prefiled direct testimony; continue to prepare
AUF response documents to OPC’'s 7th ROGs/8th
PODs; continue to review OPC’s prefiled direct
testimony and develop discovery requests
therefrom (PODs/ROGs) .

Gigi Rollini 5.40 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Print copies of filing made today, including
downloaded attachments.

November 12, 2008
Invoice 2320787
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Patricia B. Greene .50 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Review draft and prepare interim refund report;
research and analysis regarding same; multiple
phone calls to Stan Szczgiel and Kim Joyce
regarding same; phone conference with Troy
Rendell regarding same; phone conference with

OPC counsel regarding discovery; multiple phone

conferences with Katherine Fleming regarding
discovery schedule and deposition schedule;
review correspondence from John Guastella
regarding used and useful issues; continued
pPreparation of testimony regarding used and

useful; prepare discovery (Third PODs and Third

ROGs to OPC); finalize and serve same.
D. Bruce May 4.20 hours at 365.00 per hour.

2372.50

1026.00

70.00

1533.00
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10/31/08 Continue to prepare discovery (ROGs/PODs) to be
propounded on OPC by today'’s deadline; continue
to develop information on rate case expense for
exhibits; continue to analyze pre/post-hearing

statement/brief legal arguments; continue to
. prepare rebuttal testimony regarding expenses

and quality of service; prepare

notices/transmittals for discovery to OPC from
AUF;. receive and review OPC's 9th PODs and 8th

ROGs.

Gigi Rollini 4.50 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Name Title
May, D. Bruce Partner
Rollini, Gigi Associate
Greene, Patricia B. Sr Professnl
Brinker, Anna L. Paralegal

Reimbursable costs through October 31,

09/30/08

10/06/08

10/06/08

10/09/08

Other Courier

United Parcel Service
KIMBERLY A. JOYCE

AQUA AMERICA INC

762 WEST LANCASTER AVENUE
BRYN MAWR PA 19010

Accurate Stenotype Reporters, Inc.

2008

Inv

# DH0O9198C, Transcript Copy taken 9/19/08

Gigi Rollini Travel to New Port Richey

to attend PSC Customer Service Hearing -

9/26-27/08
IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC Inv #

1-9822, Manual Bates Labeling (84); Grade B

(light Litigation) B&W copies (

168)

November 12, 2008
Invoice 2320787
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855.00

..... $ 41,744.00
Value

28,543.00
10,849.00
1,022.00
1,330.00

10.73

121.00

411.62

32.51

- 9/30/08
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10/10/08

10/13/08

10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08

10/14/08

10/14/08

10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/14/08
10/15/08

10/16/08

Invoice 2320787
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D. Bruce May Flight expense associated 471.61
with technical hearing preparation. - 9/22/08

Other Courier 35.52

United Parcel Service
KIMBERLY A. JOYCE

AQUA AMERICA INC

762 WEST LANCASTER AVENUE
BRYN MAWR PA 19010

Eric Kent Tallahassee Mileage 7.26
Eric Kent Tallahassee Mileage 1.23
Eric Kent Tallahassee Mileage 7.38
Eric Kent Tallahassee Mileage ' 8.14
Eric Kent Tallahassee Mileage 1.17
Eric Kent Tallahassee Mileage 0.59
Eric Kent Tallahassee Mileage ) 4.27
Eric Kent Tallahassee Mileage 7.55
IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC Inv # 29.03

1-9728, B&W Grade B - Light Litigation (170),
Tabs (22) - 9/17/08

IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC Inv # 181.63
1-9724, B&W Grade B - Light Litigation (1,408)

- 9/17/08

D. Bruce May Travel expenses (lodging, 775.80

car rental, meals, air fare) associated with
attendance at witness deposition preparation. -

November 12, 2008

9/15-19/08

Van B. Madden Mileage 8/25/08 6.84
Vvan B. Madden Mileage 8/28/08 7.72
Van B. Madden Mileage 8/28/08 7.72
Van B. Madden Mileage 9/02/08 6.20
van B. Madden Mileage 9/02/08 7.72
van B. Madden Mileage 9/04/08 7.72
Van B. Madden Mileage 9/15/08 7.72
Van B. Madden Mileage 9/19/08 6.84
Van B. Madden Mileage 9/24/08 5.85
Vvan B. Madden Mileage 9/26/08 7.72
Van B. Madden Mileage 9/29/08 6.84
van B. Madden Mileage 9/30/08 6.84
IVIZE of Chicago, LLC Black and White 881.82
Copies

IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC Grade A 655.32

(autofeed) Black & white copies



Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
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10/20/08
10/20/08
10/20/08
10/22/08

10/24/08
10/27/08

10/28/08
10/28/08
10/28/08

10/29/08

PA 19010

Van B. Madden Errands - Mileage
10/1-10/16/08

Van B. Madden Errands - Mileage
10/1-10/16/08

Van B. Madden Errands - Mileage
10/1-10/16/08

IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC Invoice
1-9396, Grade A black and white copies
Messenger Service - 10/20/08
Other Courier

United Parcel Service

JOHN LIHVARCIK

AQUA UTILITIES FLORIDA IN
1100 THOMAS AVENUE

LEESBURG FL 34749

OTHER Lawyer’s Travel Service
D.MAY/7369792628/09-17-08
Tallahassee/Philadelphia

OTHER Lawyer'’s Travel Service
D.MAY/7375806041/12-01-08
Tallahassee/Philadelphia

OTHER Lawyer’'s Travel Service
G.ROLLINI/7375806042/12-01-08
Tallahassee/Philadelphia

D. Bruce May Research Charges

Photocopy

Messenger

Long Distance Telephone
Westlaw

Total Reimbursable Costs ............
Current Billing for this Matter .....

BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE ............

November 12, 2008
Invoice 2320787
Page 19

7.72
881.82

5.00
19.14

495.00
471.61
431.61

44 .00

605.40
5.00
19.84
8.73

48,482.70



Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue

November 12, 2008
Invoice 2320787

Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page 20
OUTSTANDING INVOICE SUMMARY
DATE INVOICE AMOUNT
10/15/08 2307927 ' 48,118.57
MATTER BALANCE BROUGHT FORWARD ............. 48,118.57
TOTAL DUE .+t v vvvenernennnnanaaenaaennns RS - 96,601.27
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Aqua America, Inc.
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REMITTANCE COPY

West Palm Beach
*Representative Office
December 16, 2008
Invoice 2334981

TERMS: DUE ON RECEIPT

(PLEASE RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT)

Oour Matter #117%542.00001
Florida Rate Case

Fees for Professional Services S
Reimbursable Costs

INVOICE TOTAL

BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE

OUTSTANDING INVOICE SUMMARY

2320787 48,482.70

11/12/08

92,562.00
7,162.89

$ 99,724.89

S 99,724.89
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MATTER BALANCE BROUGHT FORWARD:

TOTAL DUE $

December 16, 2008
Invoice 2334981
Page 2
REMITTANCE COPY

48,482.70

- — -

148,207.59

mE IR T

If you wish to remit by WIRE TRANSFER, please wire transfer funds to:

Wachovia Bank

214 K. Rogan Styeet, Jacksoavills Fl1., 32202
e e REDACTED
INTERNATIORAL Clients: BWIPT

For muﬂittotmohaxmngon

HOGLLAND & KNIGHT LLP
ACCT. #

Please indicatdi¥

reference in your wire transfer.

If you wish to remit by COURIER DELIVERY, please use the following address:

Holland & Enight LL®
Suite 864064

11050 Lake Underhill Road
Orlando, FL 32825-5016

06270



http:148,207.59
http:48,482.70

Law Offices International:
HOLLAND & KNIGHT LLP Atlanta Lakeland Portland Abu Dhabi
Bethesda Los Angeles San Francisco Beijing

P.0. Box 864084 Boston Miami Tallahassee Caracas*
Orlando, Fl 32886-4084 Chicago New York Tampa Mexico Cityw

(813) 901-4180 Ft. Lauderdale No. Virginia Washington, D.C. Tel Aviv+
EIN 59-0663819 Jacksonville Orlando West Palm Beach

*Representative Office

Aqua America, Inc. December 16, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2334981
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page 1

TERMS: DUE ON RECEIPT

For professional services rendered through November 30, 2008
in connection with the following:

Our Matter #117542.00001
Florida Rate Case

11/02/08

11/03/08

11/03/08

11/03/08

Continue to prepare draft rebuttal testimony,
including issues relating to rate case expense.
Gigi Rollini .20 hours at 190.00 per hour. 38.00

Preparation of Expedited Objections to OPC's

Ninth PODs and Eighth ROGs; preparation of

Response template to OPC’s Ninth PODs;

preparation of Answer template to OPC’s Eighth

ROGS; review Ninth PODs and Eighth ROGs to

determine current count on both; update

deadlines chart; update discovery notebooks and

document index (3.6).

Anna L. Brinker 1.30 hours at 140.00 per hour. 182.00

Review Paul Moul‘s draft rebuttal testimony;

research and analysis regarding short-term debt

inclusion in capital structure.

D. Bruce May .80 hours at 365.00 per hour. 292.00

Phone conference with OPC regarding
confidentiality agreement; phone conference
with OPC counsel regarding POD 231 and
additional responses thereto; begin development
of motion for temporary protective order; phone
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11/03/08

11/04/08

11/04/08

conference with Andrew Maury regarding ROE
issues; continued to review and revise draft

" prefiled direct testimony of Paul Moul;

conference call with Paul Moul regarding flaws
in Mr. Rothschild’s ROE testimony; review and
research regarding same; phone conference with
Paul Moul, Kim Joyce, Troy Rendell, Tim Ward,
and Mary Hopper to develop prefiled rebuttal
testimony to Mr. Rothschild’s testimony;
multiple phone calls with Paul Moul regarding
capital structure; conference with Stephen
Anzaldo regarding capital structure; phone
conference with Katherine Fleming regarding
witness depositions and witness availability;
multiple phone calls with Kim Joyce regarding
same.

D. Bruce May 2.90 hours at 365.00 per hour,.

Continue to prepare rebuttal to OPC’s prefiled
direct testimony; research legal authority
regarding negative acquisition adjustments;
attend strategy session regarding rebuttal
testimony; determine need for Motion for
Protective Order regarding POD 231(a) and (b)
and outline contents.

Gigi Rollini 5.20 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Continued review of Paul Stallcup’s testimony;
prepare for deposition; multiple phone
conferences with staff attorneys regarding
deposition schedule; telephone conference with
Kim Joyce regarding service quality issues and
preparing rebuttal testimony therefor.

D. Bruce May 1.10 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Extended phone conference with Troy Rendell
regarding testimony of Stan Szczygiel; prepare
revisions regarding same; extended phone
conference with Kim Joyce regarding testimony
of Gary Prettyman and ROE testimony of Paul

December 16, 2008
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11/04/08

11/04/08

11/05/08

Moul; prepare revisions regarding same; phone
conference with Katherine Fleming regarding
staff depositions; coordinate depositions;
phone conference with John Guastella regarding
used and useful issues; continued preparation
for hearing; research and analysis regarding
negative acquisition adjustment; review staff
witness Dobiac’s testimony; prepare potential
questions for cross-examination.

D. Bruce May 6.40 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Continue to prepare rebuttal testimony;
continue to research legal authority regarding
negative acquisition adjustments; continue to
research legal issues for pre and post hearing
briefing.

Gigi Rollini 4.30 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Download to extranet and update revised
tracking chart on upcoming deadlines.
Patricia B. Greene .20 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Continued review and preparation of Bob
Griffin, John Guastella, Gary Prettyman, Stan
Szczgiel, Steve Anzaldo's rebuttal testimony;
research and analysis regarding capital
structure issues; review and revise draft
rebuttal testimony of Dave Smeltzer; prepare
rebuttal testimony for Dan Franceski; continued
preparation for deposition of Paul Stallcup;
phone conference with Troy Rendell regarding
testimony of Stan Szczygiel; prepare revisions
regarding same; correspondence and phone
conferences with Kim Joyce regarding testimony
of Gary Prettyman and ROE testimony of Paul
Moul; prepare revisions regarding same; phone
conference with Katherine Fleming regarding

3

December 16, 2008
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deposition schedule; review used and useful

issues; continued research and analysis

regarding negative acquisition adjustment;

review staff witness Dobiac’s testimony;

prepare deposition questions.

D. Bruce May 7.20 hours at 365.00 per hour. 2628.00

11/05/08 Receive comments to Motion for Temporary
Protective Order, integrate, finalize and
prepare for filing/service; confirm documents
responsive to 8th POD No. 231(a) and (b) have
been provided and begin to prepare documents
for production to OPC; receive PSC confirmation
of filing Motion for Temporary Protective
Order; continue to develop rebuttal to OPC’s
prefiled direct testimony; continue to research
legal issues for pre and post hearing briefing.
Gigi Rollini 3.90 hours at 190.00 per hour. 741.00

'11/06/08 Review email correspondence between client and
attorneys concerning supplementing previous
discovery responses; preparation of
Supplemental Responses to OPC’s Third ROG (201)
and Eighth POD (231); preparation of Notice of
Service and Transmittal letter for same (1.2).
Anna L. Brinker 1.20 hours at 140.00 per hour. 168.00

11/06/08 Extensive review regarding Gary Prettyman’s
rebuttal testimony; provide revisions regarding
same; multiple phone calls with Katherine
Fleming and Ralph Jaeger regarding witness
availability, witness deposition schedule,
prehearing statement issues and other hearing
preparation matters; prepare supplemental
discovery response to OPC; multiple phone calls
with Paul Moul regarding ROE testimony;
continued preparation regarding same; phone
conference regarding capital structure issues;
research and analysis regarding negative
acquisition adjustments; research and analysis
regarding used and useful/single well rule;
phone conference with John Guastella; begin
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11/06/08

11/06/08

11/06/08

11/07/08

review of Guastella's draft rebuttal testimony;
begin review of draft testimony of Bob Griffin
regarding rate base adjustments and negative
acquisition adjustments.

D. Bruce May 6.30 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Prepare supplemental response for OPC‘'s POD No.
231; continue to develop rebuttal testimony;
continue to determine action needed regarding
depositions; continue research regarding
negative acquisition adjustment testimony,
memorialize and present to B. May. '

Gigi Rollini 8.10 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Legislative history research for G. Rollini on
Section 367.081(4) (f), F.S., regarding leverage
formula.

December 16, 2008
Invoice 2334981
Page 5

2299.50

1539.00

Patricia B. Greene 2.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. » 280.00

Email correspondence regarding deposition
schedule and filing of supplemental response
for POD 231la on this date; download to extranet
and update revised tracking chart document;
Download and incorporate bates label numbers
into files to be downloaded to disk.

Patricia B. Greene .70 hours at 140.00 per hour. ‘ 98.00

Review negative acquisition adjustment
testimony; review and revise same; research and
analysis regarding Kim Dismukes’ proposed rate
base amendments and rate case expense
adjustments; review testimony and revise
testimony of Griffin, Anzaldo, Guastella, Moul;
continued preparation of draft testimony in
relation to used and useful rule variance
proposed by Andrew Woodcock; begin preparation
of deposition of Paul Stallcup; review uniform
rate structure issues; review subsidy issues;
research and analysis regarding case law
concerning subsidies.

D. Bruce May 6.10 hours at 365.00 per hour.

2226.50
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11/07/08 Continue to determine deposition schedule;
continue to prepare rebuttal testimony
regarding negative acquisition adjustments;
continue to prepare Supplemental Response and
documents to OPC’s 8th POD No. 231 for
filing/service.
Gigi Rollini 6.00 hours at 190.00 per hour. 1140.00

11/07/08 Continued legislative history research for G.
Rollini on Section 367.081(4) (£), F.S.,
regarding leverage formula.
Patricia B. Greene 5.50 hours at 140.00 per hour. 770.00

11/08/08 Prepare Notice of Deposition of P. Stallup and
D. Dobiac; continue to research legal authority
for street light/garbage pass-thru charges;
continue to develop rebuttal testimony.
Gigi Rollini 1.60 hours at 190.00 per hour. 304.00

11/10/08 Preparation of final Answer and Objection to
Staff’s Seventh Interrogatory (.4); preparation
of Notice of Service for same (.3); preparation
of final Expedited Objections to OPC’s Ninth
PODs and Eighth Interrogatories (.5);
preparation of Notice of Service and
Transmittal letter for same (.4); preparation
of Expedited Objections to Staff’s Sixth PODs
and Tenth Interrogatories (.8); update
deadlines and discovery charts (.4).

Anna L. Brinker 2.80 hours at 140.00 per hour. 392.00

11/10/08 Prepare rebuttal testimony to Paul Stallcup; °
continued preparation of prehearing statement;
multiple phone calls to Katherine Fleming
regarding discovery; review discovery responses
to OPC; continued preparation of discovery
responses to staff; multiple phone calls with
Kim Joyce in preparation for deposition of Paul
Stallcup; conference with Troy Rendell;
conference with Dan Francheski in relation to
preparation for deposition of Paul Stallcup;
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11/10/08

11/11/08

11/11/08

continued preparation of rebuttal testimony of
Bob Griffin; continued preparation ‘of rebuttal
testimony of Jack Lihvarcik; continued
preparation of rebuttal testimony of Stan
Szczygiel.

D. Bruce May 6.20 hours at 365.00 pexr hour. 2263.00

Recelve and review AUF’'s Response to Staff’s
7th ROGs and coordinate today's production;
continue to assess pass-thru charge authority;
continue to determine responses to Staff 10th
ROGs; receive and review Deposition Notice and
Notice of Hearing, expedited objections, and
Notices of Service.

Gigi Rollini .70 hours at 190.00 per hour. 133.00

Provide response to attorneys concerning total
count of discovery requests propounded by OPC
(.3).

Anna L. Brinker .30 hours at 140.00 per hour. 42.00

Prepare consolidated/uniform rate structure
rebuttal testimony; continued preparation for
deposition of Paul Stallcup; review information
supplied by OPC; prepare responses to OPC
discovery requests; prepare response to staff’'s
discovery requests; conference call with
clients regarding prehearing statement issues;
continued preparation of prehearing statement;
develop rebuttal testimony Kim Dismukes’
allocation issues; continued to review DEP
issues; review water quality issues; develop
testimony regarding same; multiple phone calls
with Katherine Fleming regarding deposition and
discovery schedule issues; multiple phone calls
with Ralph Jaeger regarding discovery issues
and prehearing statement issues.

D. Bruce May 6.20 hours at 365.00 per hour. 2263.00

December 16, 2008
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Aqua America, Inc. December 16, 2008

762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2334981
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page 8
11/11/08 Consideration regarding Jasmine Lakes and

11/11/08

11/11/08

11/11/08

11/12/08

11/12/08

obtaining documentation creating various

assessments and rights of developer relating

thereto.

Holly M. Reagan .30 hours at 140.00 per hour. 42.00

Correspondence with colleague regarding title

research for any provisions regarding street

light/garbage pass-thru charges,

K. O'Donniley .30 hours at 190.00 per hour. 57.00

Continue to prepare rebuttal testimony; begin to

determine remaining issues to complete for

prehearing statement.

Gigi Rollini 1.30 hours at 190.00 per hour. 247.00

Update tracking chart for production with bates

label numbers; revise tracking chart to forward

to client.

Patricia B. Greene .60 hours at 140.00 per hour. 84.00

Prepare for and participate in deposition of

Paul Stallcup; conference with Staff counsel

regarding late-filed exhibits; conference with

Kim Joyce regarding depositions; prepare for

final hearing; continued preparation of rebuttal

testimony.

D. Bruce May 8.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 3102.50

Begin to prepare for OPC, Aqua, Attorney and

staff teleconference regarding used and useful

stipulations; receive Notice of Deposition for

Staff’'s deposition of K. Dismukes and begin to

determine action needed for cross notice;

correspondence; continue to organize discovery

and testimony for hearing. .

Gigi Rollini 1.00 hours at 190.00 per hour. ' 190.00
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11/13/08 Continued preparation of rebuttal testimony;
review and consideration of multiple e-mail
correspondence from Katherine Fleming (Florida
Public Service Commission staff) regarding
possible stipulations and meeting regarding
same; review and consideration of e-mail
correspondence regarding additional response
from OPC regarding AUF discovery (Schedule 27);
continued preparation of prehearing statement;
continued review of consideration of items to
include in draft prehearing order; conference
regarding pass-through issue; review and
consideration of possible motion to strike '
portions of Dismukes’ testimony; research and .
analysis regarding repression model; multiple
phone conferences with client regarding
rebuttal testimony.
D. Bruce May 8.10 hours at 365.00 per hour. 2956.50

11/13/08 Prepare cross-notice for K. Dismukes deposition
by staff; determine action needed for prefiled
direct testimony rebuttal, prehearing
statement, Pasco County title search; begin to
prepare cross-notice of deposition for J.
Rothschild; continue to analyze viability of
Motion to Strike portion of K. Dismukes’
testimony.
Gigi Rollini 1.40 hours at 190.00 per hour. 266.00

11/14/08 Preparation of Notice of Service and
Transmittal letter for Staff’s Eighth
Interrogatories and Fourth Requests for
Production (.4).
Anna L. Brinker .40 hours at 140.00 per hour. 56.00

11/14/08 Continued preparation of rebuttal testimony;
review and consideration of multiple e-mail
correspondence from Katherine Fleming (Florida
Public Service Commission staff) regarding
possible stipulations and meeting regarding
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11/14/08

11/14/08

11/15/08

11/15/08

11/16/08

same; review and consideration of e-mail
correspondence regarding additional response
from OPC regarding AUF discovery (Schedule 27);
continued preparation of prehearing statement;
continued review of consideration of items to
include in draft prehearing order; conference
regarding pass-through issue; review and
consideration of possible motion to strike
portions of Dismukes’ testimony; research and
analysis regarding repression model; multiple
phone conferences with client regarding

"rebuttal testimony.

D. Bruce May 8.20 hours at 365.00. per hour. 2993.00

Begin to prepare for Monday's discovery

production of significant quantity of documents

for Staff’s 4th PODs; continue to develop

rebuttal testimony, schedule and strategy. -

Gigi Rollini 3.20 hours at 190.00 per hour. 608.00

Attend internal organizational meeting on rate

case discovery, exhibits, etc.; review trial

notebooks, depositions and list of exhibits in

order to update tracking chart. i

Patricia B. Greene 1.30 hours at 140.00 per hour. 182.00

Continued preparation of rebuttal testimony of

AUF witnesses (Szczygiel, Franklin, Lihvarcik,

Luitweiler, Smeltzer, Griffin, Guastella,

Prettyman, Moul, Franceski, Anzaldo).

D. Bruce May 5.10 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1861.50

Continue to prepare rebuttal testimony.
Gigi Rollini .40 hours at 190.00 per hour. 76.00

Continued preparation of rebuttal testimony of

AUF witnesses (Szczygiel, Franklin, Lihvarcik,

Luitweiler, Smeltzer, Griffin, Guastella,

Prettyman, Moul, Franceski, Anzaldo).

D. Bruce May 4.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1642.50
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11/16/08

11/17/08

11/17/08

11/17/08

11/17/08

11/18/08

Continue to prepare for Monday'’'s discovery
production; continue to prepare and finalize
rebuttal testimony.

Gigi Rollini  2.00 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Preparation of final responses to Staff's
Eighth Interrogatories and Fourth Requests for
Production; preparation of transmittal letter
to be used in providing documents on 11/18/08;
update discovery charts (2.5).

Anna L. Brinker 2.50 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Continued preparation of rebuttal testimony of
AUF witnesses (Szczygiel, Franklin, Lihvarcik,
Luitweiler, Smeltzer, Griffin, Guastella,
Prettyman, Moul, Franceski, Anzaldo).

D. Bruce May 8.10 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Prepare documents responsive to Staff’s 4th
PODs and 8th ROGs, transmittal and notice;
coordinate compliance with Order on Procedure
to ensure voluminous documents to be produced
are sequentially numbered; continue to prepare
rebuttal testimony. ' :

‘Gigi Rollini  7.00 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Attend internal organizational meeting on rate
cage discovery, exhibits, etc.; print
attachments for Staff Interrogatories, 23, 29,
30 and 44; bates label attachment to 8th set of
staff Interrogatory #44.

Patricia B. Greene 2.50 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Continued preparation of rebuttal testimony of
AUF witnesses; review respective witness _
exhibits to be attached thereto; multiple phone
calls with client regarding witness rebuttal
testimony; continued preparation for witness
depositiong; continued preparation for final
hearing. '

D. Bruce May 8.50 hours at 365.00 per hour.

December 16, 2008
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11/18/08 Continue to prepare rebuttal testimony;
continue to prepare for document production to
PSC Sstaff’s 4th PODs.
Gigi Rollini 12.60 hours at 190.00 per hour. 2394.00

11/19/08 Assist with preparation of filing of rebuttal
testimony including preparation of request for
confidential classification.
Karen D. Walker 1.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 547.50

11/19/08 Update discovery chart to include bates
numbered documents produced in response to
Staff’'s POD 24; preparation of transmittal
letter enclosing additional documents in
response to POD 24 (.5).
Anna L. Brinker .50 hours at 140.00 per hour. 70.00

11/19/08 Prepare for and participate in deposition of
James Rothschild; continued preparation of
rebuttal testimony; conference calls with
client; prepare prehearing statement.
D. Bruce May 8.60 hours at 365.00 per hour. 3139.00

11/19/08 Continue to prepare rebuttal testimony;
continue to prepare supplemental production for
Staff's POD 24.
Gigi Rollini 9.80 hours at 190.00 per hour. 1862.00

11/19/08 Document production organization (Bates Labels);
prepare file for final hearing (exhibits) and
witness depositions. :
" Patricia B. Greene 7.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. 980.00

11/20/08 Begin preparation for deposition of Kim
Dismukes; prepare prehearing statement;
participate on conference call with Staff and
parties.
D. Bruce May 8.10 hours at 365.00 per hour. 2956.50
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11/20/08

11/21/08

11/21/08

11/21/08

11/22/08

Continue to receive client comments for
prehearing statement; finalize SS-24
transmittal for supplemental filing; begin to
prepare for responding to Staff’s 9th ROGs/Sth
PODs; receive gservice copies of filings;
finalize prehearing statement and prepare for
filing and service; confirm production of
§S-24; begin to assess need for Amended
Prehearing Statement.

Gigi Rollini 3.90 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Participate in debriefing session with client
regarding Kim Dismukes’ deposition.
D. Bruce May 1.50 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Continued preparation for Kimberly Dismukes;
review testimony of Kim Dismukes; review
schedules; review discovery (2). Participation
in deposition of Kim Dismukes (5).

D. Bruce May 7.00 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Prepare Motion for Leave to Amend Prehearing
statement and Amended Prehearing Statement to

)include P. Luitweller in the witness table;

receive and review proposed Prehearing Order
and memorialize tracked changes for revisions
needed.

Gigi Rollini  5.90 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Preparation for deposition.of Franceski,
Smeltzer, Griffin and Szczygiel; prepare
potential cross examination questions for
Dismukes; review deposition of Dismukes; review
AWWA standards; multiple correspondence with
Troy Rendell and Kim Joyce; review witnesses'’
prefiled & rebuttal testimonies.

D. Bruce May 5.10 hours at 365.00 per hour.

December 16, 2008
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11/22/08 Continue to develop order of witnesses and
prepare for final discovery and
cross-examination.
Gigi Rollini .70 hours at 190.00 per hour. 133.00

11/23/08 Continued preparation for deposition of
Franceski, Smeltzer, Griffin and Szczygiel;
prepare potential cross examination questions
for Dismukes; review deposition of Dismukes;
review AWWA standards; multiple correspondence
with Troy Rendell and Kim Joyce; meetings with
Kim Joyce, Dan Franceski, David Smeltzer,
Robert Griffin and Szczygiel to prepare for
depositions.
D. Bruce May 8.00 hours at 365.00 per hour. 2920.00

11/23/08 Begin to prepare correspondence to Assistant
Attorney General regarding intent to
cross-examine witnesses who technically are the
Attorney General'’'s witnesses; continue to
respond to OPC’s request for copies of
discovery to Staff; prepare to sort OPC's
responses to AUF’'s discovery, which again is
not sequentially numbered per the Order on
Procedure.
Gigi Rollini  1.50 hours at 190.00 per hour. 285.00

11/23/08 Review correspondence re: document production
request from the Office of General Counsel.
Patricia B. Greene .30 hours at 140.00 per hour. 42.00

11/24/08 Research re grounds for confidential
classification of executive compensation
information; begin preparing motion for
protective order and for confidential
classification.
Karen D. Walker 2.40 hours at 365.00 per hour. 876.00
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11/24/08 Preparation of Notice of Service and
Transmittal letter on Staff’s Fifth Request for
Production and Ninth Interrogatories (.5);
preparation of templates for use in responding
to Staff’s Sixth Request for Production, Tenth
Interrogatories and Eleventh Interrogatories
(1.3); update discovery and deadlines chart
(.4).
Anna L. Brinker 2.20 hours at 140.00 per hour. 308.00

11/24/08 Prepare for and attend depositions of Dan
Franceski and David Smeltzer; continued
preparation for final hearing.
D. Bruce May 8.40 hours at 365.00 per hour, 3066.00

11/24/08 Continue to research *Friendly Cross" regarding
: Assistant Attorney General’s request to directly

examine the Attorney General's own witnesses;
continue to respond to Staff’'s and OPC's
requests regarding prehearing order and
discovery; begin to prepare Request for Official
Recognition; begin to prepare Post-Hearing
Statement.
Gigi Rollini  4.20 hours at 190.00 per hour. 798.00

11/24/08 Prepare for document production responsive to
Staff‘s 8th interrogatory and 4th production of
documents.
Patricia B. Greene 2.10 hours at 140.00 per hour. 294.00

11/24/08 Preparation of witness materials for final
hearing.
Rebecca S. Bush 2.30 hours at 140.00 per hour. 322.00
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11/25/08 Continue to conduct research re requesting
confidentiality of executive compensation study
information; continue to prepare Motion for
Protective Order and Request for Confidential
Classification; revise and edit same; telephone
conference with Bruce May; telephone conference
with Roy Stahl re information that needs to
remain confidential.
Karen D. Walker 3.90 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1423.50

11/25/08 Prepare for and attend depositions of Stan
Szczygiel and Bob Griffin; post-deposition
meetings with client; preparation of opening
statement; cross-examination questions.
D. Bruce May 8.00 hours at 365.00 per hour. 2920.00

11/25/08 Review POD 24 response was produced and
coordinate effort to supplement, if needed;
finalize and prepare for filing/service Request
for Official Recognition; begin to finalize
Motion for Protective Order (OPC PODs 69 and
70) ; determine outstanding Notices/Affidavits to
be filed with PSC; prepare for upcoming filings,
including discovery set on 11/26 and Request for
Confidentiality Classification.
Gigi Rollini  7.20 hours at 190.00 per hour. 1368.00

11/25/08 Preparation of materials for use at hearing.
Rebecca S. Bush 2.20 hours at 140.00 per hour. 308.00

11/26/08 Continue to prepare redactions and highlighted
copies of exhibits to accompany motion for
protective order and request for confidential
classification; revise and edit motion for
protective order and request for confidential
classification and prepare same for filing;
prepare notice of withdrawal of request for
confidential classification of Exhibit SS-14;
prepare letter to Commission staff transmitting
documents requested. :

Karen D. Walker 4.90 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1788.50
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11/26/08 Numerous e-mail correspondence regarding
prehearing order; prepare prehearing order;
review list of staff exhibits; e-mail
correspondence to/from OPC counsel regarding
revigsed schedules by Dismukes; research
regarding "friendly cross®" by AG of OPC
witnesses; continued preparation for final
hearing.
D. Bruce May 8.70 hours at 365.00 per hour. 3175.50

11/26/08 Begin to prepare Franceski late-filed exhibits;
continue to prepare post-hearing statement;
consider whether second request for official
recognition is necessary; continue to address
the Attorney General’s suggestion that
cross-examination is appropriate of OPC's
witnesses, which the Attorney General has
adopted as its own; continue to develop Notices
of Mailing per FAC Rules. ‘
Gigi Rollini 9.70 hours at 190.00 per hour. 1843.00

11/26/08 Preparation of witness chart with exhibit and
topic references for use at hearing; redact
privileged material; preparation of materials
for review by the Public Service Commission.
Rebecca S. Bush 2.30 hours at 140.00 per hour. 322.00

11/28/08 Continued preparation for final hearing; review
Dismukes’ revised schedules; prepare cross.
D. Bruce May 3.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1277.50

11/28/08 Continue to prepare post-hearing brief; analyze
Staff witnesses to which OPC has not stipulated
to determine who OPC will cross.
Gigi Rollini 2.60 hours at 190.00 per hour. 494.00

11/29/08 Continued preparation for final hearing; review
Dismukes’ revised schedules, call with Ron
Pasceri and Kim Joyce; prepare Cross.
D. Bruce May 3.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1277.50
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11/30/08 Continued preparation for final hearing; review
Dismukes’ revised schedules, calls with Ron
Pasceri, Kim Joyce, John Guastella; prepare
cross.,
D. Bruce May 3.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1277.50

11/30/08 Continue to prepare Post-Hearing Brief;
continue witness preparation; begin to identify
late-filed exhibits needing to be filed this
week; continue to prepare for hearing,
including review of witnesses’ direct and
rebuttal testimony, witness summaries, and
consideration of limits to cross-examination.

Gigi Rollini 5.30 hours at 190.00 per hour. 1007.00
Total Fees for Professional Services ....... $ 92,562.00
Name Title Hours Rate Value
May, D. Bruce Partner 168.10 365.00 61,356.50
Walker, Karen D. Partner 12.70 365.00 4,635.50
Q‘Donniley, Katherine A. Asgociate 0.30 190.00 57.00
Rollini, Gigi Assgociate 109.70 190.00 20,843.00
Greene, Patricia B, Sxr Professnl 22.20 140.00 3,108.00
Brinker, Anna L. Paralegal 11.20 140.00 1,568.00
Bush, Rebecca S. Paralegal 6.80 140.00 952.00
Reagan, Holly M. Paralegal 0.30 140.00 42.00

Reimbursable costs through November 30, 2008

11/11/08 Eric Kent charges for mileage from 62.54
10/9/08 to 11/4/08
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11/11/08 Other Courier 10.25

United Parcel Service
KIMBERLY A. JOYCE
AQUA AMERICA INC
762 WEST LANCASTER AVENUE
BRYN MAWR PA 19010
11/11/08 Other Courier 13.30
United Parcel Service
KELLY BURNS
AQUA AMERICA 1INC
762 WEST LANCASTER AVENUE
BRYN MAWR PA 19010
11/11/08 Other Courier 3.05
United Parcel Service
KIMBERLY A. JOYCE
AQUA AMERICA INC
BRYN MAWR PA 19010

11/13/08 Messenger Service - 11/5/08 5.00
11/14/08 Van B. Madden PSC : 6.84
11/14/08 Van B. Madden PSC, Collins & Pappas 7.72
11/14/08 Van B. Madden PSC 6.84
11/14/08 Van B. Madden PSC, Collins & Pepper 7.72
11/14/08 Van B. Madden PSC 6.84
11/17/08 Messenger Service - 10/31/08 7.00
11/19/08 IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC manual Bates 73.32

Labeling, Grade B (light litigation) black &
white copies
11/20/08 Other Courier . 10.25
United Parcel Service
KIMBERLY A. JOYCE
AQUA AMERICA INC
762 WEST LANCASTER AVENUE
BRYN MAWR PA 19010
USER DEFINED 2: 1ZX90W950152575701

11/21/08 IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC Grad A (autofee) black 140.27
& white copies, manual bates labeling
11/24/08 IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC Grade A 99.98

(autofeed) black & white scanning, CD-ROM
creation



Aqua America, Inc.

762 W. Lancaster Avenue

Bryn Mawr,

11/24/08

11/26/08

PA 19010

Other Courier

United Parcel Service

KELLY BURNS

AQUA AMERICA INC

762 WEST LANCASTER AVENUE

BRYN MAWR PA 19010

USER DEFINED 2: 12ZX90W950153384086

IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC Grade A

{autofeed) black & white copies-Patricia Green

Photocopy
Long Distance Telephone
Westlaw

Total Reimbursable Costs ..........v... .
Current Billing for this Matter ............

BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE ....ccvvvovvvevennse

OUTSTANDING INVOICE SUMMARY

DATE INVOICE AMOUNT
11/12/08 2320787 48,482.70
MATTER BALANCEVBROUGHT FORWARD .......ccc00

TOTAL DUE .......ccc000a00s ce s e eere e

December 16, 2008
Invoice 2334981

48.03

" 507.62

6,103.00
38.40
4.92

7,162.89




Law Offices International:

HOLLAND & KNIGHT LLP Atlanta Lakeland Portland Abu Dhabi

Betheada Los Angeles San Francisco Beijing
P.O. Box 864084 Boston Miami Tallahassee Caracas*
Orlando, Fl 32886-4084 Chicago New York Tampa Mexico City*
(813) 901-4180  Ft, Lauderdale No. Virginia Washington, D.C. Tel Aviv*
EIN 59-0663819 Jacksonville Orlando West Palm Beach

+*Repregentative Office
Aqua America, Inc. _ December 23, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2336319

Bryn Mawr, PA 19010
TERMS: DUE ON RECEIPT

REMITTANCE COPY
(PLEASE RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT)

Our Matter #117542.00001
Florida Rate Case

Fees for Professional Services $ 86,894.50
Reimbursable Costs 7,.501.35
INVOICE TOTAL - $ 94,395.85
BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE $ 94,395.85

OUTSTANDING INVOICE SUMMARY

12/16/08 2334981 99,724.89



06270

Agqua America, Inc, December 23, 2008
762 W, Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2336319
Bryn Mawr, PA 13010 Page 2

REMITTANCE COPY

MATTER BALANCE BROUGHT FORWARD: . 99,724 .89

TOTAL DUE $ 194,120.74

If you wish to remit by WIRE TRANSFER, please wire transfer funds to:

Wachowvia Bank '

214 N. Hogan Street, Jacksonvill 208 o ?EE}
DOMESTIC Clients: Aza ‘R_@JﬁA{j 1 B

INTERKATIONAL Clients: SWIFT ~

Please indicate our INVOICE NUMBER as reference in your wire transfer.

If you wish to remit by COURIER DELIVERY, ple&se use the following address:

Holland & Knight LLP
Suite 864084

11080 Lake Underhill Road
Orlando, PL 32825-5018



http:19',120.74
http:99,724.89

Law Offices International:
HOLLAND & KNIGHT LLP atlanta Lakeland Portland Abu Dbabi
Bethesda Los Angeles San Prancisco Beijing
P.O. Box 864084 Boston Miami Tallahassee Caracas*
Orlando, Fl 32886-4084 Chicago New York Tampa Mexico Cityr

(813) 901-4180
EIN 59-0663819

Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue

Ft. Lauderdale No. Virginia
Jacksonville Orlando

Washington, D.C. Tel Avive
West Palm Beach

*Representative Office

December 23, 2008
Invoice 2336319

Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

Page 1

TERMS: DUE ON RECEIPT

For professional services rendered through December 18, 2008
in connection with the following:

Our Matter #117542.00001
Florida Rate Case

12/01/08

12/01/08

Attendance at team phone conference regarding
trial preparation (.4); preparation of Notice
of Service and Transmittal for Staff’s Sixth
Request to Produce, Tenth Interrogatories and
Eleventh Interrogatories; revise same to
exclude Eleventh Interrogatories (.6);
preparation of final Answers and Objections to
Staff’s Tenth Interrogatories for review by
client (.6); make travel arrangements for visit
to Tallahassee office to prepare exhibits for
trial (.4).
Anna L. Brinker 2.00 hours at 140.00 per hour.
Attendance and participation at prehearing
conference.

D. Bruce May 1.50 hours at 365.00 per hour.

280.00

547.50



Aqua America, Inc. _ December 23, 2008

762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2336319
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 _ Page 2
12/01/08 Prepare for prehearing conference; multiple

i2/01/08

12/01/08

12/01/08

12/02/08

e-mail correspondence with client and parties
regarding stipulations, order of witnesses,
draft prehearing order; witness summaries;
review of revised schedules supplied/provided
by OPC; continued preparation for final
hearing; review of discovery responses and
late-filed exhibits to be filed in case.

D. Bruce May 6.90 hours at 365.00 per hour. 2518.50
Prepare for witness preparation for final
hearing.

D.. Bruce May 3.10 hours at 365.00 per hour. 1131.50

Continue to prepare discovery responses to be

served and transmittals/notices to be filed

today; continue to prepare required Notices of

Compliance with FAC Rules regarding Notice;

travel to/from and attend Prehearing Conference

at PSC; determine Staff is withdrawing Staff’s

1ith ROGs, which are duplicative to Staff’s

10th ROG8S; revise notice/transmittal

accordingly.

Gigi Rollini 3.70 hours at 190.00 per hour. 703.00

Download and print attachments uploaded to
extranet by client.
Patricia B. Greene .50 hours at 140.00 per hour. 70.00

Travel to Tallahassee office (3.2); assist in

preparation for trial; preparation of documents

for filing produced by OPC in response to AUF

Request for Production and Interrogatories

(4.8).

Anna L. Brinker 8.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. 1120.00



Aqua America, Inc. December 23, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2336319
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 i Page 3

12/02/08 Continued preparation of witnesses for
testimony at final hearing; meetings with
client regarding same; numerous e-mail
correspondence with parties regarding order of
witnesses, stipulated issues, and prehearing
order; numerous e-mail correspondence with
staff regarding late-filed exhibits.
D. Bruce May 10.50 hours at 365.00 per hour. 3832.50

12/02/08 Begin to prepare late-filed exhibits to
depositions; continue to prepare responses to
staff's final discovery; continue to prepare
for trial; finalize and prepare for
filing/service late-filed deposition exhibits
for S. Szczygiel, R. Griffin, D. Smeltzer;
finalize responses to Staff’s discovery and
prepare transmittal and response sets for
- service/filing; receive remaining OPC responses

to AUF's discovery and begin to analyze; begin

to catalog bates numbers for OPC'’s produced

documents, which lack sequential numbering as

required by the Order on Procedure;

teleconference with E. Sayler (PSC Staff)

regarding late-filed exhibits and upcoming

notices of mailing.

Gigi Rollini 8.50 hours at 190.00 per hour. 1615.00

12/02/08 Preparation of files, exhibits and attachments
for PSC hearing on December 8.
Patricia B. Greene 6.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. 840.00

12/03/08 Review and respond to e-mail correspondence re
use by FPSC staff of responses to RFPOD No. 70.
Karen D. Walker .30 hours at 365.00 per hour. 109.50

12/03/08 Continued preparation for trial; conference with
attorney concerning OPC’s discovery responses;
begin preparation of work product chart
containing requests, responses and documents
produced.
Anna L. Brinker 7.50 hours at 140.00 per hour. 1050.00



Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

12/03/08

12/03/08

12/03/08

12/04/08

12/04/08

12/04/08

Continued preparation of witnesses for
testimony at final hearing; meetings with
client regarding same; numerous e-mail
correspondence with parties regarding order of
witnesses, stipulated issues, and prehearing
order; numerous e-mail correspondence with
staff regarding late-filed exhibits.

D. Bruce May 9.70 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Continue to prepare Supplemental Late-Filed
Deposition Exhibits; respond to numerous Staff
discovery, exhibit, document and prehearing
order inquiries; continue to analyze OPC
documents produced to AUF's discovery requests;
continue to prepare for final hearing.

Gigi Rollini 8.10 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Continued preparation of files, exhibits and
attachments for PSC hearing on December 8.

Patricia B. Greene 8.00 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Researched cases and professional bar standards
requiring attorneys to ensure that clients
properly respond to discovery obligations.
Kevin W. Cox 1.20 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Finalize chart showing discovery requests to

OPC, responses and documents produced (1.8);
update discovery and deadlines charts (.4).

Anna L. Brinker 2.20 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Continued preparation of witnesses for
testimony at final hearing; meetings with
client regarding same; return travel from Bryn
Mawr, Pennsylvania; numerous e-mail
correspondence with parties regarding order of
witnesses, stipulated issues, and prehearing
order; numerous e-mail correspondence with
staff regarding late-filed exhibits.

D. Bruce May 9.10 hours at 365.00 per hour.

December 23, 2008
Invoice 2336319

3540.50

1539.00

1120.00

228.00

308.00

3321.50



Agua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

12/04/08

12/04/08

12/05/08

12/05/08

12/05/08

Continue to prepare late-filed exhibits for S.

Szczygiel and D. Franceski; continue to prepare

for final hearing; continue to prepare
Affidavits of Compliance with FAC Rule notice
requirements.

Gigi Rollini 8.00 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Continued preparation of files, exhibits and
attachments for PSC hearing on December 8.

Patricia B. Greene 5.00 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Ccontinued preparation of witnesses for
testimony at final hearing; conference calls

and e-mail correspondence with client regarding

same; numerous e-mail correspondence with
parties regarding order of witnesses,
stipulated issues, and prehearing order;
numerous e-mail correspondence with staff
regarding late-filed exhibits; continued
preparation of opening statement;
cross-~examination questions and possible
re-direct questions.

D. Bruce May 10.20 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Continue to prepare for finmal hearing.
Gigi Rollini 8.00 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Continued preparation of files, exhibits and
attachments for PSC hearing on December 8.

Patricia B. Greene 5.00 hours at 140.00 per hour.

December 23, 2008
Invoice 2336319

1520.00

700.00

3723.00

1520.00

700.00




Aqua America, Inc. " December 23, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2336319
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page 6

12/06/08 Continued preparation of opening statement;
continued preparation of cross-examination
questions; continued preparation of draft
summaries of witnesses; research and analysis
regarding issues involving cross-examination
questions; review rebuttal and direct
testimonies of witnesses in preparation for
final hearing; numerous e-mail correspondence
with clients regarding final hearing and
preparation for same.

D. Bruce May 6.00 hours at 365.00 per hour. 2190.00

12/06/08 Continue to prepare for final hearing.
Gigi Rollini 5.30 hours at 190.00 per hour. 1007.00

12/06/08 Continued preparation of files, exhibits and
attachments for PSC hearing on December 8.
Patricia B. Greene 3.10 hours at 140.00 per hour. 434.00

12/07/08 Travel to Tallahassee; assist in preparation for
final hearing.
Anna L. Brinker 8.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. 1120.00

12/07/08 Meetings with client to prepare witnesses for
final hearing; meetings with witnesses to
prepare for final hearing and witness
testimony; prepare summaries; prepare
re-direct; continued preparation of opening
statement. :
D. Bruce May 10.00 hours at 365.00 per hour. 3650.00

12/07/08 Continue to prepare for final hearing.
Gigi Rollini 8.00 hours at 190.00 per hour. 1520.00

12/07/08 Continued preparation of files, exhibits and
attachments for PSC hearing on December 8.
Patricia B. Greene 5.00 hours at 140.00 per hour. 700.00



Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

12/08/08

12/08/08

12/08/08

12/09/08

12/09/08

12/09/08

12/10/08

- Anna L. Brinker 10.10 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Assist in preparation for today's hearings;
attendance at hearing; preparation for 12/9/08
witnesses.

Anna L. Brinker 8.00 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Prepare for and attend first day of final
hearing; post hearing session with clients;
prepare witnesses for second day of hearing;
continued preparation of cross-examination
questions.

D. Bruce May 10.50 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Attend final rate hearing, and continue to
prepare for remaining days of final hearing.
Gigi Rollini 10.50 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Preparation for today’s hearing; attendance at
hearing; preparation for cross-examination of
12/10/08 witnesses (11.2).

Amna L. Brinker 11.20 hours at 140.00 per hour.

Prepare for and attend second day of hearing;
post hearing discussions with client; prepare
witnesses for next day testimony; continued
preparation of cross-examination questions.
D. Bruce May 10.00 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Attend final rate hearing, and continue to
prepare for remaining days of final rate
hearing.

Gigi Rollini 10.00 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Preparation of documents for use with today’s
witnegses; updated Exhibit list (1.1);
attendance at hearing (9.0).

December 23,
Invoice 2336319

1120.00

3832.50

1995.00

1568.00

3650.00

1900.00

1414.00

2008



Aqua America, Inc. December 23, 2008
762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2336319 -
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page 8 )

12/10/08 Prepare for and attend third day of final
hearing; post hearing meeting with clients;
prepare witnesses for fourth day of hearing;
continued preparation of cross-examination
questions.
D. Bruce May 10.00 hours at 365.00 per hour. 3650.00

12/10/08 Attend final rate hearing, and continue to
’ prepare for remaining day of final rate hearing.
Gigi Rollini 10.50 hours at 190.00 per hour. 1995.00

12/11/08 Preparation of documents for use at today's
hearing; updated exhibit list (.6); attendance
at hearing (4.5); travel to Jacksonville (3.2).
Anna L. Brinker 8.30 hours at 140.00 per hour. 1162.00

12/11/08 Prepare for and attend final day of hearing;
continued preparation of cross-examination of
Paul Stallcup and redirect questions for
witnesses; post-hearing meetings with client.
D. Bruce May 8.20 hours at 365.00 per hour. 2993.00

12/11/08 Attend final rate hearing; continue to prepare
post-hearing brief.
Gigi Rollini 7.70 hours at 190.00 per hour. 1463.00

12/12/08 Preparation of Final Exhibit List; preparation
of email correspondence to attorneys, client
recapping follow up required on late-filed
exhibits (1.2).
Anna L. Brinker 1.20 hours at 140.00 per hour. 168.00

12/12/08 Review transcripts; continued preparation of
post-hearing statement of issues (brief).
D. Bruce May 7.10 hours at 365.00 per hour. 2591.50

12/12/08 Continue to prepare post-hearing brief,
: including begin to organize record and
exhibits.
Gigi Rollini .50 hours at 190.00 per hour. 95.00



Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

12/14/08

12/15/08

12/15/08

12/15/08

12/16/08°

12/16/08

12/17/08

12/17/08

12/18/08

12/18/08

Continue to prepare to file required Late-Filed
Hearing Exhibits.
Gigi Rollini .50 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Review issues; review stipulations; review
transcript for additional stipulations;
continued preparation of post-hearing brief.
D. Bruce May 7.40 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Conference call with client regarding strategy
for drafting brief and coordination of
late-filed exhibits.

D. Bruce May - .60 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Continue to prepare to file required Late-Filed
Hearing Exhibits, and continue preparing
post-hearing briefing.

Gigi Rollini 1.60 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Continued preparation of post-hearing brief.
D. Bruce May 7.40 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Continue to prepare post-hearing brief.
Gigi Rollini 3.50 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Continued preparation of post-hearing brief.
D. Bruce May 7.10 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Continue to prepare Late-Filed Hearing Exhibits
and Post-Hearing Brief.
Gigi Rollini 7.00 hours at 190.00 per hour.

Continued preparation of post-hearing brief.
D. Bruce May 7.30 hours at 365.00 per hour.

Continue to prepare required late-filed
exhibits; continue to prepare post-hearing
brief.

Gigi Rollini 7.20 hours at 190.00 per hour.

December 23, 2008
Invoice 2336319
Page 9

95.00

2701.00

219.00

304.00

2701.00

665.00

2591.50

1330.00

2664.50

1368.00



Aqua America, Inc. . December 23, 2008

762 W. Lancaster Avenue Invoice 2336319
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Page 10
Total Fees for Professional Services ....... S 86,894.50
Name Title Hours Rate Value

May, D. Bruce Partner 142.60 365,00 52,049.00

Walker, Karen D. Partner 0.30 365.00 109.50

Cox, Kevin W. Associate 1.20  190.00 228.00

Rollini, Gigi Aggociate 108.60 190.00 20,634.00

Greene, Patricia B. Sr Professnl 32.60 140.00 4,564.00

Brinker, Anna L. Paralegal 66.50 140.00 9,310.00

Reimbursable costs through December 18, 2008

10/21/08 OTHER : 13.42
D Bruce May Conf call on 102108

10/23/08 OTHER 9.53
D Bruce May Conf call on 102308

10/24/08 OTHER ' 9.80
D Bruce May Conf call on 102408

12/02/08 Florida Public Service Commission 10.20
Copies of hearing transcripts

12/02/08 Other Courier 18.08

United Parcel Service
KELLY BURNS BRUCE

AQUA AMERICA INC

762 WEST LANCASTER AVENUE
BRYN MAWR PA 19010

12/03/08 IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC manual 498.46
bates labeling, B&W copies 4
12/03/08 Other Courier 9.18

United Parcel Service
KELLY BURNS

AQUA AMERICA INC

762 WEST LANCASTER AVENUE
BRYN MAWR PA 19010



Aqua America, Inc. «  December 23, 2008

762 W. Lancaster Avenue , Invoice 2336319
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 ' Page 11
12/04/08 Other Courier 9.18
United Parcel Service )
MARY HOPPER

AQUA AMERICA INC
762 WEST LANCASTER AVENUE
BRYN MAWR PA 19010

12/05/08 Accurate Stenotype Reporters, Inc. i 401.40
Invi#{FH11128,Appearance fee, Transcript -original

12/05/08 Office Depot, Inc Inv#6098, Indx Mrkr, 112.66
STB.5/ST .

12/05/08 Tallahassee Petty Cashier 38.50
Reimbursement for legislative history. 11/14/08

12/08/08 Anna Brinker Assist in preparation for trial at - 398.86

» Tallahassee office '

12/09/08  IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC B&W ) 1,108.48
scanning; cd creation. .

12/10/08 IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC Manual bates 87.81
labeling.

12/10/08 IVIZE of Tallahassee, LLC Grade A 604.69
Black & White copies

12/11/08 Other Courier = . 34.34

United Parcel Service
MARY HOPPER
AQUA AMERICA INC
762 WEST LANCASTER AVENUE
BRYN MAWR PA 19010
12/12/08 Other Courier N 43.91
’ United Parcel Service '
MARY HOPPER
AQUA AMERICA INC
762 WEST LANCASTER AVENUE
BRYN MAWR PA 19010

12/15/08 Anna Brinker Inv#ABR081212120729,Trial-: 772.99
.preparation/attendance at trial
12/17/08 D. Bruce May . 102.94

Invi#KGI081215121006,Working lunch with Gigi
Rollini and Aqua America representatives to
prepare for final hearing, including Joyce,
Rendell, Hopper, Griffin, wWard



Aqua America, Inc. December 23, 2008

762 W. Lancaster Avenue
PA 19010

Bryn Mawr,

12/17/08

12/17/08

12/17/08

12/17/08

12/17/08
12/17/08
12/17/08
12/17/08
12/17/08
12/17/08
12/17/08
12/17/08
12/17/08
12/17/08
12/18/08

D. Bruce May
Inv#KGI081215120150,Lodging, meals associated
with attendance at final hearing preparation
with AUF witnesses

D. Bruce May InviKGI081215114511,Lodging, meals,.
cab fare and car rental associated with
attendance at depositions of AUF representatives
in Docket 080121-WS

D. Bruce May

Inv#KGI081216120007,Meeting with client (K.
Joyce and T. Rendell) and G. Rollini to discuss
items to be addressed at issue identification
conference

D. Bruce May )
Inv#KGI081215120805, Parking for meeting with
AUF representatives, Joyce, Rendell, Hopper,
Szczgiel, Smeltzer )

Bric Kent Inv#TAL081215112822,Mileage

Eric Kent Inv#TAL081215112822,Mileage

Eric Kent Invi#TAL081215112822,Mileage

Eric Kent Inv#TAL081215112822,Mileage

Eric Kent Inv#TAL081215112822,Mileage

Eric Kent Invi#TAL081215112822,Mileage

Eric Kent Inv#TAL081215112822,Mileage

Eric Kent Invi#TAL081215112822,Mileage

Eric Kent InviTAL081215112822,Mileage

Eric Kent Inv#TAL081215112822,Mileage
Henningsen Investments Inc. Reference

# 081117-13 For professional services.

Photocopy
Long Distance Telephorne

Telecopy X
Westlaw

Total Reimbursable Costs ...................
Current Billing for this Matter ............

BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE .........ccieunvenns

Invoice 2336319
Page 12

592.48

800.81

110.19

4.27
0.76
7.37
7.25
6.03
8.60
7.37
0.76
7.25
7.25
38.17

1,573.80
25.60
2.00
14.96

94,395.85



Aqua America, Inc.
762 W. Lancaster Avenue
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

OUTSTANDING INVOICE SUMMARY

DATE INVOICE

12/16/08 2334981

99,724.89

MATTER BALANCE BROUGHT FORWARD

TOTAL DUE .........

.................

December 23, 2008
Invoice 2336319

Page

13

99,724.89



BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

In Re: Application for increase in water and
Wastewater rates in Alachua, Brevard, DeSoto,
Highlands, Lake, Lee, Marion, Orange,

Palm Beach, Pasco, Polk, Putnam,

Seminole, Sumter, Volusia, and Washington
Counties by Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc.

Docket No. 080121-WS

Dated: December 24, 2008

AQUA UTILITIES FLORIDA, INC.'S

LATE-FILED EXHIBIT NO. 199



AUF Late-Filed Exhibit No. 199

Report on AUF’s Response to Scottish Highlands Survey

AUF has responded directly to the Scottish Highlands Condominium Association in
regard to several issues raised in the attached letter. It is AUF's understanding that these
issues have been resolved.

At the final hearing, the Office of Public Counsel introduced an exhibit which appears to
be a questionnaire in which residents of Scottish Highlands expressed their objection to
AUF’s request for a rate increase. For those customers that expressed any billing or
water quality issues, AUF is researching and following up with individual customers.

# 5923238 vl




AQUA.

December 5, 2008

Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc. www.aquautilitiesflorida.com
3116 Capital Circle NE, Suite 5
Tallahassee, FL 32308

Janice Johnson

Scottish Highlands Condominium Association
1 Scottish Highlands Boulevard

Leesburg, FL 34788

Dear Ms. Johnson:

I am responding to your letters of November 10 and November 11, 2008 to Mr. Charlie Beck
regarding the Aqua Utilities Florida accounts held by Scottish Highlands Condominiums. I
understand that Trish Stairiker of Aqua’s billing department has been in contact with you and
that the issues which you reference in your letter have been resolved. As you are aware, there
are 35 separate accounts set up with different uses including irrigation and a lift station in your
Association. I apologize for any inconvenience and am hopeful that we have resolved these
issues for you and your Association. We have now established Trish as your permanent contact
to work with should future issues arise that need attention.

Upon review of the accounts, it appears that there were some issues with three pre-conversion of
the meters located at your Condominium Association and also an issue with the method of
payment which has been recently resolved. One of the meter issues unfortunately stemmed from
an inaccurate coding of the meter since before Aqua owned the company and was not corrected
until our recent meter change program.. As we have reviewed our records, it appears that in one
instance a contracted meter reader manually entered readings either incorrectly or falsely. We
have a zero tolerance for falsification of meter reads and that contractor no longer works for
Aqua.

You further-mention in your letter that a 3/4 inch meter was removed and replaced with a two
inch meter. Our research indicates that this account had been inaccurately coded in the billing
system as a 5/8 inch meter since the time Aqua purchased your community in 2004. In other
words, while it appeared on this account that there was a 5/8 inch, there was actually always a 2
inch meter at that location. Since the billing system had been set up for a 5/8 inch meter, it
recognized the new meter as a 5/8 inch meter and the system automatically under billed you by a
factor of 10 after the new meter was installed and read. A bill was issued on August 20, 2008
based on the correct size meter and an “actual” meter reading. Please be assured that Aqua will
not attempt to back bill you for any of the base facility charges that were under billed during the
period that the 2 inch meter was coded as a 5/8 inch meter.

An Aqua America Company



Janice Johnson
December 5, 2008
Page 2

Also, as mentioned above, you discussed your difficulty in Aqua’s ability to spread a single
payment (check) over the 35 accounts, each of which has a different account balance. I
understand you had mailed a single check to pay for the 35 accounts at the Scottish Highlands.
Unfortunately, the check totaled a different amount than the sum of the included remittance slips
As a result, PNC (our remittance vendor) mailed your check back to Aqua for further review. As
we have relayed to you, the solution to the situation is that you need to indicate which accounts
you would like the dollars credited to.

I also understand that we have now established a permanent contact for you to work with should
future issues arise that need attention. I further understand that all future payments on the 35
accounts in Scottish Highlands will be mailed directly to the Aqua billing so that we can provide
oversight of your account. I hope you find this arrangement satisfactory.

Once again, please accept my apologies for any inconvenience any of these situations may have
caused you. If you would like to discuss any of these issues further, please feel free to contact
Trish Stairiker in the billing department at 610-645-1159.

Sincerely,

Christopher Franklint
Regional President




BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

In Re: Application for increase in water and
Wastewater rates in Alachua, Brevard, DeSoto,
Highlands, Lake, Lee, Marion, Orange,

Palm Beach, Pasco, Polk, Putnam,

Seminole, Sumter, Volusia, and Washington
Counties by Aqua Ultilities Florida, Inc.

Docket No. 080121-WS

Dated: December 24, 2008

D T S e < " g

AQUA UTILITIES FLORIDA, INC.'S

LATE-FILED EXHIBIT NO. 204



AUF Late-Filed Exhibit No. 204

Report on Chuluota New Customers Added to Base Per Year
For water, customer data for the AUF Chuluota area is as follows:

2003 1,054
2004 1,181
2005 1,223
2006 1,347
2007 1,363

For wastewater, customer data for the AUF Chuluota area is as follows:

2003 297
2004 517
2005 557
2006 588
2007 575

#5921023_vl




BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

In Re: Application for increase in water and
Wastewater rates in Alachua, Brevard, DeSoto,
Highlands, Lake, Lee, Marion, Orange,

Palm Beach, Pasco, Polk, Putnam,

Seminole, Sumter, Volusia, and Washington
Counties by Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc.
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Dated: December 24, 2008
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HBE L.. Inc. CERTIFICATE OF ANALYSIS

5600 US. | North. Fort Plarce, FL. 34946

Phone (772) 4G5-858B4 Fax: (772) AG7-584 [2133365]
Client. Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc. Workorder ID: 8456 Chuluota RUSH THM/HAAS
Parameter Qualfier Resut  Uniis Limit Method Baich  Date/Time Dale/Time Analyst 1D
Laboratory ID: 2133365001 Sampled: 11/20/08 9:00 Received: 112008 10:15
Sample ID: 803 Mazurka Grab Matrix: Water Results reported on Wet Welght Basis
Bromodichloromethane 1 gl 0.25 EPA5242 VOC3000 12308 13:17 WR E96000
Bromoform 29 vl 0.41 EPA 62422 VOC3000 1172308 13:17 WR  ED6060
Chioroform 6.2 ught 0.25 EPA5242 VOC3000 1172308 13:17 WR  E96080
Dibromochlorometiians 26 gl 0.3 EPA 5242 VOC3000 11723081317 WR 96080
1z vl 0.25 EPA5242 VOC3000 12308 1317 WR  E96080
4.8 uglL 0.18 EPAS52.1 PESTS230 1124081343 112606525 X EBG0GO
Dichloroacetic Acid 2.3 gl 0.66 EPA 552.1 PESTS239 1124081943 1172808525 JL  E9808D
Monobromoacetic Acid 0.28U wh 0.28 EPA 552.4 PEST5200 1172408 194 1172608525 L  E96080
Monochloroacetic Acid 1 wglL 0.88 EPA 5521 PESTSZ39 11724081943 1172608525 M. 96080
Total HAAS 18 gl 0.18 EPAS52.1 PESTS238 11724081943 11726008525 JL  E96080
Trichloroacelic acid 0.58 gl 0.2 EPASS21 PESTS230 11724081943 1172608525 JL  £96080
Laboratory ID: 2133365002 ' Sempled: 11/20/08 9:30 Received: 11/20/08 10:15
Sample ID: 390 Lake Lanelle Grab Matrix: Waler Results reported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichloromethane 11 wl 0.25 EPAS24.2 YOCI000 1123008 1343 WR  E96080
Bromoform 34 gl 0.41 EPA 52422 VOC3000 12308 1349 WR  E96080
Chioroform 438 gl 0.25 EPA 5242 VOC3000 112308 1349 WR  E96060
Dibromochloromethane 28 uglL 0.3 EPAS24.2 VOC3000 11/2308 13:49 WR  E96080
Totsh THMs 78 uglL 0.25 EPA524.2 VOC3000 1M2081349 WR  EDB0SO
Dibromoacetc Acid 5.1 gl 0.18 EPA 552.1 PESTS239 11741081943 11/2608600 JL  E96080
Dichloroacetic Acid 1.8 uglt 0.66 EPA 552.1 PESTS233 11724008 1943 11/26086:00 JL  E96080
Monobromoacetic Acid 0.28U gl 0.28 EPA 552.1 PESTS239 1172408 19:43 1172608800 JL  E96080
Monochloroacetic Acid 083U ugh. 0.88 EPA 552.1 PESTSZ30  11/24/08 19:43 112608600 JL  E96080
Total HAAs 74 uglL 0.18 EPA 5521 PEST5239  11/24/08 19:43 11/26086:00 JL  E96080
Trichioroacelic acid 0.47 ugh 0.2 EPA 552.1 PESTS239 11724061843 1172808600 JL  £96080
Laboratory ID: 2133365003 Sampled: Raceived: 11720108 10:15
Sample ID:  Trip Blank Matrix: Water Results reported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichioromethane 0.25U vl 0.25 EPA 5242 VOC3000 W8 1422 WR  E96060
Bromoform 0.41U Wt 0.41 EPA524.2 VOC3000 123081422 WR  E95080
Chioroform 0.25U ugl 0.25 EPA 524.2 VOC3000 123081422 WR  E96060
Dibromochioromethane 0.3y gl 0.3 EPAS24.2 VOG3000 1123081422 WR  E96060
Total THMs 0.25y ugl 0.25 EPA 524.2 VOC3000 112308 1422 WR  E9G080
'Result Qualifiers: U = Not Detected | = Analyte detected between the Laboratory Method Deection Limit and Lahoratory Reporting Limit

Applicable Florida Department of Environmental Protection Qualifiers defined below.  Statement of Estimated Uncertainty avallable upon request.

5800US 1 North 4155 St. Johns Phwy Suite 1300
Fort Plerce, Fl. 34946 Sanford, FL 32771
FDOH # E96080 FE‘)OH#EB3509

Printed: 11/26/08




HBE L, Inc. CERTIFICATE OF ANALYSIS

5600 U.S. | North, Fort Plerce, FL 34946

Phone (778) 465-8584 Fax: (772) 467-584 . [2133365)
Client: Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc. Workorder ID: 6456 Chuluota RUSH THM/HAAS

1 Reporting Laboratory Prep Analyzed Lab
Parameter Qualifier Result Units Limit Mathad Baich  Dale/Time Dale/Time Analyst D

Laboratory ID: 2133365001 00 Received: 11/20/08 10:15

Sample ID: 803 Mazurka Grab Results reported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichloromethane 1" vl 0.25 EPA5242 VOC3000 112308 13:17 WR  ES6080
Bromoform 29 vl 0.41 EPA524.2 VOC3000 1208 1317 WR 96080
Chloroform 6.2 ught 0.25 EPA5242 VOC3000 1172308 13:17 WR  £96060
Dibromochloromethane 26 gl 0.3 EPA524.2 VOC3000 /3081317 WR 96080
Yolsl THMs 72 ugl. 0.25 EPAS524.2 VOC3000 112008 13:17 WR  E96060
Ditvomoacetic Acd 4.8 ugll 0.18 EPA552.1 PESTS230 1124081943 11/26M6525 J  E9G0B0
Dichloroacetic Acid 2.3 uglL 0.66 EPA552.1 PESTS200 112408 1943 1172808525 JL  E96080
Monobromoacetic Acid 0.28U ugll 028 EPA 5521 PESTS230 11724108 19:43 112608525 JL  E96060
Monochloroacetic Acid 1 wgll 0.88 EPA552.1 PESTS239  1172400819:43 112808525 X E96080
Total HAAs 18 uglL 0.18 EPA552.1 PESTS23 11724081943 1172608525 JL  E96060
Trichloroacelic acid 0.58 ugl 0.2 EPA 552.1 PESTS239 11724108 19:43 112606525 J 96080
Laboratory ID; 2133365002 Sampled: f1/2008 930  Received: 11/20/08 10:15
Sample ID: 390 Lake Lanelle Grab Matrix: Water Results reporiod on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichloromethane 11 gl 0.25 EPAB242 VOC3000 12091348 WR  E96080
Bromolorm 34 ugh 0.41 EPA 5242 VOC3000 112308 1349 WR  E06080
Chioroform 43 gl 0.25 EPAS242 VOC3000 173008 13:49 WR  E06080
Dibromachloromethane 28 ugh 0.3 EPAS24.2 VOC3000 11/2308 1349 WR  ED6080
Total THMs 78 ugh 0.25 EPA524.2 VOC3000 208 1349 WR  EDG080
Dibromoacet Acid 51 ugl 0.18 EPA 552.1 PEST5230 11724008 19:43 11/26086:00 JL  E96080
Dichloroacetic Ackd 18 uglL 0.66 EPA 552.1 PESTS239 1172408 19:43 112500600 JL  E96080
Monobromoacetic Acid 0.28 U wlt 0.28 EPA 552.1 PESTS239 1172408 19:43 112608600 J. 96080
Monochloroacetic Acid 0.88U ugl. 0.88 EPA552.1 PESTS233  11724/08 19:43 112608600 JL  E96080
Total HAAS 7.4 gl 0.18 EPA 552.1 PESTS239 11724108 19:43 11728606600 JL 96080
Trichloroacetic acid 0.47 ugh 0.2 EPA 552.1 PESTS230 117240081943 1128086:00 JL  E96080
Laboratory ID: 2133365003 Sampled: Received: 1172008 10:15
Sample ID:  Trip Blank Matrix: Water Results reported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichloromethane 0.25U ug/lL 0.25 EPA 524.2 VOC3000 1172308 1422 WR  E96080
Bromoform 041V wl 0.41 EPA 5242 VOC3000 W08 1422 WR E96080
Chioroform 0.25V wl 025 EPA 5242 VOC3000 1208 1422 WR  E96060
Dibromochloromethane o3v vl 0.3 EPA 524.2 VOC3000 112308 1422 WR  E0G080
Total THMs 025U gl 025 EPA524.2 VOC3000 12308 1422 WR D080
'Result Qualifiers: U = Not Detacted | = Analyte detected between the L.aboratory Method Detection Limit and Laboratory Reporting Limit

Applicable Florida Department of Environmental Protection Qualifiers defined below.  Statement of Estimated Uncertainty available upon request.

ESOTR 1 North e e S I
Fort Plerce, FL 34946 Shotord, 72, 52771” SRt
FDOH # E96080 F?m#esssoo 5 =

Printed: 11/26/08 ' Page 30r4




HBEL Inc. CERTIFICATE OF ANALYSIS

e (73 nt 2400 2;".'?““ Fan 772 4671984 [2130882]

Chent. Asua Utilities Florida, inc. Workorder (D: Chuluota QT THM/HAAS

. Reporting Laboratory Prep Analyzed Lab

Parametar Gualifier Rasult Unita Limit Method Batch Date/Time  DatefMime Anatyst ()
Laborafory ID; 2130882001 . Sampled: 030508 1450  Received: 030508 16:08

Sempie D; 803 Mazurks Grab Matrix: Water Results raported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichiorormethane 19 vt 0.25 EPA§24.2 VOC2889 0708C:24 WA £96080
Bromoform 61 v 0.41 BPA 524.2 VOC2889 03708024 WR  EO8080
Chioroform 5.9 uglL 0.25 EPASH2 voC288s 0VT0B0:24  WR  E96080
Otremochioramethane 54 gl 0.30 EPA 5242 VOC2089 0IVRR02  WR E96080
Yol THMs 140 “ugh. 0:26 EPASM2 .. VOC2889 OMMORCM  WR  E08080
“Dhromogcetic Acid 13 ugl. 0.18 EPA 552,1 PESTS070  O3/A700 13:24 03MTNA 2155 J  E96080
Dichioroacetic Acid 45 g, 0.66 EPAS52.1 PESTS079  OMI78 13:24 Q17082155 JL  E95080
Monobromoacefic Acid 1.3 ugh. 0.28 EPASS21 PESTS070 037081324 037092185 JL  £98080
Monochloroacefic Acid 0.88 U gl 0.88 EPA 552.1 PESTSOT  OM170013:24 QVA7082185 J  E96080
Tatal HAAS 20 ugh. 0.18 EPAS52.1 PESTS079  O17M08 13:24 037082155 A E96080
Trichioroacellc acid 1.3 uot. 0.20 EPA 552.1 PESTSO?9  GINTAA 13:24 0INTOB21SS N E96080
Laboratory ID: 2130882002 [Sempled: 00508 1510  Received: 030508 16:08 |
Sample ID: 390 Lk Laneile Grab Matrix; Waler Results repotted on Wet Weight Basis }
Bromodichioromethane 23 wgit, 0.25 EPA S22 voC288s CITM80:8  WR  E96080
Bromatorm 64 ugit 0.41 EPA 5242 VOC2683 0M7080:58  WR  E98080
Chioroform 7.0 ul 0.25 EPA SN2 VOC2089 0M7080:58  WR  E96080
Dibromochioromethane 63 uglL 0.30 EPA S22 vOC2889 000058 WR  EgE0e0
Totsl THM} 180 gt 0.25 EPA 5242 VOC2689 03708038  WR  E96060
Divronoacstic Acd 11 wt 0.18 EPA 552.1 PESTSOTY  0JA7M813:26 3T 2231 X E96080
Dichloraacetic Acid 4.3 vl 0.68 EPA §82.1 PESTSOTY 031708 13:2¢ 0IN7082231 N E96080
Monobromoacatic Actd 1.2 vgh, 0.268 EPA 5521 PESTSO70  03n7M8132¢ 03NTA82231 JL  E96080
Monochloroacetic Acid 0.8V wl 0.88 EPA §52.1 PESTSO?3 017108 13:24 G708 2231 J  €35080
Total HAAs 17 ughL 0.18 EPA 3521 PESTS0OT9 031708 13:24 070822 WL E95080
Trienloroacetic acid 1.2 ugd. 0.20 EPASS2t . PESTSOTS Q37081324 037082231 R E98080
Laborstory 1D;: 2130882003 ‘ Ssmpied:. 030508 0:00.. . Received: 030508 11:15
Sample ID:  Trip Blank ' Matrix: Waler " Reslts reported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichioromelhane 0.25 U ugh 0.25 €Pasul | voc2e80 T 0MEN2242  WR  £06000
Bromolor 041V ugh 0.41 EPA 5242 VOC2889 038082242 WR E96080
Chioroform 025U 0.25 EPA 524.2 VOC2849 0306082242 WR  E06080
Dibromochioromethane 0.30 U vgh 0.30 EPA 5242 VOC 2889 08082242  WR  E96080
Total THMs 0.25U ul 0.25 EPA 5242 vOC2889 038082242 WR E08080

'Result Qualifiers: U = Not Detected 1 = Analyle detected between the Leborstory Method Detection Limit.and Laﬁoritory Reporting Lumit -
Applicable Florida Depariment of Environmental Protection Qualifiers defined below.  Statement of Estimated Uncertainty avallable upon request.

5800 US 1 North 4155 St. Johns Pkwy Suite 1300 16331 Cortez Bivd
Fort Plarce, FL 34946 Sanford. FL 3277 Brookavifte, FL. 34801
FOOH # E96080 FOOHM # E83509 FOOM 8 E84418

Printed: 3/19/08




HBEL, Inc. CERTIFICATE OF ANALYSIS

5600 U.8. 1 North, Fort Plerce, Fl. 34048

Phone; (772) 4862400 Ext. 205  Fax: (772) 467-1504 [2131296)
Client: Agua Utilities Florida, Inc. Workorder (D: Chuluota RUSH TTHM
Parameter ~ Qualifler Result Units Limit Mathod Batch Date/Time DalelTime Ansyst 1D
g - ]
Laboretory ID: 2131206001 Sampled: 041008 13:40 Received: 04/10/08 15:26
Sample ID:  GST Plant #2 Grab Matrix: Waler Resulls reported on Wet Welght Basis
Bromodichioromethane 1" ugl. 025 EPAS524.2 VOCZ403 M4H1M6 1826 WR  £96080
Bromoform 32 uglL 0.41 EPA 5242 vOC2903 041108 1826 WR  E95080
Chioroform 39 ugl 0.28 EPA 524.2 VOC2503 041108 1826 WR  EO8080
Dibromochioromethane 3 ugl 0.30 EPAS24.2 VOC2603 041106 16:26 WR  E£95080
Total THMs 77 ugh. 0.25 EPA 524.2 v0C2903 0411081826 WR  E96080
Laboratory ID: 2131296002 Sampled: 04/10/08 14.00 Received: 04/10/08 15:26
Sample ID:  POE Plant #2 Grab Matnx: Waler Resulls reported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichlioromethane 12 uglL 0.25 EPA 524.2 YyoC2903 01108 19.00 WR  E95080
Bromoform 27 gl 0.41 EPA524.2 VOC2903 04NN 1900 WR  E96080
Chioroform 4.8 ugll 0.25 EPA524.2 vOC2803 041108 19:00 WR E98080
Dibromochioromethane 20 uglt 0.30 EPA524.2 VOC2903 0471108 19:00 WR E96080
Total THMs 72 wlt 0.25 EPA522 VOC2803 41106 19:00 WR 96080
Laboratory ID: 2131296003 Sampled j‘(ﬁfﬂ/ﬂé’}‘%ﬁo Received: 04/10/08 15:26
Sample ID: 803 Mazurka Grab Matrix: Waler Results reported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichioromethane 0.6 ught 0.25 EPA524.2 YOC2803 041108 1934 WR E98080
Bromolom 22 ugh. 0.41 EPA524.2 VOC2903 0HM110819:M WR E9B080
Chiorolorm 5.0 uglL 0.25 EPA524.2 VOC2803 04108 18 WR  E96080
Dibromochiosomethane 22 ugh 0.30 EPA 524.2 VOC2903 041100 19:34 WR  E96080
Tols! THMs 55 ugh. 0.26 EPA524.2 VOC2903 4108194 WR  EQG080
Laborafory ID; 2131296004 Sampled: “04/10/08 13.00 Received: (4/1008 15:26
Sample ID: 390 Lk Lanelle Grab Matrix: Water Results reported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichioromethane 7.2 ugll 0.25 EPA 524.2 VOC2903 04/11/08 20:08 WR E96080
12 0.8 0.41 EPA 524.2 VOC2903 04/1108 20:08 WR E95060
6.6 ugh 0.25 EPA524.2 VOC2903 04/11/08 20:08 WR ESG0G0
13 wl 0.30 EPAS524.2 VOC2903 0411106 2006 WR ES6080
g wh 0.25 E£PA 5242 VOC2903 M411K82008 WR £96080
Sampled: 04/10/08 13:40 Recelived: 04/10/08 15:26
Sample ID:  GST Plant#1 Grab Matrix: Water Results reported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichloromethane 5.8 gl 025  EPAS2M2 VOC2303 0411082042 WR E96080
Bromoform 4.8 g 0.41 EPA524.2 VOC2903 04111082042 WR  ES6080
Chiorolorm 4.2 ugh. 0.25 EPA524.2 VOC2903 041082042 WR  EDS080
Dibromochioromethane 8.0 ugiL 0.30 EPA 524.2 vOC2903 041110682042 WR E£96080
Total THMs & ugl 0.25 EPA 524.2 VOC2903 04111082042 WR E06080
5600 US 1 North 4155 St. Johns Pkwy Suite 1300 16331 Cortez Bivd
Fort Pierce, FL. 34946 Sanford, FL 32771 Brooksville, FL 34601
FDOH # E96080 FDOH # E83509 FDOH # £84418

Printed: 4/15/08



HBEL, Inc. CERTIFICATE OF ANALYSIS

Phonw: (72 S 400 B 26~ Pax: (172 4671084 [2131419]
Client: Agua Utilities Florida, Inc. Workorder ID: Chuluota RUSH TTHM

; Reporting Labaratory Prep Pralyzed Lab
Parameter Qualifier Rosuit Units Limit Method Batch Date/Time Date/Time Analyst 1D
W
Laboratory ID: 2131419001 Sampled: 04722008 13:45 Received: 04/2208 15:34
Sample ID:  Plant#1 POE Grab Matrix: Water Results reported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichioromethane 9.9 ugh 0.25 EPA 5242 VOC2907 04/23/08 18:33 WR  E95080
Bromoform 36 ugh. 0.41 EPAS24.2 VOC2807 04208 1833 WR  E9G0B0
Chioroform 38 gl 0.25 EPAS24.2 VOC2907 04208 1833 WR  EDG08D
Dibromochioromethane 28 g 0.30 EPA 524.2 VOC2907 0472308 18:33 WR . F36080
Totel THMs 78 gl 0.25 EPA 5242 VOC2007 0472008 1833 WR 96060
Laboratory ID;: 2131419002 Sampled: 04/22/08 13:30 Received: 04/22/08 15:34
Sample ID: Plant#2 POE Grab Matrix: Water Results reportad on Wet Weight Basls
Bromodichioromethane 12 ugh. 0.25 EPAS28Z  VOC2007 OUZI08 1907 WR  ED6080
Bromoform 40 uglL 0.41 EPA 5242 VOC2907 04/2308 1807 WR E96080
Chlorglorm 46 ugiL 0.25 EPA5242 VOC2807 047308 1807 WR E96060
Dibromochioromethane 32 uglL 0.30 EPA 5242 VOC2907 04208 1907 WR  E9080
Total THMs 88 uglL 0.26 EPA 5242 VOC2607 0472318 1907 WR  E96080
Laboratory ID: 2131419003 Sampled: 04/22/08 13:30 Received: 04/22/08 15:34
Sample ID: Plant#2 GST Grab Matrix: Water Results reported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichloramethane 15 uglL 0.25 EPA524.2 VaCzE0T 0472308 1940 WR  E£96080
Bromolorm ] ugl 0.41 EPA 5242 VOC2907 0472208 1940 WR E06080
Chlorform 43 gL 0.25 EPA 5242 VOC2507 047308 1840 WR E06080
Dibromochloromethane 37 gl 0.30 EPA 5242 VOCZ807 042308 1940 WR  E£96080
Total THMs 87 wl 0.25 EPAS242 VOC207 04723008 1940 WR  E£DG0BO
Laboratory ID: 2131419004 Sampled: - 04/22/08 13:15 Received: 04/22/08 15:4
Sample ID: 803 Mazurka Grab Matrix: Water Results reported on Wet Welght Basis
* Bromodichioromeshane 14 gl 0.25 EPA524.2 VOC2807 W8 204 WR E£06080
Bromoform 46 ugh. 0.41 EPA 5242 VOC2007 0472308 20:14 WR 96080
Chiorolorm 6.2 gl 0.25 EPA524.2 voc2e07 UZM08 20:4 WR  E9B080
oi loromethane s gl 0.30 EPA 5242 voC2907 OAZ3N820:144 WR 96080
To TNy 100 ugl 0.25 EPA 5242 VOC2907 MZMB 2014 WR  E96080
Laboratory ID: 2131419005 Sampled: 04/22/08 13:15 Received: 04/22/08 15:34
Sample ID; 390 Lk Lanelle Grab Matrix; Waler * Resulls reported on Wet Weight Basis
Bromodichioromethane 14 uglh 0.25 EPA 5242 VOC2907 04123008 2048 WR E96080
Bromoform 33 uglL 0.41 EPA 5242 VOC2007 0423008 20:48 WR E96080
Chioroform 5.8 ul 0.25 EPA 5242 VOC2007 04082048 WR 08080
Dibromochioromethane 3s upl 0.30 EPA524.2 VOC2507 042308 2048 WR E96080
Total THMs 87 ugh 0.25 EPA 5242 VOC2807 42308 2048 WR E96080

'Result Qualifiers: U = Not Detected 1= Analyts detecled between the Laboratory Method Detection Limit and Laboratory Reporfing Limit
Applicable Florida Department of Environmental Protection Qualifiers defined below.  Statement of Estimated Uncestainty avallable upon request.

5600 US 1 North 4155 St. Johns Pkwy Suite 1300 16331 Cortez Bivd - AEeo

Fort Pierce, FL. 34946 Sanford, FL 32771 Brooksville, FL 34601 ol ""*.e

FDOH # E96080 FDOH # E83509 FDOH # E84418 & s
b | 2 E

Printed: 4/25/08 ' Page 3of 4



OCT<3-2008 ©3:43A FROM:AQUA UTIL 4073397490 TO: LEESBURG P.4/13

HBE L. Inc. CERTIFICATE OF ANALYSIS

Client: Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc. Workorder ID: Chuluota PWS 3590186 RUSH
; Reporting Lasborstory Prop  Analyzed Lab
Parameter Quatifier Result Units Limit Maethod Batch DetaTime  Daia/Time Aaslyst 1D

Laboratory ID: 2132770001 Received: 09/17/08 13.55

Sample [D: 803 Mazurka Grab , J
Bromodichioromethane 8.2 gl 025  EPASM2 vocH70 0072208 1602 WA E98060
Bromoform 14 g 0.41 EPA 5242 YOCHT0 09/22/08 1302 WR E96080
Chiaroform 17 ugl 0.25 EPA 5242 vocaete 00722108 1302 WR  E96080
Ditvomochioromathans 14 wl 0.3 EPAS42 vocan 09722008 10:02 WR  E£96080
Total THKE 5 whi 0.25 EPA S24.2 V2970 0872200 1902 WR  £96080
Obromoscetic ASS 33 uh 0.18 EPASSL1 PESTS198  0B20821:39 0M2MAEZ A E96080
Dichiorcacetic Acid 29 uh 0.68 €PA 552.1 PESTSION  0B/Z20021:3 0M2M8823 XL E96000
Manabromoacetic Acid 1.0 ugL 0.28 EPA S52.1 PESTSIS90 0022082139 0S2M08823 W E96080
Monochioroacetic Acid o8y ogh 0.88 EPA $82.1 PESTSION  00/220821:38 OM2M0082) JL 96060
Totsl HAAS 79 gl . 0.13 EPA 552.1 PESTSISS 00220821 OWDOE82) A E9S080
Trichloroacetic acid 0.72 ugl 0.2 EPAS52.1 PESTSI8  00/220821:)9 0S2MA83 M E96080
Laboratoty 10: 2132770002 ; Sampled: 0317208 11:30 Received: 09/17/08 13:55 K
Sample ID: 390 Lk Leneffe Grab | Matrix: \
Bromodichiromethane 1 ol 0.25  €PAS:a  TVOCHT® | TondRieds WR E96080
Bromolom 21 wt 0.41 EPA 5242 voc2e70 08/22/08 19:35 WR E96080
Chiaralorm 8.7 wt 0.25 EPA S22 vOoC2970 0022008 1935 WR £98080
Tou W& 88 gt 0.25 EPA 5242 vOC270 092208 19:35 WR £96080
Ditvomascatic Acd 19 woll 0.18 EPASS2.1 PESTSI OWZWB2139 03ZM0EE30 X 96080
Dichloroacetic Acid 21 uplL 0.86 EPA 552.1 PESTSIS8  OWZW00 21:39 ONIN088:S8 4L E96080
Monobromoacatic Add 0.43 vglL 0.28 EPA 552.1 PESTS19  O/2/08 21:30 082208838 X 98060
Monochloraacetic Acid o83 U ugt 0.88 EPASS2Y PESTSI6 O/ZAS21:39 O/230868S8 U EDE0B0
Total HAAS 'Y ] gL 0.18 EPASS2.1 PESTSI 002508 21:9 08/2308838 L EDG060
Trichloroacetic scid 0.30 ugll 0.2 EPAS321 PESTSIo 0927002139 052308858 A E98080
Laborstory ID; 2132770003  Sampled: Rocelved: 091708 13:55
Sample ID:  Trig Blank LMafnx '
Bromodichioromethane 025V ugl 0.25 TEASHT VoSBT T T T (9ne 009 WR E95080
Bromokorm 041V vl 0.41 £PA S22 vOCZ970 0872208 2009 WR E95080
Chosolorn .28V wl 0.2 EPA $24.2 VOC2970 00/22/08 2009 WR  E96080
Oibromochioromethane o3V wl 0.3 EPASH2 VOC2970 02208 2000 WR  E96080
Tota! THMs 025V vl 0.25 EPAS242 vOC2970 0922000 2009 WR E9G080

'Resuit Qualifiers: U = Not Detecied | = Analyte detected between the Laboratory Method Detection Limit and Laboratory Reporting Limit
Appiicable Florids Department of Environrmental Protection Qualifers defined below.  Stalement of Estimated Uncertainty available upon request.

e e,
Fant Piojes, FL. 3a9ss %,sé ot Py Sulla 300 e
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BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

In Re: Application for increase in water and
Wastewater rates in Alachua, Brevard, DeSoto,
Highlands, Lake, Lee, Marion, Orange,

Palm Beach, Pasco, Polk, Putnam,

Seminole, Sumter, Volusia, and Washington
Counties by Aqua Ultilities Florida, Inc.

Docket No. 080121-WS

Dated: December 24, 2008
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AQUA UTILITIES FLORIDA, INC.'S

LATE-FILED EXHIBIT NO. 207



AUF Late-Filed Exhibit 207

REPORT ON RESPONSE TO DIEHL AND BARRETTA COMPLAINTS

Aqua’s customer service team has handled four categories of incoming complaints during this
rate case: 1) calls into the Aqua call center, 2) formal Florida Public Service Commission (FPSC)
complaints requiring a response to the FPSC within 15 days, 3) those raised by customers during
the public service hearings held throughout the state, and 4) comments to the FPSC on forms
distributed at the public service hearings.

Based on our review, Ms. Barretta and Mr. Diehl both raised their issues at the Chuluota public
service hearing. AUF followed up with every customer that testified at this public service
hearing. As Mr. Franklin explained, the Company took the approach that, while the final follow-
up letters did not go through every detail of the actions taken to address the customers’ issues,
based on experience from the last public input hearings, the Company responded with more
general language responsive to categories of customer complaints. However, this does not mean
that personal contact was not made, that site visits did not occur, or that follow-up did not take
place. This level of detail, while not provided in the follow-up letters, is provided as an
attachment to Mr. Franklin’s supplemental direct testimony, which is the tracking sheet AUF
utilized to document follow-up actions taken to customer complaints raised at the service
hearings.

Mr. Diehl

For Mr. Diehl, the Company reviewed his complaints raised at the Chuluota public service
hearing. Mr. Diehl complained about water quality and customer service. As Mr. Diehlisa
resident of Chuluota, AUF is aware of the water quality issues in this system and responded by
letter that AUF is hopeful that the new treatment process will bring the TTHM level back into
compliance. We noted in our customer records that Mr. Diehl did contact the call center in 2008
about a water quality question.

In addition, AUF reviewed Mr. Dieh!’s prior contact with the call center. Mr. Diehl complained
about Aqua’s customer service and reported that our customer service representatives
disconnected calls. While these complaints are not specifically addressed in Mr. Diehl’s follow-
up letter, AUF thoroughly reviewed these as demonstrated in the detailed exhibit attached to Mr.
Franklin’s supplemental direct testimony.

As more specifically set forth in Mr. Franklin’s rebuttal testimony, in 2007, our records indicate
that Mr. and Mrs. Diehl contacted the call center six times. On July 5, 2007, Mr. Diehl contacted
Aqua to establish service. On August 14, 2007, Mrs. Diehl contacted Aqua to correct the
spelling of their last name and to make a payment through Speedpay (she was having issues with
credit card acceptance and the issue was resolved). On November 11, 2007, Mrs. Diehl called
Aqua inquiring about a high bill. The CSR walked the customer through the steps to identify
possible high consumption within the property, and the customer confirmed that she has an
irrigation system. On November 27, 2007, Mrs. Diehl called and requested a reread of the meter.
On November 30, 2007, Mrs. Diehl called for an update and it was confirmed that the read fell in



line with the previous read. With each of these conversations, the Diehl issues were addressed
and no disconnection took place. Again, while we did not go into this type of detail in our
follow-up letters, we included a summary of it in Mr. Franklin’s supplemental direct testimony
and on page 5 of his rebuttal testimony.

Ms. Barretta

Ms. Barretta testified at the Chuluota public service hearing. She also filed a formal complaint
with the Florida Public Service Commission.

As indicated in Mr. Franklin’s supplemental direct testimony, Ms. Barretta complained about a
number of issues. Ms. Barretta indicated that she has called several times in the last several
months related to overbilling and shutoff notices. She indicated that she has spoken with 10
employees at Aqua and spent 150 minutes on the phone. She further indicated that she has been
promised a corrected bill 5 times, but had not received one, and was promised returned calls
twice, but did not receive them. Ms. Barretta also stated that she has been reading her own meter
and feels that Aqua's documented meter usage is wrong. Her meter was changed out as part of
the RF campaign in April, and she has had several issues since then. As indicated in Mr.
Franklin’s supplemental direct testimony, Ms. Barretta states that her bills go for 20k gals, 30k
gals, and 50k gals. Ms. Barretta stated that since Representative Sandy Adams has gotten
involved, she thinks Aqua has been much better and she has been happier with the service.

In response to Ms. Barretta’s formal complaint, the Company acknowledged that the
representative provided Ms. Barretta an incorrect reading. An apology was extended for the
misinformation and a courtesy credit in the amount of $222.00 was credited to the account. In
her follow-up letter emanating from the public service hearing, we noted her concern about her
monthly bills and state that we did not determine any discrepancies in her billing after our
customer service department reviewed her account. Based on our review, the customer’s main
concern was a billing issue and referenced the credit that was applied to her account. Again,
while the follow-up letter did not go into the specific details, AUF personnel visited her property
and obtained a meter reading on July 10, 2008, as evidenced in the response to the formal PSC
complaint.

We also created a service order to test the meter. AUF tested Ms. Barretta’s meter on July 15,
2008. The meter tested within the standards for meter function and the meter calibration is
accurate. The documents verifying the Company’s actions are included in the formal response to
the FPSC complaint, AUF’s tracking sheet, and the specific customer account notes.
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Report on AUF’s Responses to Barager, Conte and LeFiles Complaints

Patricia Barager — According to AUF’s records, this customer’s first water quality
complalnt was in the November 8" letter to the Florida Public Service Commission. A
review of the account indicates that there were no calls from the customer to AUF
complaining of sulfur smell in the water. The Company is aware of other complaints in
this area regarding the smell of sulfur in the water. There is a defined issue in the
distribution system that contributes to the sulfur smell and a weekly flushing program is
in place to help remedy this issue. Upon reading the customer’s letter, AUF staff
recognized that it was in response to an already identified problem, and that a site visit
was not necessary. Phone calls were made to this customer, but there was no answer for
the phone number listed in our system.

Robert LeFiles — This customer’s first water quality complaint was in his December 7th
letter to the Florida Public Service Commission. Our records do not indicate that we
received calls from Mr. LeFiles regarding water quality issues. In response to the
December 7™ letter, we spoke with the customer and informed him that we would test his
water quality. Upon review of our records, it does not appear that the phone call to Mr.
LeFiles took place within 48 hours of receipt of the letter agreement with FPSC staff, as
was done in other cases. However, the testing found no water quality issues and this was
reported to Mr. LeFiles directly. The Company did not respond to the portion in Mr.
LeFiles’ letter referencing his neighbor.

Darleen Conte - Upon receiving Ms. Conte’s letter, a call was directed to the Facility
Operator in this area to identify whether there were any issues in the distribution system
or water quality complaints were being received complaining of slimy or smelly water.
None were being reported. The customer’s first water quality complaint was in her
October 31st letter to the Florida Public Service Commission. We have no record of any
calls from Ms. Conte to Aqua complaining of deteriorating faucets. Unfortunately, our
records to do not indicate that a call was made to this particular customer immediately
after receiving the letter from the Commission, which is inconsistent with the policy that
was set up to handle this complaint. However, our field staff performed a PH and
chlorine test, which were within DEP standards, and a call was made to Ms. Conte to
confirm the test. After this action, the customer seemed satisfied with the results.

#5922038_vI
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REPORT ON FILING PERMIT APPLICATION STATUS
FOR PALM PORT, ZEPHYR SHORES, AND POMONA PARK

Zephyr Shores

See attached for Zephyr Shores Permit and Clearance.

Palm Port

See attached for Palm Port written response and required permit from the WMD.
Pamona Park

The Department of Environmental Protection (DEP) issued a Notice of Violation (NOV) on December
12, 2008, received by Aqua December 15, 2008. Aqua has been working with DEP to resolve the issues
with the NOV. There has been ongoing discussion between Aqua and DEP regarding permit authority for
wells. Rule 62-555.520, F.A.C., specifically indicates like-for-like replacement does not require a permit.
In addition, it is the responsibility of the Water Management District (WMD) to permit well construction.
Aqua has received the construction permit from the WMD. The permit is shown below.

Once the well has been constructed, a clearance request is submitted to DEP in order to place the well in
service. As requests for additional information are made by DEP, Aqua will respond accordingly.



Florida Department of Charte Cust

Environmental Protection Gronwines
Southwest District SR
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April 16, 2008 Seerctin
Jack M. Lihvarcik, President
Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc.
1100 Thomas Avenue
Leesburg, FI. 34748
Re:  Final Clearance
Project: Zephyr Shores Water System —~ New Well
FDEP Permit No.:  0282237-001-wC/20
PWS 1D No.: 651-2018
County: Pasco

Dear Mr. Lihvarcik:

The Department has received your Certification of Construction Completion and Request for Clearance
to Place Permitted PWS Components into Operation [FDEP Form 62-555.900(9)] and supporting
documents for the above-referenced project. This project was approved for construction under the FDEP
permit number identified above and completed with deviations, as noted in FDEP Form 62-555.900(9).

The submitted documents indicate counplianéc with the clearance procedures identified in Rule 62-
555.345, Florida Administrative Code. Therefore, the Department is issuing this letter of release to place
the above-referenced water treatment plant into service.

Please note that public water supply systems must comply with any changes and/or revisions to applicable
laws and regulations, which affect operating procedures and/or quality standards.

If you have any questions or comments, please contact me at (813) 632-7600, extension 316.

Sincerely,

Nargellie San Inoténcio
Engineering Specialist [l
Water Facilities

cc: Dale D. Ernsberger, P.E,, Civil Engineering Associates, Inc.

“Mare Protection, Less Process”
wiere dep.state fLax
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In the Matter of an

Application for Permit by:

Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc. Project: Zephyr Shores Water System — New Well
Mr. Jack M. Lihvarcik, President Permit No. 0282237-001-WC/20

1100 Thomas Avenue Zephyr Shores WTP, PWS 1D No. 651-2018
Leesburg, FL 34748 Pasco County

NOTICE OF PERMIT ISSUANCE

Enclosed is Permit Number 0282237-001-WC/20, to construct potable water well, issued
pursuant to Section(s) 403.087(1), Florida Statutes (F.S.).

A person whose substantial interests are affected by this permit may petition for an
administrative proceeding (hearing) in accordance with Section 120.57, F.S. The petition must
contain the information set forth below and must be filed (received) in the Office of General
Counsel of the Department at 3900 Commonwealth Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3000,
within 14 days of receipt of this Permit. Petitioner shall mail a copy of the petition to the
applicant at the address indicated above at the time of filing. Failure to file a petition within this
time period shall constitute a waiver of any right such person may have to request an
administrative determination (hearing) under Section 120.57, F.S.

The Petition shall contain the following information;

(a) The name, address, and telephone number of each petitioner, the applicant's name and
address, the Department Permit File Number and the county in which the project is
proposed;

(b) A statement of how and when each petitioner received notice of the Department's action
or proposed action,

(c) A statement of how each petitioner’s substantial interests are affected by the Department's
action or proposed action;

(d) A statement of the material facts disputed by Petitioner, if any;

(e) A statement of facts which petitioner contends warrant reversal or modification of the
Department's action or proposed action;

(f) A statement of which rules or statutes petitioner contends require reversal or modification
of the Department's action or proposed action; and

(g) A statement of the relief sought by petitioner, stating precisely the action petitioner wants
the Department to take with respect to the Department's action or proposed action.

More Protectiony, Less Process”
i depstate [l

FlOrida Depa[‘tment Of Charlie Crist

Gavernor

Kottkamp

L1, Gavernor

W tichael W. Sole

Secretary



‘PERMITTEE: Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc. PERMIT No. 0282237-001-WC/20
PROJECT: Zephyr Shores Water System — New Well

If a petition is filed, the administrative hearing process is designed to formulate agency action.
Accordingly, the Department's final action may be different from the position taken by it in this
permit. Persons whose substantial interests will be affected by any decision of the Department
with regard to the application have the right to petition to become a party to the proceeding. The
petition must conform to the requirements specified above and be filed (received) within 14 days
of receipt of this notice in the Office of General Counsel at the above address of the Department.
Failure to petition within the allowed time frame constitutes a waiver of any right such person has
to request a hearing under Section 120.57, F.S_, and to participate as a party to this proceeding.
Any subsequent intervention will only be at the approval of the presiding officer upon motion filed
pursuant to Rule 28-5.207, F.A.C.

This permit is final and effective on the date filed with the Clerk of the Department unless a
petition is filed in accordance with the above paragraphs or unless a request for extension of time
in which to file a petition is filed within the time specified for filing a petition and conforms to
Rule 62-103.070, F.A.C. Upon timely filing of a petition or a request for an extension of time this
permit will not be effective until further Order of the Department.

When the Order (Permit) is final, any party to the Order has the right to seek judicial review of the
Order pursuant to Section 120.68, F.S., by the filing of a Notice of Appeal pursuant to Rule 9.110,
Florida Rules of Appellate procedure, with the Clerk of the Department in the Office of General
Counsel, 3900 Commonwealth Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3000; and by filing a copy
of the Notice of Appeal accompanied by the applicable filing fees with the appropriate District
Court of Appeal. The Notice of Appeal must be filed within 30 days from the date the Final
Order is filed with the Clerk of the Department.

Executed in Hillsborough County, Florida.
STATE OF FLORIDA DEPARTMENT
OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
DRINKING WATER PROGRAM

Jeffry S. Greenwell, P E.
Water Facilities Administrator

Southwest District

JSG/nsi
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PERMITTEE: Aqua Utilities Florida, Inc. PERMIT No. 0282237-001-WC/20
PROJECT: Zephyr Shores Water System — New Well

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

This is to certify that this NOTICE OF PERMIT and all copies were mailed before the close of
businesson /o - 3D - ] to the listed persons.

Clerk Stamp

FILING AND ACKNOWLEDGMENT

FILED, on this date, pursuant to §120.52, Florida Statutes, with the designated Department Clerk,
receipt of which is hereby acknowledged.

(0-34-07
(Date)

Enclosure

cc: Mr. Dale D. Emsberger, P.E., [Civil Engineering Associates, Inc.]

Page 3 of 3



Williams, Patricia R.

From: Rauth, Tom [Tom.Rauth@dep.state.fl.us]

Sent: Monday, December 01, 2008 10:39 AM

To: smartelli@metzgerwiliard.com; ejpeellenz@aquaamerica.com; Williams, Patricia R.‘
Cc: Vo, Dung; Martin, Jeff; Brown, Drew S,

Subject: RE: Palm Port WWTF, FLAO11742-Permit Renewal

I received the certifica(ion pages for Form 2A, OMPR and CAR signed by Mr. Lihvarcik, who meets the
requirements of 62-620.305. The application is deemed complete as of November 6, 2008 and the
effectiveness of permit can be extended until final action is taken on the permit renewal.

Thank you for cooperation and if you have any questions, please let me know.
Tom Rauth

Permitting Engineer

Department of Environmental Protection

7825 Baymeadows Way, Suite B-200

Jacksonville, Florida 32256

Phone (904) 807-3343

Fax (904) 448-4366

tom rauth@dep state flus

http://www.floridadep.org/northeast/

The Department of Environmental Protection values your feedback as a customer. DEP Secretary
Michael W. Sole is committed to continuously assessing and improving the level and quality of services
provided to you. Please take a few minutes to comment on the quality of service you received. Simply
click on this link to the DEP Customer Survey. Thank you in advance for completing the survey.

12/18/2008
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Year-Specific Clarification to OPC’s Interrogatory No. 430

In response to the request by the Office of Public Counsel (OPC) to clarify year-specific
information relating to OPC’s Interrogatory No. 430, attached is the Severn Trent
analysis for 2008. The schedule presented to Witness Szczygiel at the Hearing by was
the 2005 schedule.

The following is the appropriate data for the 2007 test year, the proposed 5-year
amortization, and the resulting adjustment to test year expense. Per the attached schedule:

o Test year total expense incurred by Aqua FL in 2007 is $49,739.18. The expense
to AUF in the rate is $29,035.46.

e The AUF portion of 2008 Severn Trent expense is added. The sum of these two
years’ expense equals $48,790.46, and is the cost to have the Avatar system
available for two years. (Per FPSC regulations, utilities are required to maintain
records from system conversions for two years.)

e AUF proposes that an appropriate treatment of these expenses is to amortize this
cost over a five-year period; an annual expense of $9,758.09.

o The resulting reduction to 2007 test year expense is $19,277.37.



Aqua Flordia

AUF Portion of Severn Trent post conversion data availability fees
oo = :

=

6386 Total 124.38

6388 Tota! 92.92
6389 Total 367.22
6390 Total 45.98
6391 Total 1,095.27
6392 Total 374.43
6395 Total 133.98
6396 Total 167.34
6397 Total 75.73
6555 Total 143.47
6556 Total 151.67
6557 Total 62.85
6558 Total 639.61
6559 Total 73.83
6560 Total 62.85
6561 Total 54.65
6562 Total 124.38
6563 Total 77.92
6564 Total 92.92
6567 Total 285.69
6568 Total 367.24
6571 Total 241.17
6574 Total 1,227.33
6577 Total 2,813.29
6582 Total 593.50
6589 Total 868.39
6595 Total 185.01
6596 Total 167.35
6597 Total 128.30
6600 Total 75.74
6831 Total 99.75
6933 Total 109.67
6957 Total 3,703.11
6958 Total 7,143.60
6960 Total 6,934.83
6964 Total 421131
6965 Total 8,722.50
9001 Total 7,900.00
Grand Total 49,739.18

AUF Portion in Rate Case for 2007 expense

2008 Total State & AUF Portion of expense

Sum of 2008 & 2007 Severn Trent post conversion system availability expenses

Recommended five year amotization

Recommended adjustment to AUF Rate Case O&M for Severn Trent
($29035.46 Total 2007 AUF Severn Trent expense - less $9758.09 annual Severn Trent amortization)

AUF Portion
124.38
92.92
367.22
45.98
1,095.27
374.43
133.98
167.34

151.67

639.61

54.65
124.38

92.92
285.69
367.24
241.17

1,227.33

2,813.29
593.50
868.39
185.01
167.35
128.30

99.75
109.67
3,504.35
7,143.60
2,633.92

5,202.15

29,035.46

29,035.46

Month costs in 2008 #of Mos  AUF %

2500 12 65.85%_  19,755.00
48,790.46

9,758.09

(19,277.37)
T

Peace River
Citus Cty

Citus Cty

Citus Cty
Citus Cty

Citus Cty

Peace River

AUF Portion Only
AUF Portion Only
AUF Portion Only
Sarasota

Sarasota

AUF Portion Only
AUF Portion Only





