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Paula Isler 

From: Paula Isler 

Sent: Wednesday, March 18, 2009 8:56 AM 

To: 'emotina@vointine.com'; Samuel Arias; Alonzo Beyene 

Subject: RE: FW: TK111 - Eymol Corp. d/b/a Voinline Telecommunications Group 

Dear Mr. Molina: 

I cannot find record where the company notified this Commission that it had requested cancellation. 
looked back at the company's 2007 Regulatory Assessment Fee (RAF) return form, which was 
postmarked January 15, 2008, and there is no note on the form nor was there any correspondence 
attached to the form indicating the company was no longer operating. 'then checked the Florida 
Department of State, Division of Corporations' records and saw where you voluntarily dissolved the 
corporation with that agency about three weeks ago (February 26, 2009), however, we (the Florida Public 
Service Commission) were not notified until I received your e-mail this morning. 

I will now open a docket to cancel this IXC registration. Just as information, a recommendation will be 
filed for the Commission to deny Eymol Corp. d/b/a Voinline Telecommunications Group a voluntary 
cancellation and instead, recommend that the certificate be cancelled on the FPSC's own motion. Any 
unpaid fees will be turned over to collections. If the company ever decides to get back in the 
telecommunications business, it would have to pay all unpaid fees, including accrued statutory late 
payment charges, at that time. In addition to the 2008 RAF plus late payment charges, the company also 
owes the 2009 RAF. The late payment charges continue to accrue until the RAF is paid. 

Please let me know if you have any questions. Thanks. 

Paula Isler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee. FL 32399-0850 
(850) 413-6502-Phone 
(850) 413-6503-Fax 
Plsler@psc.state.fI.us 

From: emolina@voinline.com [mailto:voinline@gmail.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, March 18, 2009 12:05 AM 
To: Paula Isler; Samuel Arias; Alonzo Beyene 
Subject: Re: FW: TK111 - Eymol Corp. d/b/a Voinline Telecommunications Group 

Cancel the IXC certificate for Eyrnol Corp. This company no longer exists. Please note that 
Eymol Corp. stopped the telecommunicaions business operations in January 2008. And the 
officials made the proper shutdown of the company. 

Thanks, 
Eybar Molina 

On Mon, Mar 9, 2009 at 11 :32 AM, Paula Isler <PJ!Sler@psQ.st<lte,fJ,jJ~> wrote: 

3118/2009 
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Dear Mr. Molina: 

I've been following up on the 2008 Regulatory Assessment Fees (RAFs) and payment still has not 
been received. However, we did receive the company's 2008 RAF return form with the note "Business 
Closed" written on it. Are you requesting cancellation of the company's IXC certificate? If yes, please 
confirm via this e-mail and I will open a docket. In addition, please state the company's intention 
concerning payment of the 2008 and 2009 RAFs. 

Just as information, the RAF is owed jf a certificate is active for any day during a calendar year. This 
means that the company owes the 2008 and 2009 RAFs since we were not notified in 2008 to cancel 
the certificate. If the company wants a voluntary cancellation, the 2008 and 2009 RAFs must be paid 
at the time it requests cancellation. If the company is unable to pay the RAFs, then we would still 
cancel the certificate, it would be cancelled on the FPSC's own motion and any unpaid fees would be 
turned over to collections. Just in case the company wishes to leave in good standing, I am attaching 
the 2008 and 2009 RAF returns. 

Please let me know how the company wishes to proceed. Thanks. 

Paula Isler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 413-6502-Phone 
(850) 413-6503-Fax 
P Isler@psc.stateJI.lJS 

311812009 
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• 
Paula Isler 

From: Paula Isler 

Sent: Monday, March 09, 200911 :32 AM 

To: 'emolina@voinline.com' 

Cc: 'sarias@voinline.com' 

Subject: FW: TK111 - Eymol Corp. d/b/a Voinline Telecommunications Group 

Attachments: raf-tk111-08-0-r.pdf; raf-tk111-09-0-r.pdf 

Dear Mr. Molina: 

I've been following up on the 2008 Regulatory Assessment Fees (RAFs) and payment still has not been 
received. However, we did receive the company's 2008 RAF return form with the note "Business Closed" 
written on it. Are you requesting cancellation of the company's IXC certificate? If yes, please confirm via 
this e-mail and I will open a docket. In addition, please state the company's intention concerning payment 
of the 2008 and 2009 RAFs. 

Just as information, the RAF is owed if a certificate is active for any day during a calendar year. This 
means that the company owes the 2008 and 2009 RAFs since we were not notified in 2008 to cancel the 
certificate. If the company wants a voluntary cancellation, the 2008 and 2009 RAFs must be paid at the 
time it requests cancellation. If the company is unable to pay the RAFs, then we would still cancel the 
certificate, it would be cancelled on the FPSC's own motion and any unpaid fees would be turned over to 
collections. Just in case the company wishes to leave in good standing, I am attaching the 2008 and 
2009 RAF returns. 

Please let me know how the company wishes to proceed. Thanks. 

Paula Isler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 413-6502-Phone 
(850) 413-6503-Fax 
Plsler@psc.stateJI,us 

From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Friday, February 20, 2009 10:43 AM 
To: 'emolina@voinline.com' 
Subject: TKll1 - Eymol Corp. d/b/a Voinline Telecommunications Group 

Good morning: 

This morning (February 20, 2009), the Commission mailed out delinquent notices to those companies 
that either have not paid the 2008 Regulatory Assessment Fee (RAF) or have not paid the 
2008 RAF in full. Our records show that the company has not paid the 2008 RAF. I wanted to give 
you a heads up because those certificate holders not complying with the delinquent notices will 

3/912009 
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be automatically fined $500 for a first offense, $1,000 for a second offense, and $2,000 for a 
third offense. A copy of the Regulatory Assessment Fee rule is attached. 

If the company owes the minimum and if payment is postmarked between January 31 and March 1, 
the total due is $742, which is comprised of the $700 minimum RAF, $35 penalty, and $7 interest. 
If payment is postmarked between March 2 and March 31, the total due is $784, which is 
comprised of the $700 minimum RAF, $70 penalty, and $14 interest. A copy of the 2008 RAF 
return form is also attached. Please complete it and return it with full payment, including the late 
payment charges. Just as information, late payment charges (penalty and interest) continue to 
accrue until the RAF is paid. 

If your records show that payment was made, let me know right away by providing me with the 
check number and the date payment was mailed so that I can research this further. Please let me 
know if you have any questions. Thanks. 

Paula Isler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 413-6502-Phone 
(850) 413-6503-Fax 
PIsler@.p~~,s.tqtej I,t,t~ 

3/9/2009 


mailto:ler@.p~~,s.tqtej


TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGUlATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 0113012009 

Interexchange Company Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

STATUS: 

Actual Return 
Estimated Return 
Amended Return 

PERIOD COVERED: 
0110112008 TOn:-g!31!2cm 

..:t' ;a:­

~me~pany)-q: 

ge i5 

Florida Public Service Commission 
(S.., Filing instructions on Back o(Form) 

TKll1-08-0-R 
Voinline Telecommunications Group 
7105 S.W. 8th Street, Suite 306 
Miami, FL 33144-4664 

Please Complete Below IfOfficial Mailing Address Has Cbanged 

(Address) 

LfNE 
NO. I..u ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION 

FOR PSC USE ONLY 

Check # No LheckJIj;j. 
5> --*"'---t="'", 

$ ­ .....~,~----=,;"'" 
003001 

06-03-001 
~, 004011 

Postmark Date ~~~~~~~_ 
Initials of Preparer _-=~___ 

t 
2. 
3. 
4. 
5. 

Long Dista'Jfe Services 

Access Services 

5> ______-#~_____ 

Miscellaneous Services 

Private Line Services 

Leased Facilities & Circuits Services Q 
TOTAL Telepbone Services \. t'\. 
LESS: Amounts Paid to Telecommunications Companies(l) \ 'i ) ( .; 

6. 

7. 

TOTAL REVENUES For Regulatory Assessment Fe Calculaf , \ ?7 
// 

8. 

9. 
10. 
II. 
12. 

13. 

) Facilities-Based Carrier 
) Alternate-Operator Service 

Complete below if billing agent is other than yourself. 

(Name) 
What is the total amount of customer deposits collected? 

Amount: for 20 

CURREN 

) Reseller 
) Rebiller 

/" .•..
",,,­

$ m -------------­

t fee of $700 shall be imposed as provided in 

ATlJS 

( ) Call Aggregator 
( ) Other: 

(Address: City/State/Zip) / ../ (Telephone) 
What is~ttretotal amount of bond held (if applicable)? 
pm6~nt: $ Expires: _______ 

COMPANY INFORMATlON 

Do you lease telecommunications' facilities? ( ) YES ) NO 
If YES, who do you lease these facilities from? Name: 

Address: 

I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above 
information is a true and correct statement. I am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes. whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with 
the intent to mislead a public servant in the performance of his/her duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree. 

(Signature of Company Official) (Title) (Date) 

(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 
Telephone Number Fax Numbcr ( """----'--------­

FEL No. _________________________ 
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TO AVOID PENAI.TY ANIlINTERES r CHAKGES, TilE KEGlJl.ATORY ASSESSMENT FEF. RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 0113012008 

Interexchange Company Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

(Name of Company) 	 (Address) (City/State) (Zip) 

(2) Regardless of the gross operating revenue of a company, a minimum annual regulatory assessment fee of $700 shall be imposed as provided in 
Section 364.336, Florida Statutes. 

CURRENT COMPANY STATUS 

) Facilities-Bascd Car.-ier ()c1' Reseller ( ) Call A£grcgator 
) Alternate-Operator Service ( ') Rebiller ( ) Other: 

BILLING INFORMATION 

Complete below if billing agent is other than yourself. 

(Name) (Address: City/State/Zip) (Telephone) 
What is the total amo,~~y of c{)omer deposits collected? What is the total amount of bond held (if applicable)? 

Amount: $ L. 0 for 20~ Amount: $ Expires: ______ 

COMPANY INFORMATION 

Do you lease telecommunications' facilities? ( ) YES r>q NO 
If YES, who do you lease these facilities from? Name: 

Address: 

I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above 
information is rue and correct statement. I am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with 

blic servant in the performance of hislher duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree. -+­
Surf! Vel A'(,'dS - Y.'c e ~rej ,'dent d/II/.<oo8 

atu~e of Company Official) ~ -+ (Title) . (Date) 

- VI c..e PI't:S iJCYJ I Telephone Number <1(5) "10{ 3 -5~J~ Fax Number ()u5) =<6/- ~,~{X 
(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 

F.E.I. No. ,; () -0116 ]':t 

STATUS: 

/' 	 Actual Return 


Estimated Return 

Amended Return 


PERIOD COVERED: 
01/0112007 TO 12/3112007 

Florida Public Service Commission 
(See fOilill~ InstruC'lions on Back of Fornt) 

TK111-07-0-R 
Voinline Telecommunications Group 
7I 05 S. W. 8th Street, Suite 306 
Miami, FL 3314:4.:-.4664. . 

',: :?O~II LIJd ...... 

JAN 2 Z Z008 

Please Complete Below IrOrlicial Mailing Address Has Changed 

FOR psc liSE ONLY 

Check # Lq, q4 
$ -, ()C) . ~ 06-0)-001 

OOJOOI 
$ ______ E 

$-----_P 06-03-001 

$_----­

Postmark Date 1- l'5 - a ~ 
Initials of Preparer t?;T' 

LINE 
NO. 

I. 

2. 

3. 

4. 
5. 

6. 

7. 

ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION 

Long Distance Services 
Access Services 
Private Line Services 
Leased Facilities & Circuits Services 
Miscellaneous Services 

TOTAL Telephone Services 

LESS: Amounts Paid to Telecommunications Companies!') 

INTRASTATE REVENUE 

$ '3,0 0-' 08 

$ 0 , DO 
0,00 

8. TOTAL REVENUES For Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation 

9. Regulatory Assessment Fee Due (Multiply Line 8 by 0.0020) 
10. Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 
II. Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 
12. Extension Payment Fee (see "4. Extension" on back) 

13. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE ($700,00 MINIMUM) 

(I) These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable (see "2. Fees" on back). 

$ Ot Df) 
0, () () 

B.oo 
$ '10Q, 00 
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, USPS - Track & Confirm Page 1 of 1 

Track & Confirm 


Search Results 
label/Receipt Number: 700627600003 8794 9048 

Associated Label/Receipt: 

Detailed Results: 


• Delivered, March 03, 2009,9:43 am, TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399 
• Moved, Left no Address, February 26, 2009, 9:29 am, MIAMI, FL 
• Undeliverable as Addressed, February 23, 2009, 9:48 am, MIAMI, FL 33144 
• Arrival at Unit, February 23, 2009, 5:57 am, MIAMI, FL 33144 

(~.!!~.~~) 

Notification Options 

Track & Confirm by email 

Get current event information or updates for your item sent to you or others by email. (ii..~-?) 

Track & ConflfUl 
Enter Label/Receipt Number. 

L 

http://trkcnfrml.smi.usps.com/PTSlntemetWeb/lnterLabeIDetail.do 3/18/2009 

http://trkcnfrml.smi.usps.com/PTSlntemetWeb/lnterLabeIDetail.do
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Voinline Telecommunications Group 

7105'S.W. 8th Street, Suite 306 
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Mcn Company Information for TKlll 

Printed on 03/30/2009 at 16:13:09 by PJI 

Company Code: 

Complete Name: 

Mailmg Name: 

Certificate No(s): 

Status: 

Regulation Date: 

Bankruptcy:

Company Liaison #1: 

Title: 

Mailing Address: 


Physical Location: 


Phone: 

Fax: 


Related Dockets: 


060691-TI 


070544-TI 


TKlll 
Eymol Corp. d/b/a Voinline Telecommunications Group 
Voinline Telecommunications Group 

Active 
1011912006 
No 
Eybar Molina 
President 
7105 S.W. 8th Street, Suite 306 

Miami, FL 33144-4664 
7105 S.W. 8th Street, Suite 306 

Miami, FL 33144-4664 
(305) 322-5414 
(707) 736-7652 

Acknowledgment of registration as intrastate interexchange 
telecommunications company, effective October 19, 2006, by Eymol
Corp. d/b/a Voinline Telecommunications Group. 

Compliance investi~~tion ofIXC Registration No. TKll1, issued to 
Eymol Corp. d/b/a voinline Telecommunications Group, for 
apparent first-time violation of Section 364.336, F.S. 

4 



