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1. Division Name/Staff Name: | Division Of Regulatory Compliance/lsler bug‘ii/éx 3 ‘,OH
2. OPR: -
3. OCR: | Office of the General Counsel

4. Suggested Docket Title: | Compliance investigation of CLEC Certificate No. 5186, issued to MET Communications,
inc., for apparent second-time violation of Rule 25-4.0161, F.A.C., Regulatory Assessment
Fees; Telecommunications Companies.

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)
A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company.
B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.)

1. Parties and their representatives (if any):

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any):

6. Check one:

XI Documentation is attached.
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April 10, 2009

TX104-08-0-P

MET Communications, Inc.
P.O.Box 17180

T FL 33682-7180 <& . _ —r
e SECOND NOTICE

Dear Sir or Madam:

Our records indicate that the envelope enclosing your Regulatory Assessment Fee payment for the
period January 1, 2008, through December 31, 2008, was postmarked after the due date of January 30,
2009. In accordance with Florida Statute 350.113(4), penalty and interest charges are assessed as
follows:

RAF Due $356.91
Penalty Due 60.00
Interest Due 12.00
Total Due $428.91

To avoid additional charges, your payment must be postmarked or hand delivered to the above
address by April 24, 2009. Your check should be made payable to the Florida Public Service
Commission.

If you have any questions, please call David Brown at (850) 413-6267.
Sincerely,
X aren gz/;:hr

Karen Belcher
Fiscal Services Supervisor

KOB/db
cc: Fiscal Services Section

CAPITAL CIRCLE OFFICE CENTER @ 2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULEVARD ® TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0850
An Affirmative Action / Equal Opportunity Employer
PSC Website: http://www.floridapsc.com Internet E-mail: contact@psc.state.fl.us
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March 9, 2009
TX104-08-0-P
MET Communications, Inc.
P.O.Box 17180
Tampa, FL 33682-7180

Dear Sir or Madam:

Our records indicate that the envelope enclosing your Regulatory Assessment Fee payment for the
period January 1, 2008, through December 31, 2008, was postmarked after the due date of January 30,
2009. In accordance with Florida Statute 350.113(4), penalty and interest charges are assessed as

follows:

RAF Due $356.91
Penalty Due 60.00
Interest Due 12.00
Total Due $428.91

To avoid additional charges, your payment must be postmarked or hand delivered to the above
address by March 23, 2009. Your check should be made payable to the Florida Public Service
Commission.

If you have any questions, please call David Brown at (850) 413-6267.
Sincerely,

X aren gzé Aer

Karen Belcher
Fiscal Services Supervisor

KOB/db
cc: Fiscal Services Section

CAPITAL CIRCLE OFFICE CENTER ® 2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULEVARD ¢ TALLARASSEE, F1. 32399-0850

An Aflirmative Action / Equal Opporianity Employer
PSC Website: http/Awww.lloridapsc.com Internet E-mnall: contact@psestate.flus
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Paula Isler

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Thursday, March 26, 2009 3:40 PM

To: ‘jorgetkb@yahoo.com’

Subject: RE: TX104 - MET Communications, inc.

Attachments: tx104-08-0-d-0.pdf; tx104-08-0-r-0.pdf; tx104-08-balance pdf

Dear Mr. Gutierrez:

I wanted to let you know that the Commission received MET Communications, Inc.'s partial payment of
the 2008 Regulatory Assessment Fee, but not the balance, including late payment charges. Our records
show that the company has a balance of $428.91 (breakdown attached) and must be paid to avoid the
automatic fine of $500. The delinguent notice was delivered to your company on February 26th. Please
pay immediately if you wish to keep your certificate active. Thanks and let me know if you have any
questions.

Paula isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850
(850) 413-6502-Phone

{850) 413-6503-Fax
Plsler@psc.state.fl.us

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, February 23, 2009 10:33 AM
To: 'jorgetkb@yahoo.com'

Subject: TX104 - MET Communications, Inc.

Good morning:

On Friday, February 20, 2009, the Commission mailed out delinquent notices to those companies
that either have not paid the 2008 Regulatory Assessment Fee (RAF) or have not paid the

2008 RAF in full. Our records show that the company has not paid the 2008 RAF. I wanted to give
you a heads up because those certificate holders not complying with the delinquent notices will

be automatically fined $500 for a first offense, $1,000 for a second offense, and $2,000 for a
third offense. A copy of the Regulatory Assessment Fee rule is attached.

If the company owes the minimum and if payment is postmarked between January 31 and March 1,
the total due is $636, which is comprised of the $600 minimum RAF, $30 penalty, and $6 interest.
If payment is postmarked between March 2 and March 31, the total due is $672, which is
comprised of the $600 minimum RAF, $60 penalty, and $12 interest. A copy of the 2008 RAF
return form is also attached. Please complete it and return it with full payment, including the late
payment charges. Just as information, late payment charges (penalty and interest) continue to

3/26/2009
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accrue until the RAF is paid.

If your records show that payment was made, let me know right away by providing me with the
check number and the date payment was mailed so that I can research this further. Please let me
know if you have any questions. Thanks.

Paula Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL. 32399-0850
(850) 413-6502-Phone

(850) 413-6503-Fax
PIsier@psc.state.flus

3/26/2009
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) Contact Us 'E-Filing Ser#sces o Document Searches

Detail by Entity Name

Florida Profit Corporation
MET COMMUNICATIONS, INC.

Filing Information

Document Number P97000029230
FEVEIN Number 593435918

Date Filed 03/31/1997
State FL

Status ACTIVE

Last Event AMENDMENT

Event Date Filed 08/24/2006
Event Effective Date NONE
Principal Address

13920 N. FLORIDA AVE ;
TAMPA FL 33613 US

Changed 01/03/2007

Mailing Address

PO BOX 17180
TAMPA FL 33682

Changed 01/04/2005

Registered Agent Name & Address

GUTIERREZ, JORGE E
13920 N. FLORIDA AVE
TAMPA FL 33613 US

Name Changed: 08/24/2008
Address Changed: 01/03/2007

Officer/Director Detail
Name & Address
Title PS

GUTIERREZ, JORGE E
13920 N. FLORIDA AVE
TAMPA FL 33613

Title VP

GUTIERREZ, TAMARA
13920 N. FLORIDA AVE
TAMPA FL 33613

Annual Reporis

http://ccfcorp.dos.state.fl.us/scripts/cordet.exe?action=DETFIL&inq doc_number=... 4/13/2009
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SENDER: COMPLETE THIS SECTION

B Complete items 1, 2, and 3. Also complete
itern 4 if Restricted Delivery Is desired.

; W Print your namse and address on the reverse

i so that we can return the oard to you.

; B Attach this card to the back of the mailplece,
or on the front if space permits.

COMPLETE THIS SECTION ON DELIVERY

VW&Q 53

D Addressee

by{Pdn ueme) / | . Date of Delvery
Ym:a Godmo_s',

£, Is delivery address Gifferent

j.»ArticlaAddrmedto: i YES, enter delivery addreg; W‘FE
~TX104-08-0-D \ 26
i MET Communications, Inc. F\ ? 3/
P. O. Box 17180 ol <
_ Tampa, FL 33682-7180 3. Service Type W“
' Certified Mall [ Express Mat
! Registersd  1S1_Retum Receipt for Mercharxtios
| O insured Mail 1 G.OD.
i 4. Restrictsd Delivery? (Extra Foe) 0 Yoo
1 2. Article Number , 700k 27L0 DOO3 8794 BbL1LY

PS Form 3811, February 2004

Domestic Retum Receipt
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500 Stiom

Company Code:
Complete Name:
Mailing Name:
Certificate No(s):
Status:

Regulation Date:
Bankruptcy;
Company Liaison #1:
Title:

Mailing Address:

Physical Location:
Phone:
Fax:

Related Dockets:
970485-TX

971211-TP

971366-TP

971581-TP

980322-TX

980871-TP

981967-TX

991593-TP

991948-TP

001767-TP

011395-TP

MCD Company Information for TX104

Printed on 04/13/2009 at 08:26:34 by PJI

TX104

MET Communications, Inc.
MET Communications, Inc.
5186

Active

07/25/1997

No

Jorge E. Gutierrez
President/Secretary

P. O.Box 17180

Tampa, FLL 33682-7180
13920 North Florida Avenue

Tampa, FL 33613-3231
813) 936-0200
813) 936-2668

Application for certificate to provide alternative local exchange
telecommunications service by MET Communications, Inc.

Petition by GTE Florida Incorporated for approval of resale
agreement with MET Communications, Inc.

Request by BellSouth Telecommunications, Inc. for approval of
resale agreement negotiated with MET Communications pursuant to
Section 252(e) of the Telecommunications Act of 1996.

Petition by Sprint-Florida, Incorporated for approval of resale
agreement with MET Communications, Inc.

Request for name change on Alternative Local Exchange
Telecommunications Certificate No. 5186 from MET Communications,
Inc. to MET Communications, Inc. d/b/a The Fone Company.

Request by BellSouth Telecommunications, Inc. for approval of
amendment to resale agreement with MET Communications, Inc.
plu9r3\éant to Sections 251 and 252 of the Telecommunications Act of

Cancellation by Florida Public Service Commission of Alternative
Local Exchange Telecommunications Certificate No. 5186 issued to
MET Communications, Inc. for violation of Rule 25-4.0161, F. A.C,,

Regulatory Assessment Fees; Telecommunications Companies.

Request by MET Communications, Inc. for approval of resale
agreement with ALLTEL Florida, Inc.

Request by BellSouth Telecommunications, Inc. for approval of
resale agreement with MET Communications, Inc.

Petition for approval of first amendment to resale agreement
between Verizon Florida Inc. and MET Communications, Inc.

Request by BellSouth Telecommunications, Inc. for approval of
resale agreement with MET Communications, Inc.

1



011488-TX

020039-TP

030173-TP

040418-TP

041125-TP

050603-TP

060395-TP

MCD Company Information for TX104

Printed on 04/13/2009 at 08:26:34 by PJI

Compliance investigation of MET Communications, Inc. for apparent
Iz‘iolat(iion of Section 364.183(1), F.S., Access to Company
ecords.

Request by Quincy Telephone Company d/b/a TDS Telecom/Quincy
Telephone for approval of resale agreement with Met
Communications, Inc.

Re?uest. for approval of interconnection, unbundling, resale, and
ollocation agreement between BellSouth Telecommunications, Inc.
and MET Communications, Inc.

Request for approval of amendment to interconnection, unbundling,
resale, and collocation agreement between BellSouth
Telecommunications, Inc. and MET Communications, Inc.

Request for approval of amendment to interconnection, unbundling,
resale, and collocation agreement between BellSouth
Telecommunications, Inc. and MET Communications, Inc.

Request for approval of interconnection, unbundling, resale, and
collocation agreement between BellSouth Telecommunications, Inc.
and MET Communications, Inc.

Request for approval of resale agreement between GTC, Inc. d/b/a
GT Com and MET Communications, Inc.



