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REDACTED

Costello, Jeanne

From: Wails, J. Michael
Sent: Monday, January 26, 2009 1:18 PM
To: ‘Burnett, John'
Cc: Sasso, Gary L., Costello, Jeanne
Subject: FW: PEF Fee Proposal
Attachments: 2009 Progress Energy Fee Proposal .pdf
(L
2009 Progress
Energy Fee Propo...

Confidential: This e-mail contains a communication protected by the attorney-client
privilege or constitutes work product. If you do not expect such a communication please
delete this message without reading it or any attachment and then notify the sender of
this inadvertent mis-delivery. ‘

John,

This email will confirm our discussion today in which PEF agreed to | in the
fee proposal attached to this email. This fee proposal will take effect for a PEF
matters for January 2009 and subsequent months. As I indicated, I will review the priocr
budget numbers for the rate case and NCRC proceeding and get back to you with any
revisions. :

Thank you for your attention to this matter.

Mike

DOCUMENG RUMBTR-TATE

DLO93 MAY-1 G
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ATLANTA
MLAMY
ORANDO

5T, PETERSBURG
TALAHASSEE

CARLTON FIELDS WEST PR BEACH

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 4211 W, Boy Seou Bovievard
Suite 1000
Tampo, Floride 33407-5780
PO, Box 2229
Tompo, Forida 334013239

James Michael Wolls 813.223.7000
812,229 4257 dwad 913.229.4733 ox
wols@corbonbelds.com werw.£otlion!ighth.com
Nevember 5, 2008
CONFIDENTIAL AND PROPRIETIARY

Alex Glenn John T. Burnett

Genero| Counsel - Florida Associate General Counsel - Florida

Progress Energy Service Company, LLC Progress Energy Service Company, LLC

Legal PEF - 151 legal . PEF - 151

299 1st Ave N 299 1" Avenue N

St. Petersburg, FL 33701 St. Petersburg, FL 33701

Re: 2009 Carlion Fields Fee Proposal
Alex and jchn,

| have discussed fees and/or budgets for matters we have with PEF in 2009 with both of you so |
wanted to provide this proposal to you both. The aitached “Fee Proposal for 2009 PEF Maters”
provides PEF with two alternative options for 2009 fees for PEF matters with Carlion Fields. Either
option, if selected by PEF, is acceptable to us. Upon accepiance, the ofes in the proposol
would take effect November 2008, which is when our budget year commences.

We value our relationship with you and PEF. We believe the attached proposal demonstrates our
commitment to that relationship. As always, the -; m: -fp indicated in the

attached proposal and exhibit are confidential, proprietary business information to us and we
request that you maintain its confidentiality.

If either of you have any questions obout the fee proposal, please give me o call.
Sincerely,
V3
Jomes Michael Walls
Enc!.

1416892110
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CONFIDENTIAL AND PROPRIETARY

Fee Proposal for 2009 PEF Matters
Option A:

All matters billed at the discounted hourly rates represented in the attached Exhibit. The rate for
Mike Walls is capped at -r and the other Carlton Fields attorneys who are or havi iicnl]y

worked on PEF matters, as indicated in the attached exhibit, will be bilied | [l

-s.1|1 ]tla - Any other attorney at Carlton Fields who works ona
matter in 2009 would also be billed |t il

Carlton Fields will, at the request of PEF, develop litigation or other matter budgets and work
toward completing all work within those budgets but it is understood that the budgets are not
binding and are subject to adjustment for unforeseen or unusual events, activities, or
circumstances. Carlton Fields will discuss potential adjustments to the prior budget estimates
with PEF in an attempt to provide updated budgets.

Option B:
Carlton Fields will comumit to the following:

(1). 2009 Rate Case:

Carlton Fields last provided PEF with]a—: proposal of] !D at PEF’s request

upon the understanding that PEF in-house counsel were taking on a larger role in the handling of
the rate case, as identified in the witness assignments. Based upon that same understanding, and
based upon the understanding that PEF in-house counsel have been asked to achieve budget

efficiencies of five percent (5%), Carlton Fields will commit to i proposal for the 2009
rate caseJJ

FD.S .Glr*l. I < proposal excludes all costs. The
ministerial task of marking confidential documents for production in discovery is included in
costs and also excluded from ). We anticipate that PEF will handle this

task in-house or retain hourly workers to handie it.

E-D e - h—s-'»- I o ot

cover any motions for reconsideration or appeals from a Commuission f{inal order in the rate case.
If the rate case settles at any time prior to a final Commission order, Carlton Fields agrees that it
will be paid only for the fees incurred up to the point the settlement is signed, to the extent that

its fees areqr'slt 1 oy 0 L Fm h |
-h-r-c 1t LI n g 2 B = also

does not include any appeal from any seltlement approved by the Commission. Carlton Fields is

willing to work with PEF on the timing of the payment of fees incurred and billed to address any
PEF cash flow issues.

(2). 2009 NCRC Proceeding:

Carlton Fields provided PEF at PEF’s request with a budget 0-0 for the fees for the 2009
nuclear cost recovery clause proceeding for the CR3 Uprate project and Levy Nuclear Project

14138590.2 lof2
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CONFIDENTIAL AND PROPRIETARY

costs. Carlton Fields will commit toJ -3!1 for the 2009 NCRC proceeding [
.. JIE: vroposal excludes all costs. 1 he ministerial task of marking confidential
ocuments for production in discovery is included in costs and excluded | NN

We anticipate that PEF will handle this task in-house or retain hourly workers to
andie it.

B -I) I: covers the NCRC proceeding through post-hearing briefs. -tik
does not cover any motions for reconsideration or appeals from a Commission final order. If the
NCRC proceeding is settled at any time prior to a final Commission order, Carlton Fields agrees
that it will be paid only for the fees incurred up to the point the settlement is signed, to the extent

that its fees areqsli . 1 & y \ 1}
- - 2 . Il
> does not include any appeal from any settlement approved by the Commussion. Carlton

Ficlds is willing to work with PEF on the timing of the payment of fees incurred and billed 1o
address any PEF cash flow issues.

(3). - All Other On-Going or Potential PEF matters:

Carlton Fields attomeys will bill their time 2t ISR [ oms: NN v: DN - IO

Carlton Fields will, at the request of PEF, develop litigation or other matter budgets and work
toward completing all work within those budgets but it is understood that the budgets are not
binding and are subject to adjustment for unforeseen or unusual events, activities, or

circumstances. Carlton Fields will discuss potential adjustments to the prior budget estimates
with PEF in an attempt to provide updated budgets.

141385602 2of 2
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CONFIDENTIAL AND PROPRIETARY
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&f Progress Energy

May 21, 2008

ABSG Consulting
475 14" Street, Suite 550
Oakland, CA 94612-4036

Attention: Mr. Steven P. Harris

Contract No. 24203
Amendment No. 12
Effective May 21, 2008

This Amendment is governed by the terms and conditions of the above-referenced
Contract. By this Amendment, Progress Energy Service Company, LLC offers to add the
folowing Scope of Work as follows:

Contractor is to perform Hurricane Modeling and Quantification for Progress
Energy Florida (PEF} by developing a2 loss assessment computer model of PEF
Transmission and Distribution (T & D) assets and fo perform probabilistic property
damage analyses for hurricane exposures as per Contractor’s proposal dated May 15, 2008
(Attachment A).

The Work authorized by this Amendment is not Nuclear Safety Related.

As full compensation for completion of this Work, Owner will pay
Contractor the firm fixed pricr uponr acceptance of Work and receipt of a
correct invoice. The amount o will cover Scope of Work Sections L. Hurricane
Loss Analyses (includes Task # 1-3 at a cos and Task 4 at a cost
respectively) and Section I1. Storm Reserve Solvency Analyses which includes Task 5 at a
cos . Section III. Preparation of Testimony will be charged on a time and
materials rate if necded.

Work shall begin week of May 21, 2008 and shall be complete not later 12/31/2008
as agreed to by Contractor and Owner’s Designated Representative.

Progreas Energy Service Company, LLC
P0. Box 1491
Raleigh, NC 27602

¥220044
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Page 2, Contract No. 24203, Amendment No. 12

;82 Progress Energy

Owner’s Designated Representative for the Work authorized by this Amendment is Mr,
Gary Little. Invoices for Work performed should be sent to him at Progress Energy
Service Co., LLC, PO Box 1551, Raleigh, NC 27602.

All other terms in the Contract or other Contract Amendments remain unchanged.

Please execute this Amendment, retain onc original copy for your file, and return
the other original within ten (10) calendar days to Leanne Borgen, Progress Energy Service
Company, L1C, P. O. Box 1551 (PEB 2), Raleigh, NC 27602. Please call me at (919) 546 -
2925 if questions.

Since§ely, Q
(~ ‘/%nne Borgen 517?‘4.'

Sourcing Specialist
Corporate Services Department

Attachment A

Accepted:

ABSG CQ LTING
-
B‘ '{7 s T T}77‘4’~ e NS

J
Name (printed):&,}"’fé’:‘\j W/g[ g-
Title: ;'/fc;:? zf%‘é“s//be/

Date: -Sf_" L2 -C&

Should the person's titie who is executing this document not indicate that he/she is a corporate
officer, an affidavit signed by a corporate officer shall be provided stating that the person whose
name appears above is duly authorized to execute Contracts.

Progress Energy Service Company, LEC
PE Box 1551
Raleagh, NC 27502

09RP-OPCP(OD1-46-000038



REDACTED
Ataein v et A &) P&ﬁég j

)

22 ABS Consulting

K4

May 15, 2008
Mr. Gary Little
Risk Manager
Progress Energy
Raleigh, NC

Subject: ABS Consulting Proposal for Progress Energy Florida
Hurricane Transmission and Distribution Loss Estimation
and Reserve Soivency Study

Dear Mr. Little;

ABS Consulling is pleased to provide the following proposal to perform analyses of
Progress Energy Florida's (PEF} transmission and distribution (T&D) hurricane loss
exposures and performance of storm Reserve analyses.

SCOPE OF WORK

Hurricane Modeling and Quantification - ABS Consulting proposes to develop a loss
assessment computer model of Flerida Frogress’ transmission and distribution (T&D)
assets and to perform probabilistic property damage analyses for hurricane exposures.

The analyses will involve the following tasks:

l. Hurricane Loss Analyses

Task 1 - Model Development

ABS Consulting will develop a hurricane exposure model of Progress Florida's
T&D using the EQECAT WORLDCATenterprise™ proprietary catastrophe
software. Distribution asset replacement values will be geo-coded on a sub zip
code grid using Progress Florida’s data to capture the distribution of T&D assets
within Progress Florida's service territory. Each transmission structure would be
modeled by a representative replacement value for its voltage class.

Task 2 - Asset Vulnerabilities

Storm vulnerabilities of transmission and distribution assets will be developed and
calibrated to Progress Florida's loss data from the recent 2004 hurricanes Charlie,
Frances and Jeanne as well as other industry data.

Task 3 - Probabilistic Risk Analysis

The analysis and results that will be provided are described in this section. The
resufts will include the expected annual aggregate loss exceedance curve and the
expected annual loss.

ABSG Consulting Inc. » 475 14th St. Suite 550 » Oakiand, CA 84612-4036 USA » Tel: 510-817-3105 »
Fax: 510-663-1048

www . absconsulting.com
Page 1
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Progress Florida Hurricans T&D
Loss Estimation & Storm Solvency Studies
May 15, 2008

Aggregate Annual Loss Distribution

Expected aggregate, non-exceedance toss curves, will be provided considering all
hurricane events. The non-exceedance curves will be developed to describe the
annualized loss distribution of Progress Florida's portfolio of assets using the
*Long-Term" hurricane hazard distribution.

Expected Annual Property Loss

Catastraphic computer hurricane simulations wilt be performed to assess and
quantify the potential losses. The probabilistic analyses of a full range of event
frequencies and severities will be performed to estimate the expected annual loss
from hurricanes to transmission and distribution assets. The expected annual loss
represents the "pure risk”, over a long period of time, o repair or restore property
damage caused by hurricane events,

Benchmark Studies.

Benchmark studies wili be performed to calibrate the T&D model developed. While
storm loss modeling involves many uncertainties, our experience to date has been
that loss studies that have incorporated benchmark studies against utility loss
histories show reasonable correlation of results. Progress Energy Florida's dollar
loss statistics from recent hurricanes Charlie, Frances and Jeanne will be used in
performing these benchmark studies along with other available industry data.

Task 4. - Report

The resulis of the foregoing tasks will be presented in a report, documenting the
underlying modeling and analyses performed. This report will deseribe the risk
profile of Progress Energy Florida's T&D assets.

~
!

Il. Storm Reserve Solvency Analyses
Task 5. — Reserve Fund Modeling and Analysis

Storm solvency analyses will be performed incorporating the loss distributions from
the hurricane loss analyses performed above. Four to six annual accruals cases will
be simulated. The Reserve Fund model wifl begin each year of the simulation with a
beginning balance. Earnings and expenses (if any) will be credited or debited to the
account for the simulation period. Hurricane losses will be debited as they oceur,
The fund balance will be computed each year-end.

Annual accruals will be simulated for reserve funding strategies. These may include
accruals only, initial Reserve securitization or other methods of funding. The
Reserve fund mode! will begin each year of the simulation with a beginning balance.
Eamings and expenses will be credited or debited to the account for the simulation
pertod, Storm related losses will be debited as they occur. The Reserve fund
balance with 5th and 95th percentile upper and iower bounds, and the probabiiity of
Reserve fund insolvency will be computed for each year-end.

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA

Page 2
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Progress Florda Huricane T&D
Loss Estimation & Storm Solvency Studies
May 15, 2008

The results of the foregoing tasks will be presented in a report, documenting the
underlying modeling and analyses performed. This report will describe the
performance of Progress Florida's Reserve fund given accrual and iniial balance
strategies.

[i: PREPARATION OF TESTIMONY

ABS Consulting can provide support Progress Energy Florida with expert testimony,
consultation and analytics regarding Progress Energy Florida's potential filing
before the Florida Public Service Commission relating to Reserve Fund, annual
Reserve Fund accrual, and storm costs. ABS Consulting would provide these
expert services as requested and in consuitation with Progress Energy Florida staff
and legal counsel on a time and materials basis:

- el

REQUIRED INFORMATION

Transmission and Distribution Assets

it is anticipated that transmission and distribution (T&D) asset data will be available from
Progress Energy Florida as undepreciated replacement cost. Distribution data by zip
code, if available will be used to produce revised valuation distributions at a sub-zip
level. Updated fransmission structure iatlong database with voltage and structure type
definitions along with estimates of structure replacement costs on a structure type basis
wiil be utilized to model the tfransmission assets. Distribution asset data will be provided
in the consensus format from the AEGIS working group.

Historical Loss Data,
Data on historical losses will be required for mode! calibration. This should include data

from the 2004 hurricane season and other losses.

Cost data should include a breakout of capital and O&M (or {abor) costs for storm
restoration activities for T&D separately and for overhead and underground assets if
these costs are account for separately.

Storm Reserve Sclvency Analysis Parameters,

Data required for the model include current fund level, annual accrual levels.
Teleconferences wilt be held with Progress Energy Florida staff as needed to develop
and clarify early accrual test cases.

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA.

Page 3
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Progress Florida Hurmicane T&D
Loss Estimation & Storm Solvency Studies
May 15, 2008

DELIWVERABLES

This work scope will provide the following deliverables:

. A report sumnmarizing the 2008 study model and the results of the analyses
for Progress Energy Florida’s transmission and distribution assets.
. Storm Reserve solvency analysis report will present the resuits of the

probability of hurricane losses exceeding starm fund assets in any year for a

range of annual accruals.

COST & SCHEDULE

The Phase [ and [l are proposed on a firm fixed price basis. Tasks, schedules,
deliverables and payments are provided below. This work scope consists of five tasks
and several deliverables in each Phase. Deliverables are associated with project
milestones and payments. All work will be performed under the existing Progress Energy
contract terms. The proposed payment schedule for this work is provided below:

Milestone

i. Hurricane Loss Analyses
Task 1 - Project [nception

Task 4 - Compietion of Hurricane Loss Report

Il. Reserve Modeling and Analyses
Task 5 — Storm Solvency Analysis Report

Hl. Regulatory Testimony

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA

Schedule Payment

May

TBD I

Six to eight week

after inception _|

Two week after

completion of -l !

Task 4

To be
determined ‘

Page 4

09RP-OPCPOD1-46-000042



REDACTED

Frogress Florida Hurricane T&D
Loss Estimation & Storm Solvency Studies
May 15, 2008

Terms and Conditions
It is proposed that all work will be performed under the terms and conditions of our
existing basic ordering agreement with Progress Energy.

Should the proposed scope of work be acceptable, please initiate a contract addendum
to incarporate this task and provide a formal authorization for us to begin work.

in the development of this proposal, we have tried to define a project scope of services
to meet your needs, as we understand them. Please contact us if you believe that some
adjustments to the scope of work may be required to better fit your needs, budget, or
schedule.

QUALIFICATIONS

ABS Censulting is a consulting risk management and engineering firm headguartered in
Houston, Texas, with regional offices in Ozkland, Irvine, Washington, D.C., Denver, St
Louis and the Boston area. ABS Consuiting also has offices in Europe, Tokyo, and
Singapore. Qur professional staff has comprehensive expertise in insurance loss
estimation and natural hazards risk analysis.

ABS Consulting has worked with many U.S. and intemational electric utilities to evaluate
risks and establish risk-transfer programs. This work has included project with Florida
Power and Light, Florida Power Corporation and TECO Energy to quantify Hurricane
Loss exposures of their assets,

if you are in agreement with this proposal, please sign this letter contract and return a
copy of it to us to indicate your understanding of the proposed scope of work,
acceptance of the proposed fee, attached Terms and Conditions, and to authorize us to
proceed.

We look forward to working with Progress Energy on this very important project.

/ Approved for Progress Energy Florida
54« VZ @L <

Tasks 1-5: Amount L
Steven P. Harris
Vice President by:
ABS Consulting Internationai

Signature/Date)

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA

Page &
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?&? Progress Energy
May 21, 2008

ABSG Consulting
475 14™ Strect, Suite 550
Qaldand, CA 94612-4036

Attention: Mr. Steven P. Harris

Contract No. 24203
Amendment No. 12
Effective May 21, 2008

This Amendment is governed by the terms and conditions of the above-referenced
Contract. By this Amendment, Progress Energy Service Company, LL.C offers to add the
following Scepe of Work as follews:

Contractor is to perform Hurricane Modeling and Quantification for Progress
Energy Florida (PEF) by developing a loss assessment computer model of PEF
Transmission and Distribution (T & D) assets and to perform probabilistic property
damage analyses for hurricane exposures as per Contractor’s proposal dated May 15, 2008
{Attachment A).

The Work authorized by this Amendment is not Nuclear Safety Related.

As full compensation for completion of this Work, Owner will pay
Contractor the firm fixed price upon acceptance of Work and receipt of a
correct invoice. The amount o will cover Scope of Work Sections 1. Hurricane
Loss Anatyses (includes Task # 1-3 at a cost 0- and Task 4 at a cost of -
respectively) and Section 1I. Storm Reserve Soivency Analyses which includes Task 5 at a

cost of Section 11I. Preparation of Testimony will be charged on a time and
materials rate if needed.

Work shall begin week of May 21, 2008 and shzall be complete not later 12/31/2008
as agreed fo by Contractor and Owner’s Designated Representative,

Progress Energy Service Company. LLC
PO. fox 1501
fateah, NU 27602

#130044
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&i‘ Progress Energy

Owner’s Designated Representative for the Weork authorized by this Amendment is Mr.
Gary Little. Invoices for Work performed should be sent to him at Progress Energy
Service Co., LLC, PQ Box 1551, Raleigh, NC 27602,

All other terms in the Contract or other Contract Amendments remain unchanged.

Please execute this Amendment, retain one original copy for your file, and return
the other original within ten (10) calendar days to Leanne Borgen, Progress Energy Service
Company, LLC, P. O. Box 1551 (PEB 2), Raleigh, NC 27602. Please call me at (919) 346 -
2925 if questions.

Sincerely,

Sourcing Specialist
Corporate Services Department

Attachment A

Accepted:

ABS(‘;.E(’)NS/QLTING
s, S
== 77 )

Name (printed): L:E)tféﬁb/éf/‘) / /f ‘;‘-‘@(‘f

Titte: VACE ﬁagmm i
Date: L~ /’LL/& g
s /

Should the person's title who is executing this document not indicate that he/she is a corporate
officer, an affidavit signed by a corporate officer shall be provided stating that the person whose
name appears above is duly authorized to execute Contracts.

Progress Ennrgy Service Company, LLC
#0. Sox 1551
Haleigh, NG 2/602
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Mlchinetta (opages)
<ZABS Consulting

May 15, 2008
Mr. Gary Little
Risk Manager
Progress Energy
Raleigh, NC

Subject: ABS Consulting Proposal for Progress Energy Florida
Hurricane Transmission and Distribution Loss Estimation
and Reserve Solvency Study

Dear Mr. Lithie:

ABS Consulting is pleased to provide the following proposal to perform analyses of
Progress Energy Florida's (PEF) transmission and distribution (T8D) humcane loss
exposures and performance of storm Reserve analyses.

SCOPE OF WORK

Hurricane Modeling and Quantification - ABS Consulting propases to develop a loss
assessment computer model of Florida Progress’ transmission and distribution (T&D)
assets and to perform probabilistic property damage analyses for hurricane exposures.

The analyses will involve the following tasks:

I Hurricane Loss Analyses

Task 1 - Model Development

ABS Consuilting will develop a hurricane exposure model of Progress Florida's
T&D using the EQECAT WORLDCATenterprise™ proprietary catastrophe
software. Distribution asset replacement values will be geo-coded on a sub zip
code grid using Progress Florida's data to capture the distribution of T&D assets
within Progress Florida's service territory. Each transmission structure would be
modeied by a representative replacement vaiue for its voltage class.

Task 2 - Asset Vulnerabilities

Storm vulnerabilities of transmission and distribution assets will be developed and
calibrated to Progress Florida's loss data from the recent 2004 hurricanes Charlie,
Frances and Jeanne as well as other industry data.

Task 3 - Probabilistic Risk Analysis

The analysis and resuits that will be provided are described in this section. The
resuits will include the expected annual aggregate ioss exceedance curve and the
expected annual loss.

ABSG Consulting Inc. « 475 14th St. Suite 550 » Qakiand, CA 94612-4036 USA e Tel: 510-817-3105 »
Fax: 510-663-1048

www. absconsufting.com
Fage 1
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Progress Florida Hurricane T&D
Loss Estimation & Sterm Solvency Studies
May 15, 2008

The results of the foregoing tasks will be presented in a report, documenting the
underlying modeling and analyses performed. This report will describe the
performance of Progress Florida's Reserve fund given accrual and initial balance
strategies.

Hi: PREPARATION OF TESTIMONY

ABS Consulting can provide support Progress Energy Florida with expert testimony,
consultation and analytics regarding Progress Energy Florida’s potential filing
before the Florida Public Service Commission relating to Reserve Fund, annual
Reserve Fund accrual, and storm costs. ABS Consulting would provide these
expert services as requested and in consultation with Progress Energy Florida staff
and legal counsel on a time and materials basis:

REQUIRED INFORMATION

Transmission and Distribution Assets

it is anticipated that transmission and distribution (T&D) asset data will be available from
Progress Energy Florida as undepreciated replacement cost. Distribution data by zip
code, if available will be used to produce revised vaiuation distributions at a sub-zip
level. Updated transmission structure latflong database with voltage and structure type
definitions along with estimates of structure replacement costs on a structure type basis
will be utilized fo model the transmission assets. Distribution asset data wiil be provided
in the consensus format from the AEGIS working group.

Historical Loss Data.
Data on historical losses will be required for model calibration. This should include data
from the 2004 hurricane season and other losses.

Cost data should include a breakout of capital and O&M (cr labor) costs for storm
restoration activities for T&D separately and for overhead and underground assets if
these costs are account for separately.

Storm Reserve Solvency Analysis Parameters.
Data required for the modal include current fund level, annual accrual levels.

Teleconferences will be held with Progress Energy Florida staff as needed to develop
and clarify early accrual test cases.

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA

Page 3
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Progress Florida Huarricane TED
Loss Estimation & Storm Solvency Studies
May 15, 2008

Terms and Conditions
it is proposed that all work will be performed under the terms and conditions of our
existing basic ordering agreement with Progress Energy.

Should the proposed scope of work be acceptable, please initiate a contract addendum
to incorporate this task and provide a formal authorization for us to begin work.

In the devaiopment of this proposal, we have tried to define a project scope of services
to meet your needs, as we understand them. Please contact us if you believe that some
adjustments to the scope of work may be required to better fit your needs, budget, or
schedule,

QUALIFICATIONS

ABS Consulting is a consulting risk management and engineering firm headquartered in
Houston, Texas, with regional offices in Oakland, Irvine, Washington, D.C., Denver, St.
Louis and the Boston area. ABS Consulting also has offices in Eurcpe, Tokyo, and
Singapore. QOur professional staff has comprehensive experlise in insurance loss
estimation and naturai hazards risk anaiysis.

ABS Consutting has worked with many U.S. and international electric utilities to evaluate
risks and establish risk-transfer programs. This work has included project with Florida
Power and Light, Florida Power Corporation and TECO Energy to quantify Hurricane
Loss exposures of their assets.

If you are in agreement with this proposal, please sign this letter contract and return a
copy of it fo us to indicate your understanding of the proposed scope of work,
acceptance of the proposed fee, attached Terms and Conditions, and to authorize us fo
proceed,

We look forward to working with Progress Energy on this very important project.

Approved for Progress Energy Florida

Tasks 1-5: Amount____ |
Steven P, Haris

Vice President by:
ABS Consulting internationat

Signature/Date)

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA

Page 5
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Wefes's Larost Digl Mo, TY-8H10.5887

R. ALEXANDER GLENN
General Counse! ~ Florida

December 29, 2008

Richard D. Melson
705 Piedmont Drive
Tallahassee, FI_ 32312

Re: 2008 Base Rate Case Proceeding

Dear Rick:

This tetter will confirm that Progress Energy Services Co., LLC has asked you to
join our team consisting of in-house and outside counsel as additional outside
counsel for our 2009 Base Rate Case proceeding. As you have discussed with
John Burnett, we expect that you wili assurme primary responsibility for several
Progress witnesses and will assume other duties that we agree upon as the case
progresses.

You have previcusly reviewed and signed a copy of our Guidelines for Counsel
Representing Progress Energy. Except as set forth in this letter, or specifically
agreed to by me, these guidelines will govern your reprasentation of Progress in
this matter. The lead in-house counsel for this matter is Alex Glenn (for overall
management angd billing purposes) and John Burnett (for day-to-day contact).

We have agreed that you will be compensated for your work on this matter at
our mutual, non-binding

expectation that this matter will invoive roughly 500 hours or more of your time
during 2009.

We approve your submission of manual invoices in lieu of utilizing our TyMetrix
billing system. Your bilts shouid include the following reference: “2009 Base Rate
Case,” and should be addressed to John Burnett at the fellowing address:

John Bumett

Progress Energy

P.O. Box 14042

St. Petersburg, Florida 337334042
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We look forward to working with you on this matter. Please confirm that this letter
accurately reflects our understanding by returning a signed copy of this letter to
me at your earliest convenience.
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GUIDELINES FOR COUNSEL REPRESENTING
PROGRESS ENERGY

1. Scope and Applicability of these Guidelines.

These guidelines describe the relationship of Progress Energy, Inc. and its subsidiaries (“Progress
Energy™) and its ouiside counsel and other legal service providers. Progress Energy seeks to create a
leamn approach to handling its legal maiters. This team approach, with in-house counsel closely
involved, will assure regular communication, avoidance of swprise and increased efficiency and
economy. We expect outside counsel to review the Guidelines in detail and indicate their acceptance
by signing and returning a copy of the Guidelines. Questions concerning these guidelines should be
direcied 1o the Jead Progress Fnergy attorney assigned Lo the matter (“lead in-house counsel”). In the
event of a conflict between any of these guidelines and any portion of any prior engageinent letter
generated by outside counsel and signed by a member of the Progress Encrgy law department, these
guidelines control and supersede any contrary provisions contained in outside counse!’s engagement
letter. In addition to the attomney who signs these guidelines on behalf of his or her law firm, all
members of an outside counsel team who work on a matter for Progress Energy arc expected to be
familiar with and follow these guidelines. Quiside counscl may depart from the policies and
procedures enumerated below only with the express prior approval of the Jead in-house counsel.

2. Coordination with Prosress Encrey Lawyers.

A lead in-house counsel will be your principal contact for each matter you are handling. That lawyer
will function as an integral member of the legal 1eam, and is responsible for deciding what work wit!
be performed by outside counscl. Lcad in-house counsel should be kept regularly apprised of all
significant developments in the matter and consulted sufficiently in advance of the date by which any
significant decision must be made. The lead in-house counsel should also be given the opportunity 1o
review well in advance of their due date drafts of all significant documents, including contracts,
substantive pleadings, briefs, correspondence and any other documents that will be provided to third
parties on Progress Energy’s behalf, as well as any additicnal documents the lead in-house counscl
requests to review. Outside counsel shall not file any significant documents without the express prior
approval of the lead in-house counsel,

3. Communication with Proeress Energy

All commurications with Progress Energy should be directed to and/or through the lead in-house
counsel assigned to a matter or to such other Progress Energy Law Department personne] designated
by the lead in-house counsel. All written communications shall prominently display at the top the
Progress Energy Reference Number (explained in 7(d) below) for the matter in question. Any contact
with Progress Energy employees must be coordinated and approved by the Progress Energy
lawyers in charge of the matter.

To the extent reasonably possible, appropriaie, and as designated by lead in-house connsel, all writen

communications and documents sent between outside and in-house counsel should be sent in
electronic format via e-mail, and marked with the following legends as appropriate:
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Privileged und Copfidential

Attornev-Client Privileged
Atliorney Work Product

Progress Energy Proprietary

We expect outside counsel to have the capability 10 create TIF, PDF or other scanned, electronic
documents so that such documents (¢.g., opposing party’s pleadings, discovery materials, eic.) may be
shared electronically as requested. Eventually, Progress Energy plans to enable outside counsel to
post electronic documents 10 an extranet site; we will advise your firm when the site is ready for such
postings and at that time provide instructions,

4. Litigation Early Case Fvaluation.

Progress Energy is commiited to resolving litigation at the earliest possible date, before substantial
legal fees arc incurred.  Therefore, no later than sixty (60) days of recciving a complaint in which
Progress Energy is named as a defendant, or as otherwise designated by the lead in-house counsel, we
ask that you give the lead in-house counscl your written assessment of Progress Encrgy’s exposure,
the likely cost of litigating the case 1o conclusion. and the amount (if any) for which you recommend
that Progress Energy settle the matter, using the Farly Case Evaluation Form appended to these
guidelines. This evaluation should be updated annually,

Similarly, in instances in which outside counscl is engaged o represent Progress Lnmergy in an
affirmative litigation in which Progress Energy is 1o be a plaintiff or is otherwise to be a claimant,
counsel should preparc a written casc assessment of Progress Energy’s recovery prospects, the likely
cost of liigating the case to conclusion, and the amount for which you recommend that Progress
Lnergy be willing 1o settle the matter. prior to the filing of an initial pleading on behalf of Progress
Energy and in accordance with lead in-house counsel’s instructions. You should also propose your
swategy for resolving the matter in the most cost effective manner possible (¢.g., proposed sevtlement
strategy, motions that are likely 1o be dispositive, ete.).

5. Litigation Manapcment,

Progress Energy believes that litigation is best managed through collaboration between and among
outside counsel, in-housc counscl and Progress Energy managers involved in the particular marter. To
cffectuate the collaborative process, outside counsel should communicate regularly with in-house
counsel regarding case developments. Quuside counsel should provide copics of pertinent pleadings
and correspondence from opposing counsel to in-house counsel for input before responsive documents
are sent. Responsive pleadings and cormrespondence to opposing counse! should be provided to
Progress Energy legal staff sufficiently in advance of any filing deadlines 1o cnable in-house counscl
sufficient time to provide input. Outside counsel should notify in-house counsel of all hearings or
other court ordered proceedings in advance of those procecdings and seek input from in-house counse]
regarding strategy for such proceedings.

Notice and documentation of court imposed deadlines are crucial. Outside counsel should forward to

the lead in-house counsel documentation evidencing due dates and deadlines. Of primary importance
are duc dates for answers, requests for admission, interrogatory and document requests, post-irial
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motions and appeal. Notice of irial and deadlines under discovery scheduling orders should be made
immediately and copies of the applicable arders sent to lead in-house counsel.

All discovery should be coordinated with Progress Enerpy Legal Department stafl, mcluding the
scheduling of depositions so that in-house counsel may participate, at his or her option. In-house
counse! will coordinate all communications with Progress Energy clients; outside counsel should not
contact Progress Energy clients directly without express authorization te do so from in house counsel.

6. Staffing.

You and the jead in-house counsel must agree on the legal team assigned to the matier, inchuding the
lepal and business resources to be provided by Progress Fnergy. Wherever possible, we expect you to
use attorneys who have developed a knowledge of Progress Encrgy’s businesses. Work should be
delegated 1o associates, paralegals and legal assistants whenever appropriatc.  Work should be
performed by the person whe can perform the function most effectively. Hence, 2 pariner should not
perform associate-level] tasks, associates should not perform paralega!l tasks, and paralcgals should not
perform administrative tasks, The lead in-house counsel mus! approve all staffing changes in advance,
including the addition of any aftorney or legal assistant whoe will bill Progress Tnergy. ‘This approval
should preferably be in writing or via e-mail. If there is approved wnover or other changes in
staffing, we normally will not pay for time spent by newly assigned atiorncys or legal assistanls to
become familiar with the file.

Except for extraordinary matters, your legal team should not include more than two lawyers, the
pamary responsible lawyer and an associate. If the maiter is large, it is Progress Energy’s strong
preference to have more time from a small number of attorneys instead of small amounts of time from
more attorneys. Ordinarily only one lawyer should atiend any meeting, deposition or court
appearance, and prior approval should be obiained before sending more than one lawyer.

7. Third Party Services.

Outside counse! may only engage additional service providers such as document managers,
consultams, experts, accountants, or other lawyers, with the express prior approval of the lead in-house
counsel. Progress Energy is in the process of establishing a2 number of arrangements with third-party
vendors that may allow cost savings on reimbursable expenses incurred by cutside counsel. In this
regard, at the outsel of a matter, outside counsel should discuss with lead in-house counsel any
applicable arrangements Progress Encrgy has made concemning service providers, including copy
services; court reporting services, documcent collaboration scrvices; jury consultants; and forensic
accountants,

8. Fee Arrangcements and Billing.

a. Gencrally.

Unless we have otherwise agreed. compensation will be determined on the basis of time reasonably
and neccessarily spemt on Progress Energy matters, using the pre-approved hourly rates. We expect
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that time will be billed in tenth of hour incrememts. We welcome the use of altemative fee
arrangements, and encourage you to propose contingent arrangements, fixed fees, unit fees, or any
other mutually agreeable approach, particularly arrangements that result in a sharing of the risks and
rewards of litigation.

b, Budpets.

The lead in-house counsel may request that you and your firm, within thirty (30) days of receiving 4
litigation or non-litigation matter, provide an estimate of the total fees and disbursements for the
remainder of the litigation or the project using the form attached to these Guidelines, (Atachment A -
Budget Guidelines). This budget estimate should be developed in conjunction with the lead in-house
counsel. The budget should be realistic and not overly conservative: it should inciude what you
actually anticipate will happen in the remainder of the year, litigation or project. Your approved
budget number will be incorporated into Progress Energy’s Law Department budget, and both you and
the lead in-house counsel will be responsible for meeting that budget.

Additionally, because of our own internal budgeting needs, the lead in-house counsel may request that
by Julv 15 of each vear, you submit an estimate of fecs and disbursements for the following year for
each natter an which you are engaped (estimated total fees and disbursements for cach matter). 1 you
receive a matter in July or later, you should prepare two budpget estimates, one for the remainder of the
year, another for the following calendar year.

Moreover, in matters in which the estimated fees and disbursements for a calendar year arc one
hundred thousand United States dotlars (1S $100,000) or more, or where otherwise requested by the
lead in-house counsel, you may be reguired to provide periodic budget updates. The budget should
identify fees by task and be developed with the lead in-house counsel,

{n the event that a particular matter requires work in excess of that provided for by the most recent
budget, outside counsel should contact the lead in-house atiorney before undertaking any non-
budgeted work. Surprise is to be scrupulously avoided. Failure to provide advance notice that fees or
other cxpenses will mmn in excess of amounts budgeted may result in Progress Energy’s refusal to pay
for the unbudgcted services.

Progress Energy will generally not pay for more than two hours of attorney time associated with
preparation of a budget or staffing plan [or a particular matter.

<. Rates.

In matters that are billed bascd on the law firm's hourly rates, outside counsel shall, upon engagement
of the firm, provide the lead in-house counsel with a schedule showing the billing rate for each
timekeeper (or class of tinekeeper). Once agreed upon at the commencement of a matter or the
beginning of a new calendar year, the scheduled billing rates shall remain in effcet for the duration of
the engagement or the entire calendar year unless lead in-house counsel approves proposed rate
changes in advance. Progress Energy expocts to be billed at rales that arc highly competitive with
those of comparable firms providing comparable services to Progress Energy or other similar clients.
In addition, Progress Energy expects that outside counsel will charge for services at nct billing rates
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that are no higher than those charged to other clients of the firm, except for not-for-profit or pro bono
clients.

Alternative fee arrangements, such as contingent fees, fixed fees or blended rates, may be appropriate
for some matters. Lead in-house counsel may request such altermate fee arrangement proposals and
outside counsel are expected to provide such proposals within 30 days of such request. Additionally,
outside counsel should feel free to propose any such aiTangements.

Progress Energy will pay for any portion of travel time spent by outside counsel traveling 10 a
destination al which he/she will perform Progress Energy work. In appropriate circumstances
Progress Energy may pay for such travel time during which ouiside counsel is not performing
company business. Determinanons regarding reimbursement for non-working trave! time will be
made on a case-by-case basis,

d. Invoices.

Invoices should be sent monthly via the ebilling sysiem. Bills should be sent to a web address thar we
will provide you. I’lease send originals of any back up documents (no faxes) such as travel receipts to
the lead in-house counsel at 17 PEB, Progress Energy Legal Department, 410 South Wilmington
Strect, Raleigh, North Carolina 27602, Every matier should have a separate invoice. For example, if
outside counsel is handling three pieces of litigation and twe commercial transactions, then the outside
counsel should send five seperate invoices. For maners on which oulside counsel provides ongoing
advice z subject maner invoice may be used, such as an inveice entitied “General Wage and Hour
Counsel™ or “General Lmployee Benefits Counsel.”  Progress Energy’s standard pavment terms
for suppliers are 30 days. Progress Energy will make every cffort to pay your bills on that basis. In
ne event, however, will Progress Energy pay interest.

The bill for each month should be received following the month in which the work was performed
and should be reviewed by the senior outside lawver working on each matter for which an
invoice is prepared. Progress Energy expects that all invoices be submitted via the TyMetrix billing
process using the LEDES1998B format. However, upon approval by Progress Fnergy, if a manual
invoice is sent then that invoice should contain the following: (Please see the Sample Invoice
(Guidelines, Attachment B),

1. The matter name;

2, The Progress Energy legal entity (please sce Attachment C list of Progress
Encrgy’s Legal Entities);

3. The Progress Fnergy reference number (which can be obtained from the lead in-
house counsel ).

4, The name of the Progress Energy lead in-house counsel;

3, A summary that lists the annual budget, the amount expended year-to-date (both
fees and disbursements), the amount expended since the inceplion of the case
{(both fees and disbursements) and the invoice amount;

09RP-OPCPOD1-46-000055



REDACTED

6. A summary containing the name, billing rate, time spent, and total charges for
each professional who worked on the mater during the period covered by the
mvoice;

7. An attachment with a description of each daily time entry that is sufficiently

detailed o provide for meaningful review (for example, “Trial Preparation” is
unacceplably broad and vague as an entry, and “Deposition Preparation™ is
insufficiently detsiled because it not only fails 10 note how the attomey
prepared, but fails to identity the deponcnt as well); and

8. A detailed breakdown of ali disbursements.

e. December Aceruals.

Fach year, the Law Department must accrue by December 29 all charges, both fecs and disbursements,
for the remainder of the year. Therefore, bv December 26 of each vear, you must send us all invoices
through the end of December. 1f work is performed after December 26, please include that on the
invoice for the month of January of the following vear.

8. Costs and Disbursements.
We expect your howrly rates to reflect all of your firn's overhead expenses. We will reimburse for
items other than legal fees only as set forth below.

4. Reimbursable Costs.

We will reimburse the followmg items at your actual out-of-pocket cost without any mark-up pr0v1ded
they are reasonable and necessary:

B Long distance telephone charges in the amounts actually charged by telephone
companies to vou for calls made in connection with Progress nergy matters.

2. Postage and express mail charges.

Inside photocopying at your cost, but not to exceed 10 cents per page; outside
photocopying at cost billed to you if approved by lead in-house counsel.

fnd
)

4, Computerized legal research time charges from outside vendors.

5. Coach airfare at the lowest practicable fare and moderate hotel, restaurant and
transportation charges. Please utilize Progress Lnergy rates where possible.
These can be obtamed by booking travel via the Progress Energy Travel Center
at §-888-274-2687.

6. Filing fees.

7. Court reporter fees.
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g Expert witness fees for experts specifically authorized by lead in-house counsel.
9. Cutside messenger services.

With permission from lead in-kouse counsel, you may request that such charges be billed directly to
Progress Energy.

b. Non-Reimbursable Costs.

We will not ordinanily reimburse for the following without specific authorization from the lead in-
house counsel:

1. File set-up or clerical charges.

2. Routine maintenance of case files.

3. Sccretarial or word processing charges.

4, Fux communication charges (except for actual long distance telephone toli charges).

5. Photocopying charges in excess of 10 cents per page.

6. Charges for confercnce rooms or any other facility or equipment of your firm.

7. Personal commuting or non-travel meal expenses. In the abscnce of unusual
circumstances, Progress Energy wil] not pay for meals or other incidental expenses
for attorneys or staff members when they are working in their normal office
location, inciuding firm cafeteria charges and charges for meals served in your

firm’s conference rooms as well as taxi or car-service charges from your offices to
your attorneys™ homes.

8. Localtelephone charges.

9. Budgeting or preparation of bills for Progress Encrgy.

10. Qvertime secretarial charges.

11. Tuxury hotels, first-class airfare, or business-class air fare.

9. Lepal Research.

You are strongly urged to coordinate with lead in-house counsel before underiaking legal research.
Progress Energy requires that all research projects of ten (10) hours or more be approved in advance
by the responsible lead in-house counsel, unless the lead in-house counsel has previously expressly
wailved the requirement.
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10. Leoal Database.

Progress Energy is establishing a legal database that will include rescarch, briefs and other significant
pleadings. We wartt to include in this database the following work dome by vour firm for Progress
Energy: research memoranda; dispositive motions; and other pleadings that address significant issucs
as direcied by lead in-housc counsel. Therefore, as you complete final versions of briefs or significant
pleadings {or approved research), please forward them in both hard-copy and electronic formats to the
lead in-house counsel. By signing these Guidelines, your firm recognizes that Progress Energy owns
and has the right to use research legal memoranda and motion papers the firm preparces for Progress
Energy [or any purposcs Progress Energy decms appropriate.

11. Dispute Resohition.

Our goal is prompt, cost-cfective resolution of all litigation. We expect vou to work aggressively
with the lead in-house counsel to explore and assess all settlement possibilities. including alternative
dispute resolution. Outside counsel may not reject an inquiry reparding alternative dispute resolution
or seitlement without consulting lead in-house counsel, All sctement offers or overtures should be
reported immediately to the lead in-house counsel along with your analysis and recommendation.
Although you should not undertake setilemnent negotiations without our prior approval, we encourage
you 10 consider as to each matter how the most beneficial and cost effective resolution might b
obtained.

12.  Conflicts of Interest.

We expect prompt and complete disclosure of any potential conflicts of interest, including
representation of an adverse party in any matier however unrclated It may scem.  Normally,
disclosures of potential conflicts would ocecur at the outsct of a new marter, bt we would also expect
prompt disciosure of anty potential conflicts arising during the course of a matter.

All requests Tor waivers of conflicts of interest should be accompanied by a list of all matters at issue
and areas of law involved, as well as all contact attorneys and identities of Progress Energy busincsses
involved. Progress Encrgy’s Vice President, Legal Department, has the exelusive authority to waive
conflicts on behalf of Progress Energy, its subsidiaries and its affiliates. Please note that Progress
Enerpy will not gramt blanket prospective waivers of conflicts of interest.

13. Document Reteation.

At the conclusion of each matter outside counsel handles on behalf of Progress Energy, document
retention should be discussed with the lead in-house counsel responsible for the matier,

14, Access 1o Progress Energy Extranet Sites.

Should you or someone else from your firm be directed by lead in-house counsel to access any
information or third-party scrvices via a Progress Lnergy extranet site, your firm agrees as a condition
of access to abide by any and al] terms and conditions displayed on such sites withour modification.
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15. Rules of Professional Responsibility.

Progress lincrgy expects that all attorneys representing Progress Hnergy will abide by all applicable
rules of professional responsibility,

1é. Policy Regsarding SEC Rules of Professional Conduct for Attornevs.

Quiside counsel for Progress Energy who appear and practice before the Securities and Exchange
Comurassion (SEC) on behalf of Progress Energy are expected to comply fully with the SEC’s new
rules establishing standards of professional conduct for attorneys and with Progress Energy’s policy
for complying with those rules. (Please see Altachment ). The policy requires attarneys who appear
and practice before the SEC 1n the representation of Progress Energy to make appropriate reports la
the General Counsel of Progress Fnergy (the “GC™) of evidence of a malerial violation of securiijes
laws, a matenial fiduciary duty or a similar violation by Progress Energy or its agents. Your {irm
should designate a single attorney as the “point person™ 1o make any required reporis to the GC and 1o
receive notification regarding responses from the GC.

17. Proper Business Practices.

It is Progress Energy’s policy to conduct its business with integrity and in compliance with all laws
and the Progress Energy Code of Ethics; which can be found at www.progress-energy.com. Outside
counsel agraes to abide by the Progress Dnergy Code of Fthics and all laws, including without
limitation the [lnited States Forgign Corrupt Practices Act (“FCPA™), as amended, [5 U.8.C. §§
18(mb, 78dd-1, 78dd-2, 78ff{c), the Truth in Negotiations Act, 10 U.8.C. § 2306(a), and the Federal
Encrgy Regulatory Commission (“FERC™) Code of Conduct and Standards of Conduct, Quiside
counsc] agrees that it shall take no action or use or spend any funds, regardless of source, in violation
of the laws of the United States of America or any coumry or countries in which it performs serviess
for Progress Energy, including but not limited to the payments of bribes, kickbacks, political
contributions, or other prohibited payments. Documentation of all business transactions shall properly
describe the pertinent events and such records must not be false, distoried, or misleading. No
undisclosed or unrecorded fund or asset shall be established for any purpose.

18. Entire Acreement; Amendments: Acceptance,

These Guidelines supersede and cance] any and all previous versions of Progress knergy’s outside
counsel guidelines. DPlease confirm that you have reviewed and, on behalfl of vour [irm, accept
Progress Fpergy’s Guidelines as stated above.,

e e

Rxchayd 1. Melgon

Firm:

Date: 12/18/2008
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CONTRACT NO, 363162

THIS CONTRACT, effective on March 27, 2008 (hereinafter “Contract™), is entered into between PROGRESS
ENERGY SERVICE COMPANY, LLC, not in its individual capacity, but solely as agent PROGRESS ENERGY
FLORIDA, INC., whose address is 410 South Wilmington Street, Raleigh, NC 27601 (hereinafter "Owner"), and TLG
SERVICES, INC., whose office is located at 148 New Milford Road East, Bridgewater, Connecticut 06752 (hereinafter
referred to as "Consuitant™).

In consideration of the mutual promises set forth herein, the parties hereby contract as follows:

1. DESCRIPTION OF WORK

—F

Short Form Conmibant
Nucler

Revisian 0171501

LH o

09RP-OPCPOD1-46-000082




REDACTED

Page 2, Contract No, 363162

| | R ——
e —
o

2. SCHEDULE OF WORK

3. COMPENSATION

4, OWNER'S DESIGNATED REPRESENTATIVE

5. NONDISCLOSURE OF CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION

AR AR~ RAL MLk F X LA
Short Form Conpulam
Nuthoar

Revision 0L/15/03
¥134099
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Page 3, Contract No. 363 162

6. TERMS AND CONDITIONS

Next paragraph begins on the following page.

Shart Forsy Connhast
Muclear

Revision 0171508
LI
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Page 4, Contract No. 363162

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this Contract by their duly authorized agents.

TLG SERVICES, INC, PROGRESS ENERGY SERVICE COMPANY, LLC
not in its individual capacity, but solely as agent for
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA, INC.

w LAIM.  AE

NAME (printed) Jd. ADLEE NAME: Todd Baucom

TITLE: SE. Mag ‘Mﬂl SS(ONING TITLE: Sourcing Specialist-Generation Carolinas
DATE: j/ 2 7/ 2w DATE: 3/37_/4048
.

Short Form Conmullasy
Nagehvar

Revition H1ASNE
34099
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IEEMS AND CONDITIONS

Short Form Consullam
Nuclear

Ravision 01/15/08
F134099
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Page 6, Contract No. 363162

Sty Form Compitach
Nucloar

Revision 0171500 -
FIM0H -
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RATE SCHEDULE
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Contract Employee
Code of Ethics Acknowledgment Form

Please go to the following website to review the Progress Energy Code of Ethics prior to
signing this Acknowledgment Form. Hard copies are available upon request.

hitp://www.progress-energy.com/investors/corpgovi/codeofethics.asp

I'}havg read the Progress Energy Code of Ethics. I understand that the principles stated in the
Code of Ethics represent those of Progress Energy as they relate to the work 1 perform as an
independent Consultant (or as an employee of an independent Consultant of Progress Energy),
and that violating those principles, or the legal and regulatory requirements applicable to my
work may result in disciplinary action by my employer, 1 agree to abide by and support the legal
and regulatory requirements applicable to my work. I understand that if I have questions
concerning appropriate ethics or relevant legal and regulatory requirements, I should consult

with my supervisor.

Signature of Contract Employee

Name of Contract Employee

Date

Social Security Number

Consultant Organization

Consultant shal! maintain completed forms. Do not return completed forms unless they are specifically
requested by Owner.

Shory Formw Cotuultant

Nuclaar
Ravision 0171508
0
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Supplement to
Contract No, 363162
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. PLEASE REMIT TO:
«ARLTON FIELDS £0.tox 1209

FED. 1D 50-1232896 Tampa, Fi 33¢01.3239
ATTORNEYS AT LAw B13.223 7000

Fox 813.229.4133

One Abionlic Cenlap

1201 W. Panchires 51.. Sie. 3008 P.O. Box 019101 PO gox 1171 #.00. Box 2861 P.O. Drower 190 ' PO, Box 150
Allanto, Gaargio 30309 Miaml, FL 33131 Orlondo, FL 32802 St Peiersburg, FL 33731 Tallahassea, FL 32302 Wasl Palm Banch, FL 33402
404.815.3400 305.530.0050 4078490300 727.821.7000 850.224.1505 561.659.7070
Fox 404.815.3415 Fax 305.520.0055 Fax 407.640.9099 Fax 727.822.3768 Fox B50.222.0398 Fax §61.659.7368
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JANUARY 9, 2009
PO BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. 00305-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 531202
DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT
RE: 2009 RATE CASE
ZéAi;ANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT

LESS: PAYMENTS
BALANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 12/31/08
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 12/31/08

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

AGED _ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BALANCE QUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-90 S1-120 OVER 120 TOTAL

k%k REMITTANCE COPY **%

J
AN 13 amng

L s
ELEU i RUNF” nyy v
Payment is due upon receipt. Interest will be chorged on unpaid invoices aged 35 days or more from invoice JE(;‘_“'L

Services designated with an {*) were performed under the sirict supervision of odmitted atorneys by persons not admitted Io praciice law in the controlling jurisdiction.
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CARLTON FIELDS

" ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED, IO 59-12338%6

'PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA ’ JANUARY é, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 0030%-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 531202 PAGE 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2008

g PHASE L10: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN

Task L110 : FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

12/17/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS. OF FACT WITNESS TESTIMONY .40
DEVELOPMENT AND- STATUS. g TRIPLETT FOLLOWING

12/2%/08 DMT 1.60

12/30/08 JMW 4.00

(. 0!)., ANALYSIS 33 LIMITED PROCEEDING ISSUES,
ORDERS, RULES, DRAFT OUTLINE OF SAME, ITEMS FCR
LIMITED PROCEEDING CASE PREPARATION (3.0)

Subtotal for Task L11l0

[=4]
=]
[=]

Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY
12/15/08 DMT ' .40
12/15/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF OUTSTANDING WITNESS .40
' ISSUES AND CASE STRATEGY.
12/15/08 JMW  VARIOU. LS WETH BURNETT REGARDING NN .40
12/15/08 DMT — .60
e ——— FOLLOW UP WITH
JOHN BURNETT RE 'GHD. _ '
12/19/08. DMT REVIEW. ANALYSIS OF‘;Ssﬁgﬁ'Hlxﬁ_CﬁlENT'TEAM .30
R - RE LA el . .
,___—___———_\
Privileged : "

\ . CARLTON FIELDS, PA '
TS el e —‘_.Aﬂfantu . Mlaml * Orlando « St Petersburg © Tul[uhussee . Tampa . Wesl Pulm Beach

[N R I ' Tolob s citot cvim mmtto e of cd e d mtbmm e b
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FED, ID 59.12338%6

REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA - - JANUARY 9 2009
200% RATE CASE
INVOICE NUMBER 531202 PAGE 2

12/19/08

12/23/08

12/29/08

12/29/08

12/29/08

12/30/08

12/30/08

1z2/30/08

12/30/08

JMW

DMT

DMT

‘'JMW

JMW

DMT

DMT

DMT

IMW

REF. NO. '00309-38087

.40
_ , .20
TIBBETTS.

RéguﬂST'OF JOHN‘BURNETTg*

CALL WITH

BURNETT REGARDING m .60
A FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT RE G -

SAME, ISSUES, REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT

REGARDING

REGARDING il . _
NOTES REGARDING SAME, REVIEW CLIENT

 (.4) ; -CALL WITH BUR

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING - COMMUNICATIONS f
INTERNALLY ON ISSUE, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT

(.2)

.40
TPIETT REGARDING SAME,
vﬂiq

2.40
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESEARCH ISSUES AND .80
STRATEGY CONCERNS FOR RATE CASE, INCLUDING

1.10

1.00

Atlanig * Miaml

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Orlando . SI Pe'lersburg . Ta[lahassas * Tampa * Wast Polm Beach

comenn lnw in tha controlling iurisdiction.

ORP-BPCPBBT-47-000040



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

' . ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JANUARY 9, 20089

FED. I 59.12338%6

2009 RATE CASE " .REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 531202 _ - - PAGE 3

12/30/08 JMW .20
12/31/08 DMT 1.30
12/31/08 DMT .30

RE SAME WITH MATT BERNIER {0.2).
12/31/08 DMT REVIEW, AND AﬁALYSIS OF ISSUES RE S .  1.00
12/31/08 DMT 1.20
12/31/08 JMW 1.00

CORRESPONDENCE: TO CLIENTS REGARDING ‘

FOLLOW UP. WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME,

ANALYSIS (.Z)L,REYI W TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE

NOTES REGARDIN

CORRESPONDENCE/!

MEEENNSEN PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME,

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO. CLIENT REGARDING

{.5)

. /
Subtotal for Task.L1lz20 3 14.30

Task L130  : EZPERTS/CONBULTANTS '
12/15/08 CALL WHH-CLIENT REGA@ING STATUS or-' ) .10

, * PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO LEE AND GARRETT REGARDING

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
.- ,Atlonfa « Miomi = Oflando * St. Pefersburg Tullnhassee * Tompa * West Palm Beoch
i) '“‘ wtn marbarmnrl wnrlar tha cirict sumarvision nf admitted attormevs by persors not admilted o practice low in the conirolling jurisdiction.

O0SRP-OPCPOD1-47-00004 1




CARLTON FIELDS

‘ ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JANUARY 9, 2005
2009 RATE CASE ] : REF. NO.
INVOICE NUMBER 531202 PAGE 4 .

FED. D 59-1233896

12/16/08 JMW  REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPGNDENCE REGARDING

(.2)

12/17/08 JMW

- Subtotal for Task L130 :

Task.L160 : SETTLEMENT/NON-BINDING ADR
12/16/08 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND ATTACHMENTS
REGARDING _ REVIEW
BURNETT CORRESPONDENCE AND CALL WITH BURNETT
REGARDING @ld, PREPARE RESPONSE TO CLIENT
REGARDING N

Subtotal for Task L160 s
_Task‘ L4110 + FACT WITNESSES

A 12/15/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT SLUSSER TESTIMONY

12/15/08 JMW  REVIEW AND -ANALYSIS OF_

| FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REVISE

REGARDING SAME, (il
OUTLINE -AND FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
REVISIONS; REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE

REGARDING -

12/15/08 ¥4  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OE{“_,.."',’

CARLTON FIELDS PA

’ﬁ i H Aﬂunta. + Miomi = Orardo » St Petersburg * Tulluhussoe + Tampo = West Palm Beach
i3 Hﬂ I B i inear tha chict subervision of admitted aftorneys by persons not admitted to practice law in the conirolling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000042
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.20

.40

.40

.50

.50

3.00
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
. ATTORNEYS AT LAW ‘
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JANUARY 2, 2009

FED. ID 59-1233B96

‘2009 RATE CASE - . REF. NO. 00302-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 531202 . " PAGE 5

12/16/08 JMW 1.50

COMMENTS ‘ON SAME AND CORRESPONDENCE TO TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME  (.5) ;. FOF.;LOW UP ;WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SN . e I

ISSUES, REVIEW TRIPLETT RESPONSE (.4)

12/16/08 JMW REVIEW AND. ANALYSIS or‘“ : .20
: QN V/ITH TRIPLETT; FOLLOW UP

WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING CALL WITH POTENTIAL

WITNESS, ISSUES

.80

12/18/08 JMW
y ; - T REGARDING
SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH WITNESS (.3)
Subtotal for Task L410 : 7.00
Task L420 : EXPERT WITNESSES
12/29/08 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF | ROBIngﬁfgogggsgomnENCE ' .10
YSTATUSHOR: 8 .\m%{
Subtotal for Task L420 : .10

PHASE L20: PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS

Task L110 : FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

. CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
= =¢ 5 ﬂnnlﬂ « Miami o Orlundo o, 5t Patersburg . Tallchassee » Tompe * West Palm Beach
Sarvicas des\anaredlwnh an {*} wilt performad under the shict supervision of odmilted attorneys by persoris not admitted to practice law in the controlling |ur|sdn:hon

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000043

priv




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. [D 59-T2338%4

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA © . JANUARY 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 531202 PAGE 6

12/18/08 * DMT ‘REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

1.50
DISCUSS TESTIMONY WITH SANDY WYCOFF -

(0 4), FOLLOW up W'Tp

12/29/08 DMT 3.10
T IR FOLLOW UP WITH LINDA
MILLER AND DANA BAUMANN RE GEEEND
Subtotal for Task L110 . 4.60

Task L210 : PLEADINGS
12/23/08 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS TRIPLEET AND CLIENT . . ‘ .60

CORRESPONDENCE RE -

— TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. BURNETT RE

BNl PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO D. TRIPLETT RE

' (.4); REVIEW TRIPLETT AND CLIENT
' GARDING
'PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
TRIPLETT REGARDING Qi (.2}
Subtotal for Task L210 : .60

Task L410 ¢ FACT WITNESSES
12/15/08 DMT 5.80
12/16/08 DMT 1.30
12/16/08 DMT 1.60
12/17/08 DMT .30

T privileged = o
' CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

: ﬂc':'niu ¢ Miomi * Orlando * St Petersburg « Tullahussee . Turnpu West Palm Bau:h .
St r{psmnnred -w.rh an I"‘1"were parlormed under the strict supervision of odmitled atorneys by persons not odmikted to;pru:hcs law in the conlrolimg |ur|sdlchon

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000044




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. D 591233896

PROGRESS 'ENERGY FLORIDA JANUARY 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-3B087

INVOICE NUMBER 531202 PAGE: 7

12/17/08 DMT

1.90
12/1'7_/08 DMT 1.40
12/18/08 DMT .60
12/22/08 DMT 80

AND JAVIER PORTUONDO' RE
12/22/08 DMT ATTEND RATE CASE CALL WITH MASCEO DESCHAMPS AND .80

TEAM_AND SEND FOLLOW UP MATERIALS TO TEAM RE

WITNESS TESTIMONY.
12/22/08 DMT ’ .30

§.
12/22/08 DMT .40
12/23/08 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH JOE .80
 MCCALLISTER AND DANA BAUMMAN RE -
FOLLOW UP WITH ADDITIONAL TESTIMONY AND
INFORMATION AT REQUEST OF CLIENT.
Subtotal for Task L410 : 16.00

Task L420 EXPERT WITNESSES

12/16/08 DMT PREPAREqE’OR AND ATTEND QONFEiRENCE CALL RE — 1.10
BN CARY LITTLE @ -

ol ok

'Subtotal for Task L420 . 1.10
Tagk 1440 - : OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPPORT

12/18/08 MRB - LEGAL RESEARCH WS, 2.70

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
i Aflanto « Miomi * Grlando * St. Petersburg »- Tallahussse » Tampo * West Falm Beach
ere performed under the strict supervision of admitted attorneys by persons not admilted to practice law in the controlling |ur|sd|chon

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000045
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS -

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FER. ID 59.12338%6

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JANUARY 9, 20089
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 531202 PAGE 8

12/29/08 MRB LEGAL, RESEARCH 5.60

12/31/08 MRB AWNALYSIS AND SUMMARY

UPDATING MEMO

Subtotal for Task L440 g 10.70

TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

JMW J. M. WALLS 4.40 hours
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT £.20 hours
Total Task Code 1110 : 10.60
JIMW J. M. WALLS 4.00 hours
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 10.30 hours
Total Task Code L120 : 14.30
JMW J. M. WALLS 1.10 hours
Total Task Code L130 : 1.10
JMW J. M. WALLS .50 hours
Total Task Code L1600 : .50
JMW J. M. WALLS .60 hours
Total Task Code L210 : .60
JMW J. M. WALLS 7.00 hours
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 16.00 hours
Total Task Code L410 23.00
JMW J. M. WALLS .10 hours
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 1.10 hours
privileged “'_“{1
Confidentid CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aanta * Miami * Orlande = 5t Petersburg ¢ Tallohossee * Tompa * West Palm Beoch
T s destmeed sk o I iars marfarmad onder the strict supsrvision of admitied attorneys by persons not odmitted to proclice low in the contrelling jurisdiction

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000046
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. I 59-121389¢6

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JANUARY 9, 2009

2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 531202 PAGE 9

Total Task Code L420 : 1.20

MRB M. R. BERNIER 10.70 hours

Total Task Code L4440 10.70

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT . 13.60 hours

JMW J. M. WALLS 17.70 hours

MRB M. R. BERNIER 10.70 hours
TOTALS 62.00

COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED DECEMBER 31, 2008

Code E1C5 TELEPHONE
12/12/08 TELEPHCNE
Total Code E105

TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2008

INVOICE 531202 TOTAL

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENWTS

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlanta + Miami « Orlando + St Petersburg * Tallahossee ¢ Tampa * West Palm Beach
Services desianated with on [*) were performed wnder the sirict sepervision of admitted afioreys by persons not admitted to proctice law in the contralling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000047




CONFIDENTIAL

'CARLTON FIELDS

ATTQRNEYS AT LAW

FED, ID 59.12338%6

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA s ' FEBRUARY 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE : : REF. NO.. 00305-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 535404 - PAGE 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH. JANUARY 31, 2009

PHASE L10: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN

Task LI10 . FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

01/05/09 DMT » ',,- E 25 ‘RE_LIMITED .80

01/06/09 DMT IARTS REGAD ING WITNESS TESTIMONY ' .70
 TO UPDA%E

RE SAME.JD 3);
"CAM _RE STATUS OF

*TESTIMONY ( ; 1F fﬂ, 1B 30 TH NANCY HOEDSTEIN
AND LORI CRO (% 1).

i'. .40

y
01/06/09 JMW CALL WITH Gl@é

01/07/09 JMA .20
01/13/09 JIMW .50
01/13/09 JIMW 1.00

EstNDENCE FROM. CLI

IORIDO. a-REﬁaRmxﬁ@U!!""'

CAR:LTON FIELDS, PA. \
" Aﬂumq ’ Mlqmu . Prhndo R Petepsburg + Talluhusm + Tampg; * [West Paim Beach

b i At itnrnevs by persans not admitted fo practica law in the controlling jurisdictis

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000048




FED, ID 59-12338%9%

CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA FEBRUARY 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO, 00309~38087
INVOICE NUMBER 535404 ' PAGE 2
01/13/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT DOCUMENTS AND 1.00
DRAFT ISSUES AND TESTIMONY, DRAFT AGENDA FOR
MEETING WITH MELSON REGARDING& PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING- REVIEW .
RESPONSE
01/22/09 JMW  CALL.WITH MARCTA REGAR .20
PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME
01/23/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL RE 1.30
' UPDATE OF RATE CASE TESTIMONY; REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF STATUS OF TESTIMONY AND ISSUES WITH
WALLS AND UPDATE CHART RE SAME. '
01/26/09 JIMW REVIEW VARIOUS CORRESEQNDENQE,EROM TRIPLETT .20
" 'REVIEW VARIQUS CORRESPONDENCE TO
CLIENTS REGARDING WHWEN FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME, ISSUES
01/26/09 JMW .40
REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPGNDENCE AND ATTACHMENT,
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME
01/27/09 JMW  REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 1.70
REVIEW JBRIQUS MELSON CORRESPONDENCE. REGARDING
NN .3) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
EVIEW AND RESPOND TO CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING (NN (1.4)
01/28/09 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENE CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING .20
' e FOLLOW UP
WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING%-
: : R
01/28/09 ' 4.00
CARLTON: FIELDS, PA. |
.A1|cntc . Mlnmu . Oriando . St Petersburg * Tu||uhclssee » Tampa » West Palm Beoch
T At o b carpoae ook admitied 0 low in th i di
OQRP-OﬁCPOD 7206606?2 ing jurisdiction.
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CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW ’
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA FEBRUARY 12, 2009

FED.ID 59-[2336%6

2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 535404 ' . PAGE 3

01/29/09 JMW REVIEW AND A@aLYSI.

REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND ‘
ATTACHMENTS ‘REGARDING

01/30/09 JMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL .BO
WITH LYNCH CRIZP, :AND OLIVER REGARDING

{.7}; FOLLOW UP
WITH TRIPLETT |REGARDING

~(1>

Subtotal for Task L110 : 19.80
Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY

01/05/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS: 4.50

TRIPLETT REGARDING "ISSUES FROM SAME, PREPARE
NOTES REGARDING SAME

01/05/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF STATUS, STRATEGY WITH

TRIPLETT, pREppRE

1.30

REGARDING sﬁﬁﬁﬂlf
BEURIS REGARDING

01/06/09 DMT

WITH ALEX.GLENN, JOHI
ATTEND CONFERENCE CARHI]

01/06/09 DMT .70

Privileged” " -
CARLTON FDELDS PA.

Aﬂgntu = Migmi * Orlundo . 51 ?etersburg . Tuﬂohassea * Tampa * Wesl Palm Beoch -

bt oa cemmteinm mf wdeatlad atener b b acdmittert te Pt

OQ‘RP_O BEBS D 'l'i l-.:iv in-ﬂd'uocon'lr%llionu iurisdiction.




CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FlELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED.WD 59-1233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA FRERUARY 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE . - REF. NO. 00309-3

INVOICE NUMBER 535404 . PAGE 4

01/06/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF LIMITED RATE RELIEF

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING v
: ESPONDENCE 'AND SUMMARY OF

PREP .' '
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING“ (. 2),

. REVIEW VARIOUS: CLIENT‘CORRESPONDENCEWHEGARDING
2)

0ol1/06/09 JMW

01/07/09 DMT

01/07/09 JMW .
“WLTH TRIPLETT QEGARDING
ENT |1 . 2), REVIEW GAVJ_ALYSIS

01/08/09 JMW

REVIEW CLIENT: chngPONDENCE
REGARDING
PREPARE RESPONSE, REVIEW CLIENT RESTONSE (. 2)

01/12/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS ' | , WITH
RICK MELSON. }

i
01/12/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE TESTIMONY
DEVELOPMENT AND CASE STRATEGY. :

CARLTON FIELDS PA. | .
ﬂcrdcr . Mugml « Orlande * S, Pelersbusg . 'ﬁu’llohussee . Tamk # Waest Palm Beoch
Henls ettt s mmirinin aF admita At rmaue by narcens aot admited to oractic

0ORP-OPCPOD1

e

8087

.30

.40

.40

.40

.80

e low in the :onirollmg jurisdiction.

-47-000051




CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59-1233894

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA | FEBRUARY 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE : REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 535404 - ‘ PAGE 5

30N AND TRIPLETT REGARDING — 2.70
(.3); PREPARE FOR
€ COMMITTEE .CALL TO-

01/12/0% JMW

)

REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
. REGARDING SAME (2.2); REVIEW STATUS OF ISSUES
REPORT FROM RATE CASE STEERING COMMITTEE (.2)

01/13/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE INTERIM AND 2.60
LIMITED PROCEEDINGS; DRAFT LIST OF NECESSARY
ITEMS TO' COMPQ‘TE PETITION AND TESTIMONY' FOR
' JWITH BURNETT (0.1) ; GEEEEEN
A i ] _ I WITH BERNIER
{0.2); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE
TESTIMONY DEVELOPMENT AND STRATEGY (0 3).

01/13/09 JMW 1.00
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME]' SUPPORT FOR SAME
REVIEW SUMMARY OF POINTS FOR SAME
01/13/09 i u@'iz TH, LORL. ,5 ;3554£;¢ﬁfﬁ f il - -40
01/14/09 1.30
MARCIA OLIVIER ANQ ggqp
01/15/09 8.70
01/16/03 DMT ATTEND WEEKLY REGULATORY.CALL TO UPDATE TEAM ON .60

CASE STATUS; FOLLOW UP WITH VARIOUS WITNESS
TEAMS RE TESTIMONY ISSUES AND CASE . INFORMAT1ON.

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
T_;?Hanin ¥ Ktlami * Orlanda » St Pefersburg » Tollahassea ¢ Tampa ¢ West Palm Beach
P d U bl cmemietan ok mdmited Alnemauve by Rareane nol admited 1o proctics low in the controlimn jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-00005




CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

FED. ID 59-1233896
‘ ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA
2009 RATE CASE
INVOICE NUMBER 535404

01/16/09 DMT  REVIEW AND HNALYSIS OF ISSUES RE .40
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES
AND FOLLOW UP QUESTIONS RAISED IN MEETING WITH
RICK MELSON. ‘
01/16/09 JMW REVIEW VARIONS CO 1.70
CALL WITH ] G S (. 5),.llllllllll
i N ) PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE
TO CLIENT 'REGARD M. REVIEW CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING —, FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, ISSUES (1.2)
61/19/09 OMH  REVIER,GLENN, AND DOLEN ORKESEONDENCE: REGARDING 4.70
“RESPON 'iTo CLIENT (1 0); REVIEW
CORRESPONDE§CE FROM; I BURNETT AND PORTUONDO
CORRESPONDE“TE WITH )
3} ¢
0l/20/0% JMW 1.70
" prvitess®
! PP T CARLTON FIELDS, PA..
“ Sy A nla » Miami » Orlando » St Pelersburg Tulluhussee . Tampu * ‘West Palm Beoch
- ; L __J.Li_- 41 eremont kel vimiicd senrdmr i sheict einarvition af ndmitiad: atormevs by persons not ddmitled 1o practice low in the controlling jurisdiction.

FEERUARY 12, 2009
REF. NO. 00305-38087 °

PAGE 6
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CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW'

FED. I 59-12338%5

PROGRESS' ENERGY FLORIDA , PEBRUARY 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE ' REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 535404 | . PAGE 7 |

-01/21/09 JMW .50
( 3), REVIEW TEST YEAR LETTER,
i - {PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS
‘ ) VIEW -CLIENT RESPONSE, CALL TO
CLIENT REGARDING W (.2) .
01/21/09 ' \ .50
01/22/09 .50
; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS “OF
'Tﬂf ICK ME SON (0 3)
L Tl KRNy N
01/22/09 .60
JOHN BURNETT'(O 1)
01/22/05 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE. TEST YEAR .70
. LETTER, WITNESS TESTIMONY, AND CASE STATUS; .
REVIEW AND aNALYSIs OF . RESERR
017/22/09 JMW  REVIEW VARLPUS. CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE :REGARDING 2.70

CALLS TO AND WITH BURNETT RE
CALLS.NITH "LIENTS REGARDING

REVISE LETTER AND CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT

L REGARDINGT FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
/// .,/;é- REGARDING SBME, STATUS (1.2); CALL WITH.CLIENT
& oLk = " REVIEW CELIENT

g s ‘
//GP" /i;n; CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
A RESPOND TO

7.4 o "CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
gt Afidnta + Miomi * Orlonde » St Petersburg ® Tulluhassee * Tompa ® Was! Palm Beach
et A e ik s 1#) wierm Darfrmed under the strict subervision of admitted ofiomeys by persons not adnilted fo practice low in the conmrolling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000054




CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

‘ ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA FEBRUARY 12, 2009

FED. 1D 59-123389¢

2009 RATE CASE : ‘ REF. NO. 00309—38087

INVOICE NUMBER 535404 PAGE 8

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS ‘OF

01/23/09 DMT 2.30
01/23/09 JMW 1.50
01/23/09 JIMW 1,20
: 'CONFERENCE CALL WITH MELSON
AND TRIPLET CONFERENCE CALL WITH MELSON,
GLENN AND‘T_IPLETT REGARDING
) FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME,
ISSUES ACTION ITEMS, REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING SAME (1.0)
01/24/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS. OF 2.90
. I
01/25/05 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF 2.10
01/26/09 DMT 4.60
01/26/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE CASE FILING .40
DEADLINE ANP STRATEGY.
: /
01/27/08 JMW .50
{/8); REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT AND
TRIPLETT CQRRESPONDENCE REGARDING GENSENENNG
01/28/09 DMT 1.30
01/28/09 JMW .10
01/29/09 DMT N T e ' WITH RICK . .20
i MELSON (0.1) AND DANA BAUMANN (0.1) .
priviteged | -
L e CARLTON .FIELDS, PA.

rAﬂuntu « Migmi * Orlondo ® St Patersburg Tnlluhussee * Tampa * West Palm Beach . -
Sanhcss deslqnuled with an f’]]were performed under the strict supsrvision of admitted atiorneys by persons not admited fo proctice law in the ¢ontrelling: ;unsdldloh

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000055




CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 591233854

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA FEBRUARY 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE . " REF. NO. -00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 535404 PAGE 9

01/29/09 JMA REVIEW CORRI

.30
Ir-:ﬁ FILE,
AND .
RESPONSES,
QENSENNN) PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT
REGARDING ’
01/30/09 DMT  REVIEW ] AND ANALYSI 5 -,_',;-,;A;:: RE ,STR ,m \ND 2.30
01/30/09 JMW PREPARE 'FOR 1AN‘D ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL - 1.00

REGARDING - @il e PREPARE
NOTES REGARDING SAME (.7); FOLLOW UP. ISSUES,
RESEARCH, FACT DEVELOPMENT WITH TRIPLETT (.3)

- o ] : o L oo 0 ; i ‘
01/31/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GEENRSEENNNGEEENNENY .60

~

Subtotal for Task L120 : 71.30
Tagk L130 : EXPERTS/CONSULTANTS
01/08/05 JMW  CALL WITH BEVRIS GuiNSSSIRARISEimm .60
01/22/09 JMW .10
Subtotal for Task L130 3 .70
Task L160 : SETTLEMENT/NON-BINDING ADR
01/16/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF | 2.50

“FILING OF PETITION, NOTICE, AND HEARING
ISSUES, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT
REGARDING (il

| privileged

- CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
? 1 " Aflad :Mluml * Orlando * St Petersburg * Tullqhussee * Tampo * West Palm Beach :
Ranirac .-t.fim'.’-‘s‘tui .\mﬂ'\ nn l'\ warn mrforrnsd urider the sirict sunervision of admitted aftorneys by persans not odmitted fo proctice faw in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000056




CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

FED, 1D 591235094

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA FEBRUARY 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE ' ‘ C REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 535404 S PAGE 10
01/20/09 1.50
4.00
Task L210 : PLEADINGS
01/13/09 JMW 1.30
1.30
Task L250 : OTH WRITTEN MOTIONS & suannss:on
. 2 .Jx ’n e ‘,“]‘:”‘ .1. ‘
01/07/09 JMW  REVIEW CLIENT coaﬁggﬁb 4 .40
REVISE SAME'AND'PREP§RE:5;‘“"‘
CLIENT REGARDING SAME, REVIEW CLIENT RESPONSES
Subtotal for Task L250 ; .40
Task L410 : FACT WITNESSES
01/05/09 JMW 1.00
01/08/09 JMW ‘REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF FUEL WITNESS ISS 1.30

, TRIPLETT, FOLLOW UP REGARDING SAME, PRIO
"ORDERS (.2); REVIEW STATUS OF A&KG AND
_ WITNESSES WITH TRIPLETT FOLLON UP . WET

FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT (1.0)

CARLTON FIELDS PA. E
_Aflania + Miomi * Orlando * 5S¢, Pefersburg Tah'ahus.see . Tampa . W qum‘ueoch
b e (81 simen Aadbrmart ndne tha erirt siervision of admitied atorneys by persons not udr:rnil o prﬂ:hee luw m{Ih_elcbgflmllmg\hunsdlchon

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000057
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CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED.ID 59-1233894

'PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA FEBRUARY 12, 2008
2009 RATE CASE. REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 535404 : ' PAGE 11

01/09/09 JMW -60
01/12/09 JMW 1.50
' e R . 'PREPARE NOTES
“FOR MEETING WITH MELSON
01/13/09 JMW  REVIEW AND;ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE. .20
01/14/092 JIMW .20
01/15/09 JMW 8.00
01/16/09 JMW 1.10

- REVIEW REPORT REGARDING SAME, 'FOLLOW UP WI
-TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (.5} ;  FOLLOW.UP WITH

01/19/09 JMW.

. CARITON FIELDS PA
_ e Aﬂcnfa * Miomi * Orando * Si. Pelersburg * Talluhdssee * Tampa * West Pulm &each 0 .
Famitos detmcbed it n T it naraemad (s tha chich cnarvision AF admitied pfornevs by pessons not odmitted to-prostice |uw mﬂha donlrol]m;iayrlsdtchon

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000058




CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS
"~ ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA FEBRUARY 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO: 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 535404 PAGE 12

FED. 1D 59-1233896

01/21/09 JMW

o

TESTIMONY, . P
REGARDING

01/23/09 JMW

REVIEW AND ﬁNALYSIs oF “VARIOUS TYNCH
CORRESPONDENCE AND ATTACHMENTS. REGARDING LOAD
AND. SALES FORECASTS, @} -

). CORRESPONDENCE TO CL

(.5); REVIEW TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE AND
SUMMARY OF STATUS OF FACT WITNESS TESTIMONY
( 2)

01/26/09 JMW

01/27/09 JMW -

01/28/08 JMW

01/2%/0% JMW

CARITON FIELDS, PA. B

"
'

. Arlunlu * Migmi * Orlondo ¢ St Petersburg » Tullohussea » Tumpc West Palm Bgul:h D
Gt Amsievnetar with in £1'wers berfarmed uhder the sirict supervision of admitied aftarneys by pafsons not admittad 1 piactie {law in the con'ro"mg |unsdlchon.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000059




CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FELDS

: ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA . FEBRUARY 12, 2009

FED. 1D 59-12338%95 -

2009 RATE CASE ‘ REF. NO. S 003095-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 535404 _ ~ PRGE 13

01/30/09 JMW .60
FOLLOW UP WITH "TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME
DISCUSSION WITH WEINTRAUB AND DONAHUE
CALL WITH MELSON REGARDING Wil .
FOLLOW UP
CORRESPONDENCE WITH BURNETT (.2)
Subtotal for Task L410 : 29.00
Task L420  : EXPERT WITNESSES
01/09/05 MW .70
'
01/21/09 JMW  REVIEW "CLIENT AND EXPERT CORRESPONDENCE AND .60
- ATTACHMENT FOR CONFERENCE CALL ON @i PREPARE
FOR AND ATTEND CALL, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING
01/22/09 JMW .30
Suhtotal for Task L420 : 1.60
Task L430 : WRITTEN MOTIONS & suam:ss:ons
01/07/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF FILING DEADLINE FOR TEST .20
: YEAR LETTER, INCLUDING CONSIDERATION OF '
HOLIDAY, AND ADVISE CLIENT TEAM OF SAME. 7
01/23/09 DMT NN TH LISA STRIGHT .50
(03) ;G ' WITH DANA ‘
BAUMANN (0.2}
Subtotal for Task L430 s .70

CARLTON FIELDS, PA. ‘
PR I ﬂu[nin W Maumu * Orando * Si. Petarsburg » Tu“uhussag Tampa * Wesi Palm Beach
Candirac datinattad. with niui"l wirh néﬂorﬁned under the strict supervision of admitied oltorneys by persons nof admitied fo prociice law ini the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000060




FED. iD 59-1233896

CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

' PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA FEBRUARY 12, 2003
2009 RATE CASE | REF. NO. 00309-3B087
INVOICE NUMBER 535404 T PAGE 14

Task L1110 g

'01L/06/09 DMT
g1/07/09 DMT

01/27/09 DMT

Task L120

01./14/0% DMT

Task L210

01/06/05 JMW
01/068/09 JMW

01/13/09 JMW
01/14/08 DMT

01/22/09 JMW

_?riqaggsd R

PHASE L20: PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS
FACT INVESTIGATiON/DEVELOPMENT
PREPARE FOR 'AND.ATTEND CONFERENCE CALI, RE (EENE 1.30

SRR 1 TH JAVIER PORTUONDO, LORI
CROSS, AND GARY LITTLE.

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE .80
' 'FOLLOW UP WITH WITNESS TEAMS RE
STATUS OF AND ISSUES RELATED TO Siiiiiiy.
=
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE 3.70
CASE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW AND ANAMS&LS @F-
' AND PROVIDE COMMENTS REQ :
suﬁtgggx-for’wésa:;_ 5.80
ANALYSIS/STRATEGY i
PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND:: dion ] 70
MARCIA OLIVIER RE '
G !
Subtotal for Tas .70
PLEADINGS
REVIEW AND. AmAﬂysxs OF CLIENT D 2.50
' PREPARE DRAFT
DRAFT AND REVISE PETITION FOR B2 3.00
INCREASE
REVISE PETITION gl .60
_ 'PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE '
REGARDING (N i
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES Ré .90
PROCEEDING AND STRATEGY FOR DRA@T
AND PETITION IN SUPPORT OF SAME] ﬁn
o iR
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS QF-CLlsymch 2.50

DRAFT AND REVISE PETITION

CARLTON FIELDS,

Atlonta &~ Mlami » Orlundo . St Petersburg . Tullahnssee

| Wast Palm Beoch
not Pdrr;lﬁed to proctice low in the controlling jurisdiction.

" 09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000061




&

-FED, ID 59-12338%4

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA
2009 . RATE CASE
INVOICE NUMBER 535404

Task L410

01/02/09
01/06/09

01/06/09

01/08/09

01/09/09
01/09/09

01/10/0%
01/11/09
01/12/09

o1/13/09

01/13/09

01/14/09

P Services designated with ui\'ﬁéﬁwere p%rformed urider the strich supsivision of admitted

‘DMT *

CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
FEBRUARY 12, 2005

REF. NO.
PAGE 15

_Subtotal for Task L210

" FACT WITNESSES

DMT
DMT

DMT

DMT

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE FUEL FORECAST
AND EXHIBITS WITH. DANA BADMANN

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH
BENEFITS WITNESS TEAM RE: ,

DMT

DMT
DMT
DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

WIEH" JOHN BURNETT '10.1)% §
NP WITH JAMES BAISLIP . (ol
ANALYSIS OF -

i CARLTON F%ns PA.

Afiaitg * Miomi * Orlando "St ‘Petersburg « ulﬂ:ﬁassee e Tampa * West Palm Beoch

00309 38087

9.50

.60

3.80

.70

.70

.50

ligrieys by persons nol adinitted fo practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000062




CONFIDENTIAL

* CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 5%.1233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA ‘ FEBRUARY 12, 2005
2009 RATE CASE : . REF. NO. 00309-3B087

INVOICE NUMBER 535404 ‘_‘ ‘ PAGE 16

01/14/09 DMT 2.30

01/16/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH 1.60
CUSTOMER SERVICE TEAM RE S

01/22/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF m 1.60

01/22/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH .80
. EXECUTIVE COMPENSATION WITNES,S' TEAM.

01/23/0% DMT ANALYSIS OF ; 3.00
. AND FOLLOW URNWITH: TEAM
MEMBERS RE ADDITIONAL DETAILS. 3
01/26/09 DMT - e .60
01/26/09 DMT .70
01/28/0S DMT .60
01/28/09 DMT 2.40
. i,
01/29/09 . DMT . PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH JOE .70
MCCALLISTER AND. PALE WILLIAMS RE
01/29/09 DMT ; 3.70
i
' Subtota]. for Task L410 x s 34.50
Task L430  : 51
01/28/09% DMT '[ 1.20
- |
Privileg® l
Bubtotal for Task 6430 A 1.20 .

‘Task 1440 :. OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPPORT
CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

\lonta » Miami * Orlando * St, Petersburg » To]luhussee » Tampa * West P.cﬂm Benach

l 1 vine performed under the sirict supervision of admitied aHormeys by persons not udmmed to prociice law in the controlling 1ur|sdichon

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000063
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CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. 1D 59-12338%4

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA FEBRUARY 12, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 535404 PAGE 17

01/05/09 MRB  LEGAL RESEARCH - 4.80
o1/08/05 e
01/13/09 MRB  LEGAL RESEARCH INTO 2.70
01/14/09 MRB LEGAL RESEARCH INTO il 6.50
01/16/09 MRB LEGAL RESEARCH 1.80
01/15/05% MRR UPDATE OF .50
01/20/09 WMRE A RESEARCH ON 6.40
01/23/09 MRB LEGAL RESEARCH FOR ' .20
01/26/09 W™MRB  LEGAL RESEARCH FOR 2.00
01/29/09 MRE DRAFTED MEMO TO M. WALLS REGARDING .20
a Subtotal for Task L440 : 25.60
A% aﬂ
?‘\q‘\“’g e“ti‘ﬂ‘
coo™®

TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES T

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlonta % Miami « Orlando = St Petersburg + Tallohassee * Tompo = West Polm Beach
Services designated with on {*) were performed under the siric supervision of admified attorneys by persons not admilted 1o prattice law in the confrolling jurisdiction,

O09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000064




FED. ID 59-123389¢6

CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA

2005 RATE CASE

INVOICE NUMBER 535404

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

JMW
DMT

DMT

JMW
DMT

JMW
DMT

DMT

MRB

Services designoted with on (*] were pedormed under the strict supervision of admitted attorneys by persons not admitted to proctice Jaw in the conirolling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000065

J
D

[ =

. M. WALLS
. M. TRIPLETT

Total Task Code

M. WALLS
M. TRIPLETT

Total Task Code
M. WALLS

Total Task Code
M. WAILLS

Total Task Code

M. WALLS
M. TRIPLETT

Total Task Code
M. WALLS
Total Task Code

M. WALLS
M. TRIPLETT

Total Task Code
M. WALLS

Total Task Code
M. TRIPLETT
Total Task Code

R. BERNIER

Lllo

Llzo

L130

L1660

L210

L250

L410

L420

L430

17.00 hours
B.60 hours

25.60

31.70 hours
40.30 hours

72.00

.

.70 hours

.70

4.00 hours
g 4.00

9.90 hours
.90 hours

10.80

”

.40 hours

.40

25.00 hours
34 .50 hours

: 63.50
1.60 hours

1.60

1.3%0 hours

1.90

"

25.60 hours

FEBRUARY 12,
REF. NO.
PAGE 18

CARLTON FiELDS, PA.

Aflonto » Miomi ¢ Crlende » 5t Petershurg « Tallohassez = Tempa » West Palm Beach

2009

c0309-38087




CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
FEBRUARY 12, 200%

FED, D 59-1233898

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA

2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-28087
INVCICE NUMBER 535404 BPAGE 19
Total Task Code L440 25.60 4,492 .80
ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 86.20 hours at
JMW J. M. WALLS 94 .30 hours at
MRRB M. R. BERNIER 25.60 hours at
TOTALS 206.10

COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED JANUARY 31, 2009

Code E101 COPYING

01/12/09 COPYING COST 2.80
Total Code E101 2.80

Code E105 TELEPHONE
12/17/08 TELEPHCONE . 74.36"
01/07/09 TELEPHONE 16.20
01/13/09 TELEPHONE 35.10
01/21/09 TELEPHCNE 4.05
01/30/0% TELEPHONE .15
Total Code EI105 123.86
TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2009 $126.66

INVOICE 535404 TOTAL

BALANCE DUE FRCM PREVICUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlanto  Miomi * Orlendo * St Petersburg ¢ Tollohassee * Tompa ¢ West Palm Beach
Services designated with on {*] were performed under the strict supervision of admitted offoreys by persons not admitted to practice law In the conirolling jurisdictian.

0SRP-OPCPOD1-47-000066



REDACTED

5 g PLEASE REMIT T
CARLTON FIELDS _rosemsasy

FED, ID 5v-123389% aman, FL 33601-3229
ATTORNEYS AT LAW 813.223.7000

Fax 813.229.4133

One Afionlic Center

12G1 W. Pachiras 5i., Sty. 3000 P.O. Box 019101 P.O. B [171] PO, Box 2881 P.O. Drower 190 P.O, Box 150
atlanto, Georgia :;030.9 Miomi, Ft 33121 Orlondo, FiL 32802 St Petersburg, FL 33731 Tallchassse, FL 32302 Vast Paim Beach, Fi 23402
404.815,3400 305.530.0050 407.849.0300 7278217000 B50.224.1585 54).659.7070
fox 404.815.3415 Fox 305.530.0055 Fox 407 .648.9099 Fax 737.822.3768 fax 850.222.0398 Fax 541.65%9.7368
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MARCH 12, 2002
PO BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. 00305-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 535248
DUE PATE: UPON RECEIPT

RE: 2009 RATE CASE
BALANCE DUE FROM PREVICUS STATEMENT

LESS: PAYMENTS

BALANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 02/28/0%
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 02/28/089

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BALANCE OUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 | 61-90 81-120 OVER 120 TOTAL

+%% REMITTANCE COPY *#% SUBM\TYED

\ MAR 15 2008

e j

e

oo™ ELECTRONICALLY — /
Payment is due upon receipt. inierest will be chorged on unpaid invoices oged 35 days of mare from invoice dote. /

4

‘wvices designated with an (*] were performed under the strict supervision of admitted attorneys by persons not admitied to practice law in the controlling jurisdicti

O09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000067




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. D 59-1223896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MARCH 12, 200%
2009 RATE CASE ] REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 539248 . : PAGE 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2009

PHASE 110: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN
Task L110 : FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

02/02709 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE RATE CASE .30
TESTIMONY AND WITNESSES.

02/05/05 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SUMMARY o'sp . .30

LAT, '*PROCEEDINGS REGARDING

G CRIPARE CORRESPONDENCE ' TO TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME

02/11/09 DMT DISCUSS 'I'ESTIMONY s-m-rus 'WITH TOM mesou .30
02/13/09 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS CLIEMQCORRESPONDENCE AND ' .20
ATTACHMENTS REGARDING @il
Y '

02/20/09 JMW. CALL WITH TOM HARRIS REGARDING GHFNENNENNG .20

0z2/23/09 JMW 2.60

REVIEW CLIENT RESPONSES REGARDING SAME, PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT (1.3); PFREPARE FOR AND
ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH T&D AND REGULATORY

NOTES REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP CALL WITH

BURNETT REGARDING SAME (1.0); FOLLOW UP WITH -

| WITNESS
TESTIMONY STATUS (.2)
02/24/09 JMW  REVIEW VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENTS .60
‘REGARDING | {(.1); REVIEW

VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT AND
A S R S

CARLTON FIELDS, P A,

Alloniu . Mu:mn * Orondo * 5t Petersburg # Tullnbnssee * Tampa.* ‘Wast Palm Beach

4tk mmemriee sl ndeited cineere b nertans net n w in the controlling jurisdiction
OSKP EBEBEET. 47000068




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
. ATTORNEYS AT LAW :
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MARCH 12, 2009

FED. D 591233896

2009 RATE CASE . e REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 535248 PAGE 2

WITH BEURIS REGARDING. '$AME AND REVIEW RESPONSE

ENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING@J), STATUS, REVIEW .
(.2) -

. Subtotal for Task L110

: 4.50
Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY

02/01/09 DMT REVIEW.AND ANALYSIS m‘m 1.30
02/02/09 JMW  REVIEW CLIENT. CORRE‘PONBENCE REGARDING (0 .20

' PREPARE RESPONSE

{.1); FOLLOW UP
TSSES;.

02/03/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANAL (815 OF'
] ' WITH RICK MELSON

.70
02/03/09 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS PORTUONDO AND Bumm,_ o .80
. CORRESPCNDENCE 'REGARDING,
REVIEW
. PREPARE AND REVIEW VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE TO

CLIENTS REGARDING SAME, SUMMARY
02/04/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS 'OF ISSUES WITH JOHN - .20

BURNETT,
02/05/09 DMT  CONFERENCE C_ALL WITH CLIEN‘T TEAM E-_ .50
02/05/09 DMT  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS wm 1.10
02/05/09 JMW _. 1.10

e E——— ) “FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, RESEARCH, STRATEGY,
FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH MELSON AND

PO B CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

S (Y B A;Iuntq . Mlurnl . Orlondu * St Petersburg = Tullahussee = Tampo * Wast Palm Beach

cemitatan od e it rmdnaive e rarsnRS ce low in the controlling jurisdiction
ERE BBEPEDT-47-000089




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
- ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MARCH 12, 2009

FED. 1D §9-1233896

2009 RATE CASE : REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 533248 : PAGE 3

TRIPLETT (.8)

02/06/09 JMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL 1.40
REGARDING STATUS AND STRATEGY WITH BURNETT,
PORTUONDO, MELSON _WALLS, AND TRIPLETT REVIEW

F"FOLLOW UP
ARDING SAME,

WITNESSES STRATEGY

02/09/09 JMW TOUS  CLEENT. CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING .50

RESPONSES, REVISE SAME

02/16/0% DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF .40
AND RESEARCH WITH WALL - '
02/10/09 Dur REvIEW AND ANALYSIS OF [ v T 20
RICK MELSON. . . Sl :
02/10/09 JMW : 1.00
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME, REVIEW
RESPONSES, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO BURNETT
RECARDING QD | .5)

02/11/09 JMW  REVIEW =CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING .80
02/12/09 JMW .30
PREPARE RESPONSES
02/13/09 DMT ATTEND WEEKLY CALL RE RATE CASE STRATEGY AND .40

TESTIMONY.
privileged. |
| CARHON FIELDS, PA.

oo e ‘:E‘_:,‘ Ailunm . Mluml . Orlando . Sf Palersburg . Talluhassee * Tampo = West Paim Beach .

#un b rrlemittad mfierneavs by persons not odmitied to practice low in the contralling jurisdictio

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000070



FED. ID 59-12328%96

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA ;
2009 RATE CASE : REF. NO. 00309-38087

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
MARCH 12, 2009

INVOICE NUMBER 539248 PAGE 4
02/13/09 DMT REVIEW -AND ANALYSIS N WITH JOHN
BURNETT. -
02/13/09 JMW  PREPARE FOR AND TTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL
02/13/09 JMW  ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING iy,
WITNESS TESTIMONY REVIEW AND
DEADLINGS
02/16/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE TESTIMONY AND
- PETITIONS.
02/16/09 JMW
REGARDING SAME {.7)
02/18/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CASE ISSUES RE TESTIMONY
FINALIZATION AND WITNESS STATUS.
02/18/09 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT AND TRIPLETT
CORRESPONDENCE -REGARDING
DISCUSSION WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME
02/20/09 JMW

02/22/09 DMT

Privileged -

) J EORRESPONDENCE TO
GARDING SAME, REVIEW CLIENT ‘
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.7); CALL WITH
BURNETT, CROSS, AND OLIVIER, AND WITH MELSON
AND TRIPLETT REGARDING ISSUES, STATUS OF
TESTIMONY, FILINGS, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING
SAME (.6); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF STIPULATION
AND REVISED STIPULATION, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE
TC CLIENTS REGARDING SAME, REVIEW CLIENT
RESPONSES, CALLS TO BURNETT REGARDING SAME (. 4)

.

REDACTED

.

.40

.60

-50

.40

.00

.60

.60

.70

' REVIEW AND;. ANALYSIS - OF), .10
' CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlanlu * Miami » Orlundo *+ St.Petersburg * Tu[luhassee * Tampd *» Wes! Palm Beach
o = mmuten ol bt bocnmn b marsnne Ant ndmitter_in practice low in the controlling jurisdiction.
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REDACTED

CARLTON EIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59-12330%6

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDI,X ' MARCH 12, 2009
2009 RATE CARSE _ : REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 539248 ‘ ' . PAGE 5

02/23/09 DMT  FINAL REVIEW.AND mmszs OF 3.70
02/24/09 DMT DISCUSS CASE ISSUES AND DISCOVERY PROCESS WITH .20
- LISA STRIGHT. ‘
02/24/09 OMH REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM BURNETT.REGARDING .10
"02/27/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS CLIENT .20
CORRESPONDENCE. REGARDING il
02/27/09 JMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL .50
REGARDING STATUS, WITNESS AND EXHIBIT
PREPARATION
Subtotal for Task L120 5 22.70
Task L130 : EXPERTS/CONSULTANTS '
02/03/09 JMW { CINDY LEE REGARDING STATUS OF .40
ISSUES, FOLLOW UP WITH
EXPERT," P‘REPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME
' 02/05/09 JMW PQNDENC’E REGARDING REVISED .20
AND ISSUES (.1); FOLLOW
S@ITE CLIENT REGARDING UiEEND
.1y
02/06/09 JMW ‘, ‘ DENCE. AND. PREPARE 1.50
. RESPONSE REGARDING ‘ '
REVIEW AND '
CORRESPONDENCE AND ATTACHMENT REGARDING —
UABAMNEY (.3); PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND VARIOUS
CLIENT CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING
ISSUES, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME, PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO JAVIER, WILL AND CINDY
REGARDING SAME (1.2)
02/14/09 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING- .10

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO BEURIS REGARDING
_SAME; REVIEW.CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

) Aﬂunm . Mmrnl . Orlundo . St Fetersburg . Ta"chussee * Tampa * Wast Palm Becch

J <2 X oL o h A il - S




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS '

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. 1D 59-1233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MARCH 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 539248 | : PAGE 6

Subtotal for Task L1300

-
N
.

[ -3
L=

Task L1380 : OTHER CASE ASSES, DEVEL. & ADMIN

LR i

02/05/09 JMW LBW b@ﬁ*@..b E%LJQORRE ,E_’ONPEESC,;E F .60

02/10/09 JMW

3.50
P 4,10
Task L210 : PLEADINGS
02/06/09 JIMW 3.50
TA PLETI REVIEW 'AND! ANALYSIS
OF RULES AND STATUTES AND FOLLOW UP |
CORRESPONDENCE WITH BERNIER REGARDING SAME,
RESEARCH, ISSUES, AND STRATEGY ON ARGUMENTS
02/07/09 JMW ' 3.50
. ) 'DRAFT AND REVISE PETITION FOR
_.SAME, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO BERNIER AND
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME
02/09/09 JMW 1.80

: D ANALYSIS OF COMMISSION RULES AND
3~ \AUTHORITIES REGARDING SAME (1.6); CALL WITH
ettt . 7. 'BURNETT REGARDING SAME, ISSUES (.2)
PV AR ,

‘CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Allamu ¢ Miami Orlondo ¢ 51 Petersburg « Tulluhassea + Tampo = WestPalm Beach

S T PO IUURUFAF SO T T T VR TH h.pﬁ\ér.ﬁfis Opclbﬁrﬁu)ril-vzv n the co notmlgm iurisdiction.




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

FED. T 501233896 .
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDi-‘ MARCH 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE ’ REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 539248 ) PAGE 7

02/09/09 JMW

TRIPLETT 1.40

_ ] TEW ‘RESPONSES,
REVISE PETITLON 'ESPFONDENCE TO
CLIENTS REGARDING.§ ‘(.s); REVIEW
MELSON COMMENTS (il
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLTENTS "REGA!

"

REVIEW RESPONSES, FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, STRATEGY, REVISE
PETITION (.6); CALL AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH

'CLIENTS REGARDING
- (.2)

02/11/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF: “.”"“‘“‘*”“ SRR 2.00

02/11/09 JMW .10

02/12/09 JIMW .20

’

REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
REVIEW OPC AND AG NOTICES OF
INTERVENTION, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT -

recarDING (D

REVIEW VARIOUS CORRESEQNDENCE;&NQ'AEE&QHMEN@S
FROM CLIENTS REGARDING'

.
REGARDING SAME, STRATEC

02/12/09 - IMW

URNETT AND CLIENTS
. FOLLOW UP WITH
~:5); REVIEW MEMOS AND

AUTHORITIES CON -~
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT"
TSSUES, AUTHORITIES, REVIEW RESPONSES (1.7);
DRAFT AND REVISE PETITION, NOTES REGARDING SAME
{3.5)

02/13/09 JMW

AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH BERNTER REGAR
(.5); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF _

CARLTON. FIELDS, PA.

Ailunh: » Miomi ¥ Orlando » 51, Petersburg * qulohcssee « Tampa * Woest Poim Beach
T b 0t tee feme i 8 doniniad ariaus b marsnne st adkmittad] to oroctice faw in the controlling jurisdiction.
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
: : ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA . - MARCH 12, 2009

. FED.ID 59.12338%8

200% RATE CASE : REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 539248 o PAGE 8

_ Bl (.5); REVISE
PETITION AND PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO TRIPLETT
AND BERNIER REGARDING SAME, ISSUES (1.2)

02/16/09 JMW .70
(.5); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE WITH QUESTIONS,
1SSUES FROM MELSON REGARDING SAME, PREPARE
RESPONSE {.2)
02/16/09 JIMW 1.00
. .“f uHWNmem‘fw.mm“.“” y
PREPARE AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE WITH
~ CLIENTS REGARDING SAME
02/17/09 JMW  REVIEW. AND ' ANALYSIS OF | PoRrUONDo CORRESEONDENCE .70
TT rAmEY‘
SAME, PREPARE RESPONSEl
AND CALL, WITH CLIENT- REG
: IPREPARE[EESEONSE
02/17/09 .30
02/18/0% JMW 1.20
’
A : : GHT AND
" BURNETT REGARDING ]
. FOLLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT R
. STATUS
02/18/09 JMW REVIEW AND RESPOND .TO. qsgonnsngiEgoM - .50

MELSON REGARDING
ﬂ REVISE PETITION

i

?ﬁv'\le?».ed ST

Lo CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
¢ i Aﬁumu * "Miami = Orlcndo * 5t Petersburg = Tcnlk:hussaa * Tompo « Weat Palm. Beach .
r 1 bl el Lt af et Aarnan b narcane not admitad 16 orociice law in the_controlling jurisdiction.
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW-

FEC. ID 5¢.1233696

PROGRESS ENERGY. FLORIDA MARCH 12, 2009
2009. RATE CASE S REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 539248 . PAGE 9

02/18/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT LIMITED PROCEEDING 2.00

PETITION, REVIEW TESTIMONY, SETTLEMENT, AND
REVISE SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLET'I‘ ‘REGARDING
SAME, ARGUMENTS, PRE_PARE \CORRESBONBENCE TO
CLIENTS REGARDING

)

Subtotal for Task L210

29.10
Task L230 : COURT MANDATED CONFERENCES

02/26/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL RE - 1.60
’ HEARING DATES; AMEND MOTION AND  FOLLOW UP WITH
OPPCSING COUNSEL RE SAME.

02/26/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF STAFF CORRESPONDENCE : 2.00
REGARDING MEETING TO DISCUSS RATE CASE
SCHEDULES, PREPARE AND REVIEW CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING WM (.Z2); REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS .OF STAFF AND CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND
PROPOSED SCHEDULES, CALL AND CORRESPONDENCE TO -
CLIENT REGARDING SAME (.3); PREPARE FOR AND
ATTEND STAFF CONFERENCE CALL WITH ALL PARTIES
AND CLIENTS, CONFERENCE WITH CLIENTS REGARDING
Wy (1.5)

Subtotal for Task L230

3.60

Task L250 : OTH WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSION

p2/17/09 'JMW REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING .20
; *PREPARE RESPONSE; FOLLOW UP
WITH TRIPLE{'[’T REGAR.DING WITNESS ISSUES; REVIEW

CLIENT CORRESDONDENCE REGARDING SAME

Subtotal for Task L250

"
)

6}
Q

Tagk L410 FACT. WITNESSES

02/02/05 JMW

CARLTON FIEI.DS PA.

Aﬂuniu * Miomi * Orlundo * Si. Petersburg = Tullohcssee + Tompa * West Palm Beoch

' [

oo mminioe ol admibiad wltnrnsars by morsans not odmitted to practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

FED. 1D 591233896
’ ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY' FLORIDA _ MARCH 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE . REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 539248 PAGE 10

02/02/09 JMW  PREPARE FOR AND' ATTEND ‘CONFERENCE. QALL WIT
PORTUQNDO. AND :MELSON . REGARDING
. BRSNS, PREPARE NOTES

REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME, ISSUES .(. FOLLOW UB WITH
TRIPLETT, REGARDING-

.70

02/03/09 JMW

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT EXPLAINING
SAME, ISSUES, REVISIONS, AND STRATEGY

02/06/09 JMW .80

! WITH SLUSSERN HOLDS N, AND MELSON REGARDING

I ] (.6);
REVIEW VARIOUS TRIPLETT AND CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
‘ FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME, STRATEGY (.1)

. 02/09/09 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT AND TRIPLETT R . .20
. CORRESPQNDENCE REGARDING i

o

REVIEW VARIOU,S CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING .10
 FOLLOW UP' WITH TRIPLETT

02/12/09 JMW

REGARDING SAME

02/18/09 JMW REVIEW,AND ANALYSIS OF i _ 3.50
| ) FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT

l CORRESPONDENCE TO MELSCN REGARDING SAME, REVIEW
RESPCNSE (1.2)

02/18/09 JMW

.70

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Atlanta = ‘Miami ¢ Orando = St. Pelersburg « Toiluhassee * Tampa » West Palm Bsur:h

T | IS PR I Y tetmm Al meiHad A

b marenneinot admitind to orectice low in the conirolling jurisdiction.
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REDACTED

[

CARLTON FIELDS:

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59.12338%¢

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA _ MARCH 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE _ REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 5329248 - PAGE® 11

-

- 02/19/09 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS BURNETT ANH STRIGHT“

' - ¢ 1) ; REVIEW
STATUS OF TESTIMONY FOR™ GENERATION,
TRANSMISSION AND DISTRIBUTION, PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO RURNETT REGARDING
REVIEW BURNETT AND CLIENT RESPONSES, FOLLOW UP
CALLS WITH BURNETT AND CROSS, CORRESPONDENCE TO
HARRIS AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE AND . -
ATTACHMENTS FROM CROSS. (.7); REVIEW REVISED
DESCHAMPS TESTIMQNY,_FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT E .
( 6) ; REVIEW

02/21/09 &MW

9.50
02/22/09 JMW .10
02/22/09 JMW 7.00
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING SAME
Subtotal for Task L410 : 25.60
Task L420 : EXPERT WITNESSES
02/03/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VANDER WEIDE ROE 1.50

TESTIMONY AND EXHIBITS,  PREPARE NOTES REGARDING
SAME, QUESTICNS, REVISIONS :

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

* Miami * Orlondo ® St. Petersburg « Taﬂohassae * Tompa * West Palm Beach
marl uncar the drict sinarvision of admited riomavs by nersons not admitied to piactice law in the controlling jurisdiction.
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED, ID 59-1233696

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MARCH 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 539248 : PAGE 12

02/09/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS or{NEN
CORRESPONDENCE AND PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND
CONFERENCE CALL WITH CINDY LEE AND EARL
ROBINSCN REGARDING'SAME, STUDY AND TESTIMONY,
ISSUES, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME (1.4) ;"
CALL WITH BURNETT REGARDING- ISSUES (.2);
REVIEW NOTES AND P

CLIENTS REEARDIN

02/10/09 JMW CALL WITH CROSS REGARDING _ ] .30
ISSUES, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME '
02/10/09 JMW  REVIEW VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE AND- ATTACHMENTS : .80
REGARDING . RATINGS AND COSTS WITH BEURIS AND
VANDER WEID .2} ; PULL AND REVIEW
: AND PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
- (¢3) , FOLLOW UP CALL WITH

02/18/0% JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT DEPRECIATION .50
. EXPERT TESTIMONY AND EXHIBITS, REVISE SAME

02/18/05 JMW REVIEW NOTES AND CALL TO VANDER WEIDE REGARDING .30
TESTIMONY ISSUES, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME

02/18/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CHANGES. TO. STORM - .50
TESTIMONY REGARDING il _ - PREPARE
AND, RESPOND TO MELSON CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

02/19/09. JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT DEPRECIATION - 2.00
EXPERT TESTIMONY AND EXHIBITS, PREPARE NOTES :
REGARDING QUESTIONS, REVISE SAME

02/20/09 JMW  CALLS WITH CINDY LEE REGARDING GRS .20
S
02/20/09. JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DEPRECIATION EXPERT 2.00

TESTIMONY AND STUDY, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING
SAME, REVISIONS, QUESTIONS

Subtotal for Task L420 ; 10.30

- PHASE L20: PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

% “ii‘ Adlaria = Miomi « Orlando * 5t Peiersburg . Tulluhqssee » Tampa * West Palm Beach
i

cleinicd cendansha ik riimnmideian af mdmitnd aBrrnae b marennsnnt ndmiteH inracties Jow in the mn alhna furisdiction.
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59-1213896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA . MARCH 12, 2008
2005 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00303-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 5335248 PAGE 13

Task L110 : FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

02/18/09 DMT  PARTICIPATE.IN, CONBERENCE: CALL.WITH ' .80

[P s

02/25/09 JMW REVIE?I GLJ,'EN'.P CORRESPON'DENCE REGAR.DING _ .50

, FOLLOW
UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (.2)

02/27/09 DMT ATTEND RATE CASE CALL TO UPDATE CASE ISSUES AND .50
. TESTIMONY.
02/27/0% JMW .60
WESUNWENS,  FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
SAME (.1); REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING STATUS OF TESTIMONY, DRAFTS (:2)
. I
Subtotal for Task L110 : 2.40
Task L120 ANRLYSIS/STRATEGY
02/06/09 DMT CONFERENCE, CALL WITH TEAM RE LIMITED PROCEEDING .BO
) AND OTHER PETITIONS; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
ISSUES RE WITNESS RESPONSIBILITY.
02/26/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE O .20
jvileged . : :
o - - : Subtotal for Task L120  : 1.00
‘Task L210  : PLE
‘pz]ibybélﬁ‘ i DRAFT PETITION FOR LIMITED PROCEEDING. .30

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
é‘-Aﬂﬂnm * Miomi * Orlando + 8t Petersburg * Tollchassee ¢ Tampo © West Polm Beach
SHELH B iat vinrdiar tha it cmarvision of admitted gormevs by persons not admitted to practice low in the controlling jurisdiction,
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59-12338%%

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MARCH 12, 2009 '
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 535248 o = g PAGE 14

02/16/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF OPC AND AG RESPONSE TO . .30

60-DAY NOTICE RULE -WAIVER PETITION, PREPARE
NOTES REGARDING SAME

02/17/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT LIMITED PROCEEDING .20
PETITION WITH MATT BERNIER

02/17/09 JMW

—
ASE ‘RATE RELIEF iy

BN, | PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
CLIENTS REGARDING.EEM§. FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME |

02/15/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF WHITE SPRINGS AND FRF .20 -
PETITIONS TO INTERVENE; .PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE ¢
TO CLIENTS REGARDING m REVIEW CLIENT
RESPONSE REGARDING [

02/19/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS -OF FRF OPROSITION TO 60 DAY .80
’ NOTICE REQUIa,‘; . CALL WITH BURNETT
%MIEW CLIENT.

_____ [REVIER cLIENT

— REVIEW STAFF No:rfeE “CALENDAR 'SAME;
PREPARE NOTES FOR CONFERENCE WITH STAFF AND
INTERVENORS

02/20/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RATE CASE PETITION AND .20
: INTERIM RELIEF REQUEST.

02/23/09. DMT FINALIZE NOTICE.OF WITHDRAWAL-AND COORDINATE ] -60
GATHERING APPROVALS FOR FILING OF AGREED
MOTION; FOLLOW UP WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE
SAME '

02/23/09 JMW .20

02/25/092 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT PUBLIC NOTICE FOR .30
INCLUSION IN. MFR SCHEDULE.

02/25/09 JMW REVISION TO VARIOUS PETITIONS TO INCORPORATE .90

CUSTOMER NUMBER LANGUAGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH

—  TRIPLETT REGARDING- ( 2); REVIEW AND
/ | PREPARE. CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
_Pr-‘v"‘eged P \ o5
: Y CARLTON FIELDS, PA

M- Arlnnh = Miami * Orendo ¢ 5t Plraiprsbnrg . Tallc:hussee = Tampa * West Paim Beach
g PNt it cenieinl s ddiitard Attnrmaus b nadine not admifisd To proctice law in the controlfing jurisdiction.
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. 1D .59.1233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA "MARCH 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE . REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 539248 ; PAGE 15

_ (.1} ; REVIEW §

REVISE PETITION REGARDING SAME,
. CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARD

i REVIEW, CLIENT .CORRESPONDENCE

'REVIEW STATUTE AND RULE, PREPARE RESPONSE TO
CLIENT, CALL WITH BURNETT REGARDING J (.4)

Subtotal for Tasgk L210 B 5.50

Task L230 : COURT MANDATED CONFERENCES

02/20/09 JMW A] 1.20
. I REVIEW. RES?ONSE}
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING
@M FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING STATUS
. 02/25/09 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING (HIREEN .20
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, 1SS
Subtotal'faf Task L230 : 1.40
Task L250 : OTH WRITTEN HOTIONS & snaurss:on
02/06/09 MRB  LEGAL RESEARCH -. 7.60
02/07/09 MRB LEGAL RESEARCH QN;”H‘: - 1.50
02/08/09 MRB REVIEWED DRAFT OF MOTION FOR EMERGENCY WAIVER .20
' FROM RULE 25-6.140
02/09/09 MRB REVIEW OF EMERGENCY MOTION FOR WAIVER OF RULE 1.50
: , 25-6.140; CITATIONS, AND ADDITIONAL:RESEARCH '
02/10/09 : ' 2.80
02/12/09 2.50

CARLITON FIELDS, PA.
A - ¢ Atont ¢ Miomi = Orlando = 5t. Petersburg -+ Talluhussee » Tampo * West Palm Beoch
L1 03 cirmio mabermacd sncdar tha shiet sunarvision of admited offornevs by persons not odmitted lo proctice low in the controlling jurisdiclion.
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REDACTED

. | ~ CARLTON FIELDS |

FED. 1D 59-1233896
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA ‘ MARCH 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE i REF. NO. 00309-3B087
INVOICE NUMBER 535248 , PAGE 16

02/13/09 MRRB

02/15/09 MRB

02/18/09 MRB DRAFTED PETITION FOR LIMITED BASE RATE : 2.10
PROCEEDING ‘ :

02/21/09 JMW  REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIQUS CLTENT . 20
CORRESPONDENGE - RE, . ool

REVIEW VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPC AND
INTERVENORS REGARDING SAME

02/23/09 JMW CORRESPONDENCE WITH OBC COUNSEL REGARDING -1.40
STIPULATION/ MOTION, REVIEW: RESPONSES FROM
OTHER COUNSEL, CALL WITH BURNETT AND BECK
REGARDING- FOLLOW UP PREPARATION OF JQINT
MOTION FOR SIGNATURE, NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF
PETITION (.2); PREPARE AGREED MOTION, REVIEW
NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL, CALLS WITH MARTHA CARTER,
BURNETT, PAUL LEWIS, AND REHWINKLE REGARDING
SAME, STATUS, ISSUES, REVIEW AND PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME, REVIEW VARIOUS
CORRESPONDENCE AND NOTICES FILED REGARDING SAME
(1.2} Y

02/24/02 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF PSC NOTICE ON STAFF 20
' RECOMMENDATION AND STAFF RECOMMENDATION ON
60-DAY NOTICE WAIVER

02/26/09 JMW  REVIEW CLIENT CCRRESPONDENCE AND OPC LETTER .60
REGARDING TEST YEAR AND DATA, CLIENT EMAILS

- CALL WITH BURNETT REGARDING
E REGARDING

P WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING RESEARCH ON
+ REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING (i) PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO

‘ /TRIPLETT AND BERNIER REGARDING -( 2)
ivl‘eged “‘I ' :

rr ‘
CARLTON FIELDS, PA. ’
opta -+ Miami * Orlando * 3t Pelersburg * Tollohossee * Tonipa + West Palm Beach.
meberled e tha it crmandiinn af ndmibed AMsmae b nerons ol admitiad in practics low in the conirolling iurisdiction,
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNMNEYS AT LAW

| FED. D 591233895

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MARCH 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE _ ' REF. NO. 00309-3B8087 /

INVOICE NUMBER 539248 ‘7 PAGE 17

v

>

30.10

Subtotal for Task L250 H
- . 1 .
Task L410 : FACT WITNESSES - -
02/03/09 DMT REVIEW AND-ANALYSIS O ] .60
IR, - DANA
BAUMANN AND PAUL MOORE RE SAME.
02/04/05 DNT  REVISE TESTIMONY CONSISTENT WITH COMMENTS FROM Y
TEAM. | | .
02/04/09 REVEEH;?EP»AN‘”~5 - orl 1.40
02/06/05 DMT DISCUSS RATE CASE TESTIMONY WITH EXECUTIVE 1.80
COMPENSATION TEAM. "o
P
02/09/09 DMT DREPARE FOR AND ATTEND: CONFERENCE CALL RE STORM 1.20
STUDY TESTIMONY WITH GARY L;TTLE AND RICK
MELSON. ‘ i
02/11/09 DMT  DISCUSS WITH .30
JOHN BURNETT.
02/11/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS oF il ' .40 "
02/12/09 DMT . .40
02/16/09 DMT ‘PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH 1.20
'WITNESS TEAM RE ALG TESTI Y.
02/17/09 DMT - ) 2.10
02/19/09 3.30
02/20/09 DMT ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH FUELS WITNESS TEAM 2.10
RE TESTIMONY (1.8); ATTEND UPDATE CALL RE.CASE
STATUS (0.3).

R

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
"t Aflanla ® Miomi v Orlando » 51, Petersburg = Tallahussea * Tampa -+ :West Polm Baach
suihris marfrmand undar the"eiriet winanisinn of admitled: @ttornevs by bersons not admitied to prachice law in the confrolhng jurisdiction.
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FED. ID 59-1233896

REDACTED

CARLTON FI ELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MARCH 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE ‘ ' )
INVOICE NUMBER 535248 _ PAGE 18

02/22/09

02/24/09

D2/25/09

02/27/09"

02/28/09

Task L420

02/17/09

02/26/08

02/27/09

DMT

DMT-

JMW

DMT

JMW

JMW

JMW

JMW

TO MELSON AND TRIPLETT REGARDING ]
(1.0); REVIEW BEURIS CORRESPONDENCE \
REPORTS AND INFORMATION: ON .

CORRESPONDENCE TO BEURIS REGARDING
ISSUES, STRATEGY FOR REVISIONS TO SULLIVAN

T
REVIEW MELSON CORRESPONDENCE |

REF. NO. 00305-38087

REVISE SAME, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE

REPARE

TESTIMONY AND FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE AND
CALLS TO VANDER WEIDE REGARDING STATUS (1.5)

REVIEW AND

ANATYSTS OF DRAFT WYCOFF AND 1

DESCHAMPS TESTIMONY AND FOLLOW UP WITH WITNESS
'TEAMS RE SAME;, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES
AND CASE STRATEGY.

e
[
0
o
W
]
th
4]
H
x]
]
n
w
=
'Y
=
Q

EXPERT WITNESSES

Alanta = Migmi- IJ
RPN SUNUI T 1§

PREPARE FOR AND AT

FOLLOW UP REGARDING SAME,
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS

T

'EﬁReMiEKPERT

CARLTON FIELDS: PA. -
Crlando * St, Petersburg Tullulh?see « Tampa * Wes[ Pulm[Beach

oAt
- rhvict cmandrinn nf mdmithard n“ﬂrnmn s marenne nntk adm a lnw in the

O9RP- OPCPOD1-47 0000
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59-1233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MARCH 12, 2009 .
2009 RATE CASE ] ' . REF. NOQ. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 539248 PAGE 19

02/27/09  IMW i 8.30
ARE NOTES - -
L TO CINDY;LEE
02/28/09 JMW 6.00
02/28/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALY, Is o 3.50
TO BEURTS ‘REGARD
’Subtotal for: Task L420 2 26.00
I Sl o
Task L430 : WRITTEN MOTIONS & qunn:ssxons S IE , j
' . . : i ,
02/09/09 DMT REVEEW AND ANALY‘ﬂS OF DRAFT PETITION. FOR RILE .40
WATVER. 1 1 : ) :
B * o ;. il .
i . o il i ' ; 3
:  Subtotal for Task L430 .40
Task L440 : OTH TRIAL PREPARATIC
02/03/09 MRB .40
7.00

02/04/09 MRB

CAl PA.
L Aflants * Miomi » Orando = 5 Petersburg, » To“ohu; J- Tompa ¢, Wesi Puim Beach
iarith fam 1%1 wasmre matfermen imdar tha strict sunur\if ion of admitted dhiorneys byvipersons not ndmlﬂed o praciice law in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000086
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 591233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MARCH 12, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 535248 PAGE 20

02/05/09 MRB LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING 5.8¢0

RESEARCH ON . 2.9)

Subtotal for Task L440 : 15.80

PHASE L30: DISCOVERY

Task L310 : WRITTEN DISCOVERY

02/24/05 DMT DISCUSS USE OF LIBRARY FOR DISCOVERY WITH .20
MELINDA BURROWS.

Subtotal for Task L310 : .20

TCTAI, FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

ATTCRNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

JMW J. M. WALLS 5.00 hours at
" DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 1.90 hours at
Total Task Code L110 H 6.90
JMW J. M. WALLS 11.30 hours at 8
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 12.40 hours at $
Total Task Code L120 : 23,70
JMIW J. M. WALLS 2.20 hours at §
. d A
cAVIEBET Ly
¥ onﬁdgwua

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Adlonto « Miomi + Orfonde = S5 Petersburg » Toliohassee » Tampa * West Palm Beoch
Services desianated with an [*] were performed under the strict supervision of admitted affornevs bv persons not admitted 1o proctice low in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000087



CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59-12338%6

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MARCH 12, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 539248 PAGE 21
Total Task Code L130 H 2.20 _ .
JMW  J. M. WALLS 2.10 nours at S| N -
Total Task Code L.150 : 4.10 ——
JMW J. M. WALLS 33.00 hours at &
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 1.60 hours at $
Total Task Code L210 : 34.60 ——
JMW  J. M. WALLS 3.40 hours at '
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 1.60 hours at '
Total Task Code L230 : 5.00 -
JMW  J. M. WALLS 2.60 hours at §. I
MEB M. R. BERNIER 27.70 hours at &
Total Task Code L250 : 30.30 ——
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT .20 hours at $- ]
Total Task Code L3190 : .20 __—
MW J. M. WALLS 32.20 hours at s '
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 18.50 hours at &
Total Task Code L410  : 50.70 —
JMW  J. M. WALLS 36.30 hours at S| E
Total Task Code L420 : 36.30 _—
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT .40 hours at NN B
Total Task Code 1430 : [N ‘T
MRE M. R. BERNIER 15.80 hours at s |G I
Total Task Code 1440 : [N —
ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 36.60 hours at $234.00 =
JMW J. M. WALLS 120.10 hours at $350.00 =
MRE M. R. BERNIER 43.50 hours at $175.50 =
TOTALS 210.20 '
Confidential CARLTON FIELDS, PA,

Allgnig * Miami * Orlande * 5t Petersburg v Teilohossee ® Tampa ¢ ‘West Palen Beach
Services dasianated with an ("1 were performed under the sirict supervision of admitted chornevs by persons not admitted to proctice law in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000088




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
MARCH 12, 200¢
REF. NO. 00309-38087
PAGE 22

FED. ik 591233855

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA

2005 RATE CASE

INVOICE NUMBER 529248

COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED FEBRUARY 28, 2008

Code E10% COPYING

02/11/09 COPYING COST 6.00
02/24/09 COPYING COST 129.00
Total Code EL01 135.00
Code E104 FACSIMILE
02/23/09 FAX .00
Total Code E104 .00
Code E105  TELEPHONE
02/03/09 TELEPHONE 11.25
02/09/09 TELEPHONE 174 .67
02/11/0% TELEPHONE 12.30
02/12/09 TELEPHONE 10.65
02/20/09 TELEPHONE 21.15
Total Code E105 230,02
Code E107 DELIVERY SERVICES/MESSENGERS ]
02/11/09 EXPRESS MAIL 17.30
Total Code E107 17.30

TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 20089 $382.32

INVOICE 539248 TOTAL

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

ey
fae?
Co®

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Aflanto * Micmi » Orando « St Petersburg » Tollchassee = Tampa » West Pelm Beach
Services designated with aa (*] were performed under the sirict supervision of admited attorneys by persons not odmitted to proctice low in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000089




REDACTED

PLEASE REMIT TO:
CARLTON FIELDS P, Box 3239
FED. ID 59-1233B%6 Tampa, FL 33601-323%
ATTORNEYS AT LAW £13.223.7000
Fox 813.229.4132
Ore Allantic Cenfer '
1201 W. Peachirea 5t., Sie, 3000 P.O. Box 019700 P.C. Box 1171 P.O. Box 2841 P.O. Drawer 19¢ P.O. Box 150
Adlania, Georgio 30309 Miami, FL 33131 Orlande, FL 32802 51. Pelensburg, F{ 33731 Tellghassee, FL 32302 Wast Palm Beoch, FL 33402
404.815.3400 305.530.0050 407.84%.0300 727.821.7000 850.224.1585 561.659.7070
Fox 404 8153415 Fax 305.530.0055 Fax 407,648,909 Fox 727.822.3748 Fax 850.222.0394 Fax 561.659.7368
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 5, 2008
PO BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. C(CC309-38B087

INVOICE NUMBER 496166

RE: 2009 RATE CASE

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

BALANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 03/31/08
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 03/31/08

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BATLANCE QUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-50 $1-120 OVER 120 TOTAL

*#%* REMITTANCE COPY #*¥*

Conﬁﬁe“{‘a\

ELECTRONICALLY

Payment is due upon receipt. lnterest will be chorged on unpaid invoices aged 35 days or more from inveice dote.

Services desianated with an [*] were performed under the strict supervision of odmitted attorneys by persons not odmitted to practice law in the confrolling jurisdictior

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000090



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FEC. ID 59-1233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 496166 PAGE 1

PROFESSTIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH MARCH 31, 2008

PHASE L100: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN
Task L120: ANALYSIS/STRATEGY

03/04/08 JMW CALLS AND CORRESPCNDENCE WITH CLIENT, BURNETT, .50
REGARDING REVIEW '
PCWER POINT AND CLIENT CCRRESPONDENCE REGARDING
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING STATUS,
- STRATEGY

03/07/08 DMT PREPARE FCR AND ATTEND RATE CASE KICK OFF 3.10
MEETING IN ST PETE.

03/07/08 JMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND RATE CASE KICK-OFF 2.70
MEETING IN ST PETERSBURG WITH CLIENTS
Subtotal for Task L120 : 6.30
Task L420: EXPERT WITNESSES

03/19/08 ©DMT  PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH .80
nancy HOLDSTEIN AND WILL GARRETT RE [N

S8ubtotal for Task L420 : .80
TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAIL SERVICES
ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CQODE
JMW  J. M. WALLS ' 3.20 hours at
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 3.10 hours at
Total Task Code L120: 6.30
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT .80 hours at
privileged and
Confidentia!
CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlgrte = Miami ¢ Orlondo o St Petersburg * Tallohossee » Tampao « West Polm Beach
- ) bl o 1#Y isen mnrbnrmnd wndar tha ebriet cunanician of admitiad ottarnevs by pbersons not admiitied 1o proctice lew in the controlling jurtsdiction

RP-OPCPOD1-47-000091




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. I 59-1233B%¢

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2008

2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 496166 PAGE 2

Total Task Code L420: .80

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 3.90 hours at

JMW J. M. WALLS 3.20 hours at
TOTALS 7.10

COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED MARCH 31, 2008

Code E105 = TELEPHONE
03/20/08 TELEPHONE 4.850
Total Code E105 4. 50

TOTAL COQSTS AS POSTED THROUGH MARCH 31, 2008

INVOICE 496166 TOTAL

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlonta * Miami = Orlande ¢ 51 Petersburg * Tallchossee * Tampo © West Palm Beach
Candirae dacianntad with an (*1 wera necformad undar the strict suoervision of admitted cttornevs by persons not admitted to praoclice low in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000092




PLEASE REMIT TO:

CARLTON FIELDS P0. box 3209

FED. ID 59.1233896 Tampa, FL 336013239
ATTORNEYS AT LAW €13.223.7000
Fax 811.22% 4133

One Allanlic Canter

1261 W. Peachires St., Sla. 3600 PO. Box 019101 PG, Bax 1171 P.O. Bax 2861 P.O. Diawer 190 £.0. Box 150
Allonta, Geargie 30309 Miomi, FL 33131 Orlande, FL 32602 St. Patersburg, FL 33731 Yallahassee, FL 33302 ‘West Palm Beach, FL 33402
404 B15.3400 305.530.005C 407 .84%.0300 727 .821.7000 . B5(.224.15B5 581.659.7070
Fax 404.815,3415 Fox 305.530.0055 Fax 407.648.909¢ Fox 727.822.3748 Fex B50.222.0398 Fax 561.459.7368
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY &, 2008
PO BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. c0309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 495864

RE: 2009 RATE CASE

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMEN
LESS: PAYMENTS

BALANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 04/3C/08
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 04/30/08

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

ACGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BATLANCE OUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-90 91-120 OVER 120 TOTAL

#%% REMITTANCE COPY *#+%

SUBMITTED
MAY 17 7008

A
c%c\ae““"‘ ELECTRONICALLY

Payment is due upon receipt. Interest will be charged on unpeid invoices aged 35 days or more from inveice dale.

Sensiree drcinnated with on (*] were perfermed under the strict supervision of admited allorneys by persons not admitied to practice faw in the confrouing ]urisd’lcﬁo:

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000093




CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. D 59-12328%5

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY 6, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 499864 i PAGE 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS FOSTED THROUGH APRIL 30, 2008

PHASE L100: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN
Task L120: ANALYSIS/STRATEGY

c4/10/08 JIMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF .20

04/15/08 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE, .20

04/17/08 JMW REVIEW 2.90
FRCM CLIENT, PREPARE FCR
PARTICIPATE IN CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL-
Subtotal for Task L120 3.30
Task L410: FACT WITNESSES
04/21/08 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND INTRODUCTORY CALL WITH .40
STEVE HARRIS RE STCRM STUDY.
04/28/08 ODMT DPREPARE FOR AND ATTEND INITIAL RATE CASE CALL .40
WITH SASHA WEINTRAUB RE TESTIMONY.
Subtotal for Task L410 .80

TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES _

Privileged and
Conﬁdenual

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlonic * Miomi * Orlando * 5t Petersburg * Tallahassze * Tampa ¢ West Polm Beach

o medmem e d e hn it simandicinn AF ndmitted altnmevs by persans not admitted fo practice law in the coniroliing jurisdiction.

9RP-OPCPOD1-47-000094




CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. I 59.12138%6

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY &, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
ITNVOICE NUMBER 459864 PAGE 2

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

JMW J. M. WALLS 3.30 hours at -

Total Task Code L120: 3.30
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT .80 hours at _
Total Task Code L410: .80

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY

DMT D. M, TRIPLETT 0.80 hours at $220.50 = 176 .40
JMW J. M. WALLS 3.30 hours at $346.50 = 1143.45
TOTALS 4.10 $1,319.85
COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED APRIL 30, 2008
Code E105 TELEPHONE
04/17/08 TELEPHONE 17.55
Total Code E105 17.55

TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH APRIL 30, 2008

INVOICE 459864 TOTAL

BATANCE DUE FROM PREVIQUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

C Onﬁdenﬁal

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Alianta ¢ Miomi ¢ Orlando ¢ St Petersburg = Tallahossee * Tampa * West Palm Beach
Gmmtmnr dectommted with an %1 winra narfacmad undar the crict sunarvisinn of ndmited atnmevs by parsans ot admitted to mgﬁce low in the confrolfing iurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-00009




REDACTED

PLEASE REMIT TO;
CARLTON FIELDS P.0. box 320

FED, 1D §9-1233896 Tampa, FL 33601-3239
ATTORNEYS AT LAW 813.223.7000

Fox B13.229.4133

One Atlaniic Cenlar

1201 W. Paachiree 51., Slo. 3000 F.O. Box 019101 P-O. Box 1171 P.O. Bax 2861 P-O, Drower 190 P.O. Box 150
Aflarta, Georgio 30309 Miomi, FL 33131 Orlande, FL 32802 5. Petarsburg, FL 33731 Tallahasses, Ft 32302 West Folm Beach, Ft 33402
404.815.3400 305.530.0050 407 849.0300 727.821.7000 B50.224.1585 561.659.2070
Fox 404.815.3415 Fax 305.530.0055 Fax 407.648.909¢ Fax 727 ,822.3768 Fox B50.222,0398 Fox 561.659.7368
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 11, 2008
PO BOX 14042 - JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FIL 33733 REF. NO. 00305-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 5081930
DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT
RE: 2009 RATE CASE
BALP;NCE DUE FROM PREVIQUS STATEMENT

LESS: PAYMENTS

BALANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 06/30/08
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 06/30/08

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL

TQOTAL AMOUNT DUE

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BATANCE OQUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-90 91-120 OVER 120 TOTAL

**% REMITTANCE COPY **x*

o SUBMITTED
o L 14

co®
ELECTHONICALLV

Payment is due upon receipt. Interest will be charged on unpaid invoices aged 35 doys or more from invoice date.

Services designated with an {*} were performed under the strict supervision of admited attoraeys by persons not admitied to practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000096




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

: ATTORNEYS AT LAW .
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA ‘ ‘ JULY 11, 2008

2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 508190 PAGE 1.

FED, D 59-12338%¢ . [

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH JUNE 30, 2008

PHASE L100: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN
Task L110: FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

06/20/08 MM* .00

Sibtotal for Task L110 : .00

Task L120: ANALYSIS/STRATEGY

06/05/08 JMW REVIEW AND RESPOND- TO VARIOUS CLIENT

-10
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

06/06/08 JTMW .10

06/10/08 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING il 2.90
- ) MO FoLLOW UP

WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING RESEARCH AND RESPONSE

' TO CLIENT, REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT

(.3).; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

REPARE NOTES
GARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

v PREBARE’ CORRESPONDENCE TO
CLIENT REGARDING (1.0) ; REVIEW AND -
ANALYSIS OF FPUC RATE CASE AGENDA TRANSCRIPT :
(1 2)

os/12/08" DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES R.E STAFFING FOR .20
CASE.

06/13/08 DMT FOLLOW UP WITH ENERGY SOLUTIONS CONTRACTOR RE .20

CONFIDENTIALITY OF CONTRACT FOR DECOMMISSIONING
_STUDY.

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

‘Al !hnlu * Miami Orlando * S5t. Pefersburg = Tu[luhua;eg * Tampa * West Palm Beach

B e fearbmrrmiaed enidi the ctrict cnmrvizinn bf admitted atormevs by persons not admitted 1o practice law in the controllmg jurisdiction.

9RP-OPCPOD1-47-000097
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 5%-1233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 11, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 508150 ‘ . PAGE 2

06/16/08 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPOND .60
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING:
-(.1) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE
0 CLIENT REGARDING SAME, REVIEW CLIENT
RESPONSE {.3);, PREPARE CORREQEONDENCE‘TO
CLIENT REGARDING SNENENRGENENENES REVIEW
CLIENT RESPONSES TO EMAILS (.2)

06/17/08 DMT FOLLOW UP WITH ENERGY SOLUTIONS REPRESENTATIVE .10
RE DISCLOSURE OF CONFIDENTIAL CONTRACT. ’

06/18/08 DMT  DISCUSS CONFIDENTIALITY OF ENERGY SOLUTIONS .20
: CONTRACT WITH DAN DAVIS TO OBTAIN PERMISSICON TO
',PROVIDE CONTRACT TO DECOMMISSIONING STUDY
EXPERT.

06/18/08 JMW .

" "SCHEDULING, REVIEW SAME AND PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING @il ( - 5)

06/19/08 DMT ATTEND RATE CASE STEERING COMMI'I‘TEE CALL. 1.30

06/19/08 JMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL
SREGARDING
NOTES REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME, ISSUES

2.50

06/19/08 JMW  REVIEW VARIOU: ‘ORRESPONDENQE HITH CLIENT - 1.20

“AND ANALYSIS OF
RONDENCE TO

06/25/08 DMT DISCUSS CONFIDENTIALITY OF CONTRACT WITH DAN .30
DAVIS (0.1} AND RICK LYON (0.2) AT ENERGY :
SOLUTIONS.

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

1 dnta » Miami * Orlando » St. Petersburg Tulla'nussee ¢ Tampo ¢ Wast Palm Beach
LR L e vinddar the eick sunmrvision of admitied attorevs by persons not admitted to proctice low in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000098




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED, ID 539.1233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JUuLY 11, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 508190 PAGE 3

rEviEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING [NEGEGNG
CONFERENCE CALL, REVIEW AND

06/26/08 JMW

ANALYSIS OF
PREPARE

CORRESPONDENCE TC CLIENT REGARDIN

PREPARE NOTES AND MEMO ON ISSUES

(1.5)

Subtetal for Task L120 15.70

PHASE L200: PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS

Task L410: FACT WITNESSES

06/20/08 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING .20
WITH BURNETT REGARDING PREPARE NOTES
REGARDING SAME

Subtotal for Task L4100 : .20

TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

MM* M. MORELLI* .00 hours
Total Task Code L110: .00
JMW J. M. WALLS 13.40 hours
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 2.30 hours
Total Task Code L120:  15.70
JMW J. M. WALLS .20 hours
Total Task Code L410: .20
d
v\'i““‘;,‘f’;:“:i‘;\

Con CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Aflanta = Miami * Orlondo ® St Pefersburg = Tallohassee * Tampe * West Palm Beoch
Qandirac Aarinnatad with nn [*1 were nardformed under the sirict supervision of admitted altorneys by persons not admitted to proctice Yaw in the controfling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000099




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 39-12338%¢%

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 11, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 003069-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 5081920 PAGE 4

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 2.30 hours at
JMW J. M. WALLS 13.60 hours at
MM* M. MORELLI* 6.50 hours at
TOTALS 15.90
COSTS INCURRED ON YQUR BEHALF AS POSTED JUNE 30, 2008
Code E105 TELEPHONE
05/23/08- TELEPHONE
06/19/08 TELEPHONE
Total Code E105
Code E106 ONLINE RESEARCH
06/18/08 WESTLAW RESEARCH
06/18/08 WESTLAW RESEARCH
06/18/08 WESTLAW RESEARCH
06/18/08 WESTLAW RESEARCH
06/18/08 WESTLAW RESEARCH
06/18/08 WESTLAW RESEARCH
06/18/08 WESTLAW RESEARCH
Total Code El106
TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH JUNE 30, 2008
INVOICE 508130 TOTAL
BALANCE DUE FRCM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE
jab
2
confid®
CARLTON FlELDS, PA.
Atlonta = Miami = Orlondo * St Petersburg * Tollehassee ¢ Tampo * West Paim Beach
Comiimnn dneismnniod with nn (*) wora nadermed nnder the strict sinarvision of odmitted attorneys by persons not admitted to proctice low in the controlling jurisdiction.

RP-OPCPOD1-47-000100



REDACTED

PLEASE REMIT TO:

(ARLTON FIELDS .. box 3239

FED. 1D 59-1233896 Tampe, FL 33601.3239
ATTORNEYS AT LAW £12.223.7000

Fox B12.229.4133

One Atlenlic Canlaf

1201 W. Peachiiea S1., Sto. 3000 P.C. Box 019101 P.O. Bax 1171 P.0, Box 2861 ?.0. Drawer 190 P.O. Box 150
Afnio, Georgia 30309 Miomi, FL 33131 Orlando, L 32807 51, Patersburg, FL 33731 Tallahassee, FL 32302 VWest Palm Beach, FL 33402
404.815.3400 305.530.0050 407 849.0300 727.621.7000 850.224.1585 561.650.7070
Fox 404 3153415 Fax 305.530.0055 Fox 407.648.9099 fox 727 8223766 Fax 850.222.0398 Fax 561.859.7368
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA AUGUST 6, 2008
PO BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. (003092-3B087

INVOICE NUMBER 511520
DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT

RE: 2009 RATE CASE
BALANCE DUE FRCM PREVIOQUS STATEMENT

LESS: PAYMENTS

BALANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 07/31/08
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROQUGR 07/31/08

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BALANCE OQUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-90 91-120 OVER 120 TOTAL

N *%* REMITTANCE CO *k%
& = SUBMITTED
0\

co AlG 87 2008
ELECTRONICALLY

Payment is due upon receipt. Interest will be chorged on unpaid invoices aged 35 days or more from invoice date.

Services designated with an [*) wers performed under the strict supervision of odmitted atterneys by persons not admited to practice low in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000101



-

REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59-12338%6

PROGRESS ENERGY FinORIDA ) AUGUST 6, 2008
2009 RATE CASE . REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 511520 " PAGE . 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVI&ES AS POSTED THROUGH JULY 31, 2008

PHASE 1L100: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN

Task L110: FACT iWESTIGATION/DWELQPMENT :

07/14/08 DMT  REVIEW AND, ANALYSIS, OF C‘ASEISSUES? .80
07/22/08 JMW 4.00
07/23/08 JMW 1.50
07/31/08 JMW .20
6.50
Task L120: ANALYSIS/STRATEGY
07/01/08 3.50
07/10/08 .20

N Rt CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
vAllun!a * Miogmi * Orlando = 5t Petersburg + Tolluhussee ¢ Tampo + West Polm Beach
-.t.' . ..‘L!_U.li.l . !.ﬁht\ J.h. aunrddemad imdar tha deict tumandcian nf ndmited atomavs by narscdéh ot admilied lo practice law in

OBEEBE5S

controlling jurisdiction,

00102



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

. ATTORNEYS AT '
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA AUGUST 6, 2008

FED. ID 591233896

2002 RATE CASE . . REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 511520 : "PAGE 2
07/14/08 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE Wiy 1.50

p (.1); MEETING WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING ISSUES, RESEARCH AUTHORITIES
AND ADDITIONAL RESEARCH, CASE PREPARATION
ISSUES (.5); PREPARE VARIOUS CORRESFONDENCE TO
WITNESS COORDINATORS REGARDING

‘ REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT

REGARDING SAME (.2)
07/15/08 JMW CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING;'
CALL WITH BURNETT REGARDING
S8 PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME
07/16/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF FOSSIL DISMANKLEMENT 2.60
STUDY AND FOLLOW UP WITH WALLS RE { ,

.30

07/16/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS 'OF GLIENT DOCUMENTS iy 2.50
TO PREPARE' FOR

2009 RATE CASE

07/18/08 JMW 1.50
“i07/E5/68' "DMT  ATTEND WEEKLY RATE CASE CALL WITH CLIENT TEAM. . 1.30
s aEes B 7 el ; . .

.07/3%/ 08 i b .30
Hq
Subtotal for Task L120 : 13.70

Tagk L130: EXPERTS/CONSULTANTS

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aﬂontu + Miami » Orando = Si. Petersburg = Tuﬂuhussee ¢ Tampa * West Palm Beoch :
S A L it e e tha et tinandisian of ndmitied oiorevs by persons ﬁl gdmittad 1o proctice Jow in the cantrolling jurisdictisn,

-OPCPOD1-47-000103




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LA

FED. ID 59-1232894

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA UGUST 6, 2008
2009 RATE CASE . REF. NO. 00309-38087 .

INVOICE NUMBER 511520 PAGE 3

07/16/08 JMW 1.20
07/21/08 JMW 2 . 1.50
| PREPARE CORRESPONDENEE TO TRIPLETT - :
REGARDING SAME, ISSUES; FOLLOW UP
07/23/08 MW B FOR 2D Jlentts yrTe CLIBNT D) 1.80
?PREPARE NOTES RE@ARDING"SAME' REVIEwpﬁ?
CALL WITH BUERI
{(.7); 3E : . D: 3
CONF CE CALL WITH, ROBINSON, GARRETT, AND. -
'"S'FEGARDING SAME (1 1)=¢“
ll.i-&-i‘:“ " Doy o |
07/30/08 JMW 5.50
: 5, PREPARE NOTES AND
PREPARE EOR AND ATTEND| MEETING IN ST PETER@B G
WITHM;LHENT AND CONSULTANTS, 4
{TO
_hTToRNEYS REGARDING B v
iR | :! ,,
| ! Subtqral for Task L130 10.00
i ‘ l
Task [,140: DOCUMENT/FILE MANAGEMENT !
07/15/08 KA* |CONFEF .40
SCHRAND RE -
b '
S"u.bto'tal for Task L140 .40
Task L190: OTHER CASE ASSES, DEVEL. &' ADMIN
07/25/08 JMW 2.20
TO
CARLTONKFIELDS, PA.
D g Arlamu }Msoml . Orlnndo * 5L Petersbtg . Tallahossee + Tamipa * West Pci Beoch
H .. PR | T N T S J nlrn.-hr v in the controlling iurisdiction.

P-OPCPOD1-47-000104



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

o ATTORNEYS AT LAW .
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA AUGUST 6, 2008

FED, ID 59-12338%6

2009 RATE CASE ' REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 511520 PAGE 4
07/29/08 JMW SVIEW GLIENT CORRBSPONDENCE REGARDINGEM - 3.20
. R, PREPARE RES E;

EW.. CLIENT

RESPONSE TO CLIENT REGARDING

{1.5); REVIEW DEPRECIATION TESTIMONY, EXHIBRITS,
DISCOVERY MATERIAL FOR CLIENT BINDERS (1.5)

07/30/08 JMW

1.50
07/31/08 JMW 3.00
'CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING Gl
G (> . O)
Subtotal for Task L1390 : 9.90
Task L410: FACT WITNESSES 7 '
07/15/08 DMT .. 1.10
07/16/08 DMT FOLLOW UP WITH WITNESS .10
CONTINUED FOLLOW UP RE §
07/23/08  DMT | ) ) .20
WITH BOB GRASSMAN.
Subtotal for Task L41D : 1.40

Task L420: EXPERT WITNESSES

i

privileged |

"

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

i ?EAHW . Mlorm . Orlcmdo + St Petersburg . Tulluhussee * Tampa * Wesi Palm Beach

Ctetem =k 2dmtied Alernie e mareane nnh-. nreveh

OQRP"E) C Or ﬂw4: 0h663 ollot%: ivrisdiction.




FED, 1D 59-12338%6

REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA AUGUST 6, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 511520 PAGE 5

07/18/08 DMT

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ' 1.40
a TO

BURNETT.
Subtotal for Task L4220 1.40

PHASE L300: DISCOVERY

Task L120: ANALYSIS/STRATEGY

07/15/08 S8*

ANALYSIS CF MATERIALS NEEDED FOR WITNESS .40
NOTEBOOKS

Subtotal for Task L120 3 .40

Tagk L330: DEPOSITIONS

07/18/08 S8*

DRAFT INDEX FOR THOMAS SULLLIVAN'S WITNESS .30
NOTEBCOK

Subtotal for Task L3330 H .30

TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES —
ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE
JMW J. M. WALLS 5.70 hours
DMT . M. TRIPLETT .80 hours
Total Task Code L110: 6.50
JMW J. M. WALLS 9.80 hours
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 3.590 hours
S5+ S. SCHRAND* .40 hours
Total Task Code L120: 14.10 :
JMW  J. M. WALLS 10.00 hours at $- -
nd
neped ®
A U2 gl |
?ﬂonﬁae“n

@ o v P ] ret

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Afonta = Miami * Orlando * 5t. Petersburg + Tallshassee * Tampa * Wesf Polm Beach

emm e s thin carisb enmandicinn A admiltad Afarnevs by narsons not odmitted to practice Jow in the controlling jurisdiction,

9RP-OPCPOD1-47-000106



REDACTED

~CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED 10 591233894

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA AUGUST 6, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 511520 PAGE &

Total Task Code L130:  10.00

Kax K. ADAMS* ‘ .40 hours
Total Task Code L140: T

JMW J. M. WALLS 5.90 hours
Total Task Code L190:  9.90

Ss* S. SCHRAND* .30 hours
Total Task Code L330: .30

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 1.40 hours
Total Task Code L4¥0: T1.40

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 1.40 hours
Total Tagk Code L420: 140

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 7.50 hours
S58* 5. SCHRAND* 0.70 hours
JMW J. M. WALLS 35.40 hours
Ka* K. ADAMS* 0.40 hours
TOTALS 44 .00

COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED JULY 31, 2008

Code E101 COPYING

07/18/08 COPYING COST 37.80
07/30/08 COPYING COST 238.40

Total Code E101 277.20

Code E105 TELEPHONE

07/09/08 TELEPHONE 4.20
07/25/08 TELEPHONE 14.25

Total Code E105 18.45

RbE
e
Cﬁ“ﬁb

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Atlanta * Miami * Orlondo * St Petersburg + Tallohassee * Tampa * West Palm Beach
Sanvires dacinnnlad with an (*1 ware performed under the sirict supervision of admitted attorneys by persons not admitted to practice low in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000107



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59-1233894

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA AUGUST 6, 2008
2008 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 511520 PAGE 7

TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH JULY 31, 2008

INVOICE 511520 TOTAL

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVICUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

e
pae®
cod

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflantc * Miomi * Orlando * St Petersburg  Tallchassee * Tampe * West Paim Becch
Services desionoted with an (*] were performed under the strict supervision of admitted attorneys by persons not admitted to pracice low in the controlling jurisdietion.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000108




REDACTED

PLEASE REMIT TO:
CARLTON FIELDS FO, B 3239

FED. 1) 59-12338%% Tompo, Fi 336013239
ATTORNEYS AT LAW 813.223 7000

Fox B13.229.4133

Qune Alonlic Conlor

1201 W. Pecchires 51., Ste. 3600 F.O. 8ox 019101 P.O. Bax 1171 PO Box 2861 P.O. Diower 190 P.0. Box 150
Alart, Guorgie 30309 Miami, FL 33131 Orlencdo, Ft 32802 §t. Palersburg, FL 33731 Tollchousea, FtL 32302 Wasl Foim Baoch, Fi 33402
404,815.3400 305.530.0050 407.849.0300 727.821.7000 B50,224.1585 561.659.7070
Fox 404.815.3415 Fax 305.530.0055 Fax 407,648 9099 Fax 777.822 3768 Fox 850.222.0398 Fox 561.659.73568
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA SEPTEMBER 11, 2008
PO BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSRBURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 518058
DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT
RE: 2005 RATE CASE
BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIQUS STATEMENT

LESS: PAYMENTS

BALANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 08/31/08
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 08/31/08

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL

o TOTAL AMOUNT DUE
o

000@

AGED ACCCUNTS RECEIVABLE BALANCE OUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 €1-99 91-120 OVER 120 TOTAL

*%* REMITTANCE COPY **x

SUBMITTED
SP 412008
ELECTRONICALLY

Payment is due vpon racaipl. Interest will be charged on unpaid invoices aged 35 days or more from invoice date.

Services designated with an {*] were performed under the sirict supervision of admitied atforneys by persons not admitted 1o proctice law in the controfling jutisdickit

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000109




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID $9-1233896 -

' PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA : SEPTEMBER 11, 2008
2009 RATE CASE , : REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 516058 .~ PAGE 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2008

PHASE L100: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN
Task L110: FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT . ‘

08/11/087 DMT FOLLOW UPp WITH CUSTOMER SERVlCE TEAM RE .30

SOPHIA O KEEFE RE {8

08/11/08 DMT

1.40
08/11/08 DMT .20
08/12/08 DMT .30
08/13/08 DMT ; e .50
WITH BOB GRASSMAN" (0.2];
LEE AND SOPHIA O KEEFE
08/13/08 JMW 1.50
r
08/18/08 DMT .70
08/19/08 DMT .8D
08/19/08 JMW 1.50
Subtotal for Task L110 : : 7.20

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

i 3 r{ i Atlank: * Migmi » Crlando + St. Pelersburg. « Tu“uhussae * Tampa * West Palm-Beuch
60 .‘;u,\'m:-r A b With An (7] wara  marrmard el the siriet simandeine af acdmitiad ot Ao i Lmas im Bhn mmmbeo Bl Tocdadiosi;,
"~ BERP-OP OB T 47060710



REDACTED

CARLTON FIE‘L-DS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. 1D 5P-1232804

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA SEPTEMBER 11, 2008
2009 RATE CASE ' - REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 516058 - PAGE 2 :

Task L120: AMALYSIS/STRATEGY

08/06/08 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND RATE CASE MEETING IN ST 2.70 '
: PETE. |

08/11/08 DMT ATTEND RATE CASE STRATEGY CALL. 1.30

08/13/08 DMT  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS :OF RESEARCH TSSUES RE. - .40

08/13/08 JMW  CALL WITH BURNETT REGARDING ANMSNREND .50
‘ ITH BEURIS REGARDING '

-(.1) ; REVIEW AND RESPOND TQ VARIOUS

CLIENT.AND TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

(.4)
0s8/14/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS CLIENT . .50
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
08/18/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OFm AND .40
PRIOR. RESEARCH ON TOPIC. =
08/18/08 DMT REVIEW AND. ANALYSS OF RESEARCH REGARDING .60

0B/19/08 DMT REVIEW AND ﬁALYSIS OF RESEARCH ISSUE RE gl .30

08/19/08 JMW

1.30
. e § REVIEW. CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
08/20/08 DMT  REVIEW.AND ANALYSIS OF s .30
08/20/08 DMT Ng_;-TIONAL RESEARCH RE < 4.80

CARLTON FIELDS PA.

Allanta « Miami = Orlundo . S'I Petersburg . Tulluhassee * Tampa = West.Polm Beach

o T N 09RP-OPCFOD1-47-060111"



REDACTED

CARLT’_ON FIELDS
: . - ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA' SEPTEMBER 11, 2008

FED. 1D 59-1233896

2009 RATE CASE ‘ REF. NO. (0303-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 516058 - 'PAGE 3

08/21/08 DMT 7.40
08/21/08 JMW 1.50
FOL
REGARDING SAME (.5); -

AFOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT, REVIEW
CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CALL WITH CLIENT
REGARDING“{ 3) ; REVIEW CLIENT
08/22/08 DMT 8.80
08/25/08 DMT .40
08/25/08 © DMT .30
08/25/08 JMW .30
08/26/08 DMT .60
08/28/0.8 DMT 1.10
08/28/08 DMI  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CummmRSMRSRERENNNN. .60

CARLTON FiELDS, PA.

I'IH li Aﬂanm . Mlﬂml . Otlundo . St Pe!ersburg . Tuiiohasses * Tampa *» West Palm Beach

09RP-OPCFOD{-47-000112"



FED. ID 59-1233896

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT. LAW

REDACTED

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA SEPTEMBER 11, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 516058 PAGE. 4

08/28/08

08/29/08

TMW

DOMT

Subtotal for Task L120 :

Task L130: EXPERTS/CONSULTANTS

08/05/08

os/fo7/08

ng8/11/08 -

08/11/08

oB/1z2/08

JMW  PREPARE FOR AND ), CONFERENCE : CALL: WITH

SLUSSER AND HEL

REGARDING SAME

JMH  REVIEW AND ANALY

.30

.30

34.70

CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT RE@ARDING*
1.3) ; FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING— (.1)

REVIEW TRIPLETT EXPERT AND- CLIENT

(.1); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO

-30

‘PONSE FOLLOW

TRIPLETT
CLIENT

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO' BEURIS REGARDIN
(1 3)

CARITON FIELDS, PA.

i; PRI SOOI SR IO ST Al A d

—h b e o

“'"' : Aflorita * Migmi Oriond% : 4 Sl Pe!ersburg . Ta[iahussee * Tompa * West Palm Beach

OORP-OPCPODT -47—0001 13



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59.12338%4

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA SEPTEMEER 11, 2008
2003 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 516058 ) PAGE 5

08/13/08 JMW

2.50
ORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING
VIEW CLIEM CORRESPONDENCE 4R
_ , - PREP CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT
REGARD;NG, —
R PREPARE NOTES
REGARDING SAME {.2) )
08/20/08 JMW  CALLS WITH BEURIS, AND BURNETT REGARDING .20
08/21/08 JMW VIEW: AND. ANAL¥SIS (OF ,CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE .50
08/25/08 JMW .70 -
08/26/08 JMW 3.50
CONFERENCE CALLiWITH
§ TO DISCUSS. :
' FROM CL EN' . '
"5 98/27408 JMW  REVIEW vng:ous CLIENT. CORRE ENCE REGARD] .10

CARLTON FIELDS PA.

AHunh e Miami Orlnndo * St. Patersburg o Tailuhassee * Tampo * Woast Polm Beach
Semcas desianated with an [*} were performed under the strict supervision of admitted cltorevs bv persons not gdmitted to oroctics law i

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000114

tha cantrallina iuriedicrtio



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. I 59.1233696

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA SEPTEMBER 11, 2008
2005 RATE CASE . REF. NO. 00305-28087
INVOICE NUMBER 516058 PAGE 6

08/28/08 JMW  REVIEW:ANDRESEGUBHEGLY ”;';:'2_:'}_J.fQ§RDING 2.20

I WITH BEURIS REGARDING

Subtota.l for Task L130 : .17.50
Task L190: OTHER CASE ASSES, DEVEL & ADMIN

08/01/08 MW

.30
08/04/08 JMW _ .20
OF MEETING WITH EXPERT FOLLOW UP ON STATUS,
STRATEGY g
08/06/08 TMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH CLIENTS 3.50
08/08/08 JMW 1.50
AND REVISE WIT
TO CLIENT.REG:
08/11/08 JMW 3.00
08/11/08 JMW ~ - 7 . . 1.30
CLIENTS, CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING
REVIEW
) CARLTON FIELDS PA.
N % né& 1 Al!unh * Miomi * Orlando » St, Petersburg .= Talluhassee * Tompo * Woest Palm Beach )
5 6 fd 1 Elq " | C] rfarmed under the sirict s f aHmitted atinrevs by narsnne not admited In nractica lnw in the santealline iurioliega
ervices dédidhntediwith B 1¥] were performed undec uoervision of admited n OénRP OBEP SR 47 050178




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
: SEPTEMBER 11 2008
00309—38087

FED. 1D 591233896 .
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA

2009 RATE CASE REF. NO.
INVOICE NUMBER 516058 PAGE . 7

i FOLLOW up WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
T COMMUNICATION TO CLIENT REGARDING“ REVIEW
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT (1.1); CALL WITH
FOLLOW UP WITH

08/11/08 .30
08/14/08 3.00
08/15/08 y 1.50
08/18/08 3.00

08/19/08 1.00
08/20/08 JMW  CALL WITH BURNETT REGARDING 4.60
PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME, i ~

FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAMEV.ISSUES,p

REVIEW CLIENT RESPONSE

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS.OF |T]

DOCUMENTS, MEMOS ..

(2.0)
4.00

08/21/08 JMW  REVIEW.AND ANALYSIS

— OLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME, ISSUES, RESEARCH RESULTS,
REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE AND ATTACHMENTS FROM

MAT'I'HEW BERNIER REGARDING

B . ' CARLTON FIELDS, PA
.' ot i Atlanig * Miomi *+ Orondo * St Petersburg = Tollahussee * Tompo * West Palm Baoch
Mcesr’deslunuted wsl’h ah *] were pérformed under the strict supervision of admitted attornavs by oersens not admitied 1o proctice law in the rontrrlling inrisedictin
09RP-OPCPOD1-47-00



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
ATTORN-EYS AT LAW
PROGRESS EN’ERGY FLORIDA SEPTEMBER 11, 2008

FED. ID 59-1233896

' 2009 RATE CASE. ‘ - REF. NO. - 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 516058 PAGE 8

- 08/22/08 JMW

CLIENT (BURNETT) REG
TRIPLETT MEM@,“.T

REGARDING ,SAME, ANALYSIS ISSUES (2 3); REVIEW
CLIENT COMMENTS ON :-DRAFT WITH TRIPLETT CALLS
AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT

TRIPLETT REGARDING 'SAME (. 7) ;. REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF TRIPLETT MEMO

REVIEW AUTHORITIES, FOLLOW UP
WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, FURTHER ANALYSIS
{1.7); DRAFT AND REVISE RATE CASE ISSUES MEMO
{1.3) :

08/24/08 W  REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONRENCEA - .50

/REVISE MEMG, TO (LI

3.00

08/24/08 JMW

i [t

o ), PREDARE
CORREsﬁoﬁDENCE TO TRIPLETT REGARDING VARIOUS
ISSUES AND RESEARCH, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
CLIENT REGARDING*

.40

08/26/08 JMW REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT ON
STATUS, STRATEGY, REVIEW OF SAME; STATUS OF

WITNESS REVIEWS. (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE

REGARDING _ S

PREPARE RESPONSE ({.2)

08/28/08 . JMW REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM .10
- CLIENT REGARDING ] ‘

Illllllllllll( 1);
; - Subtotal for Task L190 : 39.20"
Task L325: ADMINISTRATIVE‘ DOCUMENT PRODUCTION

08/12/08 CTS* PRINT 2 SETS OF COLOR PHOTOS FOR C. BARTOW. ‘ -00

/ Tr_'\\'ileﬂ.gd:" . .

\ S 'CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

! ' e Aﬂunio * Miomi * Orlondo * 5t Pelersburg = Tul]nhassee . Tc:mpc * Waest Palm Beach

Sarw:es desmnu!edi’wnh LI wére performed: under the sirict supervision of admitted: afformevs by parsons ant ndmitiad I oractica e in the

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000117

niralline inriedtariog



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
o ' ATT-ORNEYS AT LAW
PROCRESS . ENERGY FLORIDA SEPTEMBER 11, 2008

FED, ID 59.1233B96

. 2009 RATE CASE : : REF..NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 516058 PAGE 9
Suﬁtotal for Task L325 .00

Task L410: FACT WITNESSES

08/04/08 MW 4.00
08/07/08 DMT .50
08/07/08 JMW 4.50
08/08/08 DMT - .70
08/08/08 DMT .BO
08/14/08 JMW 1.20
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING -
08/15/08 DMF  PREPARE FOR AND' ATTEND CALL WITH FUEL FORECAST .60
- TEAM RE
08/25/08 DMT CONTACT WITNESSES RE RATE TESTIMONY FOR .40
TRANSMISSION AND DISTRIBUTION;
' y
08/26/08 1:80

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

I;f.,‘ Atlanta Miami » Orlando = ~St, Petersburg + Tulluhussee * Tampa ® West Palm,Beach

Seniras A nri i L LB Gata marinrmad nnrar tha ehrint siarisinm ok mrimitard cthormmo Lo

Ry =

“GORP-BPCPODT-47.000118



M\

-

. Servn:as deslu

FED /D 5¢-1233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA
2009 RATE CASE )
INVOICE NUMBER 516058

Task L420:

REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
SEPTEMRER 11,

REF. NO.
PAGE 10

Subtotal for Task L410 :

EXPERT WITNESSES

08/04/08 DMT

0g8/04/08 .

08/05/08

o8/08/08
08/10/08

08/12/08

08/12/08
08/12/08

08/13/08

08/14/08

0B/15/08

0B/18/08

08/21/08

P : a0 ._ o o°
U o
thd wnh!un 1*1l were performed under the sirict suervision of admittad atierevs bv cersns not admitted tn neorfics lnw.i

TERE- OB EPGB 1470007119

DMT

DMT

DMT -

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

i b .
i

i

FOLLOW, UP.WITH RI.CHARD REILAND RE~

Sy

'CLOUTIER RE$

REVIEW STORM STUDY IN PREPARATION FOR
TESTIMONY .

TEAM, JOHN BURNETT AND JAVIER PORTUONDO (0.6).

: CARLTON FIELDS, PA. :
Aflorda + Miomi » Orlando * 'St Petersbug * Tu“nhnssea . Tnmpu * West Polm Beoch

2008
00309-38087

14.50

.30

.80

.50

.60
.30

.20

.20

.90

Fentre

treallimn rericclictinr



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59-1223B96

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA SEPTEMBER 11, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 516058 PAGE 11

Subtotal for Task L420 : 11.50

PHASE L200: PRE-TRIAL, PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS

Task L110;: FA.C‘i‘ INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

- 08/01/08 ~JMW .90
.90
Task L410: FACT WITNESSES
08/11/08 JMW .90
08/12/08 JMW ; 1.80
[ 3 REGARDING SAME; FOLLOW
UP WITH TRIDPLETT REGARDING SAME, ISSUES FOR
RATE CASE :
08/18/08 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE .30
PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING iy
08/19/08 PREPARE. FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL: WITH .60
' CRISP;AND LYNCH 'REGARDING:QUin
R ' FREPARE NOTES
. REGARDINE 8AME,; CALL''TO® BURNETT REGARDING Gl
b3
Subtotal for Task L410 : 3.60

Tabk.L440: OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPPORT

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
efa Aflonte  Miami = Orlando = St. Petersburg » Tulluhqssee = Tampa ¢ West Palm Beach
5enm:es desua tted with an (*] were Derforméd urdar the sirict sunarvision af admifind ainnaus by nercnns not ndmited in sz L. im e

OSRP-CPERSD1-47000151

S | PSP T U [P



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

. FED.ID 591233894

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA SEPTEMBER 11, 2008
2009 RATE CASE . Ly REF. NO. 00305-380B7
INVCICE NUMBER 516058 PAGE 12 ‘

08/18/08 MRB* RESEARCE, JNI6M e, ;. 00

08/19/08 MRB*

4.00
08/20/08 MRB* CONTINUED AND CONCLUDED RESEBRCH.] o ¥ 7.00
08/21/08 MRB* 3.50
| 08/22/08 MRB* 3.20
08/25/08 MRB* RESEARCH. Im‘_” ) N 4.60
4.60

CARLTON -FIELDS, PA.
. " Aflanta = Miami » Orlando St Petersburg » Tulluhqssee + Tampa * West Palm Beach
Serwcesl deSlqnaled with an {*} wire performed under the sirict supervision of ndmitted altornevs hv narsnns nat Ardmitad ko sraefiea e etrellinm s dictine

0SRP-OBEBEDT-47-006771




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 591233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA SEPTEMBER 11, 2008
2008 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309~38087
INVOICE NUMBER 516058 PAGE 13
08/27/08 MRB* RESEARCH INTO 3.30
Subtotal for Task L440 : 33.20

PHASE L300: DISCOVERY
Task L.330: DEPOSITICNS
08/08/08 KA* PREPARED WITNESS NOTERBQOKS FOR JEFF LYASH, 2.70
WILLETTE MORMAN PERRY, JAMES VANDER WEIDE,
PETER TOOMEY; ASSISTED WITH WITNESS NOTEBOOKS
FOR EARL ROBINSON AND ROBERT MATTHEWS
Subtotal for Task L330 2.70

Task L332: DEFENDANTS' DEPOSITIONS - FACT WITNESS ONLY

08/08/08 S8* ANALYSIS OF WITNESSES AND ITEMS NEEDED FOR EACH .70
WITNESS
08/08/08 S8+ PREPARE WI 4.40

Subtotal for Task L332 : 5.10

TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

JMW J. M. WALLS 3.%0 hours at
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 4.20 hours at
Total Task Code L110: 8.10
JMW J. M, WALLS 4 .40 hours at

'Prl\'\‘eg ed @

lal
nfident
Con CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Atlonto + Miomi » Crlondo » Si. Petersburg = Tallahessee » Tampa * Woest Palm Beach
Services desionaled with an 1*] ware narfarmed tinder the «rict amanvisinn f admited AHameaus fn norcans nnt ndmilerd tn meeeties

DORB.OPCPOB147-000123

{| R e T




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED, ID 59-1233894

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA SEPTEMBER 11, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 516058 ' PAGE 14

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 30.30 hours
Total Task Code L120: 34,70
JMW J. M. WALLS 17.50 hours

Total Task Code L130: 17.50

JMW J. M. WALLS 39.20 hours
Total Task Code L190: 739.20

CTs+* CLIENT TECH LEVEL 1% -00 hours
Total Task Code L325: .00

KA* K. ADAMB* 2.70 hours
Total Task Code 1L330: T 3070

§8* S. SCHRAND* 5.10 hours

Total Task Code L332: 5.10

JMW J. M. WALLS 13.30 hours

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 4.80 hours
Total Task Code L410: "18.10

oMT D. M. TRIPLETT 11.50 hours
Total Task Code L420: T11.50

MEB* M. R, BERNIER* 33.20 hours

Total Task Code L440: 33.20

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 50.80 hours
S+ 5. SCHRAND* 5.10 hours
JMW J. M. WALLS 78.30 hours
MRB#* M. R. BERNIER* 33.20 hours
CTS* CLIENT TECH LEVEL 1* 0.40 hours
KA+ K. ADAMS~* 2.70 hours
TOTALS 170,10

jal
Coﬂﬂde}nt}a
CARLTON FiELDs, PA.
Aflonta » Miami * Orlando « St Petersburg « Tullahcssee » Tompa * West Palm Beach
Services designated with an {*) were performed under the sirict supervision of odmitted oomevs by narsans net ndmittad e neactiea o rvrdemllinn fraviedintia

0ORP.OPEPOD147-600793




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 5%-1233894

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA SEPTEMBER 11, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NC. 00309-38087
INVCICE NUMBER 516058 PAGE 15

COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED AUGUST 31, 2008

Code E101 COPYING

08/01/08 COPYING COST 2.70
08/08/08 COPYING CQST 216.40
Total Code E101 21%.10
Ccde EL105 TELEPHONE
08/01/08 TELEPHONE 3.90
08/13/08 TELEPHONE 17.2%
08/28/08 TELEPHCNE ] 8.25
Total Code E105 29.40
Code El124
08/12/08 (COLOR COPYING COST 14.00
Total Code E124 14.00

TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2008

INVOICE 516058 TCTAIL

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVICUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

CARLTON FIELDS, PA,

Atlantc * Miami ¢ Orlande * 5t Petersburg * Tallchassee » Tompa = West Palm Beach
Services designated with an {*) were performed under the strict subervision of cdmitted altornevs by versans amt admited tn nrnefics low in

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-0

& rantalline ioriedintin

124

th
0




PLEASE REMIT TO:

CARLTON FIELD> £, b 3239

FED. ID 59-123389¢ Tompa, FL 33601-3239
ATTORNEYS AT LAW 813.223.7000
Fox 813.229 41233
One Allantic Cenler
1201 W. Pecchiree Sk, Sie. 3000 P.O. Box 017101 P.O. Box 1171 PO, Box 2861 P.O. Drawsr 190 P.0. Box 150
Atlants, Geargio 30309 Miami, FlL 33131 Orlando, FL 32802 St. Palersburg, FL 33731 Tallohasses, FL 32302 Woesl Palm Beach, FL 33402
404.815.3400 205.530.0050 407.849.0300 727.821,.7000 850.224.1585 561.659 7070
Fox 404.815,3415 Fax 305,530.0055 Fax 407.648.909% Fax 727.622.374B fox B50.222.0398 Fan 561.659.7368
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA OCTOBER 10, 2008
PC BOX 14042 . JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSRURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 519702

DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT

REVISED:. —

RE: 2009 RATE CASE

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS
LESS: CREDITS ON ACCOUNT

BATLANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 09/30/08
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THRGUGH 09/30/08

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL

TOTAL AMQUNT DUE

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BALANCE OUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-90 91-120 OVER 120 TCTAL
AN k4% REMITTANCE CQOPY *+%
)
a
)
co®

Poyment is due upon receipt, Inlerest will be charged on unpoid invoices aged 35 duys ar more from invoice dote.

Satvices desinnoted with an [*) were performed under the strict supervision of admitted ottorneys by persons not admitted to practice law in the confralting jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000125




CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. 1D 59-12318%94

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA . OCTOBER 10, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 003085-38087

IWOICE NUMBER 515702 C PAGE 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2008

o i/ o . ° o
PHASE L10: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN

Task L1110 : FACT INVESTIGA’I'ION/DEVELOPMENTT

09/05/08 JMW  CALL WITH :BEURIS- REGARDING' gl "" 1.50
B PREDARE FOR AND PAhmICIPATE N

09/16/08 JMW REVIEW INTERVIEW.SUMMARY WITH TRIPLETT, P .20

_ My FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING STATUS OF VARIOUS STUDIES,
TESTIMONIES, COMMUNICATION TO CLIENTS REGARDIﬁG

v

g
09/18/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYS,IS OE‘ STATUS OF VARIQUS EXPE!RT -.10
REPORTS, (e | WﬁTH
TRIPLETT ;
. |
09/22/08 JMW ] REVIEW CLIENT AND. TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE ! .10
' REGARDING STATUS OF STUDIES AND REPORTS. ROE .

WITNESS

09/25/08 JMW _ REVIEW AN LYSIS. OF MEMO g - o

09/30/08 8o+ 3.70
5.80
Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY
. )
oged !
priviict B
R T CARLTON FIELDS, PA. ’
el ;i: #- gﬂﬁ"h * Miami = Orlondo * 5t Pefursburg . Tu!lchussee v Tarnpo * West PulmB ch
: ER . 1 it i semacdatan af mdmitbad A#arnee bae metgans ek ndmitied o Bractics low in the controlling iurisdiction.
OQRP-OPCP 1-47-000126




CARLTON FIELDS .

' :  ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA . OCTOBER 10, 2008

FED. 1D 59-12338%%

2009 RATE CASE ’ REF. NO. 003095-38087
. INVOICE NUMBER 519702 PAGE 2
09/05/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF. CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE .40

09/08/08 JMW 1.00
DOCUMENTS AND CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME,
REVISE DOCUMENT .
09/09/08 JMW  REVIEW CLIENT DOCUMENES; MEMOS, REVIEW AND = 2.00
09/10/08 JMW 1.80
09/12/08 JMHW 1.20
CORRESPONDENCE TO BERNIER REGARDING-
FOLLOW UP ISSUES
09/19/08 JMW REVIEW AND.ANALYSIS og:fmmwm._ .20
09/23/08 DMT .20
SHELLY
09/23/08 DMT' RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS RE (HESmnuREg 1.10
09/23/08 DMT .60
09/23/08 JMW REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM TRIPLETT REGARDING .30

RATE CASE ISSUES, STATUS OF RESEARCH, FOLLOW UP

Privileged

S CARLTON FIELDS, PA. ,
PR «3* ° EAll;anPu * Miomi = Orlundo . S? Petersburg . Tullahussee * Tompa * Woest PaIm Beach

Y U ST |

Yl nenrties I in the Fantralling jurisdiction.

ORB-OPEPB 1247506127




CARLTON FIELDS
: ' . ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA ) OCTOBER 10, 2008

FED. ID 59.1233B96

2005 RATE CASE . REF. NO.. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 519702 o PAGE 3

09/24/08 DMT 4.20
09/26/08 JMW CALLS WITH CLIENT REGARDING— .10 °
m REVIEW CLIENT . ;
CORRESPONDENCE ‘
09/29/08 JMW  REVIEW CLIENT CQRRESPQNDI;‘.‘NCE RE,@ARDING .10
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME
09/30/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE DISCOVERY AND 1.10
. ‘ ﬁiWSSES FOR C‘ASEI- FOLLOW UP RE RESEARCH ON
Bubtotal for Task L120 : 14,30
Task L130  : EXPERTS/CONSULTANTS _ l
09/03/08 JMW  CALL WITH GLENN AND BURNETT REGARDING guieiwisms .30
09/04/08 JVMW .10
09/12/08 JMW .70
09/16/08 JMR .10
09/19/08 6.20

CARLTON FIELDS, PA. -

Aﬂanta = Migmi * Orlando » St Petersburg » Tﬂllahussee » Tampa * West Palm Beach

' T Pt f o) tmad e dn mrembiog ¢ ir tha mnpmll.‘m furierlirtinn

T OORPIOBCPODT .60



CARLTON FIELDS

FED. ID 591233896 :
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA OCTOBER 10, 2008 '
2009 RATE CASE - REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 519702 ‘ ‘ PAGE 4

09/23/08 JMH .40
T B G E T
T “(BURNETT) REGARDING‘
T FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME :

09/30/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS oF NOTES OF MEETINGS .30
BETWEEN DEPRECIATION CONSULTANT AND CLIENT
REPRESENTATIVES, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT ,

RECARDING SAME, ISSUES, FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT

09/30/08 JMW  REVIEW AND.ANALYSIS.QF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE .20
REGARDING. _ IS R-VIEW AND
"ANALYSIS OF DRAFT TESTIMONY REGARDING
DEPRECIATION ISSUES, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING
SAME

Subtotal for Task L130 o '8.30

Task L190 : OTHER CASE ASSES, DEVEL. & ADMIN

i

09/11/08 JMW .50

09/12/08 JMHW 1.50

09/17/08 JMW 2.00
'TO CLIENTS REGARDING

09/30/08 JMW REVIEW AND. ANALYSIS. OF VARIOUS TRIPLETT s 1.00

S'L_:.btol:al‘ for Task L1990 T 5.00

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
i Athntc » Miomi * Orlando » St. Petersburg = Tuliahussae - Tnmpu West Palm Beoch
T S T A S T rmeys by hnrmnr. nol odmitied 1E’nruchce lerw § in the contialling |unsd|chon

RP-OPCPQOD1-47-000129




em

INVOICE NUMBER 519702 _ ‘  PAGE 5
Task L410 : FACT WITNESSES o . 5
09/02/08 DMT & e 1.80
09/03/08 DMT 1,20
09/16/08 DMT WITH TOM 1.70
HARRISON. '
09/24/08 DMT FOLLOW UP WITH WITNESSES. AND COORDINATORS RE 60
STATUS OF TESTIMONY AND STUDIES.
Subtotal for Task L410 : 5.30
Taak L4206 3
05/07/08 DMT .40
G Ay
09/12/08 DMT . REVIEW OF DISMANTLEMENT COST STUDY. .60
05/17/08 DMT FOLLOW UP RE STATUS OF VARIQUS OUTSIDE EXPERT .20
REPORTS . _
Subtotal for Task L420 : 1.20
Task L440 - : OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPRORT
’ "8 :» . R ' ‘i{u 'ﬂa‘ﬂ‘lﬂm
09/25/08 JMW “ .30
~ Subtotal for Task L440 : . .30
PHASE L20: PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS
Task L130  : EXPERTS/CONSULTANTS o ‘ .
09/23/08 DMT  REVIEW AND AN .40
Subtotal for Task L130 : .40
. CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
) {.\,;_} t}‘g Aflonta + Miomi: = Qrlando * 5t Petersburg. » Tallohassee o Tampa * West Falm Beach .
v BRI L L d condar i ekt eunanitinn oF neimitiad otarnévs by seTsons:not admitled lo praclice law in ihe controlling jurisdiction

FED. ID 591233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
OCTOBER 10, 2008

2002 RATE CASE ] ‘ REF. NO. 00302-38087

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000130



CARLTON FIELDS

' ATTORNEYS AT LAW B
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA OCTOBER 10, 2008

FED. ID 59.1233896

2009 RATE CASE . REF. NO. 00309-3B087
INVOICE. NUMBER 519702 PAGE 6
Task L250 : OTH WRITTEN MOTIONS & SbBMISSION
09/15/08 JIMW ANpL ' - 3.50
Subtotal for Task L250 g 3.50
Task L410 : FACT WITNESSES
09/20/08 DMT : 60
09/21/08 DMT- 2.60
09/25/08 DMT 1.60
09/25/08 DMT FOLLOW UP WITH WITNESSES RE STATUS: OF | .40
‘ TESTIMONY, STUDIES.
09/26/08 DMT 1.70
09/29/08 DMT 2.70
09/30/08 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CALL WITH BOB MATTHEWS .90
j Iumillilllllhz T
- : Subtotal for Task L410 : 10.50
Task L420 ‘
09/30/08 .60
09/30/08 .20
* Subtotal for Task L420 B .80

. i .
Task L440 3 OTH ’I‘RIAL PREP&IATION & SUPPORT

prviteged

-

CARLTON FIELDS, PA

uqlc . Manmr ¢ Orlando ¢ 5t. Petersburg Tnlluhossee = Tompa = West Palm Beach

ML ¢

tendar tha cifict comenisian of ndmiting dtarnevs by oersons not odmitied to practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000131




1

CARLTON FIELDS

FED ID 59-1233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA
2009 RATE CASE Lo
INVOICE NUMBER 519702

09/15/08 MRB*

09/16/08 MRB¥ CQNTINHEDV

S R L T

05/30/08 MRB*

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
OCTOBER 10, 2008

REF. NO. 00305-38087

PAGE 7

Subtotal for Task L440 :

PHASE L30: DISCOVERY

Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGX

09/23/08 S8S*

Task L310 : WRITTEN DISCOVERY

Subtotaljfor Task L120. H

09/26/08 DMT REVIEW,AND ANALYSIS OF SuliiiyAmyamumimay

09/29/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF jhuul

Subtotal for Task L310

Task L320 : DOCUMENT PRODUCTION

09/09/08 MRB* TELEPHONE DOCUMENT REQUESTS'FROM-PSC

Task L330 : DEPOSITIONS

privileged

ToLoa Tt Tray Ly ..K___.‘.J PSS PR Sy I

Subtotal for Task L3320

S CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
A]an!u s, Miami_* Orlando- » 5t. Petersburg * Talluhussee . Tumpa . Wesf Pulm Beach

commmsisian AF medeitard nlarnaue b rersent et admitsd s peactice low in

O8RP- OPCPOD1 -4

.30

6.50

.10

10.90

.20

.20

.20

the
-00

.20

contrelling ivrisdiction.

0132



CARLTON FIELDS

FED. IO 59-12318%96

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
OCTOBER 10,
REF. NO.
PAGE 8

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA
2009 RATE CASE
INVOICE NUMBER 519702

2008
003205-38087

09/16/08 SS*  TELEPHONE CALL FROM PARALEGAL TIBBETS REGARDING .40

Subtotal for Task L330 : : .40

TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

ATTORNEY FEF_SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

JMW J. M. WALLS .10 hours at
58* ] SCHRAND* .70 hours at
Total Task Code L110 : 5.80
JMW J. M. WALLS .10 hours at
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT .20 hours at
S5 S. SCHRAND* .20 hours at
Total Task Code L120 = 14.50
JMW J. M. WALLS 8.30 hours at
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT .40 hours at
Total Task Code L130 : 8.70
JMW J. M. WALLS .00 hours at
Total Task Code L1390 : 5.00
JMW J. M. WALLS .50 hours at
Total Task Code L250 3.50
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT .60 hours at
Total Task Code L310 : 1.60
MRB* M. R. BERNIER* .20 hours at
4
weged A%
r-\u\e‘é 19l
¥ on'ﬁ(“’"“t
CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflanta » Miomi * Orlando * St Petersburg * Tollahassee * Tampa & West Polm Beach
Cordmns dnvinnciad with an 1*1 wara nardarmad under tha sirict subarvision of admitted attornevs by persons not odmitted to practice law in the controlling jurisdicrion.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000133



FEB.{D 591233894

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA OCTOBER 10, 2008
200% RATE CASE REF. NO. 003059-38C87
INVOICE NUMBER 514702 PAGE =]
Total Task Code L320 .20
S8+ 5. SCHRAND* .40 hours at
Total Task Code L330 : .40
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 15.80 hours at
Total Task Code L410 B 15.80
JMW J. M. WALLS .20 hours at
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 1.80 hours at
Total Task Code L420 2.00
JMW J. M. WALLS .30 hours at
MRB# M. R, BERNIER* 10.50 hours at
Total Task Code L.440 : 11.20
ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 26.80 hours at =
85+ S. SCHRAND* 4 .30 hours at =
JMW J. M. WALLS 26.50 hours at =
MRB* M. R. BERNIER* 11.10 hours at =
TOTALS 68.70
COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED SEPTEMBER 30, 2008
Code E101 COPYING
09/09/08 COPYING COST 66.60
Total Code E101 66.60
Code E105 TELEPHONE
08/28/08 TELEPHONE & 56.01
09/04/08 TELEPHONE %& o .45
09/09/08 TELEPHCNE T 14.25
09/25/08 TELEPHONE g‘coé‘ 2.10
09/26/08 TELEPHONE 2.10
Total Code EI105 74.91
Code E11l1 MEALS
09/24/08 MEALS - VENDOR: TOOJAY'S — 44 42
iiiiiiii ﬁiiCH ORDER -
LY
CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflonta * Miomi ¢ Orlondo « St Petersburg * Tollohassee » Tompa = West Palm Beach
Sanvirac dasimnatad with nn (%) wara nardnrmed under the strict sunervicinn of admitted afomeys by rersons not odmitted 1o oractice low in the controliing iurisdiction.
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CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED.ID 59.1233894

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA OCTOBER 10, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 519702 PAGE 10

Total Code El111 44,42

TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2008

INVCICE 518702 TOTAL

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS
LESS: OTHER CREDITS

TOTAL AMOUNT DUER

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlanle * Miomi * Orlando » St Petersburg = Tolluhossee ® Tompa = West Palm Beach
T eimne decimnmiod wiiily n 191 vunre marfnrmand indar the drict cinarnvisinn of admittad offormevs by sersons not admilied fo practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.
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PLEASE REMIT TO;

CARLTON FlELDJ P.O. Box 3239

FED. 1D 59-1233894 Tompa, FL 33601.3239
ATTORNEYS AT LAW B13.223.7000
Fex B13.229.4133

One Alantic Center

1201 W. Peachiree St., Ste. 3000 " F.O.Box 019101 P.C. Box 1171 F.Q. Box 286) P.C. Drawaer 190 P.O. Box 150
Atlonte, Georgin 30309 Miami, FL 33131 QOdarda, FL. 32802 S, Petersburg, FL 13720 Tolahosses, FL 32302 West Polm Beach, Fi 33407
404.815.3400 305.530.0050 407.849.0300 727.821.7000 850,224,1585 561.659.7070
Fox 404.B15.3415 Fax 305.530.0055 Fox 407 848.9099 Fox 727.822.3768 Fax B50.222.0398 Fax 581.659 7368
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA OCTOBER 31, 2008
PO BOX 14042 ) JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. 00305-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 522256

DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT

RE: 2009 RATE CASE REVISED: v !:«ZSLC/JJ’)’H Hecl

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS
LESS: CREDITS ON ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 039/30/08
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 03/30/08

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BALANCE OUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-90 91-120 OVER 120 TOTAL
| SUBMITTED
o *%% REMITTANCE COPY *** ey 43 2008
S ELECTRONICALLY

Payment is due upon receipt. Interest will be charged on unpaid invoices oged 35 days or more from invoice date.

Services designated with an [*] were performed under fhe sirict supervision of admitied attomneys by persoas not admitted to pradiice law in the controlling jurisdicti

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000136




CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. 1D 591232894

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA OCTOBER 31, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 0030%2-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 522256 PAGE 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2008

PHASE L20: PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS
Task L440 : OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPPORT

09/02/08 MRB* RESEARCH . 3.70

05/03/08 MRB* NTINUED RESEARCH 1.80

Subtotal for Task L440 8 5.50

TOTAL FEES FCR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

MRB* M. R. BERNIER?* 5.50 hours at
Total Task Code L440 : 5.50
ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY
MRE* M. R. BERNIER* 5.50 hours at
TOTALS 5.50
3 INVOICE 522256 TOTAL
9,“
\R'Pae6 0
{\\1 ‘ e“
C o

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlanta * Miemi * Orlondo » St Pelersburg * Tolighassee = Tampa = West Palm Beach
Randirar dacinastad with as 1Y wars nerdarmacd indar tha ctrict simeevision of admitted attarnevs by nereans ot admitted 6 oractice law in the cantrallina iurisdict
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CONFIDENTIAL

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. 1D 59 1Z338%a

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA OCTOBER 31, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00302-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 522256 PAGE 2

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOQUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS
LESS: OTHER CREDITS

TOTAL AMCUNT DUE

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflonta + Miomi * Orlande * Si. Petersburg » Tallohossee * Tampa v West Palm Beach _
Services designated with an [*} were performed under the strict supervision of admitted attornevs by persons nof admitied to proctice low in the contralline inricdintic

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000138




REDACTED

-~ PLEASE REMIT TO:
\.ARLTON FIELDD P.O), Box 3739

FEL.ID 59.1233896 Tampa, Fl, 33601-323¢
ATTORNEYS AT LAW 813.223 7000

Fox B13,229.4133

One Atlantic Cenler

1201 W. Poachires St., Sia. 3000 P.O. Box 019101 F.O. Box 1171 2.0, Box 2851 F.O. Drawer 190 P.O. Box 150
Atlsnta, Geargia 30309 Miars, Fl 33131 Orlondo, FI 32802 St. Petersburg, FL 33731 Talichassae, FL 32302 Wast Polm Beoch, FL 33402
£04.815.3400 305.530.0050 407.849.0300 727.821.7000 B850.224.1585 561.659.7070
fox 404.815.3415 Fax 305.530.0055 Fax 407.648.9099 Fox 727 8223768 Fax 850.222 Q398 Fox 561,659 7368
PROGRESS ENERGY FLCRIDA NOVEMBER 7, 2008
PO BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33732 REF. NO. 003059-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 523126
DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT
RE: 2009 RATE CASE
BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT

LESS: PAYMENTS

BALANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 10/31/08
COSTS ADVANCED PCSTED THROUGH 10/31/08

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BALANCE OUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-90 91-120 OVER 120 TOTAL

e **% REMITTANCE COPY ***
o\\‘b SUBM' ED
oy i ]
A4
? . NOV 11 2008
ELECTRONICALLY
Payment is due upon receipt. Interest will be charged on unpaid invoices aged 35 days or more from invoice date.

Services designated with on [*) were performed under the sirict supervision of admitted attorneys by persons not odmitted 1o practice low in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000139




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW :
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA NOVEMBER 7, 2008

FED. ID 59-12338%6

2009 RATE CASE i REF. NO. 00309-3B087
INVOICE NUMBER 523126 o PAGE 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2008

’

PHASE L10: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN

Task L1100 B FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

10/01/08 S8* 6.90
10/02/08 JMW F 4 .30
FOLLOWING CLIENT CONVERSATIONS, DISCUSSION
REGARDING STATUS, STRATEGY
10/03/08 JMW  REVIEW TRIPLETT CORREGPONDENCE REGARDING CLIENT .70
10/06/08 -DMT .70
10/06/08 Ss* 1.90
10/08/08 DMT 1.40
10/10/08 Ss* .80
10/15/08 omr  Reviey AND Anavysis | .30
) WITH MIKE WALLS.
10/15/08 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ED LyNcH Nummmmmmnl .30

S0

: CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
§|i M I J Aflanig » Miami » Orlando + 5t Petersburg Ta“nhussee * Tampa '» Wast Polmi Beoch
B O TS, BT mnnns not admitted 4o oractice law in the contrelling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPGD1-47-00




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT, LAW

FED. ID 59-12338%6

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA . NOVEMBER 7, 2008
2009 RATE CASE o REF. NO. 00309-38087
. INVOICE NUMBER 523126 ' PAGE = 2
10/21/08 DMT  PREPARE FOR AND.ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH BOB .60

MATTHEWS RE

i0/21/08 JMW PREPARE FOR AND A’I‘TEND CQN»EER,E CE CALL_WIT;H BOB' .70

WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME

10/21/08 JMW  CONEERENCES WITH WITNESSES REGARDING“ ' .20
10/21/08 JMW 1.50
10/22/08 S8*% 2.40
10/24/08 JMW ~ REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM .90

BEURIS REGARDING REVIEW

ADDITIONAL CORRESPONDENCE FROM BEURIS, OLIVIER,

BND VANDER WEIDE REGARDING _ (.2);

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL

WITH BEURIS,. VANDER WEIDE, OLIVIER REGARDING

PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP

CORRESPONDENCE WITH BEURIS (.7)
10/27/08 DMT - REVIEW.AND ANALYSIS OF, ISSUES. RE SR .60

. ol ; B
10/28/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF) Gl T .40
10/28/08 JMA .20
10/31/08 JMW e .10
_ WITH TRIPLETT, CLIENT
FOLLOW UP _ .
T privileged - } , Subtotal for Task L110 : 21.80

| CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Boy o B 6 j l g gn'lb ‘- Miomi * Orando = St Petersburg * Tollnhcssee = Tampa * West Palm Beach
g
Camiviah Abethbntad & b 111 wm'].!.acfmmm undar the strict sunervision of admitted attornevs by persons not admitted to praclice low in the controlling jurisdiction.
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. i 59-12338%6

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA NOVEMBER 7, 2008 _
2009 RATE CASE ' REF. NO. 00309 38087
INVOICE NUMBER 523126 PAGE 3

Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY

10/01/08 JMW  REVIEW.CLIENT .CORRESPO

‘ CE. AND ATTACHMENTS . .10
REGARDING - -

10/02/08 JMW .10
10/06/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF OUTSTANDING WITNESS .10

ISSUES WITH TRIPLETT, FOLLOW UP ITEMS
10/09/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE FILING. .20

DEADLINES AND TESTIMONY CONTENT. :
10/09/08 JMW PARTICIRAIE IN-CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING .60

RS R £ DARE NOTES AND

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING @} FOLLOW UP WITH

TRIPLETT REGARDING STATUS, STRATEGY
10/12/08 SS*  ONLINE SDARQH,;f_ ) 1.70
10/14/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS | .50

SN FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME,

STATUS, REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME

.(.3};‘REVIEW CURRENT STATUS OF WITNESS

NOTEBOOKS AND PREPARE NOTES TO FOLLOW UP WITH -

TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

(.2)
10/15/08 DMT .40
10/16/08 DMT 1.40
10/16/08 DMT .40
10/16/08 JMW 1.50

FOLLOW

RESEARCH (1.3)

CARLTON FIELDS PA.

! . Atlarita « Miomi: »* Orlando * St. Pelersburg - Tallahussee » Tampa * Wesl Polm Beach
b Rorvies .-I.“.nmrm{ with on ") were performed under the strict supervision of admitted altomeys by persons ot admitied fo practice law in the confrolling jusisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000142




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

: ATTORNEYSATLAW '
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA NOVEMBER 7, 2008

FED. ID 59-123389¢

2009 RATE. CASE " REF. NO. 00309-38087 ¥

INVOICE NUMBER 523126 e PAGE 4

10/17/08 DMT 3.30
. 10/17/08 JMW .REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GiSSuiiamiess 3.90

QIRMMRINN AUTHORITIES, "PREPARE NOTES REGARDING

SAME (2.2); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

PRSI, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT

REGARDING SAME, STATUS,  FURTHER RESEARCH (.6);

CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING

! i , PREPARE NOTES

REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT

REGARDING SAME, MEMO AND ANALYSIS (.6): REVIEW

AND REVISE MEMO, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT

REGARDING SAME, REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT

REGARDING SAME ( 5)
10/19/08 DMT © .40
10/20/08 DMT 3.30
10/20/08 DMT .70
10/21/08 DMT .70
10/21/08 JMW .60
10/22/08 DMT .30
10/23/08 DMT. 70

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
: .Alluniu « Miomi ® Orando » 51, Pelersburg o Tu[[ahussee . Tumpu Wesl Palm Beach
cuimes rarbmronacd imelar the eirict umarvision of admitted altornevs by persons Aot admifited to practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.

O0SRP-OPCPOD1-47-000143




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. B 59-12318%4

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA NOVEMBER 7, 2008
2009 RATE CASE - : - REF. NO. 00309-3808?
INVOICE. NUMBER 523126 Ce - . PAGE 5 -

10/23/08 JMW REVIEW TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE AND MEMO - .10

, FOLLOW. UP WIT'H TRIPLETT
REGARDING. SRME

10/27/08 JMW  REVIEW CLIENT CQRB'E:SP@NBENCE REGARDING GEEgSR

.30
_ g . MEETING, CALL-TO
CLIENT REGARDPING
10/28/08 JMW .20
™ " - - PREPARE NOTES REGARDING
SAME, STRATEGY CALL
10/29/08 DMT o .20
WITH
GEQOFF FOSTER.
. 10/2%/08 JMW CALL WITH BURNETT REGARDING .20
: N FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME
10/30/08 JMW .60
10/31/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE TESTIMONY .30
FILING BND CASE THEMES AND STRATEGY.
10/31/08 JMW  PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL 1.40
RECARDING G eihRanantsiinly
, DPREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME; FOLLOW .
UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, ISSUES,.
_STATUS, STRATEGY
_ _ Suabtotal for Task L120 : . ‘ 24 .20
Task L130 : EXPERTS/CONSULTANTS .
10/01/08 JMW ; ' 2.00

T ReCrDING wa———

Prive | ,

R S CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

$ EE _;-:':.;'.-', X i-_‘ﬁAﬂanIu s Miami = Oriqndo » St Petersburg * Tuﬂahnssee * Tampa ® WestPaim Beach

AL Ll P R R R o L ondar tha etvict tinarvision of admitted altornevs by persons nat admitted 1o proctice law in the controlling jurisdiction

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000144




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED, ID 59-12338%6

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA . NOVEMBER 7, 2008
2009 RATE CASE . _ REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 523126 - PAGE 6

10/06/08 JMW - .30
TH" TRIPLETT
-AND EXPERT
10/06/08 JMW 5.00
. . PREPARE
NOTES REGARDING SAME, ISSUES
10/07/08 JMW 3.50
SAME,
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING - FOLLOW
16)2
10/08/08 JMW .50
10/09/08 JMW 4.00
10/10/08 JMW 1.20
"n-' m
10/13/08 JMW 1.50
' REGARDING | d
PREPARATION WORK, PREEARE NOTE REGARDING SAME
10/14/08 JMW i * .30

CALL CINDY 'LEE WITH' e
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, .
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FROM DISTRIBUTION AND
TRANSMISSION WITNESSES

CARLTON F!ELDS PA.

antu * Miami * Orlondo = 5. Petersburg Tulluhussee * Tampa ¢ West Polm Beach

L . ~ )
cm'i' rae A..mnnmfl:.u'.mhfnn Hy il eerformed under the strict supervision of admitted atorneys by persons not admitied fo proctice law in the cantrolling jurisdicfion.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000145




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 5¢-12338%¢

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA NOVEMBER 7, 2008
2009 RATE CASE . - - REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 523126 7 t PAGE 7

10/14/08 JOMW .50
10/15/08 JMW .BO
10/20/08 JMW 1.20
REGARDING :
GRS, PREPARE . CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT
REGARDING NN i r
10/21/08 JMW - REVIEW AND ANALYSIS-@uummmmismsseu S .20
QEMMMERNNED W1 TH TRIPLETT, DISCUSS CLIENT AND:
CONSULTANT FOLLOW UP REGARDING SAME _ j_i
! X " i
10/22/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS;HHMW_ 1.00
LN T P IR Py A e L T
ey, FOLIOW UP WETH TRIPLETT REGARDING | ;
SAME, ISSUES, PREPARATION FOR CLIENT 1
10/28/08 JMA  CALL WITH CINDY LEE REGARDING. STATUS OF | .40
(.2); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS ‘
CORRESPONDENCE AND ATTACHMENTS BETWEEN LEE AN@
ROBINSON (.2) .
- . i
10/25/08 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CORRESPONDENCE REGAREI&G .30
;TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME
'e
10/31708 JMH Eﬁ% .30
~ P PREPARE - ..
\ NOTES REGARDING SAME . - :
‘f“ege,d‘ 3 T .
pavE ' : |
o , CARLTON FIELDS, PA. 2y
r Aﬂuniu . #Miuml » .Orlando » 51, Petersburg * Tullahassee * Tampc * Wast Fali me(:h . |
H Lara ma it nliad Wt iirt sommrvisinn of admitted aftornevs by pérsons not admited 16 ér dctice low in tha controlling jurisdicfion

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000146




REDACTED

'CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59-1233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA NOVEMBER 7, 2008
2009 RATE CASE ’ REF. NO. 00309—38087

INVOICE NUMBER 523126 PAGE 8

23.00

L]

Subtotal for Task L130
Task L190 : OTHER CASE ASSES, DEVEL. & ADMIN
10/09/08 JMW  REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE" .10
“FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
SAME _ _

10/14/08 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALY%IS OF .80

le/20/08 JMW

emEMMENENS WITH TRIPLETT, REVIEW MEMORANDUM
REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING R

y, FOLLOW; (B2
REGARDING SAME, REVIEW

B20:CALL WITH CLIENT
REGARDING _ FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (.7); FOLLOW UP

CORRESPONDENCE .AND CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING

e (1)

10/21/08 UMW  REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING NN, .40

TO CLIENT REGARDING SAME (.2)

Subtotal for Task LI5S0

L]
m
=]

Task L250 8 OTH WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSION

10/20/08 JMW

Subtotal for Task L250 H ' .10

CARLTON- HHDS PA.

Aflants ¢ Miomi * Orlande * St Petersburg Tullohossea * Tampa * Wesr Polm Beach

cmm meEriad s the shried sunandicinn nf Admitied atarnevs by nersons nol admitted io prodlice law in the conrolling |ur|sd|d|cm
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
‘ : ATTORNEYS AT LAW :
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA NOVEMBER 7, 2008

FED. 1D 59-1233896

2009 RATE CASE - REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMRBER 523126 ‘ PAGE 9

Task L410 : FACT WITNESSES

10/01/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF FILES REGARDING WITNESS .70
TESTIMONY, PREPARE: CQ PQNDENCE TO CLIENT
(.5) 4 REVIEW

REGARDING SAME (.2)

10/08/08 OMA  REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SNENES .30
— PREPARE RESPONSE; (.1) ;
1 E@EB& 20 PENCE: G

REVIEW CLIENT

REGARDING SAME (.2)

10/14/08 JMW

I’h\

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE:TQ CRISP AND LYNCH . 1.00

YS OF

| PREPARE NOTES

10/14/08 JMW  REVIEW g . .50
Y 5 T HEORRE CE' TQ BURNETT _

REGARDING ] ———

D N - REVIEW
TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE ‘REGARDING SAME

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE"
REGARDING 4 i B
REVIEW AND

10/22/08 JMW

10/23/08 JMW  CALL WITH BURNETT, TQOMEY, AND CROSS REGARDING © .30

FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
ANALYSIS (.1); REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT -AND
TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE: REGARDING

|
CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
i o Aflonts » Miomi » Orando * St Pelersburg s Tollohossee - Tampa * West Palm Beach
Al e e ] ndae tha chict snmarvicing af ndmitisd aomevs by persons not admitted to practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000148




FED, ID 59-1233896

REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRES‘S ENERGY FLORIDA ' : NOVEMBER 7, 2008
2009 RATE CASE . REF. NO. 00303-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 523126 PAGE 10 -

10/24/08

10/27/08

'10/31/08

10/31/08
#

Task L420

10/03/08
10/03/08
10/07/08

10/08/08

10/10/08

| ==
f,,,,f,—fr*f"’fﬂ\
=~ {

-

\ _Pﬁ“\.eged <

JMW

JMW

JMW

JMW

DMT

DMT

DMT

N .30
PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME
CALL WITH BEN CRISPL ED LYNCH MIKEJRIB LORZL .70
I, CREPARE NOTES REGARDING
SAME ; - REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ED LYNCH
REGARDING 4l
PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH 1.00

TOOMEY, CROSS, GARRETT.AND OTHERS REGARDING

PREPARE NOTES RECARD

DREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME

CALLS WITH BEURIS REGARDING? .40
D —— e e NDENCE AND

ATTACHMENTS FROM BEURIS REGARDING 4l

' Subtotal for Task L410 s 8.70

EXPERT WITNESSES

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE .60
SR WITH CINDY* LEE AND JOHN BURNETT.
H;
CONFERENCE CALL WI §”$ﬁpRIS'AND VANDER WEIDE .40
REGARDING . N .
" FOLLOW UP CALL
WITH BEURIS
. REVIEW AND ANALYSIS RE. (SN .20
1.60
1.40
Subtotal for Task L420  : ~ 4.20

L}

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
gnio ¢ Miomi ¢ Orlando * St. Petersburg * TU“G"IUSSBQ * Tampa * Wes! Falm Beach
& artarmiad imeler the arict suparvisian of admitted ottornevs by persons not admitied io practios low in the contraliing ;urlsdar:hon
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FED. ID 59123386

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA NOVEMBER 7, 2008

REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

2009 RATE CASE B . REF. NO. 00305-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 523126 . : - PAGE 11

Task L110

10/23/.08
10/23/08
10/28/08
.10/29)087

10/31/08

. 10/31/08

- Task L130

10/20/08

10/22/08

DMT
DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

s

PHASE L20 PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS

FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS DF

IS WITH LEW MENDEZE AND FOLLOW UP WITH
WALLS RE SAME.

PREPARE FOR AND. ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH TOM
HARRISON RE

CONFERENCE CALL WITH ALEX GLENN, KEN FANCHI,
WILLETTE MORMAN AND DAVID FREUND RE
BENCHMARKING AND CUSTOMER -SERVICE AWARDS. -

Suhtotal for Task L110

EXPERTS/CONSULTANTS

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONEERENCEIWITH LORI

Privileged

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

- L :' tg:@e to. = Miami * Orlando * 5t Pafersburg Tulluhussee * Tampa * West Polm Beach
*}‘..—J ith nh l'\ \intftnrinrmead under the sirict sucervision of admitted aftornays by persons not udrnmed to practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.

.10

.80

.80

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000150




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
- ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA . NOVEMBER 7, 2008

FED. IO 59-1233896 -

2009 RATE CASE REF.. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 523126 PAGE 12
10/01/08 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH .80
TOMMY HARRISON ‘

10/02/08 DMT 1.90
10/07/08 DMT .90
10/10/08 DMT 4.40
10/12/08 DMT 2.20
10/13/08 DMT 2.30
16/14/08 DMT 1.30
10/15/08 DMT 2.30
/ .
10/17/08 DMT  PREPARE ‘FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL RE .90
10/21/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES REGEEENEAN. .30
10/22/08 DMT 1.30
10/22/08 DMT 1.30
10/23/08 DMT DISCUSS TESTIMONY STATUS WITH TOM HARRISON; ° .50
FOLLOW UP RE MEETING WITH EILEEN CLARK RE-.
10/27/08 DMT  PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND. CALL WITH TRANSMISSION 1.10
10/29/08 DMT 2.70

Privileged

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
;: Afionia ¢ Miami Crlondo = St. Petersburg » Tollohassee * Tompo * Wast Polm Beach
Serwcas desmnuted wdh ar I*i were performed under the strict supervision of admitted otforneys by persons not odriitied 1o practice law in the conh‘o"mg jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000151




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. D 59-12338%4

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA NOVEMBER 7, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NC. 00309-28087
INVOICE NUMBER 523126 PAGE 13

Subtotal for Task L4110 29.90

-

Task L1420 : EXPERT WITNESSES

10/02/08 DMT .70
WITH CINDY LEE; REVIEW AND

aaALYSTS or (-

Subtcotal for Task L420 H .70
Task L440 : OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPPORT
10/08/08 MRB* COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH 1.10
10/09/08 MRB* CONTINUED SEARCHIN 1.80
10/14/08 MRB* COMPUTERIZED LEGAL RESEARCH_ 1.10
Subtotal for Task L440 5 4.00
PHASE L30: DISCOVERY )
Task L330 : DEPOSITIONS
10/21/08 §S* UPDATE THOMAS SULLIVAN PREPARATION NOTEBOCKS .30

WITH GILETTE DIRECT TESTIMONY

Subtetal for Task L330 .30

"

TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES _

. a
Pri\'l\eged a.ll
Confidenti®
CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlanta = Miomi * Orlande « St Petersburg ¢ Tallchossee + Tampa * West Paim Beach
Sarvices desianated with on [*] were performed under the strict supervision of admitted aitorneys by persons not admitied to practice Jaw in the conlrolling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000152



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. 10 59.123389¢

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA NOVEMBER 7, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 523126 PAGE 14

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

JMW J. M. WALLS 4.90 hours

DM'T D. M. TRIPLETT 9,80 hours

SS+* S. SCHRAND* 13.00 hours
Total Task Code L110 : 27.70

JMW J. M. WALLS 10.20 hours

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 12.30 hours

55* 5. SCHRAND* 1.70 hours
Total Task Code L120 5 24 .20

JMW J. M. WALLS 23.00 hours

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 3.50 hours
Total Task Code L1l30 3 26.50

JMW  J. M. WALLS. 2.50 hours
Total Task Code L19%0 : 2.50

JMW J. M. WALLS .10 hours
Total Task Code L250 : .10

88* S. SCHRAND* .30 hours
Total Task Code L3300 : .30

JMW J. M. WALLS 8.70 hours

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 29.90 hours
Total Task Code L4110 3 38.60

JMW J. M. WALLS .40 hours

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 4 .50 hours
Total Task Code L420 : 4.90

MRB* M. R. BERNIER* 4.00 hours
Total Task Code 1440 : 4.00

Conﬁ:‘e“ﬁa‘

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlanta * Miami * Orlande * St Petersburg » Tailahassee * Tompa * Wesl Polm Beach
Services designated with an {*) were performed under the strict supervision of odmitted attorneys by persons not admitted to proctice law in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000153



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. IO 591233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA NOVEMBER 7, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 523126 PAGE 15

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY

DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 60.00 hours
85%* S. SCHRAND* 15.00 hours
JMW J. M. WALLS 4%.80 hours
MEB* M. R. BERNIER* 4.00 hours
TOTALS 128.80

COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED OCTOBER 31, 2008

Code E101 - COPYING

10/21/08 COPYING COST 4,80
10/23/08 COPYING COST 2.40
Total Code E101 7.20
Code E105 TELEPHONE
10/01/08 TELEPHONE 10.&60
10/09/08 TELEPHONE 6.30
10/16/08 TELEPHONE . 5.25
10/17/08 TELEPHONE .30
10/27/08 TELEPHONE 12.00
Total Code E105 34.45
Code E108 POSTAGE
10/14/08B POSTAGE 2.02
Total Code E108 2.02

TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2008

INVOICE 523126 TOTAL

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

Conﬁde“ﬁa‘

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflenta * Miami * Crlondo = St Petersburg + Tollahassee * Tompa * West Pelm Beach
Camirae datinnnian with an (*1 wers narformad under tha strict supervision of admitied abarneys by persons not admitted to practice law in the controlling jurisdiction

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000154



REDACTED

PLEASE REMIT TO:
LCARLTON FIELDS
FED. ID 59-12338%9% Tompa, FL 33601-323%
ATTORNEYS AT LAW 813.223 7000
Fux 813.229.4133
Cne Atlontic Center
1201 W. Peachirea 51, Ste. 3000 P.C. Box 019101 £,0. Box 1171 P.C. Box 2861 P.O. Drawer 190 P.C. Box 150
Aflonta, Georgla 30309 Miomi, FL 33131 COrlonde, FL 32802 SI. Petersburg, FL 33731 Tallohessee, FlL 32307 ‘West Polm Beoch, FL 33402
404.815.3400 305.530.0050 407.849.0300 727 .821.70G0 850.224.1585 541.659.7070
Fax 404.815.3415 fox 305.530.0055 Fax 407.648.909% Fox 727 B22.3768 Fox 850,222.0398 Fax 561.65%¢.7368
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA . DECEMBER 15, 2008
PO BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 528862

DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT

RE: 2009 RATE CASE

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

BALANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 12/15/08
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 12/15/08

CURRENT INVCICE TOTAL

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

AGED ACCOUNTS RECETVABLE BALANCE OUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-20 g1-120 QVER 120 TOTAL

*%% REMITTANCE COPY **%*

SUBMITTED
Confidential DEC 15 2008

ELECTRONICALLY

Payment is due upon receipl. Interest will be charged on unpaid invoices aged 35 days or more from invoice date,

Services designated with an |*} were performed under the sirict supervision of admitied attorneys by persons not admitted to practice law in the eontrolling jurisdicti

0SRP-OPCPOD1-47-000155



' REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
. o ATTORNEYS AT LAW . :
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA DECEMBER 15, 2008

FED. ID 59-12338%94

2009 RATE CASE : " & REF. NO. 00305-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 528862 . PAGE .1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH DECEMBER 15, 2008

PHASE L10: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN
Task L110 : FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

12/05/08 DMT REVIEW. AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE WITNESS
TESTIMCNY, DEADLINES AND CASE STRATEGY.

12/11/08 .JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT PRESENTATIONS

FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME
(.7) : - :

Subtotal for Tasgk L110

Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY S

12/01/08 DMT REVIEW :AND ANALYSIS OF @i

WITH

JOHN BURNETT (0.4).

12/01/08 JMW - REVIEW .AND AN7

1z/01/08 JMW

12/02/08 DMT

privileged.

i CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
H’hl?ﬁl = Miomi * Orlundo ¢ 5t Petersburg * Tulluhussee * Tampa .* Wesi Polm Beach

] [ JRUSTIY JRNY QN N PO R

O9RPIGPCPOBT-47-00

.30

2.80

.80

.40

e

07586

wirdicke



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

AT'FC)RhIEY’S AT LAW

FED. ID 59.123389¢

PROGf@ESS ENERGY FLORIDA . DECEMBER 15, 2008
2009 RATE CASE . REF. NO. . 00309-38087

INVQICE NUMBER 528862 o PAGE 2

12/02/08 JMW 4.20
12/03/08 DMT 1.40
12/03/08 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE. _ 1.00
. 'FOLLOW UP

WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, STRATEGY (.2);

CALLS WITH CLIENT REGARDING !

SO, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT

REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW THEME SLIDE, CLIENT

DOCUMENTS, _

CORRESPONDENCE TO TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (.4
12/04/08 JMW 2.00
12/05/08 MW .40

PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME;

VARIOUS  CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

(-1}
12/08/08 DMT ' REVIEW AND ANALYSIS, RESEARCH, DISCUSSION WITH 1.60
- J0 URNETT,RE ‘ ‘
12/08/08 JMW  CALL WITH 'BURNETT REGARDING. i .40
e NP FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME

12/08/08 -TMW CALLS WITHJ BURNETT AND PORTUONDO REGARDING 1.00
- ] ISSUES, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
FOLLOW UP WITH

— TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME .
Privileged ~ 2 ‘

. CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlcmtu » Miami * Orlando = St Petersburg * Tullahussea * Tampa .2 - West Palm Beach
re mnterind sradden dhn cbrict sindricisn AF relmitiad nﬂnmwn hv patsons not admitied lo oroctice law in the controlling jurisdicti

BSRE SBEP OB 7-000157




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW-

FED, 1D 591223096

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA: DECEMBER 15, 2008
2009 RATE CASE . REF. NO. 00305-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 528862 PAGE 3

"REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT 2.00
TESTIMONY, - CLTENT PRESS RELEASES AND INVESTOR

RELATIONS DOCUMENTS, OTHER :CLIENT DOCUMENTS

REGARDING

12/08/08 JMW

12/09/08 DMT 1.%90
12/09/08 DMT .60
12/10/08 DMT .60
12/10/08 JMW ° .50
"ANALYSIS OF STATUS OF
WITNESS TESTIMONY OUTSTANDING ISSUES AND
FOLLOW up REGARDING SAME, CASE DREPARATION (.3)
12/10/08 JIMW § i N ' 1.50
12/10/08 JMW  CALLS WITH BURNETT REGARDING — . . .20
12/12/08 DMT i  WITH JOHN .60
BURNETT AND NANCY HOLDSTEIN. -
12 /12/08 JMW REVIEW TRIPLETT COMMENTS ON T .50
' GEEMRE FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME
(.2)51 AND PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING SAME (.3)
12/12/08 JMW CA‘I.._I..-WJEI;I:_I{‘.‘BURNET'.I‘_ REGARDING CASE (NS .70
12/13/08 JMW .BO

' ] _ ORRESPON'DENCE 'TO CLIENT’
REGARDING SAME {.2); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
CLIENT DRAFT LETTER, PREPARE RESPONSE {.2)

CARLTON FIELDS PA.

A!lunfu v Mlorm . Or!ando » St Petersburg » Tallchussee . Tnmpu * West Palm Beach

Sl JE ldetuc 3 s Ogﬁnp OPCPOD{'E?"W in t(lj rgntmllmq ivrisdict




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
o ATTORNEYS AT LAW. '
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA = . DECEMBER 15, 2008

FED.ID 59-12338%4

2009 RATE CASE ' REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 528862 ‘ - PAGE 4

Subtotal for Task L120 -

: 31.50
Tagk L130  : ExpERTs-/c"oNSULTAN'-rs,,
©12/03/08 JMW. .20
REGARDING SAME
12/05/08 JMW REVIEW. AND 1§NALYSIS ' 1.50
- PREPARE NOTES FOR CLIENT
CONFERENCE REGARDING @M PARTICIPATE IN
_CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT (BEURIS) REGARDING GNP,
) PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP
ISSUES: REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING MEETING
CONCERNING SAME ‘ :
12/08/08 JMW .20
12/08/08 JMW .60
12/09/08 JMW .70
12/09/08 JMW 7.50
-
ISSUES, FOLLOW UP
12/10/08 JMW. CALLS WIEH_GREG BEUR_IS" REGARDING_ , .20
12/11/08 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE _ .30

S

PREPARE RESPONSE TO CLIENT AND PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO GLENN AND BURNETT REGARDING
- '

CARLTON FIELDS, PA

Aﬂanlu ¢ Migmi Orlundo * St Peiersburg . Tullahussee * Tampa * West Pulm Beach

‘e ] LI

SSPPPURVF T PRY  TLIPIN P PR, a mantrallina inrdedissic

" DORP-GBEPODT47-600188



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 591233896

5

PROGRESS ENERGY'FLORIDA S DECEMBER 15, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 528862 L PAGE 5

12/11/08 JMW 1.70
12/12/08 JMW 1.30
PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP ITEMS;
REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE, AND DOCUMENT
REGARDING |
Subtotal for Task L130 : 14.20
Tagk L410 : FACT WITNESSES
12/01/08 UMW .30
12/02/08 JWN  REVIEWIAND ANALYSIS op:' i g .00
I'FOLLOW UP
WITH TRTPLETT 3 '
12/03/08 I T GORRESPONDENCE REGARDING WM | .10
: CALL WITH CLIENT
.iEﬁ CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
12/04/08 IMW i) 1.30

REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE ;|
| , FOLLOW UP .WITH TRIPLETT b
{}.2); REVIEW }|
LTENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
(. 1)

CARLTON ‘FIELDS, PA.
Arlontu * Miomi = Orlundo = 5t. Petersburg » Tulluh,nssee * Jampo: ¢ West Palm Bea:hI

020 3 ' o [P SEN U N Y PR el b nrarticn by w in tha cnntrallines jurisdicti

~ IORBIOPCPOBT47-000180




-\

FED.ID 59-1233896

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA -

REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS
ATT()RhIEYS AT LAVV
DECEMBER 15 2008

2009 RATE CASE : REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 528862 - PAGE 6

12/05/08 -JMW

12/05/08 JMW

12/10/08 ° JMW

12/11/08 JMW

12/12/08 JMW

Task L430

12/11/08 DMT

Task L1l .

CALL AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH JAVIER PORTUONDO
REGARDING

REVIEW AND- ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE

NOTES REGARDING SAME;

CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING SAME (2.5)

ARE NOTES REGARDING SAME,

TRIPLETT REGARDING [

FOLLOW UP; WITH-#

o s

N . ,‘~ J FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARD NFERE, CALL WITH CLIENT
REGARDING il (.5);

‘Subtotal for Task L410

: WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSIONS

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

Subtotal for Task L430

. PHASE' L20: PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS

¢ FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

L Atiaria ¢ Miami . Orlondo & St. Petersburg Tulluhassee * Tampa = Wesi Polm Beach

r P sabe it ericeetatoe e detad sl her maessne mab o o rartica low in

GERPIGBEPOBT 47600767

3.

.10

50

.00

.40

.50

12.20

.40

.40

trralline jrisdictic



FED. ID 591233894

REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

PROGRESS™ ENERGY FLORIDA
2009. RATE CASE. = .
INVOICE NUMBER 528862

12/11/08

Task L1308

12/05/08

Tagk L410

12/02/08
12/02/08
12/05/08
12/08/08

12/08/08

.12/10/08

12/10/08 -
12/12/08

12/12/08

privileged )

DMT

. DMT

DMT

.DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

DECEMBER 15, 2008
REF. NO. 00309-38087

PAGE 7
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS RE STORM STUDY TESTIMONY 1.40
AND CASE STRATEGY AND THEME FOR ALL WITNESS
TESTIMONY .
_ Subtotal for Task L110 : 1.40
EXPERTS/CONSULTANTS .
4.90
4.90
.S0
.20
.40
i 2.10
R B T
.50
R T T T e
) 4.90
70
2.30
; 'REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
OUTEh hﬂbING WITNESS ISSUES.
"],JAIQEND CALL WITH TOQMEY WITNESS 1.40

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
. Aﬂonlq * Miomi * Orlando = Slr Pétersburg » Tulluhussea ¢ Tampg » Wesr Palm Beach.

[ R N

U S R DU SO A 15 e biea i i the ~antrallins inrierdinte

b9RP~OPCPOD1-47 000162



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. ID 59-12336%6

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA DECEMBER 15, 2008
2005 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 528862 PAGE 8

i2/14/08 DMT

Subtotal for Task L410 : 15.70

TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSICNAL SERVICES

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

JMW J. M. WALLS 2.50 hours
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 1.70 hours
Total Task Code L110 z 4.20
JMW J. M. WALLS 19.60 hours
DMT . M. TRIPLETT 11.50 hours
Total Task Code L1120 31.50
JMW J. M. WALLS 14.20 hours
BMT D. M. TRIPLETT 4.90 hours
Total Task Code L130 : 15.10
JMW J. M. WALLS 12.20 hours
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 15.70 hours
Total Task Code L4110 : 27.90
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT .40 hours
Total Task Code L430 .40
ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 34 .60 hours at
JMW J. M. WALLS 48.50 hours a
TOTALS 83.10
d
4%
et
Yr\ﬁ\ (‘ de“t\a

on
© CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Alenta » Miami * Orlande * St Petersburg » Tallohassee * Tompa * West Palm Beoch

Serviees desianoted with an i*) were nerformed under the sirict supervision of admilted atiornevs by persons not admitied to practice law in the contralfing jurisdictic

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000163



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

FED. I 59-323389¢

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA DECEMBER 15, 2008
2005 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 528862 PAGE S

COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED DECEMBER 15, 2008

Code E105 TELEPHONE

10/31/08 TELEPHONE . (23.70)
12/04/08 TELEPHONE .30
12/10/08 TELEPHONE 2.10

Total Code E105 {21.30)

TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH DECEMBER 15, 2008

INVOICE 528862 TOTAL

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

il
aed
coo™

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Alanic * Micmi » Crlando * 5t Petersburg * Tolichassee » Tompo * West Palm Beach
Services desianated with an [} were performed under the strict supervision of admitted aliarneys by persons not admitied to practice law in the controliing jurisdictic

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000164



REDACTED

_ L'\,"’\"{E'Q. ‘?’(rl‘\: C(:G ij(} -?
RICHARD D. MELSON <Y1 /mumb /L.EC-J'*L,
Altarney & Counselor

705 Piedmont Drive Cel: B50-322-3041
Tallahassee, FL 32312 rick@rmelsonlaw.com Phone: B5D-894-1351

February 2, 2009

Tax 1.D. #26-2102722

John T. Burnett Invoice #: 106
Progress Energy

P.0. Box 14042, PEF 151

St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042

For professional services rendered December 18, 2008 — January 31, 2009 in connection
with:

Legal Entity: Progress Energy Service Company, 11.C
Matter: 2009 Base Rate Case

Attorney Rate Hours Amount
Richard D. Melson . o _
Disbursements:
Mileage 280.50
Lodging 41.00
Parking . 600
Tolls 9.50
Total Disbursements 337.00

Total Amount Due -

@»“6'\
t\q‘\ A 6‘“‘ *

FEB 0 2 2009

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000165




Richard D. Melson

Attorney & Counselor
705 Piedmont Drive

REDACTED

Cell: 850-322-3041

Tallahassee, FL 32312 rick@rmelsonlaw.com Phone: B50-854-1331
INVOICE 5
2/2/2009 AT
e
John T. Bumett Invoice #: 106 Q“Q"b@'
Progress Energy Service Company, LLC Q{\“ &
P.O. Box 14042, PEF 151 &
St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042
Matter: 2009 Base Rate Case
Jate Description of Services Hours/Qty Rate Amount
(2/18/2008 Review Terry direct testimony outline; review ¥l 1.3
12/23/2008 Telephone conference with Jobn Burnett to discuss 1.1
1/8/2009 Review backup material for Murray testimeny re 22
1/9/2009 Review background materials for Terry testimony, 3.4
1/10/2009  Review additional Terry back-up materials including 3.5
Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson Total
(FEIN: Payments/Credits

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please

contact me at {850) 8%4-1351.
Page 1

Balance Due

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000166



Richard D. Melson

Attorney & Counselor
705 Piedmont Drive
Tallahasses, FL 32312 rick@melsoraw.com
INVOICE
2/2/2005
John T. Bumett Invoice #: 106

Progress Energy Service Company, LLC
P.0. Box 14042, PEF 151
St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042

Matter: 2009 Base Rate Case

Date Description of Services Hours/Qty Rate

REDACTED

Cell: B50-322-3041
Phone: B50-894-1351

555
'\4.\\290\66‘\“
3 o™

Amount

1/12/2009  Telephone call with Walls and Triplett regarding 46
with
Tibbetts re

and review materials re

1713/2009 5.8

1/14/2009 i’ro-rata portion (1.5 hours) of travel time from 2.6
Tallahassee to St. Petersburg for kick-off meeting;

review

Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson Total

FEN: . Payments/Cred

its

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please

lance Due
contact me at (850) §94-1351. 0

Page 2

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000167




Richard D. Melson
Attorney & Counselor

705 Piedmont Drive

REDACTED

Ceil: B50-322-3041

Tallahassee, FL 32312 rick@rmelsonlaw.com Phone: 850-894-1351
INVOICE
2/2/2009
John T. Bumen ' Invoice #: 106 hY
. Progress Energy Service Company, LLC o o
P.0. Box 14042, PEF 15] e
St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042 ¥eo®
Matter: 2009 Base Rate Case
Date Description of Services Hours/Qty Rate Amount
1/15/2009  Kick-off meeting with Walls and Triplett to discuss 9
IR "
mectings with Terry, Murray and Taylor to discuss
lenn and Burnett.
1/16/2009  Pro-rata portion of trave! to retumn to Tallahassee from 1.5
kick-off meeting,
1/19/2009  Review and respond to e-majls; reviev- 0.3
Sn |
1202009 [ > 13
Tibbetts.
1/21/200% 32
11222009 45

conference wath Taylor and other witness team
members coordination

Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson

(FE

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please
contact me at (850) 894-1351.

Page 3

Total

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000168



REDACTED

Richard D. Melson

Altorney & Counselor

705 Fledmaont Drive Cell: 850-322-3041
Tellzhassee, FL 32312 rick@rmelsoniaw.com Phone: B50-894-1351
INVOICE
2/2/2009
John T. Bumett Invoice # 106
Progress Energy Service Company, LLC 3 ond
P.0. Box 14042, PEF 151 AL g
St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042 Pieond

Matter: 2009 Base Rate Case

Date Description of Services Hours/Qty Rate Amount
3.6

1/23/2009  Weekly status conference call; review additional

Murray back-ui maten'alsr

ol AL e

1/26/2009 0.6
1/27/2009  Review Wall comments on 0.5
view and
1/28/2009  Telephone conference with Murray to revie 4.7
review and
respond to other e-mails.
1/29/2009

Reviev{ TN 1.6 —
: conference call with

wimness team 1 telephone call with Ken
Wilson re

Please make checks iayable to: Richard D. Melson Total
(FEIN: Payments/Credits

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please
contact me at (8§50} §94-1351.

Balance Due

Page 4
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REDACTED

Richard D. Melson

Attorney & Counselor

705 Piedmont Drive Cell: 850-322-3041
Tallshassee, FL 32312 rick@rmelsonlaw.com Phone: BS0-894-1351
INVOICE
2/2/2009
John T. Burneut Invoice #: 106 b‘ﬂ“&
Progress Energy Service Company, LLC N 0{\‘3‘*
P.0. Box 14042, PEF 151 PR
St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042 Vet
Matter: 2009 Base Rate Case
Date Description of Services Hours/Qty Rate Amount

1/30/2009  Participate in weekly status conference call; telephone —
call with Wall regarding R
Freview and respond to e-mails
om clent,
TOTAL FEES I

1/14/2009  Mileage: TLH to St.Pete 255 0.55 140.25
1/16/2009  Mileage: St.Pete to TLH 255 0.55 140.25

TOTAL MILEAGE 280.50
1/14/2009  Lodging in TPA (1/14) 41.00 41.00
1/15/2009  Parking 6.00 6.00
1/16/2009  Tolls to/from St. Petersburg 9.50 9.50

TOTAL OTHER EXPENSES _ 56.50

Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson Total

(FE

Payments/Credits

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please

contact me at (850) 894-1351. Balance Due

Page §
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REDACTED

d
wneeed 200
PROGRESS [ NTE 8 P dent
PERSONAL 3 wre 123 WINTER QUARTERS PASCO
" Print Date: JAN 16 09
164 CONFIRMATION ¥: C12707009833
Clerk: VM
Date Booked: JANGO®
Arrivelr  JAN 1409
RICK MELSON Departure: JAN 1809
705 FIEDMONT DR Accommodation Type:  PREM
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32312 AR IR ¢
Number of Children: 0
Site Mumber: 062
Type #ofNgw/Qty  Payment Typs Trans Tota Paymeoty Balance
PREM 4 CRETHT CARD 152.00 152.00 0.00
RESORT FEE 4 CREDIT CARD 12.00 12,00 0.00
Tonls: 164.00 1§4.00 0.00

Check In Time: 12:00 PMCheck Out Tirne: 11:00 AM

Other Check In or Check Out Details

1f you have any problem, there is an after hows phone number is posted outside the office door.If you are amiving
zficr hours your reservation with site # will be placed outside the office door-Please always check your site # a5 sites
are nol guarznived and may have changed.County Sewer Connection Code: Connection 1o the sewer requires the

use of sewer domust or sewer ¢fbow, Two vehicles ellowed per site

CANCELLATION AND REFUND POLICY
No Show - Refind will not be grasted,

Short Torm - Daily or Weelzly
Ful] refund of deposit 48 hours prior to arrival,
Mo refimd if cancelled less than 48 hours prior to amival.

Long Tem - One tnonth or longer

50-days prior to rescrvation start date - Full refund mimas 10% of total reservation emount,

60-days prior 1o reservation start date - Refimd of 50% of amonot paid.

Less than 60-days prior to reservation start date - No refund. Amount may be credited one time to 2 future
reservation within onc-ye=r of original reservation date or forfeited.

Easly Departure - If a stay is shorter tham original reservation und jess than one month no refend will be given, if one
manth or longer the rate will be adjusied to the sppropriete rate type (i.¢. daily, weakly, ete.); Credit of the adiusted
unused portion of the payment minus $150.00 adninistrative fec will be epplied 1o future reservation within one year
of cancellation date or forfeited. ’

*Policy subject to change without notice.
*Refunds for death or extended hospitalization will be reviewed on an individual basis at the Regional level.

09RP-OPCPOD1-47-000171



REDACTED

witeged 2
P atident™!

Hid-Coep Poricim Barms
8, Patersbury, F1,

PROGRESS
© RATE CASE

ﬁgm%a LA 6.8 - RIS
Q/15A8 (605 In  QU/IEA 18:11 Gt
TR (725
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CONFIDENTIAL

CONTRACT

368351

BETWEEN

PROGRESS ENERGY SERVICE COMPANY, LLC
not in its individual capacity, but solely as agent for

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA, INC.

AND

BURNS & MCDONNELL CONSULTANTS, INC.

09RP-OPCPOD1-46-000001
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I

CONFIDENTIAL

TABLE OF CONTENTS
ECTION TITLE

1 Description of Work

2 Term of Contract

3 Commencement of Work

4 Designated Representative(s)

5 Authorization of Work

6 Compensation

E Taxes and Contributions

8 Changes in the Work

G Financial Audits

Rt Warranty

11 Right to Terminate or Suspend
12 Relationship

i3 Assignment and Subcontracts

i4 Contractor Personnel Matters

i5 Insurance

i6 Indemnity

i7 Security

18 Fitness-for-Buty Policy

19 Laws and Project Rules

A. General
B. Environmenta! Provisions

20 Governing Law

& Confidentiality; Use of Information
22 Nonwaiver
23 Merger
24 Workplace Violence Prevention

tachment A Rate Schedule

ftachment B
tachment €
Iackment D
Hachment E

Background Investigation and Drug Screen

Zode of Ethics Acknowledgment Form

Florida PSC Rule 25-6.04364

Burns & Mc Donnell Memorandum dated February 18, 2008

- Page 2 of 27- Service Non-Nuclear
Revision 011508
#1457

09RP-OPCPOD1-46-000002




CONFIDENTIAL

CONTRACT NO, 368351

This Contract (hereinafter “Contract™), effective March 17, 2008, by and between PROGRESS
INERGY SERVICE COMPANY, LLC, whose address is 410 South Wilmington Street, Raleigh, NC
17601, not in its individual capacity, but solely as agent for PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA, INC.
wreinafter referred to as “Owner”), and BURNS & MCDONNELL CONSULTANTS, INC, a
:orperation, whose office is located at 9400 Ward Parkway, Kansas City, MO 64114 (hereinafler referred
0 as "Contragtor™).

WITNESSETH:
In considerstion of the mutual promises set forth herein, the parties hereby contract as follows:

tECTION 1._DESCRIPTION OF WORK

ECTION 2. TERM OF CONIRACT

i ECTION 3. COMMENCEMENT OF WORK

. ECTION 4. OWNER’S DESIGNATED REPRESENTATIVE(S)

: ECTION 5. AUTH\IRIZATION OF WORK

= 5 Service Noso-Nuclear
Revision 01/5/08
#145476

09RP-OPCPOD1-46-000003



CONFIDENTIAL

SECTION 6. COMPENSATION

VECTION 7. TAXES AND CONTRIBUTIONS

- Page 4 of 27- Service Noa-Nuclear

Recvision 01/E5M8
R145476

09RP-OPCPOD1-46-000004




CONFIDENTIAL

tECTION 8. CHANGES IN THE WORK

HECTION 9. FINANNCIAL AUDITS

ECTION 10. WARRANTY

ECTION 11. RIGE'T TO TERMINATE OR SUSPEND

+ ECTION 12, REL;3 TIONSHIP

+ ECTION 13, ASSTGNMENT AND SUBCONTRACTS

- Page 5 of 27- Service Non-Nucloar
Revision 01/15/08
H145476

09RP-OPCPOD1-46-000005




CONFIDENTIAL

SECTION 14. CONTRACTOR PERSONNEL MATTERS

JECTION 15, INSI;RANCE

- Page 6 of 27-

Service Non-Nocloar
Revision 0171308
X145476
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CONFIDENTIAL

. ECTION 16, INDEMNITY

- Page 7 of 27- Service Non-Nuclar
Revision 0171508
145476

09RP-OPCPOD1-46-000007




CONFIDENTIAL

. ECTION 17, SECURITY

: ECTION 18, FITNESS-FOR-DUTY POLICY

Non-Nuclear
Revigion 01715108
#145476

09RP-OPCPOD1-46-000008



CONFIDENTIAL

iECTION 19. LAWS AND PROJECT R ULES

- Page 9 of 27- Service Non-Nuclear
Revision 01/15/08
X145476
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CONFIDENTIAL

Revigion 0171508
#145476
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CONFIDENTIAL

- Page 11 of 27- Service Non-Nuclear

Revision 01/15/08
145476
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CONFIDENTIAL

- Page 12 of 27-

Servise Non-Nuclear
Revision 01/F5/08
H145476
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CONFIDENTIAL

- Page 13 of 27- Servige Non-Nuclear
Revision 01/15/08
#145476
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CONFIDENTIAL

EC 7 ON 20. GOV.ERNING LAW

. ECTION 21. CONITIDENTIALITY: USE OF INFi ORMATION

- Page 14 of 27- Service Non-Noclear
Revision 01/15/08
#145476

09RP-OPCPOD1-46-000014




CONFIDENTIAL

SECTION 22, NONWAIVER

ECTION 23. MERGER

- Page 15 of 27-

Service Non-Nuclesr
Revision 01/13/08
#145476
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CONFIDENTIAL

The partics executa this Coutract by their signature or the signatere of thelr authorized agents.

AURNS & MCDONNELL PROGRESS ENERGY SERVICE COMPANY, LLC,
CONSULTANTS INC, not in its individual capacity, but solely as agent for

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA, INC.
j‘*%\/()/\/ ‘
By BY:

S T
NAME (primc:lL:_ L“‘}*,(.H"( TS O W o s ol

i (Ofﬁcef Name)
TITLE: 2, e Se. Rocdangi-e,  Aao b
(ﬁ) fficer "Ejtlc) ’ ’

) b .

DATE:

- Page 16 of 27- Servive Non-Nucloar
Revision 017152
FLi3476
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CONFIDENTIAL

Attachment A

-Page 17 of 27- Service Non-Nuckews
Revizion 01/15/08
#145476
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CONFIDENTIAL

Attachment B

~Page 18 of 27- Service Noo-Nuclear
Revision D1/15/08
#145476
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CONFIDENTIAL

Attachment B

~Page 19 of 27- Service Non-Noclear
Revision 01/1508
¥145476
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CONFIDENTIAL

Attachment B

-Page 20 of 27- Sarvice Non-Nuclear

Revision 0171508
145476

09RP-OPCPOD1-46-000020




CONFIDENTIAL

Attachment B

-Page 21 of 27- Service Non-Nucicar
Revisian 01/15/08
1145476
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CONFIDENTIAL

Attachment B

-Page 22 of 27- Service Non-Nuclear
Revision 01/1508
#145476
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CONFIDENTIAL

Attachment C

-Page 230f27- Sérvice Non-Nutlear
Revision 01/1508
#4547
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CONFIDENTIAL

Attachment D

-Page_ 24 of 27- Service Non-Nuck
Revision 01/15/08
#143476
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CONFIDENTIAL

Attachment £

-Page 25 of 27- Service Non-Nuclear

Revision 01/15/08
#145476
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CONFIDENTIAL -

Attachment E

-Page 26 of 27- Service Non-Nuclear
Revision 01/15/08
145478
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CONFIDENTIAL

~Page 27 of 27- Service Non-Nuckear

Revision 01/15/08
145476
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CONFIDENTIAL
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CONFIDENTIAL

Date Issaed: 03/27/2008 Prepared By: CH

09RP-OPCFPOD1-46-000030
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REDACTED

PLEASE REMIT TO;
VARLTON FIELDS O fox 3239
Y Tompa, FL 1360} 3730
ATTORNEYS AT LAW B13.223 Y000
Fox B13.229 €132
N v?":;:f:,',':: ;‘":; o P 0. Boa 01910 PO Box 1171 PO Box 286 PO Drawer 190 PO Bon 150
Aanta, Gevrgra 30309 #vouna, FE 23131 riendo, H 32802 S Perwrsbug, FI 33731 Tokghosses. 1 12302 Wea Pl Seach, F 33402
404,915 3400 365 530 0050 407 B49.0300 127 671 7000 §50.224 1585 301 459 7070
Fas 404 815 3415 Fom 303.530:0033 Fox 407 643 V009 Fon 727 877 3758 Fox 830.222.0398 Fax 561,659 7368
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA DECEMBER 92, 2008
PC BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 528223
DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT

RE: 2009 RATE CASE

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT

LESS: PAYMENTS

BALANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 11/30/08
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 11/30/08

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BALANCE OUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-30 91-120 OVER 120 TOTAL
o2
O¢
a2t con® *** REMITTANCE COPY w*+»
gt SUBMITTED
¢zC 10 2008
= ECTRONICALLY

Poyment is dus upon receipt, Interes! will be chorged on unpeid invoices aged 35 days or more from invoice dole.

Services designoted with an (*) were parformed under the strict supervision of admitted aftorneys by persons notl admitted to proclice low in the controlling jurisdiction,

09RC-STAFFPQD2-7-000001




REDACTED

. CARLTON FIELDS
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA DECEMBER 5, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 528223 PAGE 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH NOVEMBER 20, 2008

PHASE L10: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN

Task L110 : FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

11/03/08 JMW CALL WITH BEURIS REGARDING WNEEESERENNN .20
L)

11/07/08 JMW CALL AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH BEURIS AND VANDER .40

WEIDE REGARDING NN C/LL
AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CROSS REGARDING (R

REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
AND

e

11/11/08 JMW CORRESPONDENCE WITH LYNCH REGARDING iGN L10

11/12/08 JMW CORRESPONDENCE WITH VANDER WEIDE AND BEURIS .10
REGARDING

11/25/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF Uil .40

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS WITH BOB GRASSMAN RE

11/25/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE U .30

11/25/08 JMW REVIEW ISSUE REGARDING NEEGIREER .10

REVIEW FOLLOW
" UP CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING SAME
: \J\\e%e
A1

Subtotal for Task L110 1.60

Task L120 ¢+ ANALYSIS/STRATEGY

CARLTON FIELDS, PA,
Adonto ¢ Miomi » Orlande * St Petersbuig # Tallchassee ® Tompo « Woest Palm Beach
Services designated with an [*] were performed under the strict supervision of admilied attorneys by persons not admitted fo practice law in the controlling jurisdichion.

09RC-STAFFPOD2-7-000002




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

rec o E—_—
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA DECEMBER 9, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO, 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 528223 PAGE 2
11/03/08 JMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL 1.50
REGARDING i
W REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF S
PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME
11/06/08 DMT DIscuss (NGRS /171 KATE .60
CARTER AND DRAFT EMAIL N
j FOLLOW UP
WITH CINDY LEE RE
11/06/08 JMW  CALL WITH CLIENTS REGARDING NN .50

FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT

REGARDING N

11/06/08 -JMW  REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING §ENN

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TC CLIENTS
REGARDING WS FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT

REGARDING ‘
REVIEW TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
11/21/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF .20

11/21/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF YNNGy : 40
.

11/24/08 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SNSmassiesnuniin .30
W WITH MIKE WALLS.

11/24/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS oF (iR 4.00

PREPARE NOTES REGARDING Wi} REVIEW AND
ANBRLYSIS OF PREPARE NOTES

REGARDING FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING
11/25/08 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF I .50
OIS FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING
&
2
Subtotal for Task L120 : 9.60
Task L130 : EXPERTS/CONSULTANTS

CARLTON FIELDS, PA,
Adonia ¢ Miomi « Orlonde » 51 Patersburg * Tollohassee * Tompo ¢ West Palm Beach
Services designoted with on [*] were performed under the strict supervision of admitted aorneys by persons not admitied 1o proctice law in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RC-STAFFPOD2-7-000003




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

rep i D
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA DECEMBER 9, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 528223 PAGE 3

11/04/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ENGEmSlimD .60
— T ™
R . VI
BEURIS CORRESPONDENCE WITH

, FOLLOW UP REGARDING N
(. 1)

11/06/08 JMW REVIEW FILE AND CALLS WITH ROBINSON REGARDING .10
L - "
CORRESPONDENCE WITH ROBINSON REGARDING SR

11/11/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS oF rRoBInson (SR 3.00

, PREPARE NOTES
REGARDING SAME

11/11/08 JMW CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENTS REGARDING JillND .10
e
L ]

11/12/08 JMW  REVIEW aND anaLyYsIs or NGNS i 2.00

11/13/08 JMW CALLS WITH CINDY LEE REGARDING (NN 1.40
O ¢  REVIEW
VARIQUS ROBINSON AND LEE CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING G : C.L0. WITH EARL
ROBINSON REGARDING { ISl C1EPARE
NOTES REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE,
DOCUMENTS, AND CALL WITH ROBINSON (.7); REVIEW
T
CORRESPONDENCE (. 3)

11/14/08 JMW  VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE WITH EARL ROBINSON AND .10
CINDY LEE REGARDING cmasasssssssesiiim
L

11/20/08 JMW CALLS WITH CLIENTS (BEURIS AND LEE) REGARDING .20
. ]

L Y

11/21/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CORRESPONDENCE AND .30

L
6.
?{\4“&%6

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.,
Atlanto * Miomi » Orlande = St Petersburg » Yallahossee ¢ Tompo » West Polm Beach
Services designoted with an {*] were performed under the sirict supervision of admitted attornays by persons not admited lo practice low in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RC-STAFFPOD2-7-000004




REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA DECEMBER 9, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 0030%-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 528223 PAGE 4

Subtotal for Task L130

.
~J
.

0w
<

Tagsk L410 1 FACT WITNESSES

11/05/08 JMW PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND RSN .20
e ——E——————— T
L '

11/05/08 JMW  REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING NN 4.10

Y
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING NENNGGEGNGG
(1.0); REVIEW _ PREPARE’
NOTES REGARDING NN : ::-vicwW
CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

, PREPARE

e ——
CORRESPONDENCE TO BEURIS REGARDING y
REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND
AR Y
11/06/08 MW 2.50

11/10/08 JMW  CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING NS .10
L ]

11/14/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GlNmnsaniilp 2.00

", PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
CLIENT REGARDING SN

11/21/08 JMW  REVIEW U 3.80
, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS
REGARDING ;
REVIEW

o
()
" \“\\G$

: PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS
REGARDING

R
SN : FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT ON
e e
R

11/25/08 JMW REVIEW BAND ANALYSIS OF

, REVIEW PRIOR

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlonto * Miomi © Orlonde # 5t Pelersburg + Tolighossee ¢ Tompo = West Poim Beach
Services designated with an |*] were performed under the sirict supervision of cdmited aftorneys by persons nol admitted o practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.

09RC-STAFFPOD2-7-000005



REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

FED. D _
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA DECEMBER $, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 528223 PAGE 5
CASE
Subtotal for Task L410 H 15.50

Task L420 : EXPERT WITNESSES

11/10/08 JMW  PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH BEURIS AND 1.20
VANDER WEIDE REGARDING =

Subtotal for Task L420 : 1.20
PHASE L20: PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS

Task L130 : EXPERTS/CONSULTANTS _

11/21/08 DMT REVIEW AND anaLysis oF GlNEENENIRERENNE .70
R
SRR, ¢ REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

..a\
(\f\ﬂe‘\v
ﬁ@cp Subtotal for Task L130 s .70
q-\\e%‘?'

TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

JMW J. M. WALLS .90 hours at
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT .70 hours at

W

Total Task Code L110 1.60

JMW J. M. WALLS 8.50 hours at $
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 1.10 hours at $
Total Task Code L120 : 9.60
JMW J. M. WALLS 7.80 hours at $
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT .70 hours at §

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflanta + Miomi * Orlando * St Petersburg * Tollohosses » Tumpo * West Pelm Beach
Services designaled with on [*) were performed under the strict supervision of odmired anarneys by persons not odmitted 1o praciice law in the conirolfing jurisdiction.

09RC-STAFFPOD2-7-000006




REDACTED

.. - CARLTON FIELDS
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA DECEMBER 9, 2008
2005 RATE CASE REF. NC. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 528223 PAGE &

Total Task Code L1300 8.50
JMW J. M. WALLS 15.50 hours

Total Task Code L410 : ~  15.5p
JMW J. M. WALLS 1.20 hours

Total Task Code L420 1.20

ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY

DMT . M., TRIPLETT 2.50 hours
JMW J, M. WALLS 33.90 hours
TOTALS 36.40

COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED NOVEMBER 30, 2008

Code E101 COPYING

11/12/08 COPYING COST .90
11/17/08 CO2YING COST 16.40
Total Code E101 17.390
Code E105  TELEPHONE
10/21/08 TELEPHONE 18.94
10/31/08 TELEPHONE 23.70
11/06/08 TELEPHONE 31.35
11/20/08 TELEPHONE 4.05
Total Code E105 78.04
Code E107 DELIVERY SERVICES/MESSENCERS
11/17/08 EXPRESS MAIL 69.90
Total Code E107 69.90
Code E108 POSTAGE
11/07/08 POSTAGE 5.20
Total Code E108 5.20
TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2008 $170.44
INVOICE 528223 TOTAL _
0(\3\ -
ofio®
aLe
32"
i3
e

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Allorta « Miomi » Ordonde » $1. Pelensburg » Talahosses + Tompa » West Poim Beoch
Services designated with an (%] were perlormed under the sirict supervision of admitted altorneys by persons not admitied 1o proctice fow in the controfling jurisdiction.
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REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS

reo o SN,
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA DECEMBER 92, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 0030%-3B087
INVOICE NUMBER 528223 PAGE 7

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS '

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Atlonlg ¢ Miomi s Crlando v Si. Pelersburg = Tellohossee * Tompa ¢ Wast Polm Beach
Services designated with on [*] were performed under the sirict supervision of admited altorneys by persons not odmilked 1o practice low in the conlrolling jurisdiction.

09RC-STAFFPODZ2-7-000008




REDACTED

Richard D. Melson

Attorney & Counselor

755 Piedment Drive i Cell; 850-322-3041
Tallahassee, FIl. 32312 rick@rmeisoniaw.com Phone; B50-894-1351
INVQICE

2282000

John T. Bumett Invoice #; 108

Progress Encrgy Service Company, LLC b@(\{\ﬁ\

P.O. Box 14042, PEF 151 =

St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042 6.,,06

&
Matter: 2009 Basc Rate Case

Date Description of Setvices Hours/Qty  Rate Arnount
2/212009 Telephone call with Walls and Pertuando ;egardmg 0.7
2/3/2009 Tclcpbone conference with Bumett and Walls red il 0.9

W
telephone call with Wails and Tnplcm
.

52009 Review current AR 3.2
SR cvicw last rate order SERN

SR - icw interim rate stamte and redated
rules; confercnce call with Glenn and others regarding

.
Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson Total
FLIN: :
(' Payments/Credits
If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please
contact me at (850) 894-1351. Balance Due

Page 1
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Date

REDACTED

Richard D. Melson

Altarney & Counselor
705 Piedmont Drive Cell: 850-322-304]
Tallahassee, R, 32312 rick@rmelsonlaw.com Phone: 850-894-1351
INVOICE
2/28/2009
John T. Burnen Invoice #: 108

Progress Energy Service Company, LLC
P.0. Box 14042, PEF 15)
St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042

Matter: 2009 Base Raie Case

Description of Services Hours/Qry Rate Amount

2/6/2009 Participate in weckly status conference; confer with 4.5 —

292009  Revicw GGG, < - vicw

Walls and Triplett re
with Murray and Graham re
review latest draft of Young testimony and~

) telephone ca!ls

R | rvic updatcd SRR
revicw and respend to e-mails; conference call with
Walls, Siusser and Holdstein to discuss R

L
R o ic v S
R cvicy
@ conference call with Triplett and Little re (R

A
SR, o 2nd prbv'!!e COMMEnts

P —— od and

Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson Total

FEIN: )

¢ Payments/Credits

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please

contact me at (850) 894-1351. Balance Due
Page 2
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Richard D. Melson

Altorney & Counselor
705 Piegmont Driva
Tallahassee, FL 32312 rick@meisoniaw.com
- INVOICE
2/28/2009

John T. Burnett

Progress Energy Service Company, LLC
P.O. Box 14042, PEF {5}

St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042

Matter: 2009 Basc Rate Case

REDACTED

Cell: 850-322-3041
Phone: B50-894-1351

Invoice #: 108

Date Description of Services Hours/Qty Rate Amount
2102009  Detailed review of SEENEENGRGGG confer with 5.1
Triplett re SENEENEENGG—RE
review NGNS
Wy roview documents from Licle NN
2/11/2009  Finish reorganization and redraft of RN 1.2
RN, cont:ct Graham re SR
2122009 Review UGN SRS 2
e e—— ]
S revicw ' ] i
telephone conference with Murray and Rutledge to
R
2132009 Review UENGEDNGNGENGUGNGGREEATE 1.8
participate in weekly status conference call; prepare
L
' 2\
confident’®
?r'w'\'lesed and
Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson Total
FETN: ]
¢ Payments/Credits
If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please Balance Due

contact me at (850) 894-1351.

Pege 3
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REDACTED

Richard D. Melson

Attorney & Counsefor
705 Piedmont Drive Celi: 850-322-3041
Talahzssoe, F, 32312 rick@mmcisonlaw.com Phane: B50-854-1351
INVOICE
21282009

John T. Bumett

Progress Energy Service Company, LLC
P.0O. Box 14042, PEF 151

St Petersburg, FL 33733-3042

Invoice #: 108

Matter: 2009 Base Rate Case

Datc Description of Services Hours/Qty Rate Amount
2/16/2009  Confer with Walls re CEENENGEED 36
R o S

elephone call with Gary Little re \SERGGGu__h
review (R - icw drafl of
. :nd c-moil
RN ; confironce call with Cross

and Walls; telephone call with Lintle and prepare

2/17/2009  Telephone call to Delene Graham; review and respond 0.2 —
to e-mails.

2/18/2009  Review and respond to ¢-mails; minor revisions to 5.6
U rcvic SR 2nd provide
WS oo S
R ——
L)

2/19/72009 Review and respond 1o e-mail; revicw_ 4.6 —
S . conference call with Don Taylcr

others to NGRS
VR i
o= U
. i\eged and configen
. priv
Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson Total
FEINY .
( Payments/Credits
IT you have any questions regarding this invoice, please
contact me at (850) 894-1351. Balance Due

Page 4
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Richard D. Melson

Aftorney & Counselor
795 Piedmon: Drive
Taliahassee, FL 32312 rick@rmelsonfaw com
INVQICE
2/28/2009

John T. Burnett

Progress Energy Service Company, LLC
P.O. Box 14042, PEF 15]

St. Petersburg, FIL 33733-3042

Date

Matter: 2009 Basc Rate Case

Description of Services

REDACTED

Colt: B50-322-3041
Phore:. 850-894-1351

Invoice #: 108

Hours/Quy Rate Amount

272012004

2/23/2009

2/24/2009

Prepare {or and participate in conference call re N

: weekly status conference call; revisc SR
review rate

W conference call ro SN

Review znd | GG
S rcvicw various c-mails ro WD
W correspond with client re S NENENDEND

Revicw SN
SN 1cIcphone conference to discuss (RMNNGENES
R <2l with Rutledpe and Moore ro
VY - p:cparc and circulate
"SR (0!!0+-up rc .
W [cvicy and respond to

various e-mails.

Participate in WM confcrence call: review and
tespond 10 ¢-mails; conference cail with luel team re

Please make checks payable 1o: Richard D. Melson

(FEIN: \g——

[f you have any questions regarding this invoice, please
contact me at (850) 894-1351.

fage §

7.4

0.4

(V%]

49

pdent

d
praviere? >

Total

Payments/Credits

Balance Due
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REDACTED

Richard D, Melson

Attorney & Counselor
705 Piedmont, Drive Cell: 850-322-3041
Tallahassee, FL 32312 rick@rmelsoniaw.com Phone: B50-894-1351
INVOICE
2/28/2009

John T. Burnett

Progress Energy Service Company, LLC
P.O. Box 14042, PEF [ 51

St1. Petersburg, FI. 33733-3042

Invoice ¥ 108

Matter: 2009 Base Ratc Case

Date Deseription of Services Hours/Qry Rate Amount

2726/2009  Review ‘e 35
e ———————— B AT

A ;. (cicphone
Lirt| NN tclcphone call with nuclear
L .

team to

27272009 Participate in weekly status conference call; follow-up 2.6
re R

- rovicw G

R

-

2/17/2009  long distance 2037 20,37

jat
ﬂdeﬂt‘a
Pr"\l‘i‘eged

Pleasc make checks payable to: Richard D. Mclson Total -
(FEIN. .

Payments/Credits $0.00

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please
contact me at (850) 894-1351. Ll i !

Page 6
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