
Raquel Tully O q O a l 8 - T ~  
From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 
ClB 

Monday, June 01,2009 2:07 PM 
To: Raquel Tully , 'z.Ff-t>;-:  fit; . . .  

Subject: RE: RAf08 

Good afternoon: . -  
1. Concerning the payment of $1,244 for TX962 - OneTone Telecom, Inc. - Deposit $744 as you normally would for the 2008 RAF 
and late payment charges. The balance is the $500 fine. Deposit $200 in the Public Service Commission Regulatory Trust Fund 
for collection costs and the balance of $300 in the General Revenue Fund. Please provide the Clerk's Office with proof of payment 
so that it can be documented in Docket No. 090218-TX. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, June 01, 2009 12:59 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: RAfO8 

I received two Raf pymts for 2008, please let me know the break down 

TX962 $1244.00 
TJ787 $500.00 

6/1/2009 


