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(340293 -/lr T&k\ Iqio .GQ Raquel Tully 

From: Paula lsler Cq\a.- e B 4  

To: Raquel Tully DEP 940 6/10/09 &K* XIq 
Sent: Thursday, June 04,2009 I O :  10 AM 

Subject: RE: Payment received from Sipcom Corporation - TKI 82 ;M 2oo.oa U G Q q J  
~ ~ . c y 3  - =3tnc 

Good morning: Wa\m cr 
Deposit $910 as you normally would for 2008 RAF and late payment charges. The remaining $500 is the fine. Deposit $200 in the 
Public Service Commission Regulatory Trust Fund for collection costs and the balance of $300 in the General Revenue Fund. 
Please provide the Clerk‘s Office with proofs of payment so that they can be included in Docket No. 090293-TI. Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Thursday, June 04, 2009 10:02 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

I received a check for $1410 from TK182. Please let me know the break down 
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6/4/2009 


