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Raquel Tully 

From: Paula lsler ‘p;a(=j!;rr ajA:,kh\’C 55b3 
8 4 1  j i j i v  1Q2009 am- Gc-3 Sent: 

To: Raquel Tully 
Wednesday, June 17,2009 248 PM 

Subject: RE: Raf from Dial World Network, Inc. (TK181) 

Good afternoon: 

Deposit $924.46 as you normally would, which is for the 2008 RAF and late payment charges and should be applied as follows: 
$714.46 RAF, $175 penalty, and $35 interest. The balance of $500 is a fine. Deposit $200 in the Public Service Commission 
Regulatory Trust Fund and the balance of $300 in the General Revenue Fund. Please provide the Clerk‘s Office with proof of 
payment so that it can be document in Docket No. 090292-TI. Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Wednesday, lune 17, 2009 2 3 7  PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: Raf 

I received a check from Dial World Network, TK 181 for $1424.46 

6/17/2009 


