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To: Raquel Tully . 947JUL212gg9 3.00-3iCi 

Raquel Tully 

I .. 
i* ... 

From: Nancy Pruitt 

Sent: 
-,' 'i..:.. ~ ! ,, , ~ . , , 

Monday, July 20,2009 1 I :47 AM dB Ja- RecwrY 

7 / / 6 / 6 9  Subject: RE: 

a- 
The $100 is for the 2009 RAF for this partial year. The $500 is the fine of which $200 is collection costs for 
the PSC Regulary Trust Fund and $300 is for General Revenue Fund. Please inform the Clerk's Office so 
that this is noted in Docket 090238-TC. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, July 20,2009 11:32 AM 
To: Nancy Pruitt 
Subject: 

I received a check from TG528. Jedi, Inc for $600.00 . I know that $100.00 is for their Raf pymt. Please let me know how to apply 
the $500.00 

Thanks 

7/20/2009 


