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CONFIDENTIAL

Question #267

Docket No. 090079-El

Staff's 22nd Set of interrogatories

Witness: P. Toomey

Actual 2008 - April - lJune Total
March 2009 2009 Estimated July-  Reprojection
Outside Consultants
Cost of Service William Slusser S 81,788 § 21,928 § 60,000 163,717 (1)
Return on Equity James Vander Weide 28,725 - 61,000 89,725 (2)
Contractor Connie Allisan 23,387 24,936 42,000 90,323 (3)
Fossil Dismantlement Jeff Kopp - 7,551 28,750 36,301 (4)
Nuc Decommissioning Bill Cloutier 93,100 - - 93,100 (5}
Depreciation Study Earl Robinson - - 50,000 50,000 (6}
Storm Reserve Steve Harris 72,540 - 20,000 92,540 (7)
259,542 54,415 261,750 615,707
Legal Expenses 334,325 287,708 754,225 1,376,258 (8)
Travel 4,905 2,941 113,580 121,426 (9)
Printing {Various) 17,771 99,916 20,000 137,687 (10)
5 656,543 § 444,979 § 1,149,555 2,251,077

{1)
{2)

{3)
{4)
{s)
{6)

n

{8)

(9)

{10

Salary S10K Per Month X 6 months

$17K (Direct testimony and Discovery), 525K (Rebuttal Testimony)
$7K {Deposition), 58K (Hearings), $4K {Travel)

Salary S7K Per Month X 6 months

Invoice #52576-2 paid in July 58,750 and estimated $20K (Discovery).
No estimated costs

$30K (Discovery} and 520K (Rebuttal Testimony)

320K {Rebuttal Testimony and Withess)

S} v oices from Sejal Mehta charged to incorrect project - for compilation and bates numbering of discovery responses.
Rick Melson, Attorney, prehearing motions, discovery responses, depositions, rebuttal testimony, hearmg and post

hearing, legal research on various issues, estimate based on prior electric rate cases 430 hours at
Carlton Fields estimate lsﬁlrough the end of the hearing, discovery 6 weeks, depositions,
estimated based on prior rate case legal expense, adjusted for inflation and relative complexity of the issues involved in this
proceeding compared to prior proceedings. The estimated fees for the remainder of the case assume the following events:

rebutta testimony Legal fees are

continuation of written discovery for another six weeks, taking and defending of depositions, preparation of rebuttal testimony,
preparation for and attendance at final hearing, and preparations of post hearing briefs.

Rate Case Travel Expenses Projected for July-Dec 2009
Number of people attending Hearing 9/21/09 - 10/2/09:
Witnesses/backups
Legal
Regulatory
Total
Hearing Cost:
Hotel - Hearings 9/19-10/2 = 14 days @ $130/day
Airfare @ $300/person
Rental Car {assume 4 per car = 9 cars x 50/day x 14 days)
Food @550/day

Other Travel:
Prehearing Sept 14, 2009 {4 people x $300 airfare + $130 hotel + $50 food}
Agenda Conference Nov 19, 2009 (4 people x $300 airfare + 5130 hotel + $50 food)
Agenda Conference Dec 1, 2009 (4 people x 5300 airfare + 5130 hotel + $50 food)
Total Projected Travel Expense

Printing of Rate Inserts and Cost of Service,

24
6
6

36

$65,520
10,800
6,300
25,200
107,820

1,920
1,920
1,920
$113,580
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Analysis of Rate Case Project 20044211

CONFIDENTIAL

Involce Voucher Transaction
Month Year Actount i Charge By Chasge To Source System Supplier Name MNumber Mumber Resource Type Lvl 2 Descrip {Code} Task Level 5 Description (Code) Amount
6 2009 1861900 60X00D  6OXDOD  Projects ONSITE CONTRACTOR LABCR (£O5} 629.59
6 2009 1861900 981040  60XD0OD  LABOR, PAYROLL OVERTIME COMPANY LABOR {EB0) 93.48
6 2009 1B61900 981040  60XOOD  Projects EMPLOYEE LBR ADJ NON-UN!ON OT (ELB) 579.80
6 2009 1861900 981040 60X00D  Projects OTHER BURDEN TAXES (0BT} 7.88
6 2009 1861900 981040 60X00D  Projects OTHER BURDEN TAXES [O8T) 48.88
6 2009 1861900 98111D  6OX00D  Projects EMPLOYEE LBR ADJ NON-UNION QT (ELB) 155.65
6 2009 1B61900 981110  60X00D  Projects EXCEPTIONAL HRS BURDENING (OBN) [106.64)
6 2009 iB61900 98111D  60XOQD  Projects LABOR ADJUSTMENT (ELA) [735.45)
& 2009 1861900 981110  60X00D Projects OTHER BURDEN BENEFITS (OBB) {154.44)
6 2009 1861900 981110 60XOCD  Projects OTHER BURDEN TAXES (0BT) {48.88)
6 2009 1861900 981110  6OXOOD  Projects OTHER PENSION BURDEN {OBA) {53.69)
6 2009 1861500 98GT2D 6OXODD  LABOR, PAYROLL BASE COMPANY LABOR (EBC) 154.77
& 2009 1861900 98GT2D 60XO0D  LABOR, PAYROLL OVERTIME COMPANY LABOR (EBD) 501.04
6 2009 1861900 S8GT2D  60X0CD LABOR, PAYROLL QVERTIME COMPANY LABOR (EBO) 477.66
6 2009 1861900 98GT2D 60XO0D  Projects EXCEPTIQONAL HRS BURDENING {OBN) 22.44
6 2009 1861900 9BGT2D 60XO0D  Projects OTHER BURDEN BENEFITS {OBB) 32.50
6 2009 1861900 98GT2D 6OXQOD  Projects OTHER BURDEN TAXES {OBT) 42.24
6 2009 1861900 9BGT2D 60XODD  Projects OTHER BURDEN TAXES (OBT) 53.32
6 2009 1861900 98GT2D  6OXOOD  Projects QOTHER PENSION BURDEN {GBA) 11.30
6 2009 1861900 98LW1D 60X0QD  LABOR, PAYROLL BASE COMPANY tABOR (EBC) 474.15
6 2009 1861900 98LW1D 60X00D  LABOR, PAYROLL BASE COMPANY LABOR (EBC) 190.74
6 2009 1861900 9BLWL1D 6OX00D  Projects EXCEPTIONAL HRS BURDENING (O&N) 68.75
6 2009 1861900 98LW1D 60X0OD  Projects EXCEPTIONAL HRS BURDENING (OBN) 27.66
6 2009 1861900 98LWID 6OX0OD Projects OTHER BURDEN BENEFITS (08B) 93.57
6 2009 1861900 98LW1D 60X00D  Projects OTHER BURDEN BENEFITS [OBB) 40.06
6 2009 1861900 98LW1D 60X00D - Projects OTHER BURDEN TAXES (OBT) 39.97
6 2009 1861900 98LW1D 60X00D  Projects OTHER BURDEN TAXES (OBT) 16.08
6 2009 1861900 98LWID 6O0X00OD  frojects QTHER PENSION BURDEN (OBA) 34.61
6 2009 1861300 98LW1D &0X00DD Projects OTHER PENSION BURDEN (OBA) 13.92
INCREMENTAL LABOR {INLAB) 23,352.96
Invoice Voucher Transaction
Month Year  Account i Charge By Charge To Source System Supplier Name Number Number Resource Type Lv| 2 Descrip (Code) Task Level 5 Description {Code} Amount
5 2009 1861900 60X00D  60X00D  PASSPORT SHI INTL CORP NON TAX PURCHASED SOFTWARE {MPS) Adobe Software 265.00
5 2009 1861900 60X00D  60X0OD  PASSPORT SHI INTL CORP NON TAX PURCHASED SOFTWARE {MP5} Adobe Software 530.00
5 2009 1861900 60X00D  60X00D Projects BURDEN MTLS LOAD CORP {MLC) 13.52
5 2009 1861900 981420  60X0DOD  PASSPORT SHI INTL CORP NON TAX PURCHASED SOFTWARE (MPS] Adobe Software 265.00
5 2009 1861900 981420 60X00D  Projects BURDEN MTLS LCAD CORP {MLC) 4.51
5 2009 1861900 98KZ4D  60X0OD  PASSPORT SHI INTL CORP NON TAX PURCHASED SOFTWARE [MPS) Adobke Software 265.00
5 2009 1861900 98KZ4D  60X00D  Projects BURDEN MTLS LOAD CORP {MLC) 451
5 2009 1861900 98LW3D GOX0OD  PASSPORT SHIINTL CORP NON TAX PURCHASED SOFTWARE (MPS) Adobe Software 1,325.00
5 2009 1861900 98LW3D 60X00D  PASSPORT SHI INTL CORP NON TAX PURCHASED SOFTWARE (MPS) Adobe Software 530.00
5 2009 1861900 98LW3D BOXO0D  Projects BURDEN MTLS LOAD CORP (MLC} 31.54
17 & TELECOMMUNICATIONS {iTTEL) 3,234.08
Invoice Voucher Transaction
Month Year  Account | Charge By Charge To Source System Supplier Name Number Number Resource Type Lvl 2 Descrip {Code} Task Level 5 Description {Code) Amount
4 2009 1861900 60XOOC  BOXOGD  Payables CARLTON FIELDS PA LGL539248 3170786 LEGAL SERVICES (LLS)
4 2009 1861900 60X000  GOXOOD  Payables CARLTON FIELDS PA LGL539248 3170786 LEGAL SERVICES (LLS)
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CONFIDENTIAL

Analysis of Rate Case Project 20044211
Transaction

Amount

Invoice Voucher

Month Year Account |Charge By Charge To Source System Supplier Name Number Number Resource Type Lvl 2 Descrip (Code) Task Level 5 Description (Code)

4 2009 1861900 60X00OD  60X00D  Fayables RICHARD D MELSON LGL109 3159967 LEGAL SERVICES (LLS)

4 2009 1861900 BOX0OD  £0X00D  Payables RICHARD D MELSON LGL109 3159967 LEGAL SERVICES [LLS)

4 2009 1861900 60X00D  &0OX00D Projects LEGAL SERVICES (LLS)

5 2009 1861900 60XOOD  60X00D  Payables CARLTON FIELDS PA LGL542892 3189110 LEGAL SERVICES (LLS)

5 2009 1861900 60X00D  60X00C  Payables CARLTON FIELDS PA LGL542892 3189110 LEGAL SERVICES {LLS)

5 2009 1861500 60X00D  60XOOD  Payables CARLYON FIELDS PA LGL547988 3193898 LEGAL SERVICES (LLS)

5 2009 1861500 60X00D  60X000  Payables CARLTON FIELDS PA LGL547988 3193898 LEGAL SERVICES {LLS)

5 2009 1861900 60X00D  GOX00D  Payables MCGUIRE wOODS LLP LGL91129732 3194535 LEGAL SERVICES (LLS}

5 2009 1861300 6QXO00  60XQ00 . Payables MCGUIRE WDODS LLP LG19]137342 3194665 LEGAL SERVICES (LLS)

5 2009 1861900 60X0OD  BOXOOD  Payables RICHARD D MELSON LGLIO 3184307 LEGAL SERVICES (LLS}

5 2009 1861900 98104D 6OXC0D  LABOR, PAYROLL BASE COMPANY LABOR (EBC) 30.96

5 2009 1861900 981040  60OX00D  LABOR, PAYROLL OVERTIME COMPANY LABOR {EBQ} 105.37

5 2005 1Bp1900 981040  60XO0D  Projects EXCEPTIONAL HRS BURDENING (OBN) 4.49

5 2009 1861900 981040  60X00D  Projects OTHER BURDEN BENEFITS {OBB) 6.50

5 2009 1861900 981040  60X00D  Projects OTHER BURDEN TAXES (OBT) 11.83

S 2009 1861900 581040  60X00D  Projects OTHER PENSION BURDEN (OBA) 2.26

5 2009 1861900 981110  &0X00D  LABOR, PAYROLL OVERTIME COMPANY LABOR (EBQO) 101.68

5 2009 1861500 981110 60X00D  Projects OTHER BURDEN TAXES (OBT] 857

5 2009 1861900 98GT2D 60X00D  LABOR, PAYROLL CVERTIME COMPANY LABOR {EBO) 271.40

5 2009 1861900 98GT2D  60X00D  Projects OTHER BURDEN TAXES {OBT} 22.88

5 2009 1861900 981X4  60X00D  LABOR, PAYROLL BASE COMPANY LABOR (EBC) 3,502.54

5 2005 1861900 98LX4D  60X00D  LABOR, PAYROLL BASE COMPANY LABQOR {EOC) [796.74)

S 2009 1861900 98LX40 60X00D LABOR, PAYROLL OVERTIME COMPANY LABOR (EBO) 68.18

S 2009 1861900 98LX4D  6OXQ0D  Payables GUIDANT GROUP SAG202636 3191974 ONSITE CONTRACTOR LABOR {LOS} 10.56

5 2009 1861900 98LX4D  50X00D  Payables THE BARTECH GROUP {NC SAG202635 3191873 ONSITE CONTRACTOR LABOR [LOS} 611.80

5 2009 1BG1500 SBLX40  60XOO0  Projects EXCEPTIONAL HRS BURDENING [OBN]) 507.87

S 2009 1851900 98(X4D  6OXD0D  Projects EXCEPTIONAL HRS BURDENING (OBN) {115.53)

5 2009 1B61900 SBLX4D  60X00D  Projects OTHER BURDEN BENEFITS (OBB) 735,53

5 2009 1861900 98LX4D  6OX00D  Projects OTHER BURDEN BENEFITS (O8B) (167.32)

S5 2009 1861900 98140  B0X00D  Projects DTHER BURDEN TAXES (OBT} 301.02

S 200% 1851900 98LX4D  60X00D  Projects OTHER BURDEN TAXES (OBT) (67.17)

5 2005 1861900 98LX4D  60X00D  Projects OTHER PENSION BURDEN {GBA) 255,69

5 2009 1861900 9BLX40  6OX0OD  Projects OTHER PENSION BURDEN [CBA) {58.16)

6 2009 1861900 60X00D  €OX00D Payables CARLTON FIELDS PA LGL5528593 3218076 LEGAL SERVICES [LLS) -

& 2009 1861900 60X00D  6OXCOD  Payables CARLTON FIELDS PA LGL552893 3218076 LEGAL SERVICES (LLS)

6 2009 1861500 60X00D  60X0DD  Payables MCGUIRE WOORS LLP LGI91149769 3208014 LEGAL SERVICES {LLS}

6 2009 1861500 60X00D 60X000  Payables RICHARD D MELSON LGL112 3203667 LEGAL SERVICES {LLS)

6 2009 1861500 60X00D  60XDOD  Payables RiCHARD D MELSON LGL112 3203667 LEGAL SERVICES (LLS})

6 2009 1861900 9BLX4D  BOXCOD  Projects ONSITE CONTRACTOR LABGR {LOS) 5,362.50
LEGAL EXPENSES (LEGAL) T 2e7.707.92

Invoice Voucher Transaction
Month Year  Account | Charge By Charge Ta Source System Supplier Name Number Number Resaurce Type Lvl 2 Descrip (Code) Task Level & Description [Code) Amount

82

4 2009 1861900 981580  60X00D  Payables GUIDANT GROUP SAG198972 3158489 ONSITE CONTRACTOR LABOR (LOS) Contractor Labor 40.66
4 2009 1861900 981580 60X00D  Payables GUIDANT GROUP SAG199587 3162924 ONSITE CONTRACTOR LABOR (LOS) Contractor Lakror 44,08
4 2009 1861900 981580  60%X000  Payables GUIDANT GROUP SAG200093 3165608 ONSITE CONTRACTOR LABOR (LOS) Contractor Labor 32.68
4 2003 1861900 981580  60XDOD  Payables GUIDANT GROUP SAG200579 3176002 ONSITE CONTRACTOR LABOR (LOS) Contractor Labor 3211
5 2009 1861900 981380  60X00D  Payables GUIDANT GROUP SAG201075 3178363 ONSITE CONTRACTOR LABQR (LOS) Contractar Labor 37.81
5 2009 1861900 981580 60X00D  Payables GUIDANT GROUP SAG201737 3182674 QNSITE CONTRACTOR LABCR (LOS) Contractor Labor 32.68
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Analysis of Rate Case Project 20044211

CONFIDENTIAL

Invoice Voucher Transaction
Month Year Account |Charge By Charge To Source System Supplier Name Number Number Resource Type Lvl 2 Descrip {Code) Task Level 5 Description (Codi Amount
4 2009 1861900 6OX0OD  BOX00D  Payables INDUS STAFFING SERV INC SAGZ00092 3169514 ONSITE CONTRACTOR LABOR (LDS) 1,227.28
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  eOXOOD  Payables INDUS STAFFING SERV INC SAG200578 3175863 ONSITE CONTRACTGR LABOR {LOS) = 221.40
4 2009 1861900 6OX0OD  GOXOOD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69771 3158721 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 585,36
4 2009 1B61500 60X0OD  60XO0D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 63787 3160186 PLRCHASED MATERIALS {MPM) 1,443,63
4 2009 1861500 GOXOOD  6OXOOD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69807 3159821 PURCHASED MATERIALS {MP M) 2,412.40
4 2009 1861900 60X0OD  60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 63821 3157570 PURCHASED MATERIALS [MPM]} 194.86
4 2009 1861900 60X0CD  &OXCOD  Payabies SIR SPEEDY INC 69822 3157542 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 266.33
4 2009 1B61900 60X000  o60XOOD  Payables SiR SPEEDY INC 69823 3157820 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 322.81
4 2009 1B61900 60X0CD  60X00D  Payables SiR SPEEDY INC 69824 3157139 PURCHASED MATERIALS [MPM) 255,78
4 2009 1861900 60%00D  60XCOD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69825 3157560 PURCHASED MATERJALS (MPM} 265.14
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  60OXDOD  Payahles SIR SPEEDY INC 69826 3157533 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM} 142.61
4 2009 1861500 60X00D  60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69827 3157696 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 107.14
4 2009 18561900 6OXOOD  BOXOOD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC BYBIE 3157267 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM} 118.37
4 2009 1851900 60X00D  60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69839 3157730 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 450.53
4 2009 1861900 60X000  60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69830 3157490 PURCHASED MATERIALS {MPM) 302.95
4 2009 1B6i%00 60X00D  60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69831 3161062 PURCHASED MATERIALS {MPM) 467.94
4 2009 18619500 60X00D  60X0OD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69812 3163786 PURCHASED MATERIALS {MPM) 973.52
4 2009 1861900 BOXOOD  60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69838 3157670 PURCHASED MATERIALS [MPM) 380.12
4 2009 1861500 6OXOOD  60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69859 3157206 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM} 457.53
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 6986C 3157769 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM} 254.52
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  BOXOCD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69861 3157216 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 307.43
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  GOXOOD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69862 3157660 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 238.06
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  6OX00D  Payabies SIR SPEEDY INC 69865 3157147 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 262.82
4 009 1861500 60X0GD  6GXO6D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC B9BB6 3157777 PLURCHASED MATERIALS {MPM) 989,61
4 2009 1B61900 60X00D  60X00D  Payables SiR SPEEDY INC 69885 3157148 PURCHASED MATERIALS {MPM) 763.24
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69887 3157688 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 9497.64
4 2009 1861900 GOX00D  BOXOGD  Payables SIR SPEERY INC 69894 3157697 PURCHASED MATERJALS (MPM} 975.45
4 2009 1861900 60X000  GOXO0D  Payables SIR SPELDY INC 65896 3157614 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM} 227.40
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69904 3157714 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM] 430.09
4 2009 1B61900 60X00D  60X00D  Payables S5iR SPEEDY INC 69905 3157173 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 831.56
4 2003 1861500 60X00D  60X00D  Payables StR SPEEDY INC 69912 3157631 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 979.52
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  &O0XGOD  Payables SIR SPEEDY IKC 69922 3157278 PURCHASED MATERIALS {MPM) 130.84
4 2009 1861900 GOXOC0D  6OXCOD  Payables SR SPEEDY INC 69923 3157491 PURCHASED MATERIALS {MPM) 120.75
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  GOXOOD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69953 3157641 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 1,152.14
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  BOXOOD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69957 3160177 PURCHASED MATERIALS [MPM) 117.11
4 2009 1861900 GOXOOD  60X00OD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69971 3156950 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 842.04
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  60X00D  Payables SHR SPEEDY INC 69983 3159643 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 2,565.84
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  6OXOOD  Payables SIR SPEEDY iNC 69993 3164300 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPAL} 4,243.56
4 2009 1861500 60X0OD  BOXOOD  Payabtes SIR SPEEDY INC 69994 3157316 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM} 964.59
4 2009 1861500 60X00D  60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 69995 3157060 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM} 106.61
4 2009 1861500 60X00D  60XDOD  Payables SIR SPEEDY iNC 69997 3156977 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM} 1,008,15
4 2009 186150C 60X00D  60X00D  Payabies SIR SPEEDY INC 70120 3165228 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM} 126.70
4 2009 1851900 60X00D0  GOX00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 70121 3164485 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 74.53
4 2009 1B61900 60X00D  60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 70129433 3172749 PURCHASED MATERIALS {MPM) 1,184.94
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  60X0OD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 70137 3164986 PURCHASED MATERIALS {MPM) 155,97
4 2009 1BB1900 60X00D  &SOXOOD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 70139 3164552 PURCHASED MATERIALS {MPM) 2,320.37
4 2009 1861900 60XOOD  GOXOOD  Payables SIR SPEECY INC 70173 3165293 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 392.52
4 2009 1861900 60X00D  60X0QD  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 70210 3173563 PURCHASED MATERIALS (MPM) 119.98
4 2009 1861900 60%000 60X00D  Payables SIR SPEEDY INC 70275 3176356 PURCHASED MATERIALS {MPM) 35,71

a4

09RP-STAFFPOD16-100-84



SB-00T-9T00dd4Y15-4460 58

—————rerreaa

L9TZSTOT'T  600T duny - wondadu; - jejor
6L EPS'959 5007 UJEW - Uopdadu| [e}0L SNOIARLY
88 LL6'PYY £00Z 3unr - [udy jelop

6T0T9'EL {314na) BNILYININA B ONILNIY L

ST9TT {S01) HOAY1 YOLDVYHINGD ALISNO swalodd  QOOXC9  OOX09 DKETIBL 6007 9
LTTSRT {S47} HOBY OLIVYLNQD 3115440 £BISTZE TOTET SNQILMOS YICIW sa|qeded  QOCX09  QOOX09 DOGI9BT 600T ¢
PTZET R -{S07) HOBYT HOLIVHINGD ILISNO 8605TZE  GBLSOTOVS  ONI AM3S ONIZAVLS SNONI saiqeARg  (0OXO9  QOOXQ9 OOGTI8T 6007 9
TEOIT . :(S07) YOAY1 YOLIWHINGD ALISNO 0€L0TZE  STHSOTOVS NI AHIS ONIF4VLS SNONI s3|qeAed  QOOX09  QOOX09 ODGTIBT 600 9
[, :{(S0O7) YOAY1 YOLOVYLNOD JLISNO LETPOZE  LTHYOTOVS JNI AHIS ONIZAVLS SNONI sa|qeded 0ooX09  Q0OX09 006T98T 6002 9
S8ZE {501) 4O9Y1 YOLIVHINGD JLISND SPOLETE  0FSEOTDVS DN AHIAS ONEIVLS SNANI s3|qehed coOX09  QO0X09 D06TSBT 600 9
[d-¥4 Jjaq padiewp awn ayl o} PIIER) S35 - H0qeT J01Ienuo) {SO1) YOBYT YOLIVULNGD JLSND T6TSTZE  D6L50ZDVS dNOYS LNYAIND s3|qeAed cOOX09  00X09 0061987 6007 9
60C j2q padsewp awn ay) 0] pajejas 533§ - 104 J01IeNU0) {SCT) HO8Y HOLDVUINOD ILISND 66L0TZE  9TFSOZOVS dnOYs LNvams sajgeded  QOOX09  CJOCX09 OOGISBY 600 9
30 Jjaq padseyr awr 3l 0] pale(ds sad - JOGE] JOLIenuo) {SO7) HOSY HOLDVULNOD JLISND ZEZVOLE  BIRPOZOVS dNOY¥SD LNYAIND sdlgeAed  QOOX09  QOCX09 OD6TYRT 6002 9
£9°0 Jj2q paidieyd awn 3yl 01 pAleI $334 - 10GE JO1IENUO) SO} YOV HOLOWHELINDD 3LISND SOTL6TE  T9SEQZOVS dnNOYS ENYAING saygeAed  QOOX0S  QOCX09 006TSRT 600 9
00'SPOTT i sHUasu| aley [S47) HOAW1 HOLDVYHLINGD 105440 96£90ZE 9BIEQT NI SLINIHdHIJYVH samqeAed  (QOOX05  CGBIEC9 QO6TSET 6007 9
[y} {S01) W09V HOLDVELNOD JLISND STOZ6TE  BSOEOZOVS DN AY3S ONIJIYLS SNANI sajgeAes  QOOXOD  QOOX09 006TSRT 6007 &
YT'60E .L{S07) HOBYT YOLOWHLNOD ILISNO €8Z8L1E  ¥LOTOZOVS NI AH3S ONIJSYLS SNANI sajqeded  QOOX09  GOOX09 DOGT9BT 600 S
00'69L'LT Su|reay a1 ase]) B3ey JO INON [S47) OOV HOLDYHINGD 1115440 SL506TE  06VEDT NI SINI¥dHIdUVH sa|qeded  ADOX09  COOXO9 OOATIRT 6007 &
00'tST'Y 3ueay ase) aiey 3o adioN {S47) HOEYT YOLIVYHINQD 3115430 vR906TE 6TVEQT JNI SINIHJHAdHYH sajqeAed  QOOXD9  QOOX09 QUGTIBT 600Z S
85T 3jaq padseys unl 3yl 01 pAIEJAI $334 - JOGE] JOPIRAUD) {507 4OUYT HOLIVHLNQD ILISND SZieeit  090£07OVS dNOYD INVAIND s3|qeAed  QOOX09  GOOXD9 GOGT9BT 600T S
9g's Jj3q padseyd 3w 3yl 01 pAleR1 $934 - JOGET JOLIENU0D - (SOT) YOIYT HOLOVHLNQD ALISNO £9€8/TE  SLOTOZOVS 4NOHYD INVAIND sa|qeAed  QOOXD9  COOX0J OOGTIBT 600Z S
08y 2diy a32nosar 4w Jumsn 01 ang - Suluaping {27} dHOD QY01 STIW Nag¥na spafold  QOOX09  ODOXBG OO06T9RT 6002 P
ZTT9 adAa aninosat WA Buisn 01 ang - Suluaping {D1) dy0d 001 S11UA N3a¥NE spafod  Q00X09  OOOXO% OOSTYBT 600Z b
28°0kT 2dAy 30snosar WdW Buisn a1 anp - Buuaping - {21} 90D avOT S1LN N3gHng spafesd  QO0X09  00OX09 QOETI8T 600Z ¥
90'6T% adAy a2snosas 4N Juisn 01 anp - Buluaping {21} d¥0D avO1 S1LN NIgyNg spafodd  QOOX09  ADOXO0S O06T98T 6007 ¢
64'%52 adAy 22:nosar 4N Butsn 01 anp - Suiuaping {37} YD) EVOT S1LA N3aYNE spafold  QOOX09  AOOX0S 006T98Y 6007 ¢
ab't8e (W) STYINILYIN Q3SYHOYNd TYBELTE BITOL INLAQIIAS HIS sajgeded  QOOX09  QOOXWBG O06T98T &00T ¥
ESTTE {d) STvIYILYIN ISYHIHNd SROSLTE  S8Z0L DNIAQIIAS HIS ss|qeAed  QOOX03  ODOX0S OO6TIST 6007
({1213 (W) SIVINILYIN QISYHDOUNd £595LTE VBTODL NI AQ33dS YIS sa|qeAed  Q0OX09  ODOXO9 OO6TSBT 6007
TE'6ZE (AW SIVIHILYIN QISYHDUND TLZOSLTE €820 ONI AQ33dS YIS s3jgeded  QOOX09  QOOX09 OOGTIRT 600Z ¢
59 (W) STYINILYIN QISYHIYNG L5E9LTE  ZBZOL DNI AQ33dS YIS sa|qeAed  QOOX09  OOOX09 CO6T98T 6007 ¢
[ETHT [WJW) SIVIYILYIN QISVYHDUN L6VSLTIE TBIOL JNI AQ33dS HIS sa|qeAed  QOOX0S  COOX09 CUST9SY 6002
SL°98F [NdW) STVIYILYIN QISYHOHNd Y6T9LTE 08Z0L JNIAQIIdS HIS s30eABg  (JO0X09  QOOX09 COSTYBT 6002
0E0ST {WdW) SIVINILYIN 0ASYHDUNd 6LT9LTE BLZ0L ONI AQ3345 YIS sa|qeAed  QOOX0S  QOOX0J DOATIBT 6007 ¢
SP6E {WJW) STYIHILYIN GISYHDOUND 99GGLTE BLZ0L JNI AG3I3JS HIS sajgeAed  (OOX09  GOOXO9 OORT9BT 6007 +
6E'STT {INdW) STZIMILYIA GISYHOHNA 989SLTE  £LZ04 NI AQ334S YIS sa|qeABd  QDOX09  COOX0Y-006198T 6007 v
£5°6be {NdIN) STYINILYIA QISYHOUNd £80SLTE 94704 JNI AQ33dS HIS sa|geded  QOOXO9  OOOXO9 GOGTORT 6007 ¥

unolwy {apoa) uondyuasaq ¢ (9aa yseL {apod) dudsaq 7 \a1 adAL 2unosay  saquing J3quIny awey sayddng wayshs asinog nf afieyd Agadseyd|junody  ueap yiuow
uonIesuesy JBYINOA amoau]

TTZYP00T $3{01d 58] 31eY Jo sishjeuy

TWILNZOIHNDD




PLEASE REMIT TO:

CARLTON FIELDS 70, tox 5239

FED. 10 S Tampa, FL 336013239
ATTORNEYS AT LAW £12.223.7000
Fox 813.229.4133

One Aflantic Canter

1201 W. Peschires 5L, Sie. 3000 P.O. Box 017101 P.D. Bax 1171 P.O. Bax 2861 P.O, Drawer 190 P.O. Box 150
Alkesnig, Guorgio 30309 Miomi, FL 33131 Drlando, FL 32802 St, Patarsburg, FL 33731 Tallchasee, FL 32302 Wt Palm Buoch, FL 33402
404.815.3400 305.530.0050 407 .849.0300 727.821.7000 850.224.1585 561.65%.2070
Fax 404.815.3415 fax 305.530.0055 Fax 4076489099 Fax 727.822.3768 Fax 850.222.0378 Fax 541.459.7248
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 92, 2009
PO BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. 00302-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 542852

DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT

RE: 2009 RATE CASE

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVICUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

BATANCE FORWARD

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 04/09/09 =

COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 04/09/09

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL LY

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE \

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BALANCE OUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-90 91-120 OVER 120 TOTAL

® L

**% REMITTANCE COPY ***

APE a S
PR
ELE"T:'\.
Payment is due upon receipl. interest will be charged on unpaid invoices oged 35 days or more from invoi%-e J;‘Ige-}‘ fra

ARy
Services designated with an {*) were performed vnder the strict supervision of odmitied aliomeys by persons not u&gmmmﬂmoﬂing jurisdiction.




CARLTON FIELDS

D, 1t J
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542852 PAGE 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH APRIL 5, 2009

Task L120

03/02/09

o3/02/09

03/05/09

03/06/09

03/06/09

03/16/09

03/19/09

03/23/09

03/25/09

-

DMT

DMT

JMW

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

ANALYSTS/STRATEGY - 2

PHASE, L10: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN @C&O

DISCUSS QY .30
WITH JOHN BURNERTT.

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE (EESEENESNERENY .40
L/

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

CALLS WITH
CLIENT REGARDING' REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
4N CREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME

ATTEND RATE CASE STATUS CALL RE (NN .80
(0.3); ATTEND RATE CASE CALL RE uuummny
- (0.5) .

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING .20

RN, REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING G
CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING Gaillp

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GGRRENN 1.10
RN ©INAL REVIEW OF PETITION FOR
PENSICON ACCOUNTING CHANGES; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS
AND SEND TO
CLIENT TEAM SV '

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SN .20
]

DISCUSS MOTION TO CONSOLIDATE AND DISCGOGVERY .60
ISSUES WITH KATHERINE FLEMING AT STAFF (0.4);

DISCUSS ADDITIONAL COPIES WITH CHARLES

REHWINKEL (0.2).

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GEEEENNEPIITH JOHN 1.00
BURNETT (0.2); FOLLOW UP WITH KATHERINE FLEMING

RE MOTION TO CONSOLIDATE AND ADVISE CLIENT OF

SAME (0.1); FOLLOW UP WITH MARCIA OLIVIER RE

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Alonte » Miomi » Otando « 5t Petersburg = Tuﬂahu;see * Tampa * WARR %LAEEQ%QDW-‘IG[}-DUOUGG

L Bamniear doatimenterd with e 17 ccmrs cadermed tndar tha thrict sremandcinn ff admitted atteeneore b mereane cakb ndmitedd b ccmeticn e e the mm et o Goeladioato o




CARLTON FIELDS

reo. o NP
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 92, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 003085-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542852 PAGE 2

GRS (©.1) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

e — o~ T —— oy v GEP
BERNIER (0.2); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS AND STRATEGY 02

RE oEASaSMENARS (0 .3); FOLLOW UP WITH LISA ?‘ES‘J"
STRIGHT RE GEENENNENE (0.1) .

03/26/09 DMT DISCUSS MOTION TO CONSOLIDATE WITH KATHERINE .60
: FLEMING AND QNN 170 CLIENT TEAM RE

03/26/09 JMW CALL WITH BURNETT REGARDING (NN .40
cant wiTH FPL NN FoLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW TRIPLETT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING Gy
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDINC GNP (.2)

03/30/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF G 2.20
NN (0.5) ; DISCuss
SAME WITH KATHERINE FLEMING (0.3) AND JOHN
BURNETT (0.3); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF D
o e

FOLLOW UP WITH BERNIER RE ik

03/30/09 JMW CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING NN .60
Ry FOLIOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME, REVIEW VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING SAME, STRATEGY (.3); FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, STRATEGY, PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING Gl (.3)

04/01/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF PRIOR EMAILS AND MEMOS .30
RE (e
[T ————

04/02/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF aamEREnmEinn .20
T e e e

04/03/09 DMT ATTEND CALI, WITH CLIENT TEAM RE G .50
R

04/06/09 SS* REVIEW DOCUMENTS (N .30

Subtotal for Task L1120 : 11.20

Task L1950 : OTHBER CASE ASSES, DEVEL. & ADMIN

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflonta * Miami * Odondo = 5t Petersburg = Tollohosses = Tompa = PRV A BEERD16-100-000087
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CARLTON FIELDS

Feo-© Q- ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 3

03/12/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GEREENNED 2.00

PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME,
ISSUES FOR PEF RATE CASE

03/13/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF Gy 1.50
SRS CREPARE NOTES REGARDING GBSNEED
RN, PREPARE SUMMARY OF
L

03/18/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE .80
GIAREEENEEERE CREPARE RESPONSE
TO CLIENTS (.6); CALL WITH PAUL LEWIS REGARDING
e (. 1) ; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HOLDSTEIN
REGARDING wummlp (.1)

03/18/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS CLIENT .50

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING <N

- ___ __}

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GREENNENEER PRIVILEGED

03/18/05 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GNESSRENAENNED> 2.80
e ————————————————

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING
G REVIEW CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING QP FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING GMiEERNE
A (2 . G) ; REVIEW

CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE GERNGNN
PREPARE RESPONSE REGARDING dummih {.2)

03/24/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE 2.20
<G

PREPARE RESPONSE (.4); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE (NN
L ————————————

RN  CREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING (IR (. .5) ;
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SNEEEEtnEn

SENE», PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME, STATUS; FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SBME (.7); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

—
'
1
—

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflanta * Miami * Ortlande * St Petersburg « Talichassee = Tompa « %ﬂ§@91&10&0m
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CARLTON FIELDS

ED. 1D

i - ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 4

03/25/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (NN 2.00

OEENENEEEEEp. CREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME
03/26/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (NN 3.00

ORI PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME

03/27/09 JMW  REVIEW (>
SRR PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING (il (1.0); -
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS COF G
G (1.5

$4/01/0% JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF G 2.00
e e
Subtotal for Task L1990 - 20.30
Task L320 : DOCUMENT PRODUCTION

03/17/09 S8* TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH PARALEGALS REGARDING .30

Subtotal for Task L320

-30
Task L2440 : OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPPORT

03/24/09 MRB CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING @R 1.50
_

Subtotal for Task L440 : 1.50

PHASE LZ20: PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS

Task L110 : FACT INVESTIGATION/DEVELOPMENT

03/04/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE .20
. AND POLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING QEERNED

AR PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT
REGARDING SN

03/09/0% JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GmiENENEE .30
L 4

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflania *» Miomi * Or'lundo . Sl' Peiersburg . Tc:ﬂuhussee » Tampa = wRP?SFAEFéuP(?.D1S-1GD-Dom&9
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FPROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 92, 20009

2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 5

Task L120

02/04/09

03/05/09

03/06/09

03/11/09

03/12/09.

- 03/13/09

03/16/09

03/20/0%9

-
-

JMW

JMW

JMW

Subitotal for Task L1110

ANALYSIS/STRATEGY

REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
Ay CALL WITH
BURNETT REGARDING §llllp FREPARE CORRESPONDENCE
TO CLIENTS REGARDING (NGRS R EVIEW
CLIENT AND MELSON RESPONSES, FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING

REVIEW DOCUMENT MANAGEMENT ISSUES WITH TRIPLETT

FOLLOWING TRAINING SESSION, REVIEW STATUS OF
WITNESS TESTIMONY AND EXHIBITS, FOLLOW UP
ISSUES RECGARDING SAME AND PETITIONS

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL
REGARDING NN FOLIOW UP WITH

TRIPLETT REGARDING iR
s e

CALL WITH BURNETT REGARDING GNGE:
e 4

REVIEW LEWIS CORRESPONDENCE, REVIEW GENND
GNP PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO LEWIS
REGARDING @il (. 2) ; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CROSS
REGARDING MNP REVIEW SAME, PREPARE
RESPONSE (.3)

REVIEW ISSUES (MSIRinsny
R

ITH TRIPLETT,
VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENTS REGARDING
AR (- 2)
ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENTS AND MELSON,
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (.5}

N T SSUES WITH TRIPLETT,
ORGANIZATION OF SAME; REVIEW CLIENT LETTER
REGARDING Gy PREPARE RESPONSE TO TRIPLETT,
REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING anummiy

REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
M

R
PREPARE RESPONSES

CARILTON FIELDS, PA.

-60

.20

.60

.20

.50

.70

.50

.30

DIRP-STAFFPOD16-100-000030
Atlanta + Miomi = Orlando = St Petersburg = Tofiohosses « Tompa * ‘Weast Palm Beach

.50
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2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER E£E42832 PAGE &

03/23/09

03/25/09

03/27/09

03/27/09

oa/02/09

Task L190

03/19/09

03/27/09

03/31/09

JMW

JMW

DMT

JMW

JMW

JMW

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO TRIPLETT
REGARDING AN

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF NN
S FOLLOW
UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SRR
CENEMEENEEEY PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
CLIENT REGARDING

FOLLOW UP WITH KATHERINE FLEMING RE MEETING FCR
MOTION TO CONSOLIDATE.

ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENTS AND FPL ON
S

REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT AND TRIPLETT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING GEENENEE
GBMRENMMEE PREPARE RESPONSE

Subtotal for Task L120

OTHER CASE ASSES, DEVEL. & ADMIN

REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

AN DREDARE SOME
RESPONSES

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT GENEED
Gy CALLS WITH BURNETT AND TRIPLETT
RECARDING GWEEy CALLS FROM STAFF COUNSEL,
AR ( 2) ; REVIEW FINAL ORDER OF PROCEDURE,
REVIEW STAFF CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING MEETING,
FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT REGARDING aamml (.3)

REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING Ummid
I, FOLIOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING

SAME; REVIEW UNuGSeSRR® CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING SAME

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

.10

.20

.20

.10

.50

.70

.10

09RP-5 00-0
Atflonma » Migmi * Orionds ¢ St Petesburg » Tal!uhcsseﬂ * Tampa « WestP ‘:'IFBFEQ£ SIS
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CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 7
03/31/09 JMW CALL WITH BEN CRISP REGARDING (RN
g PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME
- 04/01/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
AND QNP PREPARE RESPONSE REGARDING
SAME (.2); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE S
RN (- 5)
04/02/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (e
' e e
Subtotal for Task L1390
Task L2190 + PLEADINGS
03/02/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALY515=
. .
03/03/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (NN
C - ]
- Y
" 03/03/0% JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
03/04/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ,
: CLIENT CORRESPCNDENCE REGARDING
ADJUSTMENTS WITH TRIPLETT
03/05/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF HOLDSTEIN CORRESPONDENCE
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO HOLDSTEIN AND SLUSSER
REGARDING
03/06/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
FOLLOW UP WIiTH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, REVISE
SAME
03/08/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS CLIENT

CORRESPONDENCE
, DRAFT AND
REVISE SAME, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Aflonio » Miami » Orando * St Petersburg » Tollshossee = Tompo

.20

.70

7.50

7.40

.16

.20

.20

« VSR STAEEoD e 000000s2
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2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 003059-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542832 PAGE 8

03/09/09

03/10/09

63/13/09

03/13/09

03/16/09

03/17/09

03/18/09

o3/18/09

bMT

DMT

oMT

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

REGARDING GENNINERENEREY: REVIEW CLIENT

CORRESPONDENCE .
] PREPARE RESPONSES (NN

ey FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE TO TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME, ISSUES

ATTEND CONFERENCE CALIL WITH BURNETT, CROSS, AND 1.20
PORTUCNDO REGARDING!

FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
SAME, ISSUES (1.0); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE

REGARDINGHNIBMENENANNEE FPREPARE RESPONSE
(.2}

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF Aiiiimmumesesvin. 1.00
WSS, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING

AR S OLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME; REVIEW CLIENT AND
TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE

ARSI PREPARE RESPONSE TO CLIENT

ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM RE (IR .60
anh

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS. OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE 1.50

SEEmmPw® CALI. TO CROSS REGARDING
NNy REVIEW REVISED

i

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING .40

REVIEW CLIENT RESPONSES; CALL WITH CROSS

REGARDING N REVIEW RESPONSES,

FOLLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME

DRAFT MOTION TO CONSOLIDATE PROCEEDINGS. .20

FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAM RE QRSN 1.10

|l

REVIEW VARIQUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING .20
R FOLLOW UP REGARDING SAME;

'CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENTS REGARDING ~

(-2)

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Aflantg » Miami = Oﬁcmdo » St Pelersburg = Tuﬂuhas.see s Tompa » SQRF'PSJ AEI;Q&D‘!S—‘IBO—OMOS:;
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CARLTON FIELDS

#e0, 10 D

) ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 003095-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 9
03/19/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF i .60
R
03/25/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND .20
SRR
U PREPARE RESPONSE TO CLIENTS,
REVIEW CLIENT RESPONSE AND RESPOND TO GENENEN
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING NN
SN REVIEW TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING Sk
03/27/0% JMW CALLS WITH CLIENT REGARDING G .10
GNP REVIEW AND REVISE SN
-_——
Subtotal for Task L210 : 26.70
Task L230 : COURT MANDATED CONFERENCES

03/30/09 JMW  REVIEW QU 1.00
R

03/31/09 JMW  REVIEW G

04/01/09 JMW DRAFT AND REVISE SmEmiuiys 2.50
GRS, PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO TRIPLETT AND BERNIER

REGARDING GMMESSEEENNENp REVIEW RESPONSES

04/02/09 JMW PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TC CLIENT REGARDING .20
SRR,  REVIEW
RESPONSES; FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING

04/03/09 JMW CORRESPONDENCE WITH RICK MELSON - 1.00

TN D  ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL
WITH CLIENTS AND TRIPLETT REGARDING <,
SRS, FOLIOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME

Subtotal for Task L230 7.70

"

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Alanta = Miami « Orlondo St Petersburg = Tc!iu!'\u;see « Tompo * e§§§#m01&1mmg4
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CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 10
. Task L250 : OTH WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSION
03/06/09 JMW REVIEW PREHEARING ORDER ON 60-DAY NOTICE RULE .10
WAIVER PETITION
03/11/0% JIMW REVIEY e .10
gl FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT AND OLIVIER
REGARDING R
03/12/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF STAFF COUNSEL .10
CORRESPONDENCE AND PROPGSED SCHEDULE FOR RATE
CASES AND CLAUSE PROCEEDINGS
03/16/09 MRE DRAFTING CONFIDENTIALITY REQUEST; JUSTIFICATION 3.00
MATRIX COVERING INFORMATION PROVIDED BY PEF
CONCERNING unaanenmnnaliinanins
03/17/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF walanminmmiipesine 2.00
_ , DRAFT AND REVISE
EsEEaEReEeeey, REVIEW
CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENTS REGARDING gullp,
REVIEW CLIENT COMMENTS SN
03/18/09 MRB LEGAL RESEARCH ON Gauyniisssnset 2.70
- Y
03/27/0% MRB REVIEW OF REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION TO DRAFT 2.10
OBJECTIONS
04/01/09 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS ORDERS ON INTERVENTION .10
04/01/09 MRB DRAFTING OBJECTIONS TO OPC'S FIRST ROG (1-52); 4_80
REVIEW OF Sl
04/02/02 MRB DRAFTING OBJECTION TO STAFF'S FIRST POD (1-6); 5.40
CONFERENCE CALL ON (g
RESEARCH (e i
__04/03/09 JM

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF= 3.50
» PREPARE

NOTES REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENTS
aNp TRIPLETT REGARDING @l}; PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT AND TRIPLETT REGARDING

. CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflania * Miomi * Orando * 51 Petersburg = Tuﬂuhz:;see » Tompa * gggfﬁgggggmmmoﬂuss
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CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVCICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 11

"Task L350

03/30/09

Té.sk L4110

03/01/09

p3/02/09

03/02/09

03/02/09

03/02/09

03/03/0%

Subtotal for Task L250

: 23.90
: DISCOVERY MOTIONS
MRE DRAFTED PEF'S OBJECTION TO OPC'S FIRST, SECOND 6.70
AND THIRD REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION
Subtotal for Task L350 : 6.70
: FACT WITNESSES
JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS 1.50
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
JMW 2.50
}(.2) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS
JMW  REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 1.70
WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
{(1.2});
REVIEW. CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING <l
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
m( 5)
JMW  CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING .20
FOLLOW UP WITH
JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OFH 2.50
- PARE NOTES REGARDING
- FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING,
DMT ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH 1.10
Ay ==
CARLTON FIELDS, PA. 09RP-STAFEPOD16-100-000096
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PR CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. QO0309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542852 PAGE 12

. 03/03/09 JMW PARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL 1.50
i ' FOLLOW UP WITH BURNETT

AND ‘TRIPLETT REGARDING

03/03/05 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE JNENEENYy 2.00
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE

TO . CROSS REGARDING
VIEW CORRESPONDENCE JnENRRRNy
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE .TO CROSS

(1.0); REVIEW

03/03/02 JIMW 4.40
REGARDING' -
FOLLOW UP, IEW TRIPLETT C
CLIENT REGARDING (.4);
CALLS WITH BEURIS AND CALL WITH CROSS REGARDING
ﬁz' ARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS
' (1.2}; REVIEW VARIOUS
CLIENT (CORRESPONDENCE REGARDIN
PREPARE RESPONSES, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING (1.0);
CALLS WITH BEURIS AND BURNETT
_— - By FOLLOW UP CALL
WITH BEURIS REGARDING (.5)
03/04/09 DMT VIEW AND ANALYSIS 8.40
03/04/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS 4.60
CARLTON FIELDS, PA. 09RP-STAFFPOD16-100-000097

Aﬂanm - Mfama D Or!ando - 5! Pele!sburg a Tc‘fahcxssee . Tcmpu Wes! Puhn Bec:c
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CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 13
r
CALL WITH
PORTUONDO REGARDING REVIEW CLIENT AND
MELSON CORRESPONDENC ARDING ARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING
.03/05/0% DMT IEW AND ANALYSIS
03/05/09 DMT DIscuss SR W1 TH BECKY HIRTE.
03/05/09 JMW  REVIEW
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING
PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME (2.0); REVIEW
CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
CORRESPOND WITH
CLIENTS REGARDING {.5)
. 03/05/09 JMW  REVIEW. A ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
""" I REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
R PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS
REGARDING
03/06709 DMT REVIEW aND ANALYSIS JJENEGGGEGEGEG™
T e e e e T
y =
03/06/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
{0.6) umnE—
N (0.2) .
03/06/09 JMW REVIEW CLIENT COMMENTS ON

AR
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO LYNCH REGARDING S,
REVIEW JINENNAY PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE
TO LYNCH REGARDING
REVIEW RESPONSES, FOLLOW UP REGARDING SAME

(.4) ; REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND
PREPARE NOTES

REGARDING SAME (.2); CALLS WITH BEURIS
REGARDING ,

(.2); REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
<N FOLIOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING

.70

.B0O

.50

.00

.60

.80

.50

CARLTON FIELDS, PA. 09RP-STAFFPOD16-100-000093

Atlanta = Miami * Ordando = St Petersburg » Tollchosses * Tompo = West Polm Beoch
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ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 14
SAME {.2); REVIEW VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE AND
VIEW
VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE !
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT'REGARDING
SAME, REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE (.4)
03/06/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE 1.70
- REVIEW
CLIENT DOCUMENTS ON
"PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
CLIENTS REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE
WITH CLIENTS REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING
.03/06/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND 2.00

03/07/09 DMT 1.20
03/07/09 JMW 1.00
. ¢3/08/09 JMW 2.00
ARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS
- 03/09/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF — 8.30
03/09/09 DMT ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH NS 1.80
- AN TE7M

CARITON FIELDS, PA.
Alonia * Miami * Odando * 5t Petersburg = Tuliuhussee * Tampa * VIERFSIASTRRD16-100-000099
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CARLTON FIELDS

teo. o R
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 15
- 03/09/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE 6.30

FROM CLIENTS, MELSOM, AND TRIPLETT REGARDING

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS

SPONDENCE TO CLIENTS AND ATTORNEYS

REGARDING FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING

03/10/09 omr  Review awp anarysis or (GGG 7.70
03/10/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SN 2.30

WITH WITNESS TEAM.

. 03/10/09 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND MEET WITH 1.00
' TRIPLETT REGARDING

02/10/09 JMW

03/11/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS oF WNEGEGGENGGGE

R

03/11/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF 8.60
-CALL, TO BEURIS REGARDING
, (1.2} ;

ANALYSTS M FOLLOW UP
CORRESPONDENCE AND DISCUSSIONS WITH CLIENTS AND

TRIPLETT REGARDING (3.3);
REVIEW AND ANALY OF NOTES

REGARDING SAME,
CORRESPONDENCE WITH 4 REGARDING
. REVIEW RESPONSES (3.3); CALL WITH
MARCIA OLIVIER REGARDING

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Adanig = Miam: . Orkmda - 5. Pe‘l&rsburg - Tal!uhussee * Tompa "9@‘1?? Eﬁﬁmgimtm
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CARLTON FIELDS

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING r

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 16
{.3); REVIEW
CORRESPONDENCE WITH LYNCH REGARDING —
(.5}
03/12/09 DMT WOF P 8.80
03/12/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF 3.20
- PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE
TO TRIPLETT AND CLIENTS REGARDING FOLLOW
UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING 2.5 CALLS
WITH GLENN AND WHITE REGARD
_ (.3); CALL WITH CROSS
' GARRETT REGARDING
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING (.4)
03/13/0% DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF 3.90
FOLLOW UP
WITH MARCIA OLIVIER RE
03/16/09 DMT  pIscuss YNEEEENENNENEY :1cNE .60
TIBBETTS, LORI CROSS, AND JOHN BURNETT.
03/23/09 JMW  CALL WITH RIB REGARDING .10
03/25/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS .70
ITH LYNCH AND RIB REGARDING
RIB REGARDING
- 03/26/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIQUS CORRESPONDENCE .10
FROM RIB, CRISP, AND LYNCH REGARDING
Subtotal for Task L410 : 124.30
- Task L420 = EXPERT WITNESSES
03/01/09 JMW REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIOUS CLIENT .40

Aﬁanru * Migmi » Orlundo . S! Pe!ersburg - To!lahussee * Tompo ~ Westh}FFfocns'Tmm"
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. . QI

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 5428952 PAGE 17

-03/01/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF BEURIS CORRESPONDENCE

3.20
03/02/09 JMW 1.30
. 03/02/09 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND COMMENTS ON 3.50

PREPARE

BW(1.0); REVIEW CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE AND PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND

CONFE CE CALYL, WITH BEURIS
PREPARE
BS REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP CALLS WITH
Beurts recaroING (Y
{2.5) ‘ : T

03/02/0% JMW PREPARE .70
: ENCE TO G

ISSUES; PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS

REGARDING !lll'

03/03/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANMALYSIS CLIENT AND EXPERT

1.8¢0
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
CALL TO BEURIS REGARDING {.3); REVIEW AND
ANBALYSIS OF
1.5
03/03/09 JMW REVIEW. .20
: . PREP CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS
REGARDING ] {(.2);
03/04/09 MW REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CLIENT CORRESPCNDENCE .30

. 03/04/09 JMW REVIEW BEURIS CORRESPONDENCE ' 2.20
REPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING

REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
At&'mitl . Mvarm . Odnn&a . Sf Pe!ersbmg o Tallubassee * Tompo » Q%P#TFFQZQQ.‘&‘W1QZ
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ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 9, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 18
PREPARE RESPONSES;
VARIOUS CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH BEURIS
AND OTHERS REGARDING
03/04/09 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING NN

. a [rey . T

CARLTON FIELDS

JEEY CALL TO CLIENT REGARDING SAME

03/05/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
CALL WITH CINDY LEE REGARDING
03/05/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
03/05/09 Jww  rEview anp anaLysis ARG
03/06/09 JMW CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENTS AND DEPRECIATION
EXPERT
1 03/09/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF_
W F CLIENTS REGARDINC
€0 ITE CLIENTS REGARDING
03/10/09 JMW NAL REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
03/10/65 JMW iii“s WITH EARL ROBINSON REGARDING /NGTINERY
03/12/09 IVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
- AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH
ROBINSCON RE
Subtotal for Task L420 :
Task L430 : WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSIONS

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

10

.60

.80

.20

.10

.50

.00

.50

.00

21.
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ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA APRIL 2, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF, NO. 00305-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 19

03/16/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF q
| AND FOLLOW UP WITH GREG BEURIS RE .

.30
' 03/17/09 DMT FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAM AND COPY CENTER RE 1.30
' piscuss JANp
ETTS.
03/18/09 DMT DRAFT MOTION TO CONSOLIDATE VARIOUS RATE RELIEF 5.30

REQUESTS INTO INTERIM PROCEEDING;
WITH BERNIER RE

FOLLOW UP

03/18/09 JMW  REVIEW. AND ANALYSIS OFP .20
W TRIPLETT

- 03/19/09 DMT DRAFT MOTION TO CONSOLIDATE. 90

02/20/09 JMW REVIEW DRAFT MOTION TO CONSOLIDATE FROM 2.00
. TRIPLETT, DRAFT AND REVISE SAME, PREPARE

CORRESPONDENCE TO TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME,

REVIEW RESPONSE, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO

CLIENTS REGARDING WP REVIEW AND RESPOND TO

CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

03/23/09 JMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH .30
BURNETT AND LEWIS REGARDING
PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME;
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, REVIEW
AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
%, PREPARE RESPONSE; REVIEW TRIPLETT
CORRESPONDENCE AND FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT

REGARD INGu i

03/25/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF OPC NOTICES TO INTERVENE .10
IN FPEF'S PETITIONS FOR 2009 RELIEF, REVIEW AND
PREFARE MOTION TO CONSOLIDATE AND EXHIBITS

'03/30/09 DMT  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF il .40

Subtotal for Task L430 : 10.80

Task L440

OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPPORT

03/02/09 MRB  LEGAL RESEARCH

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aﬂﬂl\tt.l « Miomi * Orlande * St Pelersburg * Tcﬂchu;see = Tompa -%gﬂﬁ‘:ﬁgﬂs‘mmw‘*
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03/03/09 MRE  CONCLUDED RESEARCH

LEGAL RESEARCH i}

. 03/06/09 MRB

CONTINUED 2.40
RESEARCH
03/31/09 MRB EGAL RESEARCH ¥

6.90
(2.0);
(1-3) (1.1);
Subtotal for Task L440 : 24 .30
PHASE L30: DISCOVERY
Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY
03/23/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE .20
REGARDING .
q PREPARE RESPONSE, FOLLOW UP
WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING -
04/01/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS CLIENT AND .10
TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
: AR FoL10W UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARD AME
Subtotal for Task L120 H .30
Task L145 + DOCUMENT DATABASE
04/03/09 85+* D SEVERAL CALLS 1.20

CARITON FIELDS, PA.

Adlante * Miomi » Orlondo * St Pefersburg * Tolichossee = Tampa * &&ﬁl&m&1&100—03&0105
B trimn, e ieemrtae] with me I wmrn marnrmad sedar tha sirick ginandrian ~f ndmitad At ke naremee net s e reetiee bees in tha cmntenline Lscdicrfinn
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Subtotal foxr Tasgk L1145 : 1.20
Task L310 : WRITTEN DISCOVERY
03/02/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND FOR CONFERENCE CALIL RE .60

03/05/0% DMT  ATTEND MEETING IN ST PETE RE A 3.30

03/23/09% DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF _ .60
(0.5) —
“(0.1). :
03/23/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF 1.10

'03/24/09 DMT ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL RE (NGRS 1.50
03/24/0% DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF 1.30
LLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAM RE
03/25/03 DMT .30
03/26/09 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT AND TRIPLETT .20
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING ;
CALL
03/27/09 JMW  REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIOUS TRIPLETT AND .10

CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

03/30/09 DMT m .90
‘ - {(D.8); DISCUSS SRARME WITH SANDY COPE

(0.1), ARLENE TIBBETTS (0.1); LISA STRIGHT
(0.1).

¢3/30/02 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATT
CUSTOMER

CALL WITH 2.80

. §(0.8); DISCUSS AND RESPOND TO
ILS RE VARIOUS

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflonla * Miomi « erl:ndo + 5% Petersbumg * Talluhussee + Tampn 095‘; ;ﬁFqu‘fﬁ-iﬂﬂ-ﬁﬂﬂﬂtﬂﬁ
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2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
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AND RESPONSES WITH LISA STRIGHT, LORI CROSS,
AND CONNIE ALLISON {(31.3); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS
R

ITH KAREN
WATESKA (0.3); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
OVEIEERERER T T JOHN BURNETT (0.2) AND

RAYMOND PHILLIPS (0.2).

- 03/30/09 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT AND TRIPLETT
' CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

PREPARE RESPONSE; CALLS WITH CLIENT

.80

REGARDING*
.3} ; FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING-

REVIEW TRIPLETT AND
CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE GARDING

WITH RIB REGARDING CALL WITH BURNETT AND

TRIPLETT REGARDING {(.5)

03./'3 1/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS TO DETERMINE
CONFIDENTIALITY (0.4); FOLLOW UP WITH LORI
CROS5 AND KATHERINE FLEMING RE CONFIDENTIALITY

REQUEST (0.4); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
CORRESPONDENCE RE

3.60

TEW AND ANALYSIS OF
WITH LISA STRIGHT RE

{0.3); DRAFT

AND FOLLOW UP
REVIEW AND

ANALYSIS OF WITH

CLIENT TEAM

03/31/09 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND EXPERT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
SAME; - REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
OLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW VARIQUS CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
REVIEW SAME, OW UP WITH
GARDING SAME, ISSUES (.2);

03/31/09 MW cALL WrTH EarL roRInson recarpinG {NGEGNGY

, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING
SAME,  PREFARE CORRESPONDENCE TO TRIPLETT,
BERNIER AND CLIENT REGARDING

.30

.30

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

e o il © Drlundo - S Pelersburg . r.;,uuhuss% . Tampu ?ﬁes,’J’}FFPOTHmmmT
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-INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 23

- 04/01/09 DMT DISCUSS ISSUES RE WITH .70

MARCIA OLIVIER (0.2), LISA STRIGHT (0.2) AND
BART WHITE (0.3).

' 04/02/09 DMT 2.40
ITH CLIENT TEAMS RE
‘pa/02/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND 2.10
. 04/02/09 JMW  REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING .40
s CALL WITH CINDY
"REG G
REVIEW STAFF INTERROGATORIES OLLOW UP WITH
IPLETT REGARDING
04/03/09 DMT 1.70
FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE FOLLOW ©Pp
WITH JOHN BURNETT R.E- (0.2).
04/03/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OFF 1.00
‘ -1 MASCEO DESCHAMPS AND TEAM.
g4/03/09 JMW CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT (LYNCH) AND TRIPLETT .20
REGARDING (e enege; OLLOW UP
WITH TRIPLETT AND CLIENT ON Gy
4D '
Subtotal for Task L310 : 26.20

Task L311

“

PLAINTIFFS' WRITTEN DISCOVERY

03/25/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF TRIPLETT CORRESPONLDIENCE .50
TO CLIENTS REGARDING ]

UP -WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING

AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND

' FOLI.OW UP WITH TRIPLETT
; G SAME {.2); REVIEW OPC INTERROGATORIES
AND NOTICE, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING

-1)

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Ao+ Miomi » Orande = St Petenshurg » Tallhossee = Tompn = West Polm
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INVOICE NUMBER 542892 PAGE 24
Subtotal for Task L311 : .50
Tagk ..320 : DOCUMENT PRODUCTION
. '03/18/09 §58* REVIEW CHART OF RATE CASE WITNESSES, STUDIES .30
T AND PRETITIONS
04/03/09 MRB REVIEWED_STAFF'S 1ST ROGS AND 2ND POD FOR 5.20
OBJECTIONS; DRAFTED PRIVILEGE LOG FOR RESPONSE
TO OPC'S POD 12; REVISED RESPONSE TO QPC ROG 7;
REVIEWED STAFF'S 2ND ROGS {3-11) AND 3RD POD
{8-11) FCOR OBJECTIONS ’
Subtotal for Task L320 H 5.50
' *Task L325 : ADMINISTRATIVE DOCUMENT PRODUCTION
03/19/09 55* TRAVEL TO AND FROM ST. PETERSBURG FOR MEETING 8.G0
AT SIR SPEEDY TO SORT AND BOX RATE CASE FILING,
PETITION, TESTIMONY AND MFR FOR RATE INCREASE
AND TWO OTHER PETITIONS
04/02/09 SS* ATTEND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT 2 .30
REGARDING
Subtotal for Task L325 H 10.30
'Task I.345 : DOCUMENT REVIEW (NON-ATTORNEY)
owroros s aevey oS T
Subtotal for Task L345 8 2.80
PHASE L40: TRIAIL PREPARATION AND TRIAL
Task L3320 : DOCUMENT PRODUCTION
vesres e S N
Subtotal for Task L320 : 4_80

Q9RP-STAFF PDEP 6-100-000010%
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. Task La40 : OTH TRIAL DREPARATION & SUPPORT
03/04/09 MRB  LEGAL RESEARCH 3.90
Subtotal for Task L440 3 3.90
TOTAL, FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES L
ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE
JMW  J. M. WALLS .50 hours at SR - L
Total Task Code L1180 : .50 .
JMW J. M. WALLS 8.50 hours at Sl -
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 8.40 hours at & G -
§8* S. SCHRAND* .30 hours at SUMNENER -
Total Task Code L120 : 17.20 B
§S*  S. SCHRAND* 1.20 hours at $ ¢gillllip - .
Total Task Code L145 : 1.20 B
JMW  J. M. WALLS 23.50 hours at $ (N - W
Total Task Code L190 : 23.50 e
JMW  J. M. WALLS 9.10 hours at SN - W,
- DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 17.60 hours at $lill® - A Y
Total Task Code L210 : 26.70 R 000 )
JMW  J. M. WALLS 7.70 hours at SR - A
Total Task Code L230 : 7.70 N
JMW J. M. WALLS 5.90 hours at =
MRE M. R. BERNIER 18.00 hours at $ =

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Adonta * Miami * Orlnndo . S! Petersburg - Toliuhassee + Tampa 99@9 MFFma-tmmmm
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Total Task Code L250  : 23.90 A
MW J. M. WALLS 2.30 hours at ¢ NS - =
- DMT . D. M. TRIPLETT 23.90 hours at $ (N -
Total Task Code L310 : 26.20 N
gMW  J. M. WALLS .50 hours at ¢\l - L
| Total Task Code L311 : .50 B
. MRB M. R. BERNIER 10.00 hours at S N -
© 8g*  S. SCHRAND* .60 hours at $ (JIEER -
Total Task Code L320 10.60 —
$g*  S. SCHRAND* 10.30 hours at $ (D - A
Total Task Code L325 : 10.30 -
§8* S. SCHRAND* 2.80 hours at ¢ (SR - o
Total Task Code L345 : 2.80 T A
MRB M. R. BERNIER 6.70 hours at $NGNGER- Sy
Total Task Code L350  : 6.70 ]
JMW J. M. WALLS 59.60 hours at $ -
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 64.70 hours at $ JED- |
Total Task Code L410 :  124.30 U
JMW J. M. WALLS 21.40 hours at $ NN R
Total Task Code L420  : 21.40 R 0
JMW  J. M. WALLS 2.60 hours at $ (- .
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 8.20 hours at S (S - a
Total Task Code L430  : 10.80 B

CARLTON FIEIDS, PA,

_ Atlania * Miomi * Orlondo * 5t Petersburg * Tollahassee * Tampo ~09RBAFEARRIOMI5-100-0000111
Se_zi'ices designoled with an {*} were performed under the strict supervision of admitted attornays by persons not odmitted to practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.
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MRB

Services desianated with an (¥} were parformad under the sirict supervision of odmitted aftorneys by persons nat admited to practice law in the zontrolling jurisdiction,

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

M. R. BERNIER 29.70 hours at a.E= e T
Total Task Code L440 : 29.70 T A
ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY
- DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 122 .80 hours at A -
. 88% S. SCHRAND* 15.20 hours at < - =
MW J. M. WALLS 141.60 hours at «iiiS - g
MRB M. R. BERNIER 64.40 hours at JENNG_— - —
' TOTALS 344 .00 A
COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED APRIL 9, 2009
Code E101  COPYING
- 03/0%/09 COPYING COST
03/10/09 COPYING COST
03/18/09 COPYING COST
03/26/09 COPYING COST
04/02/09 COPYING COST ,
04/02/0% COPYING COST ,
Total Code EIQL
Code E103  WORD PRCCESSING
03/12/09 DOCUMENT PRODUCTION
Total Code EL103 -
Code E105  TELEPHONE
02/14/09 TELEPHONE
02/20/09 TELEPHONE
03/03/09 TELEPHONE
03/12/0% TELEPHONE
03/12/09 TELEPHONE
03/23/09 TELEPHONE
03/27/09 TELEPHONE
03/31/09 TELEPHONE
04/01/09 TELEPHONE
04/02/09 TELEPHONE
Total Code E105
Code E107 DELIVERY SERVICES/MESSENGERS
03/11/02 MESSENGER CHARGES
03/12/09 EXPRESS MAIL
03/18/09 EXPRESS MAIL
Total Code E107

Alomia » Miomi * Orlando * 51 Pelershurg * Tollahossee * Tompa G3REGFARFROENS-100-0000112
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Code E108 POSTAGE
03/17/09 POSTAGE
03/20/0% POSTAGE

Total Code £108

Code El124
03/09/09 COLOR COPYING COST
- 03/11/09 COLOR COPYING COST
03/25/09 COLOR COPYING COST
03/26/09 COLOR COPYING COST
03/26/09 COLOR COPYING COST
' 03/26/09 COLOR COPYING COST
03/26/0% COLOR COPYING COST
03/26/09 COLOR COPYING COST

Total Code El24

TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH APRIL 9, 2009

INVOICE 542892 TOTAL

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIQUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

CARITON FIELDS, PA.
Aflanie = Miomi = Orondo = St Petersburg » Tollchossee * Tompa »09RE/SEARERQA6-100-0000113
 Semdene detnctnd aith s B warn casdeemed nndar tha sirirt sunenvision of admitied oftiormevs by persons not admitted o proctice low in the controlling jurisdiction




F06 500, PLEASE REMIT TO:

- _CARLTON FIELDS o
reo, o g ATTORNEYS AT LAW 813.223 7000
Fax 813.229.4133

One Attunlic Center

1201 W. Pacchiras 51, Ste, 3000 P.O. Box B19101 P.C. Box 1171 P.C. Box 2841 P.O. Drawe 190 P.O. Box 150
Atlanio, Georgia 30309 Miam, FL 33131 Orlando, FL 32802 51, Petarsburg, FL 33731 Taflahassee, Ft 32302 West Pulm Beach, FL 33402
404.815.3400 305.530.0050 407 .84%.0300 . 727.821.7000 850.224.1585 5616597070
Fax 404.815.3415 Fax J04.530.0055 Fax 407.648.9079 Fox 727.822.3758 Fax 850.22%,0398 Fax 541.659.7348
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY 14, 2008
PO BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. 0Q0309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 547988

DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT

RE: 2009 RATE CASE

RALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT , '
LESS: PAYMENTS

BALANCE FORWARD N

1L.EGAL, SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 04/30/083
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 04/30/09

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL R

P e T e e

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE Y

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BATLANCE OUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-90 91-120 OVER 120 TOTAL

x** REMITTANCE COPY *** SUBMITTED
MAY 2 12008

ELECTRONIGALLY

Poyment is due upon receipt. Interest will be chorged on unpaid invoices aged 33 days or more from invoice date.

Services designated with an {*] were performed under the strict suﬁewisicn of admitted attorneys by persons not aﬂﬁﬁl&?g&??l%ﬂ%ﬁ@?éé&umg jurisdiction.




CARLTON FIELDS

FED.I_
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
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2009 RATE CASE RE¥. NO. 00309-38087
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PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH APRIL 30, 2009

PHASE L10: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN

Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY
04/06/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS oF (NGNS 1.80
r

"SAENEEENRS REVIEW OF (g
L ]

04/09/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF JillNNaie .60
L]

04/10/09 DMT REVIEW AND aANALYSIS oF JSNNENGNEGGNGEy .40
A

04/20/09 JMW CALL WITH JIM FINLAND REGARDING NS .10

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OFM 1.00

CALLS. WITH BURNETT REGARDING

0a/21/09 JMW

04/29/0% JMW .80

ORRESPONDENCE WITH BURNETT AND  MELSON
REGARDING Qi
04/30/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS CLIENT .10

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH MELSON REGARDING b

Subtotal for Task L1220

-~
o= ]
o

Task L310 : WRITTEN DISCOVERY

04/22/09 DMT DISCUSS DISCOVERY LIMITS WITH OPC COUNSEL; .29
FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT RE Rk

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Atonie = Miomi * Orlando = 5t Petershurg » Tallchossee * Tampa * WeRPdtAlEselNDIS-100-000115
Sarvices designated with an {*] were performed under the sirict supervision of admitied oltorneys by persons not admitted 1o proctice tow in the controliing jurisdiction.
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ATTORNEYS AT LAW
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2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 2
Subtotal for Task L310 : .20
Tagk L320 : DOCUMENT PRODUCTION
04/08/0% ER* COLLECTING DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO OPC POD .00
#76.
04/09/09 ER* COLLECTING DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO OPC POD .00
#76.
04/10/09 Ss* REVIEW ATTORNEY INVOICES AND CONTINUE TO REDACT 3.40
PRIVILEGED INFORMATION
04/14/09 SS* REVIEW REDACTED INVOICES AND ENSURE ALL 1.40
PRIVILEGED PORTIONS WERE REDACTED
04/15/09 Ka* REVIEWING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR 3.10
PRODUCTION
04/16/09 KXA* REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION .40
04/21/09 KA*  ANALYSIS OF PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE 1.40
TO OPC'S REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION
Subtotal for Task L320 : 9.70
PHASE L20: PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS
Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY
04/07/0% JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE 1.50

REGARDING FOLLOW

UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (.4 REVIEW
AND ANALYSIS OF

(.7);
REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE
TO CLIENT REGARDING

(.4)
04/09/02 JMW REVIEW AND
REGARDING

SIS OF ISSUES WITH TRIPLETT 7.40

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflanta * Miomi = Orlando * 5t Petersburg + Tallahossee * Tompo * WERRERHRTRIUEROD16-100-000116

- -‘Services designated with on {*) were parformed under the shict supervision of admitted ottorneys by persons not admitied to proctice low in the controlling jurisdiction.



CARLTON FIELDS

reo. AT
' ATTORNEYS AT LAW
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(3.0); REVIEW

FOLLOW UP WITH
BERNIER REGARDING

04/15/09 JMW iiViii _AND _ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE

04/16/09 JMW

.30

'2); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIOUS
CORRESPONDENCE FROM LEWIS, CALIL TO LEWIS

chmnme— .
.4); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT

CORRESPONDENCE AND &
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
SAME, S (.4)

04/16/09 JMW ﬁﬁHIﬁW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
CALL, TO BEURIS
REGARDING'

CALL WITH BEURIS

BUP ( .4) ; CALLS WITH BEURIS AND PORTUONDO
REGARDING FOLLOW CALLS
WITH GLENN AND BURNETT REGARD @, PrEPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING S

_ (.6); REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
AND ATTACHMENTS TO STAFF REGARDING
(-1)

.20

04/17/09 JMW

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflanta = Miami * Orlando * Si. Petershurg » Tu“uhussee * Tampa = WIBRFHIF BERROD16-100-000117
Services de.ngnc:ted with an [*] were performed under the strict supervision of admitied oforeys by persons not admitted 1o practice law in the controlling jurisdiclion.
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2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00308-38087
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04/27/09 JIMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

.50
OPC AND STAFF INQUIRIES AND RESPONSES ON AGENDA
FOR INTERIM RATES (.1); CALL WITH BURNETT
REGARDING

SRR (.4)

Subtotal for Task L120 12.80
Task L230 : COURT MANDATED CONFERENCES

04/06/09 JIMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF INTERVENERS' OBJECTIONS 10.00
: 2009 RELIEF, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE

0
' (1.0); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF _
—— (2.2); CORRESPONDENCE
AND CALL WITH JAVIER PORTUONDO REGARDING

N PREPARE
NOTES REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING

(1.0); CALL WITH ALEX GLENN REGARDING

(.6); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

RIPLETT AND BERNIER REGARDING

_ FOLLOW UP REGARDING

AME . (1.6); DRAFT AND REVISE AN

PREPARE

CORRESPONDENCE TO CLI .6) ;
REVIEW. AND ANALYSIS OF

.4

04/07/09 JMW STAFF CONFERENCE ON 200% RELIEF IN TALLAHASSEE;

3.50
ATTEND MEETING WITH CLIENTS REGARDING iy
04/08/09 JMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND STAFF MEETING ON 200% 5.00
RELIEF REQUESTS AND INTERVENER OBJECTIONS,
FOLLOW UP MEETINGS WITH CLIENTS ON Sneaaml
o T SR

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING (A NSaSunSugi)

Subtotal for Task L230

18.50
Task L250 :

: OTH WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSION

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Aflanta » Miomi » Orlando = 5t Petershurg  Tallchossee » Tompo = WEBSHBISTRGEROD16-100-000118
- Services designated with an {*) were performed under the strict supervision of odmitied cftormeys by persons not admitied to practice krw in the controlling jurisdiction,
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INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 5
04/10/09 JMW DRAFT AND REVISE RESPONSE TO INTERVENORS 7.00

OBJECTIONS AND RESPONSE TO PEF'S PETITIONS FOR
2009 RATE AND OTHER RELIEF (4.0); REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF

AT
=’ ) FOLLOW UP CALLS AND CORRESPONRENCE
PR

WITH BERNIER REGARDING

(2.5); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM STAFF
REGARDING PAA, CALL AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH
MELSON REGARDING

GNP PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
MELSON REGARDING QEEEmahaanRaunnaasmy (.5)

04/10/09 MRB ANALYZING . 6.00
3.5) ; RESEARCHING' D _
AN (1-2) , RESEARCH
_ (0.3); DRAFT
OBJECTIONS TO OPC 2ND ROG (0.8)
04/13/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE 6.00

ERNIER

CORRESPONDENCE WITH MELSON REGARDING My
3.0); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

oY (2.0) ; REVIEW AND
vSIs OrF M

. FOLLOW UP

WITH MELSON REGARDING SNV FREPARE

CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING Jiwa® (.7);

CALL WITH PORTUONDO REGARDING AR

O . )

04/15/09 JMW iiiiﬁ ﬂﬁ ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE -10

Subtotal for Task L250

19.10

Task L320 : DOCUMENT PRODUCTION

04/09/09 MRB REVIEWING DOCUMENTS (N FOR PRODUCTION 1.40

CARLITON FIELDS, PA.
_ Aflanta + Miomi * Orlando » St Petersburg = Tallohosses * Tampa « VEGRPEARGERD16-100-000113
Services designated with an [*]} were pesformed under the sirict supsrvision of admitted attorneys by persons rot admitted to procice low in the controling jurisdiction.
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FED. 1D -
. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY 14, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NQ. 003p9-38087
INVOICE NUMEBER 547988 PAGE )
Subtotal for Task L320 s 1.40
Task L410 : FACT WITNESSES

04/15/09 DMT DISCUSsS TOMMY HARRISON .60
{0.4); DISCUSS WITH KRISTY

BRUNDAGE (0.2} .

Subtotal for Task L410

.60
Task L420 : EXPERT WITNESSES

04/28/09 JMW _ .10,
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
e

CLIENTS

Subtotal for Task L420

.10
Task L430 : WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSIONS

04/14/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF Gai

REVISE SAME AND PREPARE AMENDEL
PETITION (.8); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

- FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
I CALL WITH RICK MELSON

REGARDING AP (.4) ;

04/15/09 JMW  PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL 1.20

(.4); CALLS WITH MELSON REGARDING
A

: — _ {.3); REVISE RESPONSE,
PﬁPAR_E': CORRESPONDENCE TC MELSON REGARDING

_ REVISE AND
PREPARE RESPONSE FOR FILING (.5)

,.04/17/09 JMW REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE .10

REGARDING MESSSSSeSSSSehRaseesy CALL TO FINLAND
REGARDING SlEW

Subtotal for Task L430

2.50

PHASE L30: DISCOVERY

CARLTON 'FIELDS. PA.

_ Aflanta * Miomi » Orlando * St Petersburg = lechussee = Tampo * \OhRdndfsrbiDie-100-000120
Sennces desngmﬂed with &n (*] were performer] under the sirict supervision of admitted aforneys by persons not admitted o proctice low in the controlling jurisdichion.




CARLTON FIELDS

FED.!I-
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY 14, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 7
Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY
04/21/09 SS*  MEETING AT CLIENT'S SITE IN ST. PETERSBURG: 4.80
ANALYSIS OF
© 04/30/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT PRIVILEGED LOG, .10
: : FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME
Subtotal for Task L120 : 4.90
‘Task L140. : DOCUMENT / FILE MANAGEMENT
04/17/09 KA* PREPARED CONFIDENTIAL DOCUMENTS (NN 7.40
S (:.S); REVIEWED DOCUMENTS IN
PREPARATION FOR PRODUCTION (2.9)
. 04/17/09 KA*  CONFERENCE WITH DIANNE TRIPLETT RE GESRSRSSEENEy .30
]
04/18/09 KA* REVIEWED AND PREPARED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION 1.80
~.04/19/09 KA* REVIEWED AND PREPARED FOR PRODUCTICN; REVISED 7.50
: STATUS LOG
04/20/09 KA* E-MAIL TO SEJAL MEHTA RE I EEEmienivasesmay .20
' e
' 04/20/09 KA* CONFERENCES WITH DIANNE TRIPLETT AND SHELLY .40
- : SCHRAND RE DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED AND
REVIEWING FOR CONFIDENTIALITY
04/20/09 KA* REVIEWED AND PREPARED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION; 8.90
_' REVIEWED DOCUMENTS TO BE HIGHLIGHTED FOR
CONFIDENTIALITY
©'04/21/09 KA* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS (NGNS .40
'04/21/09 KaA* E-MAIL TO SEJAL MEHTA RE JEEEEMNEENNNY .20

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflanta * Miemi * Orondo + St Pelersburg = Tu[lahussee » Tompo * \GBRPSITARERBDG-100-000121
Semr.es deslgnclled with an {*} were pedformed under the sirict supervision of odmitled attormeys by persons not admitted to proctice low in the controfling jurisdiction.




CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY 14, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-28087
INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 8
04/21/09 Ka*  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 10.50
4B TUMBERS 8, 23, 29, 46, 47, 55, 61, 62, 72,
80, 90, 93, 94, S5, 99, 105, 113 FOR PRODUCTIOCN
AN FOR CONFIDENTIALITY
04/21/09 PR* PREPARING DOCUMENTS FROM 4 64 FOR PRODUCTION. 6.80
04/22/09 KA* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS IN @R 105 RE .20
‘ PRODUCTION
04/22/09 KA* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 7.90
@ NUMBERS 31, 34, 37, 57, 78, 92, 102A, 103,
105, 111, 115 AND REVIEWED FOR CONFIDENTIALITY
04/22/09 Ka*  TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND E-MAILS WITH SEJAL .30
. MEHTA RE
04/22/09 PR* PREPARING DOCUMENTS FCOR PRODUCTION, W 21. 3.80
04/23/09 KA* REVIEWED ALL DOCUMENT FOLDERS IN POD3 BEFORE 3.70
PRODUCTION RE CONFIDENTIALITY; CORRECTED SCOME
ISSUES WITH DOCUMENTS IN FOLDERS 79, 95 AND
103; REVIEWED DOCUMENT FOLDERS 35, 37, 38, 39,
41, 42 IN POD1l BEFORE PRODUCTION RE
CONFIDENTIALITY
Subtotal for Task L140 3 63.70
Task L250 : OTH WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSION

04/11/09 MRB REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (GGG 1.90
‘ S

04/13/09 MRB  LEGAL RESEARCH i 2.60

oy

04/13/09 MRB LEGAL RESEARCH 2.30

(2.3}

04/21/09 MRB MOTION FOR TEMPORARY PROTECTIVE ORDER 1.10

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Afionts + Miomi * Odande = St Petershurg = Tu!lchussee * Tompo = WemPgisehhis-100-000122
Serv:ces designated with an [*} were performed under the strict supervision of admitted ofomeys by petsons not admitted 1o proctce low in the controfling jurisdiction.
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. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY 14, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 9
Subtotal for Task L250 3 7.90
Tagk L310 : WRITTEN DISCOVERY
©04/06/09 DMT  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE DISCOVERY 3.60

PROCESS, ANSWERING DISCOVERY, AND OBJECTIONS;
FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT I

04/06/09 DMT ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL RE (NN

pa/07/05 pMT REVIEW aNDp anaLysis or SN

OLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE - .DISCUSS
WITH JOHN RBURNETT (0.3)
AND GREG BEURIS (0.3).
04/07/05 DMT  REVIEW AND ANALYSTS |
I ~'D DISTRIBUTE SAME TO CLIENT TEAM.

ca/07/09 JC* PREPARING PRODUCTION DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO .00
OpC'S REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NO. 1.

04/08/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE aiililfle
04/08/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH 1.90
PENNEY DEVELLE
{1.2);
DISCUSS - WITH
GREG BEURIS (0.7).

04/08/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF BOARD MEETING MINUTES 1.80
: FOR CONFIDENTIALITY AND RESPONSIVE ISSUES.

o4/08/0% Jc* PREPARING PRODUCTION DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO -00
QPC'S REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NO. 1

04/09/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS. ' — 4.40

FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE 4

04/05/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH 2.10
CLIENT TEAM RE
GRS | . 4) ; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND
CONFERENCE CALL WITH WILL GARRETT RE
e =

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Allonta » Miomi = Orlando * 5t Petershurg = Ta“ahassee * Jampa * WmreetaRrmhD16-100-000123
Sem:es des:gna!ed with an ["l were performed under the skict supervision of admitted atorneys by parsons not admitted to practice low in the controling jurisdiction.
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PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY 14, 2005
2009 RATE CABE REF. NO. 0030%-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 547588 PAGE 10

'"f04/09/09 JC* PREPARING PRODUCTION DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO .00
5 OPC'S REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NO. 1

.04/09/09 JMW REVIEW VARIOQUS CLIENT AND TRIPLETT .60
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

ARy CREPARE RESPONSES
TO -

04/10/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF PRIVILEGED ENTRIES ON .30
' ATTORNEY INVOICES FOR PRODUCTION.

04/11/09 DMT REVIEW AN,
(1.5); FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE Al
{.3); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT OBJECTIOCNS
FOR FILING (0.2); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT
RESPONSE TO INTERVENER MOTION {0.3).

'-Oé/ll/09 JC#* PREPARING PRODUCTION DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO .00
OPC'S REQUEST FOR PRCDUCTION NO. 1

' 0_4/13/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT OBJECTIONS AND 2.60
o ISSUES WITH RESPECT TO CONSOLIDATION RESPONSE

(0.4) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF NEW DISCOVERY

RECEIVED AMNEENNEENy (0.2) ;

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT RESPONSES TO

DISCOVERY AND CONFIDENTIALITY ISSUES arsmanetepy

ARt ) .

04/13/09 JC* PREPARE DISCOVERY RESPONSES oy

04/13/09 JMW REVIEW oSNy .40
. _ PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO ROBINSON REGARDING AR (.1);

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO ROBINSON REGARDING
Sy (.1); CALLS WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING

(-2)

' 04/13/09 MRB CALLED SEJAL MEHTA REGARDING SUSESNESmseEamtmimy 2.10
(0.1), REVIEWED DOCUMENTS IN OPC POD 1 M9 2
FOR CONFIDENTIALITY, REVIEWED DOCUMENTS FOR
PRODUCTION IN RESPONSE TO OPC POD 1 FOR

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
o "Atlontn + Miomi * Odondo « St Petersburg » Tuﬂuhn;see » Tompa * WHERMRBTAEESOD16-100-000124
b Semces dastgnuh:d with an [*} were performed vnder the sirict supervision of admitted oftoreys by persons not odmitted fo proctice law in fhe controlling jurizdiction.
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- PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY 14, 2009
2003 RATE C(CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 11

CONFIDENTIALITY AND RESPONSIVENESS (2.0)

6_4'/13/09 MRB  REVISED OBJECTIONS TO OPC'S FIRST 3 PODS FOR 1.40
T . FILING (0.6); REVISIONS TO OPCS FIRST ROG (0.8)

© 04/14/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SNENIEEEIpY 8.20

CLIENT; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSIVE
DOCUMENTS TO WRITTEN DISCOVERY REQUESTS.

' 04/14/09 JMW REVIEW OPC LETTER, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT : .20
REGARDING SAME, RESPONSE, REVIEW TRIPLETT AND
CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

04/14/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF STAFF, OPC, AND FIPUG 3.00
: PENDING INTERROGATORIES AND DOCUMENT REQUESTS,

PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH

TRIPLETT AND BERNIER REGARDING SAME, OBJECTIONS

AND RESPONSES; REVIEW GuiEEN

04/14/09 MRB DRAFTING OBJECTIONS TO OPC'S SECOND 5.00
INTERROGATORIES (4.5); DOCUMENT REVIEW FOR
DISCOVERY PRODUCTION (0.5)

' '04f/15/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT DISCOVERY 6.80

RESPONSES AND FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT RE—
FOLLOW UP REGARDING

WITH
CLIENT TEAM.

04/15/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH .60
REILAND AND KOPP RE JENENEENERESNNN

04/15/09 JC* PREPARE DISCOVERY RESPONSES . Q0

04/16/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS FOR 5.60

RESPONSIVENESS TO OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY
REQUESTS; FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAM RE
—
04/16/09 DMT CONFERENCE CALL: WITH LORI CROSS, JAVIER .60
: DORTUONDC, AND PETER TOOMEY RE NN

b4/16/09 JC* .PREPARE DISCOVERY RESPONSES .00

CARETON FIELDS, PA.

‘ Atlanta » Miomi » Orlando ¢ St Petersburg + Tollohcssee » Tumpo » WrtPdhmBrethnia-100.000125
. -Services designoiad with on [*} were performed under the strict supervision of admitied altormeys by persens not admitted ty practice low in the controlling jurisdiction.
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2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 003209-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 547588 PAGE 12

. 04/16/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF STAFF INTERROGATORIES 1.80

AND DOCUMENT REQUESTS, SNSEIREIREERNERNN"

PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME (1.5); CALL
WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES,
PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME, REVIEW SCHEDULE
AND CALENDAR REGARDING STATUS OF SAME (.3)

04/16/09 MRB REVIEW OF FIPUG DISCOVERY REQUEST FOR 3.80
‘ OBJECTIONS; DRAFTED OBJECTIONS TC FIPUG
DISCOVERY REQUESTS (2.8); DOCUMENT REVIEW FOR
PRODUCTION TO OPC (1.0)

04/17/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS FOR 3.80
DISCOVERY (2.6); DISCUSS
SR~ R I TZA. IACONO (0.2); REVIEW
AND ANALYSIS OF DISCOVERY REQUESTS AND FOLLOW
UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE

(1.0}
- 04/17/09 JC* PREPARE DISCOVERY RESPONSES .00
.‘04/17/09 JMW CALL WITH BURNETT AND CROSS REGARDING .10

.. 04/18/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS AND FOLLOW U .30
b WITH CLIENT RE S '

' '04/20/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS TO 7.40
RATE CASE DISCOVERY; FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT

04/20/09 JC* PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION -80

04/21/09 DMT ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL RE @GNNSR 1.80

(0.9); DISCUSS q
"WITH LORI CROSS {0.5) AND JOHN BURNE

(0.4).

04/21/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 6.20
L DISCOVERY FOR CONFIDENTIALITY AND
~ RESPONSIVENESS; FOLLOW UP WiTH CLIENT TEAMS RE

" paf21/09 JC* PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION .00

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

_ Aflontg = Miami * Odaondo = 5t Petersburg = Tollohassee + Tompa *+ \SRERSTARRRDD16-100-000126
. .. Services designated with an {7} were performed under the strict supervision of admited atiomeys by persons not cdmitted to procfice low in the controlling jesisdiction.
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INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 13

' _: 04/21/09 JMW REVIEW AND RESPCND TO CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE .80
- REGARDING GH
REVIEW INTERROGATORIES REGARDING SAME (.1);

REVIEW AND aANALYSIS OF @SN~
L

CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING e (.3);

MEETING WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING STATUS OF
(.2) ; CALL WITH

CINDY LEE REGARDING

GRS RAMEINN, REVIEW LEE AND

ROBINSON CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING ewtSil (.2)

. 04/22/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 6.90
: DISCOVERY FOR CONFIDENTIALITY AND

RESPONSIVENESS (5.4); FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT

TEAMS RE G

{0.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH INVESTOR RELATIONS

RE YMEEERNNP (C.5) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS

OF FINAL DOCUMENT RESPONSES TO FINALIZE FOR

SERVICE (0.5).

~04/22/09 JC* PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION .00

04/22/03 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT AND EXPERT CORRESPONDENCE .20
REGARDING
CRRRENSRERE) PREPARE AND REVIEW

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING UMD

04/23/09 DMT  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 6.80
' DISCOVERY FOR CONFIDENTIALITY AND

RESPONSIVENESS; FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS @RE

_ FOLLOW

UP WITH CLIENT RE

‘ FOLLOW UP WITH OPC

COUNSEL AND STAFF COUNSEL RE PRODUCTION OF

DOCUMENTS AND EXPERT NON-DISCLOSURE AGREEMENTS

04/23/09 JC* PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION .00

'04/23/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT ANSWERS TO OPC 4.40
INTERROGATORIES AND CLIENT Gy

q PREPARE RESPONSE TO
CLIENTS REGARDING {.8); FOLLOW UP WITH

TRIPLETT REGARDING <INt

(:2); REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPO ING
AR, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME (.1); CALL WITH VANDER WEIDE

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Adonta = Miami = Orlando = St Petersburg = Tullohuss& = Tompa * ‘GWEcimbrrhDis-100-000127
Samces deslgnuled with an {*} wers perfonned vnder the sirict supervision of odmitiad oftorneys by persons not admitied to proctice low in the coniralling jurisdiction.
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2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 14

REGARDING
SN PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT

REGARDING 4l (.2) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF OPC
DISCOVERY REQUESTS
O REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT
OBJECTIONS, CALL AND CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT

REGARDING AND FOLLOW UP
WITH BERNIER AND TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (1.8);

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF Ity

PREPARE REVISIONS AND NOTES REGARDING SAME,
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO EXPERT REGARDING R

(.7); REVIEW TRIPLETT AND CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING (N = OL..CW

UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW
AND ANALYSIS OF

PREPARE NOTES
REGARDING SAME (.4)

04/23/09 MRBE REVISIONS TO RESPONSE TO OPC'S 1ST ROGS, 6.90
_ DOCUMENT REVIEW FOR THE SAME (6.4); REVISIONS
TO OBJECTIONS TO OPC'S 2ND ROGS (0.5)

04a/24/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DCOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 4.70
DISCOVERY FOR CONFIDENTIALITY AND
RESPONSIVENESS; FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAM TO
DISCUSS

SRR W I TH BURNETT
0a/24/069 JC* PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION .00

. 0a/24/095 JMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH 1.20
BEURIS AND VANDER WEIDE REGARDING JNNENP

, PREPARE NOTES
REGARDING SAME (1.0); CALL AND CORRESPONDENCE
WITH ROBINSON REGARDING (NN REVIEW
CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING ARSEN (.2)

04/25/0% JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VANDER WEIDE .10
COﬁii iONDENCE REGARDING

04./26'/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 1.40
DISCOVERY FOR CONFIDENTIALITY AND
RESPONSIVENESS.

. 04/2_6/09 JC* PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION .00

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

: Afontn * Miami = Orondo « 5t Petersburg « Talluhassne = Tampu * ‘HestPEnuirehD15-100-000128
: 5erv|ces desugnmed with an {*} were performed under the strict supervision of admitted ciomeys by persons net admitted i proctice low in the controlling jurisdiction.
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2009 RATE CASE ' REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 15
04/27/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 2.10
: DISCOVERY FOR CONFIDENTIALITY AND
RESPONSIVENESS; FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS TO
y
04/27/09 JMW REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING GuSuMN .30
F )
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO ROBINSON AND LEE
REGARDING (.1); REVIEW VARIOUS
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING MSSISENENEENNNIRENS
GENERNNERS® REVIEW FILINGS REGARDING SAME (.1)
04/28/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE DISCOVERY AND .40
. FOLLOW UP WITH STAFF COUNSEL RE SAME.
- 04/28/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS TRIPLETT AND BERNIER .20

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING OBJECTIONS, FIPUG
ISSUES AND RESOLUTION {.1); FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO BE FILED,
STRATEGY (.1)

. 04/29/09 pMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS oF SINEENNGGGGGG___N 3.60
ITH CLIENT TEAM; FOLLOW UP WITH
STAFF COUNSEL RE PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS AND
CONFIDENTIALITY.

REVIEW VARIOQUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 1.50

- : } FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, RESPONSE REGARDING

.04/29/09 JMW

: (.5); REVIEW AND ANALYSI
DISCOVERY REQUESTS FROM INTERVENORS, PREFPARE
NOTES REGARDING SAME (1.0)

‘ '04/29/09 Ka* PREPARED RESPONSES TO STAFF'S SECOND SET OF 2.70
INTERROGATORIES TO PROGRESS ENERGY

-04/29/02 MRB DRAFTED OBJECTIONS TO OPC'S 5TH POD .60

04/30/09 DMT ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL RE NSNS 4.80
‘ (2.1); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSIVE

DOCUMENTS FOR CONFIDENTIALITY AND
RESPONSIVENESS (2.4) ; DRAFT

0.3).

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Adanta * Miomi * Crlondo » St Petersburg = Tullahassae * Tampo * WemPdToiRpPRD16-100-000129
Serv:ces desngnuled with an [*] were performed under the sirict supervision of admitied olomeys by parsons not admitted to practice low in the controfling jurisdiction.
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- .04/30/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE DISCOVERY WITH 1.10
. COUNSEL FOR CPC.

' -04/30/09 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT AND ROBINSON
_ CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

} {.3); CALL WITH LEE REGARDING My

PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME, REVIEW AND

RESPOND TCO LEE CORRESPONDENCE: (1.3); FOLLOW UP
WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING AlEENNNGENGN
AR

(.1);
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY

REQUESTS, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME (1.0)

04/30/09 KA* DRAFTED RESPONSES TO STAFF'S SECOND SET OF
i ' INTERROGATORIES TO PROGRESS ENERGY

04/30/09 MRE DRAFTED 2ND REQUEST FOR CONFIDENTIAL
REVIEWED OPC 3RD ROGS FOR OBJECTICNS

Subtotal for Task L310 g 147.10

Task L320 : DOCUMENT PRODUCTION

- 04/07/09 MRB  LEGAL REVIEW

5.00
JAEEAERN® DI SCUSSED 1SSUES MRnmemr

I N WITH D,
TRIPLETT, SENT EMAIL NOTIFICATIONS THAT CERTAIN
DOCUMENTS WERE READY FOR PROCESSING

04/08/09 MRB REVISED QBJECTICNS TO OPC POD 1-3 (.3); 32.20
- REVIEWED DOCUMENTS #EENENSERY: O
CONFIDENTIALITY, RESPONSIVENESS (1.5); RESEARCH

{1.4)

04/08/09 55* REVIEW CONTRACTS Jisitlaierimnmmibymmmly Or

PRIVILEGED INFORMATION TO BE REDACTED

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Adlanta *+ Miami * Orlondo * St Petersburg » Ta!iahassee * Tompa ~ WaRPSmdeelhD16-100-000130
Semces designated with an { ] were performed under the sirict supetvision of admitted aftomeys by persons not admitted o practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.
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- 04/08/09 SS* REVIEW AND PREPARE DOCUMENTS ON @l 15 AND 4 2.10

IN RC OPC POD1 PRODUCTION

PR_iPARE MEMO REGARDING SSASmnmsnisi .30
—

04/09/0% MRB RESEARCHING 7.10

- 04/08/09 SS*

" 0aj10/05 ss+ reEvied axp prepARE pocuments From N 11, =2, 1.20
. 36, 38 AND 66A FOR PRODUCTION

g4/14/0% SS5* PREPARE CONFIDENTIAL PORTION OF REDACTED 1.80
PRIVILEGED INVOICES; ADDITIONAL PRIVILEGED
REDACTIONS TO SAME

-

‘ 04/15/09 MRB

REVIEWED DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED IN RESPONSE
TO OPC POD 1 (7.2)

' 04/15/09 SS*  VARIOUS EMAILS FROM CLIENT REGARDING — .90

EMAILS TO CLIENT
REGARDING _

“. 08/15/09 S§S*

.60
04/15/09 SS*  PREPARE DOCUMENTS FROM REQUEST 27 FOR 3.10
- PRODUCTION
' 04/17/09 JMW 2.00
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING
04/17/09 MRB  DOCUMENT REVIEW FOR DISCOVERY PRODUCTION, OPC 1.90

PODS 1, 2 AND 3.

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

© Adlanta * Miami * Orlando * St Patersburg » Tnihhussee * Tampa * WURFIATGEPDO16-100-000131
Ser\nces demgnuled with on {*] were perormad under the shict supervision of admified afftomeys by persons not odmilted o proctice low in the controfling jurisdiction.
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PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY 14, 2009
. 2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
~ INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 18
" 'pa/20/09 MRB REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS TG BE PRODUCED IN RESPONSE 8.10
. ' TO OPC'S FIRST THROUGH THIRD REQUESTS (7.5) ;
REVIEW OF OPC'S 4TH AND 5TH POD FOR
CLARIFICATIONS/OBJECTIONS {0.6)
. 04/20/09 SS* REVIEW DOCUMENTS SR FCR PRODUCTION 1.30
. - p4/20/09 8S* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 1.20
o ' P20 DND REVIEW FOR CONFIDENTIALITY
64/20/09 gs*  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 1.10
‘ 4EgP 30 AND REVIEW FOR CONFIDENTIALITY
" -p4af20/09 S8* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 1.20
. ‘ SEp»-: AND REVIEW FOR CONFIDENTIALITY
"04/20/09 Sg* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 1.80
o AP 13 AND REVIEW FOR CONFIDENTIALITY
04/21/0% MRB  DOCUMENT REVIEW FOR PRODUCTION TO OPC IN 5.90
' RESPONSE TO POD 1-3
04/21/09 SS* REVISE RESPONSE TO OPC'S FIRST REQUEST FOR 3.60
PRODUCTICN OF DOCUMENTS; REVISE RESPONSE TG
OPC'S SECOND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF
DOCUMENTS; REVISE RESPONSE TO OPC'S THIRD
REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
04/21/09 88* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO 4.20
OPC'S FIRST REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
REQUEST NUMEERS 5, 29, 41, 42, 44, 53, 77, 75,
AND 113
04/21/09 S§S* MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH RALEIGH AND ST. PETERSBURG .40
INDIVIDUALS REGARDING
04/22/09 MRB  REVIEWED. DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION TO OPC IN 9.80
\ RESPONSE TO POD 1-3; REVISED PRODUCTION
RESPONSES TO INCLUDE OBJECTIONS AND
CONFIDENTIALITY CLAIMS
04/22/09 gS* REVISE RESPONSE TO OPC'S FIRST REQUEST FOR 4.20

PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; REVISE RESPONSE TO
OPC'S SECOND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF
DOCUMENTS; REVISE RESPONSE TO OPC; 'S THIRD

CARUTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflanta *+ Miami * Odondo * 5t Petersburg = Tolluhume * Tampa * Vienidmirehnis100-000132

. Semces designated with an {*) were performed under the strict supervision of admitted atomeys by persons not admitted to proctice law in the controliing jusisdiction.
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2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 19
REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
R 04/22/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF COMMUNICATIONS FROM .40
. CLIENT REGARDING
"04/22/09 gS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO .70
4> AND REVIEW FOR CONFIDENTIALITY
.04/22/09 S8S* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO .60
e 45 AND REVIEW FOR CONFIDENTIALITY
'04/22/09 S8* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO .70
' A2 AND REVIEW FOR CONFIDENTIALITY
04/22/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 1.20
o AP :2 AND REVIEW FOR CONFIDENTIALITY
~ ''04/23/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOWNLOADED DOCUMENTS 2.30
: ' REGARDING CONFIDENTIALITY AND PRIVILEGE
04/23/0% SS* DRAFT CONFIDENTIAL MATRIX FOR STAFF'S USE 2.40
PURSUANT TO STAFF'S INSTRUCTION CONCERNING
DOCUMENTS PRODUCED IN CONNECTION WITH OPC'S
1ST, 2ND AND 3RD REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF
DOCUMENTS
pa/24/09 MRB DOCUMENT REVIEW - RESPONSES TO STAFF'S FIRST 1.40
p : PGD
54/24/09 MRRB DRAFTED SECOND MOTION FOR TPO .50
- 04/24/09 55% REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS; 1.20
REVIEW AND REVISE PRIVILEGE LOG
04/27/09 MRB CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. COSTELLO, A. TIBBETTS 1.20
REGARDING
{(0.2}; LAST REVIEW OF FIPUG
OBJECTIONS (0.4); REVIEW OF RESPONSE TO STAFF'S
FIRST POD (0.3); BEGAN REVIEW OF OPC'S 3RD ROG
FOR OBJECTIONS (0.3)
. 04/28/09 MRB  REVISIONS TO 2ND OPC ROG OBJECTIONS (.8); 2.30

REVIEWED ADDITIONAIL DOCS FOR SUPPLEMENTAL
RESPONSE TOU STAFF'S FIRST PCOD (0.2); REVIEWED

FIPUG DISCOVERY REQUESTS, RS VICKI
KAUFMAN REGARDING

L JUNCY

CARUTON FIELDS, PA.

S _ Allanta » Miomi * Orlando = 5t Petershurg = Tollshassee = Tompo = WerFenderrbots- 100000133
. . Services designated with an {*} wera performed under tha strict supemvision of admitted ottorneys by parsons not admitted 1o practice low in the controliing jurisdiction.
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-04/30/09 MRE REVIEWED DOCUMENTS FOR FIPUG'S FIRST POD; 1.70
Subtotal for Task L320 H 98.70
- Task L340 : EXPERT DISCOVERY
' 04/15/09 JMW CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH ROBINSON AND ‘LEE .20
C REGARDING
(.1); CALL WITH ROBINSON REGARDING
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDIING-
(.1)
Subtotal for Task L340 : .20
" Tagk TL430 : WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSIONS
) h4/13/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CONFIDENTIALITY REQUREST .40
FOR MFRS WITH OPC COUNSEL; SEND ORDER TC HIM RE
SAME .
'04/15/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSTIS OF OBJECTIONS WITH OPC 1.30
a, _ COUNSEL; FOLLOW UP WITH RURNETT RE Sl
Subtotal Ffor Task L430 H 1.70
‘ Task L440 : OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPPORT
”"04/06/09 MRB REVIEW OF JOINT INTERVENORS CONSOLIDATED 5.40
‘ RESPONSE TO PEF'S MOTION FOR INTERIM RELIEF
;. (.6).; LEGAL RESEARC
Subtotal for Task L440 : 5.40

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Ed ., Aflonto * Miomi = Ordondo » St Petersburg = Tallohossee * Tompo » VWariPalpdfereho1s-100-000134
©* Services designated with an (*) were performed under the sirict supervision of admitted attorneys by persons not admitted to practice low in the contralling jurisdiction.
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. ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

- JMW

-DMT-

8g*

PR*

DMT

KA*

R, T3

- KA*
S558*
| ER*

J. M. WALLS 14.9%0 hours at s==

D. M. TRIPLETT 2.80 hours at $ =

S. SCHRAND* 4.80 hours at i -
Total Task Code L1120 : 22 .50

K. ADAMS* 53.10 hours at <R -

P. REDDERSON* 10.60 hours at SN -
Total Task Code L140 H 63.70

J. M. WALLS 18.50 hours at <+l -
Total Task Code L230 g 18.50

J. M. WALLS 13.10 hours =

M. R. BERNIER 13.90 hours =
Total Task Code L250 s 27.00
. M. WALLS 17.50 hours =

D. M. TRIPLETT 102.20 hours =

M. R. BERNIER 22.20 hours =

K. ADAMS* 5.40 hours =

J. COSTELLO* .00 hours =
Total Task Code L3110 : 147.30

J. M. WALLS 2.00 hours

M. R. BERNIER 57.20 hours

K. ADAMS* - 4 .90 hours

S. SCHRAND* 45 .70 hours

E. REYES* .00 hours

CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY 14, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. (0030%-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 21

TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Total Task Code L320 : 109.80

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Alanta * Miaini * Otlando » St Pefershurg = Toﬂuhussee » Tompo » WWeshPolm Beselnte 100 gaot

35
Semces des;gnuied with an [*] were performed under the strict supervision of admitted cliomeys by persons not admitted 1o practice law in the conirolling jurisdiction.
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PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA MAY 14, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 547988 PAGE 22
oMW J. M. WALLS .20 hours at QNSNS - T
0 . Total Task Code L340 T20 T .
_ DMT . D. M. TRIPLETT .60 hours at $\UE» - vy
- Total Task Code LA1D  : 760
JMW  J. M. WALLS .10 hours at SRR -
Total Task Code L420 : .10
S JMWw J. M. WALLS 2.50 hours at $ R -
° DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 1.70 hours at 5 \GiNEG.G =
Total Task Code L430 : 4.20
'MRB M. R. BERNIER 5.40 hours at SufifEm-
| Total Task Code L440  : 540
 ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY
. 'DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 107.30 hours =
©.88* 5. SCHRAND* 50.50 hours =
L aOMW. J. M. WALLS 68.80 hours =
. MRB M. R. BERNIER 98.70 hours =
o KA* K. ADAMS* 63.40 hours =
 PRY P. REDDERSON* 10.60 hours =
JC* J. COSTELLO* 53.30 hours =
L ER* E. REYES* ‘ 8.10 hours =
co TOTALS 399.30

COSTS INCURRED ON YQUR BEHALF AS POSTED APRIL 30, 2009

Code 101 COPYING
04/09/09 COPYING COST
04/10/09 COPYING COST

- 04/23/09 COPYING COST
04/27/09 COPYING COST
04/27/09 COPYING COST
04/29/09 COPYING COST

~ 04/30/09 COPYING COST
04/30/05 COPYING COST

Total Code E1D1L

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

_ Aflanta * Miami = Orlondo « 5t Petersburg * Tczunhussee « Tempa * WéeeblsimBreeinis-100-000126
Serwces des:gnu?ed with an [*} were performed under the strict supervision of admitted attorneys by persons aot admitted lo practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.
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2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 0030%-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 547588 PAGE 23

QPmrpv. desmnared with an i*} ware performed undet the sirict suparvision of admitted altorneys by persens not admitted 1o practice faw in the confrolling jurisdiction.

INVOICE 547%88 TOTAL

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Code E103  WORD PROCESSING
04/08/09 DOCUMENT PRODUCTION - PRINT EMAILS AND
ATTACHMENTS
- 04/09/09 DOCUMENT PRODUCTICN - SCAN DOCUMENTS
Total Code E103
cOde E105 TELEPHONE
_-04/07/09 TELEPHONE
. 04/08/05 TELEPHONE
04/13/09 TELEPHONE
04/15/09 TELEPHONE
04/21/09 TELEPHONE
. 04/22/09 TELEPHONE
04/29/09 TELEPHONE
- -'04/29/09 TELEPHONE
. 04/29/09 TELEPHONE
Total Code EL05
Code E107 DELIVERY SERVICES/MESSENGERS
04/09/09 EXPRESS MAIL N
‘04/17/09 MESSENGER CHARGES
04/29/09 EXPRESS MAIL
Total Code EL07
Code E108  POSTAGE
. 04/06/09 POSTAGE
04/27/09 POSTAGE
. 04/28/09 POSTAGE
' Total Code ELQOS8
Code E110  OUT-OF-TOWN TRAVEL
~ 04/10/09 TRAVEL/LODGING/MEALS - VENDOR: JAMES MICHAEL P TN
WALLS - 4/7/09-4/8/09 TRAVEL TO AND ATTEND
INFORMAL MEETING @ PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION.
Total Code E110 —
Code El24
04/27/09 COLOR COPYING COST
Total Code El24
TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH APRIL 30, 2009 L

Allanta » Miami = Orlondo = St Petersburg » Tulluhussee * Tampo * BYEPBTARR2CID15-100-000137
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BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS '

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE i

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Aflonta = Miami * Orlonde = 5t Petersburg Tclbhussee » Tompa * WREsimibrrdo16-100-000128
Services designated with an {*] were perfermed under the shict supervision of admitted citomeys by persons not odmitted to practice low in the conirolling jurisdiction.




A PLEASE REMIT TO:
- (4 A R I—T O N F l E L D S Tam:t.:o-ﬂszgzé'la-zn‘?
- reo. o TR ATTORNEYS AT LAW $12.223 7000
Fux 813.229 4132

- .Or;o Allontic Canier
1201 W. Frachiraa St., Ste, 3000 F.0. Bax (19104 P.0. Box 1171 P.0. Box 2861 P.0. Drawer 160

P.O. Bo
Atlont, Georgio 30307 Mioml, FL 33131 Odgnde, F1 32802 S1. Pelntsburg, FL 33731 Talivhasses, FL 32302 West Palm B:a:h‘,sF?JZ!JDZ
404.815.3400 305.530.0030 407.84%.0300 727 .821.7000 850.224. 1585 541.459.7070
Fax 404.815.3415 Fax 305.530.0055 Fux 407.648.9099 Fox 727.822.3768 Fax 850.222.0398 Fax 561.659.7368
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JUNE 22, 2003
PO BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33733 REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 552893

DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT

RE: 200% RATE CASE

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

BALANCE FORWARD

LEGAIL, SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 05/31/09
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 05/31/09

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BATANCE QUTSTANDING BY DAYS

0-30 31-60 61-90 91-120 OVER 120 TOTAL

++% REMITTANCE COPY *** SUBMITTED

JUNZ 3 2009
ELECTRONICALLY

Payment is due upon receipt. Interest will be charged on unpoid invoices nged 35 days ar more fram invoice date.

- A9RP-STAFFPOD16-100-000139
Services designaled with an [*) were performed under the strict supervision of admilied atiorneys by persons not admitted to practice law in the controlling jurisdiction.
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ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JUNE 22, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 552893 PAGE 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH MAY 31, 2008

PHASE L,100: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN
Task L120: AMALYSYIS/STRATEGY

'05/01/09 DMT ATTEND CALL RE (USRNSSR .50
— (1.1); FOLLOW UP WITH JOHN
BURNETT AND REGULATORY TEAM RE
(0.4) .

. 05/01/09 JMW CALL WITH BURNETT REGARDING (i 1.60
PREPARE NOTES, FOLLOW UP WITH

TRIPLETT REGARDING ¢, REVIEW CLIENT

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING G (.4); PREPARE FOR

AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING

GNP REPARE NOTES

REGARDING |

_- FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING (D

{(1.2)

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF Qi .20

'05/06/09 DMT

' 05/06/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (g 10
@B CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING (N
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO TRIPLETT REGARDING
REVIEW FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH.
CLIENT REGARDING

05/07/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (ENERSESny 1.60

w {1.3); FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT
TEAM RE (P (0.3) .

05/08/09 DMT ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT TEAM RE .50

'.05/11/09 JMW

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF Qi

* PREPARE NOTES REGARDING - REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS O

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflonta = Miomi = Orondo * St Petersburg » TuHuhassee = Tampa = WAREHTAEERPD16-100-000140
Rarvieas Aaunnntnd with nn =1 were oerfommed under the siict supervision of admitted ofiormeys by persons nol admitted o practice Jaw in the controlling jurisdiciion.
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oo N ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JUNE 22, 20089
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 552893 PAGE 2
05/12/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (iR .80
' e
05/13/09 JMW CALL WITH BURNETT REGARDING @D .20
GAANPNEARRMENENN DREPARE NOTES REGARDING (Ml
" 05/15/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CALL RE QNIERENND .70
' SR
05/15/09 JMW  PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL .50
' REGARDING Ry
05/18/09 DMT FOLLOW UP WITH STAFF COUNSEL RE (il .20
05/22/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CALL RE (miiumd .30
05/27/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND .50
Y oR:pnRE
CORRESPONDENCE TC BEURIS REGARDING D (.2);
REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND DRAFT (NN
r
CALLS WITH CLIENT REGARDING (NN
REVIEW FINAL RESPONSE (.3)
05/29/09 JMW  PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL .80
REGARDING_= PREPARE NOTES
REGARDING _
Subtotal for Task L120 : 10.50
Task L140: DOCUMENT / FILE MANAGEMENT
05/05/09 KA* REVIEWED CLIENT'S RESPONSES TO OPC'S SECOND 1.60
INTERROGATCRIES TO PEF
Subtotal for Task L140 : 1.60
Task L190: OTHER CASE ASSES, DEVEL. & ADMIN
05/01/09 KP* RECEIPT AND REVIEW INCOMING DOCUMENTS; .20

SUPERVISE FILING WITH PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

CARLTON FIELDS, PA. .
Adonio + Miomi * Ordando = 51 Petersburg = Tuﬂchussee « Tompu * Vge§ ﬁ ﬁTﬁFeugF(\)D-!aq 41
 Srmdeer doianetod with e (41 ssars sednemad onder the et cuneovicion of ndmitad niomevs by parsons not admitied 16 orodice low in the controlling wrisdiction
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PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JUNE 22, 2009
' 2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 552893 PAGE 3
" 05/08/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (UENENGESSEEND 1.00
— , REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF
, CALL TO TOCMEY REGARDING
O
05/08/05 KP* RECEIPT AND REVIEW INCOMING DOCUMENTS; PREPARE .30

CD TO BE HAND DELIVERED TO TRIPP COSTON, PUBLIC
SERVICE COMMISSION; SUPERVISE HAND DELIVERY OF
SAME

Subtotal for Task L1900 - 1.50

. - Task L340: EXPERT DISCOVERY

05/11/09 SS8* ONLINE RESEARCH REGARDING = .40

Subtotal for Task L340 - .40

PHASE L200: PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS

‘rask L110: FACT INVESTIGATION

05/11/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (inimag .20
R (. 2)

Subtotal for Task L1100 : .20

Task L120: ANALYSIS/STRATEGY

05/07/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE 3.50
AND MELSON MEMORANDUM ON (e
@l (1.0); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT
'CORRESPONDENCE AND STAFF RECOMMENDATIONS @R
Dy,  FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING GSINREASAEp FREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TC CLIENT REGARDING (MM, REVIEW

(2.5}

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
_ ] Alonta = Miomi » Oronde * St Petersburg = Tollohossee = Tompo = OARE-RRiAREROP16-106-000142
- Sairuiras dacinnntad with an 1) wera npr&wmed under the striet supervision of admitted cttorneys by perons not cdmited to practice fow in the controlling jurisdiction
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2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
- .INVOICE NUMBER 552893 PAGE 4

05/08/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS @i 2.50
a2 B, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

G  PREPARE MEMO
REGARDING @milp (1.3); PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND
CLIENT CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING (ENEND

'GMMNND, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING @M@ FOLLOW UP
CALL WITH TRIPLETT AND BURNETT REGARDING G

(1.2)

CALLS WITH BURNETT REGARDING (el .50

. 05/11/09 JMW

B REVIEYW (R —— — '
REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND DRAFT (NEEENND 4.00
_ — _ , REVISE
@) PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS

REGARDING @M@ (.6); REVIEW CLIENT
CORRESPENDENCE AND

05/12/09 JMW

_ (.1); PREPARE FOR AND
ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING GHNNMENS

. REVIEW
, FOLLOW UP CALL WITH BURNETT, FOLLOW
UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING @il STRATEGY
(1L.3); REVIEW
PREPARE SUMMARY OF
' (2.0)

'05/21/09 JMW CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING REMAINING D .30

05/22/09 JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 3.00
'REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

.

- _ _ PREPARE SUMMARY OF
e —r— AND PREPARE
"SPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING GEND, REVIEW

@EmEa® (2.0); PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT
CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING O

WITH CLIENT FOR FOLLOW UP REGARDING W (1.0)

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Aflanto = Miomi * Orlando * St Petersburg, « Tollchossee = Tompa = BARPPETRAE ERAD16-100-000143

Cuimiicne rlasimmmbed with an 11 wam petormed under the sirict supervision of odmitted ofiomeys by persons ot admitied 1o practice low in the controlling jusisdicion.
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I ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JUNE 22, 2005
2005 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 552893 PAGE 5

REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND (liREEEY .40
PREPARE FOR AND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL ON

T RS A S
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE .50

05/26/09 JMW
AND UPDATED (ISR a

) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

C  — YO
Wy
3 14.70

Subtotal for Task L1200 =

05/22/09  JMW

“Task L190: OTHER CASE ASEES, DEVEL. & ADMIN

105/28/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF v 5.00

PREPARE NOTES REGARDING

_ 'PREPARE
“
05/29/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF e 3.50

GEEENENg FPREPARE (NS
L

Subtotal for Task L1%0 = 8.50

Task L210: PLEADINGS

05/12/05 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF G .20

CLTENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING Sl

05/20/08 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF TRIPLETT CORRESPCNDENCE .10
AND ., PREPARE
RESPONSE TO TRIPLETT, REVIEW CLIENT RESPONSE
.30

Subtotal for Task L2100 :

' pask L230: COURT MANDATED CONFERENCES

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aonta » Miomi * Odando * St Petersburg + Tollohossee » Tampz » PARPPAIRABERAD1G-100-000144

" Cnriirnx tetinnetad with an 17 were pedormed under the strid supervision of admited atforneys by persons not admited 15 proctice low in the contolling jurisdiction
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200% RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-28087
INVOICE NUMBER 552893 PAGE &

. 05/17/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF quuuueumiiaiusussd
| GEEEENNS REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (QENED
[ vemmm——

05/18/09 JMW  AGENDA CONFERENCE HEARING ON INTERIM AND
LIMITED RATE RELIEF IN TALLAHASSEE, REVIEW AND
REVISE (MENMEEEEr REVIEW STAFF RECOMMENDATIONS
MEMOS, AND AUTHORITIES REGARDING SAME, CALLS
AND MEETINGS WITH TRIPLETT AND CLIENTS
REGARDING

05/19/09 JMW AGENDA CONFERENCE IN TALLAHASSEE REGARDING
_ INTERIM AND LIMITED RELIEF, MEETINGS WITH
CLTENTS REGARDING (GG

Subtotal for Task L2230 :

-

Task L350: DISCOVERY MOTIONS

05/22/09 JC* PREPARE AND SERVE REQUEST FOR CONFIDENTIAL
CLASSIFICATION

Subtotal for Task L350 :

Task L410: FACT WITNESSES
05/08/09 JMW CALL WITH RIB REGARDING SRR,

CORRESPONDENCE TC TRIPLETT REGARDING )
REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM RIB REGARDING R

Subtotal for Task L410

Task L440: OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPPORT

05/14/09 JMW AGENDA CONFERENCE ON INTERIM AND LIMITED RATE
RELIEF: REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (EESENp
G REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF INTERVENERS' OBJECTIONS TO SAME AND
PEF'S RESPONSE, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
TRIPLETT AND BERNIER REGARDING

L
GEERgEp CALI WITH RICK MELSON REGARDING (D,
R

CARITON FIELDS, PA.

18.50

.50

NGO CHARGE

.00

.50

.50

Aflonio * Miemi » Orando + 3. Peterburg » Tofichasses © Tompo = CHRR-REMERESE15-100-000145 i
 Eihiene dacinnatad with nn 191 were narformad under the strict supervision of odmitied atiorneys by persons not odmitted to practice low in the controlling jurisdicion.
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05/14/09 MRB  RESEARCHING Qe 1.80
P ©EGAN RESEARCH
L
05/15/09 JMW AGENDA CONFERENCE ON INTERIM AND LIMITED RATE 1.50
_ RELIEF, REVIEW MATERIAL AND DRAFT AND REVISE
M§ PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS
REGARDING GWNNENNER REVIEW CLIENT
RESPONSES, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT AND BRERNIER
REGARDING il
- 'p5/15/09 WMRB  RESEARCHING SRS 1.50

Subtotal for Task L440 H 7.80

PHASE L300: DISCOVERY

Task L140: DOCUMENT / FILE MANAGEMENT

05/01/09 Ka* REVIEWED OPC'S SECOND INTERROGATORIES TO PEF; 1.10
NO C GE
Subtotal for Task L140 B 1.10

Task L250: OTH WRITTEM MOTIONS & SUBMISSION

05/01/09 MRB ANALYZED AND DRAFTED (S 5.30
W ; ANALYZED

DRAFTED D

05/04/09 MRB REVIEW OF OBJECTIONS TO 3RD ROGS (OPC) FOR 3.
FINAL EDITS (0.3); DRAFTING OBJECTIONS TO OPC'S
6TH POD (2.0); REVIEWED FIPUG'S 2ND ROGS AND
PODS FOR OBJECTIONS; DRAFTED OBJECTIONS TO
FIPUG'S 2ND PODS (1.6)

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflanta = Miomi = Orlando o St Petershurg + Tolighossee * Tompa - 092E,FIAREERM 16-100-000145
" €mmiine dasianntad with mn 1% wara medormad ander the ity supervision of admitted attorneys by persons nof admitted to praciice law in the conirolling jurisdiction
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.05/05/09 MRB REVIEW OF ISSUES RELATED TO OBJECTIONS TCO CPC'S
' 4TH ROGS AND &TH PODS (0.5); EMAIL
COMMUNICATION WITH FIPUG COUNSEL REGARDING OUR
OBJECTIONS TO FIPUGS 2ND POD, EMAIL REGARDING
L

3.30

(0.20); EMAIL WITH NANCY HOLDSTEIN REGARDING
b REVIEW OF

DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TO OPC'S
S5TH POD (C.6); REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS FOR FIPUG'S
FIRST POD (0.7}; REVIEW OF DOCS FOR STAFF'S 4TH
'POD (0.8); REVIEW OF OPBPC'S 7TH POD FOR
OBJECTIONS (0.50)

._OS/DB/DB MREB PREPARE OBJECTIONS TO OPC 7TH POD (1.8);
: ' PREPARATION OF RESPONSES TO OPC'S 3D ROGS

05/11/09 MRB DRAFTED OBJECTIONS TO OPC'S STH ROGS (2.1);
' DRAFTED RESPONSE TO STAFF'S 3RD ROG (0.3});
DRAFTED CONFIDENTIALITY REQUEST FOR DOCUMENTS
PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TO STAFF'S 4TH PODS AND
SUPPORTING AFFIDAVIT (0.7); REVISIONS TO

OBJECTIONS TO 7TH PCDS (0.5); REVISIONS TO 5TH
ROGS (0.5} ;

05/12/09 MRB JUSTIFICATION MATRIX FOR CONFIDENTIALITY 1.10
' REQUEST FOR STAFF'S 4TH POD, REVIEW OF

{(0.7); DRAFT MOTION FOR TPO FOR DOCUMENTS INM
OPC POD 122 (0.4);

05/13/09 MRB DRAFTED MOTION FOR TPO REGARDING OPC'S 3RD .50
ROGS, 145

- 05/18/09 MRB DRAFTED FIFTH MOTION FOR TPO .50
05/20/09 MRB MOTION FOR TEMPORARY PROTECTIVE ORDER FOR 50

CONFIDENTIAL DOCS PRODUCED, RE: OPC 5TH ROG/7TH
POD

05/25/09 MRB REVIEW OF CITIZENS', STAFF'S AND FIPUG'S
DISCOVERY REQUESTS FOR OBJECTIONS

05/26/09 MRB DRAFTED OBJECTIONS TO OPC'S 6TH ROGS (1.0); 8TH 3.10
_ POD (0.3); STAFF'S 6TH POD (0.6); FIPUG'S 3RD
PODS (0.3); FIPUG'S 3RD ROGS {(0.3); OPC'S 9TH
PODS (0.3) AND SEVENTH ROGS (0.3)

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
" Atlantc * Miomi * Orondo » Sf Petershrg * Toflohossee » Tompo ~ \RESFPSIAERRADIG-100-000147
o -_'_Séwic'gs destanated with on §*] were performed under the strict supervision of admitted oerneys by parsons not admitied o proctics law in the contralling jurisdicion.
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''p5/27/09 MRB  DRAFTED OBJECTIONS TO STAFF'S STH .70
INTERROGATORIES ;

. 05/28/09 MRRB REVIEW OF OPC'S &6TH ROGS, NN .90
oo e
R

05/29/09 MRB  REVISED OBJECTIONS TO STAFF'S S5TH ROGS .30

Subtotal for Task L250 : 306.60

Task L310: WRITTEN DISCOVERY

05/01/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISS5UES RE D 1.70
nasaEnd
' 05/01/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (e 3.00

WITH BERNIER GRS
CepmeaEaeEEEP (.3); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

DRAFT OBRJECTIONS, FOLLOW UP WITH BERNIER AND
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, ISSUES (.3); REVIEW
CORRESPONDENCE AND ATTACHMENTS REGARDING
e A S
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING (MMl PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO PRESTON PIERCE REGARDING (N
(.2); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF STAFF AND OPC ROGS
AND PODS, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME, REVIEW
AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT AND EXPERT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SN
IR, COLIL.OW UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING (N (2.2)

05/04/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (NS Sn i 2.00
-

(1.1) TR
(0.9).

05/04/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS PRODUCED IN 1.70
"pdent RESPONSE TO DISCOVERY AND FINALIZE

INTERROGATORY RESPONSES FOR PRODUCTION; FOLLOW

UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE SAME.

05/04/09 JMW CALL WITH PRESTON PIERCE REGARDINGEIENENIENED 2.50
GRS, PR EPARE
NOTES REGARDING GMEEB, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SR (.3); REVIEW G

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
_ _ Allanta = Miomi * Ordonde = 51 Patersburg » Tollchassee « Tampo - QUBRSTARRRCOD16-100-000148
Services designated with an [*] were performed under the sirict supervision of odmitted otoraeys by persens not admilted to proctice law in the controlling jurisdiction.
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" 05/04/09 Ka*

7 05/05/09 DMT

05/05/0% JMW

05/06/09

DMT

N FOLIOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

"MAKE NOTES REGARDING

ANERNIERERANNMAN REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
DRAFT OBJECTIONS TO OPC 4TH ROGS AND 6TH PODS,
REVISE SAME, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO BERNIER
AND TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (2.0); REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF

PRODUCTION WITH TRIPLETT {.1}

— 6.50
PREPARED AND DRAFTED RESPONSES TO OPC'S SECOND

SET OF INTERROGATORIES TO PROGRESS ENERGY

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (NN .80
GRS . D PROVIDE FEEDBACK RE
@ (0.2); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF QNS

SRR (0.3); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF REDACTION
ISSUE AND DISCOVERY WITH JOHN BURNETT (0.3).

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF OBJECTIONS, DISCOVERY 5.20
REQUESTS AND CLIENT/EXPERT DRAFT ANSWERS
REGARDING

ROGS, OPC 2D ROGS, AND RESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS,
REVISING ANSWERS, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
CLIENTS REGARDING GGG (S .5) ;
CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING (i

e e
SENMENA® PREPARE NOTES REGARDING @) PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING QNN
e (. S) ; REVIEW FIPUG DISCOVERY REQUESTS,
RESPONSES, IiEERSNEENEP, PREPARE RESPONSES
REGARDING SAME (.7); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

REVIEW ) FOLLOW UP
CORRESPONDENCE WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING Qi
G (.3); REVIEW CLIENT*“CCRRESPONDENCE AND
T S

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME ({.2)

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RATE CASE DISCOVERY 1.60
RESPONSES AND DOCUMENTS TO FINALIZE SAME FOR

FILING (0.9); FOLLOW UP WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL

RE OBRJECTIONS AND FOLLOW UP DOCUMENTS (0.2);

FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE MRS

T (0 _3) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

IR I T JOHN BURNETT (0.2) .

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Aflonta *+ Miomi * Odondo * St Pelersburg * Taflchassee * Tompn = DAREVSIRFEE2D16-100-000149

o o S;:nrirn,r‘m.innnfed with an [*] were serformed under the strict suparvision of admitted citorneys by petsons not admilted 1o proctics low in the controlling jurisdichion
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05/06/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS TRIPLETT AND .20
: CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING WSt
RNy FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT AND
BERNIER REGARDING SIS

05/06/09 Kax PREPARED AND REVISED RESPONSES TO OPC'S SECCND 3.70
: INTERROGATORIES NOS. 53-108 TO PEF THAT ARE DUE
5/8

05/07/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RATE CASE DISCOVERY 3.10
RESPONSES AND DOCUMENTS TO FINALIZE SAME FOR
FILING (2.3); FOLLOW UP WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL
RE .OBJECTIONS AND FOLLOW UP DOCUMENTS (0.2);

FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE e
R (C.G) .

05/07/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT COMMENTS ON 1.50

_ RN
e e— e R AR
WITH TRIPLETT AND CLIENTS REGARDING (U
CORRESPONDENCE AND CALL WITH CINDY LEE
REGARDING @ESMM8 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM
CINDY LEE REGARDING @uil§ (-6); REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF CORRESPONDENCE AND SUPPLEMENTAL
INTERROGATORY ANSWERS, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING NN (- C) ;
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS OTHER CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE AND TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING (S
SR ( . 3 )

05/07/09 XA* PREPARED DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO OPC'S SECOND 4.90
INTERROGATORIES NOS. 53-108 TO PEF TO BE
PRODUCED; REVIEWED BINS S3, 61, 63, 71, 80, 92,
93, 94, 95, 96, 102

05/08/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANAILYSIS OF RATE CASE DISCOVERY 2.80
RESPONSES AND DOCUMENTS TO FINALIZE SAME FOR
FILING (1.8); FOLLOW UP WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL
RE OBJECTIONS AND FOLLOW UP DOCUMENTS {0.2);
FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE Wi,
R (O . 8) .

05/08/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH .80
RICHARD REILAND AND JEFF XKOPP RE (HNGENG_———
SNy FCLLCW UP RE ARy

: CARLTON FiEIDS, PA.
Aflonta = Miomi » Orlondo * St Petersburg = Tu“uhussae * Tampo UNM“FERQBTG-1BO~000150 :
t,pmces desionated with an {*) were performed undar the sirict supervision of admitizd oitormeys by persons not odmilted o prochice luw in the controlling jurisdiction. -
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- 05/08/09

05/08/09
05/08/09
05/08/09

05/11/09

05/11/09

05/11/09

JMW

Ka*

55*

55%*

DMT

JC*

05/12/09 DMT

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (N .70

g FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING A
{(.3); REVIEW DISCOVERY FILINGS AND VARIOUS
TRIPLETT AND CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

, PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO TRIPLETT REGARDING G,
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING 4l STATUS
(.4) '

COMPLETED PREPARING DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 3.60
OPC'S SECOND INTERROGATORIES NOS. 53-108 TO PEF
TO BE PRODUCED;

REVISE RESPONSE TO OPC'S SECOND SET OF 1.60
INTERROGATORIES CONCERNING DOCUMENTS TO RE
PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TO SAME

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS TO ACCOMPANY .50
OPC'S SECOND INTERROGATORIES TO PEF

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RATE CASE DISCOVERY 3.70
RESPONSES AND DOCUMENTS TO FINALIZE SAME FOR

FILING {(3.1}; FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE
0.6).

PREPARE DISCOVERY RESPCNSES FOR SERVICE 2.80

NO CHARGE

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF \SEXNEntymmmy 6.00
G ' CORRESPONDENCE FROM TRIPLETT AND

BERNIER REGARDING 4MENS REVISE (uNARARSENNNY

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO TRIPLETT AND BERNIER

REGARDING @M REVIEW FINAL OBJECTIONS (1.5);
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (i

ISSUES WITH TRIPLETT AND REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
VARIOUS FILED DISCOVERY RESPONSES, FOLLOW UP
WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, DOCUMENTS (.5);
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (EENENGEEEEENNS

[ e )
PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CALL WITH GARRETT, LEE,

AND ROBINSON REGARDING 4, PREPARE NOTES
REGARDING 4 (4.0)

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSES AND OBJECTIONS

.40
WITH OPC COUNSEL.

CARLTON FiELDS, PA.
Adonte » Miomi = Orondo » 5t Pelersburg = Tollohassee » Tompa = OBRFFERASERGDIG-100-000151

Rarvirat dezinnntad with an 11 were oerformed vnder the sirict supervition of admitted oMerneys by persons not odmitted to practice low in the controliing jurisdiction
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- -'r'_ec;,m: v

. 05/12/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (SN 4.40

(0.3); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT
CONFIDENTIALITY REQUESTS AND TEMPORARY
PROTECTIVE ORDER FOR DOCUMENTS (0.2); FOLLOW UP
WITH CLIENT TEAM RE (NN
IR (1 . 4) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
R

R (2 . 1) ; DRAFT
‘INTERROGATORY RESPONSES AND
(0.4).

. 05/12/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE

e o REGARDING (NN FO1.LOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING (SN - )
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF OPC 6TH ROGS, OPC STH
PODS, ANSWERS TO FIPUG ROGS, DRAFT ANSWERS TO
OPC 3RD ROGS, PREPARE NOTES AND PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING (il
SRR R -V IEW CLIENT RESPONSES, FOLLOW UP
WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING Qlll, CORRESPONDENCE

WITH LEE REGARDING Gl
{2.2)

© 05/12/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS TO BE ATTACHED 1.16

TO OPC THIRD SET OF INTERROGATORIES REGARDING
CONFIDENTIALITY

05/13/09 DMT FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAM RE 4NN
SRS (0.4) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES
‘WITH RESPECT TO (GGG
B (0.2); REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF DRAFT INTERROGATORY RESPONSES AND
ATTACHMENTS TO FINALIZE FOR FILING (2.8).

05/12/09 ©DMT DISCUSS OBJECTIONS AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTIOGN WITH

OPC COUNSEL (D.3);: DISCUSS MATRIX WITH COUNSEL
FOR STAFF (0.2).

-506

05/13/09 JC* PREPARE DISCOVERY RESPONSES FOR SERVICE 3.50

NO CHARGE

‘05/13/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE AND

: DRAFT ANSWER TO (Y F-VISE ] FPREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING Gl REVIEW
CLIENT RESPONSE (.1); REVIEW CROSS AND BEURIS
CORRESPONDENCE AND SUGGESTED

. PREPARE. CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS

4.20

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

o Alontn * Miomi » Ordondo + St Patersburg * Tallohossee » Tompu - DBREVGFATFEOD16-106-000152 o
- Sanvicas desinnnter with on 1%1 were performed under the strict supervision of odmitted attorneys by persens not admiited to practice law in the contofling jurisdiction. -
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RECARDING qANENNERSRRENENEE (. 1) ; REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
_ REVIEW \
@M ND PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT
REGARDING GEEEMB (.2); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
STAFF 6TH PODS AND STAFF S5TH ROGS, PREPARE

NOTES REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING N

SRS (. 5) ; REVIEW GEuan
GEREEERFROM ROBINSON, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE
TO CLIENTS REGARDING (NN

GERRMEEN  CALL WITH LEE REGARDING

] (2.5); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS
OF FINAL DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND FILINGS,
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (.5)

5 05/13/09 58%* REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO OPC'S THIRD SET
L OF INTERROGATORIES CONCERNING LATE CHANGED
ANSWERS AND CONFIDENTIALITY

1.70

05/14/0%9 DMT FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAM RE (NN
R (0 .G) ; REVIEW
AND ANALYSIS OF

='('0-.4); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

RESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS FOR CONFIDENTTIALITY AND
RESPONSIVENESS (1.4); DISCUSS ISSUES (NN
O T TH JOHN BURNETT (0.3) ;
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT INTERROGATORY

RESPONSES AND CIRCULATE m
(0.9).

3.60

05/14/09 JC* PREPARE DISCOVERY RESPONSES FOR SERVICE 2.60

NO CHARGE

05/]_-4/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS CLIENT AND 1.00

EXPERT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING (NNIENNNGNGGGNGG
A

_ . . PREPARE
RESPONSES (.7); FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT ON

e —————————————————————
G REVIEW DOCUMENTS, DISCUSS WITH
TRIPLETT (.3)

05/15/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES TO
FINALIZE FOR SERVICE {2.3); FOLLOW UP WITH
CLIENT TEAM RE G (0.3) ; RESPOND TO EMAILS
AND FOLLOW UP CALLS RE (ENNGGENASey
Gy (0. 5) .

3.20

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

_ : Aflonia = Miomi = Orfdondo + 51, Petersburg * Tollohossee v Tompe < UERPFTAEREODI16-100-000153
.-.", Services designoted with on [*] were performed under the sirict supervision of admitled ofiomeys by persons not odmitiad fo practice low in the controlling jurisdiction
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.05/15/09 JC*

PREPARE DISCOVERY RESPONSES FOR SERVICE 2.60
. NO CHARGE
05/15/09 OMW REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT COMMENTS ON (NG 2.70

05/18/09

05/18/09

05/18/09

05/18/09

05/19/09%

- 05/13/0%

DMT

JC*

38*

DMT'

JC*

?: CALL WITH BURNETT
REGARDING DRAFT REVISIONS TO SAME AND

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING
&, REVIEW CLIENT RESPONSE, CALL TO EXPERT
REGARDING (NN (1.0); REVIEW ADDITIONAL
COMMENTS FROM CLIENTS WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
G (.2); CALL WITH CLIENTS
REGARDING (.
(NS | .2) ; REVIEW (NS ON CALL
WITH CINDY LEE, REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE AND DRAFT
ANSWERS {.3); REVIEW
VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING Quiiigimin

, REVIEVW IRy D
DRAFT ANSWERS TO STAFF ROGS, REVISE SAME,
WE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING

1.0)

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES TO 3.90
FINALIZE FOR SERVICE (3.6); FOLLOW UP WITH
CLIENT TEAM RE G (0.3) .

PREPARE DISCOVERY RESPONSES TQ OPC &6TH REQUEST 4.40
FOR PRODUCTION AND 4TH INTERROGATORIES NG CHARGE
CALL WITH CRISP, PIERCE, AND RIB REGARDING .40
AR

S . (.2) ; REVIEW
CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

GNP Cn1L WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME,
STATUS (.2)
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSE TO STAFF'S 4TH i.10

SET OF INTERROGATORIES TO CLIENT FOR
COMPLETENESS AND CONFIDENTIALITY

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES TO 3.70
FINALIZE FOR SERVICE (2.8); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS
oF NNy 1 TH BART
WHITE (0.4); DISCUSS (NN VITH
CINDY LEE (0.2):; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (NN
WITH RICHARD REILAND (0_3).

PREPARE DISCOVERY RESPONSES TO OPC 5TH 3.80
INTERROGATORIES BND 7TH REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NO CHARGE

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflonta » Miomi » Orondo » 5t Petersburg = Tollchossee * Tompo * 0ORP-BHAMRRCDE-100-000154

N ‘_:Ser"vices desinnoted with an }* were performed under the sirict Supérvision of admitted gHtorneys by persons not sdmitted fo proclics law in the controlling jurisdiciion
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.. 05/19/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSE TO OPC'S FIFTH .20

INTERROGATORIES TO PEF

© - 05/20/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF PENDING DISCOVERY 3.20
- RESPONSES TO FINALIZE SAME FOR FILING (2.1);

FOLLOW UP WITH VARIOUS CLIENT MEMBERS RE (U
(1L.1).

S 077 05/20/03 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT ANSWERS TO OPC STH 3.90
o ROGS AND 6TH PODS, REVISE ANSWERS TO ROGS,
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS
LEE AND ROBINSON CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE

TO LEE REGARDING (MEMREVIEW RESPONSE, REVISE

ANSWERS (2.0); REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
AREDAREEEER | EVIEW DOCUMENTS,

CALL TO CLIENTS REGARDING 4NN FOLLOW UP WITH

TRIPLETT REGARDING SEEENE(.6); REVIEW (NNEENS

: :

GMEENMEAS PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO ROBINSON
AND' VANDER WEIDE REGARDING (M@ REVIEW
RESPONSES (.6); CALL WITH LEE REGARDING QUMW

r

FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT AND BERNIER REGARDING
@ (.6) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS
CORRESPONDENCE AND ANSWERS TO ROGS REGARDING
R (1)

55/21/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH .80
TRANSMISSION TEAM RE

L ]
(0.4); FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT RE QRN
S (O . 1) .

. 05/21/09 DMT DISCUSS WSNGGNNENSNENNY TH LEE WILLIS

60
(0.2), NANCY HOLDSTEIN (0.3) AND JOHN BURNETT
(0.1) .
05/21/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF NEW DISCOVERY REQUESTS 1.10
_ (0.3); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF WiaS
aamma (0.8) .
b’5/21/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS STAFF AND OPC 1.0D

DISCOVERY REQUESTS, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING
SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING wlh,
R

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
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. 05/22/09 DMT DISCUSS OBJECTIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR OPC (0.4); .70
FOLLOW UP WITH JOHN BURNETT RE MM (0.3) .

05/22/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE DISCOVERY 1.40
. DOCUMENTS AND RESPONSIVE INTERROGATORIES; '
FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE(EMNNEEED

~.05/22/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF Gy .30
' OSSR, CREPARE NOTES REGARDING

SAME (.2); REVIEW ADDITIONAL STAFF DISCOVERY

AND CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING amml (.1)

'05/26/09 DMT . DISCUSS s .80
: WITH CHARLES REHWINKEL (0.4); FOLLOW UP WITH
TOMMY MOSES REGEEEER (0.4).

05/26/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GuENNLIcanasssuiie 1.30
. . SEENEEES 2ND FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAM RE
. ]

" 05/26/09 JMW REVIEW TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING Wl .20
. A  REVIEW

CLIENT RESPONSES, PREPARE RESPONSE TO CLIENTS

(.1) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF STAFF'S 9TH SET OF

ROGS TO PEF (.1)

05/27/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT RESPONSES TO RATE 2.60
e CASE DISCOVERY FOR RESPONSIVENESS AND

OBJECTIONS; FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE

L

" 05/27/09 pvmr rornow up wITH oursipE counselL RE [INNG .30
.|

05/27/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE 2.10

: QeSS
CALL WITH RIB REGARDING GEMEEEENNAREEED
GEEEREN PREPARE NOTES REGARDING GNP, PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDINGENENS
AN REVIEW RESPONSES AND PREPARE
RESPONSE, REVIEW GENNNNENEENEEE (1.0) ;
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF NN

PREPARE

CORRESPONDENCE TO LEE REGARDING
(.5); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS CLIENT AND

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

: Alania = Miomi » Orando * 5t Petersburg » Tollohasmsee * Tampo * ‘WinbESmPredn1s-100-000156
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TRIFLETT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

e rrrrrr—
FOLLOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING

(.5); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (NSNS
REVIEW
TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING QNN (-1)

05[2_8/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (NG 1.90

O (0. 4) ;
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF NEW DISCOVERY RECEIVED
(0.1); FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS Gl

{(0.8);
FOLLOW UP WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE STATUS OF
DISCCVERY AND CLARIFICATIONS (0.2); REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF RESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS AND RESPONSES
(0.4).

LIDS/28/09 JC* PREPARE SUPPLEMENTAIL RESPONSES TO OPC REQUEST 2.50
FOR PRODUCTICN NO. 176 NG CHARGE

05/28/09 JMW .70

PREPARE NOTES
REGARDING SAME (.3); CALLS TO BURNETT AND LEE

REGARDING Gui (- 1) ; CALL
WITH LEE REGARDING (N

T (.3

05/28/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF STAFF 10TH ROGS AND .30
VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING .
CALL WITH
BURNETT REGARDING (UISEEEENNNNY FOLLOW UP
WITH TRIPLETT, REVIEW BURNETT CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING (IS

05/29/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT RESPONSES TO RATE 2.80
CASE DISCOVERY FOR RESPONSIVENESS AND
OBJECTIONS; FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE

05/29/09 DMT CLIENT CALL RE (NN .60

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflanta * Miomi * Ordando » Si Pstersburg = Tuﬂahussen » Tompo = WISRBHTARRROD16-100-000157
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‘05'/29/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ¢SSRERENAERERSE .30

(.1} ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS
CLIENT AND TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
{.1); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS
OF OPC MAY 28 AND 29 SERVED PODS AND ROGS,
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (.1)

Subtotal for Task L3100 122.3%0
Task L320: DOCUMENT PRODUCTION
05/01/09 MRB REVIEW OF DOCS IN RESPONSE TO FIPUG'S 18T PODS; 1.10
o REVIEW OF RESPONSES TO STAFF'S 2ND ROGS (0.2)
05/02/09 SS* COMMUNICATION WITH CLIENT REGARDING (NS .20
: L]
- 05/02/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS IN CONTAINED .40

IN BINS 8 THROUGH 11 OF STAFF'S THIRD REQUEST
FOR PRODUCTION FOR CONFIDENTIALITY

05/03/09 MREB REVIEW OF OPC'S 6TH POD FRO OBJECTIONS .40

05/05/09 JC* PREPARE DCCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION 1.860
NO CHARGE

05/05/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (NN .60

. e
O 7.\
RESPONSES TO INTERROGATORIES

05/05/09 8§* REVISE (NN 1) ANALYSIS OF WHAT -80
DOCUMENTS WERE READY TO BE PROCESSED

05/06/0%9 MRRB REVIEW OF RESPONSES/DOCUMENTS FCR OPC ROG 2 5.60
(3.7) ; REVIEW OF RESPONSES TO FIPUG POD 1
(1.1) ; REVIEW AND REVISIONS TO OBJECTIONS TO
OPC'S 6TH PODS AND 4TH ROGS {(0.7.), REVIEW OF
DOCUMENTS IN POD 148 FOR PRIVILEGED INFORMATION
{0.1) '

05/06/09 SS* REVISE DRAFT RESPONSE TO OPC'S FIFTH REQUEST 1.30
FOR PRODUCTION; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO SAME

CARLTON FIELDS, PA. .
) Allonta = Miomi = Orfondo * 5t Pefersburg * Toflohosses » Tompa = WRBRRTAREERD16-100-000158
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e CARLTON FIELDS
oF 5, TR Y _ ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JUNE 22, 2009

2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
_INVOICE NUMBER 552893 PAGE 20
' g5/06/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO 3.50

FIPUG'S FIRST REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION; REVISE
DRAFT RESPONSE TO FIPUG'S FIRST REQUEST FOR
PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS

. .05/06/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO .60
L FIPUG'S REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NO. 4:
COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLIENT REGARDING_

- 05/07/09 8S*  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO .70
e OPC'S REQUEST 122 REGARDING CONFIDENTIALITY AND
NON-RESPONSIVE INFORMATION

. .05/07/0% S8S* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 2.40
S FIPUG'S REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION INCLUDING
]
COMMUNICATION WITH
CLIENT REGARDING (HENES

- 05/07/09 S8S8* REVISE RESPONSE TO FIPUG'S REQUEST FOR . .40
o PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS REGARDING REQUEST
NUMBER 4
'05/08/09 S5% REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENT TO SUPPLEMENT .50

OPC'S THIRD REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NUMBER 106

05/08/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF UNREDACTED DOCUMENTS IN 1.40
' RESPONSE TO OPC'S FIRST REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION

NUMBER 55 AND IN RESPONSE TO OPC'S THIRD

REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NUMBERS 79 AND 395

. 05/10/09 MRB REVIEW OF OPC'S STH ROGS FOR OBJECTIONS .90

. 05/11/09 MRB REVIEW OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES DUE TODAY, .50
- ' INCLUDING OPC 5TH POD (0.3), STAFF'S 4TH PODS
(0.2)
05/11/09 55* REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO OPC'S FIFTH .30

REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS

-._05/11/09 S5¥ DRAFT RESPONSE TO OPC'S FOURTH REQUEST FOR -40
- PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS

' 05/11/09 SS*  COMMUNICATE WITH KATE CARTER REGARDING .20
: .
R —

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
: . Atlantu * Miami » Orando = St Petersburg » Tolighassee * Tompa * VISRP<STAESEOD156-100-000159
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05/11/09 SS* REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO STAFF'S THIRD SET .40
| OF INTERROGATORIES TO PEF
05/11/09 SS* REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO STAFF'S FOURTH .30
o REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
05/11/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF Gunmseimumnssm ‘ .60

. COMMUNICATION WITH CLIENT REGARDING

' 05/12/09 MRB REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO FIPUG'S 2ND 3.50
ROGS (0.2); REVIEW OF DOCS IN RESPONSE TO OPC'S
3RD ROGS (1.0); REVIEWED DOCS TO BE PRODUCED, IN
RESPONSE TO FIPUG'S 2ND PODS (1.5); REVIEWED
DOCS TO BE PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TO QPC'S &TH
PCDS (0.8)

05/12/09 Ss* REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED TO OPC AND FIPUG 2.10
' REGARDING CONFIDENTIALITY; RBEVIEW AND REVISE
CONFIDENTIALITY MATRIX FOR STAFF REGARDING
SAME; REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRQDUCED TO OPC IN
CONNECTION WTH INTERRCOGATORY RESPONSES; REVIEW
AND REVISE CONFIDENTIALITY MATRIX FOR STAFF
REGARDING SAME

05f12/09 S8* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS PRODUCED IN -30
' RESPONSE TO OPC FOURTH REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION

05/12/09 SS*  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (RiiESREANN .70

i

COMMUNICATION TO CLIENT REGARDING

05/13/09 Kp* RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM JEANNE COSTELLO; .30
DOWNLOAD AND BURN CD CONTAINING
NON-CONFIDENTIAL DOCUMENTS FOR PEF RESPONSE TO
OPC POD 5 #123-126; SUPERVISE HAND DELIVERY TO
oPC

05/13/0% MRB REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED TO OPC, 3RD .40
ROGS; 6TH PODS

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Allonta’ * Miomi * Orlando = St Pefersburg « Tnlluhussee * Tompa * \WERPSHAREPD16-100-000160
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 05/13/09 8S* MEETING WITH LEGAI, DEPARTMENT, MS. TIBBETS AND 2.60
W MS. BOWERS IN ST. PETERSBURG, REGARDING
R
SN REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (UENERENNND
P~
- 3
05/13/092 §S* REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIDENTIALITY MATRIX FOR .60
: STAFF
05/14/09 MRB  REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS BEING PRODUCED IN RESPONSE 4.70
‘ TO FIPUG'S 2ND POD({0.7); FIPUG'S 2ND ROGS
(0.6); CALLED NANCY HOLDSTEIN REGARDING il
CNTTERREENENNY (O .2) ; OPC'S 6TH PODS (0.6);
OPC 4TH ROG (1.2); STAFF'S 4TH ROGS (1.4)
 °05/14/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GuuSuuliuuy 1.20
PREPARE WRITTEN
COMMUNTCATIONS REGARDING GNP TO CLIENT
: 05/14/09 8SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF EXCEL DOCUMENTS IN .30

RESPONSE TO FIPUG'S SECOND REQUEST FOR
PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH

CLIENT (R

' 05/15/09 MRB COORDINATED WITH ASHLEY BAUR AND SHELLY SCHEAND .20
CONCERNING FIPUG DISCOVERY.

-_05/15/09 MRB REVIEW OF RESPONSIVE DOCS TO OPC &TH PODS 4.40
: (2.2); STAFF'S 5TH PODS (0.7); STAFF'5 4TH FOGS
{(1.2); OPC'S 4TH ROGS (0.3)

05/15/09 85+ REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF PRODUCTION OF EXCEL .80
' SPREADSHEETS; COMMUNICATION WITH CLIENT
REGARDING QM REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF UPDATED
CONFIDENTTIAL MATRIX FOR STAFF; COMMUNICATION
WITH CLIENT REGARDING D

65/18/09 ' MRB REVIEW OF ADDITIONAIL DOCUMENTS, FINALIZING 3.60
‘ DOCUMENTS TO RBE PRCDUCED IN RESPONSE TO OPC 4TH
ROG, 6TH POD AND STAFF'S S5TH POD, 4TH ROG;
REVIEW RESPONSIVE FILINGS

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
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.05[18/09— 55%* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO 1.20
OPC'S SIXTH REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF
DOCUMENTS; REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO OP(C'S
SIXTH REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION

05/18/09 58%* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO 1.10
: OpPC'S FOURTH SET OF INTERROGATORIES REGARDING
COMPLETENESS : '

h 05/18/09 S8+ REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO 1.10
b STAFF'S 5TH REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
FOR COMPLETENESS

'05/19/09 MRB REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TC 4.70
OPC'S 7TH PODS (2.1), 5TH ROGS (1.8)

05/19/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSE TO OPC'S .70
‘ SEVENTH REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS

05f20/09 MRB REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS/RESPCNSES PRODUCED IN 1.40
_ ' RESPONSE TO OPC 7TH PCD, 5TH ROG FOR PRODUCTION
TODAY ;

- 05/20/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSES TO OPC'S STH 6.70
SET OF INTERROGATORIES AND OPC'S 7TH POD;
COMMUNICATION WITH CLIENT REGARDING (NENNEERED

O COMMUNICATIONS WITH LYNDA
BATES REGARDING GENEREE
e —————— 8
COMMUNICATION WITH OPC REGARDING OPC'S 5TH SET
OF INTERROGATORIES AND OPC'S 7TH POD;
COMMUNICATION WITH ALL ON SERVICE LIST FOR

QPC'S 5TH SET OF INTERRCGATORIES AND OPC'S 7TH
POD; REVIEW OF FINAL RESPONSES TO SAME

05/22/0% MRB REVIEW OF DISCOVERY REQUESTS (OPC) FOR .50
_ OBJECTIONS

'05/27/09 MRE REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS/REQUESTS FIPUG 3RD 2.50
ROGS/PODS; STAFF 5TH ROGS/6TH PODS FOR
CONFIDENTIALITY, RESPONSIVENESS, STATUS UPDATES

05/28/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS SUBMITTED IN 1.70
RESPONSE TC OPC POD7 REQUEST NUMBER 176

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
‘ Atlontn » Miami * Oronde = St Petersburg = Tollchassee * Tampo = \GSRRGEIARRRESD16-100-000162
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L e -

©05/29/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS Gy .30
- e ——————————————————
e —————————— e ]
G

Subtotal for Task L320 : 71.10
- .Task L390: OTHER DISCOVERY

os/12/09 e s - NN .

Bubtotal for Task L3S0 .30
‘Task L430: WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSIONS

GS/OZ/OQ 858+ REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO STAFF'S SECOND .90
) INTERROGATORY TO PEF

' .05./27/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT OBJECTIONS TO 1.00
‘ FIPUG, STAFF, AND OPC DISCOVERY REQUESTS,
REVISE SAME, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO BERNIER

AND TRIPLETT REGARDING GNGENENNGEE REVIEW
RESPONSES

Subtotal for Task L430 - 1.90

PHASE L400: TRIAL PREPARATION AND TRIAL

. Task L140: DOCUMENT / FILE MANAGEMENT

05/14/09 WS* (R .60
o -/ NO CHARGE
Subtotal for Task L1400 : .00

Task L440: OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPPORT

' 05/28/09 MRB  RESEARCHING G .70

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflonta * Miomi = Ordando » St Petersburg * Tollohossee = Tompa » VWERPSEAARER0OD16-100-000163
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05/29/09 MRB  RESEARCHING SNy .60
.
Subtotal for Task L440 : 1.30
TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES “
. ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE
JMW  J. M. WALLS .20 hours at SN - Y
Total Task Code L1ll0 8 .20 Y
MW J. M. WALLS 19.40 hours at $ NN - e
DMT D. M. TRIPLETT 5.80 hours at Sl - J
Total Task Code L120 : 25.20 N 0
Kax* K. ADAMS* 2.70 hours at $ =
WS* W. SUPPELL* .00 hours at $ = ]
JCc* J. COSTELLO* .00 hours at $ | = P
Total Task Code L140 : B
JMA J. M. WALLS 9.50 SN
KP* K. PULLEN* .50 e
Total Task Code L190 : e
JMW  J. M. WALLS .30 g
Total Task Code L210 : S
JMH  J. M. WALLS 18.50 hours at Sy - e
Total Task Code L230 : 18.50 A

MRB M. R. BERNIER 30.60 hours at gl - SRy

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Aflonta + Miami * Orlande * 5t Petersburg » Tofichossee » Tompa » VispBairirpetnDis-100-000164
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Total Task Code L250 : 30.60

JMY J. M. WALLS 38.50 hours at =

DMT E. M. TRIPLETT 59.50 hours at =

Ka* K. ADAMS* 18.70 hours at =

sSg* S. SCHRAND* 6.20 hours at =

JC* J. COSTELLO* .00 hours at
Total Task Code L3310 g 122.90

MRE M. R. BERNIER 34 .40 hours S

Kp* K. PULLEN=* .30 hours =

EG* S. BCHRANDY* 36.40 hours =

JC* J. COSTELLO* .00 hours { 3
Total Task Code L320 g 71.10

S8* S. SCHRAND* .40 hours
Total Task Code L340 s .40

JCc* J. COSTELLO* .00 hours
Total Task Code L350 : .00

KA* K. ADAMS* .30 hours at SNGTER -
Total Task Code L390C 3 .30

JMW  J. M. WALLS .50 hours at $-=
Total Task Code L4110 H .50

JMW J. M. WALLS 1.00 hours at § =

58* 2. SCHRAND* .90 hours at $ =
Total Task Code LA30 g 1.90

JmMu J. M. WALLS 4 .50 hours at $ =

MRE M. R. BERNIER 4.60 hours at § -y -
Total Task Ccode L440 : 9.10

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Aflanta * Miami * Orlondo * St Petersburg » Tallchassee = Tompa * WenbPgimnBeywhD16-100-000165
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ATTORNEY FEE SUMMARY

DMT

D. M. TRIPLETT 65.30 hours
Kp* K. PULLEN#* 0.80 hours
gg+* S. SCHRAND* 43.90 hours
JMW J. M. WALLS $2.40 hours
MRB M. R. BERNIER 69.60 hours
KA+ ¥X. ADAMS* 21.70 hours
WS* W. SUPPELL* 0.60 hours
JC* J. COSTELLO* 27.10 hours
TOTALS 293.70
COSTS INCURRED ON YOUR BEHALF AS POSTED MAY 31, 2009
Code E101 COPYING
05/04/09 COPYING COST
05/04/09 COPYING COST
05/12/09 COPYING COST
05/13/09 COPYING..COST
05/19/09 COPYING COST
05/20/09 COPYING COST
05/26/09 COPYING COST
05/29/05 COPYING COST
Total Code El101
Code E105 TELEPHONE
04/03/09 TELEPHONE
05/11/09 TELEPHONE
05/11/092 TELEPHONE
05/12/09 TELEPHONE
05/13/09 TELEPHONE
05/18/09 TELEPHONE
05/21/0% TELEPHONE
05/28/09 TELEPHONE
Total Code EI105
Code E107 DELIVERY SERVICES/MESSENGERS
04/24/09 EXPRESS MAIL
05/06/09 EXPRESS MAIL
05/08/09 MESSENGER CHARGES
05/20/09 EXPRESS MAIL
05/22/09 MESSENGER CHARGES - VENDOR: 5/1/09 PSC DANIELLE
MCINTOSH
05/22/09 MESSENGER CHARGES - VENDOR: 5/8/09 PSC DANIELLE

MCINTOSH

Afionie * Miami * Orlondo = 5t Patersburg Tulluhnssee * Tompo * BéabioiaBREDD16-100-000166
Semces designated with an {*} were performed under the sirict supervision of admitted attomeys by persons not admitted ko proctice law in the controlfing jurisdiction.
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.

PLEASE REMIT TO:

Tampa, L 33601.322%

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 813.2232.7000
Fox 813.22%.4133

' '.Onn Allantic Canter

’ T201 W, Peachures 5t S, 3000 1.0, Bex 019101 £.0. Box 1171 P.O. Box 2861 P.O, Drawer 130 .0, Box 150
N|{,,.’|u" Goorgla 30309 ’ Miomi, FL 33131 Ordando, FL 32802 5. Patersburg, FL 33731 Tallohassea, FI. 32302 West Polm Baach, FL 33402
404.315.3400 305.530.0050 407 .849.0300 727.821.7000 850.224.1585 561.859.7070
Fax 404.815.3415 Fax 305.530,0055 Fan 407.648.9099 Fox 727.822.3763 Fax B50.222.0398 Fax 561.459.7368
- PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 8, 2009
‘PO BOX 14042 JAMES M. WALLS
ST PETERSBURG, FL 33732 REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 554722

DUE DATE: UPON RECEIPT

L}

'RE: 2009 RATE CASE

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT )
LESS: PAYMENTS

BALANCE FORWARD R

LEGAL SERVICES POSTED THROUGH 06/30/09
COSTS ADVANCED POSTED THROUGH 06/30/09 ,

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL A

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

S AGED ACCOUNTS RECETVABI.E BALANCE QUTSTANDING BY DAYS

) 0-30 31-60 61-90 91-120 OVER 120 TOTAL

**%* REMITTANCE COPY *#*+¥ SUBM\TTEB
ML 17 2008
ELEGTRONlGALLY

Poryment is due upon ceceipt. Interest will be charged on unpaid invoices oged 25 days or more from invoice date,

o Sewiesduignuled with an [*) were perforined under the sirict supervision of admitted atorneys by persons not uggflanl:;? Efﬁ%@@?ﬁiﬁg%@%ﬂmg jusisdiction. -
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ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 8, 2009
2003 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AS POSTED THROUGH JUNE 30, 2009

PHASE L10: CASE ASSESSMENT, DEVELOP & ADMIN

Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY

- 06/01/03 DMT  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF Wi .30
) WITH JOHN BURNETT.
06/02/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF WSt .30
JOHN BURNETT.
06/05/09 DMT  ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT RE umim .40
106/12/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (ENEESSGSENS .40
n e QAR TE JOHN BURNETT.
' '06/12/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH .60
E CLIENT TEAM RE GEEENE
© .06/12/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CASE ISSUES AND STRATEGY .70
L RE SAME.
{ " 06/18/09 JMW REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM .10
|, - CLIENT REGARDING
S
06/13/09 JMW  PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL .50

REGARDING NN (.2); CALL WITH
CLIENTS REGARDING (N
R (- 3)

06/23/09 JMW  CORRESPONDENCE WITH BURNETT REGARDING GERNGNENN .40
2000 8 § PREPARE
MATERIAL AND CORRESPONDENCE AND CALL WITH

BERNIER REGARDING ¢S FREPARATION OF
SAME

T06/24/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF BERNIER CORRESPCONDENCE .30

@ REVISE SAME, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
BERNIER REGARDING REVIEW
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Adano + Miomi * Ordando « St Pelersburg ~ Tuﬂdussee = Tampa * - WA HIEEROD16-100-000169
Qmmdmmdw\lhon('lwuenuhuuduﬂuﬁedndmondudmiﬂaduﬂummbvwsomm&admtﬂedbpmml:lwmﬁ\ecmh'oﬂma iurisdiction.
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PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 8, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE 2
06/26/09 JMW  ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING sy .30
B PREPARE NOTES
_ REGARDING SAME
| 06/23/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE .20
o ' , PREPARE
NOTES REGARDING ¢RI FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT
i REGARDING i
 06/20/09 DMT  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF AgieSassnsseyes .30
- WITH JOHN BURNETT.
06/30/09 JMW  CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING (SN : .20
. PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING
.
Subtotal for Task L120 8 5.00
| ‘Task L140 : DOCUMENT / FILE MANAGEMENT
-06/05/09 KA* ANALYSIS AND REVIEW OF UPCOMING DISCOVERY .40
R DEADLINES
_ _ Subtotal for Task L140 B .40
_-Taslé L190 : OTHER CASE ASSES, DEVEL. & ADMIN
- ,-06[05/09 JMW  ATTEND CLIENT CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING quiliiill .30

(.1) ; ATTEND WEEKLY CALL
WITH CLIENTS REGARDING (NN ( -2)

Subtotal for Task L190 Oy .30

PHASE L20: PRE-TRIAL PLEADINGS AND MOTIONS

 Task L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY
°:06/11/09 JMW CALL WITE CLIENT REGARDING GueusunSuumy . .10
06/12/09 JMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH 2.60

CLIENTS AND TRIPLETT REGARDING

PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME, PREPARE

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aanki » Miomi » Odando * St Petarsburg + Talchasses » Tompa * Wl s SaER 0D 16-100-000170

’. t:.......... .-l..........c...-l with o (% ware rdrrmed under b drict wnacvision of odmitted ofiomevs by persans not admitted b oroctics lkaw in the conlrelling jurisdiction.
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ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 8, 2008
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE 3

CORRESPONDENCE TQO MELSON REGARDING
AND PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS
REGARDING (gl (1.0); REVIEW CLIENT

(.3);
CALL WITH BURNETT REGARDING (NN,
PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME, FOLIOW UP WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING (IEENNENNNGNEE (.3); REVIEW
AND ANALYSIS OF (SNl
CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING QN FOLLOW UP
REGARDING WEMMBWITH MELSON, DISCUSS (NN

FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT REGARDING @ (1.0)

Subtotal for Task L120 2.70

. ‘Task L190 : OTHER CASE ASSES, DEVEL. & ADMIN
 06/01/09 JMW  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (NSNS, 3.00

;. DRAFT AND REVISE MEMO REGARDING
, _ , (2.5);
FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE AND CALLS WITH BERNIER

 REGARDING (N
GRS (.5)

. 06/02/09 JMW REVIEW ADDITIONAL MATERIAL FROM BERNIER ON 2.50

REVIEW

REVISE MEMO, PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING G,
REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING ol (2.5)

Subtotal for Task L130

"N
]

Ul
[~}

Task L230 : COURT MANDATED CONFERENCES

06/16/09 " JMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING .30
AR CREPARE RESPONSE, REVIEW -
VARIOUS CLIENT CORRESPOND
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING~ PREPARE RESPONSE

(.3)

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
: : Aﬂunlu s Miami = Orlondo * 5t Petershurg = Tduha:ue * Tampa * “P&Rguﬁ;fg;ﬁgoms-1mm1n
e Zend dlitancnd a3k e P8 sre rnrbrrenart inelar the et cinansisinn ef rdmited oftomess by oecsans not odmitied Yo oneclice law in the contmlling tudsdiction.
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R CARLTON FIELDS
e _ ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY B, 2003

2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE 4

" p6/11/08 OavMM REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT DOCUMENTS AND 4.50
SR ' EMAILS REGARDING AN

C e e

QNS DRAFT AND REVISE
G FPREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
CLIENTS REGARDING .

" 06/15/09 JMW  CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING“ .10

e ——————————]
CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENTS REGARDING (NG
(.1)

- 06/15/09 JMW HEARING ON ACCOUNTING PETITION (PENSION AND 4.00
- STORM HARDENING COSTS} IN TALLAHASSEE; REVIEW
AND ANALYSIS OF PETITION, INTERVENORS®
RESPONSE, PEF RESPONSE, STAFF RECOMMENDATION,
AND

06/16/09 JMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND AGENDA CONFEREMNCE 6.00
) HEARING ON STAFF RECOMMENDATION ON ACCOUNTING
PETITICN RELIEF, FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT
REGARDINGAN

Subtotal for Task L230 . 12.50

"

~Task L250 OTH WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSION
06/02/09 JMW REVIEW VARIOUS QNN @
06/05/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (REEEESENEg .80

REGARDING SAME, CALI. WITH BURNETT REGARDING
PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME

. 06/24/09 MRBE REVIEW OF STAFF'S 10TH PODS AND 11TH ROGS FOR .60
: OBJECTIONS - DRAFTING OF SAME -

. 06/26/09 MRB CONTINUED RESEARCH (SEESNESSUISSENNINR 1.40
- D ———
fre———————————

_ CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Sws Aflonta = Miami » Odando « St Pefershurg = Tulhhnss&e « Tampa * « WERBRIALEEPD16-100-000172
Q.mmd-mmudm'lhunl‘lwammm&mmm&admlmmhmswmﬁbmmhwm the controfling furisdiction,
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- : ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA - JULY 8, 2009

2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE 5

Subtotal for Task L250 :

Task 1410 : FACT WITNESSES

. 06/05/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS eomuSENSESnERe

B

- _ _ S
SRS CALI, WITH MARCIA OLIVIER
REGARDING N

Subtotal for Task L410

'3Taak L440 : OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPPORT

os/11/oa MRE (Y

_06/15/09 MRS  RESEARCHH

~ 06/19/09 MRB  CONTINUED RESEARCH (RSN

. 06/25/09 MRB RESEARCH - (IS -

' 06/29/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
S | . R PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING GEEER

©06/29/09 MRB  RESEARCH/NENENEERA

Subtotal for Task L4240

PHASE L30: DISCOVERY

" Task L120 ¢ ANALYSIS/STRATEGY

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

.30

.30

.10

.30

2.90

10.60

Atlonta »+ Miomi » Orlando * St Petersburg = Tﬂﬁuhossee * Tampa - WHERGREIMEEROD16-100-000173

Semoetdesumladm!b an [*) were pedormad under the sirict supaovision of admitied oftomays by persons not admilted o pioctice law in the controfling jurisdickion.
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2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087

INVOICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE &

06/1'7/09 JMW REVIEW TRIPLETT AND STAFF CORRESPONDENCE 1.00
REGARDING DEPRECIATION OBJECTIONS AND ISSUES,
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING
CALL WITH LEE AND GARRRETT
REGARDING (RPN 2D RESPOND TO

CLIENTS REGARDING GENENGIGG——

 06/18/09 JMW PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH 2.00
| ROBINSON, GARRETT, AND LEE REGARDING QMRS

. FOLLOW UP
CORR.ESPONDENCE WITH GARRRETT AND LEE REGARDING

.06/25/09 JMW  REVIEW (I, 1.20
: - WITH BERNIER, FOLLOW UP RESEARCH
(.2); FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING i,
(.2); REVIEW

C
NS, FCOLLOW UP WITH BERNIER REGARDING SAME,
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TQO TRIPLETT AND BERNIER
REGARDING QN | .-); REVIEW CLIENT
CORRESPONDENCE AND FPL CORRESPONDENCE, FOLLOW
UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME {.1); FOLLOW UP
WITH TRIFLETT ON CAEEEERTD
G . 2)

© . 06/26/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF STATUS OF DISCOVERY 1.30
: CONCERNING OPC 10TH POD, OPC 8TH ROG AND
STAFF'S 10TH ROGS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLIENT
REGARDINGUEER DRAFT NOTICE OF SERVICE OF
RESPONSES TO OPC 8TH ROGS AND STAFF'S 10TH

ROGS; _
' 06/29/09 JMW PREPARE FOR AND REVIEW ROBINSON AND CLIENT 1.00
CORRESPONDENCE (EENNGEGE

ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL,
PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME, PREPARE

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
REVIEW PREPARE NOTES,

FOLLOW UP WITH BERNIER REGARDING*
a_——

Subtotal for Task L120 : 6.50

. Task L190 : OTHER CASE ASSES, DEVEL. & ADMIN

CARLITON FIELDS, PA.
E Allania = Migmi * Ordando * 5t Petecsburg + l'ulbhnssee * Tampa = - RARPIREERRD16-100-000174
c...w-... Aacinnniad with a1 were nefarmad under the strict supervision of admitied aliomeys by persans not admitiad to prodiice law in the contolling jurisdiction.
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ATTORNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 8, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE 7
; 05/17/d9 Kp* REVIEW/ANALYZE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION .40

REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE TO OPC'S 3RD
INTERROGATORIES, #118 AND STAFF'S 5TH REQUEST
FOR PRODUCTION, #37

Subtotal for Task L1990 : .40
'Frask L250 : OTH WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSION

- 06/02/09 MRB REVISIONS/REVIEW OF OBJECTIONS TQ STAFF 1.10
- . DISCOVERY FOR FILING TODAY (0.6);

CONFIDENTIALITY REQUEST FOR OPC DISCOVERY

REQUESTED BY STAFF (0.5)

' 06/03/09 MRB DRAFT/REVISIONS TO THIRD CONFIDENTIALITY 2.30
S REQUEST, AFFIDAVITS IN SUPPORT HEREOF, AND
JUSTIFICATION MATRIX IN SUPPORT THEREOF.

06/04/09 MRB COMPLETED DRAFTING ASSEMBLING CONFIDENTIALITY i.10
: REQUEST AND NECESSARY DOCUMENTATION FOR FILING

WITH PSC {0.6}; REVISIONS TO RESPONSE TO

STAFF'S 5TH ROGS (0.5)

" “06/08/09 MRB REVISIONS TO OBJECTIONS TO OPC'S 7TH ROGS TO 1.40
; INCLUDE EXCEEDING DISCOVERY LIMITS; REVISIONS
TO RESPONSE TO OPC'S 6TH ROGS:

' ps/ds/og MRB REVISIONS TO OBJECTIONS TO OPC'S 7TH ROGS. .50
.. 06/09/0% MRB PREPARED TPO FOR CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION .70

- o PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TO OPC POD 8
'“-05/16/09 MRB  PREPARED OBJECTIONS TO OPC'S 10TH PODS 1.00

o (229-251)
06/17/09 MRB PREPARED CBJECTIONS TO OPC'S 8TH ROGS; * 2.10
| REVISIONS TO RESPONSES TC QPC'S 7TH ROGS

06/22/09 MRB PREPARED TPO FOR OPC'S 9TH POD PRODUCTION .30
_ 06’/23./09 MRB REVIEW OF STAFF'S STH PODS AND 11TH ROGS FOR .80

OBRJECTIONS - DRAFTING OF SAME

* "05/26/09 MRE  DRAFTING NOI FOR INFORMATION REQUESTEDL IN .60
- ' ' STAFF'S 10TH ROGS (COMPENSATION)

CARLTON FIELDS, PA. -
: Afonta = Miomi * Oxlando = St Petersburg « Tuﬁuhussee » Tampa » VRRPPIMABERQRD16-100-000175
. Qarvirae dadnanatad with an [*] wars nerformed under the siict supervision of admitted atiocneys by persons not admitted to practice kaw in the controlling Iunsd‘adm
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ATTORMNEYS AT LAW
PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 8, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 0Q0309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE 8
05/29/09 MRB REVISIONS TO RESPONSE TO OPC'S BTH ROGS; 2.40

DRAFTED TPO FOR RESPONSE TO OPC'S 10TH PODS;
OBJECTIONS TO OPCS 11TH PODS, 9TH ROGS, STAFF'S

16TH ROGS
] Subtotal for Task L250 : 14.30
- Task L310 : WRITTEN DISCOVERY
. 06/01/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT RESPONSES AND .70

L DOCUMENTS TO PRODUCE IN DISCOVERY (0.4); FOLLOW
' UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE ¢SSR (0.3).

| .06/01/09 DMT PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH 1.10
RS MASCEQ DESCHAMPS AND TEAM RE (GGG '
fooe N

R, ] 2.80
S FOR CLIENT REPRESENTATIVES; PREPARE DISCOVERY
RESPONSES TO STAFF'S 3RD RE(Q FOR PRODUCTION

06/02/09 DMT DISCUSS DISCOVERY RESPONSES WITH KATHERINE .90
S FLEMING (0.4) AND CHARLES REHWINKEL (0.5).
©06/02/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF WSS 2.60
S ORI I T CLIENT TEAMS,

(2.2); REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF DRAFT OBJECTIONS AND DISCOVERY TO
FINALIZE FILING OF SAME (0.4).

. 06/02/09 JMW REVIEW — .20
. CEEEEEETEEENEN PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO

LEE REGARDING GHENSSERSSEENNENNE FOLLOW UP

WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING @M COMMUNICATIONS

WITH STAFF

'06/03/09 DMT REVIEW QNS 1.10
C WITH KAREN WATESKA AND LINDA

b . CONSTANTINO (0.8); FOLLOW Ur WITH CLIENT TEAMS

e : RE

'06/03/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF QEEENEEENENEENED 1.90
{0.6); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS
WITH CLIENT TEAMS (1.3).

"CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
B Atlonte = Miomi * Orando = St Petersburg = Tolhlmssee * Tompa = WERRRRTRERROD16-100-000176
. Semcas dmmd w‘ﬂ\ an (*] were performed under the strict supervision of odmified attorneys by persoas act admitted ko practice law in the controliing futisdiction.
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- INVOICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE 9

106/03/09

1 06/03/09

. 06/04/09

06/04/09

tf‘_'os/o4/09

06/05/09

06/05/09

JMW .

SG*

DMT

DMT

DMT

DMT

REVIEW AND ANMALYSIS OF VARIOUS DRAFT ANSWERS TO
DISCOVERY REGARDING
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS
REGARDIN_GBCALL WITH BEURIS REGARDING
REVIEW CLIENT RESPONSES (.8);
REVIEW RIB CORRESPONDENCE (NEENNNARRRNENNND
CORRESPONDENCE WITH RIB

SRR
REGARDING Gumih (.2) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
CORRESPONDENCE AND MEMOS REGARDING (EENENNENED

ORI
CORRESPONDENCE WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING QD
GNP (.2) ; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF STAFF
RELIABILITY ROGS AND PODS, REVIEW AND RESPOND
TO CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING GHEED (.2)

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT RESPONSES
CONTAINED IN RMS FOR FIPUG'S THIRD SET OF
INTERROGATORIES; DRAFT RESPONSE FORMAL RESPONSE
-

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SEENEEEE
WITH MASCEO DESCHAMPS.

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GRENNNNENNNNNND
GRS W I TH CLIENT, INCLUDING
_

G (1 .2) ; REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF DRAFT OBJECTIONS AND DISCOVERY TO
FINALIZE FILING OF SAME (0.4).

CALLS WITH CINDY LEE REGARDING GINEEEENEENEND

e ——
O R EPARE NOTES REGARDING
SAME ' ‘

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GNNENNE
QR 2ND FOLIOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE
o

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SUPPLEMENTAL DOCUMENTS
TO BE PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TO PENDING DISCOVERY
AND FINALIZE SAME FOR FILING {(0.1); REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF RESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS FOR
CONFIDENTIALITY AND RESPONSIVENESS (0.3);
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF NEW DISCOVERY RECEIVED
FROM INTERVENERS (0.1).

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

.20

.60

.60

.60

.10

.BO

.50

Aflonta « Miomi + Ordondo « St Petersburg Tuﬂu{msee * Tampa = VIR RSRITAEERQD16-100-000177

E Semcs dﬁunaled with an [*] were perormed under the strict supervision of admitted afiomeys by parsans not admitied fo proctice law in the controlling furisdiction,
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06/06/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GEEEREENNNGNNENEND 1.30
o QEEREEERRRSMEp AND SEND SAME TO
CLIENT TEAM (AR
' 06/08/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GENEEENSNNNENNN 1.20

MASCEO DESCHAMPS AND TEAM (0.9); FOLLOW UP WITH
CLIENT TEAMS RE

0.3).
- 06/08/09 DMT FOLLOW UP WITH FPL ATTORNEY RE COMPENSATION .10
DISCOVERY.
06/08/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS AND .80

INTERROGATORY RESPONSES TO ENSURE TIMELY
SERVICE AND FILING (0.4); DISCUSS AR
O W ITH CLIENT TEAM (0.2);
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY
SERVED IN CASE (0.2).

' '06/08/09 JC* PREPARING RESPONSES TO OPC 8TH REQUESTS FOR 3.80
: PRODUCTION AND 6TH INTERROGATORIES

‘06/08/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF G 3.00
o L ]

_ AND DRAFT (NN
O PREPARE REVISIONS AND
COMMENTS TO SAME, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
CLIENTS REGARDING @GSN (1.5); REVIEW
") CI.IENT AND TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE,
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT AND BERNIER REGARDING
O, FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE
WITH CLIENTS REGARDING

- REVIEW AND ANALYSIS
OF DRAFT OBJECTIONS, PREPARE RESPONSE REGARDING
SAME, CORRESPQNDENCE AND CALLS WITH CLIENTS
REGARDING (D (1.5)

06/09/09 DMT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS .30

'06/09/09 JC* PREPARE RESPONSES TO FIPUG 3RD REQUESTS FOR 2.50
: ' PRODUCTION AND 3RD INTERROGATORIES .

. 06/09/09 JMW REVIEW REVISED OBJECTIONS, REVISE SAME, PREPARE .30
. CORRESPONDENCE TO BERNIER REGARDING SAME (.1);
CALLS WITH HOLDSTEIN AND OLIVIER REGARDING

CENL, CRPARE CORRESPONDENCE
TRIPLETT AND BERNIER REGARDING SAME (.2)

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflonta = Miaomi * Odando » St Petensburg + Tuﬂshasm » Tampa » VWIRRSRRARERED16-100-000178

1 i_. cwm.lamhdmrhml*\mnm-hnmdundmﬂeshdsmemnmnfudmﬂadm&vmnsnotudmubdbpm:hceluwmlhecomulimqmnsdncﬁon
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- 06/10/09 DMT

.06/10/09 DMT

. 0e/10/09 JC*

 06/10/09 JMW

' 06/11/09 DMT

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS AND
INTERROGATORY RESPONSES TO CONFIRM
CONFIDENTIALITY AND FINALIZE FOR PRODUCTION

(2.1); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF =
' ' ' ' (0.7); FOLLOW UP WITH
. . (0.1).

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DISCOVERY FOLLOW UPR
QUESTIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR OPC (0.2); DISCUSS
OBJECTIONS RE EXCEEDING NUMERICAL COUNT WITH
OPC COUNSEL AND (NN CLIENT OF (NN (0.1).

LAST MINUTE CHANGES TO DISCOVERY RESPONSES,
PREPARE FOR FILING AND SERVE RESPONSES TO FIPUG
3RD REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION, FIPUG 3RD
INTERROGATORIES, OPC 8TH REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION
AND OPC 6TH INTERROGATORIES

REVIEW LEE. CORRESPONDENCE, REVIEW DISCOVERY AND

I REVIEW CLIENT AND ROBINSON

RESPONSES, PREPARE RESPONSE (.2); REVIEW CLIENT

CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING iV
REVIEW STAFF DISCOVERY

. REQUESTS AND

...'; PREPARE RESPONSE TO CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING REVIEW AND RESPCND TO

CLIENT RESPONSE (.5
TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT

AND TRIPLETT REGARDING _.

, FOLLOW WITH CLIENTS
REGARDING {.6) ; REVIEW CLIENT COMMENTS AND
FOLLOW UP

WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME (.2)

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPCNSIVE DOCUMENTS FOR
CONFIDENTIALITY (0.2); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
DRAFT INTERROGATORY RESPONSES AND DOCUMENT
REQUESTS TO FINALIZE SAME FOR FILING AND
SERVICE (1.3); FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE

(0.3.); DRAFT REVISED
RESPONSES TO SUPFPLEMENT BASED ON REQUEST FROM
OPPOSING COUNSEL (0.3); FOLLOW UOP WITH CLIENT
TEAMS RE

SRS (O .2) .

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT AND

.30

1.50

Atllonto *+ Miomi * Odando » S Petersburg = Talbhassu » Tampa * WigRRaSTR#REOD16-160-000179

Semm dosgnntu:! with an {*} were performed under the skict supervision of admitted aftorneys by pesons not admilted to prociice low in the contralling jurisdiction.
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. 06/11/09

. 06/12/09

. 06/12/09

06/12/09

.. 06/12/09

- 06/13/09

" . 06/14/09

06/15/09

06/15/09

JMW

DMT

DMT

JC*

DMT

DMT

DMT

REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT AND TRIPLETT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT
REGARDING SAME

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DISCOVERY ISSUES AND
OBJECTIONS WITHE KATHERINE FLEMING.

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT RESPONSES TO

FINALIZE SAME FOR FILING AND SERVICE AND ENSURE

PROPER FILINGS (0.8); FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT
TEAMS RE

S ————————————————— e
(0.5) ; DISCUSS (NN
_ WITH RICHARD REILAND (0.4).

PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE RESPONSES TO STAFF'S
S5TH INTERROGATORIES AND &TH REQUEST FOR
PRODUCTION

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT, TRIPLETT
CORRESPONDENCE AND i
PREPARE RESPONSES REGARDING SAME, FOLLOW UP
WITH CLIENT, TRIPLETT, AND EXPERT REGARDING
REVIEW AND PREPARE RESPONSE REGARDING
Y RESPONSES TO STAFF ROGS, REVIEW
CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE

(1.2); REVIEW SENInRRRRMERSERRAhRE

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS STAFF AND OPC
INTERROGATORY AND DOCUMENT REQUESTS, PREPARE
NOTES REGARDING SAME, CORRESPONDENCE WITH
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF
AND FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE
STATUS OF Gl

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF NN
GOSN TH CLIENT TEAMS (1.2); REVIEW AND

FOLLOW UP WITH KATHERINE FLEMING RE PENDING
DISCOVERY.

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

.20

.70

.80

.10

AHarta = Miaomi * Orondo ¢ 5t Patersburg + Tallkhasses * Tampa + VWOSRPGRTAESEOD16-100-000180

:‘ : Servim Jesngnufed with an [*) were pedormed under the strict supervision of admitted attorneys by persans not adkitied to peuctice low in the contolling furisdiction. ‘
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© 06/15/09
06/15/09

" 06/15/09

06/16/09

06/16/09

1 06/16/09

06/16/09

os/17/0%9

DMT

JC*

DMT

DMT

JC*

S58%

DMT

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF FINAL INTERROGATORY
RESPONSES AND DOCUMENT REQUESTS TO FINALIZE
SAME FOR FILING AND SERVICE.

PREPARING, FILING AND SERVING RESPONSES TO
STAFF'S 6TH INTERROGATORIES AND 7TH REQUEST FOR
PRODUCTION

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF quEESSRSRERReSulimg
FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT AND BERNIER REGARDING
CEEENUENEENN); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS
CLIENT AND TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

PREPARE RESPONSES
AND FOLLOW UP REGARDING SAME

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF PENDING DISCOVERY
REQUESTS AND RESPONSES (1.2); FOLLOW UP WITH
CLIENT TEAMS RE (NN (0.5);
@M WITH JOHN BURNETT RE (EEEENNS (0.2)
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS FOR
RESPONSIVENESS AND CONFIDENTIALITY (0.4);
REVIEW. AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT OBJECTIONS (0.2);
DIscuss
WITH CINDY LEE (0.6).

DISCUSS OBJECTIONS AND FOLLOW UP ISSUES RE
DISCOVERY WITH KATHERINE FLEMING AND NSNS

SR
AP0 EE SENT TO CLIENT
]

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS
REGARDING RESPONSE TO STAFF'S INTERROGATORY
NUMBER 97

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF PENDING DISCOVERY
REQUESTS AND RESPCONSES, DOCUMENTS FOR
RESPONSIVENESS AND CONFIDENTIALITY (1.1);
FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE @
(0.2) ; FOLLOW UP WITH WALLS RE GlNENS
0.1);

FOLILOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAM RE

0.2).

CARITON FIELDS, PA.

.70

.60

.20

Allantc * Miami * Orando * St Pelersburg = Talhhossee » Tompa + VASRPRRAREROD16-100-000181

Samces desianoted with on (*} were petformed under the strict suparvision of admitted otforneys by persons not admilied 1o proctice law in the controlling jurisdiction,
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- 06/17/09 JC*  PREPARING, FILING AND SERVING PEF SUPPLEMENTAL 3.00
A RESPONSE OPC 5TH INTERROGATORY NO. 207;
SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE OPC 3RD INTERROGATORY
L NOS, 118, 131 & 132; SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE
RN ' STAFF 5TH INTERROGATORY NO. 97B
. 06/17/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT ANSWERS TO OPC'S 6.00

7TH ROGS, REVISE SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH BERNIER
REGARDING SAME, PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
CLIENTS REGARDING @S CALL WITH CLIENT
REGARDING M, REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING (I, PREPARE RESPONSE (1.7); REVIEW
AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS TRIPLETT, BERNIER, AND
CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING n
REVIEW SAME,
e T NOTICES OF FILING AND SERVICE, CORRESPONDENCE
AND CALLS WITH CLIENTS (MARITZA) REGARDING (Hi
(1.3); CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH WATESKA,

STRIGHT, AND LITTLE _REGARDING'=~
RNy REVIEW '
FOLLOW UP WITH

N CLIENT REGARDING {8 (2.5); REVIEW OBJECTIONS,
A NOTICES, FOLLOW UP WITH BERNIER REGARDING QNN

e RS (- 5)

. .06/18/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLIENT AND BERNIER 3.00
e f CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO BERNIER REGARDING SAME;
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT RESPONSES TO OPC
7TH ROGS, OPC 9TH PODS, STAFF'S 7TH ROGS,
STAFF'S 8TH ROGS, AND STAFF'S BTH PoDS, (NG
CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS AND
BERNIER REGARDING SAME, REVIEW AND RESPOND TO
BERNIER AND CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING
@E; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF

06/19/09 JMW CALLS WITH STAFF COUNSEL REGARDING DISCOVERY .30
: ' CLARIFICATIONS, MEETING REGARDING DEPRECIATION
ISSUES AND OBJECTIONS, FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT
REGARDING (N

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflanta = Miomi * Orlando = St Petecshurg = Toﬂahussee = Tamps » WORRPLET 856E80016-100-000182

1 Somcm de.slgnuted with o [*] were parformed under the sirict supervision of admitted cttomeys by persons not admifted 1o prudtice law in the controlling jurisdictios.
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CORRESPONDENCE AND CALLS WITH VARIQUS CLIENTS 1.50
REGARDING SRR

- _ , REVIEW AND
ANALYSIS OF SAME, FOLLOW UP WITH EGALS,
BERNIER, AND CLIENTS REGARDING _

. '06/20/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS @y 2.00

REVISE SAME AND
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENTS REGARDING

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS VARIOUS
DISCOVERY RESPONSES, REVISE SAME, PREPARE
SUPPLEMENTAL FILINGS

- .06/22/09 JC* PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE DISCOVERY RESPONSES TO 4.00

OPC 7TH INTERROGATORIES AND NINTH REQUEST FOR
PRODUCTION; PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE DISCOVERY
RESPONSES TO STAFF'S 7TH INTERROGATORIES, 8TH

' INTERROGATORIES AND EIGHTH REQUEST FOR
PRODUCTION; PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE
SUPPLEMENTAL DISCOVERY RESPCNSES TO
SUPPLEMENTAL: RESPONSE TO OPC 6TH
INTERROGATORIES NO. 239; PREPARE, FILE AND
SERVE CORRECTED SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE TO OPC
STH INTERROGATORIES NO. 207

-u'”06/22f09 JMW REVIEW FINAL ANSWERS TO OPC AND STAFF ROGS, 2.50

CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE AND DOCUMENTS, DRAFT
ANSWERS TO ROG 303 AND 306, FOLLOW UP WITH
BERNIER REGARDING SAME (1.0) ; guEmmp

T

124, FOLI.OW UP WITH BERNIER REGARDING SAME
(1.0); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ADDITIONAL OPC
AND STAFF DISCOVERY, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING
SAME (.5)

L 06/22/09 . 85* REVIEW AND AMALYSIS OF RESPONSES TO STAFF'S 4.30

SEVENTH SET OF INTERROGATORIES, STAFF'S EIGHTH
SET OF INTERROGATORIES AND OPC!S SEVENTH SET OF
INTERROGATORIES; COMMUNICATION WITH CLIENT
REGARDING @V} REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFTS
REGARDING SAME

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Adlanla = Miami = Cxlando = St Petershurg = Tunahum = Tampe + VERPSTAERHOD16-100-000183

1 Samf:s desrgnu‘lad with on [*] were performed under the sirict supervision of admitted aftorneys by persans not admified ks peactica kaw in the confrofling jurisdiction.
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o 06/23/09 JC* = REVIEW DOCUMENTS SENT FROM KAREN WATESKA AND 3,70
‘ : BOB GRASSMAN FOR gl
GRS CONVERT EXCEL
AND WORD DOCUMENTS TO PDF FORMAT, RETURN
DOCUMENTS
06/23/09 JMW  CORRESPONDENCE WITH BERNIER REGARDING (NN 1.70
- 7

(.2); REVIEW
BERNIER CORRESPONDENCE AND DRAFT ANSWERS TO
STAFF 9TH ROGS, PREPARE RESPONSE REGARDING SAME
(.2); CORRESPONDENCE AND/OR CALLS WITH
ROBINSON, LEE, AND REILAND REGARDING

PREPARE NOTES REGARDING SAME {.7);
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND ADDITIONAL NOTES TO
TRIPLETT REGARDING

GEmEENlD (.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND

TRIPLETT REGARDING U
ORI CAL1S WITH CLIENTS REGARDING
O . 3 )

1 06/23/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSES GENNEND -80

REGARDING STAFF'S NINTH INTERROGATORIES; DRAFT
RESPONSE REGARDING SAME

06/24/09 JC* PREPARE DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE STAFF'S 9TH 1.00
o INTERROGATORIES NOS. 119-122

0_6/24 /09 JIMW REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 2.10

T S TAFF
COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING gl QU :. D
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TOQ CLIENTS REGARDING
G C2LL WITH CLIENT REGARDING

(.4); REVIEW VARIOUS CLIENT AND EXPERT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

CALLS WITH CLIENTS

REGARDING @lEp (.4) ; CALL, WITH KATHERINE
FLEMING REGARDING DEPRECIATION OBJECTIONS, CALL
WITH STAFF TECHNICAL PERSON, AND
CONFIDENTIALITY ISSUES REGARDING COMPENSATION
DISCOVERY REQUESTS, PREPARE NOTES REGARDING
SAME (.5); CALLS WITH GARRETT AND LEE REGARDING
I CCRRESPONDENCE WITH GARRETT AND LEE
REGARDING GEENENNN (-4) ; CORRESPONDENCE

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Aflanta » Miami * Orando * St Petersburg » Tolh!nssae * Tampa * WERPREAEEROD16-100-000184
Servmdesnnuiadvnlhr:m[‘]mpﬂfome&wdu!heshdsummofudm&ﬁduﬂamysbypsmn&admﬁbdbpnxﬁce[uwmthecontm!hngIunsdlchcm
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. 06/25/09
©06/25/09
. 06/25/09
‘95/25709
- 06/25/09

' 06/25/09

- 06/26/09

- 06/26/09

Semm deagnuied with-an [*) were patformed under the strict suparvision of admitted atiomeys by persons not odmified to practice law in the controfling jusisdiction,

DMT

JC*

JC*

S5*

S5*

DMT

DMT

WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING
(.2); CALL WITH ALEX GLENN REGARDING

G (.2)

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT DISCOVERY

RESPONSES (0.6); FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE

(0.8);

FILE NOTICE AND SERVE RESPONSES TO STAFF'S 9TH
INTERROGATORIES NOS. 119 THROUGH 122

FILE NOTICE AND SERVE RESPONSES TO OPC 4TH
INTERROGATORIES NOS. 50-59 AND 5TH PODS NOS.
75-80

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

FOLLOW UP WITH BERNIER AND CLIENT
REGARDING B (.2) ; REVIEW STATUS OF
OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY WITH TRIPLETT, DISCOVERY
RESPONSES, OBJECTIONS, SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSES,

PCLIENT FOLLOW UP (.4); CALLS AND
CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENTS REGARDING
(.2}

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSE TO STAFF'S
NINTH SET OF INTERROGATORIES; COMMUNICATION
WITH ATTORNEYS REGARDING COMPLETENESS OF
RESPONSES AND SERVICE; DRAFT NOTICE OF SERVICE
OF PEF'S RESPONSE TO STAFF'S NINTH SET OF
INTERROGATORIES AND SERVE SAME

REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIDENTIAL MATRIX /CHART
PROVIDED TO STAFF TO INCLUDE CURRENT
INFORMATION

FOLLOW UP WITH OUTSIDE EXPERT RE PRODUCTION OF
DOCUMENTS .

PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL RE
IR (¢ .5} ; DISCUSS G
WITH

e e 4
CLIENT TEAM (0.4); FOLLOW UP WITH FPL RE
RESPONSES TO SAME (0.3).

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

1.50

.80

.70

.30

1.60

Aflanta + Miami * Orlondo + St Pelershurg » Tu!hhusm * Tampa = WISRFaBTRESD16-100-000185
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06/26/09

06/26/09

. 06/29/09

- 06/29/09

06/29/09

55*

sS8*

DMT

DMT

CARLTON FIELDS

'06/26/09 bMT = REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT DISCOVERY

RESPONSES AND DOCUMENTS (1.6); FQLLOW UP
REGARDING SUPPLEMENTING AND RESPONDING TO SAME
(0.5).

06/26/09 JMW REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ADDITIONAL MEMOS ON

G CORRESPONDENCE WITH BERNIER AND

TRIPLETT REGARDING (NN (.4); REVIEW
TRIPLETT AND OPC CORRESPONDENGE REGARDING
SUPPLEMENTAL DISCOVERY REQUESTS, FOLLOW UP
TRIPLETT REGARDING SAME, REVIEW CLIENT
DOCUMENTS, FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT, REGARDING
SAME (.6); FOLLOW UP WITH TRIPLETT REGARDING

1)

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF ATTACHMENTS TO PEF'S
RESPONSE TO STAFF'S 10TH SET QF ROGS REGARDING
CONFIDENTIALITY

PREPARE EMAIL TO KATHERINE FLEMING REGARDING
RESPONSES TO STAFF'S NINTH SET OF
INTERROGATORIES

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT RESPONSES AND
DOCUMENTS TO FINALIZE FOR SERVICE AND ENSURE
PROPER CONFIDENTIALITY TREATMENT (2.3); FOLLOW
UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE NEENENEREN

T T T T —
T I

DISCUSS CCMPENSATICN DISCOVERY WITH FPL TO
ENSURE COORDINATION OF RESPONSE; FOLLOW UP WITH

CLIENT RE GENE)-

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS CORRESPONDENCE AND
DOCUMENTS FROM CLIENT AND EXPERT REGARDING GNP
PREPARE NOTES, RESPONSES
REGARDING SAME (.5); REVIEW TRIPLETT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL
DISCOVERY, PREPARE RESPONSES REGARDING SAME
(.2); REVIEW CLIENT AND TRIPLETT CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING Gl
GEEENEEEP PREPARE RESPONSES (.3)

CARLTON FiELDS, PA.

.70

.20

3.40

.40

1.00

Atlants * Miomi * Ordando '« 5. Petersburg o Tuﬁnhussee * Tampa * WesPdmdmprD16-100-000186

Servu:as desugnqlad with an {*) ware performed under the strict supervision of admitied atomeys by persons aot adimitted ko pioctice low in the contralling jusisdiction.
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"*06/29/09 S8*

©06/30/09 DMT

' '06/30/09 DMT

. 06/30/09 JMW

- 06/01/09 MRB
~ '06/02/09 MRB
.1 06/03/09 MRB

- 06/03/09 ss*

3.Los/o3/os 55*

- 06/04/09 MRB

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSES TO STAFF'S
10TH SET OF INTERROGATORIES AND QPC'S EIGHTH
SET OF INTERROGATORIES; COMMUNICATIONS WITH

CLIENT REGARDING SAME (NN
]

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT RESPONSES AND
DOCUMENTS (0.4); FOLLOW UP WITH CLIENT TEAMS RE

R (O . 5 ) .

DRAFT SERIES OF EMAILS COMMUNICATING RESPONSES
TO OPC COUNSEL ON VARIOUS ISSUES AND OBJECTIONS
RAISED WITH RESPECT TO DISCOVERY RESPONSES.

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS TRIPLETT
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING

_ Y
ORI,  CREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME

Subtotal for Task L3110 :

DOCUMENT PRODUCTION

REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS RE-SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO
OPC POD 1446, 150

REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS FOR RESPONSE TO OPC;

REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO OPC'S 8TH
PODS; FIPUG'S 3RD REQUESTS; OPC'S 6TH ROGS;
'BEGAN REVIEW OF STAFF &TH POD

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS DOCUMENTS GNEWSENED 1N
RESPONSE TO FIPUG'S THIRD REQUEST FOR
PRODUCTION; DRAFT RESPONSE TO SAME

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO
OPC'S EIGHTH REQUEST FOR PRODUCTICN, OPC'S
SIXTH SET OF INTERROGATORIES, STAFF'S SIXTH
REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION, STAFF'S FIFTH SET OF
INTERROGATORIES AND STAFF'S SIXTH SET OF
INTERROGATORIES; COMMUNICATION WITH CLIENT
REGARDING WD

CONTINUED REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO
STAFF'S 6TH POD, 5TH ROG

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

.60

.20

132 .80

1.00

5.79

.80

1.406

Allanka » Miomi * Odando * St Petersburg Taﬂuhassee * Tampa « WeRPSHGERIDD16-100-000187

mdes:gnu!edvnﬁmn{"] wepshrmadmdu&emsnpemsmafqdmmeduﬂmneysbypersonsnolodm?ﬁadbp:mhwmlhacanaamng jurisdiction.
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. 06/05/09

u;  °$/05/D9

“'96/03/09

06/09/09

-06/09/03

06/09/09

- 06/10/09

06/10/09

. 06/10/09

06/11/09

' - 06/12/09

06/15/09

06/16/09

8g*

KAa*

KA*

REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED TO QPC FOR
CONFIDENTIALITY;

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SUPPLEMENTAL DOCUMENTS
RESPONSIVE TO OPC'S SIXTH REQUEST FOR
PRODUCTION NUMBERS 146 AND 150 CONCERNING
CONFIDENTIALITY; COMMUNICATION WITH CLIENT
REGARDING W

REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED IN RESPONSE
TO OBC'S 6TH ROGS, 8TH PODS

ANALYSIS AND STATUS OF DISCOVERY DUE WEEK OF
6/8
REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS FOR OPC ROG &6; POD 8

REVISIONS TO RESPONSE TO OPC 6TH ROG; OPC BTH
PCD; FIPUG 3RD ROG

ANALYSIS AND STATUS OF DISCOVERY DUE WEEK OF
6/8

CONTINUED REVIEW OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FOR QPC
POD 8, ROG 6; STAFF'S S5TH ROGS AND 6TH PODS;
BEGAN REVIEW OF STAFF 6TH ROG 7TH POD

ASSEMBLET} MISSING RESPONSES TO STAFF'S 5TH ROGS
(0.4)

FURTHER REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS TO BE FRODUCED TO
STAFF (6TH POD)

REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS FOR STAFF'S 6TH PODS -
COORDINATED REPLACEMENT OF CCRRUPTED DOCUMENT
WITH BARBARA DEAN, REMOVED NON RESPONSIVE
DOCUMENTS; REVIEW COF RESPONSE DOCUMENT; WORKED
ON RESPONSES TO STAFF'S 6TH ROGS

DOCUMENTS TO BE FRODUCED TO STAFF 6TH ROG;
REVISIONS TC DRAFT RESPONSE FOR 6TH ROGS

REVIEWED DOCUMENTS IN STAFF'S 7TH ROGS, 8TH

ROGS AND PODS, OPC'S 7TH ROGS AND STH PODS FOR
RESPONSIVENESS AND CONFIDENTIALITY, U

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

00309-38087

.50

.50

.40

.40

-50

Aforio » Miami » Orando * Sb. Petersburg » Tauahmae * Tampa * WrorkegtAFRAOD16-100-000188

Semm da.ngnnled with an [*) were perfomed under the shict supervision of admitted aftormeys by persons not admitted fo practice kaw in the contralling jurisdicfion.
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06/17/09
06/17/09

 06/17/09
- 06/18/09
©.06/15/09

- 06/19/09

- 06/19/09

06/22/09

 06/22/69

- 06/23/09

- 06/24/09
- 06/25/09

- 06/26/09

KA*

MRB

S5*

55*

ANALYSIS OF DISCOVERY THAT IS DUE

REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS - OPC'S 7TH ROGS, STH POD;
SUPPLEMENTAL FILINGS TO OPC'S 3RD ROGS

COMMUNICATED WITH LINDA MILLER AND DEBORAH

MCSWAIN REGARDING
@ES; EMAILED ED LYNCH REGARDING
o4

; CALLED MARCIA
OLIVIER REGARDING GEEEENNNS

REVISING RESPONSE TO OPC'S ROG 7, STAFF'S 8TH
ROGS; STAFF'S 7TH ROGS - (Y

AS WELL AS MARCIA OLIVER, LINDA
MILLER AND DEBORAH MCSWAIN

MANAGING ASSIMILATION OF AND REVISING RESPONSE
TO OPC'S ROG 7

REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS FOR OPC POD 9
(RESPONSIVENESS, CONFIDENTIALITY, ETC).

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENT RESPONSIVE TD
OPC'S REQUEST 227 CONCERNING WG

@I COMMUNICATIONS TO CLIENT REGARDING
ame :

PREPARING RESPONSES DUE TODAY - OPC 7TH ROG,
9TH POD; STAFF 7TH, 8TH ROG, BTH POD

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT RESPONSES TO QOPC'S
NINTH REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION AND STAFF'S EIGHTH
REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION,; COMMUNICATION WITH
CLIENT REGARDINGGEEEE REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFTS
REGARDING SAME

REVIEW OF RESPONSES TO STAFF'S 9TH ROGS

REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED TQ CGPC 10TH
PGD

REVIEW OF STAFF'S 9TH ROG RESPONSES; REVIEW OF
DOCUMENTS FOR OPC 10TH PODS

REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION: OPC 10TH
PCD; 8TH ROGS;

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

Q0309-38087

.70

.30

.50

.30

-70

2.40

2.50

e Atlanta = Miomi = Orendo ¢ 5t Petersburg » Talhhussae = Tompa » VWOERFETASEEOD16-100-000189
S Sennczs desugmled with an [*} were performed under the sfrict supervision of admitted oforneys by persons not admitied to practice low in the controlfing jurisdiction.
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P 06/29/09 KPx REVIEW/ANALYZE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION .50

REGARDING OPC POD 10 # 231 & 232

% 06/29/09 MRB SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE TO OPC'S BTH POD, #202; 1.30
g OBC 8TH ROGS;

.06/29/09 MRB REVIEW OF STAFF'S 11TH PODS, 13, 14, 15 ROGS 1.00
o FOR OBJECTIONS; REVIEW OF RESPONSES TO B8TH
ROGS; 10TH PODS

06/29/09 SS*  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSE TO OPC'S TENTH - 3.40
B SET OF REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION; COMMUNICATIONS
WITH CLIENT REGARDING

.06/30/09 MRB  DOCUMENT REVIEW STAFF'S 9TH & 10TH PODS, 11TH-& 2.10
& | 12TH ROGS
. 06/30/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE TO 1.80

CPC 5TH ROG NUMBER 192; ORGANIZE FILING AND
SERVICE OF SAME

Subtotal for Task L320 3 70.40
Task L390 : OTHER DISCOVERY
b f__,.-;'o'é-”/'a_s_/qg JMW  CALL WITH WILL GARRETT REGARDING Q. 1.80
e w—

SETPARMRSRRENRNNE FGARDING SAME, AND PREPARE
NOTES REGARDING SAME, ISSUE, STRATEGY; REVIEW
DISCOVERY REGARDING SAME, ISSUES RAISED

Subtotal for Task L3930 8 1.80
. Task L430  : WRITTEN MOTIONS & SUBMISSIONS
'06/22/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RESPONSE TO OPC"S 9TH .60
. ‘ POD REGARDING CONFIDENTIALITY
Subtotal for Task 430 H .50

" .Task L440 : OTH TRTAL PRRPARATION & SUPPORT

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
) Aflanta * Miomi = Orlondo + St Petersbug = Tdbbassee * Tompa * ORRFSFFFROD16-100-000190
Smdeslgnondmthqn{"]werepul'omndmderlheshdsupetwslonofudmﬂadoﬂomeyxbypa:mndodmﬂedhpnn-:ﬁcebwmlhemnmﬁing jurisdiction.




CARLTON FIELDS

Feo. o\

[ e ATTORNEYS AT LAW
.- "PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 8, 2009
© - 2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087

o _'INV_OICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE 23

2.80
' Bubtotal for Task L440 ; 2.80
PHASE L40: TRIAL PREPARATION AND TRIAL
1-rae:k L120 : ANALYSIS/STRATEGY
. 06/23/09 MRB  REVIEW OF (SRt 1.20
. 06/24/09 MRB REVIEW OF (iSRS, 3.60

Subtotal for Task Ll20

tl-‘-
*

o
Q

‘ a.sk L140

: DOCUMENT / FILE MANAGEMENT
06/03/09 JC*  PREPARE DOCUMENTS TO BE INCLUDED IN WITNESS 2.80
e R _ NOTEBOOKS
/" 06/04f09 JC*  PREPARE QUGN 2.80
. 06/05/09 JC*  PREPARING G .10
B _ Subtotal for Task L140 5 9.70

. Task L410 : FACT WITNESSES _

©06/16/09 SS* PLAN AND PREPARE NS 1.70

-

' 06/16/09 SS* PLAN AND PREPARE FOR NN .80

06/18/09 SS*  PREPARE FOR (NN 3.10
_"“ —

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
o Atlonla * Miomi * Orande * St Petersburg = Tnlol-ussee * Tampa * Wouri=BrRrrPOD15-100-000191
Semces desngnuled with an [*} were petformad under the strict supervision of admired chameys by pasans eot odmitied b proctize low in the conlafling jurisdiction.




CARLTON FIELDS

Ll ' ATTORNEYS AT LAW

R PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 8, 2009
b g 2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00305-38087
.+ INVOICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE 24

06/18/09 §S*  CONTINUED PREPARATION FOR (N 1.70

4 06/20/09 sg* REVIEW‘AND ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS REGARDING 31,70

| 06/26/09. SS*  PLAN AND PREPARE FOR GuNENES 1.40

REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF (NN 2.10

i 06/30/09 SS*

"f‘f‘os‘/3a/'09 §S*  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF_ .90
fa . T

.. 06/30/09 SS* REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF QNS .30

G
Subtotal for Task L410 : 15.70
..Task L440 : OTH TRIAL PREPARATION & SUPPORT
. 06/01/09 MRB ADDITIONAL FOLLOW-UP RESEARCH - (NSNS 2.60
. 06/02/09 MRB  RESEARCH NN .80

Subtotal for Task L440

w
»

e
4

TOTAL FEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES W

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

. Atonta = Miami = Orlanda = St Petersherg = Tuﬂd\ussee + Tompa * VesPokrARerO016-100-000192
i % Setmetdesvg'lobdwnhnn {*] were perdormed under the sirict supasvision of admitied aftomeys by persons not admittad to practice law in the contioling erisdiciion.




"ﬁfﬁfmmﬂi.-‘
- . PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA

© DMT

. MRB
88

KA* .
L dCR

.:"KP*

L DMT

. - 58%*

Je

e
KA*

f;L&uE#daﬁmmdwmanm

2009 RATE CASE

CARLTON FIELDS

INVOICE NUMBER 554722

J. M. WALLS

D. M. TRIPLETT

M. R. BERNIER

5. SCHRAND*
Total Task Code

K. ADAMS*
J. COSTELLO*

Total Task Code

J. M. WALLS
K. PULLEN*

- Total Task Code

J. M. WALLS

Total Task Code

J. M. WALLS
M. R. BERNIER

Total Task Code

J.
D.
5.
J.

M. WALLS
M. TRIPLETT
SCHRAND*
COSTELLO*

' Total Task Code
M. R. BERNIER

K. PULLEN®*

K. ADAMS*

S. SCHRAND*

Total Task Code

~J. M. WALLS

L120

L140

L1s0

L230

L250

L3110

L320

f?giiogﬂgi.FEE SUMMARY BY TASK CODE

.20
.00

W o
w
o

.30

14.90

.90
16.30

32.80
45.10
15.00
39.90

56.60
.50
1.60
11.70

F1)

hours

14.90

hours
hours

17.20

hours
hours
hours
hours

132.80

hours
hours
hours
hours

70.40

hours

at
at
at
at

at
at
at
at

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

JULY 8,
REF. NO.
PAGE 25

nn

0y

nn

0o

wnin

Brdnin-n

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

2009

00309-38087

Adania = Miami « Crlondo * S5t Pelersburg ¢ Tollahassze * Tampa * WRRPERAREGRBD16-100-000193
were performed vnder the strict supervision of admitied altormneys by persons nat admitted to proctice law in the controfiing jusisdiction.



CARLTON FIELDS

B _ ATTORNEYS AT LAW

i .. . PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 8, 2009

| .- 2009 RATE CASE REF, NO. 00309-38087
. . INVOICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE 26

Total Task Coda

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

£330 1.80 o
W J. M. WALLS .30 hours at $ =
. 88*. '3, SCHRAND* 15.70 hours at § =
' Total Task Coda L410 : 16.00
|©.88* 8. SCHRAND* .60 hours
| Total Task Code 1430 : 260 —
JMW - J. M. WALLS .30 hours
- MRB M. R. BERNIER 16.50 hours
‘Total Task Code L440 :~  15.80 ——
ATTORNEY FEE. SUMMARY
- -DMT,“ D. M. TRIPLETT 48.10 hours
o KP* K. PULLEN* 0.90 hours
.- 88% 8. SCHRAND* 44.30 hours
COMW. . J. M. WALLS 66.70 hours
. MRB ‘M. R. BERNIER 94.20 hours
 ¢KA*': K. ADAMS* 2.00 hours
i ge* . J. COSTELLO* 49.60 hours
' TOTALS 305.80
COSTS INCURRED ON YQUR BEHALF AS POSTED JUNE 30,
' Code E101 COPYING -
. 06/02/09 COPYING COST
- 06/03/09 COPYING COST
'06/08/09 COPYING COST
" 06/08/09 COPYING COST
06/12/09 COPYING COST
06/17/09 COPYING COST
. 06/19/09 COPYING COST
06/22/09 COPYING COST
-~ 06/23/09 COPYING COST
. 06/23/09 COPYING COST
:.06/26/09 COPYING COST
- 06/30/09 COPYING COST
L ) Total Code E101
Code E103 WORD PROCESSING
06/13/09 DOCUMENT PRODUCTION-COPY JOB. E T

i ’ - Aflania » Miomi » Ordando * St. Petersburg * Tclahussee + Tampa * VAISRPBTRERIOD16-100-000194
Semnu dasngnuied wulh an I") were performed under the strict supervision of admiited attomeys by persons not odmitted 1o practice law in the controfling juisdiction.




.3
' PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA

CARLTON FIELDS

2009 RATE CASE
~INVOICE NUMBER 554722

‘Code E105

06/04/09
06/04/09

- 06/05/09

06/08/09
. 06/08/09

.08/11/09

- 06/12/09
06/17/09
06/18/09
~06/15/09
06/22/09

. 06/24/09
06/22/09

" code E107

06/08/09
06/10/09

-Code Eloa

06/02/09
- 06/17/09

. 06/23/09

- 06/23/09
06/29/09

" 06/29/09

- . Code E110
1 06/19/09

. Code E124

‘06/12/09
06/19/09
06/19/09
06/29/09

06/29/09

TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE

o

DELIVERY SERVICES/MESSENGERS
MESSENGER CHARGES

EXPRESS MAIL

POSTAGE
FOSTAGE

' POSTAGE

POSTAGE
POSTAGE
POSTAGE
POSTAGE

OUT-OF-TOWN TRAVEL

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
JULY 8,

REF'. NO.

PAGE

Total Code

Total Code

Total Code

Total Code

27

E103

E105

E1Q7

E108

TRAVEL/LODGING/MEALS - VENDOR: JAMES MICHARL

WALLS

CONFERENCE DOCKET 090144

COLOR COPYING COST
COLOR COPYING CCST
COLOR COPYING COST
COLOR COPYING COST
COLOR COPYING COST

Total Code

Total Code

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.
Allonta ¢ Miami * Orlondo = Si Petershurg » Tullahus&ea * Tampa * \YesFeminwehn16-100-000495

- 6/15/09 TRAVEL TO AND ATTEND 6/16/09
FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION AGENDA

E1l0Q

El24

2009
00309-38087

Semces daslgnahd with an [*] were performed under the strict supervision of admitted aftarneys by persons not admitted fa proclice law in the conteolling jurisdiction,



CARLTON FIELDS

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

PROGRESS ENERGY FLORIDA JULY 8, 2009
2009 RATE CASE REF. NO. 00309-38087
INVOICE NUMBER 554722 PAGE 28
TOTAL COSTS AS POSTED THROUGH JUNE 3Q, 2009 L
INVOICE 554722 TOTAL S
L L L L,

'BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENT
LESS: PAYMENTS

TOTAL AMOUNT DUR

CARLTON FIELDS, PA.

; : Aflania » Miami * Ordando = St Petersburg = Tulluhussee s Tompa * WenBakr Bection1s-100-000136
Senm:s desngnuhd with on () wers parformed under the strict supervision of admitled oftomeys by persans ot admilted to practice kiw in the controlling jurisdiction.




Richard D. Melson

Atterney & Counselor
705 Piedmont Driv " e
Tallahasses, FL 32512 rick@rmelsoniaw.com Phccuﬁgl: ggg.ggijg;i
INVOICE
5/3/2009 ,
Jobn T. Bumett _ Invoice #: 110
Progress Energy Service Company, LLC
P.O. Box 14042, PEF 151 4 Co “ﬁdant‘ua\
St. Petersburg, FL. 33733-3042 e iesed an
Matter: 2009 Base Rate Case
Date Description of Services Hours/Qty Rate Amount
4/3/2009  Review outline for SMGNGEEIINNETNSNSG 0 00 QI W

provide comments to Walls; review intervenors' joint
response to PEF requests for interim relief.

4/7/2009 i’rovide additional comments to Walls re upcoming 1.1
Sz, | telephone call from Walls re proposed - -

m
4/3/2009 Prepare for and attend -« NN 2.5 - -

asmesmy meet with _
m—-——-
NN ; confer with GENN
R

4/10/2009  Telephone call from Walls regarding im0 - -

4/13/2009 Rewew file and S
revicw draft response to
commcnts on same; rewcw and respond to m

telephone call fmm Walls to discuss m
R

Pleasc make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson Total
FEIN: e -
( Payments/Credits

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, pleasc
contact me at (350) 894-1351.

Balance Due

Page 1

09RP-STAFFPOD1 6-100-000197




Richard D. Melson

Attorrey & Counselor
705 Piedmant Drive Cell: 850-222-304
Taliahassee, FL 32312 rick@rmetsonlaw.cam Phone: 85043%11351
INVOICE
5/372009
John T. Burnett Invoice #: 110

Progress Energy Service Company, LLC
P.O. Box 14042, PEF 151

ial
St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042 orivileged and confidentid
Matter: 2009 Base Rate Case
Date Description of Services Hours/Qty Rate Amount

4142009  Review : p N ENNRRaN. 2nd analyze o5 Uy VN

4/15/2009  Conference call re RN 0.8 - -
SISV tclephone call with NSRS

SR cevicw final draft of response dussum— -
-~ -

4/20/2009  Telephone call with Burnett re ZASRCTRNE.. 0.3 - _
v

422/2009  Review draft responses to ' Givesr g 0.2 - -

4/23/2009  Telephoue call from Burnctt re St 0.2 - -

[,
4/29/2009  Telephone call from Burnctt rc Apums—— 22
obtain copy of PSC's Digest of Regulatory Policies; - -
SO
4/30/2009 Review R 2.7
RSN initial research and drafting re SEy————— - -
S
Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson Total —
EIN: e :
& o Payments/Credits -
If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please .
contact me at (850) 894-1351. Balance Due —

Page 2

09RP-STAFFPOD16-100-000198




Richard D. Melson

Attorney & Counselor
705 Piedmont Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32312 rick@rmalsonlaw.com
INVOICE
6/1/2009
John T. Burnett

Progress Energy Service Company, LLC
P.O. Box 14042, PEF 151
St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042

Date

Matter: 2009 Base Rate Case

Description of Services

Cell: B50-322-3041
Phone: 850-834-1351

Invoice #: 112

ial
g ot ent?

?t’\ﬂ"‘eg’e

Hours/Qty Rate Armount

5/1/2009

5/3/2009

5/4/2009

5/5/2009

5/6{2009

37772009

Review draf - RIS,
comments; research and drafting re S EERRES
C

5 e

Conduct additional research re GENIEEENANENR 75 - -

TR  rcvisc draft of memorandum re

Perform additional research and complete draft
memorandum on NN
forward memo to ‘uSeNE——

Review and provide comments on il
SEEEERRAED llow-up on NS
NG fnalize
legal memorandum Wl—_—_—G—

Review - VNG

Follow-up by phone and e-mail rc SEaniia

L cvicv A

N -

o

Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson

(FEIN:

Total

Payments/Credits

[f you have any questions regarding this invoice, please
contact me at (850) 894-1351.

Balance Due

Page 1

9
09F:1’-STAFFI’0016-100-00019




Richard D. Melson

Attorney & Counselor
705 Piedmont Drive Cell: 850-322-3041
Tallahassee, FL. 32312 rick@rmelsonfaw.com Phone: 850-894-1351
INVOICE
6/1/2009
John T. Burnett Invoice #: 112

Progress Energy Service Company, LLC
P.O. Box 14042, PEF 151

A
St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042 Lged 3 d confide” ial
privt
Matter: 2009 Base Rate Case
Date Description of Services Hours/Qty Rate Amount

5/11/2009  Review draft response to CHEESISI—ENGS oo Ny N

and provide comments on same; telephone call from

5/12/2009 _ 12 Sy N
provide comments on: - USRS
SR  tclcphonc call with RN
L
wiRE
5/14/2009  Telephone call to Walls re i —— o7 D SN
conference; telephone conference SlENENEENENEN.
S i
5/17/2009  Review draft will e s D W
w ; rcvicw and provide detailed
R
¢
L
5/18/2009  Revicw and respond to e-mails; review final draft of 0.2 - -
e
-~ ]
Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson Total
(FEIN: S— Payments/Credits
If you have any questions regarding this inveice, please k
comtact me at (350) 894-1351. Balance Due
Page 2

09RP-STAFFPOD16-100-00020¢




Richard D, Melson

Attorney & Counselor
705 Piedmont Drive
Tallahasses, FI. 32312 rick@rimelsonlaw.com
INVOICE
6/1/2009
John T. Burnett

Progress Energy Service Company, LLC
P.O. Box 14042, PEF 151
St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042

Matter: 2009 Base Rate Case

Celi: B50-322-3041
Phora: 850-894-1351

Invoice #; 112

P‘ k\ﬂ\e ed and Col!i d "tla‘
g de

Date Description of Services Hours/Qty  Rate Amount
5/19/2009 SR’ meeting with client and Walls; prepare for 7.5 -
and attend agenda conference on interim rates and -
Bartow limited proceeding.
512212009 buﬂine issues re NSNS conference call 1.5 - -
with client re SEENGGRRER
52712009 Review eummGu " o il
several telephone calls with SRS
L]
5/28/2000  Review N —— s PP
telephone calls with NGRS
L
5312009  LEXIS access (1 week) - -
Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson Total -
(FEIN: J

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please
contact me at (830) 894-1351.

Payments/Cradits -

Balance Due !

Page 3

09Rl’—STAFFPOD16-1004000201



Richard D. Melson

Altorney & Counselor
705 Piedmont Drive
Taltahassee, FL 32312 rick@rmelsonlaw.com
INVOICE
7/6/2009

John T. Bumett
Progress Energy Service Company, LLC
P.O. Box 14042, PEF 151

Celi: 850-322-3041
Phona: 850-894-1351

Invoice #: 114

ial
St. Petersburg, FL 33733-3042 oriviieged and CONRI4ENEE
Matter: 2009 Base Rate Casc
Date Description of Services Hours/Qty Rate Amount
6/8/2009  Review draft NGRS I Ny Sy
. cvicw SN
-
6122009 Review INE——— .5 G
and provide comments on «uIEN——_— -
W ; tclcphooe call
from Walls to discuss iSNSREE—
AR
S —
6/15/2009  Review materials to prepare for agenda conference on 0.6 - -
accounting petition.
6/16/2009  Attend agenda conference on accounting petition; 2.9 - -
discuss
L
6/17/2009 Review e-mails; review and comment on draft 03 - -
 ——
6/19/2009  Review draft R o2 N Sy
6/2972009 o2 D Yy

Please make checks payable to: Richard D. Melson

i{eview draft SRS

Total

(FEIN: GR——— .

Payments/Credits 4

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please

contact me at {830) 894-1351.

Balance Due

O9RP-STAFF POD[6-100-000202




MCcGUIREWOODS

Edgar M. Roach Jr Two Hannover Square
919.755.6690 434 Fayetteville Street, Suite 2140
Raleigh, NC 27601

April 14, 2009

REMITT, CorY
PLEASE RETURN WITH PAYMENT
DIRECT ACCOUNTING INQUIRIES TO!(804) 775-1801 oxr (800) 775-2202
INVOICE NO. 91129732
Progreas Energy Florida
Attn: Mr. Alex Glenn

299 1st Avenue, North Suite 1500
St. Petersburg, FL 33701

TAX ID NO. <SS
Re: FL General Rate Case - 2009
Cur Pile No. 4502779-0004
Balance Forward from Prior Invoices: Ay
{IF RALANCE FORWARD PREVICUSLY PAID, PLEASE DISREGARD)

Current Invcice:

Current Fees:
Current Disbursements:

Current Involce Total:
Total Balance Due for this Matter: a

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO THE FOLLOWING ADDRESS:
McGuireWoods LLP
Attn: Accounts Receivable

201 E. Cary Street
Richmond, VA 23219-4030

PAYMENT IN FULL IS DUE UPON PRESENTATION

09RP-STAFFPOD16-100-000203




MCGUI REW(I)DS Privileged and Confidential

Edgar M. Roach Jr Two Hannover Square
919.755.6690 434 Fayetteville Street, Suite 2140
Raleigh, NC 27601

April 14, 2009

Progress Enexgy Florida
Attn: Mr. Alex Glenn
299 1st Avenue, North Suite 1500
8t. Petersburg, FL 33701
Bill Through: 03/31/09

INVOICE NO. 91129732 TAX ID NC. -SEEsmE™

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:

Re: FL General Rate Came - 2009
Cur ¥File No. 4502779-0004

03/09/09 Review materials regarding Florida rate -
proceeding
Bdgar M. Roach Jr
03/10/095 Review draft materials; email to A. Glenn -
Edgar M. Roach Jr
03/17/09 Monitor Florida S ey -

request
Bdgar M. Roach Jx

Timekeeper Hours
Edgar M. Roach Jr 7.5
TOTAL FEES 7.5

09RP-STAFFPOIY16-100-000204




FL General Rate Case - 2009
File Numbexr: 4502779-0004
Invoice No. 91129732

Page 2
April 14, 2009

Summa of es d engeg:

Total Fees for Matter:

Total Expenseg for Matter:

Total for this Invoice:

— 4w

Ay

T] CONFIDENTIAL

D9RP-S'TA‘EFP0016-100-000205



McGUIREWOODS

Edgar M. Roach Jr 2600 Two Hannover Sguare
919.755.6690 PO Box 27507

Raleigh, NC 27611

May 7, 2009

REMITTANCE COPY
PLEASE RETURN WITH PAYMENT
DIRECT ACCOUNTING INQUIRIES TO (804) 775-1601 or (8G0) 775-2202

INVOQICE NO. 91137342

Progress Energy Florida

Attn: Mr. Alex Glenn

299 1st Avenue, Noxth Suite 1500
St. Petersburg, FL 33701

TAX ID NO. SEEeSa-

Ra: FL General Rate Case - 2009
Our File No. 4502779-0004

Balance Forward from Prior Invoices: _

(IF BALANCE FORWARD PREVIOUSLY PAID, PLEASHE DIYSREGARD)

Current Invoice:
Current Fees:
Carrent Disbursements:

Current Invoice Total:

Total Balance Due for this Matter: =—

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO THE FOLLOWING ADDRESS:

McGBuireWoods LLP

Attn: Accounts Receivable 4an
901 B. Cary Street priviled®
Richmond, VA 23219-4030

confidentid!

PAYMENT IN FULL IS DUE UPON PRESENTATION

06
09RP-STAFFPO!)16-100-0002




McGUIRFWOODS

Edgar M. Roach Jr 2600 Two Hannover Sqnare
919.755.6690 PO Box 27507
Raleigh, NC 27611
d Coni'\de“da\
4
May 7, 2009 ries®®
Progress Energy Florida
Attn: Mr. Alex Glenn
299 1st Avenue, North Suite 1500
St. Petersburg, FL 33701
Bill Through: 04/30/0%
INVOICE HO. 51137342 TAX ID NO. el
FOR PROFESSIONAL SZRVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:
Ra: FL Ganeral Rate Case -~ 2009
Dur Pile No. 4502779-0004
04/22/03 Telephone call with A. Glenn; review'“ -
L

Edgar M. Roach Jr
04/29/09 Review rate testimony -

Edgar M. Roach Jr
04/30/09 Review testimony and order ZaBSREsmmssi -

Edgar M. Recach Jr

Timekeeper Hours unt
Edgar M. Roach Jr 4.5
TOTAL FEES 2.5 _—

61
o'ml’—s““ﬂ?om




FL CGeneral Rate Case - 2009
File Number: 4502779-0004
Invoice No., 9111317342

Page 2
_Mav 7, 2009

Summ ees_a Expenses:
Total PFees for Matter:

Total Expenses for Matter:

Total for this Invoicge:

T) CONFIDENTIAL

09RP-STAFFPOD16-100-000268



McGUIREWQOODS

Edgar M. Roach Jr 2600 Two Hannover Square
919.755.66%90 PO Box 27507
Ralelgh, NC 27611
fident!
Juna 10, 2009 privi\egeda d Cont¥

REMITTANCE COPY
PLEASE RETURN WITH PAYMENT
DIRECT ACCOUNTING INQUIRIRS TO (804) 775-1501 or (800) 775-2202

INVOICE NO. 91148759
Progress Enexrgy Florida
Attn: Mr. Alex Glenn

299 1st Avenue, North Suite 1500
St. Petersburg, FL 33701

TAX ID NO. =i

Re: FL, General Rate Cage - 2003
Our File No. 4502779-0004

Balance Forward from Prior Invoices: —
(IF BALANCE FORWARD PREVIOUSLY PAID, PLEASE DISREGARD)

Current Invoice:

Current FPFees:

Current Disbursements:

Current Inveice Total: __
Total Balance Due for this Matter: =-

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO THE FOLLOWING ADDRESS:

MoGuireWoods LLP

Attn: Accounts Receivable
901 E. Cary Street
Richmond, VA 23219-4030

PAYMENT IN FULL IS DUE UPON PRESENTATICN

09RP'—STAFFPODIS-100—000209




McGUIREWOODS

Edgar M. Roach Jr
919,755.6690

Progress Energy Florida

Attn: Mr. Alex Glenn

299 1l1sat Avenue, North Suite 1500
8t. Petersburg, FL 33701

2600 Two Hannover Sqnare

PO Box 27507

Ralelgh, NC 27611

June 10 ’ 2009 N co“ﬁ de\'\ﬁa\

an
?m'\\eged

91149769

Bill Through: 05/31/09

INVOICE NO.

TAX IP NO

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND BXPENSES INCURRED:

Re: FL General Rate Case - 2009

Cur Pile

No. 4502772-0004

85/13/09 Review and edit
Edgar M. Roach Jr

Timekeeper

Hours

Edgaxr M. Roach Jr

TOTAL FEES

Su of Feesa and Expenses:

Total Fees for Matter:

Total Expenses for Matter:

Total for this Invoice:

2.5

2.5

0YRP-STAFFPOD16-100-000210



