REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET

(Please type or print. File original p/lus 1 copy with CLK.) c:a' _/\
Date: | 11/18/2009 Docket No.: 090515 <TC. . 2
1. From Staff / Division: Pruitt/ RadY PRE. cg/‘”
2.0PR: |RAD O SN
3.0CR: | GCL 7 %

4. Suggested Docket Title: | Request for cancellation of PATS Certificate No. 7896 by Ray Scott d/b/a East Coast
Payphones, effective November 16, 2009.

5. Program/Module/Submodule Assignment: B1f

6. Suggested Docket Mail List.

a. Provide NAMES/ACRONYMS, if registered company. | [ ] Provided as an Attachment

Company Code, | Parties )
if applicable: (include address, if different from MCD): | Representatives (name and address):

TG833 East Coast Payphones Ray Scott

b. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (match representatives to companies)

Company Code, | Interested persons, if any,
if applicable: (include address, if different from MCD): | Representatives (name and address): |
7. Check one: X Supporting Documentation Attached | [ ] To be provided with Recommendation

| Comments:

PSC\CLK 010-C (Rev. 04/09) : e Document2



Page 1 of 2

Nancy Pruitt

From: Katie Ely

Sent: Tuesday, November 17, 2009 9:09 AM

To: Nancy Pruitt; Ray Kennedy

Subject: FW: Order or Notice issued by the Public Service Commission (Email ID = 057745)

Nancy/Ray:

Mr. Scott would like to cancel his certificate with us. Can you please assist him
with this?

Thanks!

Katie Ely

Staff Assistant - Office of Commission Clerk

Florida Public Service Commission

850-413-6304

Please note: Florida has a very broad public records law. Most wittten communications to or from state officials regarding state

business are considered to be public records and will be made available to the public and the media upon request. Theretore, your
e-mail message may be subject to public disclosure.

From: Julie scott [mailto:scot7117@yahoo.com]

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2009 3:04 PM

To: Records Clerk

Subject: Re: Order or Notice issued by the Public Service Commission (Email ID
= 057745)

Ray Scott east coast payphones.I do not have any more payphones in
service.l believe I pay a yearly fee can you please cancel my contract.

Thanks, Ray Scott

--- On Fri, 11/13/09, Commission Clerk
<CommissionClerk(@psc.state.fl.us> wrote:

11/17/2009
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From: Commission Clerk <CommissionClerk@psc.state.fl.us>
Subject: Order or Notice issued by the Public Service Commission
(Email ID = 057745)

To:

Date: Friday, November 13, 2009, 10:16 AM

The attached order or notice has been issued by the Public Service
Commission.

If you have any problems opening this attachment, please contact the
Office of Commission Clerk by reply email or at 850-413-6770.

When replying, please do not alter the subject line; as it is used to process
your reply.

Thank you.

11/17/2009
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