
Susan D. Ritsnour 
Secretary and Treasurer 

One Energy Place 
Pensacola, Florida 32520-0781 

and Regulatoty Manager 
Tel850 444 6231 
Fax 850 444 6026 
SDRITENO@southernco.com 

March 19, 2010 

Ms. Ann Cole, Commission Clerk 
Florida Public Service Cornmission 
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 

A SOUTHERN COMPANV 

Dear Ms. Cole: 

RE: Docket No. 100001 -El 

Enclosed are an original and fifteen copies of Gulf Power Company's Request for 
Confidential Classification regarding interrogatories 2, 3, 5, 8, 9, 10, 17, 18, 19 
submitted by Gulf Power in response to Commission Staffs First Request for 
Production of Documents to Gulf Power Company (Nos. 1-22). 

Sincerely, 

Ib 

Enclosures 

cc: Beggs & Lane 
Jeffrey A. Stone, Esq. 

cOM -c 
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BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 

IN RE: Fuel and Purchased Power Cost ) 
Recovery Clause with Generating ) 
Performance Incentive Factor ) Docket NO.: 100001-El 

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE 

th I HEREBY CERTiFY that a true copy of the foregoing was furnished by U. S. mail this &day of March, 2010, on the 
following: 

John T. Burnen. Esq. Mehrdad Khojasteh Lisa Bennett. Esq. 
Progress Energy Service Co. 
P. 0. Box 14042 
St. Petersburg FL 33733-4042 

Florida Public Utilities Company 
P. 0. Box 3395 
West Palm Beach FL 33402-3395 

FL Public Service Cornmission 
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 
Tallahassee FL 32399-0863 

John T. Butler, Esq. 
Senior Attorney for Florida Power & 
Light Company 
700 Universe Boulevard 
Juno Beach FL 33408-0420 

John W. McWhirter, Jr., Esq. 
Attorney for FIPUG 
McWhirter Reeves & Davidson 
P.O. BOX 3350 
Tampa FL 33601 -3350 

Paul Lewis, Jr. 
Progress Energy Florida, Inc. 
106 E. College Ave., Ste. 800 
Tallahassee FL 32301-7740 

Vicki Kaufman 
Jon Moyle 
Keefe Anchors Gordon & Moyle PA 
118 N. Gadsden St. 
Tallahassee FL 32301 

Shayla L. McNeill, Capt. USAF 
Karen S. White 
AFLSNJACL-ULT 
139 Barnes Drive, Suite 1 
Tyndall AFB FL 32403 

Randy B. Miller 
White Springs Agricultural Chemicals 
PO Box 300 
15483 Southeast 781h Street 
White Springs FL 32096 

Patricia Ann Christensen 
Associate Public Counsel 
Office of Public Counsel 
11 1 West Madison Street, Rm. 812 
Tallahassee FL 32399- 1400 

James D. Beasley. Esq, 
J. Jeffrv Wahlen 

Curtis D. Young 
Florida Public Utilities Company 
PO BOX 3395 
West Palm Beach FL 33402-3395 

Cecilia Bradley 
Senior Assistant Attorney General 
Office of the Attorney General 
The Capitol-PLOI 
Tallahassee FL 32399-1050 

John Rogers, General Counsel 
Florida Retail Federation 
100 East Jefferson Street 
Tallahassee FL 32301 

Ms. Chervl Martin 
Florida Pbblic Utilities Company 
PO BOX 3395 
West Palm Beach FL 33402-3395 

Wade Litchfieldl 
Vice President 
Florida Power & Light Co. 
215 S. Monroe Street, Ste. 810 
Tallahassee FL 32301-1859 

Paula K. Brown, Administrator 
Regulatory Coordination 
Tampa Electric Company 
P. 0. BOX 111 
Tampa FL 33601 

Norman H. Horton, Jr.. Esq. 
Messer, Caparelio & Self, P.A. 
P. 0. BOX 15579 
Tallahassee FL 32317 

James W. Brew 
F. Alvin Taylor 
Brickfield, Burchette. et al., P.C. 
1025 Thomas Jefferson SI.. NW 
Eighth Floor, West Tower 
Washington DC 20007-5201 

Robert Scheffel Wright 
John T. LaVia, Iil 
Young van Assenderp. P.A. 
225 S. Adams Street, Suite 200 
Tallahassee FL 32301 

2 Florida Bar No. 5953 

RUSSELL A. BADDERS 
Florida Bar No. 007455 
STEVEN R. GRIFFIN 
Florida Bar No. 0627569 
BEGGS & LANE 
P. 0. Box 12950 
Pensacola FL 32591 -2950 
(850) 432-2451 
Attorneys for Gulf Power Company 



/ 9 BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION & a  
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IN RE: Fuel and purchased power cost <, 5 ‘2. 
recovery clause and generating performance DocketNo.: 1000@EI y+ 
incentive factor Date: March 1$%%%0 % , ,-\ 

1 %$I / 6 1  +@. G? c-) 
4, 

REQUEST FOR CONFIDENTIAL CLASSIFICATION / c 3 6  

GULF POWER COMPANY [“Gulf Power”, “Gulf’, or the “Company”], by and through 

its undersigned attorneys and pursuant to Rule 25-22.006, Florida Administrative Code, hereby 

files a request that the Florida Public Service Commission enter an order protecting from public 

disclosure certain information submitted by Gulf Power in response to Commission Staffs First 

Request for Production of Documents to Gulf Power Company (Nos. 1-22). As grounds for this 

request, the Company states: 

1. All, or a portion of the information submitted by Gulf Power in response to 

requests numbered 2, 3, 5, 8, 9, 10, 17, 18 and 19 of Commission Staffs First Request for 

Production constitutes proprietary confidential business information concerning bids and other 

contractual data, the disclosure of which would impair the efforts of Gulf Power to contract for 

goods and services on favorable terms. The information is entitled to confidential classification 

pursuant to section 366.093(3) (d) and (e), Florida Statutes. Specifically, the confidential 

information consists of bid documents, internal bid evaluations, and contracts for the purchase of 

coal, natural gas and light oil offered to and/or purchased by Gulf Power in connection with 

Requests for Proposal issued by Gulf Power in 2009. Gulf Power and the counterparties 

involved in these transactions consider the pricing information and other non-price terms 

contained in the documents confidential. Disclosure of this information would negatively impact 

Gulfs ability to negotiate pricing favorable to its customers in the future. In addition, potential 

counterparties may refuse to enter into future contracts with Gulf, or may charge higher prices, if 



the pricing and other non-price terms contained in the bid submissions and purchase agreements 

were made public 

2. The information filed pursuant to this Request is intended to be, and is treated as, 

confidential by the Gulf Power and, to this attorney's knowledge, has not been otherwise 

publicly disclosed. 

3. Submitted as Exhibit "A" are copies of the subject documents, on which is 

highlighted the information for which confidential classification is requested. Exhibit "A" 

should be treated as confidential pending a ruling on this request. Attached as Exhibit "B" are 

two (2) edited copies of the subject documents, which may be made available for public review 

and inspection. Attached as Exhibit "C" to this request is a line-by-lineheld-by-field 

justification for the request for confidential classification. 

WHEREFORE, Gulf Power Company respectfully requests that the Commission enter 

an order protecting the information highlighted on Exhibit "A" from public disclosure as 

proprietary confidential business information. 

Respectfully submitted this 19th day of March, 2010. I 

J E F F ~ Y  3. ST ON'^ " 
Florida Bar No. 325953 
RUSSELL A. BADDERS 
Florida Bar No. 007455 
STEVEN R. GRIFFIN 
Florida Bar No. 0627569 
Beggs & Lane 
P. 0. Box 12950 
Pensacola, FL 32591 
(850) 432-2451 
Attorneys for Gulf Power Company 



BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 

IN RE: Fuel and purchased power cost 
recovery clause and generating performance 
incentive factor 

Docket No.: 100001-E1 
Date: March 19,2010 

REQUEST FOR CONFIDENTIAL CLASSIFICATION 

EXHIBIT "A" 

Provided to the Commission Clerk 

under separate cover as confidential information 



EXHIBIT "B" 



The documents submitted herewith in response to Request # 8, consisting of pages 
stamped 0048-0222, are confidential in their entirety. 
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Gulf Power Company Long-Term Solicitation - October 2009 
Foresight Coal Sales Negotiation 

RFP (Issued October 8. 20091 
Term: 
Quantity: 
Pricing: 

4 years beginning Jan. I, 201 1 
Up to 3 million tondyear 
Quote fixed price for year one with a specified annual escalation (if any) for following 
years 

Foresieht Bid (Dated October 26. 2009) 
Term: 
Quantity: 

10 years beginning Jan. 1,201 1 
201 1 - 2 million tons 
2012-2020 - 3 million tonslyear 

ton FOB Railcar 
ton FOB Railcar 2012 - 

set the price for 2013-2014 and re-open every two ears thereafter. If parties are 
unable to reach an agreement on P r i c e , f ~ l w i l l  be used to determine 
price for 2013-2020. 

Pricing: 2011 - 

market re-opener would be conducted during the 3d quarter of 2012 to 

Neeotiation Period (October 26.2009 - Februarv 1.20101 
Gulfs initial purchase decision. based on Foresight's bid, was as follows: 

Term: 2 years beginning Jan. 1.201 1 
Quantity: 201 1 - 800,000 tons 

2012 - 1,200,000 tons 

2012 - 
Pricing: 

Through subsequent negotiations, Gulf agreed to the following: 
Term: 6 years beginning Jan. 1,201 1 
Quantity: 500,000 tondyear 
Pricing: 

2012 2011 =::: 
2013-2016 - A  market re-opener would be conducted during 2012 and 2014 to set the 
price for 2013-2014 and 2015-2016. reswctivelv. 

Gulf denied Foresight's request and negotiations ceased on February 1,2010 

0225 



DATE March 8,2010 
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RE: GULF POWER COMPANY 
LONG-TERM COAL SOLICITATION 2011-2014 

FROM: Sarah Myrick 

TO: H. Rusty Ball 

This letter is written to document the process and results of the 2011-2014 Long-Term Coal Solicitation that was 
issued on October 8,2009 on behalf of Gulf Power Company’s Plants Crist and Smith. This solicitation was made to 
support the projected 2011 through 2014 coal burn and inventory requirements at these plants. A review of Crist and 
Smith’s inventory plans and bum projections for the 2011 through 2014 timeframe indicated the need of 
approximately 1.4 million tons of coal for year 2011, 3.1 million tons in 2012, 4.3 million tons in 2013 and 4.1 
million tons in 2014. In addition, the bids received under the solicitation were considered for purchase in m effort to 
support Gulf Power Company’s Long-Tern Coal Procurement Strategy and Tactical Plan. 

A bid invitation was issued on October 8. Mo9, soliciting bids from all approved suppliers listed on the Gulf Power 
Company Bid List. The solicitation requested bids for the purchase of coal for a term of up to four (4) years 
beginning January 1.201 1 and ending on December 31,2014. The bid close date was October 27.2009. in response 
to the solicitation. twenty-one (21) offers were nccived from fourteen (14) different coal suppliers. Offers were 
nceived from the Central Appalachian, Illinois Basin, Colorado/Utah and Colombian coal supply regions. 

Due to the uncertainty surrounding Gulf Power’s coal bum as well as the lack of fixed price offers beyond 2012. the 
twenty-one proposals that were received were evaluated over two years to Plant Crist on a hrlly delivered present 
value basis, including the value of S G  and NO.. In support of the evaluation process. transpawtion rates and lease 
and maintenance costs were provided by Stephen Burns, Transportation Agent and SO1 allowance values were 
provided by Richard Taylor, Emissions Trader. 

Based on the delivered economics of all offers, Foresight Coal Sales, LLC’s offer from their Pond Creek #1 mine 
was the most competitive Illinois Basin offer with a staning price of including Sa and NO.. Their 
offer consisted of supplying 3 million tons per year for 201 1-2020 w1 a fixed pnce for the first two years and 

for the remaining eight years. Their proposal also included utilizing 
their competitive fixed pricing for the first two years, Gulf entered 
$00 tons in 2011 at a fixed price of-on and 1.2M tons in 2012 

xtensive negoiauons over a pen& of three months 
However. the parues ulbmately could not agree 
negohatlons ceased on Febnraq 1,2010 
ired. thus no purchases were made 

ir 
9 
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The documents submitted herewith in response to Request # 8, consisting of pages 
stamped 0232-0350, are confidential in their entirety. 



The documents submitted herewith in response to Request # 8, consisting of pages 
stamped 0357-0370, are confidential in their entirety. 





m: SO(IpwRw CO BVCB I N C  SRL m p m y  

Attention: B Nitahell 

w l b l l  WaO-IuIPB -016'19011 lBOS2 #oul?m OD 

TRANSACTXON CONFIMTION 

- Vdtu: Octabor 28, 2009 
Trrdo Vdte : Octobor 17. ZOO9 
Trdnrdr;tion C o n f i r w t i o n t :  01579015 

Thia Transrc t iun  Confibat ic ln  is ycrvrrnod by t ho  easo Cont rmt  Dotwen Seller 
and Buyer dated 8 ,  2004. ?ha t o m a  of t h i s  'Trdnaactim Confirpution 
are binding unlesa disputed  in wri t ing  wi th in  t w o  ( 2 )  wlaineaa D.ya of receipt 
unleas uthorwiao apooifisd i n  t h o  &a8 Contract. I n  tho w o n t  of m y  
inconais toncy betmon t h i s  Transrctlcm Conf i rmt ion  and t he  Raaa Cuntract, 
t h i a  Trdnsact ion C o n f i n n d t i u n  w i l l  yuvom. 

SELLER: Lours DREYFUS ENERGY SERVICES LP 
20 Nuatport  noad 
Wilton C'I 06897 
Tax:  203-761-8181 
Bdae Contrac t  No.: 972 
Trader:  Scott CulborMn 

a SOUTHERN CO 9VCS INC AQlT FOR SOUTHERN CCWPANY 
600 NORTH l8TH STRECI 
14N-8164 
BIRPIINGHAH, A I  35203 
?radar:  e Mitchel l  

Contract F r i c e :  

During t he  delivery period. t h e  price for each such cdlenddr day baing the  
" F l w  ddt r (a1 :  Widpoint a s  quoted i n  E la t t s  G.6 Vdlly i n  t he  auc t ion  t i t l e d  
*Daily price rurvuy I S / W t u )  under tho  heddiny Louisiana-Onshore South: 
Flor ida Gar, zone 3" FLUS USD-yr miem. 

Performancu Obligat ion:  

1 
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R o p l  Submined ET D l c r _ _  C a m :  
MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINESVILLE, INC. 11/11/09 

I 

. .  , 

04 1 1 
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Sonthm Company 
Fuel011 Sales Propal  Form 
Pricing and Payment Turns (p*u d arahrlly) 

No. 2693 P. 212 
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Southern Company 
Fuel Oil Sales Proposal Form 
Pricing and Payment Terms (plenie read cwafully) 

No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

tJ0 Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bld 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 
No Bld 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bld 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

Bnhbrtlgc, OA 
X Prcwnt,PL 

MS 

Cd.l 
Scboh 
Smith 

[knid 

D.wbup No Bid No Bid 
OlOMdCf No Bid No Bid 
Des00 County No Bid No Bid 
Rn\mn No Bid No Bid 

ulrrn LOW Red (urn) 
Ls I ULS 
Ls I ULS 
LsIULS 

LSIULS 
LS I ULS 
LSlULs 
IsluLs 
ULS ouly 
ULS only 
lS lVLS 
WJULS 
LSlULS 
LSIULS 
LSJULS 
LSIULS 

Wc wUI Npprv DFJ 
LSD but prlcing fmm 
OPlSWill bobuda 

LSluLT 
LsluLs 
LSJULS 
LSIULS 

Prylymcul remu: Net 30 
Uiiloading Fras The: I Hour 

A. 8 modiliou of mk, ucxt day dellvcry ivivill be pmvided on 
orden placed by m u .  Ifdelivery c i ~ o l  k nia under Udr 
cadilion, SCS Fwl S m h  or plnnt petsonilel will be notified 5 Deniunnge Rate: 0 a i  mi asporsibla 

Proposal Sobmitfed By: Kcviii A. Cross Date: IIJ12/2009 C D O I ~ R U ~ :  Midstream Fuel Service LLC dbn PEPCO 



The following prices 
Tax for plant Gorgas 
Smith, Crist, Scholz, 

Plant 

Gaston 
Gorgas 
Greene Co. 

Bowen 
Branch 
Hammond 
Kraft 
McDonough 
McIntosh Steam 
McIntosh CT 
Scherer 
Mitchell 
Wansley 
Wilson 
Yates 
Robins CT 

2 ' Crist 
3 Scholz 
Y Smith 

5 Daniel 

Dahlberg 
Oleander 
Desoto 
Rowan 

and the Florida Pollution Tax for 
Oleander, and Desoto. 

Terminal 

Birmingham 
Birmingham 
Meridian 

Atlanta 
Macon 
Rome 
Savannah 
Atlanta 
Savannah 
Savannah 
Macon 
Albany 
Atlanta 
Augusta 
Atlanta 
Macon 

include freight and the Walker County Excise 
plants 

Pensacola 
Bainbridge 
Panama City 

Pascagoula 

Athens 
Orlando 
Tampa 
Greensboro 

Adder 

These prices reflect a NET 10 payment terms. 



li 
Southern Company 

Fuel Oil Sdea Proposal Form 
Pricing and Payment Terms (pi- read aremy) 

h n condition of ula. next day delivery will be provided on 
orders placed by noon. H delivery cMnM be mct undcr dull 
condition, SCS Fuel S m m  or plan1 p a s o ~ c l  will bc 

Unloadlnp Pm Time: 
Payment Tenn~: 

5 Demun.peRatc: Jiiiiik notifid .I seen u paimbk. 

Propod Snbmlned B 

04 I 7 
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Truman Arnold Companies 
202 4” Avenue South 

I 

2 

Gulf Power Company 
_ _  
Franklin, TN 37064 
Attn: Angie Johnson 

Purchase Order Number: 
GO-1 001 

. Plant Crlst 

3 
Y 

This purchase order covers the purchase of Ultra Low Sulfur I 
Dyed fuel oil for Plant Crist for the period of 1-1-2010 thru 12-31- 
2010, subject to the following terms and conditions: 

Price: The delivered price for ULS fuel oil, as detailed in 
your bid response, will be-r gallon plus the OPiS 
average for Distillate - - Ultra Low Red Diesel from 
Pensacola, FL as published In “opisnet.com” for the day 
of product loading. 
Payment Terms: Net 10 
Demurrage rate:-/ hour (or fraction) past the one 
hour free time (destination only). 
The attached “GULF POWER COMPANY TERMS AND 
CONDITIONS FOR THE SUPPLY OF N0.2 FUEL OIL” is 
hereby incorporated into and made a part of this 
agreement. 
Payments are to be sent to: 

Truman Arnold Comoanies 
NY, NY 

.A 
ISSUED B Y  Southern Company Soiervlces, Apont 

S.W. Reagan .- 
t I I 

DATE: 12-08-09 DATE: 
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Truman Arnold Companies 

2 

Gulf Power Company 

Gulf Power Company 
One Energy Place 

Pensacola, Florida 32520-0328 

Plant Smith I 
This purchase order covers the purchase of Ultra Low Sulfur / 
Dyed fuel oil for Plant Smith for the period of 1-1-2010 thru 12- 
31-2010, subject to the following terms and conditions: 

Price: The delivered prlce for ULS fuel oil, as detailed in 
your bid response, will be-per gallon plus the OPlS 
average for Distillate - - Ultra Low R e d  Diesel from Panama 
City, FL as published in “opisnet.com” for the day of 
product loading. 
Payment Terms: Net 10 
Demurrage rate:- hour (or fraction) past the one 
hour free time (destination only). 
The attached “GULF POWER COMPANY TERMS AND 
CONDITIONS FOR THE SUPPLY OF N O 2  FUEL OIL” is 
hereby Incorporated Into and made a part of this 
agreement. 
Payments are to be sent to: 

Truman Arnold ComDanles 
C/O JP Mor an Chage, NY, NY 

Acct# 
A m #  

. A  
ISSUED BY: Southern CO 

S.W. Reagan 
I 

DATE: 12-08-09 . DATE: 
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Truman Arnold Companies 
202 4'h Avenue South 
Franklin, TN 37064 

Gulf Power Company 

I 

2. 

ISSUED By: Southern Compo Agent 

S.W. Reagan 

DATE: 12-08-09 

3 

L1, 

FOR: &% ulf Po er om 8 

DATE: I L/ IS/ Z m  

ApprovW. 

Aitn: Angie Johnson 

0424 



The documents submitted herewith in response to Request # 2, consisting of pages 
stamped 0048-0222, are confidential in their entirety. 
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Gulf Power Company Long-Term Solicitation - October 2009 
Foresight Coal Sales Negotiation 

RFP (Issued October 8.20091 
Term: 
Quantity: 
Pricing: 

4 years beginning Jan. 1,201 1 
Up to 3 million tondyear 
Quote fixed price for year one with a specified annual escalation (if any) for following 
years 

Foresieht Bid (Dated October 26.20091 
Term: 
Quantity: 

10 years beginning Jan. 1,201 1 
201 1 - 2 million tons 
2012-2020 - 3 million tondyear 

ton FOB Railcar 
ton FOB Railcar 

&will be used to determine 

2012 - 

set the price for 2013-2014 and re-open every two ears thereafter. If parties are 
unable to reach an agreement on Price, 
price for 2013-2020. 

Pricing: 2011 - 

market re-opener would be conducted during the 3& quarter of 2012 to 

Negotiation Period (October 26.2009 - Februarv 1.20101 
Gulfs initial purchase decision. based on Foresight’s bid, was as follows: 

Term: 2 years beginning Jan. 1,201 1 
Quantity: 201 1 - 800,OOO tons 

2012 - 1.200.M)o tons 
Pricing: 201 1 -ton 

2012 - ton 

Through subsequent negotiations, Gulf agreed to the following: 
Term: 6 years beginning Jan. 1.201 1 
Quantity: 500,000 tons/year 

2012 
Pricing: 

2013-2016 - A market re-opener would be conducted during 2012 and 2014 to set the 
mice for 2013-2014 and 2015-2016. resmctivelv. 

-- 

Gulf denied Foresight’s request and negotiations ceased on February I ,  2010. 



DATE: 

RE: 

FROM: 

T O  

March 8.2010 

GULF POWER COMPANY 
LONG-TERM COAL SOLICITATION 2011-2014 

Sarah Myrick 

H. Rusty Ball 

This letter is written to document the process and results of the 2011-2014 Long-Term Coal Solicitation that was 
issued on October 8.2009 on behalf of Gulf Power Company’s Plants Crist and Smith. This solicitation was made to 
support the projected 2011 through 2014 coal burn and inventory requirements at these plants. A review of Crist and 
Smith’s inventory plans and bum projections for the 2011 through 2014 timeframe indicated the need of 
approximately 1.4 million tons of wal for year 2011, 3.1 million tons in 2012. 4.3 million tons in 2013 and 4.1 
million tons in 2014. In addition, the bids received under the solicitation were considered for purchase in an effort to 
support Gulf Power Company’s Long-Tern Coal Procurement Strategy and Tac t id  Plan. 

A bid invitation was issued on October 8. 2009. soliciting bids from all approved suppliers listed on the Gulf Power 
Company Bid List. The solicitation requested bids for the purchase of coal for a tern of up to four (4) years 
beginning January 1.201 1 and ending on December 31.2014. The bid close date was October 27,2009. In response 
to the solicitation, twenty-one (21) offers were received hum fourteen (14) different coal suppliers. Offers were 
received from the Central Appalachian, Illinois Basin. ColoradoNtah and Colombian coal supply regions. 

Due to the uncertainty surrounding Gulf Power’s coal bum as well as the lack of fixed price offers beyond 2012. the 
twenty-one proposals that were received were evaluated over two years to Plant Crist on a fully delivered present 
value basis. including the value of S a  and NO.. In support of the evaluation process. transportation rates and lease 
and maintenance costs were provided by Stephen Burns, Transportation Agent and SO2 allowance values were 
provided by Richard Taylor, Emissions Trader. 

Bascd on the delivered economics of all offers, Foresight Coal Sales, LLC’s offer from their Pond Creek #1 mine 
was the most competitive Dlinois Basin offer with a starting price o including S a  and NO.. Their 
offer consisted Of supplying 3 million tons per year for 2011-2020 WI a fixed pnce for the first two years and 

s for the remaining eight years. Their proposal also included utilidng 
e to their competitive fixed pricing for the first two years, Gulf entered 
800.000 tons in 2011 at a fixed price of- and 1 . m  tons in 2012 

xtensive negotiations over a penod of three months 
However, the parties ultimately could not agne 

ired; thus no purchases were made. 

4 

negotiations ceased on February 1,2010. 

Page 1 
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The documents submitted herewith in response to Request # 5, consisting of pages 
stamped 0232-0350, are confidential in their entirety. 



The documents submitted herewith in response to Request # 8, consisting of pages 
stamped 0357-0370, are confidential in their entirety. 





18052 m m  co 

TRANSACTION coNFIRppI'IION 

Octuber 28, 2009 
?rad. Oat* : Octuber 11. ZOO9 
TrdIlsdCfiCJIl C h l f f m t i U n # :  01573015 

7hia Transrc t iun  Conf lmat iun  i m  governed by t h e  ease  Contract  Dr twen Sellar 
and Buyar dated W A R X  8 ,  2004. The terns uf t h i s  7ransect ion Cunf i rwt ion  
are binding u n l e s s  d isprccd  in  wri t ing  within twu 12) mslnr6a k y s  of rece ip t  
unless o t h e m i r r  specified In  the Base Contract .  In t he  event  of any 
inconslatency between t h i s  T ranaac t im  Conf i rmt ion  and t he  Base Contract, 
t h i e  7 ~ d l l ~ d C t b X l  CCMlfirmtiUn W i l l  yoVrCn. 

SEIICR: Lours DREYPUS ENERGY SERVICES IP 
20 Wastpurt Rwd 
Wiltun CI 06897 

Bdse Contrac t  No.: 972 
Tdx: 203-761-8181 

Trader:  Scott CUlCerJon 

- BUYER: SOWHERN CO SVCS INC N N T  FOR SOUTHERN CCMPANY 
600 NORTH l8TH STREET 
14N-9164 
BIRMINGHAW, A I  35203 
TIddcK: E Ni tche l l  

Cvntsaot P r i w :  

Ouriny  the du l lve ry  per iod,  t ho  price f u r  each such calendar day bciny t h e  
"FluU d d t r ( Y l :  Midpoint 8s quoted i n  Elatto Gas Oaily i n  t he  sectim t i t l u d  
"Daily p r i c e  survey ($/NMktu) under t h e  herding Louisiana-Onshore Suuth: 
Florida Gas, zone 3" FLUS USD-&ur HHe7U. 
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Southern Company 
Fuel oil Sales Propal  Fory 
Pricing and Payment Term (p& rcld C W ~ )  



/ /p Southern Company 
Fuel On Sales Proposal Form 
h idng  and Payment Terms @lease read cmhi ly)  

L l b  

.. 

* 
* * 

* 
* * * * * * * 
* * * 

5 

*See Exceptions t o  Pricing on next page. 
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Southern Company 
Fuel OU Sale8 Proposal Form 
Pricing and Payment Terms (pleric read carefully) 

Unleu your bid 8111W olhuwlse. payueul for fucl oil will be bued upon lhe daily olmiog OPlS Raclr Awnge 
lndcx far tho date of.hipmenl and fmvr the origin krmbul specifled bdow (retrieved daily by Southau Company 
Scrvboa Goin ophnd.com). and Por the apacino product (LS or ULS) &fined below M whnt you wiU be able to 
dcllw. ?la ptblished OPlS Rack Awrngc p o r t l ~  will be dded to you bid’s fued adder to detamtne 
the Uptlon paid. muodcd to four & o h 1  p*rrr. Any applicnbls slaw. ula tu d l  be pahi d m l y  to (he taxing 
authority by Ibo appmprlye Soutktn Company opuattnp compauy. Pknw iudiate in the approprhts boau below 
the p a  gallon adder 10 the appmyM(0 OFlS Rnck Average. Tlw ddmr is lo Cmsirc of lha folbwinp componcrlu: 
vutporwlon, I r u o k p r m p o ~ a ( i ~ a p p l k a b b ) u d n y u x o r ~ ~ u u q u i r o d b y b w  f o r t h c S ~ t o p a y r u c h a 8  
Walker colm(y E ~ e k  Tu for Plant Oow 4 Ihe Fbrib. Pollution Tax fm Phnla Smilh. criu. Schk Olaodcr 
d -0. If awarded a add. your hider will be 6rm fw (he lib, of tbcconmct. 

QU Prodded IC Ircle Oud 
Low SulfurYS (LS) 

Ultrn LOW Red (VIS) 
QrkkmaW Adder lo YCurrnt 

(mud Momify) Dry” OPIS PI8.1 

Gutat No Bld No Bid L S I U L S  
Go- No Bid No Bid Ls I ULS 
Gre~aa Co. No Bid No Bid LS1UL.s 

Bonwl 
Bnmb No Bid 
Flammood No Bid 
b n  No Bid 
MoIakuhS(crm No Bid 
MclnlolbCTIcc No Bid 
Schaa No BM 
M l W  No Did 
w l d e y  No Bid 
W i h  No Bld 
Yma No Bid 
Robin CT No Bid 

Cd* 
SFbob 
Smilh 

D.oid 

No Bid No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

LSlULs 
LS I ULS 
LSlULs 
Is I ULS 
ULS only 
ULS only 
LSlULS 
L s l U L S  
Ls I ULS 
LS IULS 
LSIULS 
LSIULS 

Paymsut Tarnu: Net 30 
Unloadirip Fms TLw: I Hour 

A. 8 mndltiou of iak, mxt day dellwxy will be pmvided on 
o d w  phced by mm. If delivary cannot be nwt under Y a  
condition. SCS Fwl Scrvicu or plml pnonuol will be notified 

5 D m m g e  Rala: -- as son1 as porriblc. 

P r o p o d  Snbmitlcd By: Kcviii A. Cross Date: I lllZR009 Compnuy: Midstmain Fuel Service LLC dbn PEPCO 
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The following prices 
Tax for plant Gorgas 
Smith, Crist, Scholz, 

include freight and the Walker Cc 
and the Florida Pollution Tax for 
Oleander, and Desoto. 

Gorgas 
Greene Co. 

Bowen 
Branch 
Hammond 
Kraft 
McDonough 
McIntosh Steam 
McIntosh CT 
Scherer 
Mitchell 
Wansley 
Wilson 
Yates 
Robins CT 

Terminal Adder 

Birmingham 
Birmingham 
Meridian 

Atlanta 
Macon 
Rome 
Savannah 
Atlanta 
Savannah 
Savannah 
Macon 
Albany 
Atlanta 
Augusta 
Atlanta 
Macon 

I 2 ' Crist Pensacola 
3 Scholz Bainbridge 
7 Smith Panama City 

25 Daniel Pascagoula 

I Dahlberg Athens 
Oleander Orlando 
Desoto Tampa 
Rowan Greensboro 

These prices reflect a NET 10 payment terms. 

04 1 (i 
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h a  condition of lala. next day d c l l v e ~ ~  will be provided on 
orden, placed by m. If delivery EUUYH be mct under thia 
cooditiw, SCS Fuel Smw or plant puaomd wiU be 
notifid u soon LO possible. 

Payment  tam^: 

5 
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Southern Company 
Fuel On Sdw ~ p o s a l  Po- 
Pricing and Payment Term adny) 
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I. I I L L I  
(Page 6 ;  No.18) 

I 
- ~ .. . - - For 2010 .. Fuel Oil purchases Adders to published OPlS indexer 

Bidders: RKA PTC PSEnergyl Rice 1 PEPCO Boswell A&W I Minto I Mansfield Stubbs SornmenI TAC - 

Gulf Plants -~ 
- -. ~ 



i ’ )  

DATE 12-06-09 

I 

2 

3 
Y 

DATE: 

Gulf Power Company 
One Energy Place 

Pensacola, Florida 32520-0328 

Truman Arnold Companies 
202 qLh Avenue South 
Franklin, TN 37064 
Attn: Angie Johnson 

I Gulf Power Company 

Purchase Order Number: 
GO-1 001 

Plant Crkt 

This purchase order covers the purchase of Ultra Low Sulfur I 
Dyed fuel oil for Plant Crist for the period of 1-1-2010 thru 12-31- 
2010, subject to the following terms and conditions: 

Price: The delivered price for ULS fuel oil, as detailed in 
your bld response, will be-er gallon plus the OPlS 
average for Distillate - - Ultra Low Red Diesel from 
Pensacola, FL as published in “opisnet.com” for the day 
of product loading. 
Payment Terms: Net 10 

0 Demurrage rate:-/ hour (or fraction) past the one 
hour free time (destination only). 
The attached “GULF POWER COMPANY TERMS AND 
CONDITIONS FOR THE SUPPLY OF N0.2 FUEL OIL” is 
hereby incorporated Into and made a part of this 
agreement. 
Payments are to be sent to: 

Truman Arnold Companies WCOAiPIC NY, NY 

Acct# n 
ISSUED By: Southern Company Sorvlws, Agent App 

S.W. Reagan 

0422 



Gulf Power Company 
One Energy Place 

Pensacola, Florida 32520-0328 
L 

Truman Arnold Companies 
202 41h Avenue South 
Franklin, TN 37064 
Ann: Angie Johnson 

Gulf Power Company 

Purchase Order Number: 
GO-1 002 

Plant Smith I 

DATE: 12-08-09 ’ 

This purchase order covers the purchase of Ultra Low Sulfur / 
Dyed fuel oil for Plant Smith for the period of 1-1-2010 thru 12- 
31-201 0, subject to the following terms and conditions: 

I2 f I s/zooci DATE 

1 

2 

0 Price: The delivered prlcefor ULS fuel oil, as detailed in 
your bid response, will be-per gallon plus the OPlS 
average for Distillate - - Ultra Low R e d  Diesel from Panama 
City, FL as published in “opisneLcom” for the day of 
product loading. 
Payment Terms: Net 10 
Demurrage rate: hour (or fraction) past the one 
hour free time (dest nation only). 
The attached “GULF POWER COMPANY TERMS AND 
CONDITIONS FOR M E  SUPPLY OF N0.2 FUEL OIL” is 
hereby incorporated Into and made a part of this 
agreement. 
Payments are to be sent to: 

Truman Arnold Companies 
C/O JP Mor an Chase, NY, NY 

Acct# 
A m #  

. A  
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Truman Arnold Companies 
202 4th Avenue South 
Franklin. TN 37064 

I 

Gulf Power Company 

2 

&% ISSUED BY: Southern Cornpa Agant Approved: 

S.W. Reagan FOR: ulf Po er ompa 
~ 

DATE: 12-08-09 
- 

3 

L1 

Attn: Angie Johnson 
Purchase Order Number: 

Plant Scholr 

0424 



EXHIBIT “C” 

Line-by-Line/Field-by-Field Justification 
Line(sVField(s) 

Response to Request # 2 

Confidential in its entirety. 
[Pages 48-2221 

Response to Request # 3 

Page 224, Lines 1-2 1, Columns A-B. 

Page 225, Lines 1-19, Columns A-B. 

Page 226, Lines 1-14, Columns PL-B. 

Page 227, Lines 1-17 

Page 228, Lines 1-9 

Response to Request # 5 

Confidential in its entirety. 
[Pages 232-3501 

Response to Request # 8 

Confidential in its entirety.’ 
[Pages 357-3701 

Justification 

This information is entitled to confidential 
classification pursuant to §366.093(3) (d) 
and (e), Florida Statutes. The basis for 
this information being designated as 
confidential is more fully set forth in 
paragraph 1. 

This information is entitled to confidential 
classification pursuant to §366.093(3) (d) 
and (e), Florida Statutes. The basis for 
this information being designated as 
confidential is more fully set forth in 
paragraph 1. 

This information is entitled to confidential 
classification pursuant to §366.093(3) (d) 
and (e), Florida Statutes. The basis for 
this information being designated as 
confidential is more fully set forth in 
paragraph 1. 

This information is entitled to confidential 
classification pursuant to §366.093(3) (d) 
and (e), Florida Statutes. The basis for 
this information being designated as 
confidential is more fully set forth in 
paragraph 1. 

1 A number of the original documents produced in response to this request contain pre-printed redactions which are 
in addition to the redactions made by Gulf Power in this filing. These pre-printed redactions appear in the original 
documents provided to Gulf Power by its agent, Southern Company Services, and relate to bids received by Gulf 
Power’s affiliates. 



Response to Request # 9 

Page 372, Columns A-F, in their entirety. 

Response to Request # 10 

Page 374, Line 1 

Page 376, Lines 1-2 

Page 377, Lines 1-2 

Page 378, Line 1 

Page 379, Line 1 

Page 380, Line 1 

Response to Request # 17 

Page 411, Lines 1-5 

Page 412, Lines 1-2 

Page 413, Lines 1-5 

Page 414, Lines 1-5 

Page 415, Lines 1-5 

Page 416, Lines 1-5 

Page 417, Lines 1-5 

Page 418, Lines 1-5 

This information is entitled to confidential 
classification pursuant to §366.093(3) (d) 
and (e), Florida Statutes. The basis for 
this information being designated as 
confidential is more fully set forth in 
paragraph 1. 

This information is entitled to confidential 
classification pursuant to §366.093(3) (d) 
and (e), Florida Statutes. The basis for 
this information being designated as 
confidential is more fully set forth in 
paragraph 1. 

This information is entitled to confidential 
classification pursuant to §366.093(3) (d) 
and (e), Florida Statutes. The basis for 
this information being designated as 
confidential is more fully set forth in 
paragraph 1. 

2 A number of the original documents produced in response to this request contain pre-printed redactions which are 
in addition to the redactions made by Gulf Power in this filing. These pre-printed redactions appear in the original 
documents provided to Gulf Power by its agent, Southern Company Services, and relate to bids received by Gulf 
Power’s affiliates. 



Response to Request # 18 

Page 420, Lines 1-3 

Response to Request # 19 

Page 422, Lines 1-4 

Page 423, Lines 1-4 

Page 424, Lines 1-4 

This information is entitled to confidential 
classification pursuant to §366.093(3) (d) 
and (e), Florida Statutes. The basis for 
this information being designated as 
confidential is more fully set forth in 
paragraph 1. 

This information is entitled to confidential 
classification pursuant to §366.093(3) (d) 
and (e), Florida Statutes. The basis for 
this information being designated as 
confidential is more fully set forth in 
paragraph 1. 



COMMISSIONERS: 
NANCY ARGENZIANO, CHAIRMAN 
LISA POW( ELXAR 
NATHAN A. SKOP 
DAVID E. KLEMENT 
BEN A. "STEVE" STEVENS III 

STATE OF FLORIDA 
OFFICE OF COMMISSION CLERK 

ANN COLE 
COMMISSION CLERK 

(850) 413-6770 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 

DATE: March 22,2010 

TO: Susan D. Ritenour, Gulf Power Company 

F K M :  Ruth Nettles, Office of Commission Clerk 

RE: Acknowledgement of Receipt of Confidential Filing 

This will acknowledge receipt of a CONFIDENTIAL DOCUMENT filed in Docket Number 

100001 or, if filed in an undocketed matter, concerning response to staffs 1'' Request for PODS, 

Nos. 2, 3, 5. 8. 9. 10. 17-19, and filed on behalf of -. The document will be 

maintained in locked storage. 

If you have any questions regarding this document, please contact Kim Peiia, Records 

Management Assistant, at (850) 413-6393. 
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An Affirmative ActionlEqud Opportunity Employer 

Management Assistant, at (850) 413-6393. 
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An Affirmative ActionlEqud Opportunity Employer 
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