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_. Raquel Tully wt\a !00243-7-x 
From: Nancy Pruitt DEPOSIT DATE a 200-  L e C b W  y 

3 0 0  - -=/-+ne Sent: 
To: Raquel Tully 

Subject: RE: 

Monday, May 03,2010 3:16 PM 

0 4 2 M A Y  0 7 2OiO q- 3 0 -  \a w- 

TK21:2 - BroadRiver 
to PSC Trust Fund with the remaining $300 to General Revenue. 

Nancy Pruitt 

$700 is RAF, $105 is penalty, $21 is interest, and $500 is fine. $200 of the fine goes 

Florida Public Service Commission c e -CJ 2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard y. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399 O Z O  

c -< 31. - 
02.. I -_ 4 ;-;.; 850-41 3-6128 (fax) r 2: 
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~, - 850-41 3-61 27 
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L_ .. 
From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, May 03,2010 2:29 PM 
To: Nancy Pruitt 
Subject: 

Please let me know the following break downs: 

TX 283 $1 100.00 
TX966 $1208.00 
TK212 $1326.00 

5/3/2010 


